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First day of summer 
• The Rob Pipho Jazz Quintet 
are the featured act at the 2007 
St. John Hospital and Medical 
Center Music on the Plaza con­
cert series, beginning at 7 p.m. 
The concert is on The Village 
Festival Plaza at the corner of 
St. Clair and Kercheval. 

• Grosse Pointe Woods July 
4th fireworks can be seen at 
dusk and are shot off from the 
Parcells Middle School field. 
The rain date is Monday, June 
25. 
• The Knights of Columbus 
sponsor a Red Cross blood dri­
ve from 9 am. to 3 p.m. at St. 
Paul's Catholic Church, 157 
Lakeshore, Grosse Pointe 
Farms. 
•The Eastside Republican 
Club holds its fifth annual fam­
ily picnic from 1 to 3 p.m. at 
Patterson Park in Grosse 
Pointe Park. A free meal will be 
provided. There will be a magi­
cian, playscape, children's 
pool, tennis courts and games 
on site. Guests should bring 
their own non-alcoholic bever­
ages and a dish to pass. Call 
Peggy Hennigan by June 22 at 
(313) 822-0281 to have your 
name put on the list for en­
trance into the park. 

• A public meeting of the 
Grosse Pointe Public library 
Board of Trustees is planned 
for 7 p.m. in the Woods Branch 
library, 20680 Mack. The 
agenda is available on the li­
brary Web site gp.lib.mi.us, as 
well as in each library. A board 
packet is available for review at 
each library. 
• The City of Grosse Pointe 
Park council meets at 7 p.m. in 
city hall, 15115 E.Jefferson. 
• The Grosse Pointe Board of 
Education meets at 8 p.m. in 
Grosse Pointe North High 
School's library. 

THURSDAY, JUNE 28 

• The semi-annual meeting of 
the Grosse Pointe Chamber of 
Commerce will be held from 6 
to 8 p.m. at the Lochmoor 
Club, 1018 Sunningdale, 
Grosse Pointe Woods. 
Reservations are required and 
may be made by calling (313) 
881-4722. The cost is $40 for 
members and $50 for non-
members. 
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EyesOn Design 
Clarence and Nancy Becker, owners of Pointe Hardware in Grosse Pointe Park, parked their 1950 

Nash Ambassador at the Edsel & Eleanor Ford House for the annual EyesOn Design Automotive 

Show. The Nash gets about 24 miles per gallon in the city because it is so aerodynamic. The 

Beckers say the car is roomy inside and the seats fold down to form a flat surface on which they 

can sleep while traveling. For more pictures, turn to 11 A. 

Boaters can expect to get a return 
ByBethQuinn 
Staff Writer 

Some Woods boat well 
renters can expect a check in 
the mail sometime soon. 

After an investigation of the 
costs incurred by the city of 
Grosse Pointe Woods for 
dredging the Lake Front Park 
marina, the city council voted 
to rescind the dredging assess­
ment during the 2008 boating 
season and refund any dredg­
ing fees paid for the 2007 boat­
ing season. 

Mayor Robert Novitke esti­
mates $20,000 will be returned. 

The dredging cost was 
$72,000. 

Approximately 85 percent of 
the well-renters paid their first 
$130 installment with their 
well rent prior to June 1. 

According to Novitke, the 
funds to cover the dredging 
was supposed to be covered by 
the annual boat well rents col­
lected since the last dredging 
more than a decade ago. 

An investigation revealed 
that rather than placing these 

payments in a special boat 
dock fund, former comptrol­
ler/treasurer Clifford Maison 
put them into the general fund 
from which salaries and other 
operating expenses are paid. 

The council has directed the 
city administrators to provide 
information and supporting 
documentation of the boat 
dock fund within 60 days. 

"We need to move forward," 
Novitke said. "I support taking 
a very detailed look at the way 
the administration handled the 
finances." 

Clients 
areready 
to sign up 
Kercheval Place parking 
deck under construction 
ByJohnLundberg 
Staff Writer 

Things are revving up at 
:rcheval Place in the Village 
opping district. 
Monday night, the city coun­

cil unanimously approved a 
special use permit for Ann 
Taylor Loft, an upscale 
woman's clothier, to occupy 
just over 5,500 square feet at 
Kercheval Place and, in a 4-2 
vote, approved its signage re-
-quest----—' 

But that's only the beginning. 
Kercheval Place architect 

Scott Bowers said there are a 
number of potential clients 
who are presently negotiating 
leases to move in. 

The catalyst, he said, was the 
executed lease with Trader 
Joe's and the beginning of con­
struction on the new parking 
deck. 

Finding occupants for the of­
fice space on the building's sec­
ond floor has also taken a posi­
tive turn. 

Bowers said there are discus­
sions with potential clients, and 
he should know more in the 
next month or two. 

The former Jacobson's de­
partment store has stood va­
cant for several years now. 

Several attempts for reuse 
failed until developers Cullen 
Meathe and Frank Torre and 

See PLACE, page 2A 

Council puts 
rumors to rest 
Sunrise did not 
offer contributions 
ByBethQuinn 
StaffWriter 

Weeks of rumors and specu­
lation have been put to rest. 

At its Monday, June 18, meet­
ing, the Grosse Pointe Woods 
City Council put into its records 
that Sunrise Senior Living did 
not offer improper contribu­
tions to the city. 

Sunrise recently had its site 

plan for its third Woods project 
approved by the Woods 
Planning Coinmission for a $25 
million facility on Vernier be­
tween Vernier Circle and 
Fairway. A use variance request 
will be heard by the city's 
Zoning Board of Appeals pn 
Monday, July 2. 

The controversy began in 
April when Woods councilman 
Pete Waldmeir alerted his fel­
low council members and 
Mayor Robert Novitke about 

See SUNRISE, page 3A 

POINTER OF INTEREST 

'Planning now "will avoid so many problems. 
And isn't that what you want for your family?' 

George Cassar 
Home: Grosse Pointe Shores 

Age: 36 

Family: Wife, Carolyn; 

children Mia and Robert John 

Claim to fame: attorney 

specializing in estate planning 

and taxes 

See story on page 4A 
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NEWS 

Yesterday's headlines 

50 years ago this week 

• ARMY ENDS LEASE 
WITH PARK: The U.S. Army 
ended its lease to station a bat­
talion in the Three Mile-Essex 
area and will remove its troops 
and equipment at the end of 
August. 

The Army reversed an earli­
er decision to extend the lease 
for one year and will, instead 
deploy troops and equipment 
to other parts of the Detroit 
area in a shift of defense strate­
gy. 

The anti-aircraft equipment 
has already been removed but 
the site is still government land 
until the lease expires. Troops 
will remain on guard. 

• STOLEN CAR MYSTERY 
SOLVED: Two Detroit youths 
were arrested and charged 
with car theft from a house in 
the 17000 block of Maumee in 
May. Both suspects confessed 
to taking the car. Since it was 
stolen, the car has logged 1,200 
additional miles. 

Police were alerted to the 
suspects by Dearborn police 
who detained the youths when 
they could not produce any pa­
perwork for the vehicle. 

• CTTY WELCOMES CITY 
BANK: City Bank of Detroit 
announced it will open a 
branch office at Cadieux and 
Mack. The new office will offer 
drive-in facilities, safe deposit 
boxes and a night depository. 

Architectural plans have 
been completed, but it is un­
known when construction is 
scheduled to begin. 

In the beginning... 
An architectural rendering for the proposed Grosse Pointe Methodist Church on Moross has captured the public's imagination. Construction is scheduled to be com­

pleted by 1959. The church serves some 300 families, with 45 joining the church in the last year alone. 

25 years ago this week 

• WATER RATES RISE IN 
PARK, SHORES: Councils in 
Grosse Pointe Park and Shores 
voted to increase water rates to 
its'residents. 

The Park increase will make 
up for the $56,000 deficit in the 
Park's water and sewer enter­
prise fund. The rest of the 
monies will go to offset rate in­
creases imposed by the Detroit 
Water Board, where the Park 
receives its water. 

In addition, Shores officials 
halted legal action against the 
Detroit Water Board protesting 
a recent rate increase. The 
Village council rescinded the 
action and will further review 
their water rates. 

• CHURCHES THREATEN 
TO BLOCK MARATHON: A 
delegation of clergymen have 
petitioned the Farms city coun­
cil in protest to the timing of 
the 1982 Detroit Free Press 
International Marathon held 
every fall. 

They complained that the 
event is held on Sunday morn­
ing, the same time church ser­
vices are held. The marathon's 
route forces church members 
to take other routes on the way 
to Sunday services. 

The clergymen also protest­
ed that event organizers chose 
World Communion Sunday 
which is one of the most well-
attended services of the year. 

• PARK PUTS LID ON 
TRASH: About 600 families 
living in Grosse Pointe Park 
will take delivery of new rolling 
trash bins as part of a pilot 
study of a containerized trash 
system. 

The program is designed to 
clean up alleys and help rid the 
city of stray dogs and rodents 
fhat feed .off overturned trash 

LIVE LIFE 
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TERMS. 

Pieo.se join us to learn more about The Sterling, a distinctly different 
senior living community in the heart of The Village. Seniors will 

appreciate the benefits of home ownership with fine services and amenities. 

Sunday, June 24, 2007' 
Trattoria Andiamo • 20930 Mack Avenue 
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barrels. The new system is also 
expected to increase the effi­
ciency of trash pick up opera­
tions by 59 percent. 

10 years ago this week 

• CITY HAS NEW TOP 
COP: Alfred "Skip" Fincham 
was named director of public 
safety to replace Bruce 
Kennedy, who is stepping 
down from the position after 
20 years. 

Fincham's selection ended a 
candidate search that began in 
February. He will assume his 
duties July 1. Fincham is a , ! ^ 
y$B& veteran of the City's puB-̂  
lie .safety department. .He be-
ga^ris Career in Washington 
Township, Ohio in 1970. 

• SCHOOL BOARD VOTES 
AGAINST SOUTH NIGHT 
GAMES: The Grosse "Jointe 
Board of Education voted 
unanimously against a request 
by the Grosse Pointe South 
High School Booster Club to 
host six more night football 
games at the athletic field. 

Night football games at both 
public high schools have been 

a controversial subject for the 
past several years. Neighbors 
near the athletic facilities have 
complained about the noise the 
events generate. 

While, there have been no 
reported problems at the 
games needing police interven­
tion, board members felt "un­
comfortable" in allowing six 
additional night games at the 
facility. 

• SOC, SCHOOLS CON­
TINUE TALKS: 
Representatives from Services 
for Older Citizens and the 
Grosse Pointe Public School 
System continue to discuss 
where SOC can build a new fa­
cility. 

A recent plan to construct a 
.,,%cili.^n,,„,:vne|r,.,.„ Barnes 
^ l e i n e l i t a t y ' ^ p g ^ s aban­
doned because of "neighbor 
complaints. ""''' 

Both representatives from 
SOC and the school system are 
confident they will find a place 
to locate a facility by the end of 
the year. 

5 years ago this week 

• NEW CTTY POOL SET 
TO OPEN: The new City of 
Grosse Pointe pool and bath­
house have been given the 
green light to open on July 2. 

Since construction delays 
prevented the pool from 
opening on schedule, City res­
idents have been using the 
four other waterfront parks in 
the Grosse Pointes for their 
summertime fun. 

The City is currently filling 
the pool and will open it pend­
ing Wayne County Health 
Department's approval. 

• JUDGE ORDERS 
FARMS TO BUY HOME: 
Third Circuit Judge Warfield 
Moore said Grosse Pointe 
Farms is obligated to buy one 
of two homes behind the 
t^h^fiP:& "Jud^'butiamg^n 
Kercheval. 

Grosse'Pointe 'Farms' origi­
nally bought two homes be­
hind the building with hopes 
of constructing a parking fa­
cility. 

The Farms rescinded the of­
fer after neighbors com­
plained about the proposed 
parking facility. 

The Farms made an offer of 
$290,000 plus closing costs 
for the home. 

—By John Lundberg 

PLACE: 
Let's go 
shopping 
Continued pom page 1A 

the council came to an agree­
ment for its redevelopment. 

Last year, Coldwater Creek 
and Jos. A Banks moved in at 

opposite corners of the struc­
ture. Trader Joe's, after pro­
tracted negotiations, signed a 
potential 25-year lease this 
spring. 

Because of the development 
agreement, city officials had to 
wait until the lease was inked to 
start construction of the new 
parking deck. 

Because Ann Taylor Loft 
plans to occupy more than 
5,000 square feet, it needed ap-

INTRODUCING 
AN EXCITING ADDITION TO THE HILL 

SALON SEVENTY SIX 
76 KERCHEVAL 

GROSSE POINTE FARMS 
313-886-7676 

WITH THE FORMER STAFF OF LEON'S 
nrrrrirrTnr wm 

proval from the city council to 
occupy the space. 

Hydrant testing 
The Grosse Pointe Park 

Department of Public Safety 
will conduct its annual fire hy­
drant testing and flushing from 
Friday, June 22, north of 
Jefferson^ and from Monday, 
June 25, to Friday, June 29, 
south of Jefferson. 
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South's choir teacher given a suspension 
By Bob St. John 
StaffWriter 

Grosse Pointe South High 
School choir teacher Ellen 
Bowen was indefinitely sus­
pended after being convicted 
May 22 in a Grosse Pointe 
Park municipal court of as­
sault and battery and being an 
annoying person. 

"At this time, Ellen Bowen's 
conviction has been reported 
to state Superintendent 
(Mike) Flanagan who is re­
quired under the law to con­
duct a hearing regarding the 
possible revocation of Ms. 
Bowen's teaching certificate," 
said Rebecca Fannon, Grosse 
Pointe Public School System 
community relations special­
ist. "Given the gravity of the 
offense, the upcoming sen­
tencing and certification hear­
ing, and the district's own 
need to proceed with an inde­
pendent investigation, Ms. 
Bowen has been suspended 
until further notice." 

Bowen was convicted of the 

two misdemeanor charges by 
a six-person jury consisting of 
five women and one man. 

The charges stem from an 
incident that took place at 9:28 
p.m., June 14,2006. 

The victim, 20-year-old 
Dorian West, who at the time 
of the incident was a 19-year-
old Grosse Pointe Park resi­
dent and 2005 Grosse Pointe 
South High School graduate, 
stated she was involved in a 
road rage incident resulting in 
her vehicle being rear ended 
three times. 

West stated in the police re­
port the incident began in the 
1400 block of Harvard in 
Grosse Pointe Park. West was 
stopped in the street facing 
oncoming traffic while waiting 
for her friend to move her car 
when a silver Jeep ap­
proached her flashing its 
lights. 

The victim stated the Jeep 
had room to pass, but instead 
stopped and its driver, Bowen, 
exited. 

According to the victim, 

Bowen approached in a 
threatening manner and ver­
bally assaulted her, saying, 
"They don't do that over here 
in Grosse Pointe," and sug­
gested West should "take that 
to Detroit." 

Bowen then "punched" 
West's vehicle, West said. 

During her trial, Bowen de­
nied making the comment. 
She said she asked, "What the 
hell are you doing?" or some­
thing to that effect. 

According to court docu­
ments, Bowen entered her ve­
hicle and drove off south­
bound from the 1400 block of 
Harvard. West followed be­
hind in her vehicle to get 
Bowen's license plate number. 
At the intersection of Harvard 
and Kercheval, West pulled 
along side the silver Jeep and 
told Bowen she was reporting 
the incident to the police. 

Bowen said West and her 
friend yelled derogatory ex­
pletives at her. 

West then drove away, trav­
eling west on Kercheval from 

Harvard with Bowen right be­
hind. 

As West continued on 
Kercheval, Bowen followed 
closely. The victim slowed 
down on Kercheval approach­
ing Bishop where, according 
to West, Bowen rear ended her 
three times. 

The victim's vehicle sus­
tained very minimal damage 
to its rear bumper and there 
were no complaints of in­
juries, the police report stated. 

Bowen added under oath 
that she "deliberately tapped 
West's vehicle from behind." 

She can receive a maximum 
of 90 days in jail and/or a $500 
fine for each of the misde­
meanor charges. 

During the May 22 trial, 
prosecutor Niesa Trent asked 
Bowen, "how is it that you hit 
the back of her car?" 

Bowen's response was, "She 
stopped almost immediately, 
right in here (indicating on a 
map). I mean just slammed on 
the brakes. I slammed on 
mine, and came to a screech­

ing halt right next to her and I 
tapped her car. 

"Did I tap it on purpose? 
Yes." 

Trent then asked Bowen, 
"You did tap her car on pur­
pose?" 

Bowen replied, "I did. And 
that's where I'm remorseful. I 
feel terrible about it, but I did 
it." 

Grosse Pointe Park Public 
Safety Director David Hiiler 
said this case wasn't handled 
any differently. 

"We realize Ms. Bowen is a 
prominent person in the com­
munity," Hiiler said. "However, 
we had a complaint filed 
against Ms. Bowen and we 
proceeded to handle the case 
by the book. I'm very satisfied 
with the investigation and by 
how our office handled it." 

"I'm disappointed with the 
outcome," Bowen's attorney 
John Urso said. "My biggest 
concern and Ms. Bowen's 
biggest concern is that the po­
lice wanted a conviction on 
herrecord. 

"We tried to plea bargain, 
but the police didn't want any 
part of it. They wanted a con­
viction on Ms. Bowen's 
record." 

"We kept it in Grosse Pointe 
Park municipal court and did 
not take it to Wayne County," 
Hiiler said. "We offered to 
drop the assault and battery 
charge and plead guilty on the 
annoying person charge. 

"They did accept the plea 
bargain at one time and then 
didn't take it and decided to go 
to trial." 

Bowen's sentencing was 
scheduled for Wednesday, 
June 13, the day of Grosse 
Pointe South's commence­
ment, but at the urging of Urso 
and agreement from Trent, it 
has been pushed forward to 
10:30 a.m., Wednesday, July 
18. 

Urso said he asked for the 
delay because he wants to re­
view a portion of the trial tran­
script concerning one of the 
two matters for purposes of 
possibly filing a motion. 

Two youth charged as adults in brutal carjacking 
By John Lundberg 
StaffWriter 

Two teenagers now face up 
to life in prison after Wayne 
County Prosecutor Kym 
Worthy decided to charge 
them as adults in the June 11 
vicious carjacking of two 
Canadian senior citizens in 
the City of Grosse Pointe. 

"The decision to charge ju­
venile offenders as adults is 
one of the most difficult deci­
sions that we have to make," 
Worthy said. "It is always 
done, on a case-by-case basis 
evaluating the facts and cir­
cumstances, involved. 

"The 14-year-old defendant 
has been in the juvenile sys­
tem before and it is clear that 
he has not benefited from 
what the system has to offer." 

Lamont Dontae Ward, 16, 
and Eugene Woodall Jr., 14, 
were arraigned before City of 
Grosse Pointe Municipal 
Court Judge Russell Ethridge 
Friday evening, June 15. 

Woodall was charged with 
one count of carjacking and 
unlawful driving away of an 
automobile. His bond was set 
at $150,000. 

Ward was charged with sev­
en felonies, including two 
counts of assault with intent 
to murder. His bond is 

PHOTOS BY JOHN LUNDBERG 

Below, Eugene Woodall Jr., 14, in light colored jumpsuit, and above, Lamont Dontae Ward, 16, were arraigned before City of 
Grosse Pointe Municipal Court Judge Russell Ethridge June 15. Both face up to life in prison for their alleged involvement in a 
brutal carjacking in the city on June 11. 

$250,000. 
It was an emotionally 

charged court room as friends 
and family members gathered 
to watch the arraignment. 
The two assault with intent 
counts drew gasps and sobs 
as Ward struggled with his 

composure. 
There was a brief con­

frontation following the ar­
raignment between the two 
families that was quickly bro­
ken up by the City's K-9 unit. 

"This was a brutal attack on 
two women who came into 

our community," said City 
Detective Ron Wieczorek. "It 
must be stressed that this 
crime endangered many oth­
er people as the defendants 
fled through neighborhoods 
in Grosse Pointe and Detroit 
to escape apprehension." 

On June 11, Nancy Quinn, 
63, one of the victims, was ex­
iting her car when Ward ap­
proached and allegedly took 
her keys and started the car. 
Quinn was struck by the car 
as it sped off, with Woodall in 
the passenger seat. 

Quinn was thrown to the 
ivement and sustained head 

injuries requiring medical 
treatment. Mary Eijsenck, 64, 
the other victim, held on to 
the passenger side mirror and 
sustained abrasions on her 
legs as she was dragged by 
the car. 

Both have been released 
from an area hospital and re­
turned home. Their car, a 
Ford Mustang convertible, 
was returned to them last 
week, Wieczorek said. 

Officers from the City, Park 
and Farms, Detroit and the 
Wayne County Sheriff's 
Office pursued and were led 
on a high-speed chase that 
reached speeds of 90 mph. 
Shortly after, responding to a 
tip, police located the vehicle 
parked in the backyard of a 
house on Beniteau in Detroit. 
The youths were found hiding 
in a nearby house. 

"The 16-year-old defendant 
engaged in a high-speed 
chase hitting one woman and 
dragging another at a high 
rate of speed," Worthy said. 
"We are lucky that both 
women were not killed." 

Ethridge ordered that both 
youths be assigned a public 
defender. In the event they are 
released on bail, they will be 
forced to wear an electronic 
tether to monitor their move­
ments. 

They were returned to 
Wayne County Jail. 

. V//L 

SUNRISE: 
Councils says: 
no problem 
Continued from page 1A 

an e-mail he had received from 
Woods City Administrator 
Mark Wollenweber stating that 
Sunrise is willing to donate 
funds to purchase a new cedar 
shake roof for the renovated 
Cook Schoolhouse and $20,000 
toward a new ambulance. 

In his e-mail Wollenweber 
said that Sunrise didn't want to 
go public with the contribu­
tions until after the Sunrise 

deal had been approved or de­
nied, Waldmeir said. 

This e-mail prompted an im­
mediate response from Laura 
Hester, Sunrise's senior vice 
president of devebpment,who 
requested an investigation. She 
also asked that the company be 
publicly cleared of any wrong­
doing. 

"We have always operated in 
a highly professional manner, 
and take pride in developing 
strong community relation­
ships throughout the develop­
ment and into our operations," 
she wrote in an April 25 letter 
to the city council. 

As a result of a May 16 meet­
ing between representatives 
from the Woods and Sunrise 

and an internal investigation, 
Wollenweber wrote in a May 
30 letter addressed to Hester 
with the results of the investi­
gation that "Sunrise represen­
tatives never approached 
Grosse Pointe Woods represen­
tatives either directly or indi­
rectly about possibly donating 
money for the Cook 
Schoolhouse or an ambu­
lance." f 

Wollenweber further ac­
knowledged that the content of 
his e-mail to Waldmeir was 
based on hearsay and was in­
accurate. 

Wollenweber stated that the 
city's building official, Gene 
Tutag, asked Hester in a brief 
phone conversation whether 

Sunrise could assist in pur­
chasing the roof and ambu­
lance. 

In his letter, Wollenweber 
stated that Hester's reponse 
was that "this was not the time 
to discuss it due to your ongo­
ing project under consideration 
by city planning commission 
and the city council." 

"I was very disturbed that the 
city administration would even 
approach a developer for the 
city about making contribu­
tions even if there is nothing 
wrong with it," Novitke said "I 
don't believe the city did any­
thing wrong. , 

"If s a shame that this is go­
ing to cloud the issue that will 
come before us on July 2." 
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POINTER OF INTEREST 

George Cassar of Grosse Pointe Shores likes to talk about death and 
taxes. Except he turns the normally morbid topics into positives through 

\ what he calls "life legacy management." 

Attorney helps plan for life after death 
ByKathyltyan 
Spedai Writer 

Grosse Pointe Shores resi­
dent George Cassar knows it's 
not the most pleasant topic a 
family can talk about, but he 
also knows what can happen 
if they don't. 

As a lawyer who specializes 
in estate planning and taxes, 
he wants individuals and fam­
ilies to know that with careful 
planning, they can guarantee 
that families and legacies will 
be carefully tended, that wish­
es will be adhered to, and that 
all a person has worked for 
will endure. 

But first he wants people to 
rethink how they view death 
and estates. In fact, he has re­
named estate planning "living 
legacy management," 

"People hesitate to discuss 
death and wills and bequests 
because they see it as such a 
depressing topic," he ex­
plained. "But I want people to 
think of it in terms of leaving a 
living legacy, to be actively in­
volved in the planning for 
what will happen to their as­
sets when they are gone. 
Estate planning is the most 
selfless thing you can do. It's 
not for you, but for your fami­
ly. It will give you peace of 
mind, knowing that you have 
planned carefully for their fu­
ture." 

Cassar says the most impor­
tant document a person can 
have is a trust, and it should 
cover three important areas: 
distribution of financial as­
sets, real property like houses 
or collections and final med-

PHOTO BY KATHY RYAN 

When not cruising on his Harley or in his restored 1967 Camaro, George Cassar encourages families to discuss death, taxes and "life legacy management" 

ical wishes. 
"A trust is a living docu­

ment," Cassar explained. 
"The important thing to re­
member,, is that.it can be 
changed as your circum­

stances change." 
A trust differs from a will in 

that assets are transferred in­
to a trust before death, so that 
probate court is avoided. It al­
so allows an individual to 
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grant power of attorney to a 
spouse, child, lawyer or some­
one who can make decisions 
in the event the person is inca­
pacitated. 

"A power of attorney gives 
someone the ability to act on 
your behalf both financially 
and medically," Cassar ex­
plained. "Most doctors today 
encourage patients to enact a 
power of attorney, so that 
there is no question when end 
of life medical decisions need 
to be made." 

Cassar also explained that a 
spouse might not be the best 
person to be granted power of 
attorney. 

"No one knows when a 
medical emergency will oc­
cur," he explained. "I've had 
spouses tell me that they 
know they won't be in any 
condition to be making deci­
sions regarding an ill spouse, 
so they want someone else 
named. But it is while some­
one is healthy that these deci­
sions need to be made. It's not 
the most pleasant thing to 
think about, but once people 
do establish these things, it 
gives them a great deal of 
peace of mind." 

Assets transferred into a 
trust can be homes, business­
es and collections, anything of 
value. Trusts can also be used 
to establish legacies, some­
thing individuals can use to 
continue charitable works 
they began in their lifetimes. 

"I've known families that 
have established scholarship 
funds, and rather than just 
awarding the money, estab­
lished a program whereby the 
family would come together 
to help determine the winner 
of the scholarship. What a 
true living legacy a' program 

like that is, because not only 
does it help people, it brings 
the family together to do 
something good in the name 
of their loved one, and serves 
as a lasting reminder." 

Cassar stresses that living 
legacy management is not just 
for the very wealthy, but 
something everyone, no mat­
ter age or financial standing, 
should do. 

And while the vast majority 
of trusts cover standard items 
like distribution of financial 
assets or dividing up shares of 
a family business, Cassar is 
seeing trusts used in creative 
ways as well. 

"It used to be that people 
would leave money in a will to 
a friend or relative to ensure 
that a pet was taken care of, 
and it wasn't unusual for the 
pet to meet an early end," he 
said with a laugh. "A trust will 
ensure that the pet lives a long 
and happy life." 

Cottages are now showing 
up more often in trusts. 

"People can be very at­
tached for sentimental rea­
sons to a family cottage, and 
want to keep it in the family 
for children and grandchil­
dren. Trusts can be created 
that will make sure the up­
keep and taxes on a family 
cottage are covered for sever­
al years, or be very specific 
about the sale of the proper­
ty." 

While some people find 
death, estates and taxes less 
than exciting topics, Cassar 
has been interested since tak­
ing a tax law class at Drake 
University in Des Moines, 
Iowa. 

"I had a wonderful profes­
sor for a tax law class who 
made me want to learn more. 

My interest in tax law eventu­
ally led me to financial plan­
ning, and I knew I wanted to 
help people plan for some­
thing good." -j 
" After graduating law 
school, he returned to Grosse 
Pointe, where he had spent 
most of his childhood. 

He attended Our Lady Star 
of the Sea for grade school 
and graduated from Notre 
Dame High School in 1989. 
He went to the University of 
Michigan, graduating with a 
degree in psychology in 1993, 
before heading to Drake for 
law school. 

His wife, Carolyn, also at­
tended U-M, graduating with 
a pharmacy degree. They re-

. turned from their honeymoon 
the day before he joined the 
law firm of Maddin, Hauser, 
Wartell, Roth & Heller in 
Southfield as an associate. He 
is now a shareholder in the 
firm and a partner at home as 
well, sharing parental duties 
for Mia, 4, and Robert John, 2 
V2. 

Cassar is looking forward.to 
summer and spending time 
on his boat, a 38-foot Wellcnift 
Scarab. When he's not out on 
the water, he's on the road, on 
either his favorite "toy," a "Fat 
Boy" Harley-Davidson, or in 
the 1967 Camaro convertible 
he has lovingly restored. 

But planning for the future 
is never far off his agenda. 

"It's not the easiest thing for 
people to talk about," he said. 
"But living legacy manage­
ment will give people peace of 
mind and make sure their 
wishes are followed. Planning 
now will avoid so many prob­
lems later. And isn't that what 
you want for your family? 
Peace of mind?" 
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GROSSE POINTE PARK 

Interpretation unchanged 
ByBethQuinn 
StaffWriter 

When is a thoroughfare a 
thoroughfare? 

That is the question brought 
before the Gross e Pointe 
Park's Zoning Board of 
Appeals for a second time by 
attorneys Jason Webber and 
Melissa Hollingsworth. 

They are representing 
Webber's brother, Mayce E.C. 
"Chris" Webber̂  who wants to 
erect a 101.75-foot by 40-foot 
addition to his existing home, 
located in the 16600 block of 
Jefferson. 

"Chris is an avid swimmer. 
He would like to swim year 
round," Jason Webber said. 
"He wants to add an indoor 
swimming pool with a lounge." 

City ordinances require the 
yard on the water side be 
maintained, open and unob-
scured. This structure would 

encroach into that space, ac­
cording to Park Building 
Inspector Ron Carmona. . 

In addition, an ordinance 
states a parcel must have water 
frontage and abut a public 
thoroughfare. 

In June of 2006, the board 
voted 6-1 to deny a variance 
based on its interpretation of 
the code. 

According to city attorney 
Dennis Levasseur, the issue 
has once again been brought in 
front of the zoning board be­
cause Webber want to appeal 
the decision with the Wayne 
Circuit Court. 

Circuit Court Judge Michael 
Callahan wants a transcipt of a 
court record and not just city 
council minutes before consid­
ering the case. 

Hollingsworth and Jason 
Webber contend that Chris 
Webber's property does not 
abut a public thoroughfare; so 

that section of the ordinance 
does not apply to his property. 

They contend the property is 
landlocked and that the addi­
tion would not impede the view 
of neighbors, including those 
on the adjacent street, Bishop. 

"The property doesn't abut 
Jefferson, even though that is 
his street address," 
Hollingsworth said. "It's legally 
not his property." 

Many neighbors living next 
to the Webbers and on Bishop 
were present at the meeting or 
sent letters voicing their con­
cern that the addition would 
obstruct their view of the wa­
ter. 

"Our house has a view of the 
lake which will be destroyed," 
said Sally Ubeck of Bishop 
Lane. 

Hollingsworth contends the 
new addition would abut the 
dead end portion of Bishop, 
leaving the water side of the 
property open and unobstruct­

ed. 
"The real issue here is 

whether the property abuts a 
thoroughfare," said Levasseur. 
"The neighbor's letters of dis­
pleasure have no relevance to 
the variance.". 

Levasseur continued that 
the city looked at the property 
in terms of general uses and 
concluded it does touch a thor­
oughfare. 

"Bishop is a thoroughfare in 
common usage as defined by 
the Webster Dictionary," 
Levasseur said. 

There is an easement on the 
Webber's property which 
abuts Jefferson, even though 
there is another property in be­
tween Webber's home and 
Jefferson, he said. 

As it did last year, the zoning 
board voted 6-1 to deny the 
variance based on its interpre­
tation of the code. 

The Webbers most likely will 
appeal the decision. 

Cut summertime 
vacation costs 

Advanced planning is the 
key to cutting vacation costs. 
The better you plan your next 
vacation, the better your 
chances to save. 

AAA suggests the following 
tips to stretch vacation dollars: 

• Choose an experienced 
travel agent. Agencies work for 
you, not individual airlines or 
hotels, to find the lowest air­
fares and rates. 

• Book early. Begin planning 
at least four to six months in 
advance. For the best savings 
on cruise and tour reserva­
tions, book six to eight months 
before your departure. 

• Ask about special promo­
tions. Hotels sometimes offer 
free upgrades or price dis­
counts. Your travel agent can 
also identify specials through 
participating tour companies. 

The secret to lower airfares 
is also in the planning: 

• Book early. Lower airfares 

are more likely when travel is 
booked as far in advance as 
possible. 

Some ideas to consider: 
• Choose an alternate air­

port. Flying in and out of near­
by, but less popular airports 
can often save hundreds of dol­
lars. 

• Experiment with travel 
dates. Flying Monday through 

.Thursday offers chej ^ ___ 
:-- than weekend travef "During 
holidays, consider flying on the 
holiday itself, such as 
Thanksgiving or New Year's 
Day 

• Fly "red-eye." Late night or 
"red-eye" fares are often con­
siderably less expensive than 
morning or afternoon flights., 

. • Consider layovers. Direct-
to-your-destination flights are 
most convenient and, usually, 
most costly. If time permits, 
consider an airport layover or 
connection. 

® Scarless Breast Augmentation 
• Liposuction © Mini Facelifts 

• Endermoiogie • Tummy Tuck 
® Penile Enlargement 

, © Age Management 
• Hyperbaric'® Thermage 

• Natural Hormone Replacement 

Dr. Robert Grafton, M.D. 
Board Certified Plastic Surgeon, 

Over 20 Years Experience 

555 Barclay Circle, Ste. 140 • Rochester Hills 

6 248-299-6228 
for a free consultaion 

GROSSE POINTE WOODS 

Out with the old, in with the new 
ByBethQuinn 
StaffWriter 

With a little help from her 
friends, JoAnn Hinds of Grosse 
Pointe Woods will get the new 
fence she has been wanting for 
several years. 

Having once a permit appli­
cation denied, Hinds attended 
the June 4 city council meeting 
fully armed with pictures, 
brochures and neighbors sup­
porting her request for a fence 
variance. She wants to build a 

5.5 foot privacy fence along the 
south and west side lot lines of 
her property. 

Her previous request for 
variance was denied as it vio­
lated a city code requiring that 
50 percent of the fence height 
and width consist of 2 inch 
openings. 

A solid fence with a lattice 
top was proposed. 

In her most recent applica­
tion for a permit, Hinds wrote 
that she was unable to find a 
fence meeting the require­

ments that is of high quality or 
in the redwood color she de­
sires. 

This time around, Hinds 
came armed with a petition 
signed by her neighbors re­
questing the council grant her 
a variance to install a redwood 
color vinyl privacy fence with a 
lattice top. She also included 
photos showing her "existing 
fence that is worn, leaning and 
showing it's 25-plus years," 
and copies of the brochure de­
scribing the proposed fence. 

At the meeting, several 
neighbors urged the council to 
give Hinds permission to in­
stall the proposed fence. 

"The new fence mat JoAnn 
was to put up would enhance 
the neighborhood's looks," 
said neighbor George Graham. 

The council unanimously ap­
proved the Hind's request for a 
variance. 

Work on the replacement 
fence must start in six months 
and be completed within one 
year. 

| Up close, in person 
Wayne County Sheriffs Department hosts an open house from 10 a.m. to 2 p.m., Saturday, June 30 

at Mounted Unit Barn, on Hines Drive just west of Newburgh Road in Iivonia. Area residents will 

have an opportunity to spend time with Michigan's only full time mounted police unit and it's hors­

es. The event is free and refreshments will be available. 

}f 6/13/07. Customers without a "Loyalty Checking Account" will receive the Valued Customer rate of 5.19% 
APY on the H-montn w. Minimum opening deposit requirement is $500 and maximum deposit is $100,000. Deposits are allowed only on the maturity date 
or during the grace period. Account fees could reduce earnings. Penalty may be imposed for early withdrawal. Not available for public units. Other restrictions 
may apply. "Customer must maintain ah open and active checking account at Flagstar Bank'with at least one automatic, recurring transaction monthly to 
qualify for the Loyalty Program. "Loyalty Checking Account" rate offer cannot be combined with coupons or other special offers. 
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The Eastsi|e Republican 
Club will hold its fifth annual 
family picnic from 1 to 3 p.m. 
Sunday, June 24, at Patterson . 
Park, Grosse Pointe Park. 

The Eastside Republican 
Club will provide a free lunch 
of grilled hotdogs and ham­
burgers to members an#, their 
families. 

Also available will be a ma­
gician, playscape, children's 
pool, tennis courts and vari­
ous games. 

These events promise to en^ 
tertain both children' and 
adults in the crowd: \ 

Guests are requested to\ 
bring their own non-alcoholic \ 
beverages and a dish to pass. 

All area residents are wel­
come to attend the afternoon's 
festivities. 

To register, call Peggy 
Hennigan by Friday June 22, 
at (313) 822-0281. 
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Waiting for the big ©ne 
The annual Jack Boni Family Perch Derby at Lake Front Park in Grosse Pointe Woods was quite a 

catch on Saturday, June 16. More than 125 residents enjoyed the picture perfect day to drop a line 

in Lake St. Clair in search of yellow perch. Jimmy Passalacqua, of Grosse Pointe Woods, above, is 

demonstrating the much-needed trait for anglers—patience—while waiting for his catch. Dozens 

of area children participated in the Family Perch Derby on Lake St. Clair, fishing for the biggest and 

best catch of the afternoon.Parks and Recreation Director Melissa Sharp said this is one of the best 

events of the year at the park and it draws anglers of all ages for-an afternoon of fun. 

HOUR MAGAZINE 

Farms establishes 
a park for dogs 

Grosse Pointe Farms has es­
tablished a dog park at the 
back of the parking lot behind 
Kroger near the corner of 
Mack and Moross. 

The following rules have 
been recommended: 

• Dogs must be licensed and 
registered and a dog pass is re­
quired for entrance. 

• Permits are available 
through the parks and recre­
ation department. The dog 
owner must complete an appli­
cation and sign a liability waiv­
er. 

• Dog owners must clean up 
after their pets and are respon­
sible for their pets at all times. 

• Dog owners must be resi­

dents of the Farms. . 
• Dogs must be on leashes 

until they are confined in the 
park. 

• Aggressive dogs are not 
permitted in the park and they 
must be removed at their first 
sign of aggression. 

• Dogs must be accompa­
nied by an adult 

• There is a limit of two dogs 
per owner. 

• Children under five years 
old may not enter the park 

• Dogs in heat and puppies 
under four months are not al­
lowed. 

• Dog park permits can be 
canceled for non-compliance 
to the rules. 
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EDITORIAL 

Smell test 
in the Woods 

A
s Grosse Pointe News cartoonist Phil 
Hands implies in this week's sketch, 
something does not smell right in Grosse 
Pointe Woods, and it is not just the fish 
flies. 

Boat dock renters at the Woods Lake 
Front Park marina raised a stink last 
week about being assessed a $130 dredg­

ing fee this year and next year for the channel work completed 
last fall. The boaters cried foul, claiming they have been paying 
increased slip rental fees for a decade in order to pay for the 
dredging. 

We have heard these types of complaints many times from 
disgruntled taxpayers, but in this case, it turns out the boaters 
were right. They were being double-dipped. 

In fact, the city council acknowledged as much last week 
when, in an uncharacteristic move, it voted to refund boaters 
their $130 dredging fee assessed this year, due June 1, and re­
scinded the $ 130 dredging fee scheduled for next year.., 

The city will pay for last fall's $72,000 dredging work with 
surplus funds from the parks budget and with some money 
from the general fund. The city council also directed City 
Administrator Mark Wollenweber to examine the parks and 
marina funds for the past three to five years. 

Boaters claim they have been subsidizing the parks and 
recreation fund and •other city services through boat slip rental 
fees. Hopefully, Mr. Wollenweber's audit of the books will de­
termine if the boaters are correct. 

Some of the boat slip fees was supposed to be put in an en­
terprise fund in order to pay for anticipated dredging costs. 
However, when the city went to do the work, no money had 
been set aside. 

Former city Controller Cliff Maison — who resigned in 
March when he was found allegedly taking gasoline from the 
city pumps and is being investigated by the Michigan State 
Police for other possible alleged wrongdoing — is being 
blamed for the dredging fund fiasco. 

Apparently, the former city financial officer used the dredg­
ing money collected over the years to pay for other city ex­
penses. When the dredging bill came due, he hoped the 
boaters had short memories and recommended the $130, two-
year special levy be passed on to the dock renters. The boaters, 
however, do have good memories and justifiably protested. 

Of course, Mr. Maison is no longer with the city and his side 
of the story has yet to be told. 

The dredging mess comes On the heels of the Cook 
Schoolhouse scandal where senior housing developer Sunrise 
was accused of offering to pay $9,000 toward a new cedar roof 
for the recently acquired historic building in Ghesquiere Park. 
Sunrise also was reported to have promised to pay $20,000 to­
ward a new city ambulance. 

The allegations stem from rumors and an e-mail from Mr. 
Wollenweber to Councilman Pete Waldmeir, who questioned 
whether the rumors were true. 

Laura Hestor, senior vice president of development for 
Sunrise, took umbrage to the accusations and demanded an 
investigation. Upon questioning all the parties involved, the 
city determined that it was a city official, Gene Tutag of the 
building department, who asked Sunrise if it would be willing 
to fund the schoolhouse and ambulance. Ms. Hester reportedly 
responded that it would not be a good time, for Sunrise to get 
involved since her-company was seeking a variance for a se­
nior community at the current site of Vernier Terrace 
Apartments. 

Mayor Robert Novitke said that while he does not think the 
city did anything wrong and that it did not "lean" on anyone to 
contribute toward city projects, he is nevertheless "disturbed" 
that a city official would solicit contributions from a developer. 

Meanwhile, city administrators are scouring the books to see 
what other runds may have been moved around while borrow­
ing from Peter to pay Paul. 

This comes at a time when the Ad Hoc Recreation Bond 
Committee is looking at ways to spend a recreation bond re­
newal that will be on the November general election ballot. 
The bond was last approved by voters in 1996. 

Ideas for a new recreation bond, if approved by voters, in­
clude an indoor playscape, a family changing room arid an 
aquatic splash pad. The city council recently hired an architect 
and a construction adviser to develop a long-term master plan 
for all of the parks. 

The city has spent $1.3 million of the future bond money for 
a new liner and other improvements to the Lake Front Park 
swimming pool. The work was paid for with bond anticipation 
notes approved by the city council last summer. 

With all the questions being raised concerning the boating 
fees, parks and recreation funds and city finances in general, 
we might suggest Grosse Pointe Woods administrators get 
their financial house in order before going to taxpayers to 
dredge up even more funds to misappropriate. 

OUR STAFF 
EDITORIAL 
(313) 882-0294 
Chuck Klonke: Sports Editor 
Ann Fbuty: Acting Features 
Editor 
Bob S t John: Staff Writer 
Beth Qulnn: StaffWHter 
JohnLundberg: Staff Writer 
Diane Morelli: 
Editorial Assistant 
Debra Pascoe: Copy Editor 
Suzanne Swanson: Proofreader 

CLASSIFIED 
(313)882-6900 
Barbara Yazbeck Vetnacke: 
Manager 
ftanVelawio: 

Melanie Mahoney 
JessfcaNatsctake 

POINTE 
NEWS GROUP 

Member SuburBan 
NewspopersafAmerlcaand • 
National Nw&paperAssoclation 

PRODUCTION 
(313)882-6090 

Ken Scoop 
Production Manager 
GregBartosiewicz 
David Hughes 
Pat Tapper 
Penny Derrick 
Carol Jarraan 
MarySeaJager 

CffiCULMIQN 
(313)343-5577 
Amy Conrad: Manager 
Cheryl Locknart 

DISPIAYADVERI1SING 
(313)882-3500 
Peter Jf.Birkner; 
Advertising Manager 
Kathleen M- Stevenson: 

Julie R. Sutton: 

KenGOng: 

Sally Sehuman; 
Administrative Assistant 

PHIL HANDS 
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Historic building 
to be demolished 
To the Editor: 

The cash donors, who con­
tributed to a restricted fund for 
moving the Clinton Grove 
Caretakers House out of the 
Clinton Grove Cemetery, will 
finally be able to get their do­
nations back, 

On June 6, letters and bills 
from the donors were present­
ed to the historical group that 
had abandoned the project in 
May 2006. 

We wish to thank our major 
contributors: Community 
Central and LaSalle Banks, 
Nickel & Saph, as well all the 
other donors for their patience. 

Our sincere appreciation 
goes to Former Macomb 
County Prosecutor Carl 
Marlinga for the dignified way 
in which he represented us. 

Special thanks to Clinton 
Township Supervisor Robert 
Cannon for his continued sup­
port of our historic preserva­
tion efforts, and to the Clinton 
Township Department of 

Public Works for the fine job 
they do in maintaining the 
buildings in the historic park. 

The first two cash donors to 
the project, from Clinton 
Township, received their re­
funds last June as required by 
Win Sowerby, Clinton 
Township treasurer. 

The fate of the oldest and on­
ly home on the National and 
State Historic Registers in 
Clinton Township with much 
public, private and grant sup­
port available willing to save it 
for public use, has fallen on the 
deaf ears of the nine board of 
directors of Clinton Grow 
Cemetery. The board has votetj 
to demolish it rather than allow 
it to become a living museum 
for the community. 

CAROLLYNNANDREN 
Director 

Clinton Grove House 
Preservation Project, Inc. 

Macomb 
ALANMARSCHKE 

Assistant Director 
Grosse Pointe Farms 

In praise of multiple 
talents 
l b the Editor: 

The Pointer of Interest arti­
cle, "Canvas reflect his expe­
rience" (June 14 Grosse 
Pointe News), on Michel 
Pilorget bought back memo­
ries of decades ago when he 
was among the definitive 
landscapers in our communi­
ty 

This is just a short note in 
further praise of his multiple 
talents. 

Michel also brought to his 
^landscaping work the heart of 
Ihe artist. For man£ years he 
created the landscape for my 
Grosse Pointe Park waterside 
property. 

He accomplished his work 
with such talent that as the 
lucky recipient of his efforts, I 
was able to stroll amongst the 
surroundings of a French 
landscape in Grosse Pointe. 

LARRY CHARFOOS 
Grosse Pointe Woods 

VIEWPOINT ON PUBLIC ISSUES By Kenneth M. Braun 

'Tax Hiker's Shopping Guide' 
"The $112 million in loop­

holes recommendedfor elimi­
nation by the governor would 
go a long way towards balanc­
ing the budget without sacrific­
ing critical services to the poor­
est of ihe poor. There are 170 
tax expenditures in Michigan's 
tax code that cost taxpayers 
over $29 billion a year." 

—Press release from Gov. 
Jennifer Granholm's office, 

June 9,2005 

T
he above statement 
cites one of the most 
malicious docu­
ments produced by 
state government: 

the Michigan Department of 
Treasury's annual "Executive 
Budget Appendix on Tax 
Credits, Deductions and 
Exemptions." 

Rather than a tally of taxpay­
er "costs," the document is in 
fact a listing of where residents 
are being spared major tax in­
creases. Under truth-in-adver­
tising guidelines, this report 
should be renamed, the "Tax 
Hiker's Shopping Guide." 

An example of its damaging 
impact can be found on page 
49 of the 2007 edition, which 
contains many of the items on 
the governor's recent proposal 
for an unprecedented $ 1.5 bil­
lion tax on services. 

The "Tax Hiker's Shopping 
Guide" talks about taxpayers 
keeping their own money as if 
it's an example of pork-barrel 
spending. A reader can quickly 
forget who earned the money 
in the first place when reading 
it: 

"Tax expenditures can be de­
fined broadly as the tax rev­
enue foregone as a result of 
preferential provisions such as 

"Tax expenditures can be defined broadly as 
the tax revenue foregone as a result of 
preferential provisions such as credits, 
deductions, exemptions, deferrals, exclusions 
or lower tax rates.... For economicpurposes, it 
makes no difference whether a policy objective 
is pursued through direct spending or through 
the tax code" 

credits, deductions, exemp­
tions, deferrals, exclusions or 
lower tax rates. These provi­
sions are tax expenditures be­
cause, like appropriations, they 
allocate resources for specific 
public purposes, but do so 
through the tax system rather 
than the expenditure system. 
For economic purposes, it 
makes no difference whether a 
policy objective is pursued 
through direct spending or 
through the tax code." 

In other words, the "econom­
ic purpose" of your money is to 
accomplish what state govern­
ment wants to do. Whether this 
happens by way of you spend­
ing the money or the govern­
ment doing it for you is a mere 
detail. 

The document represents an 
audacious government wish 
list. While it included about $29 
billion in potential tax hikes 
when the governor spoke of it 
in 2005, the 2007 version con­
tains just over $31 billion— 
enough to more than double 
the annual amount of money 
taken from Michigan resi­
dents. 

First created in 1979, the re­
port states that getting politi­
cians to consider tax hikes is its 

reason for existence: "It is de­
signed to aid policymakers in 
evaluating the effitiehcy,effec-
tiveness and relative impor­
tance of each tax expenditure." 

Mission accomplished: The 
governor seriously promoted 
—and the Legislature serious­
ly considered—imposing a 
$1.5 billion service excise tax , 
this year. Fortunately, Michigan 
taxpayers were far less enthu­
siastic about it and the service 
tax—which would have cost 
an estimated 19,000 jobs in its 
first 18 months of existence— 
appears to be tabled. 

The rest of the avaricious list 
details a tax increase idea for 
nearly every economic transac­
tion: 

• The state constitution pro­
hibits a sales tax on food and 
prescription drugs, yet the 
"Tax Hiker's Shopping Guide" 
still fantasizes about the $1.65 
billion such a tax would gener­
ate. 

• In one of its more macabre 
moments, the guide mentions 
an extra $50 million the state 
would gain if it went after or­
thopedic products such as arti-
ficiarlimbs and eyes. 

• The governor excluded 
health care and social assis­

tance from her 2 percent ser­
vice tax proposal, but the guide 
notes that a full 6 percent levy 
on these activities would ding 
taxpayers an additional $5.2 
billion. 

• State coffers could swell by 
$ 1.8 billion if pension benefits, 
IRAs, worker's compensation, 
health insurance premiums, ; 
veteran's benefits and Social 
Security payments were taxed. 

• The state could get another 
$69.5 million if it repealed the. 
sales tax "loophole" on tap wa­
ter purchases. 

• While killing the home­
stead property tax exemption 
for hdmes and farms would fat­
ten state coffers by $4 billion, 
just removing the partial iri-
come tax deduction for home-

. stead property tax payments 
would net more than $860 mil­
lion. 

This is not an exhaustive list. 
Other examples of state covet­
ing are detailed in plots to tax 
charities, education, the federal 
government and much more. 
The mere existence of such a 
report creates the clear impres­
sion that Michigan's political 
class views the private wealth 
of taxpayers as its personal 
piggy bank. 

If state lawmakers and the 
governor consider 
Michiganians more than mere 
cash cows, they should stop 
reading the "Tax Hiker's 
Shopping Guide" and get to 
work on abolishing it. 

Kenneth M. Braun is a policy 
analyst specializing in fiscal 
and budgetary issues for the 
Mackinac Center for Public 
Policy, a research and educa­
tional institute based in 
Midland. 
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OP-ED 

I SAY By Bob St John 

Walking for mom and a cure for cancer 

M 
y family and I 
walked three 
miles up and 
around 
Comerica Park 

last weekend in support of our 
mother, Florence, a breast 
cancer survivor, and to help 
raise money for cancer re­
search. 

We were part of approxi­
mately 30,000 people who 
walked and ran during the 
16th annual Race for the 

Cure. 
Cancer survivors donned a 

pink shirt, while the rest of us 
wore white t-shirts or other 
colorful displays of team spir­
it. It's an emotional day for 
everyone associated with the 
Race for the Cure. 

There is a survivor's tent for 
the hundreds of men, women 
and children who were hon­
ored for beating cancer. 

It's also a time to mourn and 
reflect on the thousands who 
die each year at the hands of a 
disease that hopefully one day 
will vanish. 

The starting line was 
Woodward Avenue right in 
front of Comerica Park. 

The runners were the first 
to leave, followed by the 
swarm of us who took the 

leisurely path of less resis­
tance, walking the 1.5 miles 
north before turning back and 
returning to the front of the 
Detroit Tigers' home. 

It was a beautiful morning 
that turned steamy once the 
humidity hit us near the half­
way mark. 

Unfortunately for my mom, 
she isn't able to walk the route 
due to severe arthritis in her. 
lower back and ankles. 

It doesn't really matter if 
she walked or not. My dad, 
Joe, my brother-in-law, Jody, 
and I took turns pushing my 
mom along Woodward in her 
wheelchair. 

My mom's mission to beat 
cancer started a few years 
ago. She recently celebrated 
her one-year anniversary of 

being medically "cancer free." 
I have witnessed her fight 

first-hand. Losing her hair 
during chemotherapy and 
then enduring months of radi­
ation eradicated her cancer. 

The aggressive treatment 
plan kicked cancer's butt, but 
the side effects my mom en­
dures have suppressed her 
body, but not her will. 

It's tough to see my mom 
struggle to walk due to her 
arthritis and to see her body 
being pushed and pulled by 
the ugly side effects. 

She still says the tough days 
are lined with the love she 
feels to as she declares, "be 
alive to see my five grandchil­
dren graduate from college." 

Her inner fight is awesome. 
It's inspiring. It's worth push­

ing the extra mile to battle 
through my seemingly uphill 
battles that are just tiny 
bumps compared to her 
Mount Everest. 

I try not to get discouraged, 
but at least I can stand tall 
with a healthy body. 

This event is part of a na­
tional series of races orga­
nized by the Susan G. Komen 
for the Cure breast cancer 
foundation and sponsored lo­
cally by the Barbara Ann 
Karmanos Cancer Institute. 

Race officials say this year's 
race will generate around $2 
million with most of that be­
ing put to use fulfilling the 
screening and treating of 
breast cancer patients. 

Statistics show about 
180,000 people nationwide 

will be diagnosed with breast 
cancer just this year alone. Of 
those, nearly 41,000 will die 
from the disease. 

It's not a fair fight, but at 
least thousands beat the dis­
ease using medicine, prayer 
or whatever method they 
choose.. 

I have lost two relatives to 
cancer and two is enough. 

I'm happy my wife, Heather, 
and daughter, Emma, walked 
the three miles with me in 
support of my mother — 
Heather's mother-in-law and 
Emma's grandmother. 

Mom, I will always be at 
your side, doing whatever you 
need to keep you going 
strong. 

Mom, I just want to let you 
know, I love you. 

STREETWISE ByReneeLanduyt 

June 21 is the 
first day of 
summer. What 
is your favorite 
summertime 
activity? 
If you have a question you 
would like asked, drop us a 
note at 96 Kercheval on The 
Hill in Grosse Pointe Farms, Ml 
48236 or e-mail to editor® 
grossepointenews.com 
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'Definitely the Slip 
and Slide. Any water 
activity' 
CARLYVERKUILEN 
Grosse Pointe Farms 

'Going up north and 
wake boarding.' 
JAKEBIELACCIZ 
City of Grosse Pointe 

'I like seeing nature 
change from the dor­
mant state of winter 
into spring and sum­
mer as it comes alive 
with color.' 
MIKEDECRANE 
HarperWoods 
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'Definitely rock 
climbing, especially 
out west.' 
ADAMWNTON 
Royal Oak 

'My favorite is going 'I like camping and 
to Tiger games.' swimming.' 
TREVORJUJF HANNAHCHILEN 
Grosse Pointe Shores City of Grosse Pointe 

FYI By Ben Burns 

t <r • 

T
odd Clements saw 
his first ghost when 
he was about 12 
years old on 
Mackinac Island. 

Clements was walking at 
the Mission Point Resort and 
saw the figure of a person. 

"But I could see through 
him as though he were a mist 
or a swarm of bugs," Clements 
recalled. "The figure was there 
for a very short time, and I 
was not able to share my 
sighting with anyone else." 
. Clements, 33, of the Woods, 
later learned that particular 
specter is called "Harvey," a 
Mackinac College student 
who when his love for a young 
woman was not returned, 
threw himself off the bluffs 
behind Mission Point. Harvey 
still reportedly makes appear­
ances to this day at numerous 
spots around the resort. 

That sighting sparked a life­
long interest in the unex­
plained. About 3 1/2 years ago, 
Clements and his wife, Nina, 

were visiting Mackinac on a 
typical October day. "The 
weather was dreadful (rain, 
snow, etc.,), so we spent a lot 
of time indoors." 

They ended up at the Island 
Book Store, and Clements 
asked the counter person if 
they had any books with ghost 
stories. She showed them 
what they had, but none was 
exclusively about island 
hauntings. 

"That gave me an idea to 
write what I wanted to read, 
and the book 'Haunts of 
Mackinac, Ghost Stories, 
Legends, & Tragic Tales of 
Mackinac Island' was born." 

The 161-page volume in­
cludes the 10 deadly ship­
wrecks that dot the straits 
around the island and has 
chapters like "The Woman 
Who Weeps," "Skull Cave," 
"The Ghostly Soldier of Rifle 
Range Trail," "The Murder of 
Frances Lacey" and "The 
Mission House Ghosts." 

Clements includes at the 
end of each story a Haunts & 
Ghost Activity Scale charting 
the most recent sightings, the 
strength of the activity and the 
frequency of the activity. 

Clements advises readers 
the stories in the book are for 
entertainment purposes only, 
and while he has attempted to 

Todd Clements 

relay historical facts, some in­
formation provided by individ­
uals is not verifiable. He ad­
monishes amateur ghost 
hunters to "never trespass on 
private property and do not 
engage in activities that could 
be considered unwise or dan­
gerous." 

He also advises in a chapter 
titled "What is a Ghost?" that 
the first thing you have to real­
ize is that ghosts don't know 
they are dead. 

Clements attended Grosse 
Pointe North, finished high 
school through home school­
ing and graduated from the 
University of Michigan in 

1997 with a degree focused on 
psychology, communications 
and marketing. 

He published the book him­
self through House of 
Hawthorne Publishing be­
cause with his sales and mar­
keting background, "I knew 
the Mackinac book was going 
to do well." 

The first and second print­
ings were 500 each, but both 
sold out in two months. A 
third printing of 1,000 lasted 
through winter 2006-07; a 
fourth printing of 5,000 is on 
its way out various doors in­
cluding that bookstore on 
Mackinac that sparked the 
idea. 

You may meet Clements 
from 10 a.m. to 4 p.m. this 
Friday and Saturday at the 
Children's Home of Detroit* 
where he will be signing 
books as part of the Grosse 
Pointe Garden Walk. The 
$14.95 volume is also avail­
able at Borders or through 
todd@hauntsofmackinac.com 
with additional shipping 
charges. 

'Grosse Pointe* 
The publication date has 

been set for Sept. 17 by 
Arcadia Press for Suzy 
Berschback's second book, 
"Grosse Pointe, Then and 

Now." This time the photogra­
pher and curator of the Grosse 
Pointe Historical Society 
teamed with Ann Marie 
Aliotta, editor of the society's 
newsletter, to produce what is 
described as an affectionate, 
amusing look at how the area 
has changed and how it has 
stayed the same. 

Berschback's first book, 
"Grosse Pointe 1880-1930," 
published in 2001, is noWin its 
sixth printing. She compiled 
that one with Madeleine 
Socia. 

This book links the early 
days in the 1880s with the 
Grosse Pointe of today and in­
cludes chapters on the Village, 
the Hill, Mack Avenue, resi­
dences and streets, mansions, 
farms and subdivisions. 

It will be available at local 
book stores and other retail 
outlets. 

Instant history 
Who said historians are 

stuck on the past? It certainly 
doesn't apply to the Park's 
Bob Bury, executive director 
of the Detroit Historical 
Museum. 

The museum's latest exhibit 
honors Tiger sophomore 
Justin Verlander's no-hit 
pitching gem on June 12, the 
first no-hitter at Comerica 

Park. The exhibit will also 
honor the five other no-hitters 
in the 107-year history of the 
Tigers. 

If you have memorabilia 
from any of those no-hit 
games by Jack Morris 084), 
Jim Bunning C58), Virgil 
Trucks (two in '52) or George 
Mullin (' 12) and are willing to 
donate it or loan it to the 
Detroit Historical Museum, 
call Tracy Smith, director of 
exhibitions and programs at 
(313)833-1405. 

Meanwhile, if you want to 
share in the excitement of 
Verlander's accomplishment, 
you can see a ball from the 
game; a scorecard, program 
and ticket stub from the game; 
an '06 Verlander World Series 
uniform jersey and a framed 
photo and pitching rubber 
signed by Verlander. The dis­
play will also include photos 
and memorabilia of the other 
Tiger no-hit pitchers through, 
Sunday, July 8. 

Youngsters under 17 wear­
ing Tiger gear will be admitted 
free. 

Ben Burns of the City of 
Grosse Pointe is director of the 
journalism program at Wayne 
State University. Be can be 
reached at 
burnsben@comcast.net or by 
phone at (313) 882-2810. 

VETERANS POST By Freddy Groves 

To blog or not to blog: You're in the Army now 

I
n World War II, the news 
was reported days and 
weeks after the fact in 
newspapers or as a short 
during Saturday mati­

nees. Now e-mail and blogs, 
complete with journal entries, 
comments and embedded 
videos, can go out with the tap 
of the send button. And it's 
there that the Army is drawing 
a line in the sand. 

Or is it? 
A 2005 directive outlined the 

restrictions on what service 
personnel could and could not 
do online. Army personnel 
were asked to "consult with 
their immediate supervisor" 
before they posted anything 

Army personnel were asked to "consult with their immediate supervisor" before they posted 
anything that might "contain sensitive and/or criticar information, and to register their blogs. 
Staying safe was the main focus.... And it "is not limited to letters, resumes, articles for 
publication, electronic mail (e-mail), Web site postings, Web log (blog) postings, discussion in 
Internet information forums, discussion in Internet message boards or other forms of 
dissemination or documentation." 

that might "contain sensitive 
and/or critical" information, 
and to register their blogs. 
Staying safe was the main fo­
cus. 

A new directive (Army 
Regulation 530-1) threatens to 
end nearly all online activity. 
Specifically, it requires an 

"OPSEC review prior to pub­
lishing." Period. 
,.}. And it "is not limited to let­
ters, resumes, articles for pub­
lication, electronic mail (e-
mail), Web site postings, Web 
log (blog) postings, discussion 
in Internet information fo­
rums, discussion in Internet 

message boards or other forms 
of dissemination or documen­
tation." 

Sounds pretty clear: 
Everything done online needs 
prior review. 

And yet a fact sheet issued 
later says, "In no way will 
every blog post/update a sol­

dier makes on his or her blog 
need to be monitored or first 
approved by an immediate su­
pervisor and Operations 
Security officer." 

So which is it? The directive 
that says a soldier needs to get 
permission for everything, in­
cluding e-mail? Or a fact sheet 

that says not so? In a crunch, 
which carries the most weight? 

And where does that leave 
the Operations Security officer 
commander? Hanging from a 
very thin thread, considering 
that the new directive talks 
about the punishment for fail­
ing to comply. 

It doesn't take much to real­
ize what's going to happen: 
Many commanders will flat 
out ban soldiers from blog-
ging. 

Write to Freddy Groves in 
care of King Features Weekly 
Service, P.O. Box 536475, 
Orlando, FL 32853-6475, or 
sendane-mailto 
letters.kfws@hearstsc.com. 
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OPINION 
GUEST OPINION By Lee Hamilton 

There's still room for improvement in Congress 

i n the run-up to last year's 
elections, critics of the 
House of Representatives 
and its leadership articu­
lated three broad con­

cerns. 
Fiist, they believed Congress 

had abandoned its constitu­
tionally mandated role over­
seeing the conduct of the 
Executive Branch/. 

Second, they contended the 
C3QP leadership had^allowed ^ 
lbfeb îsts and their money^b'"'"? 

become too powerful. 
Third, they condemned the 

majority for trampling on the 
right of the Democratic minori­
ty to offer meaningful alterna­
tives in legislation and debate. 

Now, as we approach the 
mid-point of the Democrats' 
first year back in control, it 
seems an apt moment to gauge 
how well the new majority is 
performing on all three fronts. 

The short answer is: some 
improvement, but still only fair. 

While the House has once 
again become a force on over­
sight and made some progress 
on lobbying and ethics reform, 
it's still got a long way to go in 
restoring balance to its internal 
procedures. 

Oversight: If you've been 
keeping up with the news, you 
know that Congress has al­
ready significantly expanded 
its oversight of the Executive 
Branch—on eveiything from 

the Iraq War to its hearings on 
the U.S. attorney firings. It is 
holding the White House and 
Cabinet officials accountable 
for their actions and decisions, 
and as a result enhancing 
Americans' ability to judge 
their government's actions. 

This is a vital improvement 
to our democracy which does 
not function well if those in 
power go unquestioned. 

•,, .^Lobbying: The-Hpuse has^ak 
' :so moved productively— 
though not as thoroughly as it 
ought to have done—on lob­
bying reform. The Abramoff 
scandals and corruption 
charges against several former 
members of Congress not only 
brought the institution itself in­
to disrepute, they also sapped 
Americans' trust that the sys­
tem could function fairly on be­
half of ordinary citizens. 
Democrats' promises of fall-
scale ethics reform were key to 
their win last fall. 

The lobby reform bill passed 
recently by the House is cer­
tainly an improvement, but it 
hardly knocks the ball out of 
the park. The House failed to 
create an independent office to 
investigate allegations of ethi­
cal improprieties; it also wa­
tered down a proposal that was 
in the initial version of the bill 
requiring that two years pass 
before a retiring House mem­
ber be allowed to lobby his or 

her former colleagues. 
And though it did require 

disclosure of lobbyists' 
"bundling" of campaign contri­
butions, that measure will un­
doubtedly face a stiff headwind 
in the House-Senate confer­
ence on the bill. 

So while the House may be 
moving in the right direction 
on ethics, issues, it has not yet 
lived up to Americans' expec­
tations of .A cornplete turn-*;,...,: 
around from what came be­
fore. 

Fair procedures: The 
Democratic majority, which 
controls the terms of debate 
and sets the parameters for 
considering legislation on the 
floor, often seems to forget how 
damaging mistreatment of the 
minority can be. It has sent far 
too many bills to the floor with­

out allowing amendments. It 
has toyed with some of the 
most egregious of the previous 
Republican majority's viola­
tions of House norms—such 
as holding open floor votes be­
yond the normal time limit so 
that the leadership can twist 
arms. Most recently it consid­
ered changing the rules to dis­
allow the so-called "motion to 
recommit," one of the few tools 
feejy^ljse minority can u§e to 
get its point across. 

Internal procedures can 
seem like unbearably arcane 
issues, of little import to most 
Americans. Nothing could be 
further from the truth. The 
goal in the House—the most 
representative institution our 
nation possesses—is to create 
a process that is fair and that 
allows the nation's business to 

be done, while also letting the 
minority present an alternative 
policy, have it debated fully, 
and then see it voted up or 
down. The way the majority 
uses the rules is a basic test of 
that fairness; if it quashes the 
minority's ability ever to have 
its alternatives heard, it flunks. 

Now, the House minority 
bears a share of responsibility, 
too. If its members are con­
stantly playing little games to 
score political points, rather 
than developing serious policy 
alternatives, then it, too, shares 
the blame for undercutting the 
civility and fairness necessary 
for the House to work. 

As congressional scholar 
Norman Ornstein put it not 
long ago, "If the minority uses 
the opportunity to offer 
amendments to exploit cyni­

cally the opening for political 
purposes, it soon will lose its 
moral high ground for object­
ing to majority restrictions on 
debate and amendments." So 
far, neither Democrats nor 
Republicans have covered 
themselves with glory on this 
front. 

The House ought to be a bea­
con of open, deliberative and 
thoroughgoing debate, an in­
stitution that truly represents 
the diversity and rair-minded 
decency of ordinary 
Americans. Let us encourage 
our representatives to make 
Congress an institution we can 
all point to with pride. 

Lee Hamilton is director of 
the Center on Congress at 
Indiana University. He was a 
member of the U.S. House of 
Representatives for 34 years. 

GUEST OPINION By Sen. Martha G. Scott 

Shortsighted 
cuts hurt people, 
make state less 
competitive *.*y 

-w •m «.' 

S
ince taking office, 
Gov. Granholm has 
resolved more than 
$4 billion in budget 
deficits. To do so, she 

has cut more than $3 billion 
from state government, more 
than any previous governor. 
Today the state government 
employs fewer people than at 
any time since the early 1970s. 

FUnding for local govern­
ments, including local police 
and fire, has been cut by $585 
million, resulting in aloss of 
more than 1,600 local police of­
ficers. 

Higher education funding 
has been cut by more than 
$250 million, forcing students, 
and families to endure double 
digit tuition increases. And 
funding for our public schools 
has been prorated twice, in­
cluding the reduction of adult 
education and gifted and tal­
ented programs, by more than 
$500 million. 

Yet Michigan's budget is 
more than $3 billion short of 
the revenue it needs to provide 
the current level of services 
over the next year. And 
Michigan's budget shortfalls 
will continue as long as we 
have declining revenues and 
increasing spending pressures 

that include the rising cost of 
health care, increased 
Medicaid and Department of 
Human Service caseloads, and 
rising prison populations. 

Tax cuts have not been 
proven to be economic stimu­
lators. State revenue peaked 
and unemployment was at its 
lowest in 1999 when income 
tax and single business tax 
rates were 12 percent and 18 
percent higher, respectively, 
than today. 

Rep. Ed Gaffney, R-Grosse 
Pointe Farms, accuses us of not 
treating taxpayers' wallets 
with respect. However, we be­
lieve vehemently in treating 
taxpayers with respect, and 
that includes protecting public 
safety, K-12 education, and 
health care for our most vul­
nerable citizens. 

This is in response to the 
Grosse Pointe News April 12 
guest column, "State spending 
needs to be curbed," fay state 
Rep. Edward Gaffney. 

Sen. Scott represents the 2nd 
Senate District, which includes 
areas of Detroit and the cities 
ofHamtramck, Harper Woods, 
Highland Park and all of the 
Grosse Pointes. She serves on 
the Senate Appropriations 
Committee. 

GROSSE POINTE WOODS 

Refuse contract on hold 
A decision regarding renewal 

of a contract with the city's 
waste hauler is taking a back 
seat. * ' 

Grosse Pointe Woods Mayor 
Robert Novitke and city coun-
tilmembers voted to send the is­
sue to a future committee of the 
whole meeting. 
" ^ have been satisfied with 

Waste Management's service, 
but when a multi-million con­
tract is presented to us, we rieed 
id have all of the information to 
•rn&icethe right decision," Wtoods 
Mayor Robert Novitke said. 

'1 don't have enough of a com­
fort zone with this issue to vote 
on it," couricilmember Vicki 
Granger said. "Getting all of the 
facts will be better in the long 
run." 

City Administrator Mark 
Wollenweber and Director of 
Public Works Joe Ahee recom­
mended the city extend its con­
tract with Waste Management 
for five years. 

Brian Conaway, Waste 
Management's community and 
municipal relations manager, 
said, '*We have given the city of 
Grosse Pointe Woods our best 
service possible and will contin­
ue our fine service." 

The Woods currently pays 
$737,841 for Waste 
Management's services. During 
year one of the new contract, 
the payment would be $738, 
251, followed by a 2 percent 
hike in years two and three and 
a 3 percent hike in the final two 
years of the contract. 
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. * ~ > V ^ GET MOBILE TO MOBILE. 
: , Enjoy the. Eargest'-roobiie tQ niobilG . '. 

•"- calling* Community, over 62 million.. 

^ TRY US RISK-FREE. 
if'you aren't completely satisfied, 
you can gel out of your contract. 

^ EXPERIENCE THE NETWORK WITH 
THE FEWEST DROPPED CALLS. 
Testing from the leading independent 
research company proves that AT&T has 
the fewest-dropped calis of any national 

- •. wireless carrier." . '. '• 
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FREE SHIPPING 

mus.&&.uiMJdm 

CALL 1.866.MOBILITY - CLICK ATT.COM/WIRELESS - C'MON' IN TO A STORE 

Downtown Detroit 111 Monroe St. 
(313)964-7000 

*Eastpointe 22371 Gratiot Ave. 

(586] 777-0007 
•Roseville 29024 Gratiot Ave. 

(586] 776-6055 
•Sterling Heights Inside Lakeside Mai! 

(586] 532-2580 

AXWQBKi&ffi. 
Harrison Twp. 35434 Jefferson Ave. 
(586)790-1987 
Rosevilie Inside Macomb Mail 
(586)293-1400 
Royal Oak 1800WI4Mi leRd. 
(248) 288-0980 
Warren 28925 Van Dyke Ave. . 
(586)751-0900 = -. 

* O p e n Sunday ALSO. asBfcn 

RadioShack. 

For information on other AT&T 
products call 1-800-613-9420 

"AT&T also imposes monthly a Regulatory Cost Recovery Charge of up to $1.25 to help defray costs incurred in complying with State and Federal telecom 
regulation; State and Federal Universal Service charges; and surcharges for customer-based and revenue-based state and local assessments on AT&T. These are 
not taxes or government-required charges. 

Offer available on select phones. Dropped calls claim based on experience among national carriers. Limited-time offer. Other conditions and restrictions apply. See contract 
and rate plan brochure for details. Subscriber must live and have a mailing address within AT&T's owned wireless network coverage area. Up to $36 activation fee applies. Equipment price 
and availability may vary by market and may not be available from independent retailers. Early Termination Fee: None If cancelled in the first 30 days; thereafter $175. Some agents 
impose additional fees, Unlimited voice services: Unlimited voice services are provided solely for live dialog between two individuals. Offnet Usage: If your minutes of use (including 
unlimited services) on other carriers' networks C'offnet usagei during any two consecutive months exceed your off net usage allowance, AT&T may at its option terminate your service, deny 
your continued use of other carriers' coverage, or change your plan to one imposing usage charges for offnet usage. Your offnet usage allowance is equal to the lesser of 750 minutes or 
40% of the Anytime minutes included with your plan (data offnet usage allowance is the lesser of 6megabyt.es or 20% of the kilobytes included with your plan}. Rebate DebK Cards: Price 
of SYNC™ phone before mail-in rebate debit card and data package purchase is $94,99. Minimum $9.99 data package purchase required. Price of BLACKJACK™ phone before mail-in rebate 
debit cards and PDA Connect package purchase is $194.99. Minimum $19.99 PDA Connect package purchase required. Price of SAMSUNG C41T phone before mail-in rebate debit card and 
data package purchase is $79.99. Minimum $9.99 data package purchase required. Allow 10-12 weeks to receive rebate debit cards. Rebate debit cards not available at all locations; void 
where prohibited, taxed, or restricted. Must be a customer for 30 consecutive days. Must be postmarked by 08/30/2007. Sales tax calculated based on price of unactivated equipment 
HBO®, HBO Mobile5", and The Sopranos'1' are service marks of Nome Box Office, inc. HBO content ©2007 Home Box Office, inc, All rights reserved. GPS capable with optional accessory. 
©2007 TeleNav, inc. All rights reserved. TeleNav® is a registered trademark of TeleNav, In t TeleNav GPS Navigator1" is a trademark of TeleNav, Inc. All other trademarks are the property 
of their respective owners. Service provided by AT&T Mobility. ©2007 AT&T Knowledge Ventures. All rights reserved. AT&T, AT&T logo, angular, and Cingular logos are trademarks of AT&T 
Knowledge Ventures and/or AT&T affiliated companies. -

http://ATT.COM/WIRELESS
http://6megabyt.es
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NEWS 

• * * » . . V3 EyesOn Design 
TOP:This matching red and white 1957 Chevy and boat were 
an eye-catcher. Even the white with red trimmed tires on the 
car and boat trailer matched. LEFT: This handsome 1947 
Indian motorcycle took on extra flare with its fringed leather 
seat and leather studded bag and is owned by Brian Chidsey 
of Warren. It was one of the vehicles displayed on the Edsel & 
Eleanor Ford grounds for the Detroit Institute of 
Ophthalmology's 19th annual EyesOn Design Automotive 
Design Show on Sunday, June 17. BELOW LEFT: The Pierce-
Arrow hood ornament is simply classic. The car is owned by 
Terry and Rita Ernest of Port Huron. BELOW RIGHT: The 
FB2-304 Azonia is a concept car built by General Motors. 
BOTTOM LEFT CORNER: Hood ornaments ranged from the 
functional to the classic to the unusual such as mis one which 
resembles a bird of prey. BOTTOM LEFT: The rear view of the 
1936 Stout Scarab owned by Larry Smith of Bloomfield Hills. 
This car is one of nine that were built by william Stout, an 
aeronautical engineer. In 1932, he set up the Stout 
Engineering Laboratories in Detroit and built his first Stout 
that year. BELOWRIGHT: The uncluttered Scarab dashboard. 
BOTTOM CENTER: Matt DeCoster of Grosse Pointe Park 
brought his 2000 Honda S-2000 registered in the Aero Tuner 
category. BOTTOM RIGHT: The 1930 Packard 745 Sport 
Phaeton. 

Photos by Renee Landuyt 
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Linda Bologna - Owner 
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Don Girodat 

A M E R I C A N S P t B D Y 

P R I N T I N G C E N T E R S , I N C . 

27413 Harper Avenue 
St. Clair Shores, Michigan 48081 

£ 
1* 
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Chris Fitzsimmons 
Agent 
29900 Harper Avenue, Suite C 
St. Clair Shores, Ml 48082 
586 285 1200 Rax 586 285 1296 
chris.fitzsimmons.nytu@statefarm.com 

24 Hour 
Good Neighbor 

Service® 

Located at 12 Mile and Harper 

Life long Grosse Pointe resident! 
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M W my i deal graphics, com 
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, ~ 3 p PRINTING & 

"•'<£' EMBHO!DERY 

j ^ f i „ - ^ Chris Campo 
i Steve Salerno 

1709 9 Mile • west of Harper • St. Clair Shores 
I (586) 322-4441 -fax (586) 552-4423 (586) 552-4243 

Kmetz Heating & Cooling Co, 
"Your Cooiist Friend in Town" 

* Since 1929 • 

23760 Harper Ave. • Saint Clair Shores 
f!% Phone:586-777-1929 
y. Fax: 586-777-6232 

M 

1 M R L O O F 1 
Jewelry & Gifts 

28525 Harper • St. Clair Shores 
(at 117a Mile) 

www. maloofj ewelry. com 

Tlie Eastside's Newest, Cleanest, Modern 

IJoggy Day Caire Cen te r 
Daily/Weekly and Extended Boarding 
:i Obedience Training ' Daily Tours 

10% OFF 
DOG GROOMING, INCLUDING DO-IT-YOURSELF DOGGIE WASH 

GOOD DURING SUMMLR 2007 
^ , — ^ 

Outdoor Poo! • Doggie Whirlpool • New Outdoor.PH'y Park! 
•: * HURRY! MAKE YOUR JULY 4TH & SUMMER * * 
. RESERVATIONS EARLY! «***« 

www.americanpetsinn.com JB&. 

5S6-778- 23000 industrial Drive East; 
St. Clair Shores,^"' 

Joel L. Pelavin, M.D.r P.C. 
M e d i c a i Eye Examina t ions • Con tac t Lenses • Opt ica l S tud io 

ie f rac t ive S u r g e r y and Las ik * Cataract S u r g e r y * G l a u c o m a Trea tmen t and S u r g e r y 
Macu la r D e g e n e r a t i o n Eva luat ion • D iabet ic Re t i nopa thy Eva lua t i on a n d T r e a t m e n t 

(586)296-7770 
' 29750 Harper A v e n u e • St . C la i r S h o r e s 

w w w . p e l a v i n m d . c o m 
H s: Mon, Wed, Thurs & Fri 9am-5pm • Tues lpm-8pm • Sat 9am-12pm (call for working Saturday) 

PAYING TOO MUCH FOR INSURANCE? 
We offer Money Saving Discounts for: 
• Multiple Policies, Including Life Insurance 
• Good Credit 
• Older Homes with Updates 
• Special Group Rates also available 

CALL TODAY 
FORYOUh* 

FREE QUOTE! 

Since 1972 
• Home • Auto * Yacht • Life • Business 

JACKSON HULET INSURANCE AGENCY 
26503 Harper Avjenue, St. Ciair Shores, iVIl 48081 

(586) 774-0488 • Fax: (586) 779-9030 • jhinsurance@voyager.net 

Come join us with our partners from Line Systems Inc. 
as we introduce the E-Z Fit Fastener Program. The in-stock solution to all your fastener needs, 

Experience hands-on training with various Air Nailers & Staplers. 

No longer will you have to shop to multiple stores to find the nails or staples your need. 
Have you heard about the E-Z Fit repair program? Most tools can be diagnosed and usually repaired within 48 hoursl 

Have a tool that is down? Bring it to the DEMO Day and we can get you back to work, only as quick as you want to be. 
Stop in and check out the NEW Bostitch product line. We will have tools ready for you to try out and take home. 

Saturday 
June 23rd 

Sponsored by ENFORCER. Products 
We wili give away an 

to first 100 customers! 1 year home pest control Quart 
and an 8 Pk, e* Rs* MBK Wmi Blocks 

EVERY HOUR!!! 
from 10am-4pm 

A l ! D a y ! ! Register to win. Drawing held in store. No purchase necessary! 

Come in and meet The Hot Man from ENFORCES. PRODDCTS - Frank Vlasah from 10am to 4pm 
Let's talk about rats & bugs & how to get rid of them!!! 

GILBERTS SRO HARDWARE 

Hobby and Toy 

<*•*£!**. 

A Neighborhood Tradition Since 1970 

JULY 15th. Lego Con tes t D e a d l i n e 
(Last day to enter, stop by for rule sheet) 

JULY 22nd.. , Lego Con tes t W i n n e r s A n n o u n c e d 
(Creations maybe picked up) 

JULY 28th...... T h o m a s The T a n k & B r i o P l ayday 
(Train rides outside and 20% off) 

AUGUST 11th . . .Groovy G i r l D ress -up Day 
(Dress up as a groovy girl for prizes and 20% off) 

AUGUST 19th. M o d e l K i t Car C o n t e s t D e a d l i n e 
(last day to enter. Stop by for a rule sheet) 

AUGUST 26th M o d e l K i t Car W i n n e r s A n n o u n c e d 
(Prizes awarded) ' 

SEPTEMBER 15th.. . . .37th A n n i v e r s a r y Sa le & B reye r D a y ! 
(Biggest sale of the year!) 

. . : , .... . ;» • • • : • .. & M__ 

21714 Harper Ave. at 8 7* Mile Rd. • St. Clair Shores 
(586) 771-6770 • www.whistle-stop.com 

Store Hours: Mon-Sat 10am-8pm • Sun 12pm-5pm 

ra 

mailto:chris.fitzsimmons.nytu@statefarm.com
http://www.americanpetsinn.com
http://www.pelavinmd.com
mailto:jhinsurance@voyager.net
http://www.whistle-stop.com
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Graduations 
Images capture the 2007 graduations 

at North, South and ULS PAGE 23A 

SCHOOLS OBITUARIES AUTOMOTIVE 

GROSSE POINTE PUBLIC SCHOOL SYSTEM 

Officials happy with district's progress 
By Bob St. John 
StaffWriter 

The Grosse Pointe Public 
School System officially put its 
2006-07 school year in the his­
tory books last week. 

Superintendent Suzanne 
Klein and board of education 
members were elated at how 
well the school year went and 
the progress being made to 
make it even better for the up­
coming academic year. 

"We believe in the pursuit of 
educational excellence for 
each and every child, each and 
every day," Klein said. "Our 
goal is to help every child in 
this school district reach their 
fullest potential each and every 
day. 

"I'm proud to say we finished 
another productive school year 
that allows us to do even more 
next year." 

The biggest story of the year 
is the ground breaking cere­
mony for the new pool and ath­
letic facility at Grosse Pointe 
South High School. 

The multi-million dollar pro­
ject is slated to be ready at the 
end of next summer, meaning 
South's girls swim team will 
host its first home meet in 
more than two decades. 

Demolition has begun on the 
facility facing Fisher. Once 
completed, it will be a state-of-
the-art multi-purpose building 
that will be not just a prized 
part of the Grosse Pointe 

FILE PHOTO 

Members of the Grosse Pointe Board of Education, Superintendent Suzanne Klein, Assistant Superintendent Chris Fenton, and 
South High School officials joined in the ground breaking ceremony of the new pool facing Fisher. The pool project headlined 
the school district during the 2006-07 school year. 

Public School System, but of 
the state. 

School Board President 
Brendan Walsh shared Klein's 
optimistic viewpoint of the 
2006-07 year. 

"The current board of educa­
tion have now been serving the 
community together for one 
year," Walsh said during the 
June 11 board of education 
meeting. "Being a trustee has 
always been difficult, but more 

so now at what is one of the 
most trying times in the history 
of public schools in the state of 
Michigan. 

"The responsibility is im­
mense, and I am proud of how 
this board has responded, both 
individually and collectively," 
Walsh added. "Amidst a relent­
less stream of complex and dif­
ficult decisions, the community 
should have the comfort of 
knowing that our motivation 

has always been founded in 
what will be best for our school 
system, not just for today or 
next year, but to allow us to ex­
cel for years to come in an un­
certain future." 

Some of the cost of building 
the pool has been covered by 
the Friends of the Pool com­
mittee, which has raised more 
than$160,000, Klein said. 

In addition to the Friends of 
the Pool committee, the Grosse 

Pointe Foundation for Public 
Education has dedicated its 
fundraising efforts to support 
district programs. 

"The foundation has done a 
marvelous job of working hard 
to make sure our programs 
stay on top," Klein said. "The 
members of the foundation 
and all of those who have do­
nated deserve a lot of credit." 

Science labs at Parcells and 
Pierce middle schools were re­

vamped. But on a much larger 
scale, Brownell Middle 
School's science lab is in the 
midst of a total makeover. 

The walls are being moved 
to allow more space in the lab. 

Klein said the classroom will 
not be ready for the start of the 
year, but should be completed 
in a timely manner. 

"The South pool and the 
Brownell science lab are our 
two. biggest facility enhance­
ments made this year," Klein 
said. 

As of Sept. 27,2006, the dis­
trict's enrollment was 8,878 
with a teaching staff of 583, 
clerical staff of 61, engineer­
ing/custodians/maintenance 
staff of 78, 
aides/monitors/parking lot at­
tendant staff of 131, school ad­
ministrative staff of 30 and 36 
other support personnel. 

The district's general fund 
budget is a little more than 
$104 million with a per pupil 
costof$ll,731. 

Ninety percent of the 2007 
high school* graduates will go 
on to higher education at an es­
timated 160 different institu­
tions. This year the school dis­
trict has 14 National 
Scholarship semifinalists and 
11 commended students. 

Klein said Grosse Pointe ele­
mentary and middle school 
students scored among the 
highest in the state on the 2006 

See DISTRICT, page 15A 

Congrats to the winners of Grosse Pointe News & Biz Team 
"Acting & Improtf Classes" Enter-to-Win Contest: 

GRAND PRIZE WINNERS: 
Kathleen Weston, Chfissy Panagos, Kellie Koch 

RUNNERS-UP: 
Rachelle Blachut, Celeste Franke-Joyce, Oayle Ma as, 

Ariana Serventi, Sydney Thompson 

* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

"Acting & Improv Summer Camp Classes for Kids & Teens" 

The Assumption Cultural Center's tradition of hosting great class offerings 
continues as Biz Team announces 4-day "Acting & Improv Summer Camp 
Classes." 

The 4-day class will provide Kids & Teens an introduction to theatrical acting & improvisation. 
Utilizing proven theatre exercises and improv games, these classes will teach students to 
work within a group, improve communications skills & enhance self-confidence white 
providing a fun learning experience. 

Glass Sessions are listed for respective age groups. Tuition is only $139 (per student/session) 

Session A (ages 15-17) Mon., June 25 -Thur., June 28 1pm - 4pm 
SessionB (ages 9-11) Mon., July 9 - Thur., July 12 9am - Noon 
Session C (ages 12-14) Mon., July 9 - Thur., July 12 1 p m - 4 pm 
Session D (ages 15-17) , Mon., July 16 - Thur., July 19 9am - Noon 
Session E (ages 9-11) Mon., July 16 - Thur., July 19 1 pm - 4 pm 

Taught by an Improv Pro! "Ms. Margaret," Instructor for the Kids & Teens 
Acting & improv Summer Classes, is a graduate of Wayne State's Theatre Arts 
program, an alumna of The Second City and has taught acting and improvisation 
for years! 

Classes are held at The Assumption Cultural Center, 
located on Marter Rd., in St. Clair Shores (near Vernier in GP Woods). 

Visitwww.bizteamconsulting.com. Call (313) 808-1710! 
Class sizes are limited! 

• H M H H H H H B B B B B B B H M M M M H M H a i H H H B H H B B r B I 

Registration for Kids & Teens Acting & Improv Summer Camp Classes 
Name, Address & 

Age of Student: . = 

Parent/Guardian Name 
(printed) & Signature 

E-mail & Phone # ' s : _ 

Preferred Class Session:. 
Amount Enclosed: 

Please mail form w i t h check (made payable to Biz Team) 
to: Biz Team, 1415 Hol lywood Ave. , G.P. Woods, M l 4 8 2 3 6 
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128KERCHEVAL 
GROSSE POINTE FARMS MI 48236 

(313)884-3700 
DESIGN § CONSTRUCTION § CABINETS § RENOVATION 

SINCE 19S4 
www.nniischkTkirchcns.coni 

http://Visitwww.bizteamconsulting.com
http://www.nniischkTkirchcns.coni
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Pointes 
By Bob St. John 
StaffWriter 

The Radio Astronomy Team 
(RATZ) hosted an open house 
Friday, June 8, demonstrating 
the high-tech fun the club 
members enjoy. 

High school students 
throughout the Grosse 
Pointes can join the astrono­
my team led by Ardis Herrold. 

"We have a lot of fun," 
-Herrold, a Grosse Pointe 
North science teacher, said. 
"We're not competing against 
other schools and we didn't 
build our telescope from a kit. 

"Our club members work 
hard to do things they like 
outside of school. It's an ex­
tracurricular activity and for 
some, this is like getting a var­
sity letter." 

Club members who spend 
their entire four years of high 
school in the program earned 
a Brass RATZ honor. This 
year's recipients were 
Graham Kozak, Zak 
Schroeder, Jenny Konwiak, 
Allison Frantz, Mike Hulway, 
Marie Lacombe, Jerry 
McDonnell, Chris Samelak, 
Greg Spencer and Nate Stano. 

Herrold said RATZ get an 
opportunity to go on the roof 
where the club's telescope is 
located. 

She said this is the second 
radio telescope the club has 
used. The original was" in ser­
vice from 1990 to 2006 until it 
was destroyed in a snow 
storm. 

Herrold said the current 
telescope, called GBT, is more 
advanced and better engi­
neered than its predecessor. 

"Our new radio telescope is 
fully steerable and computer 
controlled," Herrold said. 
"The name GBT pays homage 
to the Green Bank Telescope, 
the largest fully steerable ra­
dio telescope in the world." 

That telescope is located at 
the National Radio 
Astronomy Observatory in 
Green Bank, WVa. 

A radio telescope is a form 
of a directional radio antenna 
used in radio astronomy and 
in tracking and collecting data 
from satellites and space 
probes. They operate in the 
radio frequency portion of the 
electromagnetic spectrum 
where they can deflect and 
collect data on radio sources. 

Many astronomical objects 
are not only observable in visi­
ble light but also emit radia­
tion at radio wavelengths, 
Herrold said. 

Besides observing energetic 
objects such as pulsars and 
quasars, radio telescopes are 
able to "image" most astro-, 
nomical objects such as galax­
ies, nebulae, supernovas and 
even radio transmissions from 
planets. 

Herrold began the RATZ 
program in 1989 when she 
was a teacher at Grosse 
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PHOTOS BY RENEE LANDUYT 

Above, RATZ members s 
the seniors leaving the 
Greg Spencer and Mike 

parents, friends and former club members who participated in the open house how the new GBT radio telescope works. Below are 
(Radio Astronomy Team). Back row from left are Nate Stano; Graham Kozak; Zak Schroeder; Jerry McDonnell; Chris Samelak; 

; front row from left are Allison Frantz; Sasha Allaer; Ardis Herrold, director; Jenny Konwiak and Marie Lacombe. 

Pointe South. 
"Back in the beginning, 

most of the members were 
South students because it was 
based at that school where I 
was teaching,"' i Ierrold said. 

She moved to North a cou­
ple of years later and that is 
where the club is currently 
based. 
„ /'Now that RA'f/. has been 
at North, n»n-.' •>• ib<- metn 
bers arc Nmili *\\nU nK" she 
said. "We don'! cure who 
wants to join. We just have 
fun, allowing club members to 
focus on science and engi­
neering." 

Herrold, who has a degree 
in geology fiom the University 
of Michigan, earned a teach­
ing certificate and began her 
teaching career in 19K7 

"I wanted to £e! into a. ca­
reer studying li'^oiogy. but 
there were no jobs in my field 
at the time 1 graduated," 
Herrold said. "1 earned my 
teaching certificate and here J 
am, having a lot of fun teach­
ing and directing" the radio as­
tronomy club,1' 

Herrold estimates 40U high 
school students have been ei­
ther a core or casual member 
of RATZ since its inception in 
1989. 

CITY COUNCIL 
MUNICIPAL BUILDING 

HARPER WOODS, MICHIGAN 48225 
PUBLIC HEARING NOTICE 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Harper Woods will b<> holding a 
Public Hearing on Monday, July 9, 2007 at 7 u0 p.m. for the purpose 
of obtaining public input and comment on a request from Shamrock 
Cab Company to increase their rates and charge as permitt^ri by 
section 24.5 of the Harper Woods Code of Ordinances. 

Residents who are unable to attend this hearing rmiy submit their 
written comments regarding this matter to the City Ciirk's Office 
prior to the hearing date. 

CITY OF HARPER WOODS 

POSTED: June 18,2007 
PUBLISHED: June 21,2007 

MICKEY D. TODD, 
City Clerk 

St. Clar* 

Nursery School 

3 and 4 year old programs 

For More Information, Please Call 

(313)647 

tudents earn $1,000 scholarship 
University Liggett School's 

Lucy Gellman, of Grosse 
Pointe Park, and Grosse 
Pointe North's Paul Browski, 
of Grosse Pointe Woods, were 
two of 28 Wayne County stu­
dents who received a $1,000 
scholarship from the Comcast 
Foundation. 

The 2007 Comcast Leaders 
and Achievement 
Scholarship Program recog­
nizes students who have 
demonstrated leadership 
skills, academic achievement 
and a commitment to service. 

"Comcast is proud to ac­
knowledge the success and 

CITY OF HARPER WOODS 
POLICE DEPARTMENT 

WAYNE COUNTY, MICHIGAN 
NOTICE 

AUCTION OF IMPOUNDED/ABANDONED VEHICLES 
Pursuant to PA 104, an auction will be held on June 28, 2007 at 5:00 p.m. at 
Woods Towing, located at 22755 Lexington, Eastpointe, MI. The following 
impounded/abandoned vehicles will be auctioned: 

2003 Ford Explorer 
1994 Ford Explorer 
1992 Geo Metro 
1993 FordAerostar 
1995 Honda Accord 
1993 Ford Thunderbird 
1992 Oldsmobile 88 
1993 Plymouth Sundance 
1994 Honda Accord 
1990 Mazda 626 
1993 Lincoln Continental' 
1993 Nissan Althna 
1999 Ford Contour 
1992 Pontiac Grand Prix 
1995 Cadillac Eldorado 
1994 Dodge Ram Van 
1987 Chevrolet Astro Van 
1993 Oldsmobile Achieva 
1989 Dodge Ram Van 
1993 Toyota Camry 
1992 Chevrolet Cavalier 

1FMZU72K13ZB04849 
1FMDU34X0RUD82157 
J81RF2360N7518718 
1FMCA11U4PZC26187 
1HGCD7269SA005921 
1FAPP6248PH108073 
1G3HY53L2NH375878 
1P3XP28D5PN639677 
1HGCD5649RA130148 
1YVGD22B3L5253120 
1LNLM9741PY652281 
1N4BU31FXPC245503 
1FAFP65Z8XK189355 
1G2WJ14X9NF276917 
1G6EL12Y9SU617319 
2B6HB21Y0RK148243 
1GBDM15Z4HB227439 
1G3NF54N0PM0O0364 
2B7GB11Y2KK397960 
4T1SK12E3PU184835 
1G1JC5443N7103913 

The above vehicles can be viewed 1/2 hour prior to the auction, at Woods Towing. 
Payment- by cash or certified check only. Cars listed may be pulled or released 
prior to the auction by the Harper Woods Police Department. 

POS'lED: June 14, 2007 Lt . DenniS Root 
PUBLISHED: June 21.2007 Traffic Safety Section 

potential of such outstanding 
student leaders, all of whom 
are preparing for the next 
step in their educational ca­
reers," said David L. Cohen, 
executive vice president and 
co-chairman of the Comcast 
Foundation. 

"The willingness of these 
students to play a leadership 
role in their local communi­
ties, coupled with their acade­
mic achievement, will put 
them on the path to success." 

A commitment to commu­
nity service is an essential 

component in the selection of 
winners. 

This year's winners have 
participated in a wide variety 
of community service activi­
ties such as mentoring and tu­
toring younger students, vol­
unteering at hospitals and 
participating in local blood, 
food and clothing drives. 

Each year, Comcast works 
with high school principals, 
guidance counselors and 
school administrators to se­
lect the scholarship recipi­
ents. 

cityof0§r0«0e | t a r a i £ J l farms, Michigan 
PUBLIC NOTICE 

Statement of Final Objectives 
Pursuant to federal guidelines, the City of Grosse Pointe 
Farms will undertake the following project funded by the 
2007/2008 Community Development' Block Grant (CDBG) 
Program for the period of July 1, 2007 to December 31, 2008. 

Project 
ADA Sidewalk Ramps 
SOC Senior Services 
Administration 
SOC Minor Home Repair 

CRN: 06/21/07 

Location 
Mack Avenue 
City wide 
N/A 
City wide • 

Amount 
$15,600 
$29,900 
$14,500 
$38,000 

Matthew Tepper, 
• City Clerk 
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SCHOOLS 
FERRY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 

Students meet Tigers star Craig Monroe 
By Bob St John 

, Staff Writer 

Ferry Elementary fifth-grad­
er Andrew Januzzi of Grosse 
Pointe Shores was the king of 
the hill for one day last week. 

Januzzi's dad, Mel Joseph, 
recently won lunch with 
Detroit Tigers outfielder, Craig 
Monroe, at an auction. Joseph 
talked Monroe into visiting his 
son and his classmates at Ferry. 

"I'm excited to meet Mr. 
Monroe and it's great that 
everyone in the school gets to 
meet him, too," Januzzi, 12, 
said. 

"This is a great opportunity 
for Andrew to meet a local 
hero who youngsters look up 
to and admire," Joseph, said. 
"C-Mo is a good role model." 

"This is a huge event for the 
school," Ferry Principal, Gloria 
Hinz said, "The school is 
buzzing with excitement be­

cause all of the kids want to see 
Craig Monroe." 

Monroe made the visit when 
he and the rest of his team­
mates had a day off after win­
ning two of three games 
against the New York Mets. 

"It's important to do your 
best at whatever you choose to 
do in life," Monroe told stu­
dents. "It doesn't matter if its 
being a professional baseball 
player or a doctor or a lawyer, 
but do your best and good 
things will come your way." 

Good things came Monroe's 
way later that night when he 
was l-for-3 at the plate with 
one run scored, and witnessed 
history when Tiger pitcher 
Justin Verlander threw a no-
hitter to help Detroit beat 
Milwaukee 4-0. 

Monroe played a vital role in 
helping the Tigers gain a berth 
in last year's World Series, the 
team's first since 1984. 

PHOTOS BY BOB ST. JOHN 

Andrew Januzzi, right, takes a seat with Tigers outfielder Craig Monroe, who also spent some time speaking to the entire stu­
dent body. 

DISTRICT: 
Officials 
happy 
Conimuedfrom page 13A 

MEAP tests. 
Students at North and South 

High rank as one of the top na­
tionally who take at least one 
of the 20 advanced placement 
courses offered. 

In addition, Barnes Early 
Childhood Center has been 
featured on national television 
for its outstanding preschool 
programs. 

Of the staff, 80 percent of the 
teachers hold advanced de­
grees. Teachers have recently 
been recognized at the county, 
state and national levels for: 

• Teacher of the Year, Wayne 
County. 

• Wal-Mart award. 
• The Detroit News' award. 
• Michigan Science Teach­

ers Association award. 
• Michigan Earth Science 

Teachers Association award. 
• Michigan Social Studies 

Association award. 

• Who's Who in America ed­
ucation award. 

• Einstein scholar from the 
United States Department of 
Education. 

Students will also benefit 
from several new curriculums 
that will be introduced in the 
fall. 

"We offer so many good, 
nurturing programs at each 
level of our public school sys­
tem," Klein said. "Students 
who enroll in any of our many 
extra curricular programs have 
opportunities to excel." 

Both of the high schools' 
choirs have earned honors and 
many of the high schools' ath­
letic squads have won league, 
district, and regional titles. 

South's boys hockey team 
won the Division H state cham­
pionship in March. 

Klein concluded by remind­
ing parents of children who 
will be new to the district that 
they have to officially enroll 
their students at the adminis­
tration building, 389 St. Clair, 
City of Grosse Pointe. 

For more information, con­
tact district administration of­
fices at (313) 423-3003 or visit 
gpschools.org. 

GROSSE POINTE PUBLIC SCHOOL SYSTEM 

District offers 
summer learning 

Last year more than 600 
students attended the Grosse 
Pointe Public School 
System's Summer Learning 
Program with some of the 
most popular classes being 
the mini sessions. 

The district also offers more 
traditional courses, such as 
kindergarten through fifth-
grade readiness classes, 
speech and language enrich­
ment, and a resource center 
for language arts and math. 

The district also offers astro 
camp with sections for stu­
dents heading into first 
through fifth grades. Classes 
offered include, "New Solar 
System" and "Sun, Moon, 
Earth," 

Other elementarymini ses­
sions include Spanish, 
Chinese, video production 
and math mania. 

Traditional middle school 
courses focus on study, math 
and reading skills, while en­

richment courses are offered 
in forensic science, Chinese 
and personal financial fitness. 

High school courses include 
full-year and semester cours­
es allowing students to fulfill 
credit requirements during 
the summer, including 
Michigan virtual high school 
options. 

Enrichment classes include 
personal financial fitness and 
ACT/SAT prep. 

Forms can be filled out on­
line at gpschools.org and e-
mailed to Grosse Pointe 
Schools. Charge the summer 
school classes through 
PayPal's secure site or mail 
completed forms to Grosse 
Pointe Public School System, 
389 St. Clair, Grosse Pointe, 
MI 48230, Attn: Summer 
Learning Program 2007. 

For more information, con­
tact Ranae Beyerlein at (313) 
432-3095 or Kathy Sexton at 
(313)432-3094. 

GROSSE POINTE PUBLIC SCHOOL SYSTEM 

A district resolution is being 
prepared to honor retiring 
school system employees. 

The resolution by Grosse 
Pointe school board members 
will honor: 

• Lois Handy, Trombly 
Elementary, 

• Lawrence Lobert, assistant 
superintendent, 

• Karen O'Sullivan, South 
High, . 

• Richard Wellman, Barnard 

Center. 
"These staff members have 

successfully met challenges 
presented by changing times, 
have generously used their tal­
ents and energy for the benefit 
of the school district's resi­
dents, and have enjoyed fine 
rapport with their colleagues 
and other members of the edu­
cational community," accord­
ing to a draft of the resolution. 

—BradLindberg 

VBri70nwireless 

How families save. 
On messaging 

Unlimited Messaging 
for up to 5 lines 

to anyone on any network in the U.S. 
text • IM • picture • video 

On additional lines 
^ Monthly Access 

W i t h an America 's Choice® Select Fami ly SharePlan® 

Messaging not everywhere in America's Choice Coverage Area. 

On phones 
for everyone 
Buy One «2 r n r P 
Get up to 3 r n L L 
$2999 

VX5300 

9.99 2-yr. price - $50.00 Mail-in Rebate. 

th new 2-yr. activation per phone. 

We'll pay for your calls. 1.877.2BUY.VZW verizonwireless.com 

VERIZON WIRELESS COMMUNICATIONS STORES AUTHORIZED RETAltfRS 

^™ 

fcppment Pri^s, models &reium policy vary by tocatioa 

ALLEN PARK 
3123 FairlaneDr. 
313-271-9255 
AUBURN HILLS 
Great Lakes Crossing Mall 
248-253-1799 

8159Ghall is fSte.C 
{off Grand River, 
in front of Target) 
810-225-4789 
CANTON 
42447 Ford R d 
(comer of Ford & 
Uliey RrJs., Canton Comers) 
734-844-0481 
DEARBORN 
24417 Ford Rd. 
(just west of Telegraph) 
313-278-4491 

Fairlane Mall 
(3rd floor 
next to Sears) 
313-441-0168 
DETROIT 
14126 Woodward 
(Model T Plaza) 
313-869-7392 
FARMiKGTQN HILLS 
31011 Orchard Lake Rd. 
(southwest Cornef of Orchard 
Lake Rd.& 14 Mile Rd.) 
248-538-9900 

FENTON 
17245 Silver Pkwy 
(in the Sears Piaza) 
810-629-2733 
FT.GRATI0T 
4129 24th Ave. 
810-385-1231 
LAKE ORION 
2531 S. Lapeer Rd. 
(Orion Mall 2 miles 
north of-the Palace) 
248-393-6800 
COMING SOON! 
MACOMB TOWNSHIP 
18501 Hail Rd., 
Romeo Commons 

H t k MONROE 
B T 2 1 6 1 MatiRd. 

(in front of Kohl's) 
734-241-4099 
NORTHVILLE 
Three Generations Plaza 
20580 Haggerty Rd. 
734-779-0148 

4302512 Mile Rd. 
(Twelve Oaks 
Service Df „ 
north of Sears) 
248-305-6600 

Twelve Oaks Mall 
(lower level play area) 

IN COLLABORATION WITH 

Alcatel •Lucent 

P0NTIAC/WATERFOBB 
454 Telegraph Rd. 
(across from 
Summit Place Mail) 
248-335-9900 
ROCHESTER HILLS 
3035 S. Rochester Rd. 
(at Auburn Rd.) 
248-853-0550 
ROYAL OAK 

31921 Woodward Ava 
(at Normandy) 
248-549-4177 
ST. CLAIR SHORES 
26401 Harper Ave. 
{at 1 0 1 / 2 Mile) 
586-777-4010 
S0UTHFIELD 
28117TetegraphRd. 
(south of 12 Mile Rd.) 
248-358-3700 
STERLING HEIGHTS 
45111 ParfcAve. 
(M-59 & M-53, 
Utica Park Plaza) 
586-997-6500 

Lakeside Mall 
(lower level, Sears Ct) 
TAYLOR 
23495 Eureka Rd. 
(across from Southland Ma 
734-287-1770 

Southland Mall 
23000 Eureka Rd. 
(in the JC Penney wing) 
TROY 
1913 E.8ig Beaver Rd. 
(Troy Sports Center} 
248-526-0040 

^™ 

Oakland Mall 
(inside Main Entrance 
next to food court) 
WARREN 
5745 Twelve Mile Rd , 
Heritage Village 
WESTLAND, 
35105 Warren Rd. 
(southwest Corner of 
Warren& Wayne fids.) 
734-722-7330 

OR VISIT THE VERIZON 

WIRELESS STORE 

AT CIRCUIT CITY 

AUBURN HILLS 

DEARRORN 

LAKESIDE 

NOVI 

ROSEVILLE 

TAYLOR 

TROY 

WESTLAND 

WSJWS 

Proud sponsor o f the 
Detroi t Pistons 

See store for 
Return/Exchange Policy. 

Cellular ami Mors 
734-981-7440 
CLARKSTON 
Cellular Technologies 
248-625-1201 
CLAWSDN 
Communications USA 
248-280-6390 
COMMERCE 
Cellular Source 
248-360-9400 
Wireless Tomorrow 
248-669-1200 

Authorized Cellular 
586-566-8555 

Cellular City 
248-848-8800 ' 
FERNDALE 
Communications USA 
248-542-5200 
FT. GRAM 
Wireless Solutions 
810-385-3400 
GROSSE POINTE 
Authorized Cellular 
313-417-1000 

Herkimer Radio 
734-242-0806 
Herkimer Too 
734-384-7001 
MT CLEMENS 
Authorized Cellular 
566-468-7300 
NORTHVILLE 
Cellular Muttons 
248-349-8116 
OAK PARK 
Cellular CeMons 
248-284-0091 

248-628-8400 
PLYMOUTH 
Ann Arbor Wireless 
734-456-3200 
ROSEVILLE 
Authorized Cellular . 
586-293-6664 
ROYAL OAK 
Cellular Celliitidfis 
.248-582-1100 
Fusion Communications 
248-549-7700 

SOUTHRELO 
Wireless EISA 
248-395-2222 
STERLING HEIGHTS 
Authorized Cellular 
586-795-8610 
TAYLOR 
Cell Phone Warehouse 
734-374-4472 
TROY 
The Wireless Shop 
248-458-1111 
UTICA 
MobMMoUie Wireless 
586-739-9977 
WARREN 
Multillnks 
586-497-9800 -
Wireless Network 
586-573-7599 
WESTBL00MF1ELD 
Global Wireless 
248-681-7200 

Auto One 
248-960-0500 

WAL*MART 
Avai lable in select locat ions. 

Free Handset Software Uigradal 

0 4 3 » « E » 0 «E> 

Test Drive: America's Choice plan required; customer must pay all other charges, incl. taxes, surcharges, data services and downloads; early termination fee applies unless phone is returned. 
*0ur Surcharges lind. Fed. Univ. Svc of 11.7% of interstate and in f 1 telecom charges (varies quarteriy), 4 t Regulatory and 70^ Admintstrativefliiie/mb., and others by area) are nottaxes (detaib: 1-888-684-1888); gov't taxes and ft 

our surcharges could add 9%-27%to yQurbill Activation fee^ine: $35 ($25 for secondary Family lines . • • - ' ' • ' ' S 

IMPORTANT CONSUMER INFORMATION; Subject to Customer Agmt, Caliing Plan, rebate form and credit approval. Lip to 5175 early termination fee/line, up to 45t/min. after allowance. Shipping charges may apply. Rebate takes up.to 6 weds, j g 
Limited-time offer. White supplies last. Offers and coverage, varying by service, notavailable everywhere. Network details and coverage mapsatvzw.com. V CAST Music and VZ Navigator: Atid'J charges reqy.® 2007 VerizonMfireless 

http://gpschools.org
http://gpschools.org
http://verizonwireless.com
http://mapsatvzw.com
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NEWS 

Obituary notices are purchased and often prewritten by family or friends. While we try to run obit­
uaries as submitted, we nevertheless reserve the right to edit for accuracy, style and length. 

CM. 
Dominick 

Harper Woods resident, 
CM. Dominick, 74, died 
Saturday, June 9, 2007 in 
Harper Woods. 

He was born in Hamtramck 
to John and Josephine 
Dominick. 

Mr. Dominick attended 
Hamtramck High School and 
received a degree from Detroit 
Engineering Institute. He 
graduated from the University 
of Michigan with a Liberal 
Arts degree and received a 
Bachelor of Arts degree from 
Wayne State University. 

He worked as ah engineer­
ing technician in the automo­
tive industry. 

He served in Korea as a 
sergeant in the 1st Cavalry for 
the United States Army. 

Mr. Dominick was a mem­
ber of Unity Church and en­
joyed the Eagles' monthly 
spaghetti dinner dance. He 
was a longtime Bally Health 
Club member and considered 
the group as his extended fam­
ily. 

An active dancer, he enjoyed 
ballroom, square, and rounds 
with many groups including 
the Tomcats. 

He enjoyed traveling. Some 
of his favorite places to visit 
were Europe, the Caribbean, 
Mexico, Canada, Puerto Rico, 
and within the United States. 

He loved spending time with 
his grandchildren and getting 
together for family dinners. He 
was an avid reader. 

Friends will remember him 
as a positive, inspirational, and 
encouraging influence. 

He is survived by his daugh­
ter, Leslie (Michael) Kishler; 
and grandchildren, Jessica 
and Matthew Kishler. 

He was predeceased by his 
wife of almost 50 years, Mitzi 
Overland Dominick; son, John 
"J.D." Dominick; sister, 
Genevieve Graybill; and broth­
er, Stanley Dominick. 

A memorial service will be 
announced to friends and fam­
ily at a later date. 

Rene 
Haelewyn 

Rene Haelewyn, 82, of 
Grosse Pointe Woods, died 
Thursday, May 17, 2007 sur­
rounded by family. 

He was born in Detroit in 
1925 and attended St. 
Matthew Grade School, 
Catholic Central High School, 
and the University of Detroit. 

During World War II, he 
served in the United States 
Army Air Corps. He flew 53 
missions in a B24 Liberator 
with the 15th Army Air Force 
based in Cerignola, Italy. 

He returned home .in 1945 
with plans tb/marry his high 
school sweetheart, Matilda 
Wetzel. "•-.:/. . 

The couple celebrated their 
60th wedding anniversary in 
November 2006. 

They built their home in 
Grosse Pointe Woods in 1953. 

; Mr. Haelewyn was em­
ployed by the Wayne County 
Road Commission, designing 
area, roads, bridges, and run­
ways, at Metropolitan Airport 
in Detroit. He retired in 1992. 

Throughout his life, he 
placed great importance on 
the role of family. 

He was a music enthusiast. 
He enjoyed classical music 
and wasr.ia member of the 
Rackham 'Choir and the St. 
Joan of Arc; Men's Choir. He 
built three violins, one of 
which' his granddaughter, 
Chelsea, plays in her school 
orchestra. 

His love of music was 
equaled by his love of flying 
and model airplane building. 
He enjoyed helping his son-in-
law, Rob, build and fly a 
Lancair plane. 

Each night with dinner, he 
drank a glass of fine French 
wine that he preceded with a 
toast of "... and thou beside 
. me" to his beloved wife. 

He is survived by his wife, 
Matilda; daughter, Jill (Robert) 
Tweed; sons, Gary Haelewyn, 

William (Charyl) Haelewyn, 
and Douglas (Barbara) 
Haelewyn; and grandchildren, 
Jason Haelewyn, Dr. Kyle 
(Sanjay) Rajagapolan, Chelsea 
and Hannah Tweed, Jessica, 
Danielle, and twins Abigail 
and Douglas Haelewyn. 

A funeral Mass was cele­
brated on Thursday, May 24 at 
St. Paul Catholic Church with 
a procession to the columbari­
um, military taps, and a pre­
sentation of the United States 
flag. 

Robert 
Thomas Lannen 

St. Clair Shores resident, 
Robert Thomas Lannen, 81, 
died Tuesday, June 12,2007, at 
St. John Hospital in Detroit. 

Mr. Lannen was born on 
Sept. 1, 1925, in Detroit to 
Robert and Bethel Elison 
Lannen. 

He was a World War II veter­
an of the United States Navy. 

Mr. Lannen was the retired 
president of the Pfiester Co. 
and an avid golfer. 

He was a former member of 
the Detroit Golf Club and a 
member of the Seven Springs 
Golf and Country Club in 
Florida where he spent win­
ters for over 30 years. 

He is survived by his wife, 
Margaret Welch Lannen; sons, 
Gary (Rose) Lannen, William 
(Martha) Lannen, and Richard 
(Mary) Lannen; grandchil­
dren, Thomas Lannen, David 
Lannen, Sean Lannen, Rachel 
Lannen, and Kelly Lannen; 
and brother, Robert Lannen. 

He was predeceased by his 
son, Robert (Sheila) Lannen. 

A funeral service was held 
on Friday, June 15 at St. 
Margaret of Scotland Catholic 
Church in St Clair Shores. 

Interment is at Resurrection 
Cemetery in Clinton 
Township. 

Memorial contributions can 
be made to any charity. 

Hawaiian, and Tahitian. A 
Hawaiian dance scholarship 
will be awarded in her memo­
ry at the center. 

At Grosse Pointe North High 
School she was a member of 
Willow, Safe Rides, and the 
National Honor Society. 

Her family will always re­
member her wonderful smile. 

Ms. Myers is survived by her 
parents, Timothy and 
Marianne Myers; brother, Tim; 
grandparents, Grandma 
Hayes, and Barbara and 
Richard Simonds, and many 
aunts, uncles, and cousins. 

A funeral Mass was cele­
brated on Thursday, June 14, 
2007, at Our Lady Queen of 
Peace. The Grosse Pointe 
North High School choir sang 
at the service. 

Interment is at Holy 
Sepulchre Cemetery in 
Southfield. 

Memorial contributions can 
be made to the Children's 
Hospital of Michigan, 
Development Office, 3901 
Beaubien, Detroit, MI 48201. 

Tricia 
H. Myers 

Harper Woods resident, 
Tricia H. Myers, 19, died 
Monday, June 11,2007. 

She was born on April 30, 
1988 in Warren. She is the 
daughter of Timothy and 
Marianne Myers. 

Ms. Myers was scheduled to 
graduate from Grosse Pointe 
North High School on 
Thursday, June 14,2007. 

Her favorite class was choir. 
She won the Biggest Heart 
Award for choir. She attended 
Blue Lake. 

She was a dancer and assis­
tant at Harper Woods 
Recreation Center. She danced 
modern, jazz, ballet, 

William 
Adams Savage 

Longtime Grosse Pointe 
resident, William Adams 
Savage, 85, died Saturday, 
June 16,2007. 

He was born on Aug. 14, 
1921 in Guelph, Ontario to 
Thomas and Isabel Savage. 

Mr. Savage attended Trinity 
College School in Port Hope, 
Ontario and later Wayne State 
University. 

He was devoted to his wife 
of 63 years, Mary 
(Mackenzie). They met when 
they were children in the cot­
tage town of Bruce Beach, 
Ontario. The area remained 
significant for his entire life. 

They married and settled in 
Grosse Pointe. Later in life, 
he and his wife traveled, often 
to elder hostels. 

For most of his career, Mr. 
Savage worked at the former 
J.L. Hudson Co. in Detroit. 

He was nicknamed "Doc" 
Savage after the fictional ac­
tion hero Doc Savage, Man of 
Bronze. 

He was very proud of his 
military service in World War 
II where he served two tours 
of duty as a Spitfire pilot and 
flight instructor for the Royal 
Air Force and the Royal 
Canadian Air Force. 

During service, he spent 
time in England, Egypt, and 
the Middle East. He named 
his plane "Mary Mac" after 
his then girlfriend, and later 
wife. 

For the 50th anniversary of 
D-Day, he and his wife 
cruised England and France 
with a group from the 
Canadian Fighter Pilots 

Brian A Joseph, Owner/Chairman 

16300 Mack Avenue, Grosse Pointe, MI 48230 
Adrianna N. Schnell, Manager 

28499 Schoenherr, Warren, MI 48088 
Jennifer F. Jones, Manager 

Charles J. Van Hove II 

Association. 
One Spitfire he instructed 

currently hangs in Chicago's 
Museum of Transportation 
and Industry. 

An active member of 
Grosse Pointe Memorial 
Church, he served the church 
in many ways. He often spoke 
of the wonderful people he 
knew and worked with there. 
He enjoyed his friendships 
with the Senior Men's Club of 
Grosse Pointe and the 
Ecumenical Men's Breakfast. 
He often served as chauffeur. 

He was a prolific reader. His 
favorite authors included 
Charles Dickens and Samuel 
Pepys. He was interested in 
history, biographies, classics, 
and current events. He en­
joyed sharing what he read. 

Music was also a favorite 
pastime of his. He enjoyed the 
classical pipe organ and mu­
sic by J.S.Bach. 

He is survived by his wife 
Mary Savage; daughters 
Connie Ralston, arid Judy 
(Giulio) Martinelli; daughter-
in-law, Sue; seven grandchil­
dren, and four great-grand­
children. 

He was predeceased by his 
son, Billy (Betsy); daughter, 
Susie; sister, Mary; and broth­
er, Thomas. 

A memorial service will be 
held at 2 p.m. Sunday, June 24 
at Grosse Pointe Memorial 
Church, 16 Lakeshore, 
Grosse Pointe Farms. 

Memorial contributions can 
be made to the Grosse Pointe 
Memorial Church Music 
Fund, 16 Lakeshore, Grosse 
Pointe Farms, MI 48236, and 
the Grosse Pointe Public 
Library, 10 Kercheval, Grosse 
Pointe Farms, MI 48236. 

Rene Haelewyn Tricia H. Myers 

William Adams Savage 

Charles 
J. Van Hove n 

Grosse Pointe Woods resi­
dent, Charles J. Van Hove n, 
83, died Sunday, June 17, 
2007. 

He was born on Oct. 3,1923 
in Detroit. He received his 
bachelor's degree from the 
University of Detroit in 1946 
and was the purchasing man­
ager for the Chrysler Corp. 

A United States Army veter­
an, he enjoyed coin collecting, 
reading history books, and 
traveling abroad in his later 
years. 

Mr. Van Hove was the co-
founder and treasurer of the 
Saturday Club and a past pres­
ident and secretary of the 
Grosse Pointe Numismatic 
Society. 

He is survived by his daugh­
ters, Carol (Jeffrey) Sradak 
and Patricia . (Daniel) 
Neumeyer; son, Charles J. 
(Julie) Van Hove HI; grandchil­
dren, Rachel and Caleb 
Neumeyer, and Daniel Van 
Hove; and sisters, Louise (Gil) 

CM. Dominick 

Bazil and Ann (Ron) Thomas. 
He was predeceased by his 

wife, Patricia A. Van Hove; and 
brother James Van Hove. 

A funeral Mass will be cele­
brated at 10 a.m. Thursday, 
June 21, at Our Lady Star of 
the Sea Catholic Church, 467 
Fairford, Grosse Pointe 
Woods. 

Interment will be at Mt. 
Olivet Cemetery in Detroit. 

Assistance of Michigan 

• Vacation Relief 

Hourly & Live-In Caregiving 

Help with Bathing, Meals 

& transportation i 

• Bonded and Insured A 
63 Kercheval Ave., Sui te 18 

Grosse Pointe Farms, Ml 

www.homecareassistance.com 

FINALLY 
AN ACCOUNT WORTHY 

OF YOUR MONEY 

KEY SIGNATURE MONEY MARKET SAVINGS 

APY* 
FOR BALANCES OF $50;000 OR MORE 

You've worked hard for your money. With the Key Signature Money Market 

Savings account, you will maximize your returns while having 24-hour 

access in case an. unexpected need arises. Plus, you'll have peace of mind 

knowing your money is FDIC insured7* And, your Key' Signature Money 

Market Savings account is "complemented by your choice of KeyBank 

personal or business checking accounts! which offer a host of exclusive 

benefits that reward you for your relationship with Key. Please stop by your 

local-branch, call T-888-KEY-1234 or visit key.com. 

KeyBank 

*AII annual percentage yields (APYs) are accurate as of 06/16/07, and are subject to change without notice, AH interest rates and 
APYs for all balance tiers are variable and may change at any time after the account is opened. This is a 10-tiered account. At any 
time, interest rates and APYs offered within two or more consecutive tiers may be the same. When this is the case, multiple tiers will 
be shown as a single tier. As of the date stated above, for personal accounts the APYs and minimum balances are as follows: $.01-
$24,999.99, APY Is 0.10%; $25,000.00-$49t999.99, APY is 5.00%; $50,000.00-$99,999.99, APY is 5.25%; $100,000.00+, 
APY is 5.25%, Requires minimum opening deposit of $30,000.00 from funds not currently on deposit with KeyBank. Fees may 
reduce the earnings on this account. Public funds are not eligible for this offer. Available for small businesses with sales of $10 
million or less. "Deposit balances are insured up to the maximum allowable limit. Ho open a Key Signature Money Market Savings 
Account, you must have an existing or open a KeyBank personal checking account (excluding Key Student Checking) or a business 
checking account. KeyBank is Member FDIC. ©2007 KeyCorp. 

http://www.homecareassistance.com
http://key.com
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AUTOS By Jenny King 

2007 Chevrolet Aveo comes with comprehensive safety and security 
features. The 2007 Chevrolet Tahoe has legendary Z71 capability and 
new second row innovations. 

Large 

A
strange thing hap­
pened on the way 
to a 2007 Chevrolet 
Aveo. It was the 
2007 Chevrolet 

Tahoe, a full-size sport utility, 
substantially redesigned for '07 
and introduced to the market­
place early last summer. 

Our original intent was to re­
port on the subcompact Aveo. 
But the scheduling slipped in — 
if one can say that about a 2-
1/2-ton truck—this beauty, 
with its running boards, 
leather-clad seats and various 
bells and whistles. 

It is good exercise getting in­
to these family vehicles, a feat 
that usually requires grabbing 
an interior handle or the locked 
steering wheel, figuring out 
which foot to place first on the 
aforementioned running board 
and ascending into the SUV It 
was a surprise on opening the 
rear liftgate to find very little 
room for two mesh bags filled 
with the Saturday mornirig uni­
forms worn by middle-school 
basketball players at Jefferson 
Avenue Presbyterian Church. 

A search for passengers for 
the Tahoe garnered two on a 
cold Saturday morning. Sylvia 
Sanders and Debbie Rosetos 
said they were game for a trip 
up to St. Clair in search of the 
last ice floes and some lunch. 
They settled into their second-
row captain-style seats and en­
joyed the living-room ambience 
of the truck based vehicle. 

There was some confusion 
about how to keep feet warm in 
the rear, a problem not com­
pletely resolved using the sec­
ond-two climate control fea­
tures. 

And a reading of one of the 
information manuals was no 
help in setting our course on 
the navigation system. Just as 
well; we already knew how to 
get there. And back. 

Once inside and on the road, 
we'll confess this SUV is seduc­
tive and ingratiating. It feels ca­
pable of just about anything ex­
cept passing up opportunities 
to have its 26 gallon fuel tank 
"adjusted." The Tahoe LT with 
four-wheel drive and 5.3-liter V-
8 engine is rated at 15 miles per 
gallon in the city and an aver­
age 21 mpg <3n the highway. 

This was a flex-fuel vehicle 
with engine capable of running 
smoothly on E85 ethanol 
blends. A quick Internet check 
showed'but four E85 sources in 
metro Detroit, all in suburban 
locations. 

The standard vehicle price 
on this model was listed as 
$38,420. This is a lot of truck 
for the buck. The test vehicle, 
however, was all dolled up with 
several options packages. The 
Tahoe LTZ equipment group 
tacks just over $8,800 to your 
invoice. It includes some 
leather seat trim, a three-pas­
senger third-row seat, 
heated/leather-trimmed second 
row seats with power release, 
heated washer fluid and rain 
sensitive wipers, all-row head 
curtain air bags and rear park­
ing assist. 

For an additional $2,250, 
you'll get that navigation sys­
tem; a rear-seat entertainment 
feature runs $ 1,295, and a 

rearview camera system is 
$250. 

Cha-ching: $51,975, includ­
ing destination charge from its 
birthplace, Janesville, Wis. 

Chevrolet's subcompact fi­
nally arrived, dressed in mus­
tard yellow and ready for ac­
tion. And that it did get, with a 
weekend excursion east across 
the Ohio Turnpike to greater 
Cleveland. 

Hello, economy; farewell, ul­
tra luxury. The five-speed Aveo 
LS four-door came with a 
clutch and crank windows. 
And, after extensive searching, 
there appeared to be only one 
cupholder, at the rear of the 
center console. 

The Aveo is sold internation­
ally and is a colaborative effort 
between General Motors and 
Daewoo. 

Power is provided by a 103 
horsepower 1.6-liter four. With 
a five-speed manual transmis­
sion, highway fuel economy 
can average 37 mpg. The four-
speed automatic loses one 
mpg. 

The base price on the Aveo 
' LS sedan tested was $ 11,950. 
Its counterpart Aveo5, with a 
truncated appearance and lift-
gate rear end is about $ 1,000 
cheaper. Fold-down rear seats 
turn the sedan into a willing 
work vehicle, and the tough, 
washable upholstery seems 
quite practical. 

Chevrolet said the Aveo was 
redesigned for this model year 
and has a longer and wider 
body than its predecessor. 

Anti-lock brakes are a $400 
option on the LS sedan, while 
side air bags protecting front 
seat passengers are standard. 

from Chevy 
'-•:•• - ' > j * * , - ^ w ^ : < * < 

• • v W i T 1 J . iffirSi• "^ ^X 

The Chevrolet Tahoe, redesigned for 2007, will take you around with style and authority. 

Aveo is Chevy's fuel-efficient five-passenger subcompact imported from South Korea. 

So is air conditioning, driver A $425 package buys you 
seat height and lumbar adjust- cruise control, keyless entry 
ment, tilt front seat headrests and power door locks, which and fog l̂amps boosted the total 
and rear window defogger. were over-sensitive and kept price by $935. 

locking without prompt. 
Wheels, sound system adds 

^m^a-s&s&^^^s^^^^^^^si^eB^s^^i^^^^^^sss^ 

DonGobley 
Where Professionalism & Loyalty Is Reality 

East Nine Mils Road 

586 772 8 2 0 0 / 3 1 3 343 5300 

dongoafeycaditiac.com/ 

Just east af t-94 
"Hours Monday'fi Itar&tpy - 8:30am until 9:00pm 

Tuesday, Wednesday, Friday - 8:30am until 6:00pm 
,*8M$ employee lease payments based on 24 month, 18,fltKI miles per year. With approved GMAGS-C lief credit CTS $3,825 00 total due, STS S3f959 SO 
total due, Escalade: $5,975,83 total due. Ail sipings just add tax plus plates to monthly payment Offer expires Juno 30,2037 

http://dongoafeycaditiac.com/
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TEST DRIVE ByGregZyla 

The luxurious 2007 Nissan Altima 2.5 S offers push button ignition, 
Intelligent Ke^ Bluetooth hands-free phone system and more at a great 
startingprice of $19,800. 

The 2007 Nissan Altima 2.5 S performs 

T
his week, we're be­
hind the wheel of 
Nissan's all-new 
2007Altima2.5S. 
With a base price of 

$19,800* consumers looking for 
a mid to larger Size vehicle that 
produces excellent gas mileage 
ahd is fun to drive should take 
note. 

Although the Altima brand 
first appeared in 1993, this 
fourth generation offering is 
Undoubtedly Nissan's best ef­
fort to date. Specifically, 
Aitima's 15 year evolution re­
sults in a car that's perfect for 
families who need room for 
five, want great fuel mileage,' 
and are working with a strict 
budget. 

The base Altima lists for just 
$17,950, and receives the same 
peppy 2.5-liter 4 cylinder en­
gine that powers our "S" mod­

el. It puts out 175 horsepower * 
and 180 pound-feet of torque, 
and comes connected to a fine 
shifting 6-speed manual trans­
mission. This engine-transmis­
sion combination results in 25 
city miles per gallonand an as­
tounding 35 highway, which we 
found to our liking as we fol­
lowed a high school baseball 
team some 300 miles during 
our test to "away" games. 
When we returned the car, al­
most a half-tank of regular 
grade fuel remained in the 20.0-
gaUontank. 

For those looking for more 
performance, a more expensive 
3.5 series powered by a 270 
horsepower 3.5-liter V6, is 
available. However, we recom­
mend Aitima's 4 cylinder over 
the V6 for two reasons; cost and 
fuel economy. The V6 models, 
Which start at $24,000, escalate 
quickly into "Maxima Land" 
price range as $30,000 comes 
quickly when adding a few nice 
options. Additionally, EPA 
numbers drop significantly, to 
21 and 29 for a V6 manual and 
22/28 for the CVT automatic. 

We especially like Aitima's 

exterior design. Similar to 
Chrysler when it comes to 
putting "new and novel" de­
signs o|t the highway, both 
Altima and big brother Maxima 
are two of the best looking cars 
ohthe road. With its all-new 
sculptured look, including 
"350-Z" style headlights, the 
motif blends both aerodynamic 
touches and a "chiseled" look 
that, somewhat mimics 
Maxima's personality. 

As for size, Altima is two 
inches shorter this year than 
last, yet is still spacious in near­
ly every manner. 

Underneath, Nissan keeps 
Altima glued to the road via ful­
ly independent four-wheel sus­
pension with front and rear sta­
bilizer bars. Aiding in the stop­
ping procedure are 4-wheel 
disc brakes, although the 4-
wheel anti-lock feature will cost 
$300 more. 

Safety items include driver 
and passenger air bags with 
dual stage deployment, seat 
mounted front side air bags 
and front and rear side head 
curtain air bags located in the 
roof. Years ago, customers 

would pay dearly for this kind 
of safety, and we applaud 
Nissan for making these items 
standard on base models. 

Other standard features are 
too numerous; but they are all 
there, from air conditioning to a 
chrome dual tipped exhaust. 

Inside, the. cloth seats are 
comfortable, with fully reclin­
ing front buckets. The driver 
side seat manually adjusts six 
ways, while the passenger side 
adjusts four ways. (Do we real­
ly need adjustable power 
seats?) The spacious rear seat 
is a 60/40 split folding bench 
design with fold-down center 
armrest. 

We especially like the ameni­
ties, like eight cup holders (four 
front and four aft), door mount­
ed storage pockets, front dual 
seatback storage pockets, cov­
ered lower console storage, 
overhead console storage and, 
finally, a coin holder. If you 
have something to store, 
Nissan Altima has a place for it, 
and the interior overall is much 
better than previous generation 
models. 

Important numbers include a 

2007 Nissan Altima 2.5 S 

wheelbase of 109.3 inches, 15.3 
cubic feet of luggage space, and 
a3,127pound curb weight. 
Our tester's final price came in 
at $21,935 with the addition of 
a convenience package for 
$1,050, (not recommended) 
and $ 170 for floor mats in cabin 
and trunk (expensive). With 
$635 destination, we arrive at 
the final tally. 

Nissan's Altima has come a 
long way since it debuted to 

battle Toyota Camry, Ford 
Fusion/Taurus, Chevy Malibu 
and Honda Accord. Currently, 
it could well be the best buy of 
the bunch, and we rate it a 9.5 
on a scale of one to 10. 

Likes: Price, performance, 
fuel economy, room, design. 

Dislikes: Anti-lock brakes 
optional, traction control not 
available on 4-cylinder models. 

Greg Zyla is a syndicated au­
to columnist. 

Tire care maximizes performance 
Savvy drivers are constantly 

seeking ways to increase fuel 
economy and to squeeze out 
more miles per tank. 

Instead of focusing purely on 
the fuel gauge, experts suggest 
paying more attention to tires. 
The right rubber on the road 
can save gas in the tank. . 

"Tires that are unde&inflated 
by just 6 to 7 psi (p'dtinds-per 
square inch) can reduce fuel 
economy by 2 percent or more 
... and tread wear life by as 
much as 10 percent," says Fred 
Koplin of Yokohama Tire Corp. 
"When a tire is under-inflated, 
the car's weight rests more on 
the tire's shoulders than its cen­
ter, causing poor fuel economy, 
uneven wear and a less-than-
firm ride, which can significant­
ly reduce driver control." 

Koplin says most people 
aren't aware that today's tires 
are scientific marvels, holding 
up under extreme heat and 
freezing conditions, cruising 

over pavement, rocks, dirt, wa­
ter, snow, mud, gravel and all 
sorts of road hazards. Tires 
boast" advanced tread designs, 
sidewalls, belts and com­
pounds, and they work so well, 
they've practically become an 
afterthought in most house­
holds. 

"The-tire's proper.inflation 
level can be found on a placard 
in the glove box or on the car 
door or in the owner's manu­
al," says Koplin. 

Koplin suggests the follow­
ing procedures to aid proper 
tire wear: 

• Once a month, when the 
tires are cold, or at least three to 
four hours after the vehicle has 
been driven, check tire pres­
sure with a reliable tire gauge. 
(Normal driving causes tires to 
heat, raising air pressure. 
Releasing air when tires are hot 
may dangerously under-inflate 
the tires.) And.be sure that the 
valve ,stems have a plastic or 

metal cap to keep out dirt and 
seal against leakage. 

• Tires should be rotated at 
least every 5,000 to 8,000 miles 
and the alignment should be 
checked once a year. 
Misaligned tires can cause the 
car to drag, which lowers 
mileage and causes unneces­
sary, tire wear. 

• An over-inflated tire puts 
less tread on the road and in­
creases wear on the center of 
the tread. A tire is designed to 
run with, the vehicle's weight 
spread evenly across the tire's 
width. 

"Even though tire technolo­
gy has advanced as much in 
the past decade as almost any 
other facet of automotive engi­
neering, only the discerning 
consumers understand the 
high-tech realities of tires," 
says Koplin. "However, with es­
calating fuel prices, the time is 
fast approaching when drivers 
are going to focus on simple 

things like proper tire pressure 
to maximize tire performance, 
increase fuel economy and 
boost tread wear." 

With gas prices at record 
high levels, you'll want to 
make sure you are getting the 
best gas mileage possible. 
Once all these checks are tak­
en care of, you'll be ready to set 
off. 

We Run Small Ads To Pass 

BIG SAVINGS on TO YOU! 
SPECIALS aty i l7WOI .OAuto.com 

EMPLOYEE PRICING TO EVERYONE! 

NEW 2007 SONATA 
LEASE 169 

Hyundai Advantage 
AMERICA'S BEST WARRANTY 

ft 106,000 Mile 
I PotfflrtiwnPfflMtifto 

I Tr 60,000 Hit* S T r Miming Miles 

s .Wi^& f t t o to r j r ^&CwLwa lY S23$dJS.12G03irL'e5[snFsr. 

YOUR NO-HASSLE DEALER 

HYUNDAI 

<S> HYunoni 
Drive your way" 

Gratioi @ 12 Mile Rd. * Roseville 

1-877-666-6428 

Hot weather driving tips 
Each summer more than 7 

million cars breakdown on the 
road. Most breakdowns can be 
easily avoided. . >; 

"Hot weather brings unique 
challenges," says Ray Palermo, 
director of public relations for 
Response Insurance. "It can 
present dangerous conditions 
for both the vehicle and its oc­
cupants." 

Before heading out, be sure 
to check out the basics, includ­
ing: oil, transmission fluid, 
windshield washer, battery 
level and strength, tire pres­
sure, cooling system, and a 
well .equipped emergency kit 
and tool box. 

"Drivers need to stay cool as 
well," says Palermo. "Our na­
tional driving habits surveys 
have shown that 75 percent of 
drivers are fearful of encoun­
tering road rage and 37 per­
cent said they had personally 
experienced it in the previous 
six montfcts^' 

Do not estalate aggression 
on the road by responding to 
it. Take along moist towlettes 
and water to refresh yourself, 
and stop to stretch and relax! 

• When driving in hot 
weather, it is important to keep 
an eye on the lights and 
gauges. If the temperature 
gauge moves up, turn off the 
air conditioner and turn on the 
heater to its highest and 
hottest setting. It wiU be un­
comfortable, but it will help 
draw some.of the heat.away 
from the engine. 

• If. you are stopped in traf­
fic, put the car in "park'' and 
lightly step on the gas to help 
circulate coolant. 

• If the temperature light 
goes on or if the gauge enters 
the red zone, immediately pull 
op1 the road to a safe spot, well 
away from traffic. Do not drive 
any further —" not even to the 
next exit. Driving with an 
overheated efjgine can cause 
serious damage to the engine. 
,;• Dp not attempt to remove 

the radiator cap itself. The hot 
pressurized coolant will spray 
out with great force. Do not 
pour water over the radiator or 
engine, since a dramatic 
change in temperature could 
cause damage. After the en­
gine cools, add a 50/50 mix of 
coolant and water to the reser­
voir to bring it up to its proper 

level. 
• Even when not stranded 

due to a breakdown, summer 
h e ^ can pose dangers. Never 
leave'a' dhild or pet in a parked 
;Car. Even an outside tempera­
ture in the 80s can quickly 
b|irig a car interior to lethal 
levels. 

• Bring a cell phone for 
emergency calls, but do not 
use it while driving., 

• Make sure your tires are 
properly inflated. Improperly 
inflated tires can affect your 
gas mileage. Also inspect tires, 
including the spare for signs of 
uneven or excessive .tread 
wear. You don't want to have a 
blowout. 

Race car on display 
Race fans can virtually roar 

around the Daytona 
international Speedway at 
rnprathfln 180 mph, thanks to 
AAA's simulated race car. 

The public is invited to go 
for a eyber-drive from 2 to 8 
p.m., Thursday, June 27, at 
Roy O'Brien Ford, 22201 Nine 
Mile, St. Clair Shores. 

In addition to the two-seater 
simulator, the actual No. 6 
AAA Nextel Cup Ford Fusion 
race car will be on display with 
the 850 horsepower engine 
fired up. * 

While fans cannot drive the 
real No. 6 car, free high quality 
photos will be taken of visitors 
next to the race car and can be 
printed or saved from AAAs 
Web site. Top speeds in the 

simulator races will also be 
posted at.AAA.com/motor-
sports: 

Prize drawing giveaways in­
clude an AAA collectible team 
jacket and tickets to the Nextel 
Cup Series 3M Performance 
400 at Michigan International 
Speedway Aug. 19. 

AAA is in its second year 
partnering with 
Roush/Fenway Racing as pri­
mary sponsor of the No. .6 
AAA Ford' Fusion. 

"Hero" cards of David 
Ragan, the 2007 driver of the 
No. 6 car, will also be available. 

Ragan, 21, began racing at 
age 11 in the Bandolero Series. 
He is competing for the title of 
Rookie of the Year in the 
Nextel Cup Series. 

http://And.be
http://atyil7WOI.OAuto.com
http://at.AAA.com/motor-
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Hill Days 
Businesses in the Hill shopping district in Grosse Pointe Farms celebrated its annual H iIIIJ i\««11-*1 

weekend. Several of the local merchants sold dozens of items shoppers will use this su i u 1 i *.|u 

daily with the Fourth of July fast approaching. Pictured above is 4-year-old Leah Glovt r \ i l ' \ WSk & 

mom, Sue, who had their faces painted in front of the Grosse Pointe News by Martha O >.<_.... * ** 

Right, shoppers take their time mulling over sale items. V4fc? 
PHOTOS BYRENEE LANDUYT 

HURRY, ONLY 44,999 TURKEY LEGS LEFT. 

TASTE OF CHICAGO: 70+ RESTAURANTS. 10 DAYS. JUST ONE OF THE CITY'S GREAT SUMMER EVENTS. 

GRANT PARK, CHICAGO, IL - JUNE 29 - JULY 8, 2007. 

BOOK YOUR 3-DAY GETAWAY FOR A CHANCE TO WIN SHELL GAS FOR A YEAR. 

WWWXNJOYiLLINOlS.COM/D-0AY ! 1800,2.CONNECT ! FAMiLY GETAWAY 

.LIN03S. MILE AFTER MAGNIFICENT MILE, 

SKILL CONTEST rules at enjoyitSinois.com, $2500 Shell gift card for yr. of gas. Void in AK, AZ, CT, HI, MD, ND, NJ, VA, VT, and where prohibited by law. Contest ends 8/31/07. Must be US resident 18 or older to enter. Sheil Oil Products US is not a promotion sponsor. 
The Magnificent Miie® is a registered trademark of GNMAA. ©2007 Hlinois Department of Commerce and Economic Opportunity, Bureau of Tourism TTY: 1.800.406.6418. 

GMAC AND SAAB FINANCIAL 
LEASE PULL-AHEAD! 

No-Charge Scheduled Maintenance for 3 years or 
36,000 miles on all Saab vehicles! 

http://WWWXNJOYiLLINOlS.COM/D-0AY
http://enjoyitSinois.com
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BUSINESS 

ROBERTA. 
HUDSON, a 
Butzel Long at­
torney and share­
holder, has co-au­
thored a treatise 
on initial public 

offerings. 
The paper was co-authored 
with Donald L. Toker of 
Crowell & Moring LLP in 
Washington, D.C. 
The article examines the trans­
actional aspects and regulatory 
requirements of an initial pub­
lic offering of securities. 
Hudson is the manager of the 
firm's Business Law Group. He 
represents domestic and for­
eign public and private compa­
nies and high-technology com­
panies in corporate finance, 
mergers and acquisitions, e-
commerce and general busi­
ness matters. He has extensive 
experience in securities mat­
ters including numerous public 
and private equity and debt of­
ferings, venture capital fi­
nance, compliance, reporting 
requirements, going private 
transactions, investment man­
agement, the organization of 
hedge funds and corporate 
governance matters. 
He regularly assists foreign-
based companies in connec­
tion with U.S. and cross-border 
transactions, joint ventures, 
distribution and sale arrange­
ments, and trade matters. His 
industry expertise includes 
manufacturing, high-technolo­
gy including software, Internet 
and computer services, finan­
cial services, automotive and 
real estate investment trusts. 
He served as general counsel 
for a NASDAQ listed company 
during its adoption of the cor­
porate governance provisions 
of the Sarbanes-Oxley Act and 
under listing requirements and 
handled a wide variety of the 
company's general corporate 
and regulatory issues. 
He has appeared before the 
United States Suprenie Court, 
the Securities and Exchange 
Commission and numerous 
other courts and agencies. He 
is a trained mediator and arbi­
trator for the American 
Arbitration Association, 
National Association of 
Securities Dealers, Inc. and for 
private disputes. 
He is the co-author of the BNA 
Corporate Series Portfolio and 
the co-editor of the Michigan 
Business Formbook. He was 
also a contributing author to 'A 
Practical Guide to E-Business 
Law." He frequently lectures 
on topics involving business 
and securities law issues. 
Hudson's professional mem­
berships include the American 
Bar Association's Committees 
on Federal Regulation of 
Securities and International 
Business Law, former council 
member of the Business Law 
Section of the State Bar of 
Michigan, and former chair­
man of the Securities and 
Commodities Law Committee 
of the Metropolitan Detroit Bar 
Association. His business and 
community memberships in­
clude president and board 
member of the Michigan chap­
ter of the French-American 
Chamber of Commerce and a 
member of the Business Law 
Advisory Board of the Institute 
of Continuing Legal Education. 
Hudson is listed in "The Best 
Lawyers in America" (corpo­
rate law and international 
trade and finance law) and in 
"Michigan Super Lawyers" (se­
curities and corporate). He is a 
'Martindale-Hubbell featured 

AV Peer Review Rated Lawyer. 
Hudson is a graduate of Wayne 
•State University (B.A. with dis­
tinction, 1969; J.D., cumlaude, 
1972), and was on the editorial 
board of the Wayne Law 
Review. 
Hudson is a resident of Grosse 
Pointe Farms. 

GABRIELLE THOMAS has 
been appointed Accounting 
Aid Society's director of devel­
opment. 
In addition to grant writing and 
program development, 
Thomas is planning the 35th 
anniversary gala for the 
Detroit-based nonprofit that 
provides tax assistance and 
promotes the economic self-
sufficiency of low-income fam­
ilies in southeast Michigan. 
She earned an MBA from the 
University of Detroit and has 
more than 10 years of experi­
ence in business planning and 
project management. 
She is an active volunteer for 
school and extracurricular ac­
tivities for her three teenage 
children. Thomas resides in 
Grosse Pointe Park. 

ROBERT PERTUSO has been 
named managing editor of 
Veritas Global LLC, a business 
intelligence and global inves­
tigative firm, announced 
Gregory Suhajda, chief operat­
ing officer. 
Pertuso, as a member of the 
FBI, has investigated numer­
ous organized crime groups 
and racketeering cases, de­
fense industry procurement 
fraud, and served as the super­
visory senior resident agent of 
the Indianapolis Division 
where he led numerous white-
collar crime and organized 
crime investigations. 
In 1996, he was transferred to 
the Detroit Division Foreign 
Counter-intelligence Squad 
where he was one of the first 
agents to be trained in investi­
gating economic espionage 
and the theft of trade secrets 
from U.S. corporations. He al­
so served as the Detroit 
Division Case Agent for the 
9/11 terrorist bombings as a 
member of the Joint Terrorism 
Task Force. 

MARY SUE STONISCH, 
DJD.S., won a gold medal for 
her entry in the 13th annual 
American Academy of 
Cosmetic Dentistry Smile 
Gallery competition, spon­
sored by Americus Dental 
Labs, Inc. 
The annual competition high­
lights the effects of cosmetic 
dentistry at its finest. 
Stonisch exhibited outstanding 
skill in the single unit anterior 
or posterior esthetics category 
where she won the gold medal. 
She is a Grosse Pointe Woods 
resident. 

G R O S S E P O I N T E F A R M S 

auction a hit 
Bidders at Joseph 

DuMouchelle, Fine Jewels and 
Timepieces auction, held 
Tuesday, May 8, at the Ritz 
Carlton in Dearborn were daz­
zled by the final bid totaling 
$960,000 for a 13.24 carat 
emerald cut diamond lady's 
ring. 

Bidding for the diamond 
opened; at $700,000 and quick­
ly escalated. Buyers were in at­
tendance from throughout the 
United States, Canada and 
Europe, as well as heavy phone 
bidding activity by potential 
buyers. 

Highlights included a 5.57 
carat emerald cut diamond 
ring that fetched $108,000. 

Other featured diamonds in 
the sale include a 5.51 carat 
fancy intense yellow diamond 
lady's necklace that sold for 
$48,000. 

More than 270 lots were of­
fered in the annual spring 
event. 

For more information, call 
(800) 475-8898 or at josephdu-
mouchelle.com. 
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Joseph DuMouchelle, right, and Melina (Lindy) Adducci held their annual spring auction that 
brought in a high volume of buyers from around the country. 
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contest 
PHOTO COURTESY OF ANGELO DICLEMENTE 

The Grosse Pointe Business and Professional Association of Mack Avenue will hold its summer sidewalk sale (co-sponsored by the 

Grosse Pointe News) Wednesday, July 11, through Saturday, July 14. The theme for this year's event is "Summer Fun for Kids on 

Mack." Featured during the sale will be a bike decorating contest for kids in various age groups at 6 p.m., Thursday, July 12, on the 

lawn of Grosse Pointe Woods City Hall. Prizes will be donated by American Cycle and Fitness, 20343 Mack. The contest will be fol­

lowed by a concert in the Woods at 7 p.m. featuring the band, "Avenue," sponsored by the city of Grosse Pointe Woods. At 11 a.m., 

Saturday, July 14, AAA of Grosse Pointe will hold a bike safety rodeo at city hall. For additional information on all events, call Angelo 

DiClemente, chairman of the summer sidewalk sale, at (313) 884-9400. 

NOEL SELEWSKI AGENCY 
(313)886-6857 

Serving the community for over 25 years 
• Auto • Home • Life 

• Commercial • Residential 
• General Liability • Renter's Insurance 

15206 Mack Ave 
Grosse Pointe Park, MI 

Located in the Lakepointe Building 
(2 blocfes South of Tom's Oyster Bar) 

n-ooDoao loaof uaoaoaaaoa*: oooocjoaaoodD"* 
Each One Sold 

Supports 
Contact the Grosse Pointe Chamber of Commerce at 313.881.4722 The Grosse Pointes 

grossepointechamberofcommerce.org 

A HOME 
EQUITY LINE 

BUILT AROUND 

* < PRIME MINUS 1 % HOME EQUITY LINE. 
Arc YOU looking for a great rate with great extras YOU won't find anywhere else? 

• PRIME RATE MINUS I% FOR THE LIFE OF THE LOAN 

* NO CLOSING COSTS • INTEREST ONLY PAYMENT OPTION 

FRANKLIN 
BANK 
WE PUT FIRST. 

FRANKLINBANK.COM I 80Q-527-4447; 

Goossf. POINTS W O O D S I BIRMINGHAM I SOUTW^ICLD i TROY I LIVONIA I SHELBY TOWNSHIP I FLINT I FLUSHING 

Tlie Al'k <•!• thi'. virubii'.K'ilii inn :- " ;v-.. .1, nfpubli, m.m dai..- ,n, ki.uu up io ai>\. ;'I'.ippi-,ii>-ed v.ilik .«ui eredii M'OIVS of 700 and above. Minimum line amount of 550,000 with an immediate draw of $10,000. Must 
h.tu- ,m jitto tiviiiiii'!' twin ,111 Ukmi.ite Ani'ss t:ht\l,!iis;Ai'nuiii(Jk -me IIHOIMIII voiir {ax advisoi repudmi; t.ix deductibility. The rate is indexed to the Prime Rate, which is published in the' Wall Street Journal and may 
urv Orliir.r.iEfs .irkt <enm .110 .e,jiLiMe. R.ito 1 ,m go ,!• low .is 4 oil"., hut will never [W higher tlun Is"... A Sn" anmul fee is waived for one year. The borrower is responsible for flood insurance and title fees, if required. 
I'ropoay HMiruK-.' 1. K'i|inK\t [idl. .mi |IJ;IIK>II! nt unj\i!ti kii.il in- required .u the end ol'ihe term '_" vcirv A S.V111 prepayment penalty will be applied to the original'line amount if the loan is paid off within the first 
three u-iiiv Tefi in and t niidilnun -.sibieil to loan .ippmval 

MEMBER FDIC mm 
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NEWS 
these or any crimes should call 
the Grosse Points Shores police 
department at (313) 881-5500. 

Grosse Pointe woods 

City of Grosse Pointe 

Drunken driving 
A 32-year-old Detroit man 

was arrested for drunken dri­
ving following a traffic stop on 
Cadieux at 3:19 a.m. Saturday, 
June 16. 

Police stopped the vehicle 
for speeding. When question­
ing the driver, police detected a 
strong odor of intoxicants 
coming from his facial area. 
The man failed field sobriety 
tests and registered a .24 on a 
breath test 

A LEIN (Law Enforcement 
Information Network) check 
revealed the man had several 
driver's license suspensions 
and was wanted on a felony 
warrant in Detroit. 

He was arrested and held for 
pick up. His vehicle was im­
pounded. 

Suspicious behavior 
Police are investigating the 

actions of several young peo­
ple who were going from 
house to house in the 800 block 
of Rivard on Friday afternoon, 
June 15, 

Police said when questioning 
the men and. women, they 
claimed they were conducting 
a survey for a local telephone 
company. They showed identi­
fication to the officers, but a 
check with the company re­
vealed the IDs were not the of­
ficial format of the company. 
Police also became suspicious 
because they left the area right 
after being questioned. 

Police said the nature of the 
questions being asked by the 
group have them concerned 
about a possible identity theft 
attempt. 

Home for sale? 
iJkii^U.,, ; .. , , - i - ,...J#V. - ... J.-

Police are investigating the 
removal of several items from 
a house.on Cameron Place re­
ported at 7:32 a.m. Thursday, 
June 14. 

Police said the homeowner 
reported the house was for 
sale, but a bank had it listed in 
foreclosure. The homeowner 
reported that a local moving 
company had entered and tak­

en several items without con­
sent. 

—By John Lundberg 
Those with information on 

these or any crimes should call 
the City of Grosse Pointe police 
department at (313) 886-3200. 

Grosse Pointe Farms 

Fugitive arrest 
A 23-year-old Detroit man 

was arrested following a traffic 
stop at Mack and Kerby at 4:20 
p.m. Saturday, June 16. 

Police stopped the vehicle 
for having an improperly dis­
played license plate. A LEIN 
(Law Enforcement 
Information Network) check 
revealed the man had nine dri­
ver's license suspensions and 
was wanted on warrants in 
Detroit and Roseville. 

He was arrested and held for 
pick up. His vehicle was im­
pounded. 

Drunken driving 
Police arrested a 65-year-old 

Grosse Pointe Woods man for 
drunken driving following a 
traffic stop on Mack at 11:14 
p.m. Friday, June 15, 

Police stopped the vehicle af­
ter observing it weave from 
lane to lane. When questioning 
the driver, police detected a 
strong odor of intoxicants 
coming from the man's facial 
area. His speech was also 
slurred and his eyes were 
bloodshot. 

After failing field sobriety 
tests, the man registered a .15 
on a breath test. 

He was arrested and his ve­
hicle impounded. 

Held for pick up 
A 23-year-old Detroit man 

was arrested after a traffic stop 
on Mack at 5 p.mV Sunday, 
June 10. 

Police became suspicious 
when they observed the man 
approach his vehicle, then 
leave when he saw them and 
returned to a store in the 18000 
block of Mack. He later re­
turned with a female and she 
drove away with him as a pas­
senger. 

After stopping the vehicle, 
the driver admitted the vehicle 
was the suspect's. A LEIN 
check revealed the man was 
wanted on several warrants. 

He was arrested and the ve­
hicle was released to the fe­
male driver. 

—By John Lundberg 
Those with information on 

these or any crimes should call 
the GrossePointeFarms police 
department at (313) 885-2100. 

Grosse Pointe Park 

Cellphones stolen 
On Monday, June 11, be­

tween 3:30 and 8:30 p.m., and 
Tuesday, June 12, between 
2:30 and 6:15 p.m., cell phones 
were taken from unlocked 
lockers in the ladies locker 
room at Windmill Pointe Park. 

Items swiped 
On Monday, June 11, be­

tween 1:30 and 5 p.m., a 
Blackberry and a pair of golf 
shoes were taken from an un­
locked car parked on the street 
at Middlesex and Avondale. 

Rims lifted 
On Wednesday, June 13, be­

tween 3:30 and 5:35 a.m., four 
20-inch chrome wheels were 
taken from a 2006 Dodge 
Durango parked in the 800 
block of Barrington. 

Going nowhere 
Overnight on Monday, June 

11, a watch, a wallet filled with 
credit cards and a passport 
were taken from an unlocked 
vehicle parked in the 900 block 
ofPemberton. 

Two bikes taken 
from two homes 

Overnight on Tuesday, June 
12, two separate complaints 
were received concerning bicy­
cles taken from properties in 
the 1000 and 1100 blocks of 
W&yburn. 

—ByBemQuinn 
Those with information on 

these or any crimes should call 
the Grosse Pointe Park police 

department at (313) 822-7400. C a r S t o l e n a t W O r k 

The School District Of The City Of Harper Woods 
Notice to Bidders 

The School District Of the City Of Harper Woods will receive sealed bid proposals for 
construction, trade work as listed below from qualified Subcontractors for the New High 
School/Middle School Phase II - Building Construction, 20225 Beaconsfield, Harper 
Woods, ML 

Proposals Due Proposals may be mailed or delivered in person to Ms. Sue Hedemark, 
^ Secretary Of The Board Of Education for the School District Of The City Of Harper 

Woods, 20225 Beaconsfield, Harper Woods, MI. 48225. 

Proposals must be received prior to 2:00 p.m. (local time) on Wednesday, June 27,2007. 

Proposals will be publicly opened at 2:15 p.m. in the Board Of Education conference 
room. All bids will be evaluated after the bid opening. Bids received after 2:00p.m.on the bid 
date will be disqualified. 

The project will utilize separate prime contractors. All contracts for construction will be direct 
contracts with the Owner. Overall administration of the Project will be the responsibility of 
the Construction management Firm, E. Gilbert & Sons, Inc., 45887 Mound Rd., Utica, 
Michigan 48317, Phone: 586-731-7450, Fax 586-731-9289. The Owner will award contracts on 
or about July 17,2007 to separate contractors for separate bid divisions or combinations of bid 
divisions. A Bidder may submit a proposal on more than one Bid Division; however, a separate 
bid must be submitted for each Bid Division of a combined bid. All bids shall be submitted on 
the bid forms provided in the project specifications, completely filled in, and executed (copies of 
the bid forms are acceptable). Facsimile bids will not be accepted. 
The Bidders shall read and review the Bidding Documents carefully, and familiarize 
themselves thoroughly with all requirements. 

A Pre-bid meeting (non-mandatory) will be conducted by the Construction Manager, E. 
Gilbert & Sons, Inc. on June 19, 2007 at 11:00 PM at the on site field office. 

Plans Available One (1) set of Bidding Documents will be provided to each contractor 
furnishing a plan deposit fee of $50.00 per set through E.- Gilbert & Sons, Inc.. All checks 
and/or money orders are to be made payable to the School District Of the City Of Harper 
Woods. Plans may be obtained from E. Gilbert & Sons, Inc., attention Nancy Schroeder (586-
731-7450). Plan deposits are refundable, provided plans and specifications are returned in 
good condition to the Construction Manager following contract awards. All questions 
regarding the bidding procedures, design, and drawing/specification intent are to be directed to 
the Construction Manager on a Clarification Request Form (See Section 00310), attention 
Michael Beaugrand or Robert Koepsell. 

A Bid Security in the amount of five percent (5%) of Base Bid shall accompany ALL 
proposals or proposal combinations. The Bid Security may be in the form of a Bid Bond, 
Cashier's Check, or Money Order. Personal checks are NOT acceptable. Bids may not be 
withdrawn for a period of sixty (60) days after the bid date. Successful Bidders may be 
required to furnish Surety Bonds as stated in the Project Specifications (Section 00600). 

All Bids shall be accompanied by a sworn statement disclosing any familial relationship that 
exists between the owner (s) or any employee of the bidder and any member of the Board Of 
Education of the School District. The Board Of Education will not accept a bid that does not 
include a sworn and notarized familial relationship disclosure statement. 
The Owner reserves the right to reject any or all proposals, accept a bid other than the low bid, 
and to waive informalities, irregularities, and/or errors in the bid proposals, which they feel to 
be in their own best interest. 

Separate proposals will he received for the following Bid Categories: 

290 Building Landscaping 
335 Pre-east Concrete Storage Building 
1106 Stage Rigging & Curtains 

GPN: 06/14/07 

Ms. Sue Hedemark, 
Secretary of the Board of Education 

City of Harper Woods 

Grosse Pointe Shores 

No brake lights 
A 42-year-old Detroit man 

was arrested following a traffic 
stop on Lakeshore 4f\l"2:57 
a.m. Sunday, June 17. * \ ' 

Police stopped the vehicle af­
ter observing it having no func­
tioning brake lights. A LEIN 
(Law Enforcement 
Information Network) check 
revealed the man had a sus­
pended driver's license and 
was wanted on a Detroit war­
rant. 

He was taken into custody 
and his vehicle was released to 
a licensed passenger at the 
scene. 

Many warrants 
Police arrested a 34-year-old 

Detroit man following a traffic 
stop on Jefferson near Matter 
at 2:53 a.m. Saturday June 16. 

Police stopped the vehicle af­
ter observing its license plate 
frame obscured the number, 
making it unreadable. The dri­
ver could not produce any pa­
perwork for the vehicle. A 
LEIN check revealed he was 
wanted on five warrants. 

He was taken into custody 
and his vehicle impounded. 

Wrong way 
Police arrested a 48-year-old 

Eastpointe man for drunken 
driving following a traffic stop 
on Lakeshore at 10:53 a.m. 
Tuesday June 12. 

Police stopped the vehicle af­
ter observing it driving north in 
the southbound lane. When 
questioning the driver, police 
observed a strong odor of in­
toxicants coming from his fa­
cial area. He failed field sobri­
ety tests and registered. 11 on a 
breath test. 

A LEIN check revealed the 
man had two driver's license 
suspensions and was wanted 
on two warrants. 

He was arrested and his ve­
hicle impounded. 

—By John Lundberg 
Those with inprmation on 

At 12:40 p.m., Wednesday, 
June 13, a Chrysler LeBaron 
owned by an employee of a 
grocery store on Mack was 
stolen from the store's parking 
lot. A female coworker on 
break saw three men in a white 
minivan circle the lot a few 
times, then pulled up to the 
parked car. One of the men en­
tered the LeBaron and drove it 
away. 

The witness said she thought 
the men were her coworker's 
friends so she didn't think any­
thing was amiss until the 
coworker discovered his car 
was missing. 

Stock missing 
Sometime between the in­

ventory dates of Feb. 11 and 
May 20, approximately 
$29,000 in merchandise was 
taken from a Mack camera 
store. Police suspect an em­
ployee who worked six to sev­
en months at the store and 
who opened the store approxi­
mately 30 minutes before other 
employees arrived. 

IDtheft 
A 44-year-old female resi­

dent reported that an unknown 
person used her Social 
Security number to open a 
DirectTV account. She became 
aware of this when the account 
went delinquent and was sent 
to a collection agency. 

Her ID was stolen in August 
2006 after she opened a new 
cellular phone account at a cell 
phone store on Mack. 

Mom supplies 
graduates drinks 

Between 12:26 and 2:20 a.m., 
on Sunday, June 17, police re­
sponded twice to reports of a 
possible party involving alco­
hol at a house on the 2100 
block of Lennon. The first time 
the police visited the house, the 
underaged youths ran inside 
and would not speak with the 
officers. 

The second time the officers 
spoke with the homeowner 
who admitted to purchasing al-

city of d r u s e s | Jmt t te Jifarms, Michigan 
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, that the City Council will 
consider the following proposed ordinance at its meeting 
scheduled for Monday, July 9, 2007, at 7:00 p.m. in the City 
Council Chamber of City Hall at 90 Kerby Road. 

This hearing is to consider an amendment to Code No. 12-03, 
Zoning Ordinance, Section 1602, pertaining to the Duration 
of Activities Related to Demolition, Renovation and/or 
Construction of Buildings in Residential Districts. The pro­
posed ordinance is available for public inspection at City 
Hall, 90 Kerby Road, between 8:30 a.m. and 4:30 p.m. 
Monday through Friday. Written comments regarding this 
proposal will be accepted at the City Clerk's Office until 
Friday, July 6, 2007,12 00 noon. This meeting is open to the 
public and all interested persons are invited to attend. 

G.P.N: 06/21/07 
Matthew Tepper, 

City Clerk 

GROSSE POINTES-CLINTON 
REFUSE DISPOSAL AUTHORITY 

MEETING SCHEDULE 
July 10,2007 6:00 p.m. City of Grosse Pointe Park 

15115 E. Jefferson Avenue 
Grosse Pointe Park, MI 48230 
(313) 882-6200 

September 11,2007 6:00 p.m. City of Mount Clemens 
One Crocker Blvd. 
Mount Clemens, MI 48053-2537 
(586)469-6803 

November 13,2007 6:00 p.m. City of Grosse Pointe Farms 
90 Kerby Road 
Grosse Pointe Farms, MI 48236-3100 
(313) 885-6600 

January 8,2008 6:00 p.m. City of Grosse Pointe Woods 
20025 Mack Avenue 
Grosse Pointe Woods, MI 48236 

'.-'. (313)343-2440 

March 11,2008 6:00 p.m. Village of Grosse Pointe Shores 
795 Lake Shore Road 
Grosse Pointe Shores, MI 48236 
(313) 881-6565 

May 13,2008 6:00 p.m. City of Harper Woods 
19617 Harper Avenue 

> Harper Woods, MI 48225 
(313)343-2500 

For more information, please contact our General Counsel: 

John J. Gillooly 
Garan Lucow Miller, P.O. 
1000 Woodbridge Street 

Detroit, MI 48207 
(313)446-5501 

cohol for her son's graduation 
party. 

Citations were issued to nine 
youths for underage drinking 
following administrations of 
preliminary breath tests. One 
guest, who refused to take the 
test, was taken to the police 
station and his parents were 
contacted. 

The police advised the 
homeowner several times to 
have her son return to the 
scene. After several minutes of 
not complying, she was arrest­
ed for obstructing justice. 
When she was placed in hand­
cuffs, her son appeared from 
the home. He was taken into 
custody for obstructing justice. 

Wrongway 
On Sunday, June 17,; police 

responded to . a citizen's call 
about a Black Toyota heading 
east in the westbound lanes on 
Mack.; Other motorists were 
blowing their horns and swerv­
ing to avoid rutting the car. The 
87-year-old female driver said 
she didn't realize:she was dri­
ving the wrong way until oth­
ers were blowing their horns. 

Needed a iide> 
At 3 p.m. Sunday, June 17, a 

19-year-old male resident re­
ported, in the 1800 block of 
Broadstone, that an overnight 
guest took his car without his 
permission. 

Late night drinking 
At 2:01 a.m., Saturday, June 

16, police observed a Toyota 
Camry with a burned out 
brake light swaying in a lane of 
traffic at Mack and Eight Mile. 
After pulling over the driver, a 
33-year-old St. Clair Shores 
male, police noted an odor of 
intoxicants coming from the 
man's facial area. 

Police administered field so­
briety tests during which the 
driver swayed and was unable 
to correctly recite the alphabet. 
When he refused a preliminary 
breath test, police received a 
warrant for blood tests. He was 
taken to an area hospital and 
was found to have a blood alco­
hol content of .069. 

The driver was issued a cita­
tion for operating a vehicle 
while intoxicated, refusing a 
preliminary breath test and 
having a broken brake light. 
He posted a $100 bond and 
was released. 

—ByBethQuinn 
Those with information on 

these or any crimes should call 
the Grosse Pointe Woods police 
departmentat (313) 343-2400. 

Parking 
costs OK'd 

Construction surprises do 
not come cheap. 

That's what City of Grosse 
Pointe officials now know as 
they approved an additional 
$92,202 in costs to remove tMe 
foundation and backfill p£ the 
former Jacobson's parking 
structure Monday night 

During the course of demoli­
tion, contractors discovei&d 
that the foundation was con­
siderably thicker than expect­
ed. 

It was also found that the 
backfill Contained elements 
that were not suitable for the 
construction of the new park­
ing deck. 

The city's only recourse was 
to pay the additional costs for 
the cleanup. 

"It appears to be backfill 
from the structures that were 
on the site before the garage 
was built and contains broken 
pipe and roots," said Peter 
Dame, city manager. 

It took only a few days to de­
molish the old structure. A new 
parking deck is expected to be 
completed by the time Trader 
Joe's opens for business in 
Kercheval Place at the end of 
the year. 

"This extra cost due to un­
foreseen conditions would 
have been required regardless 
of the contractor," Dame said. 

The costs will be absorbed 
by the parking garage bond. 
The budget for the new park­
ing structure included a contin­
gency amount of $200,000 to 
cover unexpected costs, Dame 
said. 

—By John Lundberg 
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SCHOOLS 
HIGH SCHOOL GRADUATIONS 

PHOTO BY RENEE LANDUYT 

Grosse Pointe North 
graduates 
Above, members of the Grosse Pointe Board of Education and Superintendent Suzanne Klein 

stand on the stage as the 2007 graduating class of 373 Grosse Pointe North students file into their 

assigned seats on the football field. Graduation was held Thursday, June 14. Pictured right is State 

Sen. Martha Scott, D-Highland Park, center, with graduates from left, Stephanie Dennis, Rebecca 

Dennis, Jonathan Ismail and William Schrage.,. 
**ev 
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I Grosse Pointe South 
PHOTO BY RENEE LANDUYT 

PHOTO BY RENEE LANDUYT 

ULS graduates 

Grosse Pointe Board of Education President Brendan \V&lsh, center, hands a diploma to one of 

Grosse Pointe South's 369 students who were a part of the 2007 graduation ceremonies held 

Wednesday, June 13, on the front lawn of the high school. Left, school board members listen to one 
of several student speeches during commencements. 

* W -

I Elizabeth Claire Palmer, far 

I right, addresses her fellow 
; classmates who were a part of 

| University Liggett School's 

i 2007 graduating class of 64 stu­

dents. The commencement 

' ceremony was held Tuesday, 

| June 12. Pictured right is a ULS 

j graduate with her 2007 tassel 

shining bright during the 

event. 
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UNIVERSITY LIGGETT SCHOOL 
BOARD OF TRUSTEES, ADMINISTRATORS, FACULTY AND STAFF 

* AND T H E I R PARENTS. 
Along with their admissions decisions, the class was offered 

more than $1,500,000 in merit scholarships. 
Je rome Balingit 

Chelsea Elizabeth Baumgarten 

Lawrence Randolph Belcher, III 

Elizabeth Bicknell 

Alexander D. Brooks 

William Yales Campbell, J r . 

Stephen Alexander (.-arson 

Alexander Cole-Selvaggio 

Joseph Moynihan Conway 

Michael Stephen Corheti 

Johnathan Demetrius Craig 

Grace Deborah D'Arey 

Ryan Daniel Deane 

James Philip Dickinson 

Alexia Marie' E;ii»a 

John William Laurence EiUpalrick 

Alexander David Limbaeh Fleming 

Tsighie Ari. Foster 

Thomas Kaname Fujishige 

Lucy Sullivan Cellman 

Mary Josephine Gerlach 

John Feabody Gray, J r . 

Erik Brandon Gutermuth 

Matthew Douglas Hames 

Bianca Taraara llawasli 

James F . Hightower 
Winston Hughes 

Gregory Pierron Jones 

Za chary Wav*ie Keith 

David Russel Keys 
THlany Danielle Keys 

David Milton Kouskoulas 

$fe i ^ ; K#§* 
' & . : • • 

Andrew Nelson LaLonde 

Kamille Patricia Unnaza LaRosa 

Patrick G. Latcham, J r . 

Kyle Lawrence 

Dimitra Stefania Leheta 

Jessica Marie Leonard 

Charles Andrew Litch 

Cait l in Mtrnn, 

Jonathan Crawford Colter Nicboll 

Jacquelynn Elizabeth Olson 

Kather ine Jean Olson 

Elizabeth Claire Palmer 

Anthony Michael Provemano 

Sanjay Rama 

J i l l ian Ashley Rippblone 

Rachel Esther Robinson 

Lau'rcn Marie Russell 

Grif im Scillian 

Mia Rose Serafmo 

Ryan Gary Silver 

Den me Simmohs 

Sabr'a Kiuitt- Gorman 

Carlton Daynel Snyder, J r . 

Monique-Terese Squiers 

Jul ie Marie Stockm&rin 

Carrie Michelle Taylor 

Samantha Ann Troyariovich 

Catherine Watson 

Stephanie Lee Watts-Garcia 

Chelsea Whitfield 

Meghan Esther Wilson 

Michael Zukas 

] urn «• Oit Lnisnfi * Hua)M U s * As 11 
It*-,1. -*^ 

* I Hrfabi'ih^Pjilint i 
-• 

\ iuhonv P i m m / .im 

Mn ha' I / u l t 
« -

T M E 6 4 - M L M B L R U N I V E R S I T Y L I G G E T T S C H O O L C L A S S O F 2 0 0 7 
R E C E I V E D A C C E P T A N C E S T O T H E F O L L O W I N G C O L L E G E S A N D V N IVERSLL1ES. C O N G R A T U L A T I O N S O N Y O U R A C A D E M I C R E C O R D ! 

A d r i a n C o l l e g e 

A l b i o n C o l l e g e 

AUiya C o l l e g e 

A m c T ' i ; u \ 11 m v e r s i t y 

A m h e r s t C o l l e g e 

Afji>m;is ( ' o H c g c 

1CH N | ; n e U n i v e r s i t y 

B a r d Co l l ege . 

B a r w n C o l l e g e 

BoMi>n C o l l e g e 

B o s t o n U n i v e r s i t y 

B o « d o i n CnHe<>'e 

. B u t l e r U n i v e r s i t y 

C a s e W e s t e r n R e s e r v e 

C e n t r a l M i c h i g a n U n i v e r s i t y 

C l a r k A t l a n t a U n i v e r s i t y 

C o l l e g e o f C h a r l e s t o n 

C o l l e g e o f W i l l i a m & M a r y 

C o i l f g * tor C r e a t i v e S t u d i e s 

C o l u m b i a U n i v e r s i t y 

( i« l ( imj .His C o l l e g e <>i Ar t & D e s i g n 

C o r n e l l U n i v e r s i l y 

D l P i v U n i v e r s i t y 

L m o r y U n i v e r s i t y 

! e r r i s S l a t e U n i v e r s i i v 

F l o r i d a StrHe U n i v e r s i t y 

C e o r g e W a s h i n g t o n U n n c r s i i y 

G e o r g e t o w n U n i v c r s i t y 

C c U y s b u r g C o l l e g e 

<!<)»iriirr C o l l e g e 

i i u i t f o r d C o l l e g e 

C u s t a v n s A d o l p h u s ( ' o l l e g e 

H a r v a r d C o l l e g e 

i l o f . M r a U n i v e r s i t y 

I l o p e C o l l e g e 

I n d i a n a U n i v e r s i t y at B l o o n i i n g t o n 

J o h n s H o p k i n s U n i v e r s i t y 

K . a l a m a / , 0 0 C o l l e g e 

K e t t e r i n g U n i v e r s i t y 

L a k e F o r e s t C o l l e g e 

U n i v e r s i t y 

L e c s - M c R a c C o l l e g e 

L e h i g h U n i \ e r s i ( \ 

L o y o l a U n i v e r s i t y C h i c a g o 

Mn n b a t ( a n v i l L' C o l l e g e 

M a r y l a n d I n s t i t u t e ( a l l e g e o i ' A r t 

M a s s a c h u s e t t s I n s t . O f T e c h n o l o g y 
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M i e l n g a u I c c h n o l o g i c a l i ' n i v e r s i ( v 

M i d d l e h u r y C o l l e g e 

M o r s . h o u s e C o l l e g e 

New ^ ot 'k U n i v e r s i t y 

N i a g a r a U n i v e r s i t y 

N o r t h e a s t e r n U n i v e r s i t y 

N o r l h e m M i c h i g a n U n i v e r s i l v 

N o v a S o u t h e a s t e r n U n i v e r s i t y 

O a k l a n d U n i v e r s i t y 

O b e r l i n C o l l e g e 

P e n n s y l v a n i a S t a t e U n i v e r s i t y , 

U n i v . P a r k 

P e p p e r d i n e U n i v e r s i t y 

P u r d u e U n i v e r s i t y 

R e n s s e l a e r P o l y t e c h n i c I n s t i t u t e 

R o c h e s t e r I n s t i t u t e o f T e c h n o l o g y 

R<>s<.'~ H u h n a n I n s t i t u t e 

o i r e i l m o i o g \ 

S c h o o l o f t h e A r t i n s t i t u t e 

of' ( Chicago 
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Svt'eri B r i a r C o l l e g e 

S \ r a c u s e U n U o r s i u 

1 'eniple U n i v e r s i t y 

f 'uf ts U i i i y e r s i t y 

C l l a n O U n i v e r s i t y 

U n i v e r s i t y o f A k r o n 

U n i v e r s i t y of C a l i f o r n i a 

a t B e r k e l e y 

U n i v e r s i t v of C a l i f o r n i a 

a t S a n t a B a r b a r a 

U n i v e r s i t y of C a l i f o r n i a 

at S a n t a C r u z 

U n i \ e r s i t y o f ( j l i i e a g o 

U n i v e r s i t y of C i n c i n n a t i ( C o l l e g e 

C o n s e r v a t o r y o f M u . s i e ) 

I ' n i i ' c r s i t y 01 C ^ o n n e c t i e u t 
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U n i v e r s i t y of I l l i n o i s 
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U n i v e r s i t y oi M i i i n i i 

U n i v e r s i t y o f M i c h i g a n 

U n i v e r s i t y o l N o r t h C a r o l i n a 

at Chapel 11 ill 

U n i v e r s i t y o f S a n Dii ' i^o 

U n i v e r s i t y o f S o u t h e r n C a l i f o r n i a 

U n i v e r s i t y of l o l e d o 

U n i v e r s i t y o f V e r m o n t 

U n i v e r s i t y o f W i s c o n s i n , M a d i s o n 

V a n d e r b i l i U n i v e r s i t y 

V i l h m o v a U n i v e r s i t y 

W a k e F'ove.Sl U n i v e r s i t y 

W a v n e S t a t e U n i v e r s i t y 

W e b s t e r U n i v e r s i t y 

W e s t e r n M i e l i i g a n U n i v e r s i t y 

Whe.ato.n C o l l e g e 

Y a l e U n i v e r s i t y 
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IK'-V,., COOK ROAD (MAIN CAMIHJS), GKOSSF; F'OINTF WOODS, MI 43236 
313.88-1.4444 a 313.884.1775 FAX m WWW.ULS.ORG 

l'nuAT'>if\ Ij'^vctl SiiuKil, Michsgiin\ ultjrsi o>ahntilional independent school, is a colteop-prcporaloiy 

finy -.fhn'A sr-n1!^ ••ind-'.nl'- in grades I've -K thouid-, 12. Uniorr\il)- Liggett School does not unloiijully 

diM rinincj/c ai'jjin-l <:m- penan on the. htt'-t< <>\ ndvjion. nice, creed, color, national origin, -lex, age, 

dnnbdtl\t or any oilier protected clu^ as provided by ajrpti.ca.ble imv. 

file:///iuhonv
http://www.uls.org
http://ajrpti.ca.ble


SECT I OSS! B • GROSSE POINTE NEWS • JUNE 21,2007 

Take a look around 
River Days opens Detroit's RiverlFront 

doors to family fun. PAGE6B 

CHURCHES SENIORS HEALTH ENTERTAINMENT 

Dentist Mary Sue Stonisch is making the community brighter by 
restoring grins in the Give Back a Smile program. She believes that 
bright smiles lead to bright futures. 

g the smile 
Laura Phelps 
Special Writer 

Mother Teresa famously said 
"peace begins with a smile." 

Those words continue to in­
spire Grosse Pointe Woods 
dentist, Mary Sue Stonisch, 20 
years after she first began vol­
unteering with the American 
Academy of Cosmetic 
Dentistry's Charitable 
Foundation. 

On July 21 and 22, the com­
munity will be able to "restore 
a life by restoring a smile." 
People can get their teeth 
whitened for $250 and pro­
ceeds go to the academy's Give 
Back A Smile program that re­
stores the smiles of men and 
women who have been domes­
tically abused. 

July 15 will mark 20th an­
niversary of Stonisch's 
Faircourt Dental Smile 
Enhancement Studio, 20040 
Mack, Grosse Pointe Woods. In 
celebration of that, she said she 
wants to give something back 
to the community by lending 
her skills and dental tools to 
the cause. 

"It's a talent I've been 
blessed with and something I 
can bless others with, but in 
addition I certainly do it to in­
crease public awareness," said 
Stonisch. "Something I can 
give back is some of that beau­
ty they have lost." 

In two days, she plans to 
raise $6,000 for the program. 

Dentists receive whitening 
kits donated from Ultradent 
and Discus Dental to use dur­
ing the event. 

"It's hard enough to be a vic­
tim of abuse, but to lose some­
thing like a smile...a smile af­
fects your confidence, and 
overall health," said Stonisch. 

Since the program's launch 
on May 27,1999, it has raised 
$4,096,242 and 525 victims of 
domestic abuse have Been 
treated. 

In July 2001, the Academy 
was one of eight organizations 
in the world to receive the 
Award of Excellence. It was al­
so honored with the 
Associations Advance America 
Summit Award for the Give 
Back A Smile program. 

Repairing the smile of some­
one who has been attacked can 
have a significant impact on 
the progress they are able to 
make in their lives, Stonisch 
said. 

"To help a woman after be­
ing tragically a victim of do­
mestic abuse, to help them 
reintegrate back into the work 
force brings shivers to me," she 
said. 

However, not everyone who 
has been abused is eligible for 
the program. The Academy 

Dr. Stonisch, left, worked in Nicaragua last Christmas doing 
mission dental work. ** ' 

has a policy that the victim 
must be out of the abusive rela­
tionship for one year. 

"If you apply to the program 
you have to be in recovery so 
that we know we're helping to 
rebuild a life of someone mov­
ing out of the halfway house 
and reintegrating into society." 

Applicants for the restora­
tion program must complete at 
least one interview to confirm 
that they were a victim of do­
mestic abuse. They also need 
verification from a counselor, 
social worker, or case manager 
so the foundation can be as­
sured the victims are actively 
trying to change their lives. 

People have the mispercep-
tion that restoring a smile al­
ways means undergoing an in­
tensive makeover, Stonisch 
said. Instead, it is often some­
thing minor like a cracked 
front tooth that is holding them 
back from having the appear­
ance they want. The improve­
ments are usually completed in 
one or two appointments. 

She describes the transfor­
mation as an "awakening of 
the person." 

"It changes your personal in­
ner spirit," said Stonisch. "So 
many people walk around with 
their hands over their mouth 
and don't realize the impact it 
can have for other's perception 
of them." 

The purpose of the whiten­
ing event that Stonisch is host­
ing is not only to raise money, 
but to increase awareness and 
alert survivors that there are 
services available to them. 

Stonisch urges the commu­

nity to get involved in the pro­
gram so "they can be part of 
giving someone back a smile." 

She is no stranger to charity. 
Stonisch has spent time in 
Nicaragua and Malawi for mis­
sion work, including dentistry. 
She is also a member of The 
Matrix Band, the Give Back A 
Smile music group. 

The group traveled to 
Nashville, Tenn. and sang with 
country singer Reba 
McEntire's guitarist. The 
group adds dental terms to the 
lyrics of familiar tunes such as 
"I Will Survive" and "Born to 
Make Smiles". 

"I think we all could give 
back a little," said Stonisch. "I 
feel most satisfied when I'm 
giving." 

Not everyone is eligible for 
the whitening procedure. 
People with decay, severe gum 
recession, and open margins 
on existing crowns can not 
have their teeth whitened. 
Also, some people have teeth 
that simply will not get any 
whiter, said Stonisch. 

All participants in the Give 
Back A Smile program must 
have a consultation before the 
event and should contact the 
Faircourt Dental Smile 
Enhancement Studio at (313) 
882-2000. 

Those who do not want the 
procedure or can not receive it 
can still help the cause by do­
nating at Stonisch's office or 
online at aacd.com/foundation. 

On both days of the event, 
promoters will be outside the 
office along Mack accepting 
"drive-by donations," she said 

Grosse Pointe Woods dentist Mary Sue Stonisch with a child she helped in Nicaragua. 

Scholars 
The Grosse Pointe Historical 
Society awarded Andrew 
VanEgmond, Grosse Pointe 
North High School; Andrew 
LaLonde, University Liggett 
School; and Parti 
Schollenberger, Grosse Pointe 
Historical Society Scholarship 
Committee member. The third 
recipient is Tamara Andrade 
from Grosse Pointe South High 
School (not pictured). Students 
are selected each year by con­
sulting high school history de­
partment personnel. The schol­
arship was founded in 1993. 
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HEALTH SERVICES 

Bon Secours Hospital 
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Cottage Hospital 
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FACES & PLACES 

Scholarship recipients 
The American Association of University Women, Grosse Pointe branch, awarded its annual ed­

ucational scholarships to the following local women: Deborah Antrikin, who attends Macomb 

Community College and is majoring in elementary education; Angeline Howell who attends 

Macomb Community College and is majoring is nursing and intends to transfer to Wayne State; 

April Patrick, who attends Wayne State University and is majoring in education/Spanish; 

Joanna Hernandez, who attends Macomb Community College pursuing a nursing major; Janis 

Maul, who attends Macomb Community College and is majoring in nursing; Sylvia Nitsch, who 

attends Macomb Community College and is majoring in graphic arts; Emily Jatkoe, who at­

tends Walsh College, where she is working on a master's degree in international business; 

Kalyn Risker, Alternatives for Girls who attends Eastern Michigan University with an emphasis 

on business administration; and Shaelon Stokes, Alternatives for Girls, who attends Wayne 

State University and is majoring in accounting. Also pictured are Judy Floria head of the educa­

tion foundation and American Association of University Women, Grosse Pointe branch, and 

President Lynne Pierce. 

Scholarships awarded by DAR to high school graduates 
The Louisa St. Clair Chapter 

Daughters of the American 
Revolution of Grosse Pointe 
awarded scholarships to grad­
uating seniors from all three 
Grosse Pointe high schools. 

This year's awardees are 
Elizabeth Bielski, a Grosse 
Pointe South High School 
graduate, who plans to major 

in pre-med at Wayne State 
University; Katelyn Zemenick, 
a Grosse Pointe North High 
School graduate, who plans to 
attend the University of 
Michigan; and Kamille P. 
LaRosa, a University Liggett 
graduate. 

She is attending Kalamazoo 
College in the fall. 

In addition to local scholar­
ships, the National Society 
Daughters of the American 
Revolution awards more than 
$150,000 in scholarships and 
financial aid each year to stu­
dents, and supports schools for 
the underprivileged with annu­
al donations exceeding 
$1 million. 

S 
Since 1936 

Drapery Cleaning Specialist 
Custom Draperies, Blinds & 

Window Shades. Cleaned, Sold, 
Repaired. Take Down & ReHang 
Service Available. Call for FREE 
phone estimate. Mon-Fri 9am-4pm. 
313-521-3021 

LOCHMOOR 

HARDWARE 
The Dog Days of S u m m e r a r e j u s t 
a round t h e corner a n d it 's t i m e for 
your ou tdoor p ro jec t s . Come see 
w h y Lochmoor^Ace H a r d w a r e is 
Grosse Poin te ' s p ioneer h a r d w a r e 
s to re $ c e l e b r a t i n g i t s 8 0 t h y e a r ! 
I n c l u d e t h i s a r t i c l e w i t h y o u r 
pu rchase of $5 or more , a n d we'll 
give you a pack of ou r popular Ace 
L a w n Bags.. . F R E E ! Lochmoor Ace 
H a r d w a r e "The C a n d y S tore Fo r 
Adul t s" is located a t 20779 M a c k 
Avenue, Grosse P o i n t e Woods, 1 
block n o r t h of Vernier. 313-885-
0242 

ALINOSI Ice Cream 
Old Fashioned Soda Fountain, 

Chocolates, Truffles, and Cakes at Sara's 
Sweets! Fri. & Sat Noon-lOpm, Tues., 
Wed., Thu. ,& Sun. Noon-9pm. Closed 
Mon. 20737 Mack G.P. Woods, Next to 
Lou's Pet Shop Daily. Specials. (313) 
881-2888 

IRISH G0FFEE 
BAR » GRILL EST 

1380 

Best Kept Secret in 
Grosse Point©! 

You don ' t need a coupon to ge t 
the best prices on food a n d dr inks . 
Come in to the I r i s h Cof fee a n d 
check out the i r g r e a t m e n u w i t h 
reasonab le pr ices . G e t t h e "BEST 
FRESH GROUND ROUND BURGER" 
in town. Only $1 .96. M o n d a y -
Fr iday 11:00am - 5:00pm. Or t r y 
our Deluxe Ground Round Burger , 
choice or sa lad or cole s law a n d 
french fries only $4.96.. . (Dine in 
only.) G r i l l o p e n d a i l y t i l l 
1:00am, M o n d a y - S a t u r d a y 
11:00am - 2:00am, S u n d a y 5:00pm 
- 2am . . .at 18666 Mack Avenue, 
Grosse Po in te F a r m s , (313)881-
5675. 

To advertise in this column call (313) 882-3500 by 12:00 pm Fridays 

Fbiir more weeks 
There are only four more weeks to go before the AAUW-GP Branch stops accepting books for its 

annual used book sale Sept. 19 through Sept. 22 in Grosse Pointe Woods. Books are pouring into 

the storage garage where each is being marked by members of the University Women, Grosse 

Pointe Branch for the sale in the Grosse Pointe Woods Community Center, 20025 Mack Plaza. 

Proceeds are earmarked for scholarships for local students to attend local colleges and universi­

ties. Pictured are, in back, Margaret Alber and Joanne Mualem, book sale co-chairs, and in front, 

rare book expert Kay McKay. 

Author addresses Friends meeting 
By Kelly Fordon 

The highlight of the May 22 
annual meeting of the Friends 
of the Grosse Pointe Library 
was a presentation by histori­
an Harlow Giles Unger, author 
of "The Unexpected George 
Washington." 

He regaled the audience 
with little known facts of 
Washington's private life. 
Unger is the author of many 
other books, including the 
award-winning "Lafayette." 

Board members, Kelly 
Fordon, Elsie Onychuk, Henry 

Sprague and Gloria Whelan, 
were reelected to the board 
and three new members, 
Laurie Arora, Allison Kuhnlein 
and Chris Hamer, were induct­
ed. 

Two volunteers, Lynne 
Severini and Joanne Dennis, 
were honored with 2007 
Service Awards for their con­
tributions to the establishment 
of the new Friends Down 
Under Book Store at the 
Grosse Pointe Woods branch 
of the library which opened in 
February. 

The Friends will be working 
on several new projects this 
year including a Friends Book 
Club, which will include con­
temporary literary discussions 
in the fall and conclude in the 
spring of 2008 with the 
Classics Books Lecture Series. 
The Friends are looking for 
volunteers for the Friends 
Down Under Book Store to in­
crease hours of operation next 
year. For more information call 
the Friends at (313) 343-2074, 
ext. 6 or visit the Web site at 
gpfriends.org. 

Senior Men's 2007 tennis champ earns club trophy 
Tom Roberts of Grosse 

Pointe Park was awarded the 
Roy Vorhees Jr. Trophy during 
the Senior Men's Tennis Club 
2007 party, which signals the 
end of the season. 

The annual tournament was 
held in May at Wimbledon 
Tennis House in St. Clair 
Shores. 

Roy Vorhees, Jr. of Grosse 
Pointe Woods, a longtime 
member of the tennis club, is 
founder of the tournament. 

Runner up this year was Roy 
Vorhees m of St. Clair Shores. 

The club plays at 
Wimbledon in fall, winter and 
spring, and outdoors at the 
Grosse Pointe Neighborhood 
Club in the City of Grosse 
Pointe in the summer. 

Roberts is president of the 
Senior Men's Club. Call (313) 
886-3031 for information. 

The Senior Men's Club of 
Grosse Pointe meets twice 
monthly at the Grosse Pointe 
War Memorial for meetings, 
luncheon and a program. '•".-• 

From left, Tom Roberts and Roy Vorhees III. 

St. Clair 

Art Fair 
2007 

Sat., June 23* 10-7 
Sun., June 24 • 10-5 

In Palmer Park & Riverview Plaza 
Downtown St. Clair, Michigan 

(1-94 East to Exit 257) 

• 120 Visual & Performing Artists 
• Live Music 

• 5K Run 

Fun for the Whole Family 
Super Raffle! Drawing Sun., June 24, 4pm 

Need not be present to win 

Sponsored by 

Presented by the ST. CLAIR ART ASSOCIATION; 810-329-9576 

Class reunion 
The Grosse Pointe South 

High School class of 1987 is 
having a noon picnic on 
Saturday, June 30, at the 
Grosse Pointe Farms Pier Park. 

It is free. Attendees must 
bring their own food and bev­
erages. Families are welcome. 

For more information, call 
Bill Kalmar at (313) 505-6578 
or go to bkalmar@thinkcam 
bridge.com. 

$50,000 raised 
The Michigan Humane 

Society's spring Mutt March 
drew some 500 walkers, who 
raised nearly $50,000 to help 
the more than 100,000 animals 
the humane society will house. 

http://gpfriends.org
http://bridge.com
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FACES & PLACES 

Historical society acknowledges three homes 
The following three build­

ings were given a bronze 
::;tiiarlier by the Grosse Pointe 
Historical Society at its annual 
meeting to designate their his­
torical significance to the com­
munity 

Backman House 
1894 grocery store and home 
194 Moross Road 
Trjis p||>j$erty had a very ear­

ly beg&fjrig. In 1778 it was de­
scribed as "Land on the west 
side of Lake St. Clair, contain­
ing three acres in front and 40 

: acres in depth. It is bounded on 
the north by Joseph Peurnier, 
on the* south by Antoine 
Gaulette, in front by Lake St. 
Clair and in the rear by unlo-
cated lands. This was the land 
that would become the estate 
of Magloire Morass .in 1850 

. and later part of the C|arles G. 
Moran Subdivision in f§747"-:'' 

The property, specifically Lot 
No. 22, had various i>wners 
over the next 64 years: ilgnace 
Morass (1836), Ajptoine 
Morass (1848), Magloire 
Morass (1871), and Charles G. 
Moran (1874). In August 1892, 
Lot No. 22 was sold to Matthys 
Lodewyk and a year later, after 
his death, the lot was pur­
chased by Charles L. and Kate 
Backman for $410. 

In 1894, the building con­
tained the Backman Grocery 
Store which sold produce and 
penny candy treats. Children's 
shoes were another standard 
item. The Backman store deliv­
ered in those days and the 
horse and wagon were housed 
in an old barn behind the store. 
In front were displays of fresh 
fruits and vegetables. Behind 
the store, the living quarters 
had eight bedrooms and 1 and 
1/2 baths. The double door in 
front served as the entrance to 
the store. There were built-in 
cabinets, pine plank floors, and 
a narrow, steep stairway to the 
second floor. A pot-bellied 
stove provided heat for the 
StOre. .;.;,, 
- Upon Charles LvBackman's 
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Backman House, 1894 grocery stm v and home at 194 Moross 

Charles and Ingrid Koebel's home at 203 Cloverly, Grosse Pointe Farms 

death in 1938, Lot No. 22 was 
passed on to his eldest son, 
linus Backman (Uncle Len) in 
1939. The family store was 
converted to a home and Uncle 
Len and his sister, Mrs. John 
Kerby lived there with nothing 

indicating it was once a popu­
lar country store. 

Uncle Len continued to live 
at 194 Moross until his death in 
1966. It was then that Ignatius 
@ggy) Backman put the house 
up for sale and on July 1,1966, 
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Marlene and Kenneth Harle 
purchased the property. 

Charles and Ingrid 
Koebel House 

Eliel and Eero Saarinen, 
Architects, completed 1940 

203 Cloverly Road, Grosse 
Pointe Farms 

In 1937, Charles and Ingrid 
Koebel retained the architec­
tural firm of Eliel and Eero 
Saarinen to design and build a 
residence in Grosse Pointe 
Farms. The project was the 
first commission of Eliel and 
Eero. Both Eliel and Eero 
Saarinen worked on the de­
sign; Eero later wrote in a sum­
mary of his career that he 
spent about two months work­
ing on the design. The involve­
ment and influence of his fa­
ther, Eliel Saarinen, is reflected 

in many aspects of the design. 
In many respects, the house 
mirrors the Saarinen House at 
Cranbrook, Bloomfield Hills. 
Robert F Swanson, who asso­
ciated with his father-in-law 
and brother-in-law, prepared fi­
nal plans for the house in 
October 1939. Pipsan Saarinen 
Swanson was retained as inte­
rior designer. Other members 
of the Saarinen family provid­
ed additional design elements, 
including custom-woven tex­
tiles and art objects. The house 
features custom designed inte­
riors, lighting, hardware, fur­
nishings and finishes. 

The Saarinen design of the 
house contains repeated use of 
circles, inscribed in rectangles, 
and reflects the architects' inte­
gration of interior and exterior 
environments, hand-made and 
machine-made elements, and 
of architecture, sculpture, art, 
interior design and fine crafts­
manship. 

Built on a 154-foot by 170-
foot corner lot, the two-story, 
five-bedroom flat roofed struc­
ture contains 5,600 square feet 
of living space. Completed in 
1940, the home was owned by 
the Koebel family until 1985, 
when it was acquired by the 
present owners, Mariam C. 
Noland and James A. Kelly. It is 
one of only two single family 
homes in the U.S., outside of 
Cranbrook, that was jointly de­
signed by Eliel and Eero 
Saarinen. 

Entering the house, a curved 
brick wall leads guests into the 
library with its original book­
cases ahd a banquette seating 
nine. The brick wall in the li­
brary is accented with ribbons 
of Monel steel and mortar. The 
45-foot living-dining room has 
two 13-foot double-pane win­
dow walls with Monel steel 
framing which make the rear 
lawn and garden seem almost 
part of the interior. 

The dining area is defined by 
a curvilinear, receded ma­
hogany, paneled wall that has 
three niches for sculpture. In 
the garden room, the quartzite 
sandstone floor, carefully de­
tailed brick walls and bamboo 
ceiling are all original. The 20 
foot window wall offers a view 
of the curved brick wall across 
the lawn. There are five bed­
rooms and four baths on the 
second floor, three of which 
have Pewabic tile. Original 
built-in dressers, desks and 
bookcases are found in four of 
the bedrooms, the fifth one 
was designated as a maid's 
room. Framed original sketch­
es attributed to Eero Saarinen 
and other concept drawings 

for the house are hung in the 
upstairs hall. 

Three of the original "signa­
ture" Saarinen gates are locat­
ed on the properly. 

William A. McGraw 
House 

1884 Queen Anne Cottage at 
71 Lakeshore 

Redesigned 1927 by Robert 
O. Derrick 

The pretty Queen Anne cot­
tage designed for William A. 
McGraw was located at 
Lakeshore and Lakecrest. 
Although one of the later 
"colonists,'' McGraw was an 
ardent admirer of the Pointes. 
His property embraced about 
10 acres and was known as 
"The Poplars" because of a row 
of Lombardy poplars, and an 
Osage orange hedge that de­
fined the front of the property. 
It was a ribbon farm that ex­
tended from Lake St. Clair to 
Grosse Pointe Blvd. The interi­
or of the residence was a mod­
el of convenience, and its gen­
eral finish and tasteful appoint­
ments were admired by all. 

An attractive feature of the 
grounds of McGraw and his 
neighbor is a small park in 
front, extending to the lake. In 
1884, properties often included 
20 acres and had well stocked 
orchards of cherry, pear, peach 
and apple trees and graperies, 
which were the pride of then-
owners 

McGraw was the son of 
A.CMcGraw whose firm A.C. 
McGraw & Co. was one of the 
oldest and most successful 
mercantile firms in Detroit. He 
married Harriet A. Robinson, a 
niece of John S. Newberry. 
Both he and his wife were born 
in Detroit. They had two chil­
dren, Kathleen and Harrie. 

In 1927, there was extensive 
remodeling done to the fagade 
for Percival Dodge, by Robert 
O. Derrick, architect. At that 
time, the property consisted of 
three acres. The lot across 
Lakeshore was. __xacant 
Located on one of the last large 
parcels of land, the house sat 
on a deep lot, 634-foot by 109-
foot, with lake views. It is a 14 
room, two-story, gracious 
home with outstanding fea­
tures, quality and architectural 
details rarely found today. It 
has seven natural fireplaces, 
historic gardens, high, ceilings 
and a carriage house. The 
property is located where the 
road bends and approaches 
more closely to the lake. This 
historic home is an excellent 
example of adaptive reuse. It is 
currently owned by Jennifer 
and Todd Callewaert. 

This house is known as "The Poplars" and is owned by Jennifer and Todd Callewaert 

Theatre tea 
Grosse Pointe Theatre hosts a 
2 to 5 p.m., Sunday, June 24, 
tea, silent auction and raffle in 
the Crystal Ballroom of the 
Grosse Pointe War Memorial, 
32 Lakeshore, Grosse Pointe 
Farms. It will include a musical 
revue, a costume show, theatri­
cally themed tablescapes and a 
champagne luncheon. Prizes 
will be awarded for the best tea 
ensemble and hat. 
Reservations may be made by 
calling the theatre's box office 
at (313) 881-4004. The cost is 
$55. A pre-tea table viewing for 
$10wiU be from 11:30 a.m. to 1 
p.m. Proceeds will be used to 
refurbish the Fries Auditorium 
stage. 

Marlene and Kenneth Harle, owners of the Backman House; Jennifer and Todd Callewaert, 
owners of "The Poplars;" Peggy Woodhouse, chair of the selection committee; James A. Kelly, 
owner of the Saarenin house; Valerie Dodenhouse, member of the selection committee/Grosse 
Pointe Historical Society board membeK 

Tennis is easy to play. Meet new friends. 
Learn new skills. Begin a lifetime of fun. 

Call today to sign up. Who Knows? A little fun 
could lead to a passion for the game! 

Junior lessons are held at 
the University Liggett School. 

To Register Call: 

313-886-2944 

E A 8 T S I D E 

E\T\F 
TENNIS & FITNESS 
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CHURCHES 

Fireworks 
Are you looking for some­

thing to do before the fire­
works display begins in 
Grosse Pointe Woods on 
Sunday, June 24? 

St. Michael's Episcopal 
Church, next to Parcells, is 
playing host to a Fireworks 
Festival from 5:30 to 9:30 p.m., 
June 24, on the front lawn of 
the church. & 

The evening includes food, 
games, a Moonwalk and live 
music. 

Sandwiches, including 
Italian sausage, chicken, burg­
ers and hot dogs, are sold 
along with several side dishes, 
soda and bottled water. The 
Moonwalk, children's activi­
ties and face painting will be 
free of charge. 

A musical presentation by 
church organist Dan 
Dillingham, begins at 8 p.m. in 
the church. He will play a vari­
ety of patriotic and classical 
pieces. 

This is a free concert. 
The church is located at 

20475 Sunningdale Park. For 
more information, call St. 
Michael's office at (313) 884-
4820. 

Guitar tournament 
"Guitar Hero Tournament" 

will be held for children from 
H to 17 years of age beginning 
at 10 a.m. Friday, July 13, at 
the Grosse Pointe 
Congregational Church. 

There will be a winning 
prize for each age group and 
the entry fee is $5. Entry dead­
line is Monday, July 9. 

Entry fee, the player's name 
and age should be addressed 
to Alison Scarfone, youth di­
rector, Grosse Pointe 

Congregational Church, 240 
Chalfonte, Grosse Pointe 
Farms, MI 48236. 

For more information, visit 
the church's Web site at gp-
cong.org. 

VBS 
Join St. Paul's Lutheran 

Church Vacation Bible School, 
22915 Greater Mack, St. Clair 
Shores, from 9:30 a.m. to 
noon, June 25 through June 
29. Registration begins at 9 
a.m. 

Preregistration is advised 
and can be done by calling the 
church office at (586) 777-
0215. Messages will be re­
turned. 

Empty bowls 

Children from Assumption 
Church Camp will host an 
"Empty Bowls" fundraiser 
from 11 a.m. to 1 p.m. Friday, 
June 22, at Assumption Greek 
Orthodox Church, 21800 
Marter, St. Clair Shores, to 
help stop world hunger. 
Donations are $10 for adults 
and $5 for children. Guests will 
have a soup and bread lunch 
and take home a ceramic bowl 
decorated by Assumption chil­
dren. Proceeds will benefit or­
ganizations fighting world 
hunger, Gleaners Community 
Food Bank and the 
International Orthodox 
Christian Charities. 

Vacation Bible School 
"The Great Bible Reef" is the 

theme for the 2007 Vacation 
Bible School at First English 
Evangelical Lutheran Church, 

800 Vernier Road in Grosse 
Pointe Woods, June 25 through 
29. 

Children will "dive deep into 
God's word" after a free-will 
offering dinner 5:45 to 6:30 
p.m. 

Bible school hours are 6:30 
to 8:15 p.m. 

The cost is $7.50 per child; 
families with three or more 
children will pay $20. 

Call the church office to reg­
ister at (313) 884-5040. Call 
Anne Kbenig at (313) 881-4515 
with questions. 

Meaningful Mondays 

St. Paul Evangelical 
Lutheran Church, 375 
Lothrop, Grosse Pointe Farms, 
offers Meaningful Mondays 
for Living Well in Jesus Christ 
to the community. 

It begins with Fools for 
Christ: Clown Ministry on 
Monday, June 25.. The event 
begins with a summertime 
meal at 6 p.m., meditation is at 
6:45 p.m. and ministry with a 
hands-on activity from 7:15 to 
8 p.m. Weather permitting, the 
meal and worship service will 
be outdoors. 

The evening will include a 
non-verbal worship service 
where the message of the 
Gospel is conveyed by the ac­
tion of the participants and the 
background music with the 
clown defined as a fool. 

"We are called to be fools for 
Christ's sake." 1 Corinthians 
4:10. The glory of God is re­
vealed in that God uses the 
weak and unwise to bring the 
saving message of Christ to 
people. God's messages of 
love and forgiveness are con­
veyed by the clown who 
brings out the child in us all. 

The gospel message calls us 
to adcept one another in 
Christ's love and to trust in 
Jesus Christ as Lord and 
Savior. 

The clown reaches out for 
acceptance in a very simple 
way and risks the possibility 
of rejection. 

The symbols of rejection 
and sadness, as well as joy 
and celebration, we find in the 
clown remind us of Jesus 
Christ who was rejected yet 
triumphed in resurrection. 
The white face of the clown 
symbolizes death while the 
bright colors painted over the 

white symbolize joy and cele­
bration. In the clown, we re­
call the joy and celebration of 
the resurrection of Jesus and 
the forgiveness of sins that 
Jesus offers freely to all. 

Meaningful Mondays in 
July include God doesn't 
make junk featuring the min­
istry of Arts & Scraps on July 
2; God's healing touch featur­
ing health ministry on July 9: 
Conversations with Christ fea­
turing the prayer ministry on 
July 16; God's green Earth 
featuring Earth keeping on 
July 23; and bound in the spir­
it featuring the ministry of the 
Pieces Be with You Quilt 
group on July 30. 

Pilgrimage 

On Thursday, Aug! 9, the 

Holy Family Church Ushers 
Club will sponsor a pilgrimage 
to the Basilica and National 
Shrine of Our Lady of 
Consolation in Carey, Ohio. 

Bus 1 leaves at 7:15 a.m. 
from St. Athanasius Church, 
18720 13 Mile at-KeUy. Bus 2, 
on which Italian will be spo­
ken, leaves from the Kmart 
parking lot at Garfield and 
Canal at 6:45 a.m., then pick­
ing up at St. Athanasius at 7:15 
a.m. 

Both buses return at 7 p.m. 
All seats are $25. Deadline is 
Aug. 1. 

Make checks payable to 
H.FC. Ushers Club and mail to 
Tina Bullis, 18130 Airport, 
Fraser, MI, 48026. 

Include a self-addressed 
stamped envelope. 

For more information, call 
(586) 296-6295. 

Anthony August Ricci 
Dino and Julie Ricci of 

Grosse Pointe Farms are the 
parents of a son, Anthony 
August Ricci, born March 22, 
2007. 

Maternal grandparents are 
William and MaryAnne 
Hielscher of Grosse Pointe 
Woods. 

Paternal grandparents are 
Roger, and Sandra Ricci of 
Grosse1 Pointe Woods. 

Teresa Ricci of Harper 
Woods is the great-grand­
mother. 

Harper Woods. 
Paternal grandparents are 

Dr. and Mrs. Monroe S. 
Lechner, Venice, Fla. and St. 
Clair, formerly of Grosse 
Pointe Park. 

Evan Grey son Lechner 
Paul and Rhonda Lechner of 

St. Clair Shores are the par­
ents of a son, Evan Greyson 
Lechner, born April 24,2007. 

Maternal grandparents are 
Ronald and Rita Rehahn of 

Eve Karina Marie 
Adams 

Jeanene Adams of the City 
of Grosse Pointe has adopted a 
daughter, Eve Karina Marie 
Adams, born Nov. 17, 2005, 
and adopted March 6,2007, in 
Rostov, Russia. 

Grandparents are Tom and 
Evon Adams of Fort Myers, 
Fla. 

Woods are the parents of a 
daughter, Alyssa Eleanor 
Eppers, born April 12,2007. 

James and Eleanor Mayle of 
Royal Oak are the maternal 
grandparents. 

Marilyn Eppers of RoseviUe 
and the late John Eppers are 
the paternal grandparents. 

Alyssa Eleanor Eppers 

John and Beth (Mayle) 
Eppers of Grosse Pointe 

Gabriel Elijah Egan 

Dennis and Teresa Egan of 
Mount Pleasant are the par­
ents of a son, Gabriel Elijah 
Egan, born April 7,2007. 

Ted and Joyce Orwig of 
Mount Pleasant are the mater­
nal grandparents. 

Paternal grandparents are 
Diane Egan of Grosse Pointe 
Farms and the late Dennis 
Egan Sr. 

Great-grandmother i$ Opal 
Luce of Mount Pleasant 

WORSHIP 
First Church of Christ, Scientist 

282 Chalfonte Ave. 

Sunday Service -11:00 a.m. -12:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Testimony Meeting 

8:00 p.m.-9:00 p.m. 

All are warmly welcome at Both services 
Free Chiidcare provided 

Questions? 884-2426 

A Saint 
Ambrose 

Parish 

Saturday Vigil Mass 
at 4:00 p.m. 

Sunday Masses 
at 8:30 & 11:15 am. 

St. Ambrose Roman Catholic Church 
15020 Hampton, Grosse Pointe Park 

One block north of Jefferson, at Maryland 

FIRST ENGLISH EVANGELICAL 
LUTHERAN CHURCH 
800 Veniier Koad (Cotwtf Wedgewood) 

(313)884-5040 

9:00 am - Traditional Worship 
10:30 am - Contemporary Worship 
7:00 pm - Thursday Evening Service 

Nursery Available 

c!> 
' Rev. Walter A. Schmidt, Pastor 

Rev. Gerald Slsklz, Associate Pastor 
"Go Make Disciples" ~ 

4 

Grosse Pointe 
UNITED METHODIST 

CHURCH 
A Friendly Church for 

All Ages 
211 Moross Rd. 

Grosse Pointe F a r m s 
886-2363 

Sunday 
9:30 a.m. Worship 

Church Sunday School & Nursery 
10:45 am 

LOGOS Congregation 

Rev. Robert D. Wright-Pastor 
Rev. Pamela Beedle-Gee-Associate Pastor 

Grosse Pointe Baptist Church 
Christ Centered and Caring - Committedto Youth and Community 

Sunday Worship -11:00 AM 
Sunday School - 9:30 AM for Age 2 - Adult 

Awana Clubs Wednesday @ 6:15 p.m. 
Middle School Youth meet Wednesday at 6:30 p . m . 

Senior High Youth meet Tuesdays at 7:00p.m. 

21336 Mack Avenue Grosse Pointe Woods 
Phone: (313) 881-3343 

Jefferson ZLvenue 
TresByterian Church 
Serving Christ in Detroit far over 153 years 

Sunday , June 2 4 , 2 0 0 7 
8:30 a.m. Informal Worship Dodge Hall 

10:30 a.m. Worship Service 
Sermon: "Belonging" 
Scripture: Galations 3:23-29 

Peter C. Smith, Preaching at both services 
Summer Church School: Crib - Second Grade 

Join us for: 
Church Picnic and Carillon Concert 

Sunday, June 24,11:45 a.m. - Front lawn 
Parking. Lot 
Behind Church 

8625 E. Jefferson at Burns, Detroit 
Visit our website: www.japc.org. 313-822-3456 

SERVICE 

Christ the King 
Lutheran Church 

Mack at Lochmoor 
884-5090 

8:15 & 10:45 a.m. - Worship Service 
9:30 a.m. - Sunday School 

& Bible Classes 
Supervised Nursery Provided 

www.christthekinggp.org 
Randy S. Boelter, Pastor 

Timothy A. Holzerland, Assc. Pastor 

Grosse Pointe 
Congregational Church 

10:00 a.m. FAMILY WORSHIP 
(crib room available) 

10:00 a.m. Church School 

AFFILIATED WITH THE UCC AND ABC 

240 CHALFONTE AT LOTHROP 

Rev. Ed Bray, Pastor 

www.gpcong.org 
gpcon^sbcglobal net 

884-3075 

GRACE UNITED 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 
1175 Lakepointe at Kercheval 
Grosse Pointe Park 822-3823 

s nday-Worship 10:30 a.m. 
I esday-Thrift Shop" 10:30-3:30 

Wednesday -Amazing Grace Seniors 
every second Wednesday at 

The Tompkins Center at 
Windmill Pointe Park 11:00-.3:00 

COME JOIN US 
Pastor: Marguerite (Margo) Allen 

WELCOME 

m\ mm 

0P£V BOOBS 

St James 
Lutheran Church 

"ontkHilT 

170 McMillan Road 
Grosse Pointe Farms 

Sunday: 
Holy Eucharist 

at 9:30 a.m. 

313-884-0511 
stjamesgp@ameritech.aet 

Grosse Pointe Woods 

A place of grace, a place of 
a 

Sufid»? Worship 10:30 a,ai, 

GROSSE POINTE MEMORIAL CHURCH 
Established 1865 The Presbyterian Church (V.SA.) 

8:30 a.m. Lakeside Worship Sendee 
10:00 a.m. Worship Service in the Sanctuary 

The Rev. Peter Henry, preaching 

A STEPHEN MINISTRY and LOGOS Congregation 

16 Lakeshore Drive, Grosse Pointe Farms * 882-5330 

www.gpmchurch.org 

Ptstork jHarmmi' Optrdf 
A House of Prayer for All People 

Traditional Anglican Worship 
Since 1842 

SUNDAY 
8:30 and11:00 a.m. - Holy Communion 

• 11:00 a.m. - Church Sunday School 
and Nursery 

THURSDAY 
12:10 p.m.- Holy Communion 

170 E. Jefferson Avenue 
On Hart Plaza al the Tunnel 

Free Secured Parking in Ford Garage 
with entrance in the median strip 

of Jefferson at Woodward 

(313)-259-2206 
marinerschiirchofdetroit.org 

Grosse Pointe 
Unitarian C h u r c h y 

June 24, 2007 
Converting to Unitarian Universalism 

Speaker: Christine Edith Hillman 
Service at 10:30 a.m. 

17150 MAUMEE 
881-0420 

Visit us at www.gpuc.us 

T&' 

St, Paul Ev. Lutheran Church 
375 Lothrop at Chalfonte 

881-6670 
Sunday 

10am Worship 
With Communion 

Nursery.Available 

Rev. Frederick Harms, Pastor 
Rev. Morsal Collier, Assoc. Pastor 

Old St %ar\f$ Cathode Cfiurch 
* Greektown-Detroit 

Welcomes You 
(corner of Monroe & St. Antoine) 

Visit and worship with us 
when you're downtown 

Weekend Masses 
Saturday: 5:30 p.m. 

Sunday: 8:30 a.m. 
10:00 a.m. (Latin-Choir) 

12:00 p.m. 

Dai ly Mass: 
Monday- Saturday at 12:15 p.m. 

Confessions 20 minutes before eveiy Mass 

http://cong.org
http://www.japc.org
http://www.christthekinggp.org
http://www.gpcong.org
mailto:stjamesgp@ameritech.aet
http://www.gpmchurch.org
http://marinerschiirchofdetroit.org
http://www.gpuc.us
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HEALTH/SENIOR 
SENIOR SCENE By Ruth Cain 

A very different method of fundraising 

I
f you're looking for a lu­
crative fundraiser for 
your group, IVe got just 
the plan. This project is in 
its final stage, involving a 

group of 12 women in their 70s 
and 80s who are raising money 
for Monongahela historical 
sites. Monongahela is a small 
community near Pittsburgh. 

Twelve women were essen­
tial to the project because it in­
volved producing a calendar, 
with different women posing 
for each month. 

The women knew elderly 
ladies posing for a calendar 
wouldn't fire up much enthusi­
asm among buyers. So they de-

. tided they would pose nearly 
nude. 

Each had to overcome a 
great deal of worries before 
they agreed to participate. 
What if the priest happened to 
walk by during a photo shoot, 
or their children and grand­
children were unforgivingly 
embarrassed? 

They decided that the funds 
raised would be worth the pos­
sibility of negative feedback. 
Now they are eagerly awaiting 
the calendar's debut next 
month. 

Brainchild for the calendar 
was Lorys Crisafull, 80, who 
was inspired by the 2003 movie 
"Calendar Girls" starring 
Helen Mirren as one of a group 
of British women who pub­
lished a nude calendar to raise 
money for cancer research. 
Crisafull pondered the idea 
and decided "Why don't we do 

that in Monongahela? We need 
something to put us on the , 
map, to get us going." 

Before it could happen sheJ 

had to find sponsors, a photog­
rapher who'd work for free 
and a group of 70 and 80-year-
old women who had the guts 
needed to pose showing some' 
flesh. 

The women who signed up 
for the project were all well-
known members of the tight-
knit community; 

Crisafull, a former 5th grade 
teacher, became better known 
as Miss January, who is pho­
tographed lounging in a black 
convertible and covered in 
pearls, holding a champagne 
glass in one hand and dangling 
slinky sandals from the other. 

Miss September, pho­
tographed in the back seat of a 
1968 Mercury convertible, ex­
plained her decision to partici­

pate. "One of the advantages 
of being olo* is that you can do 
anything you want and get 
away with it." 

Miss April posed with noth­
ing but a pink umbrella cover­
ing her 75 year-old body. Miss 
jDecember gives a sultry glance 
from behind a poinsettia cen­
terpiece with two strategically 
placed red Christmas balls. 
Lack of space prevents de­
scribing all the months' depic­
tions. 

_ I'm just kidding, folks, sug­
gesting this project. If I con­
templated doing, such a thing, 
I'm sure my family would de-
ode I'd lost a few buttons and 
it was time for me to be in a dif­
ferent setting. Secretly, howev­
er I do think it might be fun, if I 
were covered sufficiently with, 
fike, maybe a tent. 

On to less racey information 
regarding seniors. 

This was passed on to me by 
my friend Ann Parker. A col­
lege freshman and an elderly 
lady happened to be sitting 
next to each other at a football 
game. 

A conversation began and 
began to get a bit heated when 
the college student said it was 
impossible for the older gener­
ation to understand his genera­
tion. 

"You grew up in a different 
world, actually an almost prim­
itive one," the freshman told 
the woman. "The young people 
of today grew up with televi­
sion, jet planes, space travel, 
man walking on the moon, our 
spaceships have visited 
Mars...We have nuclear energy, 
electric and hydrogen cars, 
computers with light-speed 
processing..." 

He paused to take a sip of 
beer. 

The woman took advantage 
of the break in the student's 
litany and said, "You!re right, 
young man. We didn't have 
those things when we were ""' 

•young...so we invented them. 
Now, what are you doing for 
the next generation?" 

My thought for the day 
The typical American house­

hold now gets 104 television 
channels, up from 61 in 2000, 
Nielsen Media Research re­
ported. 

But viewers last year 
watched only 15 percent of the 
channels available to them. I'm 
atypical because I have only 61 
channels, but my complaint is 
whywith61 channels, I often 
can't find anything worth 
watching. How about you and 
your TV? 

You canreach Cain with 
questions or comments at her 
e-mail: ruthcain@comcastnet 

Check it out 
Bon Secours Nursing Care Center Auxiliary presented a check for $ 100,000 to members of the 

Nursing Care Center's senior management during the auxiliary's annual meeting. Holding the 

check, from left are Bon Secours Cottage Health Services CEO Jeff Collins, Sister Pat Heath, vice 

president of the mission, auxiliary President Sandra Vandenberghe, and nursing care center ad­

ministrator Julie Maher. The auxiliary's annual donation is raised from fundraisers, including the 

Autumn Jubilee and the Christmas Fare Exfraordinare. It will be used on enhancements to resident 

rooms, furniture for common areas and speciality equipment needed. 
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Health foundation secures grant 
to provide medical, dental services 

St. John Health Foundation 
has secured a $150,000 grant 
from the McGregor Fund to 
help provide medical and den­
tal services at the Advantage 
Family Health Center. 

The center is a recently reno­
vated facility.located within St. 
John Health's Conner Creek 
Village at 4777 E. Outer Drive 
in northeast Detroit. 

It is a federally qualified 
health center that receives a 
federal grant from the Health 
Resources and Services 
Administration Bureau of 
Primary Health Care through 
Section 330 of the Public 
Health Service Act. 

The center opened in May 
2006 as a result of a collabora­
tion among Advantage Health 
Centers, St. John Health, the 
Detroit Department of Health 
and Wellness Promotion and 
several nonprofit funding 
agencies. Advantage Health 
Centers manages the 15,442 
square-foot facility, providing 
the primary care, while St. 
Jofm Health offers secondary; 
.and tertiary care. 

The $150,000 grant will sup-, 
port completion of the renova­
tions ot the center. 

: CurrenfeseFvices provided in­
clude family medicine, col­
poscopy and internal medicine 
specialty clinics, pediatrics, 
;breast and cervical cancer 
screenings, HIV/AIDS primary 
care, treatment for sexually 
transmitted diseases, behav­
ioral health, radiology, medica-
ti#%, laboratoryand social 
work services. The center's 
goal is to provide a full continu­
um of clinical and dental care 
to the insured, uninsured and 
underserved persons in norm-

east Detroit and the surround­
ing service area. Since its in­
ception, the center has served 
more than 2,000 patients, with 
more than 4,800 encounters. 

The Advantage Family 
Health Center will soon offer 

-on-site dental services with the 
addition of a dental clinic at the 
Conner Creek "Village facility. 
Currently, dental services for 
the poor and uninsured are 
provided at the St. John 
Community Health Center on 
Gratiot near downtown Detroit 
and the Thea Bowman 
Community Health Center on 
Fenkell in northwest Detroit. 

the McGregor Rind is a pri­
vate foundation organized "to 
relieve the misfortunes and 
promote the well-being of 
mankind" by assisting in the 
following areas: human ser­
vices, education, health care, 
arts and culture, and public 
benefit. . . . , . ' 

Since its establishment in 
1925 by Tracy W McGregor 
and Katherine Whitney 
•McGregor, the fund his pro­
vided apprc^mately $170 mil­
lion in assistance to organiza­
tions serving the metropolitan 
Detroit area. 

St, John Health is the largest 
provider, of inpatient care in 
southeast Michigan and one of 
the largest employers in metro 
Detroit. It provides 
comprehensive prevention, 

Correction 
In the June 7, 2007, issue of 

the Grosse Pointe News, the 
name of lisa A Manz-Dulac, 
M.D. was misspelled. 

primary care and advanced 
treatment programs with more 
than 125 medical centers, and 
nine hospitals spanning five 
counties. 

August bike event supports 
Alzheimer's Association 

The Mind Over Matter bike 
event to benefit the 
Alzheimer's Association be­
gins at 8 a.m. Saturday, Aug. 4, 
at Metro Beach's West Grove 
Pavilion. 

Hosted by Harrison 
•Xownship, Parks and 
Recreation and Kristine 
Korpal, a nurse at Sunrise 
Assisted Living in Grosse 
Pointe Woods, the event is a 
tribute to Kbrpal's father, Karl 
.T» David. It features a five mile, 
25 mile and 50 mile ride as well 
as a 40 mile ride along Lake St. 
Cpair to the Grosse Pointes. 

The five mile ride stays in 
Metro Beach; the 25 Mile Ride 
ventures out to Freedom Hill in 
Sterling Heights and back; the 
50 mile ride leaves Metro 
Beach and follows the scenic 
route along 

Jefferson/Lakeshore to Grosse 
Pointe and back. Fees are $25 
for the five mile ride; $40 for 
the 25 mile ride; $50 for the 50 
mile ride and $10 for those un­
der 16. Family discounts are 
available. 

The 40 mile ride begins at 8 
a.m. and the others at 10 a.m. 
The event concludes with a 
raffle of donated items. 

All participants receive a 
Mind Over Matter 2007 T-shirt, 
water bottle, lunch, chair mas­
sage, ice cream and the chance 
to win prizes. 

Online registration is avail­
able at alzgmc.org and more 
information on the ride can be 
found at mindovermat-
ter2007.com. - - v 

Korpal said she's "been on a 
mission" since her father 
passed away from Alzheimer's 

in 2003 and created the 
fundraiser to raise awareness 
and benefit others with the dis­
ease. 

"He had the disease for 10 
years," she said. "My dad also 
had his humor, pride, and dig­
nity until the very end. 

"'Mind over matter' was one 
of my father's lines as I was 
growing up. When things were 
tough, Dad would always say, 
'mind over matter.'" 

Korpal said the first year, the 
event raised nearly $10,000 
and the second, $17,001 was 
collected. 

For more information, con­
tact Korpal .at 
korpal5@wideopenwest.com; . 
by phone at (586) 876-0827 or* 
write her at 25548 Carno 
Circle, Harrison Township, 
MI, 48045. 

Series explores Metabolic Syndrome 
Do you carry excess weight 

around your waist? 
Is your figure an apple or 

pear? 
If you have an "apple" 

shaped body and have diffi­
culty losing with, you may 
Jxave Metabolic Syndrome. 
• Learn how you can positive­
ly impact the way your body 
uses and stores fat in a three-
part program presented by 
•0on Secours Cottage 
Community Health 
Promotion. Classes are from 
11 a.m. to noon on Tuesdays, 

June 26, and July 3, and 
Wednesday, July 11, at Bon 
Brae Center, off Jefferson be­
tween 10 and 11 Mile roads, 
in St. Clair Shores. There is a 
$50 fee for the entire pro­
gram. Instructors include 
Roxolana Karanec, M.S., 
R.D., CDE, and Irene 
Benvenuit, B.S., certified fit­
ness instructor. 

Having Metabolic 
Syndrome means you already 
have risk factors related to 
your metabolism. 
. The more risk factors you 

have, the higher the likeli­
hood of developing cardiovas­
cular disease, stroke and/or 
type 2 diabetes. 

Risk factors include: excess 
body fat around the waist, ele­
vated blood pressure, elevat-
. ed triglycerides and a low lev­
el of HDL (good) cholesterol, 
and a resistance to insulin. , 

To register for this new 
Metabolic Syndrome pro­
gram, call BSC Community 
Health department at (586) 
779-7900. 

Space is limited. 

If you are at least 100 pottfids overweight, suffer from weight-related health conditions 
and have unsuccessfully tried fftl*^weight~loss methods, don't miss this seminar! 

Our physicians will inform yo»and answer your questions about the many weight-loss 
options available, including batteft® surgery. Please join us and bring a friend! 

WARREN 
Dr. Hares 

Apnl 12; June 26-6 p.m.. 
Dr. Koie 

May 30-6 p.m. 

Dr. Schuhknecht 
April 19-6 p.m 

Dr. Hawasli or Dr. Megutd 
A|>r:23;May N; 

june4&25-6p.m 

MADISON HGTS 
Dr. Hares 

May 2-6 p.m. 
Dr. Katz 

June 13-6:30 p.m 
Dr.Kole 

June 20-6 p.rn. 

MACOMB T W . 
Dr.Kole 

April 10-6 p.m. 
Dr. Schneider 

April 24; May 22; 
June I8r6p.m, 

NOV! 
Dr. Katz 

May 16̂ 6:30 p.m. 
Dr. Schuhknecht 

June 7-6 p,m. 

SrtOHN 
J HEAjLTH* 

Space is limited. Call $66*1123*4458 for more information and to register today I 

St. John Weight Loss Center 
www.sijohn.org/weightloss/seminars 

http://alzgmc.org
http://ter2007.com
mailto:korpal5@wideopenwest.com
http://www.sijohn.org/weightloss/seminars
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Take a walk, a ride, a view during River Days 
ByAnnL.Fouty 
Acting'Features Editor 

Take another look at the 
Detroit RiverFront. 

Experience the 31/2 miles of 
rejuvenated riverfront proper­
ty during the six-day River. 
Days celebration featuring 
music, food and family activi­
ties that culminates with the 
49th annual Target Fireworks, 
beginning at 10:06 p.m., 
Wednesday, June 27. 

Grosse Pointers will be ab­
solutely shocked at the river­
front's new look, says Matt 
Cullen. As general manager of 
the Economic Development 
and Enterprises Services of 
General Motors, co-chair of 
the Detroit RiverFront 
Conservancy, chairman of The 
Parade Company and a Grosse 
Pointe Shores resident, he and 
a community of enthusiastic 
people pulled together the 
multi-level, multi-attraction 
family-oriented event in just 90 
days. 

It was a Herculean task, he 
said of the orchestrating of the 
River Days which run from 
Friday, June 22, to Wednesday, 
June 27, with events spanning 
from the new Rivard Plaza & 
Pavilion to the GM Plaza and 
Promenade and beyond. 

"This is a snapshot of what 
you can do. It's remarkable 
how quickly it came together," 
Cullen said. "All (involved) 
played nice because the vision 
is so powerful. 

"The excitement of the vi­
sion caused people to jump on 
board. It will be well run, safe 
and people will have* a great 
time," he says of the coopera­
tion, ideas and plannng of 
events which were completed 
in a matter of weeks. "I'm real­
ly excited to show off the 
RiverFront. I want people to 
understand the RiverFront is 
here. Eighty percent of the 

River Days 
11 a.m. to midnight Friday, June 22 
10 a.m. to midnight Saturday, June 23 
10 a.m. to 10 p.m. Sunday, June 24 
11 a.m. to 10 p,m. Monday, June 25, 
and Tuesday, June 26 
11 a m t o n p.m. Wednesday, June 
27 
For updates visit 
detroitriverdays.com 

people I encounter don't know 
a thing about it." 

Also, the 10-year renovation 
of the Renaissance Center has 
been completed to include four 
movie theaters, restaurants 
and shopping. 

"Come on down and have 
fun," he says.-

The list of River Day events 
is extensive and covers a vari­
ety tastes and interests that 
Michiganians indulge and cul­
tivate. Cullen says he proud of 
how so many corporations and 
600 volunteers have pulled to­
gether to create the house-
warming, as he terms it for the 
first part of the RiverFront im­
provements. Ultimately, the 
RiverFront project will be 
some five miles long." 

Families can be captivated 
by events on the water (a tug 
boat race, a parade of light or a 
tour of the EPA's research ves­
sel). Landlubbers can enjoy 
music or get autographs from 
members of the Michigan 
Sports Hall of Fame. The best 
part is a majority of the events 
are free. Food, amusement 
rides and tours are offered at a 
nominal price. 

Major players stepped up, 
beginning in February, with 
General Motors leading the 
way to make the event a go, 
Cullen says. Highlights include 
the GM Cool Event, DTE 
Energy Parade of Lights, HAP 
Ultimate Air Dogs, The 

Matt Cullen, general manager 
of the Economic 
Development and Enterprises 
Services of General Motors, 
co-chair of the Detroit 
RiverFront Conservancy, 
chairman of The Parade 
Company and a Grosse Pointe 
Shores resident 

Discovery Zone, a carnival, 
live music, the Detroit 
Symphony Orchestra, The 
Official VIP Rooftop Party and 
the fireworks. 

GM sponsored events in­
clude the Chevy racing tour, a 
Buick golf trailer, Duke 
University basketball coach 
Mike Krzyzewski, an interac­
tive NFL quarterback display 
and classic cars. 

Diamond Jack's River Tours, 
the Coast Guard's working 
boats, an open bass fishing 
tournament, the Detroit fire 
boat, the Bob-Lo boat, interna­
tional tug boat races and jet ski 
demonstrations are just a few 
of the water events sponsored 
by DTE Energy. One of the 
highlights is the parade of 
lights at 10 p.m. Saturday, June 
23. Grosse Pointers are en­
couraged to enter their boats, 
which they have decorated. 

Rock Financial provides a 
cooling station in the GM 

NATIONAL 

e&k& 

W h y n o t s u r p r i s e s o m e o n e w i t h M i c h i g a n ' s 
F i n e s t C o n e y I s l a n d Chi l i S a u c e ? 

That ' s r igh t , you can now o rde r 

National Coney Island's chili sauce 
and ho t dogs to enjoy a t h o m e . 

Place your order today! 
Nationwide delivery available. 

6700 East Davison • Detroit, M I 48212 
Tel. 313-365-5611 

Grosse Pointe War Memoria 
&**hr 

T e l e v i s i o n 
f o r t h e 
W h o l e 

C o m m u n i t y 

June'18 to June 24 

8$0,m Vitality Plus (Aerobics) 
g;PQ m Musical Storytime 
g;30 w Pointes of Horticulture 
|Q:00 am Who's hi the Kitchen 
1Q&&&& Things to do at die War Memorial 
11:00 am Out of the Ordinary 
l^gQamTecl^Pofflt^s 
.12;PQ am Economic Club of Detroit 
l;QP.pffl Senior Men's Qub 
IjSGjjm, Great Lakes Log. 
2;00 pm The Joan Prost Show 
2;3Q.nm The Legal Insider 
3;0iP,ffm, Things to do at the War Memorial 
3i3fijmA&rdable Style 
4:00 pm Vitality Plus (Tone) 
.4i?0m pm Musical Storytime 
g;QQpm Positively Positive 
gffO pm Senior Men's Club 
&PJ)..psq The Legal Insider 
&3P..pm Who's in the Kitchen 
?;00pra Vitality Plus (Step/Kick Boxing) 
Z;3.P.„pa Things to do at the War Memorial 
8:00 pm Positively Positive 
8j3SLDja Tech Pointes 
$M$m Affordable Style 
9;i?0 pm Pointes of Horticulture 
10:00 pm The John Prost Show 
1Q:30 pm Great Lakes Log 
Jl^SLpia Out of the Ordinary 
,llt3P m Ifofo Printff 

100 am 

.&30 am 
§Mm 
&20~jm 
?;00 am 

8Mm 

Economic Qub of Detroit 
Senior Men's Club 
Great Lakes Log 
The John Prost Show 
Tech Pointes 
Affordable Style 
Pointes of Horticulture 
The John Prost Show 
Great Lakes Log 
Out of the Ordinary 
The Legal Insider 
Things to do at the War Memorial 
Affordable Style 
Vitality Plus (Tone) 
Musical Storytime 
Positively Positive 

Featured Guests 
Who's in the Kitchen? 
Doug Cordter - Rotolone d'uovo 

to 
Summer • Music Festival, CardioMax, Girls 
Empowered Summer Camps & Advanced 
Ballroom Dancing 

Out of the Ordinary 
Heather Williams - Hypnotherapist Entergy 
Worker 

TechFpintes 
Digital Video Recorders 

Economic Club of Detroit 
The Honorable Alberto Gonzlaes, Attorney 
General, U.S. Dept. of Justice 

Senior Meg's Cjub 
Bill Soloman, Referee 

Great Lakes tog 
Paul & Judy Krietsch - Living on a Boat 

The John Prost Show 
Lester Robinson - Metro Airport 

Insider 
Sexual Harassment 

Affbrdable Style 
Boy's Room Makeover 

TECHPOINTES 
Whether you have a new computer or have had 
one for a long time, this show is for you. Joe 
Bracken and Dan McDuffee will 'keep you 
up-to-date with the latest web sites, technology 
and software for your computer. 

Every day at 1 1 J 3 0 sum., 8:30 p.m. 
11:30 p.m. and 2 0 0 a,m. 

Schedule subject to change without notice! 
For further infotmation call, 313.8817511. 
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GM Plaza and Promenade 

Wintergarden at the GM 
Renaissance Center. It will fea­
ture the GM Powertrain exhib­
it with vintage and current GM 
models, a display of historical 
technology, fuel diversity ex­
hibits and racing and perfor­
mance displays.' 

The Michigan Sports Hall of 
Fame will host Denny McLain, 

Bill Gadsby, Jim Northrup and 
Ron Kramer who will sign au­
tographs. 

There will be five-minute he­
licopter rides and a Pooch-A-
Palooza Pet Walk, at 9 a.m. 
Sunday, June 24, on the GM 
Promenade. To register, call 
theYMCAat (313) 309-3377. 

Volunteers can be identified 

by their shirts, Cullen says, 
and will assist guests with 
parking. Some 10,000 spaces 
are available at the RenCen 
and at Stroh's. 

"All of southeast Michigan 
(and) Windsor should enjoy 
this. This is a great festival; a 
great time for the family," 
he says. 

Garden tour committee 
The 16th annual Summer Garden Tour, sponsored by the Grosse Pointe Garden Center Inc. will be 

from 10 a.m. to 4 p.m. Friday, June 22, and Saturday, June 23, rain or shine. Tickets purchased pri­

or to the tour are $ 12 and $ 15 on tour days and are available at the Grosse Pointe War Memorial, 32 

Lakeshore, Grosse Pointe Farms, and local businesses. For more information, call the Grosse 

Pointe Garden Center between 9 a.m. and 2:30 p.m. Tuesdays through Thursdays, at (313) 881-

7511, ext. 206. There will be six gardens in the Grosse Pointe area, the Trial Gardens at the War 

Memorial and the Children's Home of Detroit gardens. The tour will include a raffle and offerings 

from more than 15 vendors. Master Gardeners and artists from the Grosse Pointe Artist 

Association will be available at various locations. The garden tour committee includes, standing 

from left, Carol Sauter, Mike Geibel, Marie Mainwaring, Jean Forton, Adrienne Gregory, Sarah 

Flynn and Shirley Martin; and seated,from left, Jean Azar, Jan Hagen, Mary Northcutt, Peg Noble 

and Dolores Berger. Also on the committee are Carolyn Nantroup, Diane Yordy, Pam Barnwell and 

Laura Kennedy. 

Sign up for life on a ribbon farm camp 
The Grosse Pointe Historical 

Society offers the children's 
summer camp series, "life on 
the Ribbon Farm," for ages 7 
through 11 from 1 to 4 p.m., 
Monday through Thursday, 
July 16-19. 

Activities scheduled are: 
Monday, July 16 — picnic 

foods and lawn games. 
Participants will make 
checkerboard sandwiches and 
butterfly cookies, have an out­
door picnic, catch bugs and 
play old-fashioned lawn games 
and create crafts. 

Tuesday, July 17 — habitant 
fun and games. Participants 

will explore Grosse Pointe's 
early French roots and make 
French crepes and apple cider. 
They will participate in a scav­
enger hunt and learn about the 
French Provencal family. 

Wednesday, July 18 — early 
American theatrics. 
Participants will explore the 
lives of early American boys 
and girls through theatrical es­
capades. Plenty of opportuni­
ties will .be provided to hone 
acting skills, learn about props 
and stage directions, Bring a 
shoe box to make a set. 

Thursday, July 19 — gold ol' 
summer picnic. Children will 

make their own lunch consist­
ing of chicken, a salad, pota­
toes and cakes. While supper is 
in the oven, children will pot 
herbs to take home and trans­
plant into their own garden. 

The camp is held at the 
Provencal-Weir House, 376 
Kercheval, Grosse Pointe 
Farms and the cost is $120. 
Space is limited. , 

Register in advance by send­
ing a check to the Grosse 
Pointe Historical Society, 381 
Kercheval, Grosse Pointe 
Farms, MI 48236. Include your 
phone number and the child's 
name and age. 

Film showcases hockey superstar, Maurice Richard 
"Cinema Canada" will bring 

to Hockeytown the story of 
Maurice "Rocket" Richard, 
known as one of the most bril­
liant and controversial players 
the sport of hockey has ever 
known. 

"The Rocket" takes the view 
through the early days to the 
middle of Richard's career in 
the 1950s. From the beginning, 
Richard had only one desire — 
to play hockey in the National 
Hockey League. After a long 
day at the factory, Richard 

would put on his skates and 
put his heart and soul into ful­
filling his dream. Beyond his 
talent and agility, his passion 
and determination were leg­
endary. 

He broke records on the ice 
and raised controversy off the 
ice. Richard's impact on hock­
ey has been compared to that 
of Babe Ruth on baseball. 

Veteran director Charles 
Biname's biopic captures the 
gritty feel of the sport in the 
1940s and 1950s, while also 

conveying the human side of 
Richard, his family and his fel­
low players. 

"The Rocket" will be 
screened at 7 p.m. Monday, 
June 25, at the Detroit Institute 
of Arts Film Theatre, 5200 
Woodward. 

Admission is free. 
"Cinema Canada" is present­

ed by the Consulate General of 
Canada-Detroit and the Detroit 
Institute of Arts, in celebration 
of Canada Day and the 4th 
of July. 

./ 

http://detroitriverdays.com
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STATE OF THE ARTS ByAlexSuczek 

Brilliant 'Othello' cast 

A
team of brilliant 
stars and one 
newcomer are 
performing 
"Othello" 

at Stratford this summer, pro­
viding an experience that will 
be hard to match. 

As the Moor, Philip Akin 
blends with a cast of some of 
Stratford's best as if he is a 
longtime company member in­
stead of making his debut this 
season. That in itself is a big 
achievement. In a classic work 
of such quality as "Othello," his 
style needs to be in harmony 
with his supporting cast. It is to 
a remarkable degree. He also 
has special gifts for the role. 
Rather than having a thunder­
ing voice like many playing the 
part, his is powerful enough, 
but well modulated. His lines 
are expressed with conviction, 
responsive to whoever is on 
stage interacting with him.His 
achievement adds immensely 
to the force of his duet with 
Jonathan Goad's Iago, for ex­
ample. That is true in all their 
scenes together, but especially 
effective when Iago is subtly 
persuading him to suspect 
Desdemona of being unfaith­
ful, and then offering what he 
claims to be evidence. Like two 
great collaborative artists, they 
seem to inspire each other as 
they respond to the increasing 

energy and emotion of their 
exchanges. In the process, the 
enormity of Iago's insidious 
campaign to poison Othello's 
love for Desdemona is over­
whelming. It is possible that 
there is no more eloquent rep­
resentation of the green-eyed 
monster than this and it is hard 
to imagine it portrayed with 
greater impact. 

The leading women are no 
less brilliant. As Desdemona, 
Clair Jullien projects the per­
fect sweet innocence and 
youthful sincerity of the closely 
protected aristocratic daughter. 
Her protestations of love for 
the rough soldier are touching 
and convincing. The gradual 
realization that something is 
poisoning her husband's mind 
against her is genuinely alarm­
ing. And her ability to face the 
realization that death may be 
imminent is noble and touch­
ing while the Moor's inability to 
put faith in her protestations 
reverberates with tragedy. 

As Emilia, Lucy Peacock 
brings a great leading lady's 
skill to a pivotal supporting 
role. She gives no hint of suspi­
cion as her husband, Iago, ma­
nipulates her to aid his scheme 
to bring down the Moor and 
destroy his marriage. 
Following his orders, she un­
wittingly provides him'With the 
symbolic handkerchief that he 
uses to indict Desdemona be­
fore Othello. 

But as the web of the plot 
lines is knit to its final knot, her 
awakening to his treachery 
and her outrage and condem­
nation are boundless. There is 

genuine shock and horror in 
her responses to the exposure 
of Iago's plot. 

Meanwhile, Jeffrey Wetsch 
as Cassio and Gordon Miller as 
Roderigo are frustratingly 
gullible pawns in Iago's 
scheme. Roderigo is a pitiful, 
willing victim bilked of all his 
wealth, the other discredited, 
demoted and nearly slain in 
the slaughter that brings the 
tragedy to an end. Their credu­
lous responses to Iago's decep­
tions provide important valida­
tion of his performance. 

An important factor in the ef­
fectiveness of this production 
is that it is presented on the 
surrounded stage of the Tom 
Patterson Theater. This inti­
mate venue provides closeness 
to the action from every seat 
and provides acoustical bene­
fits so as not to miss a word of 
the rich, fast moving dialogue. 
Director David Latham de­
serves exceptional credit as 
well. His blocking of the entire 
show gives emphasis to the ac­
tion and exchanges and makes 
possible an especially powerful 
impact in the final confronta­
tion scene where all of Iago's 
destructive schemes are finally 
exposed. In total, it adds up to 
a masterful performance of a 
stunning tragedy filled with 
some of the greatest text and 
tragedy of theater. "Othello" is 
presented in repertory at the 
Stratford Festival through 
Sept. 22. 

For a Visitor's Guide, tickets 
and the availability of special 
offers, call (800) 567-1600 or 
visit stratfordfestivalca 

A LA ANNIE By Annie Rouleau-Scheriff 

Cool salad beats summer heat 
shines through in the citrus 
di " 
m 
OI 

cool down your family with 
" ' ' • ' i d . 

L
ooking for a cool (lit­
erally) meal option, I 
turned to my gal pal 
IisaGressens— 
queen of the salads. 

Lisa is always experimenting 
with salad ideas from greens to 
spinach to pasta to grains. She 
threw this fresh, easy to pre­
pare spinach salad my way. 

Lisa's Summer Fresh 
Spinach Salad with 

Citrus-Honey Dressing 

17-oz. package fresh baby 
spinach leaves 

1 cup shredded red cabbage 
(optional) 

1 cup sliced fresh strawber­
ries 

111-oz. can mandarin or­
ange segments, drained 

1/2 cup sliced green onions 
(about 1/2 bunch) 

1/2 cup crumbled 
Gorgonzola cheese 

1/4 cup toasted pine nuts 

Citrus-Honey Dressing 

1/4 cup fresh squeezed or­
ange juice 

1/4 cup honey 
2 tablespoons salad oil 
2 teaspoons Dijon mustard 
First prepare the dressing by 

combining the orange juice, 
honey, salad oil and Dijon in a 
small jar or container. 

Cover tightly and shake well. 
Store in refrigerator until 

ready to serve. 
For the salad, begin by 

roughly chopping the spinach 
leaves and place in a large sal­
ad bowl. (I believe that salad 
should come to the table in 
bite-sized pieces.) Toss in the 
shredded red cabbage. 
Arrange the strawberries and 
the mandarin orange seg­
ments over the spinach. 

Sprinkle the green onions, 
Gorgonzola and the toasted 
pine nuts over the salad. 

Shake the dressing well and 
drizzle lightly over the spinach 
salad. 

Turn this summer salad into 
the main course by topping it 
with grilled salmon or chicken. 

The taste of the honey 
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Jazz and dance 
Phil Ogilvie's Rhythm Kings. James Dapogny's '20's Style Jazz and Dance Band debuts at Music 

on the Plaza, sponsored by St. John Hospital and Medical Center. It performs on the Village 

Festival Plaza at the corner of St. Clair and Kercheval. The free outdoor concert begins at 7 p.m., 

Thursday, June 28. The rain location is Maire Elementary School, 740 Cadieux, two blocks west of 

the Festival Plaza. For more information, call (313) 886-7474 or visit thevillagegp.com. ] 
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at COMERICA PARK 

CAPUCHIN SOUPER SUMMER CELEBRATION XXVI 

Raffle tickets are $1 each and may also be purchased in advance. 
This year tickets can be bought using credit cards. You need not 

be present to win. Go to Ahee.com for more information or 
to buy raffle tickets online. 100% of proceeds go to the Capuchins 

via the Edmund T. Ahee endowment for hunger fund. 

Don't miss your chance to attend this unprecedented event. 
Enter on the Red Carpet, stroll down the Walk of Fame, pose 

for paparazzi, and party like the stars. Enjoy the extraordinary 
firework display, live music, and the annual raffle of exquisite 

jewelry valued at over $32,000.00! An event that only an 
exclusive venue like Comerica Park could host. 
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The Johnny Trudell Orchestra, The Mega 80's, Air Margaritaville, 
Robert Penn, Chris Macres and more. 
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21 and over, Food court fare available for purchase, 
Cash bar, Dress to thril l, Complimentary self-parking, 

Valet parking available. 
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A stunning 2 Carat custom-made platinum diamond ring, watches 
by Rolex, Cartier, Tag Heuer and David Yunnan and jewelry by 

Roberto Coin, Mikimoto and the exclusive Ahee collection will be 
in this incredible raffle. 

H I 11 
For more information, Please call 1-800-987-AHEE, 

or visit wwu.ahee.com/capuchins 
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Summer fun 
Grosse Pointe Earms Boat Club, city get 

set for annual regatta PAGE 2c 

HOOPS HONORS LACROSSE CLASSIFIED 

YOUTH SOCCER 

GPSA keeps getting better 
* * « * - * - • * * 
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Megan Herbst (11) and Nikki Capizzo (4) were members of Grosse Pointe Soccer Association Breakers teams that won division 
titles in the Michigan Premier Soccer League last fall. Both players were instrumental in helping Grosse Pointe North advance 
to the state Division I semifinals. 

Successful program refuses 
to rest on its laurels 

There's always room for im­
provement, even when some­
thing is as successful as the 
Grosse Pointe Soccer 
Association. 

In recent months, the club 
has made its weekly skills 
night free to all GPSA players 
between the ages of 8 and 12 in 
both the house and travel pro­
grams. 

It has also created the posi­
tion of coaching director and 
hired Dan Kelly to fill the spot. 
Kelly holds a Class B coaching 
license and has a reputation of 
being one of the best trainers 
in the region. 

Kelly will be responsible for 
developing a club curriculum, 
which will establish bench­
marks of age-appropriate skill 
development for athletes in the 
house, metro and travel pro­
grams; continue to recruit 
highly-qualified and experi­
enced trainers and coaches in­
to the club; establish specific 
goals of development for both 
individuals and teams; mentor 
and develop some of the club's 
younger trainers; conduct 
coaching clinics for the parent 
coaches in the house and 
metro programs; and continu­
ously evaluate and implement 

changes to improve the pro­
gram. 

The GPSA is searching for 
an indoor facility for its travel 
teams to use for practices and 
skill sessions during the cold-
weather months. 

One of the reasons the GPSA 
has been successful at the old­
er age levels and in producing 
players for the successful high 
school teams at Grosse Pointe 
North, Grosse Pointe South 
and University Liggett School 
is because it focuses on individ­
ual player skill development 
among the younger players. 

"The key to development is 
to keep it fun for the kids and 
put them in an environment 
that improves their skills, 
builds their confidence and ig­
nites their passion for the 
sport," said GPSA president 
Chris Corden. "The young 
players are like sponges. They 
soak up information like water, 
and they are quick studies. By 
contrast, if a player doesn't 
have a complete skill set by age 
13 or 14, it is very difficult to 
accelerate a player's develop­
ment to a point where he or 
she can compete at the highest 

See SOCCER, page 2C 

North bows in quarters 
By Chuck Klonke 
Sports Editor 

The deeper a team goes into 
the state tournament, the more 
miniscule the margin for error 
becomes. 

"I was disappointed with our 
execution in the first inning," 
Grosse Pointe North coach 
Frank Sumbera said after the 
Norsemen's bid for a second 
straight Division I state cham­
pionship ended last week with 
a 3-1 quarterfinal loss to 
Farmington. 

"Wfe should have gotten out 
of the first without any runs 
scoring." 

Instead the Falcons scored 
twice, which turned out to be 
all they needed. 

A slow grounder that got 
through when an infielder 
oyercommitted on what ap­
peared to be a bunt attempt put 
runners on first and third. 

It also helps to have luck on 
your side. After a hit batter 
loaded the bases and a ground-
out brought in the game's first 
run, a line drive that looked 
like a certain double play, 
glanced off an infielder's glove. 

"The kid hit the ball of the 
end of the bat and it had that 
funny spin on it," Sumbera 

said. "If that ball is caught, it's 
an easy double play because 
the runner was way off the 
base." 

North couldn't touch 
Farmington starter Harvey 
Martin in the first two innings 
and he struck out five of the six 
batters he faced. 

"When we started hitting the 
ball in the third, it was right at 
people," Sumbera said. "(Phil) 
Dilone hit a shot down the 
third base line that was fielded. 
(Tim) Tibaudo hit a ball hard, 
right at the left fielder. And 
(Marc) Reno hit a ball up the 
middle that the pitcher 
knocked down and threw him 
out." 

The Norsemen cut the lead 
to 2-1 in the fourth when con­
secutive one-out singles by 
Mike Stevenson, Matt 
Koppinger and Jon Chapel 
produced a run. 

North mounted another 
threat in the fifth, but came up 
empty because of a controver­
sial pickoff call. 

Dilone led off with a single 
and appeared to get back to 
first base safely on the pickoff 
attempt, but he was called out. 
North's coaches argued the 
call, but to no avail. 

"We could have had another 

run because Reno and (Mike) 
D'Agnese each singled," 
Sumbera said. 

"To make matters worse 
there was a picture in the pa­
per the next day that made it 
look like Dilone got back in 
time." 

Instead, Farmington added 
an insurance run in the bottom 
of the fifth on an RBI single by 
BurneyMitchum. 

Koppinger led off the sixth 
with a single for North, but the 
next three batters were retired. 
The Norsemen went down 1-2-
3 in the seventh. 

Both Koppinger and Martin 
finished with five-hitters. 
Martin struck out 10 and 
Koppinger fanned four. 

"We ran into a good pitcher," 
Sumbera said. 'All the games 
in the semifinals and finals 
were close, too." 

North finished the season 
witha31-6 record. 

"I was pleased with the sea­
son," Sumbera said. "We fin­
ished No. 3 in the final state 
rankings, and our two-year 
record was 69-7. And we won 
29 games the year before that. 
We've picked up a lot of metal 
— league, district and regional 
championships — and I'm real 
proud of these kids." 

Chargers end ULS's tourney run 
By Chuck Klonke 
Sports Editor 

University Liggett School 
baseball coach Dan Cimini 
hopes that one bad afternoon 
doesn't detract from 2 1/2 
months of good ones. 

"We had a phenomenal 
year," Cimini said after the 
Knights lost their Division IV 
quarterfinal game to Allen 
Park Inter-City Baptist 14-4. 'At 
the start of the year, no one ex­
pected us to accomplish what 
we did. We've accomplished 
things that baseball teams at 
this school have never accom­
plished. I told the kids, they 
should be proud of them­
selves." 

And they should. 

ULS finished with a 27-6 
record. The Knights won the 
overall Metro Conference 
championship, their third 
straight state district title and 
the state regional champi­
onship. ULS was ranked No. 1 
in the state in Division IV for 
nearly the entire season. 

"I told the kids I loved the ef­
fort they gave. All but three se­
niors will be back, and we'll try 
to duplicate the effort from this 
year and go one step farther," 
Cimini said. 

In its quarterfinal game at 
Goodrich, ULS took a 4-0 lead. 

Joe Conway singled home a 
run in the first inning and the 
Knights picked up three more 
in the third. Walks to Patrick 
Gustine, Curtis Fisher and 

Michael Thomas loaded the 
bases. Two scored on a single 
by D.J. Henderson and another 
came in on Conway's second 
RBI single of the game. 

"We had the bases loaded 
with two out and a chance to 
break it open in the third, but 
ended the inning on a flyout," 
Cimini said. "Then Inter-City 
Baptist just started hitting the 
ball. I have to tip my hat to 
them. I don't think anybody 
could have beaten them on 
that day. 

"That's baseball. If there's 
anything I feel good about it's 
that they beat us. We didn't 
give them the game." 

The Chargers tied the game 

See ULS, page 3C 
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Several members of the Grosse Pointe Academy of Taekwondo won medals at the Michigan 
Taekwondo Championships in Northville. In front, from left, are Ryan Kavulick, Jordan Smith, 
Teddy Sweeney and Erynn Masa. In back, from left, are Bailey Walker, Kyle Steffek, Jordan 
Davis, Manisha Ravi, Jack Steffek, Marvin Masa, Anthony Smith and grandmaster Doug Shin. 

Academy students shine 
Members of the Grosse 

Pointe Academy of 
Taekwondo made another im­
pressive showing at the 
Michigan taekwondo champi­
onships in Northville. 

In the Black Belt Division, 
Ryan Kavulick won gold 
medals in sparring, forms and 
board breaking; Anthony 
Smith won gold medals in 

sparring and forms; Bailey 
Walker won a gold in sparring; 
and Jordan Davis won gold in 
sparring and forms. 

Manisha Ravi won gold in 
sparring and forms; and 
Marvin Masa won gold in spar­
ring. 

In the Red Belt Division, 
Teddy Sweeney won gold 
medals in sparring and forms. 

In the Bodan Division, 
Jordan Smith won gold in 
forms and silver in sparring; 
and Erynn Masa won gold in 
sparring and forms and silver 
in board breaking. 

In the Blue Belt Division, 
Kyle Steffek won silver in 
forms and bronze' in sparring; 
and Jack Steffek won gold in 
sparring and silver in forms. 

South freshmen win tournament 
Everyone contributed as 

Grosse Pointe South's fresh­
man baseball team won the 
Grosse Pointe North 
Invitational. 

Coach Dick Swarthout used 
all of his players as the Blue 
Devils won all three games, in­
cluding a 6-2 victory against 
North in the championship 
game. 

The pitching of Karl Brecht 
was the highlight of the North 
game. Brecht pitched five in­
nings, allowed three hits and 
struck out six. Charles Getz 
pitched two innings of score­
less relief. 

Getz and Pat Kennedy hit 
two-run doubles, while Brad 
Remillet and Ryan Miller drove 
in a run apiece with doubles. 

A strong defensive effort fea­

tured some fine catches in 
right field by Mike Temrowski, 
and solid second base play 
from Matt Temrowski. 

Brandon D'Agnese had two 

of North's five hits. 
South opened with a 14-1 

romp against Warren-Mott. 
Miller and Evan Inger each 

collected two hits, while 
Andrew Lajdziak, Inger and 

Farms-City Little League results 
MAJOR LEAGUE 

Tigers 15, Yankees 11 
The Tigers' offense in the extra-in­

ning slugfest was led £y Steve 
Brengman, Brett Bigham and 
Andrew Wright with three hits 
apiece. Ben Moxon, Josh Davey and 
Andrew Bigham each had two hits 
and Murray Sales had a double. 
Andrew Addy and Eric Addy led the 
Yankees' attack. 

Tigers 4, Yankees 3 
Brett Bigham's hit in the bottom of 

the sixth inning drove in the winning 
run for the Tigers' come-from-be-
hind victory. Andrew Wright, Sam 
Kuhna, Blake Reece and Josh Davey 
had the Tigers' other hits. Steve 
Brengman and Andrew Bigham 
pitched well as they combined for 
eight strikeouts and didn't allow a 

walk. Jacob Yglesias pitched a fine 
game for the Yankees, giving up sev­
en hits and striking out four. 
Yglesias, Daniel Baird and Connor 
Coyle led the Yankees' offense. 

Tigers 5, Astros 4 
The Tigers held off the Astros in a 

well-played game. Winning pitcher 
' Brett Bigham went five innings, al­
lowed five hits and struck out nine, 
including six straight. He also had a 
double and a single. Murray Sales 
pitched the sixth inning to record the 
save. The Tigers' other hits were 
from Andrew Bigham, Sales, Steve 
Brengman (a double) and Blake 
Reece. Joe Andreoli pitched well for 
the Astros and struck out five. Ken 
Elkin had two singles for the Astros, 
who also1 had hits from Tommy 
McShane and Andrew Barnett. 

2007 UNIVERSITY LIGGETT 
2 

SOCCER CLINICS 
Since 1977 

LIMITED ENROLLMENT 

TRAINING CLINICS AT • 

UNIVERSITY LIGGETT SCHOOL 
Cook Road Campus-Grosse Pointe "Woods 

For Boys and Girls-Ages 6-16 (Grouped by Ability) 

^kjuly 30-August 3 
August 6-11 
August 13-18 
(Includes Goalkeeping session) 

^ " Special half day sessions for 5 and 6year-olds 

& special evening sessions for teenage players 

For further, information call 

313-884-6718 or 313-884-4444 
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Miller drove in two runs 
apiece. Getz, Remillet, 
Kennedy, Clay Mandel, Matt 
Terarowski and Max Bobinski 
had the Blue Devils' other hits. 

Remillet pitched the first 
three innings and didn't allow 
an earned run. Mike 
Temrowski closed out the 
game with three straight 
strikeouts. 

Tim Rogers did a good job as 
a pinch runner, while Anthony 
Stavale and Billy Mestdagh 
played well in the field. 

Dan Fisher had three hits to 
lead South to an 11-1 victory 
against East Detroit. 

Among the Blue Devils' 13 
hits were two apiece for Mike 
Temrowski, Bobinski, Mandel 
and Will Basse. One of Basse's 
hits was a two-run double. 
Miller and Justin Martin also 
had hits. 

Steven Walworth allowed 
only one hit in four innings. 
Lajdziak pitched a scoreless 
fifth. 

Andy VanderSchaaf played a 
solid second base and scored a 
run. 

Farms Boat Club 
holds 55th regatta 

The Grosse Pointe Farms 
Boat Club and the city of 
Grosse Pointe Farms will hold 
its 55th annual regatta for resi­
dents at the Grosse Pointe 
Farms Pier Park from 
Thursday, June 28 through 
Sunday, July 1. 

The event includes many 
children's, family and adult, 
events, along with a fireworks 
display scheduled for 
Saturday, June 30. 

Festivities begin at 7 p.m. on 
June 28 with the final sailboat 
race in the spring Thursday 
night racing series. After the 
race, the past commodores of 
the Farms.Boat Club will pro­
vide hot dogs and drinks in the 
pavilion. Race results for the 
series will be announced. 

Thursday night is also the 
start of the Art in the Park dis­
play where children from age 5 
to 15 are invited to enter their 
art work that represents the 
theme of "Celebrating Life on 
Lake St. Clair/' 

Last year's display was the 
first, and this year's is expected 
to be larger and more exciting. 

Art work can consist of 
paintings, drawing, clay mod­
els or poetry and will be dis­
played in the community cen­
ter throughout the weekend. 
All art work should be submit­
ted to the park office by 9 p.m. 
on June 28 and must include 
the entrant's name, age, ad­
dress and phone number. 

Trophies and ribbons will be 
awarded. All participants will 
be recognized. Art work can be 
picked up after Sunday, July 1. 

, Family events start on 
Saturday, June 30 with the bi­

cycle parade at 11 a.m. 
Trophies and ribbons will be 
awarded for the most patriotic 
decorations for two age groups 
—3to7and8-ll. 

At noon, the first pie-eating 
contest will be held at the pavil­
ion. 

"That should supply all par­
ticipants and witnesses with 
lots of laughs and good times 
and a free piece of pie for the 
contestants," said Steve 
Sicklesteel, vice commodore of 
the Farms Boat Club. 

All ages are welcome and en­
couraged to participate. 

Several other events are also 
scheduled for Saturday: 

1 p.m., inflatable boat races. 
All ages register and compete 
at the beach. 

2 p.m., rubber duckie race. 
Buy your duckie race numbers 
by 1:30 p.m. and meet at the 
beach. 

3 p.m., sand castle contest. 
Bring your best designs, pails 
and shovels to the beach. 
Judging will be at 4:30 p.m. 

3 to 5 p.m., pie baking con­
test. Take your best looking 
and tasting pie to the pavilion. 
Judging is at 5 p.m. 

3 to 5 p.m., best 
Independence Day picnic table 
decorating contest. Judging is 
at 5 p.m. 

4 to 5:30 p.m., family and 
children's games at the pointe 
out by the gazebo. 

5 p.m., decorated boat judg­
ing. 

6 p.m., awards ceremony 
outside the Pier Park commu­
nity building. 

7:30 p.m. until dusk, music 
provided by the band "Soul 

Provider." 
6 to 8 p.m., glow sticks sale 

throughout the park. 
Dusk, City of Grosse Point* 

Farms fireworks display.. 
A barber shop quartet wil 

stroll the picnic area from 1 to 
4 p.m., and face painting wil 
be available near the basket 
ball courts. 

On Sunday, July 1 at 1 p.m, 
there will be a pet parade 
Contestants should meet bj 
the tennis courts. Prizes forth* 
most patriotic costumes will h 
awarded in two categories -
dogs and all others. A judged 
choice award will be given fa 
the most exotic or the best ani 
mal trick. Pets must remaii 
leashed or caged at all times. 

Owners must clean up aft© 
their pets. Pets must have al 
current vaccinations and pet 
must be removed from tht 
park before 2 p.m. 

There will be a drawing on 
June 28 for the chance to win i 
reserved parking spot, a re 
served picnic area and a pri 
vate fireworks viewing area fa 
Saturday. 

Tickets are on sale at the 
Parks and Recreation front 
desk for $ 1 apiece or six for $5 
All proceeds will benefit the 
Grosse Pointe Farms Boat 
Club. 

The rain date for the regatta 
and the fireworks display is 
Sunday July 1, in which case 
the pet parade will be can­
celled. 

"This year's regatta promis­
es to be another memorable 
event for children and parents 
alike, so plan on coming early 
and staying all day," Sicklesteel 

Three North basketball players 
selected to All-State squads 

Three members of Grosse 
Pointe North's girls basketball 
team received postseason hon­
ors from the Basketball 
Coaches Association of 
Michigan. 

Kelly DeFauw was named to 
the Academic All-State team. 

In order to be eligible for the 
Academic All-State team, a 
player must be a junior or se­
nior, have a minimum 3.5 
grade-point average and be 
named to one of four All-State 
teams. 

DeFauw, who carries a 4.0 

GPA, received honorable men­
tion on the BCAM All-State 
squad. During the winter, here 
Motor City Blazers under-16 
team finished fourth in the 
state AAU tournament and 
qualified for the national tour­
nament in Orlando, Fla., in 
July. 

Ariel Braker was named to 
the Class A third team, while 
Olivia Stander was a fourth-
team selection. 

All three are underclassmen. 
DeFauw is a junior, Stander a 
sophomore and Braker a fresh­

man. 
The Norsemen advanced to 

the regional championship 
game and finished the season 
with a 23-2 record. 

All three are multiple-sport 
athletes. 

DeFauw also ran track and 
qualified for the Division I state 
meet. Braker was a member of 
the track and volleyball teams 
at North. Stander is one of the 
top high school soccer players 
in the state and she led the 
Norsemen to a berth in the 
state Division I semifinals. 

SOCCER: 
GPSA feeds 
high schools 
Continuedfrom pagelC 

levels." 
In keeping with that philoso­

phy, the GPSA has introduced 
a Soccer Youth Academy that 
will be run by Kelly in the off­
season. 

The indoor program will run 
from November to April and 
will be open to youngsters par­
ticipating in the under-6 to un­
der-Sage groups. 

The program will focus on 
individual skill development, 
encourage enthusiasm for the 
sport and give a head start to 
the players whose goal is to 
play travel soccer. 

'At the end of the day, how­
ever, it is important to keep 
things in perspective," Corden 
said. "We need to keep in mind 
that the real value of youth ath­
letics is the lessons they instill 
in our kids — lessons of team­
work, self sacrifice, time man­
agement, dedication and com­
mitment. 

"Our true goal and mission is 
simply to offer a piece of the 
larger puzzle of a well-rounded 
childhood with the hope of 
helping our kids develop into 
confident, mature and respon­
sible young adults, while estab­
lishing some great friendships 
along the way." 

Last fall, the Breakers '91A 
team, coached by Kelly, and 
the Breakers '92A. team, 

coached by John Mellon, each 
finished first in Division 2 in 
their age levels in the Michigan 
Premier Soccer League. Next 
fall, each of the teams will be 
moved to Division 1. 

The Michigan Premier 
league is comprised of the best 
teams in the state, and qualify­
ing for Division 1 places both 
Breakers squads among the 
top 10 teams in the state in 
their age groups. 

Last year, the '92A team ad­
vanced to the semifinals of the 
2006 State Cup. 

Members of the '92A team 
were Katherine Bowman, 
Alyssa Bruno, Ariana Conti, 
Nikki Capizzo, Mandy Ferrick, 
Ana Harris, Allison Handlon, 
Emily Klinefelt, Stephanie 
McShane, Hannah Orlicki, 
Heather O'Connnor, Holly 
Spencer, Rae Sklarski, 
Katherine Steen, Catherine 
Wieczorek. 

Players on the '91A team 
were Charlotte Waldmeir, 
Sarah Kinnear, MeganHerbst, 
Megan Ryan, Katherine 
Corden, Emma Brush, 
Bridgette Haas, Alex Filippelli, 
Jiliian Black, Lauren Jacob, 
Anna Schulte, Kate Fridholm, 
Ellen Muniga and Erika Kay. 

"The Breakers '91 and '92 
teams are terrific examples of 
what the GPSA experience of­
fers," said GPSA commission­
er Rick Jacob. 'Virtually all of 
these young ladies have been 
playing together since they 
were 8 or 9 years old, and they 
have developed friendships 
that will last a lifetime. It is so 
much more than just soccer. 

"It has been a wonderful ex­

perience to watch them mature 
as players and individuals from 
when they started together six 
years ago. The experience has 
also built friendships among 
the parents 'and families of the 
players. It has been incredibly 
fulfilling to watch our kids take 
their soccer game from the 
travel field to the high school 
field. It's especially fun to 
watch GPSA teammates com­
pete against each other when 
playing for North, South, 
(ULS)orRegina. 

"These offseason travel 
teammates, turned high school 
competitors show incredible 
respect for one another on the 
field, and at the end of the 
game — still best friends — 
share a handshake and a smile 
and look forward to being 
teammates on GPSA (teams) 
again the next season." 

Jacob said that the GPSA 
considers itself a "farm club" 
for the local high school teams. 

"Obviously, one of our most 
important goals is to develop 
athletes that can participate 
and contribute to the success 
of their respective high 
schools," Jacob said. "The ath­
letic directors and coaches at 
all of the local high schools 
have made strong commit­
ments to developing their re­
spective programs." 

In 2004, the Soutn girls team 
made it to the Division I state 
semifinals, and last fall the 
South boys also reached the 
Division I semifinals. 

North's programs have been 
successful for years, and this 
spring the North girls ad­
vanced to the Division I semifi­

nals. 
The ULS girls team won the 

Division IV state championship 
in 2005 and the boys won the 
state title in 1996 and 1999 and 
reached the state semifinals in 
2001. 

"The entire community is 
proud of their achievements 
and to the extent to which GP­
SA players contributed to their 
teams' success, we are 
thrilled," Jacob said. 

The GPSA bylaws state that 
at least half of the players must 
live in the Grosse Pointes or 
Harper Woods. 

"In reality, more than 80 per­
cent of the kids on GPSA 
teams are home grown," 
Corden said. 

"Even though the private 
clubs may be able to recruit a 
broader range of athletes, by 
providing our players with the 
best training available and 
competing at the highest levels 
possible, GPSA offers young 
athletes in our community a 
tremendous soccer experience' 
and prepares them to succeed 
at the high school level." 

Anyone interested in learn­
ing more about the club 
should visit its web-site at 
grossepointesoccer.org. or to 
get more information about the 
travel teams contact girls travel 
director Luke Ciaramitaro at 
(313) 881-7897 or (313) 400-
1330 or luke@dc-ins.com or 
boys travel director Tom 
Corsentino at (31£) 882-1383 
or (586) 709-3509 or tom.cors-
entino@eds.com. 

Registration for the fall sea­
son of the house and metro 
leagues will be in August. 

http://grossepointesoccer.org
mailto:luke@dc-ins.com
mailto:entino@eds.com
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MAC champions 
Grosse Pointe South's girls track team placed sedond in the Macomb Area Conference White 

Division championships and the Blue Devils had three division champions in seniors, from left, 

Colleen Manardo, Sam Mackenzie and Emily McLaughlin. Manardo won the pole vault. 

Mackenzie was first in the high jump. McLaughlin led the field in the 3,200-meter run. 

ULS wins tourney opener 
University Liggett School's 

softball team met a familiar foe 
when it opened the state 
Division IV tournameHfc -

The Knights, who had 
played Immaculate 
Conception in their final regu­
lar season game, winning 12-4, 
met the Bengals in a pre-dis-
trictgame. 

Once again, ULS held the 
upper hand, winning 11-1. 

Neither team used its best 
pitcher in the first meeting, so 
the tournament game between 
the Knights, who had a strong 
finish in the Metro Conference 
tournament, and IC, which had 
won the Catholic League C-D 
Division, figured to be a close 
contest. 

In reality, it was all ULS. 
Knights pitcher Taylor 

Brown was at her best as she 
allowed two hits, struck out 
four and walked only one in six 
innings. She faced only nine 
batters through the first three 
innings. 

IC scored its only run in the 
fourth when Heather Soroka 
led off with a single, moved to 
third on a pair of sacrifices and 
scored on the only ULS error 
of the game. 

The Bengals made contact 
against Brown but she got 
strong defensive support from 

shortstop Catherine Vatsis, 
who made several spectacular 
plays; Kate Shannon, who 
calmly handled three popups 
at second base; and catcher 
Danielle Vespa, who called a 
strong game and threw out an 
IC runner at second on the 
Bengals' only steal attempt. 

ULS scored in every inning. 
Vatsis led off the first with a 

triple and scored on Brown's 
groundout. 

Ke'Ana Bryant walked to 
start the second and moved 
around to score the deciding 
run after a single by Shannon 
and Megan Amicucci's 
groundout. 

The Knights extended their 
lead to 5-0 in the third. Vatsis 
started the inning with a walk 
and scored on Brown's single. 
Vespa doubled, Bryant walkd 
and Shannon and Amicucci 
followed with RBI singles. 

Walks to Vatsis, Brown and 
Kristin Peterson loaded the 
bases with one out in the 
fourth, and when Bryant and 
Shannon followed with run-
scoring singles, ULS had a 9-0 
lead. A walk to Vatsis, a single 
by Brown and Vespa's double 
produced a run in the fifth. 

The game ended on a mercy 
rule in the sixth when 
Amicucci walked, stole second 

and scored on Kristen 
Smitherman's single. 

In the earlier game, ULS 
overcame a 3-1 deficit with 
three runs in the third inning, 
and added three more runs in 
each of the next two innings to 
break the game open. 

The teams traded first-inning 
runs. Vatsis led off with a walk 
and scored on Vespa's triple to 
tiethegameatl-1. 

Vespa tripled again to start 
the Knights' third-inning rally. 
She scored on Peterson's sin­
gle. Walks to Bryant and 
Shannon loaded the bases and 

-Amicucci followed with an RBI 
single. Smitherman hit another 
single to give ULS a 4-3 lead. 

Brown led off the fourth with 
a single and came home on 
Vespa's third straight triple, 
giving her 14 for the season. 
Amicucci and Smitherman 
capped the inning with RBI 
singles. 

A walk to Vatsis, singles by 
Brown and Vespa and a double 
by Bryant gave ULS three runs 
in the fifth. The Knights got 
their final two runs in the sixth 
when Smitherman got an in­
field single and Vatsis and 
Brown hit RBI doubles. 

Vespa, who made her third 
mound start, finished with a 
one-hitter. 

Defending champ 
ends ULS's hopes 
By Bob St. John 
StaffWriter 

University Liggett School's 
girls lacrosse team faced de­
fending state champ 
Bloomfield Hills Sacred Heart 
in a regional championship 
game at Pontiac Notre Dame 
Prep. 

The Lady Knights, playing 
the role of decisive underdog, 
lost 14-3 to finish an improba­
ble run in the state Division II 
playoffs. 

"We knew we were up 
against the defending state 
champ; so we really had noth­
ing to lose," ULS head coach 
Tamara Fobare said. "I'm 
proud of the girls for playing a 

good game and keeping 
Sacred Heart off the score­
board for the first part of the 
game. 

"The girls played very well 
during the regionals and it was 
nice to make it to the finals to 
play a very good team." 

Natalie Boll, Kate Fitzgerald 
and Liz Smith scored for the 
Lady Knights. 

Fobare's squad battled Notre 
Dame Prep in a regional semi­
final earlier in the week, win­
ning 9-8 on a goal by Jamie 
Bow. 

Earlier, Prep defeated host 
ULS 16-12. 

"We played Prep tough a 
couple of weeks ago, but made 
some key mistakes that cost 

us," Fobare said. "We played 
just as well in this game, but 
didn't make those crucial mis­
takes. 

"We were very excited to win 
another close game and make 
the regional championship 
game." 

Jacqueline Nicholas scored 
three goals to pave the Lady 
Knights' attack. 

Other goal scorers were Kat 
Olson, Luisa Myavec, 
Fitzgerald and Smith. 

ULS ended its season 5-10 
overall. 

The future is a bright one for 
Fobare and the Lady Knights, 
who return next year a majori­
ty of their top scorers and de­
fenders. 

* * 
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Five-time champs 
Wimbledon Racquet Club's women's doubles B team won the Metro East Travel League champi­

onship for the fifth straight year. In front, from left, are Barb Prill, Violet Kircos, Sharon Hautau and 

Dee Hutchinson. In back, from left, are Marlyn Zampardo, Joanne Champney, captain Karen 

Stieber, Ty Lefebvre and Diane Stieler. Not pictured are Mary Rose Hodgman, Jocelyn Bierkle, 

Angeline Materna, Beth Shefferly, Sonya Zakolski, Debbie Ballew, Dora Romanelli, Barb Gervais, 

Debbie Mann, Karen Basha, Marina Vandenbrink, Natalie Flournoy and Pam Kruczek. 

Grassley finishes a 
solid soph season 

Grosse Pointe North gradu­
ate Matt Grassley had a solid 
sophomore season for the 
Heidelberg College baseball 
team. 

Grassley played 32 games in 
the outfield and batted .292. He 
was second on the team with 
three triples and his 30 RBIs 
were fourth. He hit five dou­
bles and scored 21 runs. 

PHOTO BY TERRI LIGHT 

Taylor Brown delivers a pitch for University Liggett School's 
softball team in its state tournament game against Macomb 
Christian. 

ULS: 
Fisher makes 
Dream Team 
Continued from page 1C 

in the bottom of the third on 
Justin Barber's home run, and 
they added four more runs in 

the fourth inning. 
Fisher, Henderson and 

Conway were named to the 
Division IV All-State first team, 
and Thomas was a second-
team selection for the squad 
picked by the state coaches. 

Cimini was selected as the 
Division IV coach of the year. 

Fisher was named to the All-
State Dream Team, which en­
compasses all four classes. 

Salvo '96B opens with a victory 
The Grosse Pointe Soccer 

Association Salvo '96B team 
opened its season with a 5-1 
victory against the Blue Water 
St. Clair Lakers. 

Hunter Lane played in goal. 
Carter Beck had two goals, 

while Eric Bergeron, Noah 
Erickson and Ben Malley each 
scored once for the Salvo. 
Ricky Emig and John Hoover 
collected assists. 

Anthony Carrier and Tristan 
Lane provided solid defense. 

We Run Small Ads To Pass 

BIG $AVINGS On To You! 
SPECIALS atXIWJtfOtOAuto.com 

EMPLOYEE PRICING TO EVEBYOfli; 

NEW 2008 MITSUBISHI LANCER ES 
LEASE $ 169 
101100 
•10-YR/100,OGOMILE 

POWERTRAIN LIMITED WARRANTY 
• 5-YER/60,000-MILE BUMPER TO BUMPER COVERAGE 

A M P M M f i YOWNO-HASSLE Gratiot @ 12 Mile Rd.'Roseville 

mnsumsm ™«« 1-877-666-6428 

Tennis is easy to play. Meet new friends. 
Learn new skills. Begin a lifetime of fun. 

Call today to sign up. Who Knows? A little fun 
could lead to a passion for the game! 

Junior lessons are held at 
the University Liggett School. 

To Register Call: 

313-886-2944 

E A S T S I D E 

E\T\F 
TENNIS & FITNESS 

http://atXIWJtfOtOAuto.com
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Photos, Art Ads: Thursday, June 28 - H©on 
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956 ?estCorttroi 
957 Plumbfnga installation 
958 Propane 

130 ART FRAMING 
& RESTORATION 

LE Chateau Art Gallery 
and Custom Framing, 
15001 Charlevoix, 
Grosse Points Park. 
Our experts use the 
finest frames and mats 
to enhance the beauty 
of your artwork. We 
guarantee your 100% 
satisfaction on our 
work and prices. 313-
821-8930 

« n safidaasSrig 
962 stormsAndsccewis 

965 sweaters 

969 swimming woiSetvtca 

971 l&lephcKetnBtallatlon 
973 "fliework 

975 vacuum sales/service 
976 ventliaSoriService' 
977 WaliWashirig 

103 ATTORNEYS/LEGALS 

NEED an Attorney? 
Law offices of William 
Rabaut. Over 20 years 
experience (313)884-
9060 

109 ENTERTAINMENT 

DJ: Professional and 
experienced. Ideal for 
graduations, birthdays, 
wedding receptions, 
anniversaries and other 
special occasions. Call 
SCQtty (313)247-2052. 

112 HEALTH & NUTRITION 

Personal Training ^ 
Fight Cardiovascular Disease, 

High BP, Inflexability, 
Loss of Baian.ce, 

Strength & Stamina 
RoryMcKeown 

, (313)580-6082 j 

114 MUSIC EDUCATION 

PLAYING piano, pro­
vides permanent pleas­
ure, as your pursuit be­
comes palatable: For 
lessons, . call Penny, 
(313)824-7182 

VIOLIN lessons, $10/ 
172 hour. Call Tara, 
(313)823-3433. 

VOICE & piano teach­
er. Masters degree in 
vocal performance. All 
ages. Kristine, 
(313)575-2686 

Owned/ Operated by 
METRO AIRPORT CAB. 

Luxury transportation to and! 
from airport. All size vehicles.! 

Toil Free • 866-7C 
Established 30 years. 

24 hours/ 7 days. 
We accept all 

major credit cards. 

120 TUTORING EDUCATION 

CERTIFIED teacher 
available for tutoring, 
all subjects, referen­
ces, call Patty, 
(313)884-8949. 

KINDERGARTEN thru 
2 reading, 16 years ex­
perience teaching Kin­
dergarten- 1st. Special­
ized training in Project 
Read and other meth­
ods used for dyslexic 
students. Call Michele 
for more info, 
(313)881-3647. 

MATH tutor- college 
senior math major can 
tutor your child this 
summer. Call Dustin, 
(313)823-3433. 

123 DECORATING SERVICES 

CUSTOM sewing: slip­
cover, w indow treat­
ments, . headboards, 
accessories. Krysta, 
(313)885-1829 

128 PHOTOGRAPHY 

200 HELP WANTED GENERAL 

ALL students/ others. 
Student work. $14.25, 
base appointment, 
flexible schedules, cus­
tomer sales/ service, 
no experience re­
quired. Conditions ap­
ply. Ages 17 +, filling 
positions now! 586-
293-5016 

DRIVER, part t ime. 
Small truck. Must have 
good driving record. 
Apply in person, 16901 
Harper. 

EXCELLENT opportu-
nity for serious nail 
tech. Experience wi th 
gels & acrylics helpful. 
Will train. Needed yes­
terday!! (313)881-0010 

GARDENERS. Good 
pay, work & attitude. 
(313)377-1467 

GOURMET grocery 
store is looking for ex­

perienced: 1. Stocker 
with speciality food ex­
perience; 2. Produce 
clerk; 3. Deli person; 4. 
Meat cutter. We are a 
customer service ori­
ented store and you 
must be friendly and 
outgoing! Apply in per­
son, Village Food Mar­
ket 18330 Mack Ave­
nue, Grosse Pointe 
Farms. 

PROFESSIONAL Pho- MASSAGE therapist 
tography By Bernard and nail teeh needed 
Specializing in wed- for busy day spa. 
dings, portraits & cele- (586)214-2303 or fax 
brations. 313-407-0388 (586)776-8820. 

100 ANNOUNCEMENTS I 100 ANNOUNCEMENTS 

983 Wrou#Ttiratl 

200 HELP WANTED GENERAL1 

GROWING company 
now hiring. All depart­
ments, $7.00- $10.00 
per hour. Must be 18 
wi th valid state issued 
identification and so­
cial security card. Ap­
ply at 8800 Conant, 
Hamtramck, Mi 48211. 
313-995-8114. 

IXL Glass- seeking par 
t ime counter help, 
could lead to full t ime. 
Must love working wi th 
customers, be able to 
answer phones and 
great wi th computers. 
Great high energy envi­
ronment. Fax cover let­
ter and resume to 313-
884-4032. 

TANNING salon Is hir-
ing a friendly and pro­
fessional person for 
part t ime. (586)773-
1450 

TCBY now hiring. Flex­
ible hours, good pay, 
rapid advancement op­
portunity. Apply at 
17045 Kercheval. 

201 HELP WANTED 
BABYSITTER 

FUN, happy family 
looking for a long term 
nanny to help stay at 
home mom with 3 chil­
dren ages 6- 2. Approx. 
25- 30 hours per week, 
mostly daytime, occa­
sional evening/ travel. 
Must be reliable, non-
smoker, very competi­
tive wages. Please call 
Kristina (313)822-4055 

202 HELP WANTED 
CLERICAL/OFFICE 

PART t ime bookkeep­
er, experience neces­
sary. One day per week 
or less as needed, to 
maintain auditable 
books for retail opera­
tion. Contact, Larry 
Hart at Artisan Knit­
works, (313)823-4132; 
between 12:00 and 
6:00, Tuesday- Satur­
day. 

206 HELP WANTED 
PART TIME 

DEADLINES 
Please cali for holiday close 

pl&lkattortfoifallqwir̂  

Homes f o r sate: 
Photos, art, togos: 
12P.M FRIDAY 
words ads:4 P.M.MONDAV 
Open Sunday grid: 
4 P.M. MONDAY 
sen ta isand land for sate: 
12 P.M. TUESDAY 

12 P M TUESDAY 

PRICING 
Prepayment is required. 
w&aceept visa, Mastercard, 
cast* and check Please note 
$2 feeforttecOned credit cards. 
Wordads; 
i2wordsfor$21.15; 
adcriHona£ttK>msar&65eeacri. -
Afc&reviatforts arerjpj; accepted. 

$UM per column Inch. 
Bordered ads: 
$3940 per column Inch. 
we offer special rates 
for help wanted sections. 

Given lor mufti-week scheduled 

creditapprovalXaii for ratesor 
fcirmore tntermaBcm, Phone lines 

Tuesday. Pfeaseca!! early. 

CLASSIFYING 
AND CENSORSHIP 

heading. The pu&iisner reserves 
eie nghtto editor reject ad copy 
submitted for publication. _ 

CORRECTIONS 
A N D ADJUSTMENTS 
Responsibility for classified 
advertising errors is f Imlted to ei­
ther a cancellation of the charge 
or a re-run of the portion of the 
error. Notification must be given 
In Sme for the correction in trie 
following issue, We assume no 
resportslblflty for the same after 
the first insertion 

202 HELP WANTED 
CLERICAL/OFFICE 

RECEPTIONIST/ office 
assistant- corporate 
office in St. Clair 
Shores seeks recep­
tionist/ office assistant, 
Requires 2+ years in 
similar role. Hours: 
8:30am- 5pm. Monday-
Friday. $10- $11.50 per 
hours. Great atmos­
phere. Resumes to: 
afrakes@hhaservices.c 
om or fax: 586-771-
3044. Attn: Recruiter. 
EOE 

203 HELP WANTED 
DENTAL/MEDICAL 

DETROIT dental office 
needs hygienist, front 
desk & dental assis­
tant. Full time or part 
time. (313)824-9890. 
Fax, £313)824-9894. 

PART time medical as­
sistant needed, solo 
dermatology practice, 
25 hours per week. 
$12/ hour. Fax resume 
to 586-774-2644 

204 HELP WANTED DOMESTIC 

ESTATE jobs- Grosse 
Pointe area for experi­
enced staff. Great wag­
es! Private" chef, 
grounds/ maintenance 
coordinator (live- in), 
housekeeper, nanny. 
Resumes to Cindy at 
Harper Associates, 
cindv@harperjobs.com 
Fax: 248-932-1214, 

Phone: 248-932-3662 

Grosse Paintc News 

(313)882-6900 ext. 3 

206 HELP WANTED 
PART TIME 

ANY Transportation 
Company, safe, relia­
ble, anywhere. Pickup 
truck- trailer towing-
courier . available. Ri­
chard (313)320-4336. 

Don't Forget-
Call your ads in Earlyl 

Classified Advertising 

313-882-6900x3 
Crosse Ifcinte News fkmftpjwuti 

F ITEMS UNDER $50.00 
Cr«se fcinte News * * « • ^ ^ News 

Your Ad is FREE, 
if Item is Under $50.00 

• One Item, Each Ad 
• Maximum Four Time Run 

•Cost of Item Printed with Description 
• Deadline Tuesday, Noon 

• 12 Word Maximum 
• Set up in Merchandise For Sale section 

Call 313-882-6900 ext. 3 

PART TIME PARKING 
ENFORCEMENT OFFICER 
• The City of Grosse Pointe is 

accepting applications for a 
FART TIME METER ENFORCEMENT OFFICER. 

Duties include: Parking enforcement; School 
Crossing Guard and Miscellaneous Duties for the 

Parking Department. Must be able to walk 
extended distances, write violations, and have a 
valid Michigan drivers license. Employee must be 

available to work 20- 30 hours per week. 
Starting pay $ 12/ per hour. 

Application may be obtained at 
Grosse Pointe City Hall, 17147 Maumee, 

Grosse Pointe, MI 48230; Monday - Friday, 
8:30am- 5pm. 313-885-5800 or 

On line: www.grossepointecitv.oro 
Application must be received no later 

than July 12, 2007. EOE 

Place an Order 
MAIL OR FAX THIS FORM (OR PLACE AN ORDER ON OUR WEB SITE) 

Grosse Pointe News and Pointe of Purchase 
Mail: Classified Advertising, 96 Kercheval, Grosse Pointe Farms, Ml, 48236 

Phone: (313) 882-6900 Ext. 3 Fax: (313) 343-5569 

Web: grossepointenews.com 

YOUR ADVERTISEMENT 

CLASSIFICATION NO. 

S21.15 FOR 12 WORDS. ADDITIONAL WORDS. ,65G EACH. CALL FOR COLOR] 

$21.15 

13 S22.45, S23.1G 

17 $2440 S2KQ5 m-w » 

NO.OFWEEKS: X COSTPERWEEK:. TOTAL: 

YOUR CONTACT AND BILLING INFORMATION 

NAME: 

STREET ADDRESS' 

CITY STATE: ZIP:. 

PHONE' 

AMOUNT ENCLOSED; 

QVISA • MASTERCARD CARD NO. 

SIGNATURE: 

EXP. DATE: 

Prepayment Is required. We accept Visa, Mastercard, cash and check. 

Declined Credit Cards. Minium fee $2.00 or 3% of total declined. 

207 HELP WANTED SALES 

Are You Serious 

About a Career in 
Real Estate? 

We are serious about 
your Success! 

*Free Pre-ficensing 

classes in 

Grosse Pointe 

^Exclusive Success 

Systems Training & 

Coaching Programs 

*Earn While You Learn 

*Variety of Pay Plans 

Call George Smale 
313-886-4200 

Coldwell Banker 
Schweitzer 
Real Estate 

cbschweitzer.com 

210 HELP WANTED 
RESTAURANT 

EXPERIENCED bar­
tender wanted. Please 
call (313)881-8540 
(Must have experience) 

Classifieds: 313-882-6900x3 
Grosse Paints News ffa 

210 HELP WANTED 
RESTAURANT 

EXPERIENCED grill 
cook/ kitchen, dish­
washer. Immediate 
opening. Please call 
Mack Daddy's, 313-
417-9000. 

If You Don't Need 
It..Sell It 
Why keep old clothes, books 
or household Items you d o n ' t 
need when you couid sell 
them? Now is the per fec t 
time to plan a garage sale — 
and the classified section Is 
the per fect place to adver­
tise. You could put money In 
your pocket and have room 
to spare! 

Crosse fointe News 

Classif ied Advert is ing 
Depar tment 
(313)882-6900 ext. 3 

LAST 
, WEEKS 
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ACROSS 
1 Kreskin's 

claim, briefly 
4 Wanders 
9 Aware 

12 Boudreau of 
baseball 

13 Otherwise 
14 Can. neighbor 
15 l957Astaire 

movie 
17 Crafty 
18 Corn spike 
19 Chops into 

small bits 
21 Reflective 

24 
25 

26 
28 

31 

33 
35 

36 

power 
Grad 
Romanian 
money 
Overactor 
Flounder 
through 
puddles 
Token of 
defiance 
Papa 
Elbow 
counterpart 
Examine ore 

38 Affirmative 
40 
41 
43 

45 
47 

48 
49 

54 

Blunder 
Support group? 
Game 
participant 
Sunday meal 
Science 
workplace 
Thither 
Bees' 
structure 
A billion 
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51 
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years 

55 Hackneyed 
56 Retainer 
57 Firmament 
58 Handle the 

helm 
59 Adipose 

tissue 

DOWN 
1 Sprite 
2 Old French 

coin 
.3 Bitot 

wordplay 
4 Capital of 

Saudi Arabia 
5 On unpaved 

areas 
6 Literary 

collection 

7 Starbucks 
flavor 

8 Pilfers 
9 Bribe of a 
• sort 

10 Gilligan's 
home 
Picks up the 
check 
Born 
Pout 
Plankton 
component 
Meadows 
Thorn in 
Elmer Fudd's 
side 

27 Spring time 
29 Withered 
30 Munich 

11 

16 
20 
21 

22 
23 

mister 
32 Deserve 
34 Use up 
37 America's 

Cup 
contenders' 

39 Buffy,to 
vampires 

42 Concise . 
44 Regis' 

network 
45 Tournament 

situations 
46 Chess piece 
50 Never, in 

Nuremberg 
51 Vacationing 
52 — culpa 
53 Wager 

http://GROSSEPOINTENEWS.COM
http://Baian.ce
mailto:cindv@harperjobs.com
http://www.grossepointecitv.oro
http://grossepointenews.com
http://cbschweitzer.com
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303 SITUATIONS WANTED!307 SITUATIONS WANTED 
DAY CARE I NURSES AIDES 

ATTENTION: 
by M I C H I G A N LAW 

DAY CARE 
FACILITIES 

(In-Home & Centers) 
Must Show Their 
Current License 
To Advertising 
Representative 
When Placing 

Your Ads 
THANK YOU 

Parents - Please 
Verify All Child Care 

Licenses! 

EXCELLENT referen- COLEMAN'S Angels of 
ces. Licensed & insur- home care. Assistance 
ed, 15 years. Spacious, for the elderly, L P N , 
safe nurtur ing home. 8 CNA's, EMT's. Refer-
1/2 & Harper area. ence. Angels are 
(586)777-8602 watch ing. (313)449-

2156 

300 SITUATIONS WANTED 
BABYSITTERS 

COLLEGE student 
home for summer look­
ing for babysitting posi­
tion, in your home. No 
smoking, great with 
kids! Plenty of experi­
ence, available any­
time! Please calf Devon 
at (313)690-0510 

DEPENDABLE, re-
sponsible and *fun* 
school social worker 
seeking summer child 
care opportunity, in 
your home. Own trans­
portation, non- smok­
er, loves pets. Availa­
ble weekdays and 
weekends. CPR/ First 
Aid certified. Excellent 
references. Call Stefa-
nie: (586)201-2673 

EXPERIENCED stLH 
dent seeking babysit­
ting position in your 
home. 5 years Liggett 
Day Camp counselor, 
CPR certified, own 
transportation and ex­
cellent references. Ste­
phanie {313)884-3673 

FUN outgoing, respon­
sible coilege junior 
wants to be your sum­
mer nanny, in your 
home, If interested 
contact Elizabeth, 
(313)821-2622 

FUN responsible, MSU 
junior seeks babysit­
ting opportunities in 
your home. 313-300-
5263, Denise 

RESPONSIBLE care-
giver/ babysitter availa­
ble in your home. Keep 
your kids busy all sum­
mer long! Have fun 
with games, sports, 
crafts & educational 
activities! {313)600-
0747 

THIRD year UofM stu-
dent looking for sum­
mer, babysitting, in 
your home. Experi­
enced, own transporta­
tion. Maureen, 
(313)802-3696 

302 SITUATIONS WANTED 
CONVALESCENT CARE 

AIDE resides in 
Shores, cares for elder­
ly whenever needed. 
Caring, dependable, 
reasonable. Excellent 
references. (586)872-
.3471 

CARE AT HOME 
Care givers, persona! 

care, cooking, cleaning 
' Licensed - Bonded 

Since 1984. 
Full/part time, live-in. 

(586)772-0035 
ELDERLY caregiver 
with excellent referen­
ces, available full or 
part time. (313)918-
9653 : 

HEALTH care Options. 
Persona! in- home 
care, cooking, laundry, 
part/ full time. Hourly. 
Tracy Scott Evans,' R.N. 
(313)673-4604 

PRIVATE duty by male 
health care, professio­
nal, not an aid, but a li­
censed respiratory 
therapist. Interested 
parties please call 
(586)634-2509 

A+ Live-ins Ltd. 
Companion Caregivers provide 
Personal Care, Cleaning, Cooking 
& Laundry. Hourly & Daily Rates 

Insured & Bonded 
Dee Allen - Grosse Pointe Resident 

881-8073 

305 SITUATIONS WANTED 
HOUSE CLEANING 

AFFORDABLE house-
cleaning by Polish lady. 
Honest, dependable, 
detail oriented. Grosse 
Pointe references. 
(313)729-6939 

EXPERIENCED refla^ 
ble cleaning for your 
office or home. Excel­
lent references. Rea­
sonable rates. 
(586)747-8512 

LYNN'S Housekeep­
ing. Leave your clean­
ing to me. weekly, bi­
weekly, monthly. 1-
time cleaning available. 
All - supplies included. 
Senior discounts. Ref­
erences. 586-817-6275 

MARGARET L L C 
House cleaning and 
laundry services. Polish 
ladies with very good 
experience, ' excellent 
references. We speak 
English! (313)319-7657, 
(313)881-0259 

PROFESSIONAL 
cleaning service. 8 
years experience. Ref­
erences, (313)354-1277 

SPRING has sprung. 
For all your cleaning, 
laundry &. hand ironing 
needs, use Professio­
nal Cleaners. Proudly 
serving Ail Pointes 
since 1985. EDP, Inc. 
Insured & Bonded 

Home Care 
Assistance of Michigan 

•Full Time •PartTime 

# • Live-in 
•Personal Care 

•C lean ing •Cookin 
•Laundry 

Insured/Bonded 
Henry DeVrles, Jr. 

313-343-6444 

POINTE CARE 
SERVICES 

SOCAward Winner 
"Senior Friendly Business" 

PERSONAL CASE, 
COOKING, CLEANING, 

LAUNDRY ' 
FULL/PART TIME 

INSURED ee BONDED 

313-885-6944 
, Mary Qhesquiere, R.it. . 

S U M M E R T I M E and 
the cleaning is easy. If 
Cathy does it! Week­
days & Saturdays avail­
able. (586)783-4445 

Y O U finally found her, 
a woman who actually 
l ikes to clean! Reliable, 
t rustwor thy. 12 years 
experience, referen­
ces. (313)550-2890 

InThe Classifieds jng 
Grosse Paints News 

(313)882-6900 ext. 3 

406 ESTATE SALES 

310 SITUATIONS WANTED 
ASSISTED LIVING 

PRIVATE nursing care-
35 years home/ hospi­
tal experience, special­
izing: vents, auto cas­
es, IVs, wounds, basic 
nursing care. Anna, 
Mary, (248)545-7051 

WILL do cooking, 
cleaning, laundry, driv­
ing, errands, shopping. 
$8/ hour. Call Janis, 
(586)779-1457 

400 
ANTIQUES/COLLECTIBLES 

CASH reward- Collec­
tor paying top dollar for 
WWII souvenirs. Ger­
man or Japanese 
swords, daggers, hel­
mets, f lags, etc. 
(313)802-9955 

OIL paintings (original). 
Large/ beaut i ful . Tradi­
t iona l / Victor ian. $150-
$800.(313)647-0595 

PIANO (upright) 100+ 
years old. All new felts, 
hammers, etc. Ivory 
keys, great shape. Can 
help move. First $500 
Offer. (313)378-1758 

401 APPLIANCES 

GE wh i te , side- by-
side refr igerator. $250, 
you move. 313-618-
2668. 

STYLISH black side by 
side refr igerator. Only 
15 months o ld . Admiral 
by Maytag. 26 cubic 
feet. Exterior water , ice 
dispenser. 
(313)878-4014 

404 BICYCLES 

C A N N O N D A L E bikes, 
min t condi t ion! F600 
mounta in XT, Head 
Shok, black, $450. 
R2000 road ui tegra, 
Kysrium wheels, red, 
$1,200. Cycle-ops 
trainer, USPS model , 
w i th v ideos, $120. 
(313)580-6082 

M E N ' S Trek mounta in 
bike. Alpha 4500. 2 1 " . 
New. Stored in bed­
room, $250/ best. 
(313)477-0055 

406 ESTATE SALES 

GROSSE Pointe Farms, 
475 Bellanger, Friday, 
Saturday, 10:00am-
4:00pm. Furniture, d in­
ing room sets, ant i ­
ques, c lothing, area 
rugs. 

406 ESTATE SALES 

5010 Lafontaine. 7 
blocks South of MO-
ross. 7 houses West of 
Mack. Antiques, col-
iectables, furniture, ap­
pliances clothing, 
bikes, X-mas tree,ficus 
trees, home improve­
ment, construction, 
tools, drafting table, 
books, household, and 
more! Saturday, June 
23rd 10am-5pm. 

406 ESTATE SALES 

INTEGRITY ESTATE SALES 
y ^ ^ "Known for Honesty & Integrity" 

www.iluvantiques.com 
Creative Solutions to Home Liquidation! 

Call us before you clean or throw anything away! 

(586)344-2048 

GARY'S HOUSEHOLD SALES 
ESTATE 'MOVING SALES 

garyshousehold@aol.com 

CENTERLINE/WARREN ESTATE SALE 
8061 BERNICE 

(East off VanDyke, Between 10 & 11 (1-696). Light on VanDyke at Bemice 
THURSDAY, JUNE 21 

FRIDAY, JUNE 22 & SATURDAY JUNE 23 
9:00AM- 5:00PM 

Glassware, kitchen items, knick- knacks, bird baths, 
gardening. Some tools. The garage is PACKED full 
& we are still unpacking so you have to dig aroundl 

This is one of the most PACKED houses we nave done 
in a long time and all prices are great to move fast! 

Street numbers honored at 9:00am Thursday 

Grosse Pointe Sales, Inc. 

ffc June 22 & 23 (10-4) 
1449 Torrey, G.P.W. 

(2 houses off Holiday) 

Estate Sale. Neat and Clean. Traditional furniture includes 
mahogany breakfront, writing desk, sofa table, antique wash 
stand. Victorian glass curio, sofa, chairs, 2 double beds, twin 

beds, oak table, dressers, vanities. 2 sets sterling silver 
flatware, tea service, Lalique, Waterford, Fostoria, Hummel 

collection, B&G, fine china sets, linens, 1940 rattan patio set.' 
Numbers Friday only @9:30-10:00 

Renee A. Nixon {313)822-1445 

faUtdw S&fate Saiu 
633 NEFF ROAD, G.P. CITY 
Thu., June 21st (9:00-3:00) 
Fri., June 22nd (10:00-3:00) 

Absolutely amazing antique sale. The owner collected 
quality and it shows!! Featuring: mammoth quantity of 

old transferware (20th, 19th and 18th century pieces) by 
Davenport; Wood, Clews, Ridgway, Spode and more; 

Royal Doulton, small Tobys and figurines; lots of Belleek; 
Waterford; brass; vases; baskets; inkwells; silver; British 

Royals collectibles; huge assortment of thousand eye; 
old etchings; prints; jewelry; and more. 
Numbers @ 7:30 A.M. THURSDAY!!! 

www.rainbowestatesales.com Look for the Rainbow!!! 

John King 
313-961-0622 

* c i i p & Save This Ad« 

EVERYTHING must 
go! House full of furni­
ture. Thomasville, 
Lane, Vintage & Anti­
que. Living room, din­
ing room, kitchen & 
bedroom. Lamps, mir­
rors & accessories. 
June 22, 23; 9am- 4pm. 
June 24,12-4pm. 

TOP quality estate 
sales by Decorative An­
tiques. Friday, June 22, 
9am- 4pm. Saturday, 
June 23, 10am- 4pm. 
8120 jefferson, Indian 
Viilage Manor, {on Jef­
ferson just east of Van 
Dyke and Belle Isle). 
Contents: antiques & 
collectibles, fabulous 
furniture, Venetian & 
Deco fixtures, pottery. 
Oriental rugs, glass­
ware, porcelain, art, 
gold, diamond & cos­
tume jeweiry. 

408 FURNITURE 

ANTIQUE dining room 
set: table with 6 chairs, 
leaf, china cabinet & 
buffet, $900. {586)772-
3272 

KING sized headboard, 
footboard & frame, 
wrought steel, antique 
finish, $450. (586)776-
4836. 

LITTLE Folks twin bed, 
4 drawer dresser, 3 
drawer desk, chair 
(Ash); and mattress, all 
for $750. Upholstered 
lounging chaise, $400. 
313-618-2668 

409 GARAGE/YARD/ 
RUMMAGE SALE 

1 day only! 1510 Hun­
tington Blvd., Grosse 
Pointe Woods. June 
23rd, 9am- 2:30pm. 

1029 Audubon- Thurs­
day, Saturday; 9am-
1pm. Brio tabie, Play-
scape, bikes, toys, 
clothes, household, 
storm doors, snow-
blower. 

409 GARAGE/YARD/ 
RUMMAGE SALE 

1254 Harvard, Park-
Saturday, 9am- 3pm. 
Everything must go! 
Furniture, household, 
kids. 

1337 Harvard, Grosse 
Pointe Park: upscale 
garage. sale. Friday, 
8am- 3pm. Saturday, 
9am- i2noon. Furni­
ture, silver set, 2 luxu­
rious fur coats, good 
books, kitchen ware, 
quality clothes, toys. 

1833 Hawthorne, 
Grosse Pointe woods. 
Friday 9am-2pm. 

20 family contribution! 
Vintage to new items, 
4 student desks, lots of 
great clothes infant to 
adult all 25£ each. 
Fund raiser for Wayne 
Elementary School, De­
troit. 230 McMillan, 
Grosse Pointe Farms. 
Saturday, 9am- 2pm. 

21911 Chaion, St. Clair 
Shores. Saturday, 8am-
1pm. Lots of every­
thing. Boucher' pins, 
Hallmark, toys. 

21930 Edmunton, St. 
Clair Shores, {North of 
Vernier/ West of Mack). 
June 21- 24: 9:00am-
4:00pm. Furniture, ex­
ercise, lawn equip­
ment, toys, more! 

22804/ 22815 Harmon, 
(9 Mile, behind Kmart) 
June 21- 23, 9am- 5pm. 

352 Merriweather, 
Thursday- Saturday 
9am- 4pm. Lots of fur­
niture, antiques, cot-
lectables, rugs, power 
washer, yard tools 8t 
much more! 

429 Maison, Friday, 
Saturday 9am~ ?. 
Dressers, Christmas/ 
craft misc., collecta-
bles, more! 

507 Lakepointe, 
Grosse Pointe Park. 
Antiques, brass, glass, 
furniture, toys, tools, 
housewares. Huge yard 
sale. Rain or shine. Fri­
day and Saturday; 
9am- 4pm. No pre-
saies. 

596 Lakeland, 9- 3. 
Moving, garage sale. 
Friday, Saturday, June 
21,22. Good deals. 

700 block of Lincoln 
Road garage sale, 
Grosse Pointe City. 
June 23rd, 9:00am-
2:00pm. Raindate June 
30th. Antiques, books, 
bric-a-brac. Clothing, 
furniture, exercise 
equipment, household 
miscellaneous, toys. 

4 families- many items. 75 Muir, Farms. Friday, 
Saturday; 9am- 2pm. Saturday, 9:00am-
22301 Alger (off Mack), 4:00pm. Lot's of every-
St. Clair Shores. thing! 

406 ESTATE SALES 406 ESTATE SALES 

ESTATE & MOVING SALES 

AUCTIONS & APPRAISALS 

SENIOR MOVING SPECIALISTS 

CLEAN OUTS 

LOW STEFEK • 313.574J039 
WWW.STEFEKSLTD.COM 

Wanted Vintage Clothes And Accessories 
Paying Top Dollar For The Following: 

clothes From The 1900's Through 1970's. 
•Costume *Fine Jewelry/watches 

•Cufflinks -Furs -Hats -Handbags -Shoes 
Lingerie -Linens -Textiles 

•Vanity *Boudoir items 
References, complete Confidentiality 

"Best of Hour Detroit" 
"Paris'1 248-866-4389 

Another Quality Estate Sale! 
Friday, Saturday; June 22, 23; 10am - 4pm 
7328 Creek View, Pebble Creek Condos, 

West Bloomfield 
(North off 14 Mile Road, West of Orchard Lake Road) 

30 years continuous residency. Antique and Traditional 
contents. Baker Country French dining room set, 
Baker and Henredon wing back chairs. Heredon 
sofa/ love seat. Sterling flatware. Rosenthal and 

Royal Doulton dinnerware. Silver, crystal, linens. 
300 leather Franklin Mint books. 

Plus huge amounts of quality things throughout. 

See you there! Edmund Frank & Co. (313)854-6000 

MARCIA WILK 
ESTATE SALES 

3 1 3 8 8 1 2 8 4 9 
WWW.MARC1AWILK.COM 

15 N. EDGEWOOD 
GROSSE POINTE SHORES 

North Edgewood is five streets past Vernier 
between Vernier and Matter off Lakeshore Drive 

FRIDAY & SATURDAY JUNE 22, 23, 
- ^ 9:00AM- 4:00PM a 

This house Is full! This Is on excellent sale with 
beautiful antiques and tons of useful household itemsl 

Look at my website www.marciawilk.com 
for an extensive listing as well as pictures and a mapl 

Street numbers honored at 8:30am Friday. 
I accept Visa, MasterCard, and Discover. 

409 GARAGE/YARD/ 
RUMMAGE SALE 

961 Trombley, Grosse 
Pointe Park, Saturday, 
10am- 3pm. Toys, 
clothing, household. 

BEST ever dale! Huge! 
1410 Lakepointe. Sat­
urday/ Sunday 9:00am. 
Even a cockatiel! 

DETROIT, 3553 Bishop 
1st block off Mack. 
June 23, 24. 9am- 5pm. 
Mufti- family- moving-
wedding consolidation 
sale. Antiques/ great 
junk. 

GROSSE Pointe Ani­
mal Adoption Society. 
Pets for adoption. 
(313)884-1551. WWW. 
GPAAS.org 

GROSSE Pointe Farms, 
28 Beverly Road, Fri­
day, 9:00am- 4:00pm 
Saturday 9:00am-
3:00pm. Knick- knacks, 
dining room set (dark 
wood), excellent condi­
tion, $400/ best offer. 
Changing table, white, 
like new, $70. Stroller-
Italian Berritini, origi­
nally $400, asking 
$200. 30 yards of Nau-
gahyde, for boat. 2- na­
vy blue Naugahyde, 
Chippendale chairs. 

GROSSE Pointe Farms, 
295 and 301 Moross 
Road, (both at corner 
of Beaupre). Vintage, 
Shabby Chic items. 
Furniture, chaise, wick­
er, rugs, household 
items, clothing, tools, 
garden, etc. Everything 
under the sun... great 
stuff... don't miss! Fri­
day, Saturday; 8am-
4pm. 

GROSSE Pointe 
Household Sales is 
having their own out­
side sale. Antique 
Cherry drop leaf table, 
collectibles, decorative 
items, clothes, purses, 
jewelry, vintage linen, 
silver & silver plate, 
toys, books, holiday & 
household items. Lots 
of card tables, folding 
tables, lamps, table 
cloths, supplies. Bikes, 
air conditioner, trunks, 
antique skate sail, 
much more. Prices: 
,25£- $250.00 Friday-
Saturday; 9am- 3pm. 
881 Washington, NO 
pre-sales. 

GROSSE Pointe Park, 
1366 Whittier, Friday & 
Saturday 9:00am-
4:00pm. 3 family ga­
rage sale. Loads of 
toys, adult & kidsc 
clothes, knick- knacks, 
small microwave, al­
mond electric stove, 
figurines, Jacuzzi tub, 
books, small furniture, 
etc. etc.! 

GROSSE '. Pointe 
Woods, 1834 Hunt 
Club. (Mack, between 
7- 8 Mile). Friday, Sat­
urday; 9am- 3pm. Mov­
ing sale: furniture, 
children's, miscellane­
ous. 

409 GARAGE/YARD/ 
RUMMAGE SALE 

GROSSE Pointe 
woods, 1938 Hunting­
ton. Friday '8am- 1pm. 
Saturday 9am- 1pm. 
Misc. household, dou­
ble stroller, other baby 
items, furniture, elec­
tric dryer, grill and 
much more. 

GROSSE Pointe, 831 
Washington. Friday, 
9am- 3pm. Patio furni­
ture, antiques, cam­
corder, household, 
clothes. 

HARPER Woods. MOV-
ing! Furniture, Little 
Tikes, garden, car, 
scooter, Mary Kay. Fri­
day, Saturday, 9am-
6pm. 

HUGE garage sale! 478 
Calvin, Saturday/ Sun­
day; 9:00am- 3:00pm. 
u name it-We got it!!! 

HUGE garage sale-
multi family. Saturday, 
June 23; 10am. Gary 
Lane in Lakeshore Vil­
lage, St. Clair Shores. 

JUNE 23rd, 10am- 4pm 
708 Hawthorne. Home 
decor, women's 
clothes, beads. 

M U L T I family. June 22, 
23, 9am- 4pm. some of 
everything, household,, 
kids, etc. 18564 
Mccormick, Detroit, 

SALE! 5275 Bishop. 
June 23 only. 9am-
5pm. Antiques, furni­
ture, household, stain 
glass. 

SATURDAY 9am- 2pm 
household items, toys. 
557 Thorn Tree Rd, 
Grosse Pointe woods 

SOMETHING for ev-
eryone garage sale! 
20960 Kenmore, Harp­
er Woods. June 29, 30 
& July 1. Rain date: July 
7 & 8 . 

SOUTH Bend lathe, 9" 
very good condition. 
Fully equipped, mill at­
tachment/ bench. 
$775.(313)885-9120 

ST. Clair Shores, 22325 
St. Joan. Friday, Satur­
day 9am-5pm. Moving! 

ST, Clair Shores, 22631 
California, (between 8 
& 9 Mile, off Greater 
Mack). Friday, Satur­
day, Sunday. 9:00am~ 
4:00pm. Many house­
hold items 

ST. Clair Shores, June 
21st- June 23rd 9am-
4pm. Estate & house­
hold. 21900 Edmunton 
& 21831 Chaion (cor­
ner of Helen) 

SUPER yard sale! Fri­
day, Saturday 8am-
3pm. 20274 Wopdmont 
used treasures. 

VERA Bradley brand 
new with tags. 1/2 off 
retail price. Crocs with 
tags (kids/ adults). Pot­
tery Barn outdoor. Fri­
day, 9am- ?. 1308 
Hampton. 

409 GARAGE/YARD/ 
RUMMAGE SALE 

EASTENGtISH, 
VILLAGE 

Annual Heiĝ iborficrod 
Garage-Sale 

Saturday, Jon* 23 
$un4ay»f«ne2$ : 

9am- Spm -ft 
EEV is located between 

" hhck i Haspo^ " 
Caijjeas / Ease Outer Drive 

www.e^tenglteMiteS&brg 

412 MISCELLANEOUS 
ARTICLES 

BESSLER 23C II en-
larger, digital timer, 
plus miscellaneous 
darkroom supplies. 
Make offer. 313-618-
2668 

JOHN Deere 17. 5 HP 
OHV, L110 auto with 
rear bagger, Sacrifice, 
$1,000.(313)884-1527 

LAWN mower, Iver-
son women's 10-
speed bike, Marukin 
men's 12- speed bike. 
Little Tykes country 
kitchen play toy, Trea­
dle sewing machine, 
portable sewing ma­
chine. (313)885-7437 

STOVE, gas, 4 burner/ 
oven. Refrigerator, side 
by side. Washer/ dryer, 
3 years. Sears Ken-
more. Dining room set: 
cream color, buffet, 
china, 4 chairs, mirror. 
Dresser. (313)822-0506 

413 MUSICAL 
INSTRUMENTS 

GROSSE POINTE 
STRINGS 

Repair & set- up of 
violin, viola, cello and 
bass. Rehairing bows. 

Selling reasonably 
priced student 
instruments. 

Call (313)882-7874 
for an appointment. 

KAWAI console piano 
and bench, off white 
gloss, excellent condi­
tion, make offer. 313-
618-2668 j 

WANTED- GuitaVs, 
Banjos, Mandol ins and 
Ukes. Local col lector 
paying t o p cash! 3^3-
886-4522 . i 

415 WANTED TO BUY 

FINE china dinner-
ware, sterling. silver 
flatware and antiques. 
Call Jan/ Herb. 
(586)731-8139 

IF you are settling .an 
estate and would like 
to sell vintage teacup 
sets or collections, 
please call 586-713-
7978 

RECORDS, LPS, 45S. 
Flames favorites, help­
ing Detroiters with dis­
abilities. (313)283-3422 

416 SPORTS EQUIPMENT 

BOWFLEX XTL with at­
tachments, $500. 
(586)872-1401 

*S 

su|do|ku 
O Puz2les by Pappocom 

Tips and computer program at: ;$ 

www.sudoku.com L 
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DIRECTIONS: 
Fill in the grid so 
that every row, 

every column and 
every 3x3 grid 

contains the digits 
1 through 9 with 

no repeats. 

Thursday 06-21-07 

E-8 SOLUTION 06-14-07 

http://grossepointenews.com
http://www.iluvantiques.com
mailto:garyshousehold@aol.com
http://www.rainbowestatesales.com
http://WWW.STEFEKSLTD.COM
http://WWW.MARC1AWILK.COM
http://www.marciawilk.com
http://GPAAS.org
http://www.e%5etenglteMiteS&brg
http://www.sudoku.com
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422 UNDER $50.00 

2 matching brass chan­
deliers, 2 2 " diameter, 
Wil l iamsburg style, $45 
(313)881-2240 

BEAUTIFUL leaded 
glass panel: $50. 
(313)882-8332 

BICYCLE Tag- a- long/ 
3rd wheel , (up to 85 
pounds) $25 (313)823-
8538 

DISPLAY cases (37 
Approximately 3'x 6'. 
313-300-8842 

PAIR wa lk ie Talkies, 
never used, still in box-
es, wi l l sacrifice $50. 
(586)268-2024 

503 HOUSEHOLD PETS 
FOR SALE 

510 ANIMAL SERVICES 

AKC, registered Yorkie BACKYARD Bandits-
puppies. 2 males, Pet waste removal, as 
$900/ each. 1 small fe- low as $10. per week, 
male, $1,200. Ready, (586)443-8800 
June 30. (810)679-3367 

500 ANIMAL 
ADOPT A PET 

GROSSE Pointe Ani ­
mal Clinic: female 
smaller Rottweiler mix 
puppy. Male Shepherd 
mix puppy. Many kit­
tens, many colors, un ­
usual female orange 
cat. (313)822-5707 

Classifieds: 313-882-6900x3 
Crosse 5binte News BbmiQFfAMcmss 

GOLDEN Retriever 
puppies, English bred 
ultra light, $800.- Check 
webwww.magnum 
kennel.com or 
(231)824-6777 

LAB pups, AKC/ OFA, 
black, yellow. Ready 
June 15, vet checked. 
nancve 1@charter.net 
(248)449-3177 

THEY'RE back 
ChiPom- YorkiePoos, 6 
weeks, tiny, too cute! 
$350.(313)523-5211 

505 LOST AND FOUND 

FOUND: medium large 
black & brown dog, 6/ 
4 on Lakeland. 
(313)418-5927 

GROSSE Pointe Ani­
mal Clinic: male Gold­
en / Chow. (313)822-
5707 

LOST, orange, whi te 
short hair cat, little 
over 1 year old. 10/Jef­
ferson. St. Clair Shores. 
586-899-3659 

602 AUTOMOTIVE 
FORD 

2006 Ford Focus, sil­
ver, 4 door, 18,000 
miles. $8,500/ best of­
fer. (313)881-6911 

1999 Ford Taurus SHO-
immaculate condition. 
116,000 miles. Asking, 
$5,990.(313)610-2123 

603 AUTOMOTIVE 
GENERAL MOTORS 

1984 Buick Riviera, 
leather, 60k, beautiful 
car, $4,500. (313)623-
7691/(313)882-4180 

1994 Cadillac, 100,000 
miles, new battery, 
struts, spark plugs, 
brakes, tires, transmis­
sion, fuel pump, ser­
pentine belt, oil 
changed every 2,000 
miles, heated seats, 
auto start, car alarm, 
excellent shape, 
$5,000. (586)778-4189 

603 AUTOMOTIVE 
GENERAL MOTORS 

2001 Chevrolet Malibu-
V6. Cold air, automatic, 
drives excellent. 
110,000 miles. $3,300. 
(586)344-8896 

1993 Chevy Lumina, 4 
door, 23,000 actual 
miles, mint condit ion, 
excellent for school, 
work, $4.,500. 
(586)773-6668 

2004 Corvette Coupe, 
automatic, torch red/ 
black. Head's up. 
12,000 miles. Magnesi­
um wheels, loaded. 
Must sell. $33,500/ 
best offer. (586)948-
9628 

1989 Pontiac Firebird-
runs good. (313)331-
6558 

604 AUTOMOTIVE 
ANTIQUE/CLASSIC 

605 AUTOMOTIVE 
FOREIGN 

MERCEDES, 1972 
brown, 280. 4 door, 
75K miles. $9,000/ 
best, 313-433-8345 
(Mel) _ _ 

605 AUTOMOTIVE 
FOREIGN 

1997 Honda Accord 
LX, 124,000 miles, 
great shape, $3,500. 
(313)822-3169 

2000 Acura 3. 2TL, 44K 
miles, $10,950, new 
tires, 1 owner, leather, 
power, auto, excellent 
condit ion, service re­
cords. St. Clair Shores 
(913)961-0628 

2005 Avalon, spacious, 
stylish, good gas mile­
age, touring package. 
(734)827-5452, 
(313)881-3268. 

2003 BMW Z4 converti­
ble, maroon/ tan interi­
or, automatic, perfect 
condit ion inside 8< out, 
100,000 mile factory 
warranty, $22,900. 
(313)881-1359. Cell 
(734)709-1634 

1996 Saab SE Turbo, 5-
speed, leather, moon 
roof, great on gas, ex­
cellent condit ion. 
$3,700. (586)344-8896 

2004 Volvo S60, leath-
er, sun roof, 32,000 
miles, excellent condi­
t ion, 100,000 transfera­
ble warranty. $17,500. 
(313)332-4677 

TO PLACE AN AD 
CALL 313-332-6900 ext3 

Grosse Pointe News 

606 AUTOMOTIVE 
SPORT UTILITY 

2003 Dodge Durango, 
high miles, well main­
tained. Loaded. 
$10,000. Toll f ree/ 866-
493-2082;313655-9984 

651 BOATS AND MOTORS 

611 AUTOMOTIVE 
TRUCKS 

1999 Ford Ranger. Au ­
tomatic, good condi­
t ion, high mileage, 
$4,200/ best. (586)484-
1634 

612 AUTOMOTIVE 
VANS 

1986 Catalina 27 sail­
boat. Excellent condi­
t ion. $16,000. 586-773-
1642, www.w ideopen 
west .com/~adub/ 

W E are Here Founda­
t ion, Inc. Donate your 
boat! 100% tax deduc­
tible. All proceeds to 
environmental cleanup 
group. Contact Jennifer 
Yezback. 586-778-2143 

653 BOAT PARTS/SERVICE 

2006 Dodge Caravan. 
22,000 miles. Under 
warranty. CD, A M / FM, 
air. $13,000/ best. 313-
550-6493 

651 BOATS AND MOTORS 

2003 290 Amberjack, 
180 hours, original 
owner, $87,500. 
(313)886-2210 

2006 Catalina 16. 5, 
mint condit ion, new 3. 
5 hp 4 stroke, loaded 
options/ trailer. $9,250. 
(586)776-5815 

GREATER GrOSSe 
Pointe Boat Cleaning. 
Bonded, insured. To-
mek, 313-806-3739. 
Ryan, 313-549-7740 

JOE'S Unique Boat Top 
Replacement or new 
custom canvas, up­
holstery design. 
(586)294-2838 

M A R I N E 
W O O D W O R K 

Custom Design & Built 
Cabinetry. Repairs, dry-
rot. 30 Yrs Experience. 
Portfolio/ References 

(248)435-6048 

654 BOAT 

BOATWELLS, Alter 
Road. Up to 20', $200/ 
season, safe & secure. 
(313)822-3641 

NORTHERN Michigan-
Boyne ci ty. Lake Char­
levoix. 32 ft. boat slip, 
$1,800/ sq. ft or 
$6,000/ season 
(231)838-4167 

657 MOTORCYCLES 

2000 HD Deuce, low 
miles. $25,000 invest­
ed; sacrifice $13,000. 
Don't buy new... save 
half, immaculate! 586-
557-2905 

661 WATER SPORTS 

WINDSURFER begin­
ner board. Portable, in­
flatable sail board wi th 
a solid deck. Mint con­
dit ion. $325 (586)291-
5700 

WE ACCEPT 

FOR YOUR 
CONVENIENCE 
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1 bedroom apar tment 
$500. Grosse Pointe 
area. Bob, 313-595-
3886 

1 bedroom upper 
apartment, Grosse 
Pointe. $750/ month, 
includes heat, air, ap­
pliances. EOE. 
{313)683-3617 

1 - 2 bedroom upper 
flats on Beaconsfield. 
$600/ up. {313)824-
7900 

1300 Beaconsfield, up­
p e r , 2 .bedroom, den. 
Kitchen, living , r oom, 
dining room, 1 car ga­
rage, remote. Air con­
dit ioning. Non- smok­
ing. $750/ month plus 
security, (313)822-
8928,(313)407-9211 

1315 Maryland, newly 
built 1988. Extra large, 
2 bedroom. Large 
deck, all appliances, 
dishwasher, off- street 
parking. $750. 
(313)506-2133 

133 Muir Road carriage 
house, $525/ month 
plus 1 1/2 months. No 
pets. (586)596-2084 

1381 Somerset, uppeh . 
no pets, non- smoking. 
3 bedrooms, good con­
dit ion. (313)821-8402 

1458 Beaconsfield- up­
per flat. 3 bedrooms, 
basement $800. Appl i­
ances included. Open 
Sunday 2pm. 313-418-
2593 

1ST month free! 870 
Nott ingham, lower and 
upper, 2 bedrooms, 
hardwood f loors, appli­
ances, $625. (586)212-
0759 

2 bedroom special-
$625 no deposit, no 
credit checks (313)933-
3288 

2 bedroom, Kingsville, 
beauti ful / spacious, 
carpeting, , appliances, 
laundry, no pets. $625. 
(313)881-9313 

3 bedroom upper, ap­
pliances, laundry, pri­
vate porch, storage, 
Grosse Pointe schools 
& parks. Wayburn, 
$750. (248)867-8755 

330 Rivard- 2 bedroom 
upper. Newer ki tchen, 
hardwood floors. No 
pets. $850/ month, 
heat included. 
(586)530-1972 

696 Neff, Grosse 
Pointe corner of Water­
loo. Lower flat, 2 bed­
room, new oak floors, 
water, lawn, snow, full 
appliances, garage, 
$1,100. (313)885-3749 

876 Trombley, 3 bed­
room lower, 2 baths, 
natural f ireplace, newly 
decorated. Garage, 
Separate basement, N O 
pets. $1,200/ month 
plus security deposit. 
(313)882-3965 

879 Beaconsfield, 5 HARPER Woods- 2 
rooms, newly decorat- bedrooms, 1 full bath. 
ed, off street parking. Second floor condo, 
quiet building, no pets, $650/ month. Tappan & 
$650/ month. (313)331- Associates, (313)884-
3559 6200 

887 S t Clair, . 2 bed- LAKEPOINTE, beauti-
room lower, applian- ful, 5 room, 1 bed-
ces, off- street parking, room, appliances, quiet 
$750/ month (313)885- building, no pets. $650. 
0470 (313)882-0340 

912 Neff, 2 bedroom NOTTINGHAM 2 bed-
upper flat, t w o car ga- r 0 0 m apartment, $575/ 
rage, $750/ month. m o n t h , plus utilities. 
(313)886-8694 (586)739-7283 

AVAILABLE August 
1st, exceptional 2,200 
sq. ft. upper flat in the 
Park wi th 2 bedrooms, 
2 baths, large family 
room and more! 
$1,300. Call (313)821-
6361 

BEACONSFIELD, Jef­
ferson. Large 1 bed­
room, french doors, 
balcony, quiet building 
$550. (586)438-9431 

FARMS. Upper 2 bed-
room, all appliances, 
hardwood, fireplace, 
private storage, water, 
garage. $975. (313)640-
1857 

GREAT one bedroom, 
living room, dining 
room, air conditioner,' 
appliances, laundry, 
heat, parking. $600. 
{313)886-8058 

GROSSE Pointe 3 bed-
room, new carpet ga­
rage, no pets, 
security.313-886-9009/ 
313-739-8039 

GROSSE Pointe City, 2 
bedroom lower, l iving/ 
dining rooms, base­
ment, garage. $910 
plus security, includes 
heat/ water. (586)463-
2228 

GROSSE Pointe 
Farms- 3 bedrooms, 2 
full baths. Second 
floor, $1,500/ month. 
15801 windmi l l Pointe 
Drive. Tappan & Asso­
ciates, (313)884-6200 

GROSSE Pointe Park, 
992 Nottingham, 5 
room apartment, newly 
decorated, off- street 
parking, $650/ month 
plus utilities & 1 1/2 
month security depos­
i t (313)571-1866 

GROSSE Pointe Park-
2 bedrooms, 1 1/2 
baths. Second floor, 
$900/ month. Tappan & 
Associates, (313)884-
6200 

GROSSE Pointe Park-
4 bedrooms, 2 1/2 
baths. Second floor, 
$1,200/ month. Tappan 
8t Associates, (313)884-
6200 

GROSSE Pointe 
Woods, 2037 Vernier, 2 
bedroom lower, appli­
ances. Air conditioning. 
Garage. Off- street 
parking. No pets, non­
smoking. $750. 
(313)418-1738 

NOTTINGHAM lower 
3 bedroom, appliances. 
$850/ month. Great 
condition! (586)943-
8870 

PARK- large studio 
basement apartment. 
Laundry, off street 
parking. Must see, 
$500/ month, security. 
586-212-1660 

SOMERSET, 3 bed-
room upper, recently 
painted, appliances, 
separate basement, 
garage. No pets, $775. 
plus security. (313)881-
3039 

SOMERSET- large 3 
bedroom lower. Built-
in bookcases, hard­
wood floors, garage. 
Lots of storage, water 
included. $850 + de­
posit. (301)320-0942 

SPACIOUS 2 bedroom 
townhouse, new car­
pet, paint, private park­
ing. Call Bob, 313-670-
3461. 

T R O M B L E Y - beautiful-
ly decorated spacious, 
10 rooms, fireplace, 
air, finished basement, 
garage. (586)677-0521 

UNIQUE 2 bedroom 
lower near village, 
large rooms, fireplace, 
private porch off dining 
room, new kitchen, 
washer/ dryer, $1,400/ 
month. (313)886-9497 

U P D A T E D 1 bedroom' 
apartment available in 
quiet 4 unit apartment 
building, central air, in­
cludes kitchen with ap­
pliances, study area, 
personal laundry facili­
ties, large storage unit. 
Parking. Water includ­
ed. NO pets, $565/ 
month. (586)949-1281 

WAYBURN upper- 2 
bedroom, 1 bath. Air, 
appliances, basement. 
$675. (313)882-0025 

State and federal housing 
laws prohibit discrimination 
that is based on race, color, 

religion, national origin, 
sex, disability, age 

(Michigan Law), 
marital (Michigan Law) 

or familial status. 

' For further information, 
call the Michigan 

Department of Civil Rights 
at 800-482-3604; the U.S. 

Department of Housing and 
the Urban Development 

800-669-9777 
or your local 

Fair Housing Agency. 

3482 Haverhill off 
Mack, upper, 3 bed­
room, basement. Fire­
place. Water. 2 car ga­
rage. $800, Open Sun­
day 1pm. (313)418-
2593 

BEDFORD, near Mack-
3 bedroom lower, ap­
pliances, 2 car garage, 
freshly painted, re-
sanded floors. $785, 
plus util it ies. (313)885-
4236 

CADIEUX/ Mack, i 
bedroom. Best area, 
laundry, parking, heat/ 
water $495 (313)882-
4132 

C H A T S W O R T H / war-
ren- 2 bedroom upper, 
freshly painted, refin-
ished hardwood f loors, 
refrigerator. $525/ 
month + util it ies. 
(313)886-5702 

DETROIT, off St. Clair-
2 bedroom • upper. 
Hardwood floors, new­
ly painted. 1/2 base­
ment, garage. Call Bob, 
313-670-3461. 

DUPLEX- Ontario/ Ca-
diuex. 2 bedroom,. 
den, basement, yard. 
$675, plus util it ies. 
(313)407-5177 

EASTSIDE near I-94 & 
Moross. Clean 2 bed­
room, wood floors, ga­
rage, air condit ioning, 
appliances included. 
Credit check 8t security 
deposit required. $700/ 
monthly. No pets! 
(313)510-3393 

EVANSTON Upper 2 
bedroom, rent $495, 
security deposit $400. 
(313)475-8853 

M O R A N G / Cadieux, 1 
bedroom, heat, water, 
laundry, parking, $390-
$450.(313)882-4132 

MOROSS near S t John 
Hospital, 2 bedroom, 
basement, central air, 
$675/ month plus se­
curity. Call (313)885-
9195. 

POINTE Manor Apart­
ments. 1060 Alter/ Jef­
ferson. 1 bedroom, 
$460. Studio, $390. All 
utilities included. 
(313)331-6971, 
(586)292-3189. 

702 APTS/FLATS/DUPLEX 
S.C.S/MACOMB COUNTY 

13 / I-94. Beautiful 1. 
bedroom, central air, 
appliances, no pets. 
Starting at $540/ 
month. (810)459-7851 

RIVIERA Terrace (on 
Jefferson between 9 & 
10)- 1 bedroom upper 
floor, water, heat, air 
condit ioning included. 
Grill area & outside 
pool. No pets. Availa­
ble July. (586)445-4713 

ST. Clair Shores, 1 bed­
room upper condo. 
Heat, water included. 
Covered parking. $675/ 
month. Call Alex, 313-
268-2000 

$ 
Ahoy Mate! 

Do you love being near 
the water? If yes, 
we have spacious 
1 and 2 bedroom 

apartments, in the 
Nautical Mile. 

Private basement w i th 
laundry hook ups. Pool! 

One month free ren t 
North shore 
Apartments, 
(586)771-3124 

ROSEVILLE one bed 
room apartment, first 
floor. All appliances. 
NO pets. 248-543-3940 

703 APTS/FLATS/DUPLEX 
WANTED TO RENT 

NON- smoking senior 
seeks, 1 bedroom 
apartment in Pointes, 
no pets. (248)701-8715 

704 HOUSES-RENT 

1341 Somerset- large 
2. 5 bedroom. Hard­
wood floors, fireplace, 
washer/ dryer, dish­
washer. Landlord pays 
water; $750 for one; 
$800, two . (313)884-
2488 

WANTED to lease: 
prefer 3 bedroom 
ranch. Couple, 2 chil­
dren near Grosse 
Pointe High schools. 
586-489-1161, . 313-
886-6269 

70S HOUSES FOR RENT 
POINTES/HARPER WOODS 

1366 Anita- 3 bed­
room, 1 1/2 bath, brick 
bungalow Fully remod­
eled. New carpeting. 
$1,150.(313)610-9977 

1447 Maryland, spa­
cious, 2 bedroom up­
per, freshly painted, 
newly remodeled kitch­
en and bath, new car­
peting throughout, 
shared basement 
$650. Shown by ap­
pointment, Jim Saras 
Agency, 313-927-0418 

1875 Norwood, Grosse 
Pointe Woods. 4 bed­
room colonial, 1 1/2 
bath, air, convenience 
for everything, $1,350/ 
month. (313)884-7127 

1960 Roslyn- House for 
rent. $850.00 per 
month , plus util it ies. 2 
bedrooms, 1 bath. Liv­
ing room, dining room. 
1 car garage. Hard­
wood ' floors through­
out. Call (313)885-
5001, for appo in tment 

20501 Kingsville, beau­
tifully refinished, 1,300 
sq. f t . 3 bedrooms, 1 
bath, natural fireplace, 
hardwood f loors, priva­
cy fence, appliances in­
cluded. $1,000. 
(313)885-2793 

20611 Hol lywood- 3 
bedrooms, 2 baths. 
Grosse Pointe schools. 
2 car garage. $825/ 
month. (248)670-2132 

2147 Hollywood, off 
Mack, 3 bedroom, 3 
bath, finished base­
ment, deck, $1,300. 
(313)617-7954 

220 Ridgemont Road, 
Grosse Pointe Farms. 3 
bedroom ranch on qui­
et street near Farms 
Pier. First block off Ker-
cheval. Mutschler 
kitchen/ family' room, 
With sliding glass/ 
screen doors to. 
Fenced yard. Air, sprin­
kler system. Partial fin­
ished basement. At­
tached garage. Glass/ 
screened porch. 
$1,650 month. Utilities 
not included. Stove/ re­
frigerator/ dishwasher/ 
dryer. Short or long 
term lease. (313)885-
0099 • 

604 Notre Dame, 
quaint 2 bedroom 
ranch, approximately 
700 sq. ft. Great room 
with fireplace, kitchen, 
laundry room, (no 
basement). Appliances 
provided, garage, utilit­
ies not included. No 
pets. Walking distance 
to the Village! $750. 
Shown by appoint­
ment. New Clam in­
vestment, (313)884-
6861 

CHARMING farm 
house in Grosse Pointe 
City. 2 bedrooms, 1 
bath. Available July 7th. 
$950/ month. (313)407-
7112 

FARMS, 120 Muir. 1 
bedroom, air, hard­
wood, appliances. Hos­
pitals, shopping, parks. 
(248)425-4563 

GORGEOUS, secluded 
Farms, 3 bedroom, 2 
bath ranch. $1,675/ 
month. (313)492-8542 

GROSSE Point Woods. 
Cozy 1- 2 bedroom, 
large fenced yard, nat­
ural fireplace, all appli­
ances included, 2138 
Roslyn. $750/ plus se­
curity. (313)205-0155 

HARPER Woods, 2 
bedroom, basement; 
$795. Eastpointe, 3 
bedroom, basement; 
$900. Section 8 ok on 
both! 313-347-1431 

PARK- Maryland. 4 
bedroom. 2 car garage, 
basement. $1,050, plus 
Utilities. (586)739-7283 

SUNNINGDALE in the 
Woods- 3,800 sq. ft. 
English Tudor. Fully fur­
nished. Short or long 
term lease. (313)882-
0154Visitwww.677' 
sunningdaie.com 

>v 
Residential Leases 

in the Grosse Pointes 
From $1400 - $1,650 

(313)884-7000 

706 HOUSES FOR RENT 
DETROIT/WAYNE COUNTY 

MOROSS, Landsdown. 
2 or 3 bedrooms, 1 1/2 
baths, fenced, $640-
$690.(313)882-4132 

RADNOR {Detroit), sin­
gle family house w i t h 
loft style bedroom, liv­
ing room, kitchen and 
den. $400/ month. 
(586)484-8114 

707 HOUSES FOR RENT/ 
S.C.S/MACOMB COUNTY 

26060 Lehner- Rose­
ville, off Frazho by Gra­
tiot. 3 bedroom home. 
Section 8 ok. $870/ 
month. Call Mary 
(586)612-8145 

3 bedroom ranch, new 
windows, roof, kitchen, 
floors. Lawn service. 
Clean. Fenced yard. 
$850/ month. (586)552-
1952, (248)495-6369 

EASTPOINTE, 3 bed-
rooms, 2 baths, air, 
$1,000/ month. 
(313)461-5706 

WARREN- 21576 Sun-
set. North off 8 Mile, 
East of Ryan. Newly re­
modeled, 2 bedroom. 
1/2 acre land. Section 
8 ready. $750/ month. 
586-612-8145 

708 APT-FLAT-DUPLEX 

CARRIAGE/ guest 
house rental sought by 
teacher. New to area. 
Quiet, professional. 
(248)303-0073 

LOOK 
Classified Advertising 

313-882-6900 ext 3 
Fax 313-343-5569 

Qrosse Fsinte News 

DOUB 
2007 

RULES: Reshuffle six letters to form a new word If a word is given, 
find an anagram of that word. Place letters in boxes next to shuffled 
letters. After all six words are solved, find new 6-letter words shuffled in 
the six columns or two diagonals. ' 
HINT: There might be more than one answer hidden in the six columns 
or two diagonals. Can you find FIVE words? Happy Hunting! 
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Last Weeks 
Puzzle Solved 
C o l . 2 : C A M E R A 

Col. 5: DEPOTS/DESPOT/POSTED 

Top Left Diag: SPRUCE 

Top Right Diag: PALLET 
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http://www.magnum
http://kennel.com
mailto:1@charter.net
http://www.wideopen
http://west.com/~adub/
http://www.677'
http://sunningdaie.com
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709TOWNHOUSES/ 
C0ND0S FOR RENT 

GATED high rise studio 
on Detroit River. Spec­
tacular v iew, 500 sq. 
ft. , all appliances, air 
condit ioning, $650/ 
month includes heat, 
water, 24 hour valet 
parking. (313)823-8356 

GROSSE Pointe, nice 1 
bedroom, second floor 
condo. $770 per month 
plus security deposit, 
includes heat, air, w a ­
ter. Updates- k i tchen, 
bath, hardwood f loors. 
1 year lease. By ap­
pointment only. 
(586)296-8048 

KINGSVILLE: 2 bed­
room, first f loor, end 
uni t condo, near St. 
Johns. $600/ month in­
cludes water, appli­
ance, carport. No pets. 
(586)484-8114 
HUGE 3 bedroom,. 2 
bath condo. Large eat-
in kitchen. Fireplace, 
garage, huge basement 
for storage. $1,450/ 
month . 313-410-7706 

709 TOWNHOUSES/ 1 7 1 6 0FFICE/C0MMERC!AL|716 OFFICE/COMWIERCIAL1716 OFFICE/COMMERCIAL! 723 VACATION RENTALS I 723 VACATION RENTALS I 723 VACATION RENTALS 
C0ND0S FOR RENT I FOR RENT I FOR RENT I FOR RENT I MICHIGAN I MICHIGAN I MICHIGAN 

LAKEFRONT condo 
(near 14 Mile) w i th 45 
foot boat slip available 
for lease. Stunning! 
Great v iews! Water/ 
electric at dock. Great 
room, new kitchen, 
balcony, media room, 2 
car garage, 2 bed­
rooms. 2 1/2 baths. 
$2,850/ month , plus 
util it ies. Cathy Cham­
pion, Bolton- Johnston. 
313-884-6400 

711 GARAGES/MINI 
STORAGE FOR RENT 

1,000- 2,700 sq. ft. St. 
Clair Shores, East-
pointe,. Roseville. John, 
586-612-1181 

2 room office suite. 
540 sq. ft. 93 Kerchev-
al, "Hi l l " . 2nd floor. 
Easy parking, includes 
heat / air. (313)881-
6400 

2,200 sq, ft. service 
shop, large fenced 

1 car garage, secured yard, 2nd floor apart-
storage, $80 / month, ment , a larm, Detroi t 's 
Grosse Pointe Park, eastside, $800/ mon th . 
(586)212-1660 . 313-319-8700 

712 GARAGES/MINI 
STORAGE WANTED 

W A N T E D in Grosse 
Pointe Woods or 
Farms, a garage for 
storage of a van. 
(313)882-0876, 
(313)506-1374 

Reduced 30% 
Harper at Vernier 
Near I-94. 2 Deluxe 

suites of offices-
each 1,600 sq.ft. 

(1 fully furnished) 
Mr. Stevens 

(313)886-1763 

377 Fisher Road, 
Grosse Pointe. 180 sq. 
ft. Executive office and 

• 335 sq. ft. executive 
suite. 5 day cleaning, 
private entrance and 

parking. 
Many amenit ies. 
19959 Vernier, 
Harper Woods. 
Between I94 8i 

Beaconsfield. 3,450 sq. 
ft. can be divided. 
Lots of w indows, 
jani tor service, 
private parking. 
Please contact 

Donna at 
313)882-0899 

BUILDING for lease 
Kercheval on The Hill. 
Suitable for retail or 
professional services. 
(313)343-5588 

SMALL executive off i­
ces in Harper Woods 
available for immediate 
occupancy. (313)371-
6600 

Grosse Pointe 
woods 

Office space for lease 
individual offices. 

Start ing at $400 /mo . , 
includes all uti l i t ies 

313-268-2000 
G R O S S E Pointe 
Woods; 2 large- beauti­
fully furnished, profes­
sional offices. Pointe 
Plaza. Ail utilities, 24 
hour security. $450. 
Donna, 313-882-9400 

ST. Clair Shores: Ideal 
for sales rep., thera­
pist, or masseuse. All 
utilities included. 
(586)445-2622 

719 RENT WITH OPTION 
TO BUY 

CLINTON Township. 
19/ Garfield. 2 bed­
room, 2 1/2 bath. Base­
ment , at tached garage. 
No pets. Free month ! 
(586)854-3339 EHO 

CASEVILLE on Sagi­
naw Bay- lakefront 
homes. Discounted 
weekly summer rates! 
989-874^5181, 989-
550-0911 

CASEVILLE- 3 ' bed-
rooms. Beach access. 
All necessities 
(313)418-3915 

HARBOR Springs cozy 
golf condo, near beach.. 
Sleeps 8. Many extras. 
(313)823-1251 

HOMESTEAD Rjdge-
top condominium, 2 
bedroom, 2 bath, lake-
view, accomadates 6, 
$1,100/ week. 
(248)879-2092. 

LAKE Huron water­
front. Beautiful private 
cottage on estate prop­
erty, sleeps 4, $500/ 
week. (810)622-0755 

LEXINGTON area, 
near beach, new 3 
bedroom, central air, 
$500/ week. No smok­
ing/ pets. (313)882-
4942 

L E X I N G T O N area, 
cottage. Private beach, 
fenced yard, k ids/ pets 
ok, $500/ week. 
(810)359-7917 

PORT Austin, 
Downtown, full 
new ; 
Air, 
great 
rade. 
ping. 
ming. 
tor 

Ml, 
size 

l bedroom condo. 
cable, • balcony, 
for the 4thl Pa-
fireworks, 
golfing, 

Sleeps 8 
dates, 

(586)215-1453 

shop-
swim-
f. call 
rates. 

T h — ' ^ V 

C I . A S S I F I F O S 

PUCE YOUR AD TODAY! 
CALL (313)882-6900 X 3 
Grosji foktte NEWS BbtaiQ^^maum 

716 0FFICE/C0MMERC1AL1716 OFFICE/COMMERCIAL 
FOR RENT I FOR RENT 

(313)884-7000 
COMMERCIAL BUILDINGS FOR LEASE 

G. P. Farms 1,410 sq. ft. G. P. Woods 3,100 sq. ft. 
G. P. Farms 1,250 sq.ft. 
G.P.Park 499 sq.ft. 
G.P.Park 2,100 sq.ft. 
G.P.Woods 1,200 sq.ft. 

XZ.P. Woods 1,100 sq.ft. 

Eastpointe 1,265 sq. ft. 
Eastpointe 1,750 sq. ft. 
St. Clair Shores 800 sq. ft. 
St. Clair Shores 1,001 sq. ft. 
St. Clair Shores 1,500 sq.ft. 

IREGTORY OF SERVICES 
Some classifications are not required by 
law to be licensed. Please check with 
the proper state agency to verify license. 

907 BASEMENT 
WATERPROOFING 

Don't Know who 
To Call?... 

Don't Be Intimidated 
By High Pressure 

Salesman - For an 
Honest Answer Call 
JAMES KLEINER 

Basement 
waterproof ing 

inside or Outside 
Method 

Wails Straightened 
& Braced 

Footings underpinned 
Drainage Systems 

All Concrete - Masonry 
Licensed 8i insured 

10 Year 
Transferable Guarantee 

Owner ~ Operated 

(313)885-2097 
(586)466-1000 

Providing Dry 
Basements since 1976 

RX. ~ 
STREMERSCH 

BASEMENT 
WATERPROOFING 

WALLS REPAIRED 
STRAIGHTENED 

REPLACED 
ALL WORK 

GUARANTEED 
LICENSED 

313-884-7139 
SERVING COMMUNITY 

38 YEARS 

THOMAS 
KLEINER 

construction Co. 
BASEMENT 

WATERPROOFING 
•Digging Method 

•Light Weight 10Aslag 
stone backfill 

• Spotless Cleanup 
•Walls straightened & 
Braced or Replaced 

•Steef T beams 
installed 

•Foundations 
Underpinned 

•All Concrete & 
Masonry 

•25 Years Experience 
•10 Year Transferable 

Guarantee 
•Drainage Systems 

installed 
Licensed & insured 

A-1 Quality 
workmanship 

Every Job we Do! 
"Most trusted & 
referred in the 

Pointes" 
(586)296-3882 
(313)886-3150 
Grosse Pointe 
Fax 313-886-3151 

Member BBB 

907 BASEMENT 
WATERPROOFING 

I.UIILM.M/IJJMJ _ ..., _ 943 LANDSCAPERS/ 
TREE SERVICE/GARDENER • TREE SERVICE/GARDENER 

CflPIZZO 
CONSTRUCTION 

•BASEMENT 
WATERPROOFING 

•WALLS STRAIGHTENED 
. AND REPLACED 
•10 YEAR GUARANTEE 

Family Business 
LICENSED: 
INSURED 

TONY & TODI 
885-0612 

FOUNDATION 
PROBLEMS? 

We Stop Sinking, Buckled, 
Cracked, Leaking 

,. * Basement Walls 

-fowls 
C y BASEMENT 

SINCE 1975 
• BUCKLED 
• SAGGING 
• CRACKED 
• LEAKING 
• BASEMENT 

WALLS 
•EGRESS' 

WINDOWS 
CRACK INJECTIONS 

586-776-7270 
Fuliy Licensed & Insured 

WALLS moving? We 
install S Beams, to pre­
vent wal l movement . 
James Kleiner Water­
proofing, (313)885-
2097 

Mike Geiser 

Construction 
Basement 

Waterproof ing 

10 yr. Guarantee 
Dig Down Method 
Wall Straighten/ 

Bracing 
Wall Replacement 

No Damage To 
Lawn or Shrubbery 
Spotless Clean-tip 

Licensed -2342334 
Insured" 

Free Estimates 

(313)881-6000 

SAVE on affordable 
light- masonry, tuck-
point ing, brick replace­
ments , mortar color 
match ing. Estimates. 
Current references. 
(313)884-0985. 

SEMI - ret ired mason. 
50 + years experience. 
Licensed/ insured. Rea­
sonable. New York 
f lagstone/ l imestone 
restorat ion. (586)772-
3223 

912 BUILDING/REMODELING 

D A V I D Carlin Remod­
eling. 35 years exper i ­
ence. 'Remodeling and 
design, all phases. Li­
censed. 313-938-4949 

GATESDECK.COM. 
Cedar, t reated, mainte­
nance free, bu i l d -new/ 
restore o ld. Licensed/ 
insured. BBB, free est i­
mates. (586)774-3797 

YORKSHIRE Building 
& Renovation. Addi­
t ions, ki tchens, baths, 
complete renovations. 
Licensed, insured. 
(313)881-3386 

916 CARPET INSTALLATION 

GARY'S Carpet Serv­
ice, installation, re-
stretching. Repairs. 
Carpet & pad available. 
586-228-8934 

918 CEMENT WORK 

911 BRICK/BLOCK WORK 

A - 1 Brick wo rk , Tuck-
point ing. Chimneys, 
porches repaired. Bro­
ken steps, 40 years ex­
perience, Licensed. 
(586)294-4216 

BRICK & concrete. Re­
pair/ replacement. Ail 
types. CJS Co. Free es­
t imates. (313)806-7299 

EXCELLENT tUCkpoint-
ing & brick work . Joe 
Bokano (586)773-6548 

GREAT Lakes Chimney 
Safety, LLC. Tuckpoint-
ing, brick work . Mason­
ry repairs. 20 years ex­
perience. Insured. 
(313)885-8538 

JAMES Kleiner Mason­
ry, Basement water­
proofing, concrete. 
Brick, block, f lagstone, 
porches, chimneys, 
walls, patios, walks, 
borders, expert tuck 
pointing. Limestone re­
storat ion. Serving the 
Pointes since 1976. Li­
censed, insured. 
(313)885-2097, 
(586)466-1000 

SMALL jobs reasona­
ble! R.R. Coddens Con­
struct ion. Tuckpoint ing. 
(313)886-5565 

BEST there is, profes­
sional masonry, brick 
tuck point ing, all ch im­
ney repairs, side waik 
builder, all roof ing re­
pairs, garage straight­
ening, steps replaced. 
(586)779-7619, 
(586)876-8190 

JAMES Kleiner- A l l 
concrete, masonry, 
basement waterproof­
ing, serv ing the Pointes 
since 1976. 313-885-
2097,586-446-1000 

VITO'S Cement. Drive­
ways, porches, patios, 
tuckpoint ing. Licensed/ 
insured. (313)527-8935 

920 CHIMNEY REPAIR 

J&JCHIMNEY 
SYSTEMS, INC. 
Ml LIC 2101086325 

Rebuilt, Repaired, 
Relined, Gas Oners, 

Glass Block Installed 
insured 

(586)795-1711 

J A M E S Kleiner. Chim-
neys repaired, rebuilt . 
(313)885-2097, 
(586)466-1000 

929 DRYWALL/PLASTERING 

EXCELLENT plaster & 
drywal l repair. Joe Bo­
kano (586)773-6548 

918 CEMENT WORK 

(313)999-1003 
LAKESHORE 

PLASTER, INC. 
Plaster Repairs, 

Drywall, 
Int. / Ext. Painting, 

Stucco, PowerWashing, 
Licensed / insured 

A A A plaster/ dry wal l . 
Water damage. 25 
years experience. Li­
censed, insured. Joe* of 
Hallmark Remodeling. 
(313)510-0950 

A N D Y Squires. Plaster­
ing & drywal l . Stucco 
repair. Spray textured 
ceilings. (586)755-2054 

A V E N E W Painting & 
Drywall. Residential & 
commerc ia l . Referen­
ces. Nice work , nice 
prices. (586)524-5507 

LOU Blackwell. Plaster­
ing, water damage. Li­
censed/ insured. Refer­
ences. Guaranteed, 
(586)776-8687. Cell: 
(313)658-8687. 

930 ELECTRICAL SERVICES 

(586)415-0153. Uni­
versal Electric. Older 
home specialists. Cir­
cui t breaker boxes, 
outdoor plugs, re­
cessed lights, addi­
t ions, all types of elec­
tr ical work. Licensed, 
insured, www.nomore 
fuses.com 

FIRST 
ELECTRICAL CO. 

Licensed Master 
ElectricalCon tractor 
(586)776-1007 

Free Estimates 
Commerc ia l / 

Residential 
Code Violations 
Service upgrade 

Renovations 
Reasonable Rates 

S & J ELECTRIC 
Residential 
Specialist 

No Job Too Small 
313-885-2930 

934 FENCES 

ALL fence and gate re­
pair. New. installt ions, 
too. Dr. Fence, PHD. 
(313)882-4406 

FENCE- building and 
repair. All styles, over 
40 years experience. 
Free est imates. Call 
George, (313)886-5899 

936 FLOOR SANDING/ 
REFINISHING 

FLOOR sanding and 
finishing. Free est i­
mates. Terry Yerke, 
586-823-7753 

NATURAL Hardwood 
Floors- complete floor­
ing service. Dust free! 
15 years. ' Tony, 
(313)330-5907 

918 CEMENT WORK 

912 BUILDIMG/REMODELING1912 BUILDING/REMODELING ft: 

& : !—i 
HAWS O. STUHLDREER BUILDING, IRC. 

Remodeling • Carpentry 
(313)882-5958 • Fax (313)882-6165 

Licensed & Insured 
fc, Consultant: HansSr. (313)881-1554 „ 
r - * 

MATTHEW WINTER 
CONSTRUCTION, INC. 
Sfteetetdftoty tot ISeMdeMUol 

@OK&tete emd 'Ptwent. 
•Dr iveways »Pat ios • W a l k s 

• G a r a g e Floors • F o o t i n g s 
vj "Licensed/Insured" s w 
w 586-495-9999 m? 

G & G FLOOR CO. 

Wood floors only • 
313-885-0257 

Floors of distinction 
since 1964. 

Bob Grabowski 
Founder / President 
Licensed, Insured 
Free Estimates 
We supply, install, 

sand, stain and finish 
wood 

floors, new & old. 
Specializing in 
Giitsa finish. 

(586)778-2050 

visa, Discover & 
Master Card accepted 

P R I M A Floors,. LLCT 
Hardwood specialists. 
New installation. Refin-
ishing. Guaranteed! 
Ray Parrinello 
(586)344-7272 WWW. 
pr imahardwoodf loors 
.com 

943 LANDSCAPERS/ 
TREE SERVICE/GARDENER 

A - 1 Ron's Tree Service. 
Tree Tr imming, 
shrubs. Immediate 
Service, (248)990-8064 

A A A Lawn Care- 10% 
discount/ seniors, 
Weekly lawn mainte­
nance. Fertilizer pro­
gram, shrub pruning, 
mulch, spr ing/ fall 
clean up. Licensed, in­
sured. Commercia l / in­
sured. (586)453-1362 

BERG Bros. Tree Serv­
ice. Senior discounts. 
Tree t r imming, s tump 
grinding, tree removal. 
Ash specials! "Fully in­
sured, highly referred" 
Visa/ MC. (586)262-
3060 

BLOOMlN ' Easy Gar-
dens. Garden design, 
install plants, renova­
tions & weed ing. . Mary 
Birnbryer. Advanced 
Master Gardener. 
(313)516-3568 

BROTHER'S Tree & 
Shrub Tr imming. Sod, 
seeding, top soil, 
mulch. Delivered & In­
stal led. Hard work ing, 
Grosse Pointe resi­
dents. Jonathan, 
(313)680-0455 

D A N Mllleville Tree 
Service. Tree t r im-
mimg,. tree & s tump 
removal . Ash Tree spe­
cialists. Licensed, in­
sured. Serving the 
Grosse Pointes for over 
40 years. (586)776-
1104 

DAVE'S Tree & Shrub. 
Tree removal / t r im­
ming. 15 years experi­
ence. Toping, pruning 
(586)216-0904 

918 CEMENT WORK 

DERK Brown Lawn 
Sprinklers. Service and 
installation. (586)774-
1 7 7 7 

D O M I N I C ' S Stump Re-
moval, since 1972. 
Stumps only, no trees. 
Fuliy insured. (586)445-
0225 

GARDENER serving 
the finest Grosse 
Pointe homes, since 
1979. Weeding, edging, 
cultivating, planting, 
pruning, trimming, win­
dows, eves & more. 
(313)377-1467 

K&K LAWN & SHRUB 
SERVICES INC. 

Complete Landscaping 
Lawn Cutting 

Clean-ups 
Sod, Seeding 
Shrub & Tree 

Trimming /Removals 
Aeration 

Fertilization 
Gutter cleaning 

Pavers, walls 
Topsoil, Mulch, Stones 
installed 8. Delivered 

V1SA/MC/DISCOVER 
FREE ESTIMATES 

Licensed & Insured 
(313)417-0797 

LANEY'S Landscape-
Specializing in lawn 
maintenance, land­
scape design, sodding, 
brick pavers. (313)885-
9328 

MAC'S TREE AND 
SHRUB TRIMMING 
COMPLETE WORK 
Serving The Pointes 

For 30 Years 
Reasonable Rates 

Quality Service 
call Tom 

(586)776-4429 

Q U I C K cuts Lawn & 
Snow Service. Reason­
able rates. Call 
(313)530-6806. 

SHRUB trimming. 
Grosse Pointe based 
for 18 years. Prompt 
service, reasonable 
rates. (313)610-4084 

SHRUBS trimmed 
beautifully, 25 years 
experience/ Grosse 
Pointe references. Free 
weed, n feed with each 
shrub job. Call Sal, 586-
909-9064. 

TEE'S Lawn Sprinklers-
work done by owner. 
Repairs, service. 
Prompt, efficient serv­
ice, since 1988^ 
(586)783-5861 

THE Tree Surgeon. 
Tree trimming, stump/ 
tree removal. Specializ­
ing: Ash Borer. 
(586)263-7818 

TIRED of companies? 
Affordable. Reliable. 
Next day service! Trim­
ming, planting, com­
plete bed work, more. 
(313)377-1467 

TLC to your garden 
beds. Weeding, clean­
ing, cultivating, plant­
ing, and more. 
(313)881-3934 

944 GUTTERS 

CALL Mr. Squeegee to­
day! Get clean w in ­
dows w i t hou t breaking 
the bank or your back. 
I wi l l do your w indows, 
gut ters and power 
washing. Fully insured. 
References available. 
{313)995-0339 

FAMOUS Mainte-
nancei Window 8t gut­
ter cleaning. Licensed, 
insured. Since 1943. 
313-884-4300 

GENTILE roof ing and 
siding. Custom seam­
less gut ters. Licensed, 
insured. (313)884-1602 

SEASONAL gutters & 
w i n d o w maintenance. 
Reasonable rates. Call 
(248)730-2086 

945 HANDYMAN 

>". *N 

918 CEMENT WORK 

DECORATIVE STAMPED CONCRETE 

RESIDENTIAL CONCRETE 

Driveways • Patios 
Footings, Garage Raising, porches 

Basement Waterproofing 
Licensed & Insured 

GARY DIPAOLA MARTIN REIF 
566-220-2212 566-775-4266 

945 HANDYMAN 

FRANK'S Handyman 
Service. Painting, elec­
trical, . carpentry, 
plumbing 8t misc. re-
pairs. (586)791.-6684 

P R O M P T service, rea­
sonable prices. All 
home repairs. Painting, 
carpentry, plumbing, 
etc. Servicing tire 
Grosse Pointes, 17 
years. Bud, (313)268-
8698 

946 HAULING & MOVING 

AAA Hauling. Rubbish 
removal, appliances, 
backyards, garages, 
houses, etc. Dump-
sters available. 
(586)778-4417 

APPLIANCE 
REMOVAL 

Garage, yard, 
basement, clean Quts^ 
* Construction debris. 

Tree/shrub removal 
Free estimates. 

MR.B'S 586-759-0457 
VISA/MC 

t^S) 
A low price- Mike han­
dyman, electrical, 
plumbing, carpentry, 
flooring, painting. Ce­
ramic tile. Anything big 
or small. Also, remod­
eling. (313)438-3197, 
native Grosse Pointer, 
586-773-1734, 810-
908-4888 cell. 

ABLE, dependable, 
honest. Carpentry, 
painting, plumbing, 
electrical. If you have a 
problem, need repairs, 
any installing, cali Ron, 
(586)573-6204 

ALL repairs & installa­
tions. Electrical, paint­
ing, drywall, carpentry. 
Tile. Kitchens, baths, 
basements. Professio­
nal, affordable. Li­
censed & insured. Call 

Kris (586)925-1949 

FATHER & Son. HOn-
est/ dependable. 20 
years experience. Car­
pentry, painting, elec­
trical, plumbing, base­
ment finishing, tree/ 
shrub trimming. Haul­
ing, power washing. 
Grosse Pointe Woods 
resident. Chris, 313-
408-1166 

918 CEMENT WORK 

»* wo&n'! ;msm ausc MMWWI. Sf aw; 

Wa So Ail The Loading & Cleanup 

• Olii furniture and appliances 

•Office and horns eiear.ups 

• Verd waste and construction da&ris 

Book onl ine at 18flDgo!jiHik.com 

j»r cat i 1-SflO-U68-gS65-

GROSSE 
P O I N T E 

M O V I N G & 
S T O R A G E 

Local & 
Long Distance 

Agent for 
Global Van Lines 

822-4400 
• Large and Small Jobs 
• Pianos (our specially) 
• Appliances 
• Saturday, Sunday 

Service 
• Senior Discounts 

Owned & Operated 

By John Steininger 
11850 E. Jefferson 

MPSC-L19675 ,., 
Licensed - Insured 

FREE ESTIMATES 

918 CEMENT WORK 

Grazio H 
Construction, Inc. 

Since 1963 
R e s i d e n t i a l 

DRIVEWAYS -FLOORS -PORCHl S 
OAKAftF^ RAISFO «f RFNFWI I ) 

I \ p i i s f d \<|(| ir<| (Hr •Ifi ich I ' . iw is 
I ic iris* d Cil \ S S I I I 0< l\S I I IS I I I i <l 

(586)774-3020 

http://GATESDECK.COM
http://www.nomore
http://fuses.com
file:///piisfd
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AVENEW Painting & 
Drywall. Residential & 
commercial. Referen­
ces. Nice work, nice 
prices. (586)524-5507 

BRIAN'S PAINTING 
Professional painting, 

interior/ exterior. 
' specializing all types 

painting, caulking, 
w indow glazing, 

plaster repair. 
Expert gold/ 
sliver leaf. 

All work guaranteed. 
Fully Insured! 

Free Estimates and 
Reasonable Rates, calB 

586-778-2749 
or 586-822-2078 

DINO'S Painting- com­
plete painting. Exterior/ 
interior. Owner operat­
ed 23 years. Always 
good, thorough prep 
work. Neat. Grosse 
Pointe references. Li­
censed. Ail work guar­
anteed. (248)761-7562 

FIREFIGHTERS/ paint-
ers. interior/ exterior. 
Residential. Power 
washing, wall washing, 
wallpaper removal. 
Free estimates. 
(586)381-3105 

G.H.I. Painting, interi­
or/ exterior. Plaster re­
pair. Wood replace­
ment. Free estimates. 
insured. Call Greg, 
(586)777-2177 

H.A. Painting- Interior/ 
exterior. Repair plas­
ter/ drywall. Window 
glazing. Power wash­
ing. Chimney repairs. 
Brick replacement. An­
dy, (313)443-5422 

J IMMY the Painter, in­
terior/ exterior. Drywall 
repair,, wall paper re­
moval. Certified/ insur­
ed. Free estimates. 
(313)617-8502 

JOHN'S 
PAINTING 

Interior- Exterior 
faux finishes. 

Specializing in repairing 
damaged plaster, 
drywall & cracks, 

peeling paint, window 
puttying, caulking, 

paint aluminum siding. 
All work guaranteed 

Reasonable Rates 
G. P. Reference 

Licensed/Insured 
Free estimates 

Senior Discount 
313-882-5038 

N&J Professional 
Painting. Interior, exte­
rior, faux finishes, plas­
ter repair, wallpaper 
removal, staining, 
caulking, power wash­
ing. Very clean!. Free 
estimates. (586)489-
7919 

PAIGE P A I N T I N G 
LLC 

Interior/ Exterior 
Wallpapering and 
removal, insured. 

No Job Too Small 
586-350-5236 

PAINTING by Jimmy, 
interior/ exterior. Plas­
ter & drywall repair. 
"Real World Prices". 
(313)282-4976 

Don't Forget-
Call your ads in Early! 

Classif ied Advert ising 

313-882-6900x3 
Grosse Tbinte News 

PREMIER Painting. In­
terior/ exterior. Plaster 
& drywall repair, w in ­
dow caulking & glazing. 
Power washing, re­
painting aiuminum & 
wood siding. Licensed 
& insured. {313)884-
3588 

STEVE'S Professional 
Painting. Specializing in 
exteriors. Serving 
Grosse Pointe since 
1980. References avail­
able. Finest materials & 
quality workmanship. 
All work guaranteed. 
(586)996-2924 

957 PLUMBING & 
INSTALLATION 

COMPLETE 
PLUMBING 
SERVICE 

MARTIN VERTREGT 
Lie. Master Plumber 

(313)886-2521 
(313)610-3949 

Serving the Pointes 
Since 1980 

D | R E C T 

PLUMBING 
& 

DRAIN 

886-8557 
*Free Estimates 

*Full Product Warranty 
*Senior Discount 

*References 
*AII Work Guaranteed 

MICHAEL HAGGERTY 
Lie. Master Plumber 

DOBSON Plumbing & 
Repairs. 45 years expe­
rience. Complete 
plumbing. 313-443-
1619,313-368-6954 

L.S. Walker Company. 
Plumbing, repairs, 
drains, sewer cleaning. 
Reasonable! (586)784-
7100, (586)713-5316/ 
cell. 

CAPITAL 
PLUMBING, LLC 

• Drain Cleaning 
$125 Includes Free 
Camera Inspection 

• Basement 
Waterproofing 

•Re- pipes 
• Sump Pump 
Specials $325 

No Service Charge 
Licensed & Insured 

1-800441-0525 

m 

RR CODDENS 
Family since 1924 

Re-Roofs-Tear Offs 
Hand Nailed Only 

Tgp.t" Offs 

Chimnev Repair 

L.icensed^Bui'der'insui'ec 

959 POWER WASHING 

AQUA Power Washing 
"You name it, we'll 
power wash it!" 
(313)632-9090 

POWERWASHING-
decks, porches, & pa­
tios. Repairs, staining, 
& sealing. Over 35 
years experience. Free 
estimates. (313)885-
4609 

960 ROOFING SERVICE 

r MM. ^ • _ a « A i 

GENTILE 
R0BFIN6 INC 

Since 1940 
•Tear-ofFs 
•Expert Repairs 
•Gutters 

Licensed • Insured 
313-884-1602 
\£ree Estimates/ 

7J&J7 
ROOFING 
SIDING. GUTTEHS 29522 LITTLE MACK, 

ROSEVILLE 

CERTIFIED 
PROFESSIONAL 

ROOFERS 
1-800-459-6455 

www.JJROOFING.COM 

Licensed & Insured 
FREE 

ESTIMATES 

DAVID EDWARD 
ROOFING 

Residential Specialist 
RE-ROOFS • TEAR OFFS 

licensed & Insured 
FREE ESTIMATES 
(|3<55*j* / 1 St^^tmS^K 

ROOFING 

¥or%sfiire 
ft^t^pu^k 

•TEAROFFS 
•RESHIINGLE 
•FLAT ROOFING 
•GUTTERS 
•DOWNSPOUTS 
•STORM WINDOWS 
•STORM DOORS 

Fully Insured 'Licensed 

313«881*3386 

973 TILE WORK 

CEREMIC tile installa­
tion and repair. Free 
estimates. Carlos, 
(313)530-1295 Grosse 
Pointe resident. 

GROUT Girl. Affordable 
grout restoration, 
staining, caulking, tile 
installation and repair. 
www.grout-gir l .com 
Suzanne, 313-378-
0843, insured. 

977 WALL WASHING 

MADAR Maintenance. 
Hand wash windows 
and walls. Free esti­
mates 81 references. 
313-821-2984. 

980 WINDOWS 

981 WINDOW WASHING 

CALL Mr. Squeegee to­
day! Get clean win­
dows wi thout breaking 
the bank or your back, 
1 wil l do your windows, 
gutters and power 
washing. Fully insured. 
References available. 
(313)995-0339 

FAMOUS Mainte­
nance. Licensed & in­
sured since 1943. Gut­
ter cleaning/ power 
washing. 313-884-
4300. 

M A D A R Maintenance. 

Hand wash windows 
and walls. Free esti­
mates & references. 
313-821-2984. 

973 TILE WORK 

AAA complete baths, 
kitchens, tile design. 25 
years experience. Li­
censed, insured, Joe of 
Hallmark Remodeling. 
(313)510-0950 

Andersea TVT 
'i\ tit Jk -LAL/ 

GLASS 
CO. 

WINDOWS-DO OH 8 

is an authorized 
dealer and service 

center for 
A n d e r s e n 

(313)884-0484 

Classifieds 
Work For You 

To place an ad call: 
(313)882-6900x3 

Grosse feinte News 

PROFESSIONAL win­
dow & powerwashing. 
Free estimates. Low 
rates. Senior discount. 
Shane, (586)770-7328. 

UNIVERSAL Mainte­
nance- w indow clean­
ing, gutter cleaning, 
power washing. Fully 
insured. Free esti­
mates. (313)839-3500 

954 PAINTING/DECORATING 1954 PAINTING/DECORATING! 954 PAINTING/DECORATING! 954 PAINTING/DECORATING 
BEST roofing 81 roofing 
repair, joe Bokano 
(586)773-6548 

Flat Roof 
specialist 

Over 30 Years Exp. 
Free Estimates 

Licensed - Guarantees 
(313)372-7784 

I). HKIIVIN 
HHMI 'TMI 'KUM MI M -

PAINTING .- • A - 1 • 1 •• 
I ' • " 1 • r 

PLASTER REPAIRS: wans, ceiling, cornea 
Moldings, Repaired or Reproduced 

CARPENTRY: Rough & Finished, Architectural Molding^ 
Custom Mlllwork. Reproductions 

REFERENCES CALL 586-746-1101 INSURED 

FOR FREE ESTIMATE & DESIGN 
AWARD WINNING QUALITY WORK 

41 YEARS EXPERIENCE • ESTABLISHED 1966 

Dick Haroutsos t jy -&fa^»?: . ' i rc^ 

C O M P A N Y 

'Interior & Exterior 
^Restoration, Custom Painting & Faux Finishes j 
^Window Glazing & Caulking 
'Plaster & Drywall Repair 
•Power Washing: Siding, Brick & Patio 

SUPERIOR PREPARATION 
AND CRAFTSMANSHIP 

FREE ESTIMATES 
LICENSED & INSURED 

^^miM&dxM&Xe&'&mstsaiim^ 

f. * 

f~-*-<" l^^^^J^^L^pt
J 

\ -5 

- y 

i . , 

s'r _-*{&• 

'1 

< j ; y 

s a 

"BJ^V 

•> i. i t * ' 

\ & 

L_i J 

J'-*-, ,>.''';-'.i-rL 

Grosse Pointe News 
# 

#«_ 

/ 

F I 

fc 
.* v. ' 

.( '.^•wif^t*? •>>_ "-•'4V--V- '"* "•v -•' i ' , ^ r t r t »Cr f 
" k * jHrUftirtWr 

- a* . J | f i ^ r « r fri^'^T^, 

•Jlt&VJ&us; 
- j * " • / } , » < ; > • . ' 

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 

I I 

i 
I 
I 
! 
I 

I 

i Name 

Address 

City/Zip_ 

Phone number 
Mail to: 

Grosse Pointe News Subscriptions 

96 Kercheval • Grosse Pointe Farms, Ml 48236 

313-343-5577 

My payment is included: 

• Check 

• Money order 

• Visa 
• MasterCard 

exp /. 

$37.50 for 52 issues 
i — 

www.grossepointenews.com Local addresses only 
• '"• '• '•f" •""• 'W.j l : ' 

http://GR0SSEP0INTENEWS.COM
http://www.JJROOFING.COM
http://www.grout-girl.com
http://www.grossepointenews.com

