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• Grosse Pointe Woods
Winterfest is from noon to 2
p.m. in Lake Front Park. For
more information, call (313)
343-2470.
• St. Paul's Lutheran Church,
22915 Greater Mack, St. Clair
Shores, hosts a family oriented
puppet show at 10 a.m. It will
be performed again at 9:30
a.m. on Sunday, Feb. 3. For
more information, call (313)
884-5554.

MONDAY, FEB. 4

• Grosse Pointe Woods City
Council meets at 7:30 p.m. in
council chambers, 20025
Mack.

tUiSOAY, FIB. S
•Your Child and Technology:
What Every Parent Needs to
Know will be presented from 7
to 9 p.m. in Room B312 at
Grosse Pointe North High
School. Sponsored by The
Family Center and Grosse
Pointe middle and high school
parent organizations, the free
event is designed to assist par-
ents in understanding how
technology shapes children,
how schools use it to enhance
learning, its social uses and
how to keep children safe.
Presenters are school psychol-
ogist Scott Bruns, Technology
Curriculum Coordinator Grace
Smith and Grosse Pointe Geek
founder Joe Bracken. Space is
limited and reservations can be
made by e-mailing info@fami-
lycenterweb.org or calling
(313)432-3832.

m• As part of its Classic Books
Lecture series, The Friends of
the Grosse Pointe Public
Library host University of
Michigan professor Ralph
Williams who will discuss
"Ghosts in Shakespeare" at
7:30 p.m. in the Grosse Pointe
South High School auditorium.
The lecture is free to group
members, students and teach-
ers. Non-members pay $10.
• The Grosse Pointe
Community Blood Council
holds an American Red Cross
Blood Drive from 9 a.m. to 8:30
p.m. at the Grosse Pointe War
Memorial. Babysitting is avail-
able upon request. Walk-ins
may come after 10 a.m. Call
(313) 884-5542 for an appoint-
ment.
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ST. CLAIR SHORES

Positive news
Shores Theatre screens will light up again
as zoning board variance is granted

PHOTO BY RENEE LANDUYT

Dressing up the snow
Cecelia Moyer, 7, put on her red party dress to shovel the snow in
front of her Grosse Pointe Park home. The area saw about 4
inches of accumulation last week.

By Bob St. John
StaffWHter

The Shores Theatre in St.
Clair Shores cleared a hurdle
toward getting the green light
to renovate.

The theater, which opened
in 1935, is owned by Grosse
Pointe Shores resident Bob
Liggett of Liggett Holdings.

In a recent move, Macomb
County Circuit Court Judge
Diane Druzinski upheld the
St. Clair Shores Zoning Board
of Appeals' variance it grant-
ed to allow 58 parking spaces.

Attorneys representing
Nine Mile and Mack property
owner Al LaHood and Travis
Hamburger owner Paul
McAdory sued the city of St.
Clair Shores, saying the vari-
ance should not have been
granted.

"We arp pleased w.th the

judges decision," said Bruce
Ferguson, CFO of Liggett
Holdings.

"We still have a lot of hard
work left before we pull the
first movie ticket.

"We are eager to get on with
that hard work."

LaHood and McAdory have
until Feb. 6 to appeal
Druzinski's opinion or ask for
reconsideration.

"I think the community at-
large is for the theater," said
St. Clair Shores attorney
Robert Ihrie. "The theater is a
healthy addition to the Nine
Mile and Mack area."

The project to expand the
local theater has been
through several phases, in-
cluding meetings with city of-
ficials, school officials from
nearby South Lake High
School, property owners and
attorneys

Expansion approval was re-
ceived from the St. Clair
Shores Planning Commission
and the St. Clair Shores City
Council, and a parking vari-
ance was granted by the St.
Clair Shores Zoning Board of
Appeals in 2006.

Ferguson presented a plan
in March, 2006 that would
have expanded the theater
from two to eight screens, to a
packed South Lake High
School auditorium.

The plan was rejected and
Ferguson brought back a
scaled down version that in-
cluded a five-screen complex.

St. Clair Shores city offi-
cials gave the go-ahead and
the Zoning Board of Appeals
granted the parking variance.

The Shores Theatre has
been an anchor in downtown
St. Clair Shores for
generations.

PHOTO BY BOB ST. JOHN

Approval to open the Shores Theatre, above, has still not been granted, but a recent court ruling
will help speed up the process.

Bowen gets her say at hearing
By Bob St. John
Staff Writer

Grosse Pointe South Choir
Director Ellen Bowen had her
say in court Monday giving tes-
timony why she should not
have to adhere to the State
Department of Education's rec-
ommended six month suspen-
sion of her teaching license.

Several people spoke to
Administrative Law Judge
James Ward on behalf of
Bowen, while others were on
hand to argue against the dis-
trict's longtime teacher.

"I testified in order to bring
full exposure to the heinous,

unethical practices I personally
witnessed that were committed
by Ms. Bowen," said former vo-
cal coach at Grosse Pointe
South High School, Wayman
Ezell.

"Ms. Bowen's lawyer showed
extremely poor judgement by
asking me under oath to identi-
fy those children who were
berrated by Ms. Bowen in my
presence.

"Unfortunately, 1 had to com-
ply-"

Bowen was represented by
teachers union attorney Lily
Ciccodicola.

Ezell was employed by the
district January through June

2006.
These actions were a result

of Bowen's May 2007 convic-
tion of assault and battery and
annoying person charges stem-
ming from a case of road rage
in Grosse Pointe Park in 2006.

Bowen was suspended for
the month of September and
returned to her teaching post
Oct. 1.

In addition, the school dis-
trict suspended her through the
summer months.

A decision by Ward in the
case is expected to be rendered
this spring. However, State
Superintendent Michael
Flanagan has the final say.

POINTER OF INTEREST

Tm continually amazed that people at the
worst times in their lives can be thinking of
others and be so generous.'

Daniel Kurdziel
t " Home: Grosse Pointe Woods

-»v

!,.,*£ Family: Wife, Joyce; children,

F*.;? Lisa, 26, Dan, 23, and Michael,

yj-^t 20
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Polio
pugilists

Kercheval in the Village busi-
ness district in the City of
Grosse Pointe has taken on a
new moniker "March of
Dimes" to raise funds for infan-
tile paralysis.

Leo Carrier installs the new
sign with the approval of from
left: Mrs. Phillip Koemf r, Rev.
Paul Ketchum, Ed Hickey and
City Clerk NorbertNeff.

— From the Jan. 30,1958 is-
sue of the Grosse Pointe News

50 years ago this week

PHOTO BY FRED RUNNKLI.S

• ANN LANDERS TO AD-
DRESS PTA: Famed syndicat-
ed newspaper advice colum-
nist Ann Landers will address
t he Richard Elementary
School Parent Teachers
Association.

Landers, whose advice col-
umn is syndicated to 166 news-
papers nationwide, will speak
to the PTA on "Our Children's
Biggest Problems: Parents."
Ann Landers is the nom de
plume of Jules Lederer of
Chicago, where she lives with
her husband and 18-year-old
daughter. She receives roughly
5,000 letters a month seeking
advice.

• CENTRAL LIBRARY

MARKS FIFTH YEAR OF
SERVICE: Grosse Pointe
Central Library marked its fifth
year of service to the Grosse
Pointe communities with a cer-
emony recently.

The facility, in which ground
was broken for in September
1951, has far exceeded its ex-
pectations for use with the help
of donations by Pointe resi-
dents.

The library, designed by
famed New York architect
Marcel Breuer, has been wide-
ly written up in library and ar-
chitectural magazines and has
stood as a model for public li-
brary buildings throughout the
United States.

• POLICE SEEK PURSE
SNATCHER: Grosse Pointe
Woods police are looking for
two suspects in a purse snatch-
ing that occurred recently on
Roslyn. Police said a woman
was accosted by a "shabbily
dressed" couple while walking
home. The woman was
knocked to the ground during
the assault but was unharmed.

x I nttanp

tinue this commitment with a renew

* r_ *» [\ i

25 years ago this week

• PARK ASKS COURT TO
CLOSE ARCADE: Grosse
Pointe Park officials have ap-
pealed to Wayne County
Circuit Court Judge Maureen
Reilly to close the arcade lo-
cated within the Esquire
Theater on Jefferson.

Several neighbors have
packed recent council meet-
ings seeking the video parlor's
closing. They claim young-
sters, who frequent the game
room litter, vandalize and cre-
ate a nuisance. Theater owner
Rob Putansu said he needs the
revenue generated from the
parlor to keep the theater
open.

• PROSECUTOR TO AP-
PEAL MURDER REVERSAL:
The Wayne County
Prosecutor's Office has filed
an'appeal in the murder con-
viction reversal of Fantts
teenager David McKendrick.

The Michigan Court of
Appeals recently reversed the
murder conviction of
McKendrick on a technicality.

McKendrick, then 15, plead-
ed guilty to second degree
murder in the October 1980
slaying of 81-year-old Kerby
resident Elizabeth Keir. He
was sentenced to 20 to 40
years in prison and sent to the
Riverside Correctional Facility
in Ionia to receive psychiatric
care.

• TAX ASSESSMENTS
MAY GO DOWN: For the first
time in more than 30 years,
property tax assessments in
the Grosse Pointes might go
down.

The reasons are the de-
pressed housing market and
changes in the State Tax
Commission's guidelines for
figuring assessments. Instead
of using a 30-month cycle in
property values, the commis-
sion will base their assess-
ments on a 12-month cycle.

See YESTERDAY, page 6A
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Woods honors Eagle Scout with his own day
ByKathyRyan
StajfWHter

In recognition of his accom-
plishments in scouting, athlet-
ics and academics, Thursday,
March 13 has been proclaimed
Jimmy Bennett Day in Grosse
Pointe Woods.
* Bennett, 17, the son of Rob
and Maureen Bennett, earned
the rank of Eagle Scout in
2007. He is a member of Lake
Shore District Troop 34, where
he is senior patrol leader.

His Eagle Scout leadership
project involved making beds
and toys for the Grosse Pointe
Animal Adoption Agency. He
came up with the idea of assist-
ing the organization after his
family adopted their dog,
Maggie, from the agency.

"I have always liked the time
I spent in scouts," he said. "I
have made most of my best
friends there. It has given me
confidence, and I plan on stay-
ing involved with scouting as
long as I can."

Bennett has also received the

_:-**.* .. ,

Mayor Robert Novitke presents Jimmy Bennett with the official proclamation setting Thursday, March 13, as Jimmy Bennett
Day in recognition of his outstanding achievements in scouting, academics, community service and athletics. Bennett's family,
including his parents Rob.and Maureen, and his brothei; Kevin, and sistei; Deianey, were there to share in this special recogni-
tion. Also pictured are city administrator Mark WoIIenwebei; council members Joe Suchei; Lisa Pinkos Howie, AI Dickinson,
Pete Waldmeii; Vicki Granger and Art Bryant

Arrow of light Award for out-
standing scouting and was vot-
ed "Scout of the Year" twice by
his peers.

In addition to his scouting,
Bennett was recognized by the
Grosse Pointe Woods City
Council for his academic and
athletic achievements.

A senior at Grosse Pointe
North, he has a 3.6 grade point
average and is a member of the
National Honor Society. He al-
so plays on North's football
team and participates in the
school's Impact Club, a com-
munity service based student
organization.

Bennett hopes to attend ei-
ther Western Michigan
University or Michigan State
University in the fall, where he
plans to major in anthropology.

Mayor Robert Novitke pre-
sented the official proclama-
tion to Bennett at the Monday,
Jan. 21 city council meeting.
Bennett was accompanied by
his parents and his brother,
Kevin, 14, and his sister,
Deianey, 10.

GROSSE POINTE PARK

ChiUy-fest celebrates winter
ByBethQuinn
StaffWriter

While most people dream of
a white Christmas, Grosse
Pointe Park's parks and recre-
ation staff are dreaming of a
white Chilly-fest.

That is when Patterson Park
will be turned into a winter
wonderland featuring numer-
ous cold weather activities for
Park residents to enjoy.

The Park is holding its first
annual Chilly-fest from noon to
3 p.m. Saturday, Feb. 9 at
Patterson Park.

The festival is an expanded
version of the Valentine Skate
which the Park sponsored in
years past.

"The Valentine Skate was al-
ways popular," said Terry
Soloman, parks and recreation
director.

"People were asking us to

make it a little bigger and a lit-
tle longer."

The 2008 Chilly-fest will have
activities encompassing every
part of the lakefront park locat-
ed at Three Mile and Essex,
Soloman said.

"We will be handing out a
map showing where the activi-
ties are as people enter the
park," Soloman said.

The event will go on as
scheduled even if there is no
snow on the ground, she said.

"We have made contingency
plans for most of the activities,"
Soloman said.

Residents will be able to ice
skate to music provided by a
D. J. for the entire three hours.

"We have it set up that the
music will be heard throughout
the park," Soloman said.

A heated tent, furnished with
tables and chairs, will be erect-
ed over the tennis courts adja-

cent to the skating rink. Chili,
chili dogs, chips, bottled water
and pop will be sold.

Soloman added the chili will
be prepared by Jo Joe's Galley,
windmill Pointe Park's new
concessionaire.

"We are hoping people will
come for lunch," Soloman said.
"Nothing will sell for over $2."

Snowball targets made by
Carl Penszynki, maintenance
supervisor, will be located by
the kayak launch.

"If we don't have snow to
make snowballs, we will use
tennis balls and relocate to the
tennis courts that have the bas-
ketball hoops," Soloman said.

She added that park employ-
ees collected old tennis balls
left at the courts by players dur-
ing the past year for this activi-
ty-

The maintenance crew also
collected fallen pine cones

which will be turned into
peanut butter bird feeders. This
activity will be located under
the overhang by the Park rest
rooms.

Finesse Cuisine Catering will
conduct an ice sculpture
demonstration in the gazebo.
Three completed ice sculptures
will be displayed throughout
the park.

A trolley pulled by a team of
Belgian draft horses will disem-
bark at the picnic shelter and
circle the park's perimeter.

"We will also have a s'more-
making station at the shelter
for people waiting to ride on
the trolley," Soloman said. "It
will be another place to warm
up."

Bike, Blades and Boards will
be conducting a snowboarding
demonstration from 1 to 1:30
p.m. at the sledding hill.

There will also be a snow-

PHOTO BYRENEELANDUYT

Cousins Douglas Ross, left, and John Stravel found a way to
enjoy a Michigan winter day at the Patterson Park skating
pond.

man building contest, face
painting and a chance to try-

out snowshoes
event.

during the

Seventh annual Winterfest has entertainment for all ages
By Kathy Ryan
Staff Writer

There will be something for
everyone at the seventh annu-
al Grosse Pointe Woods
Winterfest celebration from
noon to 2 p.m. Saturday, Feb.
2, at Lake Front Park.

A chili cook-off, a pie bake-̂
off, an inflatable slide and a
Score-0 competition will high-
light the day, along with lunch
and refreshments.

"This is an event that has
grown tremendously over the
years," said City
Councilwoman Vicki Granger,
who also serves as the coun-
cil's recreation commission
representative. "It's a great
day for everyone of all ages."

The chili cook-off and the
pie bake-off are open to resi-
dents and non-residents.
Entrants must register with
the park office, as space is lim-
ited. Set up begins at 11 a;m.
Participants are asked to bring
one gallon of hot chili and
serving utensils. Crock pots
are not required and the chili
will be served in cups provided
by the city.

Judging be-
gins promptly at
11:15 a.m.
Winners will be
announced at
noon.

Several digni-
taries will be do-
ing the judging
for the chili
cook-off, includ-
ing Mayor
Robert Novitke
and councilmen
Joe Sucher and
PeteWaldmeir.

"I can't believe
how seriously
people take
these competi-
tions," said

Granger. "We have had several
unique recipes over the years,
including one with venison."

The pie bake-off will be held
at the same time. Bakers are
asked to bring serving utensils
and to cut the pies into single
servings placing them in cups
provided by the city.

Judging for the pie bake-off
will be very official, with
Municipal Judge Lynne Pierce
presiding over the festivities
and Councilman Art Bryant of-
fering his expertise.

"I'm known in my family for
making a great apple pie, so
I'm certainly qualified to do
the job, and I'm honored that
my new position with the city
allows me to participate in im-
portant events such as this,"
said Bryant, with his tongue
planted firmly in cheek.

Children can participate in
the Score-0 competition,
where they take aim with a
hockey stick and a puck and
partake in unlimited swoops
down the inflatable slide.

Everyone can stay for lunch,
which includes hot dogs
cooked up by members of the

city's recreation commission. Winterfest is that people.have "But I'm thinking we really Winterfest to Winter Blast. It's
There is no charge, but regis- the chance to come out and need to change the name from really that much fun."
tration is required. Call the see Mends and neighbors they
park office at (313) 343-2470, don't always see in the winter,
or register online
parks@gpwmi.us.

at because everyone is cooped up
inside their houses," said

"What's fun about Granger. ;
?
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Dan Kurdziel is continually impressed with the strength of the human
spirit and the incredible generosity of families that has enabled
Michigan to be one of the leaders in organ and tissue donation.

Giving others the
ByKathyRyan

Dan Kurdziel speaks for
those who are often times too
sick to speak for themselves.
And he listens to those who are
too heartbroken to say very
much.

As a representative for Gift
of Life Michigan, the Grosse
Pointe Wxxis resident knows
the joy an organ or tissue
transplant can bring to the
family of a chronically ill indi-
vidual, literally giving them the
gift of life. He is also acutely
aware of a potential donor
family's depth of sorrow, when
he asks if they considered or-
gan donatioa

"I just listened," he said. "I
listened to them talk about
their loved one. I listen to their
concerns. Oftentimes the fami-
ly just wants to talk."

Gift of life Michigan is the
state's organ recovery organi-
zation and operates under the
auspices of the Centers for
Medicare and Medicaid. It was
founded in 1971 by surgeons
coordinating the relatively new
field of kidney transplantation.

By law, hospitals must con-
tact Gift of Life Michigan or
one of its 56 countrywide com-
parable organizations when a
patient is deemed a candidate
for organ or tissue donation, or
any time a death occurs.

Kurdziel joined Gift of life in
1999 following what he refers
to as a "permanent layoff" by a
food supply company.
3 "I'had worked for the corn-
jpany for 17

"When they built a plant in
Alabama and moved much of
the company's business there,
I lost my job. I like to say I was-
n't fired; I was permanently
laid off."

While searching for a new
career, Kurdziel focused on his
background in business and
psychology. He holds a bache-
lor's degree in psychology and
a master's degree in guidance
and counseling. He had previ-
ously worked at Cottage
Hospital.

"I worked with a career
counselor and that helped me
focus my interests. I always
wanted to get back to health
care," he said. "I loved the hos-
pital environment and I hon-
estly thought I could help peo-
ple.

"When I was approached by
Gift of life, I knew this would
give me an avenue to do just
that. It took me a long time to
get back to what I loved doing,
but I couldn't be happier."

And he also feels Challenged.
When he first joined Gift of

Life Michigan, Kurdziel was a
donation coordinator. He took
calls from hospitals indicating
they had a potential organ
donor, and it was also his job to
approach families about poten-
tial donation .̂.

Dan Kurdziel, Gift of Life Michigan hospital development representative, presents the Medal of Honor to James Orosz; M.D.,
chief medical officer at St John Hospital St John was honored for its work in organ donation.

UNIVERSITY.LICrGETT SCHOOL
EARLY EDUCATION WORKSHOPS

"Hospital personnel are not
allowed to raise the issue of or-
gan donation with a family," he
explained. "It is felt that it
could create some confusion
with the families and some-
times a family is angry with the
hospital or just with the situa-
tion that brought their loved
one to this point."

"It was my job to speak with
the family, to ask if they have
ever considered organ dona-
tion. Oftentimes they had, but
if they hadn't, I would answer
their questions and hopefully
clear up any concerns they
might have."

"But mostly I would just lis-

ten. I gave the family the op-
portunity to talk about their
loved one to help me under-
stand their relationship and
help them to make the decision
that is best for them."

Kurdziel's job also included
speaking from the potential re-
cipient's perceptive.

"I was also the voice of those
who were receiving organs. I
would tell the families the good
that could come from their
gift."

Kurdziel is now a hospital
development associate and
works directly with hospital
staffs to raise their awareness
of organ and tissue donation.

bitemey
Helping your child take the amazing beginning

steps toward reading and writing
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Giving jour child a solid foundation in math skills
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and 7=00-8:00 p.m.

Learning about the world through the
eyes and ideas of young children

Tuesday, May 6, 2008: 8:30-9:30 a.m.
and 7<OO-8:OO]>.m.

Workshop Leader
Molly Yarbrough Diemer

isPro^am Coordinator and a
Pre-Kindergarten teacherfirtke

Primary School at University
LiggettSdtool Diemer

attended Lesley University in
Cambridge, Massachusetts,
for her teacher certification

and Masters in Early
Childhood Eduaithn.

Her research has been in the
Project Approach philosophy.
In 200$, Liggett awarded a

Venture Grant for her to study with
Xitlian Kate and Sylvia Chard, the
founders of the Project Approach.

Molly enjoys presenting at stale and
national conferences.
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RSVP to Molly Diemer at

mdiemerfil&uls.org or
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18101 East Warren Avenue
near 7 Mile and Mack
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Tour appointment can be scheduled within 24 to 48 hours.

He is currently assigned to
several hospitals in Wayne and
Macomb counties and assists
administrators and staff in es-
tablishing donation proce-
dures and protocol through in-
service and continuing educa-
tion programs. !

"There has been a;dramatic
increase in awareness of or-
gan and tissue donations," he
said. "We're very proud of the
record Michigan has in this
field. In 2007, there were 301
organ donors and 920 tissue
donors. We are one of the lead-
ing states in the nation for or-
gan and tissue donation, and I
think that is something we can
all be very proud of.":

Kurdziel urges every family
to have an "end of life discus-
sion" to make everyone's wish-
es known. If organ and tissue
donation is the desire, he
urges them to register with the
Michigan Secretary of State;
That office will send potential
donors a red. heart sticker to
affix to their driver's license,
making their wishes legally
binding.

"It will not only make our job
easier, it will take the responsi-
bility away from loved ones at
a very trying time," he said.

Kurdziel dismisses the idea
that working in a field that ap-
pears to focus on death is de-
pressing or draining.

"I am continually amazed
that people at the worst times
in their lives can be thinking
of others and be so generous..
To me, it's a continual reafftr-
mation of the strength of the
human spirit."

A lifelong resident of the
eastside, he graduated from
St. Ambrose before going on
to Wayne State University. His
three children, Lisa, Dan arid
Michael, are North gradu-
ates.

"Our youngest, Michael,
goes to school at Michigan
Tech, so Joyce and I are emp-
ty nesters and we have to ad-
mit that we are really enjoy-
ing it," he said with a laugh.

Downtime for Kurdziel in-
cludes reading, running and
watching movies.

And, yes, Kurdziel's family
knows he wishes to be an or-
gan and tissue donor.

"We sat down and I dis-
cussed my wishes with them,"
he said. "It's something every
family should do."
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Get help keeping fitness resolutions
ByBethQuinn
StaffWriter

It's a phenomenon that oc-
curs every year.

In January, fitness centers
are filled to capacity with peo-
ple eager to keep their New
Year's resolution to get in
shape. But by mid-February
the numbers dwindles to nor-
mal levels.

Mary Beth Hathaway, man-
ager of Grosse Pointe Park's
Lavin's Recreation Center, be-

lieves the winter doldrums
make people lose their incen-
tive to workout.

"Winter just gets to people,"
she said. "They don't want to
leave their house to exercise."

Hathaway and her staff have
organized the "Keep Your
Resolution Challenge" to help
people stay focused on their
fitness goals.

The challenge 'funs from
Saturday, Feb. 9 to Saturday,
May 3.

It is open to Park residents

who are members of the
Meade Fitness Center or who
take fitness classes in the
recreation center.

There is a $5 fee per partici-
pant which will later be part of
the first place winner's prize.

The challenge will kick off
with a sign up and informa-
tional meeting at 11 a.m.
Saturday, Feb. 9, at the Lavin's
Center.

Fitness trainers will be .pre-
sent to help participants estab-
lish goals, collect beginning

statistics, which will be kept
confidential, and help get them
started in the right direction.

Park resident Heather
Dixon, M.D. will be available
to conduct a Bio-Impedance
Analysis which assesses body
composition by measuring the
percentage of water, fat and
muscle tissue. The cost for the
analysis is $30 per person.

Throughout the 15-week
event, training tips will be
posted on the fitness room bul-
letin board.

At the half-way mark,
Saturday, March 15, trainers
will check the participants'
progress.

Dixon will also present two
lectures on health related top-
ics and spa day will be held in
the early spring.

Final statistics will be taken
Saturday, May 3 and the win-
ners will be posted Saturday,
May it). • • • • • '

The winner will be the mem-
ber that makes the most
change in body composition

and who comes closest to
reaching personal goals,
Hathaway said.

First place receives the cash
taken as participation fees,
one free month added to their
fitness membership, one free
personal training session and
a free fitness center T-shirt.

Second place gets one free
month added to their member-
ship anOTfree T-sfeirt and f6w^(

el; •.
Third place receives a free T-

shirt and towel.

GROSSE POINTE PUBLIC LIBRARY

Central model project approved
ByBethQuinn

'StaffWriter

Have model will travel.
The trustees of the Grosse

Pointe Public Library unani-
mously approved the library
purchasing an architectural
model of the new Central
branch, which will be trans-
portable.

The cost of the model is
$12,800 — $11,500 for labor
and $1300 for materials.

Board President Bob Klacza
said it would be slightly small-

er in scale than the norm of
1/4 inch per foot, perhaps 3/8
inch per foot. This allows it to
be "suitcaseable" and would
fit in an airplane's overhead
bin.

The transportable model
will allow the Grosse Pointe
Library Foundation to use it as
a presentation tool when it
meets with potential donors,
according to Foundation
Director Marcia Scavarda.

She envisions taking two
trips to Florida for "cultivation
events" with Grosse Pointers

who spend the winter there.
She said the foundation

traveled to the Sunshine State
to meet with potential donors
for the recently built Ewald
and Woods branches.

"The response was very fa-
vorable," Scavarda said. "The
attendance was gangbuster."

The model will show the
proposed renovation and ex-
pansion to the Marcel Breuer
designed building as concep-
tualized by the architectural
firm designLAB of Boston.

The roof and second floor

can be removed revealing the
interior layout. All site and
landscaping features includ-
ing terraces, the courtyard
garden and roof decks will be
shown.

The cost was originally to be
split by both the library and
the foundation, but Library
Director Vickey Bloom pro-
posed that the library pay the
entire cost, so it will belong to
the library at the end of the
project.

It is estimated the model will
be constructed in six weeks.

Dogs come to rescue in Farms home invasion
A Grosse Pointe Farms

homeowner credits her dogs
for possibly saving her from
serious injury during a break-
in at her house on Kerby re-
cently.

The homeowner, who asked
not to be named, said her dogs

her to the presence of

three men when she returned
home.

The dogs began acting ag-
gressively and prompted the
men to escape the house
through a side door carrying
more than $1,000 in cash and
several fur coats.

During their escape, one of

the men kicked and injured
one of the dogs, said Farms
Detective Michael McCarthy.

"I believe my dogs saved my
life," said the homeowner.

The suspects were later, ar-
rested and charged with home
invasion.

One has since been released,

but police are still pursuing
charges against him,
McCarthy said.

The suspects discarded the
stolen goods during their es-
cape. They were later recov-
ered by police.

; v, —JohrvLundberg

YESTERDAY
Headlines
to remember
Continued from page 2A

10years ago this week

• WHO PAYS FOX CREEK
SUTt UNSETTLED: It is still
undecided who will pay the
$1.9 million settlement to resi-
dents on Fox Creek who sued
the City of Detroit and Grosse
Pointe Park over sewage over-
flows that were pumped into
their yards after heavy rainfall.

Grosse Pointe Park officials
claim it should be their insurer,
the Michigan Municipal
League, who defended them in
the lawsuit. Fox Creek resi-
dents recently won a $3.8 mil-
lion lawsuit, divided equally
between the two cities.

A recent mediation ruling
concluded that Grosse Pointe
Park is responsible for the pay-
ment.

• LIBRARY BOARD VA-

• t fJurtU** 1

Coming in February 2008

Same Great Quality..,

.. .Another Great Location

Mack Avenue
North of Cook Road

Grosse Pointe Woods

for more info
www.beldingcleaners.com

313.822.5800

Grab & Go
Specials

Mack Daddy's Restaurant proudly introduces

These fresh Sc delicious complete dinners are ready to
"Heat & Eat!" No fuss, No muss!

TAKE A NIGHT OFF FROM THE PLANNING,
PREPARING, COOKING & CLEANING!

Monday- February 4,2008 - Chicken Cacciatore
Mom's best! Served with rice pilaf, small house salad,
roll & butter and homemade brownie,

Wednesday-February 6,2008 - Chicken Pot Pie
Homemade with tender chicken and fresh vegetables, served
with small house salad, roll & butter and homemade brownie.

Friday- February 8,2008 - Salmon Patties
A Friday Favorite! Served with spicy remouiade sauce, rice pilaf,
vegetable du jour, small house salad, roll & butter and
homemade brownie.

per person

CANOES TO BE FILLED: Six
applicants have filed to fill two
vacancies on the Grosse Pointe
library Board. \

The vacancies were created
with the resignations of two of-
ficials, who were recently elect-
ed to other offices in the
Pointes.

The applicants , are
Claudia Jeannette, Katherine-
McDonald, M. Ann Meehan,
Donald Sweeney III, David
Bergeron and Florence Miller.
The new board members are
expected to be announced in
March.

5 years ago this week

<• CLOCK TOWER TO
HONOR PARK COUNCIL-
MAN: A clock tower on
Jefferson and Pemberton will
be named after Vernon
Ausherman, a 20-year veteran
of the Grosse Pointe Park City
Council, who passed away re-
cently.

Ausherman, 82, succumbed
to cancer, and was remem-
bered as an energetic council-
man. During his 20 years on
the council, he was instru:
mental in transforming lower
Jefferson into a cosmopolitan
suburban gateway of condo-
miniums, professional build-
ings and landscaped pocket
parks.

• CROWN VICS PUR-
CHASE POSTPONED: City
of Grosse Pointe officials con-
cerned over recent document-
ed explosions of gas tanks in
Crown Victorias, have de-
layed the purchase of two
new vehicles requested by
Police Chief Al Fincham.

Fincham said the vehicle's
gas tanks would be retrofitted
with a protective liner, a move
that meets the approval of the
Michigan Association of
Chiefs of Police. Council offi-
cials delayed the purchase be-
cause of fears over police offi-
cer's safety.

• CHANGES MADE TO
WOODS BRANCH PLAN:
The Grosse Pointe Woods
Planning Commission and
Grosse Pointe Public Library.
Board made changes for the
planned Woods branch at
Parcells Middle School.

Several changes were made
to the architectural detail on
the sides of the building fac-
ing Mack and Vernier.

Officials are hopeful that
they will soon have the design
concept needed to pursue
construction.

— John Lundberg

lues on all Cruise Lines • River Cruises •
•ise Rates • Worldwide Cruises

Your Cruise Specialists
Phil & Laura Filkin
313-884-0180

www.suncoastcruiseplanners.com ^
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Dubai News
Grosse Pointe resident John H. Mecke took the News Reader, 96 Kercheval, Grosse Pointe

Grosse Pointe News along When he visited Farms, MI 48236; or e-mail to editor@grosse-

Dubai, United Arab Emirates. He stands before pointenews.com. Your picture will appear in an

the symbol of the area's growth and develop- upcoming issue,

ment, the Burl Al Hotel. It is de-

signed to resemble a billowing

sail, because it is built on an is-

land in the Arabian Gulf. When

you travel, take along a copy of

the Grosse Pointe News and

I ' | i l i I M i . . . I _ l 1 [ ' '

Tax Time is here!
Calculate tax and trust cash flow requirements.

Tax return preparation and planning.
Trust cash flow administration and returns:

1120,1120S, 1065, 1041, 1040, 990, State, 709 and 706 returns.

Contact:

JOHN M. RICKEL, C.P.A., P.C.
EMAIL rickelbaun@comcast.net

TELEPHONE 31 3.886.0000

WOML-iTS E.'JRU?>££.N & AM

CLOTHING COLiE'TT'.O

ACCESSORY HANDBAGS SHOES

T E N D E R

OO*v'\TOV« U P! R VIINC- MA V

Captured DVD bandit
By John Lundberg
Staff Writer

The thief had a common
M.O.

He would steal a vehicle and
come into the Village commer-
cial district for some shopping.

The problem was he wasn't
interested in paying for the
items which he had selected.

The thief would then, flee
with his booty, which was
mostly DVDs stolen from a
business in the 17000 block of
Kercheval.

He would then drive back in-
to Detroit.

However, his good luck fi-

nally ran out last week.
The City of Grosse Pointe

police arrested the 42-year-old
Detroit man Tuesday, Jan. 22,
after a wild police chase.

The chase ended with the
suspect's vehicle striking an-
other car at the intersection of
Cadieux and East Warren.
After a brief foot chase, the
man was restrained and taken
into custody.

Police officers said events
unfolded as follows: The man
entered the business to pilfer
his usual goods. After being
confronted by store personnel,
he ran out the rear entrance,
setting off the security alarm.

He got into a vehicle —•
which he had stolen earlier —
and sped off with police in pur-
suit.

After nearly colliding with
oncoming traffic on Cadieux,
the man made the fateful deci-
sion to wildly turn onto East
Warren.

The turn resulted in the acci-
dent and his ultimate appre-
hension.

The man was charged with
three counts, including: retail
fraud, fleeing and eluding po-
lice and possession of a stolen
vehicle.

For more police news, turn
to page 19A.

In
with AAA Trave

\ A \ nit m U i-

jei tit'ii mnit »vlh
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\ J C J lions inch at

Whether you're looking for a last-minute winter getaway or planning

your summer vacation, AAA Travel Agency can make the most of

your vacation dollar. We can customize vacations to fit. your lifestyle

and your budget.

AAA Travel Agency Hot Deals:
• Cruises for less than $60 per person/per day

• All-inclusive vacations - 5 days from less than $800 per person

- includes airfare, hotels, meals, drinks and entertainment!

• . Fantastic Disney vacation specials

SPACE IS LIMITED.

RESERVE NOW FOR BEST SELECTION.

For details and reservations, contact your nearest AAA Travel Agency location!

AAA/Grosse Pointe • 19239 Mack Ave. • 313-343-6000

Restrictions apply. Prices/offers are per person, land or cruise only (unless otherwise stated) on select dates and categories. Subject to
availability and may be withdrawn without notice. Air-indusive pricing from select gateways. AAA Member Benefits are available on select
AAA Preferred partners, valid on select dates and are subject to change. See AAA Travel Agency for complete details.

- 1 '

And right now,
well give you a

$100 ?=rd
just for opening a checking account

with us.*Come in and ask how.

iccount and establish direct deposit
closed within the first six months,
to substitute items of equal value.

account. Offer subject to change or.
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RIA1 By Arthur I. Cyr

market
wisdom

lobal stock markets are in turmoil. The
principal catalyst is the large amount of
debt based on real estate originating in
the United States which has gone bad.
Current Wall Street losses related to the
credit problems are estimated at more
than $100 billion.

In response to the sharp drop on Wall
Street and overseas markets, the U.S. Federal Reserve has low-
ered the benchmark interest rate by three-quarters of a per-
centage point. This was handled outside the usual schedule of
the Fed's Open Market Committee meetings. Also, the Bush
White House and Democratic-controlled Congress agreed on a
rushed stimulus package to include individual income tax re-
bates and tax cuts for business.

In popular media, bad news usually drives out good. The
alarmed voices of TV commentators provide the contempo-
rary counterpart of tabloid scare headlines. This tone rein-

forces public anxi-

Free nmrkets can be
inefficient, irrational,
manipulated and badly

however, they reflect basic
realities, including public
psychology.

ety. A special rate-
setting meeting by
the Fed also fuels
concern.

Lower interest
rates will ease
pressure on fi-
nanciers and
homeowners un-
der stress. -
Servicing and re-

" tiring loans of all
sorts will entail less cost.

But a focus on Washington and media behavior overshad-
ows the basic truth that authentic free markets go down as
well as up. Markets can be inefficient, irrational, manipulated
and badly regulated. By definition, however, they reflect basic
realities, including public psychology. We should be primarily
corcero.ee! not that equities markets have dropped, but why
this hSSfi&ppened — and how best to react.

Despite our enormous general prosperity, many have re-
mained frustrated in pursuit of the American dream of private
home ownership. The collective response by too many lenders
has been to throw the rule book out the window. In a time of
easy money, or readily available credit, borrowers unqualified
in terms of assets and financial history nonetheless were em-
braced with "subprime" loans. Also very germane is that a lot
of money moved into real estate speculation after the dot-com
stock market bubble burst in 2000.

The proliferation of types of lending organizations has facili-
tated the process, but some large established commercial
banks clearly put greed before good judgment. The growth of
an extremely complicated global financial derivatives market
greatly expanded possibilities for financial mischief as well as
loss. Derivatives have become engines of risk creation as well
as risk management.

Individual home loans traditionally based at local banks
have been packaged into big bundles of bonds and other debt
instruments, peddled literally around the globe. The scale and
complexity of these arrangements mean small individual loan
defaults are much less likely to be noticed quickly.

During the Great Depression, American humorist Will
Rogers became enormously popular because of timing as well
as wit. His sense of humor was inherently engaging. Beyond
that, however, his honfespun rural style provided a self con-
scious contrast with the East Coast big city financiers blamed
for the nation's economic problems. Those problems were un-
precedented, before or since, including an unemployment rate
of 25 percent.

Inspired by Rogers, here are three direct down to earth
points.

First, as a worker, take pride. The United States—you and
me—has the most productive and largest economy in the
world. Our gross national product now totals well above $13
trillion.

Second, as a citizen, be concerned. Current tense govern-
ment intervention directly reflects public sentiment that any
significant market downturn is intolerable. Instead, there
should be serious analysis of reintroducing more government
oversight of financial activities.

Third, as an investor, do your homework. A good guide.is
"Security Analysis" by Benjamin Graham and David Dodd,
first published in 1934 during the Depression, revised and re-
published regularly since. You can even read the book while
the TV is on.

Arthur I. Cyr is Clausen distinguished professor at Carthage
College and author of "After the Cold War," NYU Press and
Palgrave/Macmillan. He can be reached at
acyr@carthage. edu.

—Scripps Howard News Service
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Speech
and language
To the Editor:

The article "Preschoolers on
FAST program," Jan. 17
Grosse Pointe News, immedi-
ately caught my attention.

The FA.S.T. program cur-
rently being used at one of the
schools in the Grosse Pointes
describes a method of instruc-
tion for reading readiness
preparation.

I have been a practicing
speech-language pathologist
for 30 years and a professor in
higher education for 20. In
fact, the use of specific meth-
ods for increasing phonemic
awareness or the relationship
between speech sounds and
letters have been used for over
a century.

Historically, conscientious
teachers in the late 1800s be-
gan focusing on these skills. It
was a time when literacy was
increasing in the general pop-
ulation, speaking skills were
deemed important, and they
soon found some of their stu-
dents were having difficulty
speaking and also learning to
read.

Currently, in a number of
Northern European countries,
reading ability and instruction
are not expected until 6 to 8
years of age. Teachers of the
speech-language impaired
have been part of the educa-
tional system in the United
States for 80 years. They are
highly trained experts in the
areas of speech and language
development and disorders
and language learning disabili-
ty-

There is a vast amount of
scholarly literature on the ef-
fectiveness, as well as lack of
evidence, in the practice for
reading readiness programs.

As schools or school districts
consider adopting or using
programs such as R.E.A.D., I
strongly advocate the speech-
language pathologist be direct-
ly involved.

The teaching of "where their
tongue, lips and mouth should

be to make that sound" is the
responsibility of these individ-
uals.

Collaborative teaching mod-
els are ideal and encouraging.

CAROLE W. GORENFLO,
PH.D,

Grosse Pointe

High school
highlight
To the Editor:

Is the front page article
"Bowen seeks court appeal,"
Jan. 24 Grosse Pointe News,
with a big photo the biggest
news in the Pointes?

What was new? There was
an appeal hearing. No deci-
sion, just the hearing.
Everything else in the front
page article was a rerun.

I find it interesting that Ms.
Bowen's hearing is so signifi-
cant that it gets top coverage
and yet there is nothing in the
Grosse Pointe News about Ms.
Bowen's choir students receiv-
ing top ratings for solos and
ensembles at districts the
same weekend!

Beth Quinn made her opin-
ion regarding Ms. Bowen pub-
lic in the I Say column,
"Setting the record straight —
on Ellen," Oct. 4 Grosse Pointe
News. Now it appears the new
"administration" at the Grosse
Pointe News is not so subtly
voicing its opinion as well via
the prominence and place-
ment of Quinn's "news" story.

Perhaps the Grosse Pointe
News is in need of some story
"leads." How about reporting
on the incredible South Choir
performance at Jefferson
Avenue Presbyterian Church
in December? Or the impres-
sive results from District Solo
and Ensemble Jan. 18 and 19?
Maybe a story chronicling the
preparation the choir is under-
going for its trip to Spain this
February. How about the in-
credible undertaking of
Bowen's upcoming production
of Les Miserables at South?

Perhaps the Grosse Pointe
News could do a story about
how many of this year's choir

seniors will be pursuing music
and theater studies at top uni-
versities next year. Qr, how
many of Ms. Bowen's former
students now have successful
careers in music and theater.

As a parent of one current
Bowen student and two
Bowen graduates, I am offend-
ed by the Grosse Pointe News'
focus on Ms. Bowen's traffic
offense.

My children's experience
with Ms. Bowen, spanning
more that eight years, has
been without question the
highlight of their high school
years.

ANDREA SULLIVAN
Grosse Pointe Farms

Personnel
information
To the Editor:

I was in attendance at the
Jan 14 Grosse Pointe Board of
Education meeting and am
still concerned about the pri-
vate information including
home phone numbers and
home addresses of the 57
teachers, who disagreed with
board member Ahmed Ismail
and was requested by him.

My first concern as a regis-
tered nurse, who works in this
community is, can a patient
contact my human resources
department and ask for my in-
formation? My second
thought was, why are our em-
ployees personal information
so readily available to the pub-
lic? Is there a policy in place to
provide this in a responsible
way?

Every one of the 57 teach-
ers, who signed that letter is
easily reached by using the e~
mail system provided by the
Grosse Pointe Public School
System. It is as easy as typing
in their first name, a period,
their last name and ending
with gpschools.org.

If clarification was indeed
Mr. Ismails intent, then the
professional, appropriate and
responsible way to do this
would be to use this system
during business hours.
. I believe our hard working
professionals are entitled to
uninterrupted family and free
time.

The district will never know
the true intent of the gather-
ing of this information.

A request for easily available
information was made of our
administration. I don't care if it
took five minutesor 10 days, if
it's easily available on the
Internet then do it yourself.

School administration is
busy with tfte business of the

district and shouldn't be called
upon by one individual to pull
together information for what
appears to be for personal use.
I think our resources can be
used more wisely.

JUUYGAFA
Grosse Pointe Woods

Assessment crisis
To the Editor:

Wake up Grosse Pointes,
schools and expensive ser-
vices alone do not make a
community desirable.

The latest assessment val-
ues indicate the Grosse
Pointes stand alone in their de-
cline in home assessment val-
ues. Grosse Pointe Park suf-
fered the worse decline in
Wayne County and Grosse
Pointe Woods was not far be-
hind.

The Grosse Pointe commu-
nities must wake up and real-
ize they are not the first choice
on many potential homeown-
er's lists. The Pointes must re-
alize the world has changed
and can no longer live on its
laurels.

The Grosse Pointes must ag-
gressively market and change
the community. For example, a
mortgage company in the
Pointes is moving downtown.
What are the Grosse Pointes
going to do to attract the folks
that are being relocated?

Where is the Grosse Pointe
welcome mat? All the Grosse
Pointes should allow short
term rentals to allow potential
residents to experience the
community while they are
looking for a home. A commu-
nity that denies short term
rentals is a community that de-
nies potential residents.

The Grosse Pointes must re-
examine their business strate-
gy. Are hair salons, banks and
dry cleaners the only desirable
businesses?

The resurgence of the
Village is a great start. What is
being done on the Hill or on
Mack Avenue in the Woods?

Potential residents want
schools, services and conve-
nience. It is unacceptable to
live in a community where one
needs to go to Troy or
Birmingham to shop.

What is the Grosse Pointe
Chamber of Commerce doing
to attract new business?

The Grosse Pointes love to
talk about their past, when are
they going to realize the world
has changed, and what- are
they going to do to guarantee
their future?

SCOTTBLAINE
Grosse Pointe Woods

GUEST OPINION By Bill Kalmar

Governor's goosebumps give me the chills

D
uring the recent
Michigan
Presidential
Primary, Gov.
Granholm re-

marked, "voting for a woman
who potentially will be the next
president of the United States
gave me goose bumps."

Well, having a governor, who
has taken leave of reality, is in
over her head, when seeking

It is unfortunate that seeking ways to attract
new business and relieving our burdensome
tax structure doesn't give her goosebumps.

guidance about Michigan's fu-
ture surrounded herself with
former Democratic governors,
whose DNA contains tax in-
creases, is the last to know
when companies are vacating

the state, grants pay increases
to state employees, refuses to
privatize services and endorses
taxes on services such as
singing telegrams—gives me
the chills and a huge headache.

It is unfortunate that seeking
ways to attract new business
and relieving our burdensome
tax structure doesn't give her
goosebumps.

But obviously when it comes
to leadership, lame ducks don't
get goose bumps!

Bill Kalmar is a former resi-
dent of Grosse Pointe and the
former director of the Michigan
Quality Council.
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SAY By Bob St. John

Cabrera, Willis trade brings smiles to Tiger fans

T
he Detroit Tigers'
much anticipated
season officially
starts in a couple of
weeks when players

report for spring tuning in
Lakeland, Fla. .

The season took on a new
meaning in early December
when "the Tigers officially an-
nounced the trade that brought
all-star third baseman Miguel
Cabrera and former all-star
pitcher Dontrelle Willis to the
team in exchange for promis-
ing youngsters Cameron
Maybin, Andrew Miller, Burke
Badenhop, Eugogio de la Cruz
and Mike Rubelo.

Not only does this trade help
the Tigers, but it makes Detroit
one of the favorites to win the
2008 World Series.

The addition of Cabrera to
the lineup compliments the
trade to. acquire shortstop
Edgar Renteria from the
Atlanta Braves.

This is what the Tigers' line-
up might look like come
Opening Day: 1. Curtis
Granderson, center field; 2.

Placido Polanco, second base;
3. Gary Sheffield, designated
hitter; 4. Magglio Ordonez,
right field; 5. Cabrera, third
base; 6. Carlos Guillen, first
base; 7. Ivan Rodriguez, catch-
er; 8. Jacque Jones, left field; 9.
Renteria, shortstop.

What about this for a pitch-
ing staff: Ace Justin Verlander,
followed by Willis, Jeremy
B6nderman, Kenny Rogers
and Nate Robertson.
• The defending World Series
champ Boston Red Sox have a
similar team, but it has less of-
fensive firepower and the start-
ing pitching is a step below.

The Los Angeles Angels of
Anaheim are in the same boat
with good pitching and an im-
proved offense with the addi-
tion of outfielder Torii Hunter.

Our Tigers will be the "team"
to beat, if Bonderman, Willis
and Robertson pitch better
than they did a year ago. Each
has the potential to win more
than 15 games.

Detroit could post a team
similar to the powerhouse
Baltimore Orioles squads of
the 1970s, when nearly its en-
tire starting pitching staff won
20 or more games. And the of-
fense helped the team win
more than 100 games a few
times that decade, thanks to
manager Earl Weaver's fa-
vorite play, a three-run homer.

The New York Yankees and
Cleveland Indians know these
trades put the Tigers ahead of
them.

Tigers' fans were quoted in
the daily newspapers the week
after the trade saying the trade
for Cabrera and Willis was
great. They also said General
Manager Dave Dombrowski

had some guts to pull this off
and has the will to win this up-
coming year, not a couple of
years down the road, if these
prospects pan out.

Only a couple of fans said
the trade was a bad idea be-
cause the team gave up too
much future talent for Cabrera
and Willis.

Don't these fans realize
Cabrera is only 24 years old
and a perennial .300 hitter with
power, while Willis is only 25
years old and has been to two
All-Star games in his five big-
league seasons.

Detroit's lineup is loaded
with .300 hitters'who can hit 20
or more homers. There is not a
team in Major League Baseball
that can boast a lineup this
stacked.

The Yankees have put to-
gether some loaded lineups, in-
cluding 1927 with Babe Ruth
and Lou Gehrig, and the 1998
squad which won 114 games.

Both of these Yankees pow-
erhouses went on to win the
World Series.

Can Detroit repeat these his-
toric feats? It can, if the pitch-
ing stays healthy, because the
offense will consistently hit.

In my opinion, the only thing
the Tigers need now is to solid-
ify its bullpen, because Joel
Zumaya will not be back until
after the All-Star game due to
shoulder surgery a couple of
months ago.

Closer Todd Jones, who is
nearing the end of his career,
will need to continue to save
victories, which he has done
during his previous two years
with the Tigers.

Owner Mike Hitch saw ticket
sales skyrocket the day after

the trade was announced.
He will enjoy sitting in his

owner's suite, while his Tigers
play in front of standing room

, only crowds night-in and
night-out.

Unfortunately, fan favorites
Brandon Inge and Marcus
Thames will see only spot duty,
unless they're traded for
prospects.

Inge will back up Cabrera at
third or play an outfield spot to
give Jacque Jones, Granderson
or Ordonez a day off. He can
also catch, which he did before
converting to a third baseman.

Thames will see time in the
outfield and DH, but most of.
his time will be on the bench.

Dombrowski's bold moves
havaiput the Tigers on top of
the baseball world. His reputa-
tion as one of the game's top
GM's improved with this sweet
deal.

Detroit sports fans can get
pretty spoiled this summer, es-
pecially if the Pistons and Red
Wings have long runs in their
respective postseasons.

Fans might have to venture
downtown to enjoy three pa-
rades. It can happen and the
odds are in Detroit's favor.

I will definitely be heading
downtown to purchase tickets.

Spring training begins in on-
ly a few weeks.

Go Tigers.'

STREETWISE ByReneeLanduyt

What was
your favorite
childhood
meal?

..I t f " - T r > V ; • • ; • ; - • ! • " ' • < - - '

If you have a quesUonyou
would like asked, drop us a
note at 96 Kercheval on The
Hill in GrossePointe Farms, MI
48236 or email to editor®
grossepointenews.com
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'Beef stroganoff, be-
cause it reminded me
of my grandmother,
who always made it.'
DR. KEVIN PRUSH
GrossePointe Woods.

'B'sghetti because we
always had it on
Wednesday night and
my mom made the
sauce from scratch.'
MELANlk JACOBS
HunUngton Woods

'My favorite was .
creamy tuna with
peas over toast. I
haven't had that for
about 16 years, but it
sounds good again!'
KIM BATE
Grosse Pointe Farms

'My mom was a terri-
ble cook, so I guess
my favorite was being
invited to a Mend's
house for dinner or
when we ordered a
pizza.'
SHELLYLOTOCKI
Sterling Heights

'My favorite was my
Aunt Mary's grape
leaves. I would eat at
least a dozen while
she was cooking
them.'
UDIA PRUSH
Grosse Pointe Woods

'Pizza, hot dogs,
peanut butter and jel-
ly, and of course
cake!'
RACHELLE BLACHUT
City of Grosse Pointe

FYI By Ben Burns

'When will the residents ever learn?'

T
he blogosphere is a
world of opinions,
commentary and
quotes on the
Internet, some of

them wise some of them witty,
some just plain inane, and a
fair number simply offensive
or in bad taste.

Blog is short for Web log,
many of which are like online
personal journals or diaries
that allow readers to comment
in response. There are thou-
sands, if not millions of them
out there.

A Grosse Pointe Woods
mom, who for two decades
wrote a human interest col-
umn for a Fort Wayne, Ind.
newspaper, offers some of the
most trenchant remarks on lo-
cal, state and national affairs
on her blog, nancynall.com.
And she draws a lot of com-
mentary from across the na-
tion.

Nancy Nail Derringer, who
has a last name that sounds
like a 1930's bank robber, free-
lances for a variety of local
magazines and publications
both on the Internet and be-
yond. And her lance is always
sharp.

For example after Hillary
Rodham Clinton, the only
contender of note, won the
Michigan Democratic primary
over "uncommitted,"

Derringer observed:
"The NYT's (New York

Times) map is interesting, in
that "uncommitted" carried
the Democrats' day in only two
outposts — the thinly populat-
ed mystery spot of Emmet
County, at the very tip of the
mitten, where only 1,222
Democratic ballots were cast,
but 49 percent of them went
forU.N. Committed, and the
Communistic pinko liberal
People's Republic of
Washtenaw, which should not
be counting on a warm hug
from President Hillary, by
God."

Or this about Mayor Kwame
Kilpatrick's latest imbroglio:

"Sing along with me now:
When will theyyy ever learn?
Oh when will they ever
learnnnn? Detroit's mayor be-
comes approximately the mil-
lionth public official to learn
that it's not the crime, it's the
cover-up."

And tiiis about her husband,
Alan:

"Idon't know what it is with
my husband and the gentle-
manly sports. You'd never -
know he was brought up
working-class in.a northwest
Ohio factory town. By rights,
we should have his-and-her
Barcaloungers with a freezer
full of venison in the garage,
and instead we own a million
dollars' worth of Hardy fishing
reels, half a dozen graphite
rods suitable for catching
everything from bluegill to 25-
pound salmon, a handmade
McKenzie River drift boat and
an English saddle (that last
one's mine). And now, soon, a
shotgun. One of our new

shooting books instructs us on
the etiquette of firing so as not
to hit your beaters, as well as
techniques for switching
quickly between multiple
weapons, the last predicated
on the assumption you have an
assistant standing next to you
with a second gun..

"Who are you going shoot-
ing with?" I asked. "Prince
Charles?"

Beaters, by the way, are folks
who move through the woods
driving game to where the
sporting types can gun the crit-
ters down from a stand.

Derringer is also the origi-
nator of a mostly dormant Web
site called "Grosse Pointe
Today" that includes weather
and news of the day and links
to regular columns by real live
alien.
. Beryl Ament of the Park,
who writes heartwarming
copy about life and times in
that fair city. Ament is a
Britisher, who calls herself an
alien, but has resided in this
country for more than half a
century.

The former Wayne State
University administrator has
written about Christmas pud-
ding, outhouses, and the death
of an ash tree in front of her
Park home.

The site also contains links
to the Grosse Pointe Chamber
of Commerce, the Grosse
Pointe News and assorted oth-
er organizations of interest.

Pond hockey
Former Grosse Pointer, Ford

Executive Chairman Bill Ford,
Jr. 50, plays pond hockey in
charity tournaments in Vail,

Colo., with his own team and
also with Red Wing alums who
journey to the upscale ski re-
sort.

Rocky Mountain News re-
porter Lynn DeBruin inter-
viewed the Ford exec for a Jan.
25 story. She wrote:

"Some came dressed in
threadbare college jerseys, or
with helmets barely secured to
their heads with jump-rope-
like chin straps.

'A few came without their
teeth—a consequence of a
puck or stick gone awry years
ago.

"No matter the age or the
skill level, most of the men—
and women—who braved
subfreezing temperatures at -.
the second Rocky Mountain
Pond Hockey Championships
were warmed by fond child-
hood memories."

"... Ford, whose team lost in
the over-40 final to the local
Geezers," told DeBruin that
"he has been playing since he
was a boy growing up on the
shores of Lake St. Clair."

"I remember Christmas Day,
after we opened presents, we'd
go out and play for hours and
hours. Ijust loved it," Ford
said. "You never got cold, and
if you did there was no one to
complain to anyway."

Dog Training
Shirley Julin, who used to

run her Best Friends dog train-
ing classes at the War
Memorial, advises me that she
is now offering sessions at
Arlington Elementary School
in St. Clair Shores. She has
been training dogs for more
than three decades and is a be-

havior counselor for the
Grosse Pointe Animal
Adoption Society.

I have seen her take a ram-
bunctious dog and settle it
down in a few minutes with
her low-key approach.

Julin and .her assistants be-

lieve that "Happiness is a well
trained dog," and they special-
ize in the gentle training of
your favorite Fido. [

She also offers classes in
Eastpointe and Roseville.
Contact her at (248) 393-0699
for more information.

Thinking of Selling?

Call us first

We'll open the vorld to you

We are working with clients

all over the country helping them

sell their diamonds, fine & estate jewelry,

signed pieces, and small objects daft .

DuMoifchelle Palm Beach -New York-

GroeflePdBteIWm«.MI 48236

(800) 475-8898 of 013) 884-4800
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Ellen Bowen directs the Pointe Singer Ensemble at the Michigan District Solo and Ensemble Festival.

Students earn accolades
On Friday, Jan. 18, and

Saturday, Jan. 19, almost 100
students from the Grbsse
Pointe South High School
Vocal Music Department per-
formed at the Michigan District
Solo and Ensemble Festival.

The event, sponsored by the
Michigan School Vocal Music
Association, was held at
Avondale High School in
Auburn Hills.

Of the 88 students who per-
formed, 64 received 1st divi-
sion ratings for excellent per-
formances and qualified to
compete in the State Solo and
Ensemble Festival, April 4 and
5, at Walled Lake High School.

First Division Ratings —
Ensembles:

Freshman Women's
Ensemble, Freshman Select
Women,
Freshman/Sophomore Men's
Ensemble, Crazy 8, South
Singers, Men of South Singers,
Men of Pointe Singers, Women
of Pointe Singers, Pointe
Singers, Lauren Jacob
and Stephanie Aboukasm
Duet First Division Ratings
Individuals:

Stephanie Aboukasm,
Jessey Baker, Angela Berg,
Jillian Black, Galen Calligan,
Grace Denton, Clare Dice,
Alana Dickson, Madeline
Dombi, Bridget Doyle, Sarah
Duffield, Daniel Dusina, Carrie
Fisk, Emily Flom, Michael
Gilbert, Julie Griffin, Katie

Griffin, Jack Hessburg, Emily
Holm, Lauren Jacob, Maggie
Kelch, Tripp Kennedy, Chris
Khoury, Janice.Kulik, Maggie
Leins, Alexandria Mahone,
Laura Manardo, lisa Martin,
Ben Maters, Brad Menchl, Rob
Montgomery, Gabe Moss,
Danielle Muawad, Natalie
Nihem, Alexandra Papas, Greg
Papas, lindsey Phillips, Nicole
Pytel, Divya Raman, Alyssa
Rickard, Cassie Rickard, Holly
Roseborough, Nick Ryder, Kelli
Sarakun, Joey Simon, Mack
Sterr, Bobby Sullivan, Aedriell
Tard, Marybeth Train,
Ajith Varghese, Dana Vreede.
Allyson Webb, Kathleen
Weston and Katie Whitney.

Twenty two individual per-

formances received a 2nd divi-
sion rating for good perfor-
mances. They were: Brittany
Bachteal, Jaclyn Beach,
Anna Bickerstaff, Rachelle
Blachut, Eliisa Bojanic, Kyla
Cools, Maggie Davisson,
Ali Dulchavsky, Billy
Finkenstaedt, Sarah Harness,
Maggie Hartz, Amanda
Harvey, Eddy Harvey, Mateja
Kbpcak, Lara McCann-Moran,
Madison Murphy, Andrew
Pytel, Natalie Rhodes, Brittany
Schwikert, Tory Spangler,
Hannah Sparrow and Lara
Willmarth.

The Grosse Pointe South
Choirs are directed by Ellen J.
Bowen and accompanied by
RichardWolf.

And the winner is...
The Grosse Pointe Public

Library will celebrate the 80th"
annual Academy Awards with
"Oscar Night at the Library,"
a discussion with John

Monaghan, longtime film, liter-
ature and English teacher at
Grosse Pointe South High
School. It will be held at 7:30
p.m. Wednesday, Feb 13 at the
Woods branch library, 20680

Mack.
Monaghan will exam this

year's nominated films as well
as films overlooked by the
academy. Attendees will also
get a chance to view clips from
the nominated films.

Monaghan, a Grosse Pointe
native, has written about
movies for various metro
Detroit publications for the past

IIvery Thursday, wt provide the Pointes with complete coverage of the
people, organizations, businesses, sales and events in our community.

We make it easy for Pointers to
stay informed about their schools .
and local sports, health, family ,
events, real estate, business,
restaurants, gardening, antiques,
home maintenance and more.
Our readers benefit from our

advertising and the eastside's best
classifieds, and the local award
winning real estate section
YourHome.
Our subscribers save each week and

have the paper delivered in their mail.
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20 years including many re-
views and film related articles
for the Detroit Free Press.

His favorite films are
Hollywood crime thrillers of
the 1940s and 1950s.

The program is free, but seat-
ing is limited. To register call
(313) 343-2074, ext. 220 or visit
gp.lib.mi.us.

New trustee
At its January board meeting,

Grosse Pointe Public Library
trustees welcomed their newest
member, Steve Matthews.

Matthews will represent the
Harper Woods portion of the
Grosse Pointe Public School
District. He was selected last
week by the Harper Woods
City Council to fill the trustee
seat left vacant by James Haley
who retired from the board last
November.

Matthews is currently an em-
ployee of the Troy School
District.

"I want to thank Steve
Matthews for volunteering
and bringing his substantial
experience to this position,"
Bob Klacza, board president
said. "He was previously on this
library board in its beginning
years."

Matthew's term will end
June of 2010.

Heidelberg
News
Marlene Hamel of Grosse Pointe Woods and Marge Slezak of

Grosse Pointe Farms took the Grosse Pointe News to Heidelberg,

Germany, where they saw the Hotel Zum Ritter St. Georg, built

in 1592. The two were attending the christening of Hamel's

grandson, Kieran, son of Leslie and Hall Henn. When you travel,

take along a copy of the Grosse Pointe News and have a photo

taken of yourself in front of a local landmark. Send the picture,

along with a few words to: The Grosse Pointe News Reader, 96

Kercheval, Grosse Pointe Farms, MI 48236; or e-mail to

editor@grossepointenews.com. Your picture will appear in an

upcoming issue.

Family Day at historical museum
Celebrate Black History

Month at the Detroit Historical
Museum's annual African
American Family Day from 11
a.m. to 4 p.m. Saturday, Feb. 2.

This event is free for families
of all ethnic backgrounds to
celebrate African American
history and culture.

This year, in partnership
with the International Detroit
Black Expo, African American
owned and operated business-
es featuring entrepreneurs and
their stories will be spotlighted.

For more information, call
(313) 833-1805 or visit.
detroithistorical.org.

— I
10/18/07

CITY OF HARPER WOODS
WAYNE COUNTY, MICHIGAN

SYNOPSIS: REGULAR CITY COUNCIL MEETING

The regular City Council meeting was called to order by Mayor Kenneth A. Poynter at 7:30 P.M.

ROLL CALL: All Councilpersons were present.

MOTIONS PASSED
1) To receive, approve and file the minutes of the regular City Council meeting held

December 17, 2007.
2) That the agenda of the regular City Council meeting having been acted upon, the meeting

is hereby adjourned at 8:40 p.m.

RESOLUTION PASSED
1) To approve the following items on the Consent Agenda: (1) Approve the Accounts Payable

listing for Check Numbers 82641 through 82878 in the amount of $1,478,681.01 as
submitted by the City Manager and Finance Director, and further, authorize the Mayor
and City Clerk to sign the listing. (2) Approve payment to Nu Appearance in the amount of
$10,390.99 for contractual lawn cutting and fall cleanup in various areas of the city,
including City Hall, the Library, DPW and the 1-94 service drive. (3) Approve the
appointments to the various boards and commissions as listed on the attached
memorandum from the City Clerk.

2) To approve payment to Cortis Brothers Trucking and Excavating in the amount
of $185,381.86 for Progress Payment No. 1 on the Johnston Park Tennis Court Project,

, #180-096.
3) To approve payment to Wayne County in the amount of $138,348.50 for the operation and

maintenance of the Milk River Drain for the 1st quarter of FY2008.
4) That in accordance with Section 25-40 of the City Code of Ordinances a fee in the amount

of forty dollars ($40,00) is hereby established for the release of vehicles impounded by the
Police Department.

5) To approve payment to AAA Pipe Cleaning Corp. in the amount of $42,691.42 for Progress
Payment No. 4 on the 2007 Sewer Cleaning and CCTV Investigation Project, #180-100.

6) To adopt the Performance and Indemnification Resolution related to the City's Permit to
Work on County Roads..

7) lb adjourn to executive session for the purpose of discussing labor contract negotiations.

Kenneth A. Poynter, Mayor

Published: GPN, Jan. 31, 2008

Mickey D. Todd, City Clerk
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Print received
Members of the Gallagher and Aubrey families joined Dr. Mark

Weber, president of the Grosse Pointe War Memorial

Association, to dedicate Ron Stark's print, "Iwo Jima, the First

Flag," to the War Memorial. Pictured left to right are Mary Ann

Gallagher Aubrey, Weber and Thomas A. Gallagher of Grosse

Pointe Woods, former Grosse Pointe Woods resident Edmund

Aubrey and Ronald Aubrey. MaryAnn and Ronald Aubrey pre-

sented the print to the War Memorial in honor of their fathers,

Thomas A. Gallagher and Edmund Aubrey, both World War II

veterans. Gallagher served as an Army lieutenant labor officer in

the 602nd Ordnance Ammunition Company. In the Italian

Campaign, he prepared the front line situation maps for Brig.

Gen. Urban Niblo. Prior to this duty, Gallagher served in the

North African Campaign and the Sicilian Invasion. Aubrey

served as a tech sergeant tail gunner for the 15th Air Force. His

777th Squadron, 464th Bomb Group was based in Foggia

Pantanella, near Bari, Italy. Aubrey's 50 missions were to

Romania, Germany, Austria, Yugoslavia, Northern Italy and

the Southern France Invasion. Both veterans spoke of their war

experiences. Weber spoke of the valor of the World War n veter-

ans and of all the people who have served and currently serve in

the U.S. armed services. Vi Lindberg, the widow of Chuck

Lindberg, one of the Marines pictured raising the American flag

over Iwo Jima, spoke with the families via a teleconference call.

Mr. Lindberg signed this print before his death in June 2007. The

print is on display in the Veteran's Room of the Grosse Pointe

War Memorial Alger House.

PHOTO COURTESY OF KATHLEEN GALLAGHER KEDZIERSKI

OHwireless

Proof needed
First-time applicants for a

Michigan operator's license or
identification card must now
prove established permanent
legal presence in the United
States.

The attorney general recent-
ly issued an opinion stating un-
der current law the state can-
not issue a driver' s license to
anyone, who is not in the coun-
try legally and permanently.

Applicants for an original
driver' s license or state-issued
identification card must now
meet four standards, in addi-
tion to Michigan' s driving and
physical health requirements,
by providing documentation
of:

•A valid Social Security
number or ineligibility for one.
Applicants must bring their
Social Security card or other
acceptable document or a let-
ter of ineligibility from the U.S.
Social Security Administration
to a Secretary of State office.

•Legal and permanent pres-
ence in the United States.

•Their identity, legal name
and date of birth.

•Michigan residency.
A list of acceptable

documents is available at
Michigan.gov/sos. The Web
site includes information on
obtaining a Social Security

card from the federal govern-
ment.

"This is one more tool in our
initiative to bolster Michigan's
border and document securi-
ty," said Secretary of State
Terri Lynn Land.

Land is also working to en-
hance driver's license security.
She has proposed the creation
of an upgraded standard dri-
ver' s license and an optional
enhanced version that can be
used in place of a passport at
the Canadian border. The plan
is being considered by the state
legislature.

Her proposal also would
change the law to allow resi-
dents, who are in the U.S.
legally, but temporarily, to ap-
ply for an upgraded standard
license.

"Under the attorney gener-
al's opinion, those who are in
the country legally, but on tem-
porary student or work visas,
are ineligible for a Michigan li-
cense, though most still can
drive using the license of their
home country," Land said. "We
need to reconsider that aspect
of the law to avoid unintended
consequences for individuals
or job providers. I encourage
citizens to voice their support
for our proposal and contact
their legislators."

SPRING SALE
JANUARY 25 - MARCH 10

DESIGN SERVICES 20 STANDARD FINISHES PREMIUM FABRICS

Save up to 50%. Limited time only.

Exclusive
-* Verizon Wireless

£&' music phone

*'
X

fc-

LG VXS35O- $99 99 2-yr. price
rebate. With new 2-yr. activate

Orange, Green or Silver
$129.99 2-yr. price
-$5Gff]8fMrr rebate.
With raw 2-yr. activation.

BlackBerry® Pearl™
$249 99 2-yr p r i c e - 1 ' . , il i [-!•:•-"• CO
Advanced DeviceCre ' .".': . • 2 -i \ i . • m/ after rebate on Nationwide Emat i

3

i

$ after rebate

with 3 Megapixel camera jf? • -"^vy ;-
$199.99 2-yr.0ice-$SO;mail-in rebate.
Wjth new 2-yr. acSvatfen.

Switch to America's Most r-t-i:-?k Wireless Network.'

Free Shipping: 1.877.2BUY.VZW verizonwireless.com any store

VERIZON WIRELESS COMMUNICATIONS STORES A U T H O R I Z E D RETAILERS Equipment pric«, models & return policy vaty by location.
Authorized Retailers may impose additional equipment related charges, including cancellation fees.

.ALLEN PARK
(3128Fair!aneDr.
313-271-9255
AUBURN HILLS
Great Lakes Crossing Mall
248-253-1799
BRIGHTON
8159Cha!lis,Ste.C
(off Grand River,
in front ofTarget)
810-225-4789

CANTON
42447 Ford Rd.
(corner of FordS
Lilley Rds.; Canton Corners)
734-844-0481
DEARBORN
24417 Ford Rd.
(just west of Telegraph) |
313-278-4491 I
FairlaneMali
(3rd floor next to Sears)
313-441-0168 |
DETROIT '
14126 Woodward
(Model T Plaza)
313-8697392

> 300 Renaissance Center
(level 1 between
towers 200 & 300)
313-567-4055

FARMINGTON HILLS
31011 Orchard Lake Rd
(southwest corner of
Orchard Lake Rd.& 14
MileRd.)
248-538-9900
FENTON
17245 Silver Pkwy.
(in the Sears Plaza)
810-62.9-2733
FT.GRATIOT
4129 24th Ave.
810-385-1231
LAKE ORION
2531S. Lapeer Rd.
(Orion Mall 2 miles
north of the Palace)
248-393-6800

.LIVONIA
'29523 Plymouth Rd.

(atMiddlebelt)
734-513-9077

.MONROE
'2161 Mall Rd.

(in front of Kohl's)
734-241-4099
NORTHVILLE
Three Generations Plaza
20580 HaggertyRd.
734-779-0148
NOVI
4302512 MileRd.
(Twelve Oaks Service Dr.
north of Sears)
248-305-6600

Twelve Oaks Mall
(lower level play area)
PONTIAC/WATERFORD
454!elegraphRd.
(across from Summit
Place Mail)
248-335-9900

ROCHESTER HILLS
3035 S. Rochester Rd.
(at Auburn Rd.)
248-853-0550
ROYAL OAK
31921 Woodward Ave,
(at Normandy)
248-549-4177
ST. CLAIR SHORES
26401 Harper Ave.
(at 101/2 Mile)
586-777-4010
SOUTHFIELD
28117TelegraphRd.
(south of 12 Mile fid.)
248-358-3700
STERLING HEIGHTS
45111 ParkAve.
(M-59&M-53,
Utica Park Plaza}
586-997-6500

Lakeside Mall
(iower level, Sears court)
TAYLOR
23495 Eureka Rd.
(across from
Southland Mall)
734-287-1770

TROY
1913 E. Big Beaver Rd.
(Troy Sports Center)
248-526-0040
Oakland Mall
(inside main entrance,
next to food court)
WARREN

'5745 Twelve MileRd.,
Heritage Village
586-578-0955
WESTLAND
35105 Warren Rd.
(southwest corner
of Warren & Wayne Rds.)
734-722-7330
OR VISIT THE
VERIZON WIRELESS
STOREAT
CIRCUIT CITY
AUBURN KILLS
BRIGHTON

NEW!
BLOOMFIELDTOWNSHIP
DEARBORN
LAKESIDE
NEW!
MADISON HEIGHTS
NOVI
ROSEVELLE
TAYLOR
TROY
WESTLAND

IN COLLABORATION WITH

Alcatel'Lucent
Free Handset Software Upgrade!

See store for Return/Exchange Policy.

CANTON
CellularandMore
734-404-0191
734-981-7440
CLARKSTON
Cellular Technologies
248-625-1201
CLAWS0N
Communications USA
248-280-6390

COMMERCE
Cellular Source
248-360-9400

Wireless Tomorrow
248-669-1200
FARMINGTON HILLS
Cellular City

FERNDALE
Communications USA
248-542-5200

FT.GRATIOT
Wireless Solutions
810-385-3400
GROSSE POINTE
Authorized Cellular
313-417-1000
MACOMB
Authorized Cellular
586-566-8555

MONROE
Herkimer Radio
734-242-0806

Herkimer Too
734-384-7001
MT CLEMENS
Authorized Cellular
586-468-7300

NORTHVILLE
Cellular Cellutions
248-349-8116
OXFORD
Wireless Network
248-628-8400

PLYMOUTH
20/20 Communications
734-456-3200

Wireless USA
734-414-9510
ROSEVILLE
Authorized Cellular
586-293-6664
ROYALOAK
Cellular Cellutions
248-582-1100
Fusion Communications
248-549-7700

SOUTH LYON
Cell City
248-587-1100
SOUTHFIELD
Wireless USA
248-395-2222

STERLING HEIGHTS
Authorized Cellular
586-795-8610
Wireless Network
586-997-1777
TAYLOR
Cell Phone Warehouse
734-374-4472
TROY
The Wireless Shop
248458-1111

UTICA
Mobile2Mobile Wireless
586-739-9977

WARREN
Multilinks
586-497-9800

Wireless Network
586-573-7599

WESTBLOOMFIELO
Global Wireless
248-681-7200
WIXOM
Auto One
248-960-0500

WOODHAVEN
Cellular Connections
734-675-9400

Proud sponsor of the
Detroit Pistons

Activation fee/line; $35 ($25 for secondary Family SharePlan® lines w/ 2-yr. Agmts).

IMPORTANT CONSUMER INFORMATION: Subject to Customer Agmt, Calling Plan, rebate form and credit approval. Up to $175 early termination fee/line & other charges. Offers
and coverage, varying by service, not available everywhere. Rebates take up to 6 weeks. Limited-time offers. While supplies last. Shipping charges may apply. Device capabilities:
Add'l charges & conditions apply. Network details and coverage maps at verizonwireless.com. © 2008 Verizon Wireless GTEM
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Honored
Walsh College honors Grosse Pointe

family PAGEISA

SCHOOLS OBITUARIES AUTOMOTIVE

POUPARD ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

unveils Dr. Kin
By Bob St. John
StaffWriter

Poupard Elementary
School's 358 students honored
Martin Luther King Jr.
Thursday, Jan. 24, during an
assembly.

Each student took a turn glu-
ing Ihe 660 dominoes it took to
create a portrait of the Civil
Rights leader, which was un-
veiled during the assembly.

"Thank you for coming to
our special assembly honoring
the great Dr. Martin Luther
King Jr.," said Poupard

Principal Penny Stocks. "It is
up to all of you boys and girls
to keep his dream alive and
treat everyone with respect."

John Clinkscales, a parent of
a Poupard student, played the
part of King. He gave students,
parents, teachers and Grosse
Pointe Public School District
Assistant Superintendent of
Human Resources Tom
Harwood dozens of facts per-
taining to King's life.

Each grade chipped in by ei-
ther singing a song, reading a
famous King quote or reading
sections of his biography.

PHOTOS BY BOB ST JOHN

Each Poupard student glued dominoes to create the portrait of
£ Jr., shown above.

Students sang the songs,
"Follow the Drinking Gourd,"
and "We Shall Overcome."

Stocks recited the following
poem by educator and poet
Jamie McKenzie. She read:

"Some kings rule their king-
doms sitting down,

Surrounded by luxury, soft
cushions and fans,

But this King stood strong
stood proud
stood tall,

When the driver told Rosa
"Move to the back of the

bus!"
When the waiter told stu-

dents
"We don't serve your kind!"
When the Mayor told voters
"Your vote don't count!"
And when the sheriff told

marchers
"Get off our streets!".
using fire hoses, police dogs

and cattle prods
to move them along,
This King stood strong
stood proud
stood tall,
Speaking of peace
of love
and children
hand in hand
free at last
free at last,

When some yelled for vio-
lence

For angry revenge
An eye for an eye
And a tooth for a tooth,

to all

Taking part in the portrait unveiling were from left, Poupard Principal Penny Stocks, Arlene
Arrington, representing Sen. Martha Scott, Whitney Marshall and John Clinkscales.

He stood his ground
Preaching peace,

And when some spit out hate,
He stood there smiling
Spreading love,
Until it rolled like the sea

across the land,
Sweeping away Jim Crow
Breaking down the walls
Ringing the bell
Joyfully,
For Freedom

Until
Standing on the mountain

top,

They shot him
Coldly,
Hoping to see him fall
Hoping to put him away
To bring him low,

But this King
even in death,
even today
stands strong
stands proud
stands tall,
And we remember.

At the end of the assembly,
Arlene Arrington, a represen-
tative from State Sen. Martha

Scott's office, and Clinkscales
glued in the final two dominoes
to complete the King portrait,
which was shown to the those
in attendance.

The portrait idea was created
by Robert Borsch and brought
to Poupard by Whitney
Marshall, whose mom, Sandra,
works in the school office.

Students held their official
King March the following day,
Friday, Jan. 25.

King was born Michael
Luther King, Jr., Jan. 15, 1929,
and was assassinated April 4,
1969, in Memphis, Tenn.

spiritual development
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ST. JOAN OF ARC SCHOOL

School
open

St. Joan of Arc Catholic
School will hold an open house
and learning fair from 6:30 to
8:30 p.m. Thursday, Jan. 31.

The school is located at
22415 Overlake Drive, St. Clair
Shores.

This annual event gives visi-
tors interested in the school
and parents of children cur-
rently attending the school an
opportunity to get a first hand
look at the St. Joan of Arc edu-
cational experience. *

It's a time to meet teachers,
administrators and current stu-
dents. There will be special
greeters, tour guides and hos-
pitality for visitors new to the
school.

The learning fair portion of
the event features special dis-
plays, demonstrations and pre-
sentations.

A Promethean Board
demonstration by eighth-grade
students showing presenta-
tions they created about the
1940s in honor of the school's
60th anniversary will be
shown.

The school's robotics club
will showcase its ability to
build and program robots to
execute commands in the
school's science lab.

The library will feature a dis-
play of storybook quilts, on
loan from the Quilt Guild of

Metro Detroit, depicting
scenes and characters from
children's literature.

Also of note is an exhibit of
student artwork, featuring one
piece of art from every child in
first through eighth grade.
Homeroom classes, school
clubs and sports programs will
participate and be highlighted
during this event.

The school's academic pro-
grams run through grade
eight, beginning with three-
and four-year-old preschool
and including the young fives
in half- and full-day kinder-
garten programs.

Individual appointments to
visit the preschool classroom
may be made through the
school office at (586) 775-8370.
St. Joan of Arc's preschool pro-
gram is licensed by the state.

St. Joan of Arc has been ac-
credited by the Michigan Non-
public School Accrediting
Agency since 1992 and meets
or exceeds its 14 standards.
This accreditation certifies the
effectiveness of curriculum, re-
ligious formation, the activities
program, student services, pro-
fessional planning, parent in-
volvement, and overall pro-
gram effectiveness.

For more information, visit
stjoan.net or call (586) 775-
8370.

UNIVERSITY LIGGETT SCHOOL

Our Lady Star of the Sea Catholic School Principal Patricia Stumb, far left; Assistant Principal Julia Aemisegger, far right; and third-' ;

graders, in front from left, Paul Marcuz, Mora Downs and Bennett Burke, welcomed visitors to the school Monday, Jan. 28, the firsts

day of Catholic Schools Week. Taking the tour were, back row from left, Todd Zoellick, United States Department of Education '. •;.

deputy secretary's regional representative Region V; Tamra Hull, director of marketing for Catholic schools; and Sister Mary \

; Gehringer, superintendent of Catholic schools. . . -;,

Honored
University Liggett School baseball , w ,
cently received the Division IV Coach of the Year Award from the
Michigan High School Baseball Coaches Association. ULS facul-
ty member and middle school baseball coach, Glynn Conley, left,
presented Camini with the award.

Grosse Pointe South parent Laurie McCarron has been sending messages and packages to U.S. troops in Iraq. Her daughter is cur-

rently a freshman and a member of the choir. McCarron spoke to Choir Director Ellen Bowen, and they decided it wouid be great if

the students could record holiday carols, greetings and patriotic songs for the troops this year This recording would then air on the

Armed Services Radio Network. South Principal Al Diver gave the musicians permission to record the CD at the high school and

have a mother's support group, the Blue Star Mothers, and Col. Norman Fabian, above center, present at the recording to send mes-

sages to the troops. The Grosse Pointe South Choir students recorded the carols and greetings, Wednesday, Dec. 19. Three different

groups pesformed: South Singers, Women's Choir, and the Pointe Singers. A professional radio producer, who works with the

Armed Service Radio Network, was on hand to produce the CD. CMS Set. Greg Holmes said that the CD aired on the Armed

Services Radio Network Christmas Day between 9 a.m. and 4 p.m.

Exercise plans tailored to your pets
Full size catf "condos"
Professional grooming services
Convenient pick-up/delivery services

4209 Griswold .tifx-id, Port fiv?rors

(810) 984-2330

17150 Waterloo, Grosse Pointe,
313-885-4600

48230

Please come visit our Nursery School,
meet our staff and learn about our

developmental early childhood program.

ROSSE POihSTE NORTH

event
g soon

Grosse Pointe North High
School is having its 40th an-
niversary celebration from 7
p.m. to midnight, Friday, April
25, at the Grosse Pointe War
Memorial, 32 Lakeshore,
Grosse Pointe Farms.

"We're looking forward to
having North parents, staff and
alumni over the age of 21 at-
tending," said Valray Schmitt,

the event representative.
Entertainment will be pro-

vided by The Caverners: A
Beatles Tribute Band. There
will be a strolling dinner, cash
bar, silent auction and raffle.- .

Tickets are $40 per person. A
limited number of tickets are
available.

For more information, visit
gpschools.org/northparent.
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PARCELLS SV9EDDLE SCHOOL

Students, staff
celebrate unity
By Bob St. John
StaffWriter

Students are making sure
everyone who walks down

around the auditorium, uniting
everyone.

"Our goal is to unite our
school as a community," said
student Leena Raza. "One pro-

each hallway is seen as an ject we have created is a col-
equal.

The Parcells Middle School's
UNITE club is working to-
wards accomplishing this feat.

Members showcased their
unique perspective Friday, Jan.
25, during a special assembly
celebrating Martin Luther
King, Jr. Day.

"Our goal is to bring aware-
ness of tolerance and diversity
to the students and staff of
Parcells," said student Tori Lee.
"Tolerance means to accept
others even though they may
be different from us in some
way."

Students and staff watched
a Power Point presentation,
about diversity as seen through
the eyes of King.

They also created a green
and gold chain they linked

lage of all the students in the
school."

Principal Mark Mulholland
capped the assembly by thank-
ing the students and staff for
living up to the club's unity
motto.

"Martin Luther King, Jr. had
a dream that all people would
live in peace and harmony,"
Mulholland said. "We can car-
ry out that dream here at
Parcells Middle School."

Mulholland also quoted for-
mer President Jimmy Carter.

"We have become not a melt-
ing pot, but a beautufll mosa-
ic," Carter said. "Different peo-
ple, different beliefs, different
yearnings, different hopes, dif-
ferent dreams."

"We are united at Parcells,"
Mulholland concluded.

PHOTO BY BOB ST. JOHN

Members of Parcells Middle School's UNITE dub are from left, Renee Walton, Catie Williams, Perry Jemison, Tori Lee, Sade
Rayford, Saim Raza, Leena Raza, Laura Hidalgo and Jalen Land.

GROSSE POINTE NORTH

Quite a
performance
Grosse Pointe North recently held its annual string extravaganza

and Band-o-Rama to the delight of hundreds of fans, who

packed the gymnasium. Pictured left is the Grosse Pointe North

concert band under the direction of David Cleveland.

PHOTO COURTESY OF CONNIE LEANNAIS

G.P.P.S.S.

Call to
enroll
students

Parents of students who will
be entering the Grosse Pointe
Public School System for the
2008-09 school year are asked
to call district officials at (313)
432-3083 to schedule an enroll-
ment appointment.

All forms are available on
the district's Web site,
gpschools.org or by calling the
local elementary school or the
school district's central office.

The district uses enrollment
data for budgeting and staffing
purposes starting in early
spring. The sooner a student is
enrolled, the more accurate the
data.

Kindergarten information
nights are also currently under
way at each local elementary
school. They offer parents an
opportunity to learn more
about each school and the dis-
trict's educational program.

Extended
kindergarten

Parents interested in learn-
ing more about the district-
wide extended kindergarten
day program may call (313)
432-3083.

Tuition this year will be
$3,750 and forms, down-pay-
ment, and enrollment applica-
tions, must be completed by
Feb. 27.

The lottery drawing will be
held March 3.

Street Cooperat;V

, . r

Wednesday, February 6th • 6 00 pm - 7 30 pm

NOW enrolling for the 2008 - 09 school year.
All children are welcome to the open house.

Space will be limited.

For questions, please call
(313)432-3800

20090 Morningside
Grosse Pointe Woods

. i

l i ' l I O . I i N j i ' , • ; . ' f
l l ; I fjij\j\,'\* \* ' f , n

-I M'lOKt-

d £nw\\mq Mow W 2008/09
CROSS1; POINTE

C\PPSS SWolIirienf Process - Deadline F&bmaty 27 foi* K-1st grades

For all new students, residency and enrollment must be processed
by appointment at 389 St. Clair Ave. To schedule an appointment,
call 313/432-3083.

Packets may be picked
up at your neighborhood
elementary school, central
office, or downloaded
from the district website
www.gpschools.org.
We use registration data
determine staffing.

Extended Day Program
applications
and downpayments are due
Feb. 27. The lottery drawing
will be March 3. Seven sites
for extended day
kindergarten will run
depending upon
enrollment. These are:
Barnes, Defe^ Trombly,
Richard, Kerby, Monteith
and Ferry.

qualified, committed teachers, creative energy, literacy activities, physical education

-EXPERIENCE-
new friendships, learning by doing, enrichment classes - trench, cooking,

dance, Kalo for Kids Fitness, Make it Take it Library

+Key me,av\ \\\e. wond to you-
we pvA a wocld-clags education

- kandsin

TODDLER 1-2 V2 yr.
TRANSITION 2 V2 -3 yr.
PRESCHOOL 3-4 yr.
YOUNG 5's
KINDERGARTEN
Flexible scheduling offered; Half day, Full day
6:30am-6:00pm
Year round child care

DEDICATED TO EACH CHILD AS A TOTAL
INDIVIDUAL-SOCIALLY, EMOTIONALLY^
PHYSICALLY AND COGNITIVELY
AND CARING SCHOOL ENVIRONMENT.

2008-09 SCHOOL YEAR
REGISTRATION BEGINS

SATURDAY, FEBRUARY 23> 8-10arh

22150 Marter Road
St. Clair Shores, MI 48080

PHONE: 586-772-4477

Completion of
$1.7 million renovation
and expansion program

Recipient of the
Governor's Quality Care Award

Grosse Pointe Public School System • p:313/432-3083 • f:313.432-3002 • www.gpschoo1s.org

A LIFETIME OF LEARNING
BEGINS AT ASS f . " N
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COLLEGE

Pointer
honored
by Walsh

College recently dedi-
cated the 37,000-square-foot
Jeffery W Barry Center in
memory of the former Pointer,
who served as its president
from 1970 to 1991.

Barry of Grosse Pointe
Woods died in 2006 after a long
illness.

As part of the dedication,
%folsh awarded Future Leaders
Scholarship to children and
grandchildren of Walsh stu-
dents and alumni.

A luncheon followed for for-
mer Barry Scholarship recipi-
ents and Barry's family. The
Barry Endowed Scholarship
was created in 1991 to honor
Barry's retirement. Initially
funded by a donation from
Sam and Jean Frankel, nearly
200 %&lsh undergraduate ac-
counting students have bene-
fitted from the fund.

The $10.5-million expansion
is an environmentally sustain-
able building designed toward
attaining a bronze-level LEED
certification. Architects are
Chicago-based Valerio Dewalt
Train Associates, a national ar-
chitectural practice known for
its expertise in sustainable de-
sign.

;E CANVASSER

Barry family members, from left, are Mindy Barry of Grosse Pointe Park; Mary Phillips, sister; and Jeff Barry Jn of Grosse Pointe Park; brother John C. Barry;
Jane Barry, wife of Jeffery W Barry, of Wilmington, N.C. and formerly of Grosse Pointe Farms; Walsh College President Stephanie W. Bergeron; daughter Lydia
Kelly; and Patrick Kelly, of Winnetka, III.

FAMILY CENTER

Group hosts tech forum
Learn to be a partner, work-

ing with children to enhance
learning and to protect them
at a one-night seminar spon-
sored by the Family Center
and parent groups of Grosse
Pointe's public high schools
and middle schools.

Your Child and Technology,
What Every Parent Needs to
Know, an evening program for
elementary school, middle
school, and high school par-
ents, will take place from 7 to
9 p.m. Tuesday, Feb. 5, at
Grosse Pointe North High
School, Room B312.

It is open to the public and
free of charge.

Speakers will address how
tech savvy children think, how
technology is being used to en-
hance learning in schools, the
social use of technology and
how to safeguard children.

Grace Smith, Grosse Pointe
Public Schools technology
curriculum coordinator, will
address how technology is
used to enhance learning in

schools, as well as school dis-
trict safety features.

Joe Bracken of Grosse
Pointe Geeks will talk about
and demonstrate the social us-
es of technology including
Facebook, MySpace, and
YouTube. He will share how
we can protect children on
home computers.

Scott Bruns, Grosse Pointe
Public School District psychol-
ogist, will discuss how tech-
nology impacts the way chil-
dren think, learn and social-

ize.
This program is sponsored

by The Family Center and the
Mothers' Club of Grosse
Pointe South, the Grosse
Pointe North Parents' Club
and Norsemoms, the Pierce
PTO, Brownell PTO and
ParcellsPTO.

Space is limited and reser-
vations are requested. For
more information, call The
Family Center at (313) 432-
3832 or visit familycenter-
web.org.

REAL ESTATE ONE

Valentine's
Day Tea

at Sunrise on Vernier

Thursday, February 14th • 2:30pm-4:00pm
Join in the festivities as Sunrise on Vernier hosts a Valentine's Day Tea.

Caregivers are welcome to bring your senior loved ones to enjoy a special

tea and a therned arts & crafts activity.

While you're here, meet our team, tour our community and find out we

do to make our community a place seniors are proud to call home. Since

1981, Sunrise Senior Living has been committed to providing seniors,

families and caregivers with innovative senior living and care options,

RSVP for you and a friend today!

SUNRISE
ASSISTED LIVING9

Sunrise on Vernier 313-642-2000 1850 Vernier Road, Grosse Pointe Woods, Ml 48236

Alzheimer's Care

For more information and a FREE online newsletter, visit
www.sunriseseniQrliving.com

Realtors take the plunge'
Real Estate One employees

will be diving into the icy wa-
ter at Belle Isle Saturday, Feb.
9, as part of the 2008 Law
Enforcement Torch Run Polar
Plunge to benefit Special
Olympics Michigan.

The Rea! Estate One team,
known as the Priceless
Plungers, is comprised of the
Real Estate One owners, cor-
porate managers, office man-
agers, staff and agents from
across Southeast Michigan.

"We think this is a great op-
portunity to show our corpo-
rate commitment to the com-
munities where we live and
work," said Duke Hynek,
chairman of the Real Estate
One Charitable Foundation.
"Even in these difficult eco-
nomic times, there are indi-

viduals who are willing to do
extraordinary things to assist
worthwhile causes."

Real Estate One is involved
with a number of charities,
but its Charitable Foundation
Committee has chosen SOMI
as one of its primary charities.

"I pray for warm weather
for the participating plungers
and that they don't freeze on
their way to the showers,"
said Hynek.

The annual Law
Enforcement Torch Run Polar
Plunge is known for its cos-
tume contest, where plungers
compete for the Golden
Plunger Award.

The award honors the
plunger with the most cre-
ative costume or best jump in-
to the water.

The Polar Plunge is made
possible by the Law
Enforcement Torch Run, a
group of police officers and
corrections personnel com-
mitted to raising funds and
awareness for SOMI.

Proceeds from the Polar
Plunge support the year-
round sports training and ath-
letic competition for more
than 15,200 children and
adults with intellectual dis-
abilities who live in Michigan.

The Detroit Polar Plunge is
one of 14 Polar Plunges hap-
pening throughout Michigan
in February and March.

For more information on
the Law Enforcement Torch
Run, or Special Olympics
Michigan, visit somi.org or
call (586) 731-0922.

What parents need to know
in case of emergencies

Parents need to know if care of him or herself in case
their child is prepared to take of a medical emergency?

• Auto

• Home

•L i f e

• Commercial

NOEL SELEWSKI
AGENCY

* M i / n I' i ' i l l I , ' , / ' •

, ' - ' 5 •

• Residential

General Liability

Renter's Insurance

313-886.6857
15206 Mack Avenue, Grosse Pointe Park

Located in the Lakepointe Building
(2 blocks South of Dylan's Raw Bar & Grille)

Each year more than 100
million patients are treated in
emergency rooms in the
United States. "The Little
Book of Big Medical
Emergencies," prepares chil-
dren for the most common
medical crises with simple,
straightforward information
that may help save someone's
life.

From headaches to neck in-
juries, choking to cuts and
bruises, women's emergen-
cies to CPR, this is emergency
care and prevention 101 for
children, whether they're in
middle school or a senior in
college.

Here's some advice from
Dr. Stuart Fischer on what to
do if somebody is suffering
from a nosebleed: from Dr.
Stuart Fischer:

• Call 911 if the bleeding is
from both nostrils or they feel
bleeding down the back of the
throat.

• Remain seated. Get a
chair and have the patient
keep their head forward and
facing downward.

• When the bleeding is
from the front of the nose, ap-
ply cold compresses such as
ice packs across the bridge of
the nose covering both sides,

• Do not let nosebleed pa-
tients blow their noses. They
could dislodge clots patching
leakingblood vessels,

• Do not let a nosebleed pa-
tient lie on their back since
they could choke on blood.
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Obituary notices are purchased and often prewritten by family or friends. While we try to run obit-
uaries as submitted, we nevertheless reserve the right to edit for accuracy, style and length.

Clara Bettina
Buesser

Clara Bettina Buesser, 89,
died Monday, Jan. 21,2008, in
Arm Arbor while lovingly at-
tended by the combined
Buesser-Rieveschl family that
she created, nurtured and
cherished. • • . '
, Born Clara Bettina Smith on
Aug. 17,1918 in Louisville, Ky,
the daughter of Thomas
Gardener and Helen Peake
Smith, she was raised and edu-
cated in the greater Cincinnati
area. Asked once how she de-
veloped her wide ranging in-<
terest in and knowledge of art,
music, and gardening, she
replied, "I had a library card."

With her first husband
George Rieveschl, inventor of
the antihistamine Benadryl,
she raised their two boys in a
modern home she helped de-
sign and landscape in Grosse
Pointe Farms.

Married in 1973 to Detroit at-
torney Anthony C. Buesser, she
set about building a new close-
knit family consisting of her
two boys and his three children
and their families.

Listing her occupation, with
a straight face, as" homemak-
er," she designed, built or reno-
vated 10 personal residences
and two cottages. Her family
said that she bound them to-
gether with laughter, trust and
love, and presided with quiet
tact and grace, and expects
that when she meets God, He
will say to her, "Welcome, I
haveadesignprojectforyou."

She is survived by her hus-
band, Anthony C. Buesser of
Ann Arbor; two sons Gary T.
Rieveschl of West Harrison,
Ind., Jan L. (April) Rieveschl, of
Santa Rosa Beach, Fla.; three
step-children Kent Buesser
Baumkel of Ypsilanti, Anthony
C. (Iris) Buesser Jr. of Dexter
and Andrew C. (Qjen) Buesser
of Ann Arbor; five grandchil-
dren and four great-grandchil-
dren.

Burial will be private. A
memorial service celebrating
her life will be held in late
spring, her season of the year.

Memorial donations may be
made to Arbor Hospice, 2366
Oak Valley Dr., Ann Arbor, MI
48103. Share a memory with
the family at vermeulenfuner-
alhome.com

Eleanor Bismack
Eldridge

Longtime Grosse Pointe
Park resident Eleanor Bismack
Eldridge, 96, died Saturday,
Jan. 26, 2008, at ShorePointe
Nursing Center in St. Clair
Shores.

Mrs. Eldridge was born Oct.
23, 1911 to Albert and Anne
Kulish Bismack of Minden
City. She was part of a Sanilac
County farming family com-
posed of seven brothers and
four sisters.

After graduating from Ubly
High School, she attended
Ypsilanti State College, now
Eastern Michigan University,
in the early 1930s. She was an
executive secretary at the
McCord Corp. in the mid 1930s
and the Reconstruction
Finance Corp. during the early
1940s.

On Feb. 20,1937 she married
Detroit cemeterian Charles
David Eldridge Jr. In the 1940s,
she spent summers at Pine
Lodge, Pointe Aux Barques. In
1944 the Mrs. Eldridge, her
husband and sons moved to
Grosse Pointe Park.

Her family said she was
known for her holiday enter-
taining, love of gardening and
her dogs. She spent many
hours volunteering for the
American Red Cross,
American Cancer Society, and
the Trombley School PTA.

Mrs. Eldridge spent her 41
years in Grosse Pointe Park en-
joying swimming, fishing and
boating on Lake St. Clair.

She loved dinners and danc-
ing at the Detroit Boat Club
where she was active on the so-
cial committee for many years.

As a member of the

Chippawa Flying Club, she en-
joyed flying with her husband
in his airplane to many mid-
west destinations. She also en-
joyed travel and had a great
love of Florida, Mexico, and
Hawaii.

In 1985, Mrs. Eldridge and
her husband moved to Grosse
Pointe Shores, where they en-
joyed spending time with their
grandchildren.

The love of her life, her hus-
band Charles, predeceased her
on May 11,1988.

She is survived by her sons,
Charles EH (Sandra) of Santa
Cruz, Calif., Loyal Arthur
(Barbara) of Hickory Corners,
and William Robert of Lake
Angelus; and her beloved 10
grandchildren, Sandra Fairon,
Laura Furmanski, Trey
(Becky) Eldridge, Peter
(Michelle) Eldridge, Sara
Eldridge, William Eldridge II,
Richard Eldridge, Dr. Charles
Eldridge IV, Christopher
(Francis) Eldridge, and
Elizabeth (David) Weber. She
also is survived by her 12 great-
grandchidren, Max Fairon,
Scarlett Furmanski, Catherine,
Allison and Madeline Eldridge,
Alex and Mitchell Eldridge,
Garrett and Brayden Eldridge,
and Lilly, Claire and Anabel
Weber.

Services were held at Chas.
Verheyden Funeral Home,
Grosse Pointe Park, Michigan
with interment at Forest Lawn
Cemetery, Detroit, Michigan.

Nicolas Kaliardos
Longtime Grosse Pointe

Farms resident Nicolas
Kaliardos, 81, died Sunday,
Jan. 27, 2008, at St. John
Hospital and Medical Center in
Detroit.

Mr. Kaliardos was born on
Christmas Day, 1926, in
Detroit. He was raised in the
Greektown area until age 7,
when he returned with his
family to their mountain home-
land, Morn", a small village in
northern Greece.

In the village, Mr. Kaliardos
experienced a wonderful coun-
try life, and developed a deep
appreciation for the land. He
also suffered the ravages of
World War II, including the
killing of his brother, the burn-
ing of his family' s homestead,
and imprisonment as a Greek
freedom fighter, all at the
hands of the German-Italian
army. Nevertheless, village life
in Greece left an indelible and
positive impression on his
character and core values, in-
cluding honesty, integrity, and
righteousness.

Mr. Kaliardos returned to
Detroit in 1945 at the age of 18,
and soon thereafter met his fu-
ture wife, Catherine Dasgalos.
He proudly served in the U.S.
Army and was a member of
the American Legion. He
owned several small business-
es during his career, and was
an inventor with multiple
patents.

Mr. Kaliardos and his wife
had two sets of fraternal twins,
five years apart, and moved to
their current residence in
Grosse Pointe Farms in 196(>.
He had a passion for gardening
and cooking (and eating), and
passed that onto his family.
Visitors to his house rarely left
without a spirited conversa-
tion, a Greek history lesson,
and a full stomach!

His family said that those
who knew him will never for-
get his independent thinking

1 Light a Candle of Remembrance

1 Online Obituaries

Dedicate 3 Perspective (e-cards)

Post a Heart

1 Tools for Caregtvers

Order Rowers and Gifts

1 Online Memorials <8t Guestbooks

Grief Support Message Boards

1 365 Days of Grief Support

1 Find a Friend

and strong will as well as his
genuine caring, generosity and
sense of humor. Above all, Mr.
Kaliardos was a deeply devot-
ed husband and father.
Nothing was more important
to him.

He is survived by his loyal
and loving wife, Catherine;
daughters Christine and Mary;
sons William and James; and
son-in-law Keith Ballman. He
is predeceased by his parents,
Vassilios and Soultana; and his
brothers, Demetrios and
Efthmeos.

Eleanor Anne Keith
Harper Woods resident

Eleanor Anne Keith died
Thursday, Jan. 24, 2008, at St.
John Hospital and Medical
Center in Detroit. She was 75.

Mrs. Keith was born Sept.
16, 1932 in the City of Grosse
Pointe to Pauline and Thomas
Wade. She attended St. Paul
Catholic School from elemen-
tary through high school and
Ross Business School. She was
a secretary at Rossi and
Company Advertising in
Detroit.

Mrs. Keith volunteered for
many charities including the
Detroit Grand Prix, The
Parade Co., Eastpointe
Chamber of Commerce, the
former Saratoga Hospital, and
the American Cancer Society.
She belonged to the Eagles
Club in St. Clair Shores,
Jefferson Beach Yacht Club
and the Legion of Mary.

She was an avid Detroit
Tigers fan and enjoyed needle-
point crafts.

She is survived by her
daughter, Anne Keith; sons
Greg (Colleen), Christopher
(Kimberly) and Andrew;
grandchildren Megan, Amy,
Brian, Connor, Skye, Trew,
Lochlan and Nola; sisters Mary
(John) Martocci and Paula
(John) Abraham; brother John
(Grace) Wade; and sister-in-
law Elizabeth (Jim) Fowler.

Mrs. Keith was predeceased
by her husband, Donald Craig
Keith; parents; and her brother,
Thomas Wade.

A funeral Mass will be cele-
brated at 10 a.m. Friday, Feb. 1
at St. Clair of Montefalco
Catholic Church, 1401 Whittier
Rd., Grosse Pointe Park.

Memorial donations may be
made to the University of
Michigan Hospital,
Otolaryngology Head and
Neck Research, 1500 E.
Medical Center Dr., Ann Arbor,
MI 48109-0312.

The Bev. Donald
Francis Leininger

The Rev. Donald Francis
Leininger, 76, died .Friday, Jaa
25, 2008. He was the beloved
son of the late Harold L. and
the late Coletta M. (nee
Verbiest) Leininger, longtime
Grosse Pointe Park residents.

Leininger was born April 12,
1931 in Detroit and was or-
dained a Roman Catholic
priest on June 21, 1958 in
Garrison, N.Y.

His many assignments in-
cluded 14 years as a mis-
sionery in Okinawa, Japan. He
spent one year in Guam, was
an associate pastor in Toronto
and also in Middletown, Conn.
At that time, he was a member
of the Order of Friars Minor
Capuchins and was assigned
to Rome for three years.

In 1985 he became a mem-

Eleanor Bismack Eldridge Nicolas Kaliardos Eleanor Anne Keith

The Rev. Donald Leininger Edward P Rem

ber of the Roman Catholic
Diocese of St. Petersburg, Fla.
In 1989 he was appointed pas-
tor of St. Luke the Evangelist
Catholic Church in Palm
Harbor, Fla., the position he
held until retiring in 2000.

He is survived by his sisters,
Mary Lou (Carl) Schulte and
Rose Anne Leininger; niece
Donna Marie Baciulis; and
nephew Donald William
Schulte.

A funeral Mass was celebrat-
ed Jan. 29 at St. Bonaventure
Monastery, Detroit, with inter-
ment at Resurrection
Cemetery, Clinton Township.

Memorial donations may be
made to St. Lawrence
Seminary, 301 Church St., Mt.
Calvary, WI 53057 or the
Capuchin Mission Association,
1820 Mt. Elliott, Detroit, MI
48207.

Share a memory with the
family at wujekcalcaterra.com.

vice will follow at 2 p.m.
Share a memory with the

family at verheyden.org

Ruth M. Lucas
Ruth M. Lucas, 78, a resident

of St. Clair Shores, died
Thursday, Jan. 24, 2008, in
Hillsboro Beach, Fla.

Mrs. Lucas was born June 5,
1929 to Genevive and Roland
Minogue'in Manitowoc, Wis.
She attended Michigan State
University and graduated in
1951 from Baldwin-Wallace
College in Ohio. She worked as
a substitute teacher.

She is survived by her
daughter, Kathy; sons Dan and
Mike; and brother Roland
MinogueH.

She was predeceased by her
husband, Robert; and sister
JudyWilcox.

Memorial donations may be
made to the Henry Ford
Hospice, 1 Ford Place 5A,
Detroit, MI 48202 or American
Cancer Society, 18505 W 12
Mile Rd., Southfield, MI 48076.

Edward P. Rem
City of Grosse Pointe resi-

dent Edward R Rem, 98, died
Saturday, Jan. 26,2008. He was
born Jan. 18, 1910 in Wayne
County.

He served during World War
II in the 121st Infantry
Regiment. He was a decorated
veteran having been part of the
Normandy Campaign, the
Battle for Brittany and fighting
on the Crozon Peninsula.

Mr. Rem was a real estate
broker and insurance agent. He
enjoyed reading historical
books and ballroom dancing.

He is survived by his sister,
Virginia Wrosch; nephew
Donald (Cynthia) Rem; and
several other nieces and
nephews.

He was predeceased by his
wife, Rosalyn.

A funeral Mass was celebrat-
ed Jan. 30 at St. Philomena
Catholic Church in Detroit.

Memorial donations may be
made to St. Philomena Catholic
Church, 4282 Marseilles,
Detroit, MI 48224-1446.

Share a memory with the
family at verheyden.org.

Betty L. O'Neal
Harper Woods resident Betty

L. O'Neal, 77, died Sunday,
Jan. 27,2008.

She was bora Jan. 13, 1931
in Yancy, Ky. to Wolsey and
Martha Sharp.

She is survived by her
daughter, Martha "Elaine"
O'Neal; sister Mary Cupp; sis-
ter-in-law Bertha Sharp; and
several special nieces,
nephews and friends.

She was predeceased by her
husband, Elmer; parents; three
brothers; and six sisters.

Visitation will be at 11 a.m.
Saturday, Feb. 2 at Chas.
Verheyden Funeral Home,
16300 Mack Ave., Grosse
Pointe Park. A memorial ser-

Everett Monroe
Scranton

City of Grosse Pointe resi-
dent Everett Monroe Scranton,
84, died Friday, Jan. 25, 2008,
from complications due to
Parkinson's disease.

He was born March 18,1923
in New Haven, Conn, to Walter
N. and Loretto Farrell
Scranton.

Mr. Scranton served during
World War II in the 70th
Infantry Division in Europe. He
was awarded the Purple Heart
for battlefield injuries and the
Bronze Star Medal for meritori-
ous achievement in ground op-
erations against the enemy.

He was a graduate of the
University of Kentucky with a
degree in business administra-
tion and received his Masters of
Business Administration and
Juris Doctor degrees from the
University of Michigan.

He worked 40 years for
Chrysler Corp; in a variety of
executive positions including
vice president of Chrysler
space division in New Orleans,
executive director of Chrysler's
international division in
Geneva and London, director
of administration systems and
organization planning, assis-
tant treasurer, associate direc-
tor of legal affairs, and director

Everett Monroe Scranton

of investor relations.
He was a member of the

Business School Council,
Tulane University, New
Orleans, Business School
Council of Eastern Michigan
University, and a board mem-
ber of Holy Cross Hospital, and
Blue Cross of Michigan.

A longtime member of St.
Paul on the Lake Catholic
Church, Grosse Pointe Farms,
he was past president of the
Cardinal Club of Detroit and a
member of the Knights of
Malta.

Mr. Scranton is survived by
his wife, Madeleine (nee
Hurley); children John
(Nancy), Mary (Donald
Westrich) Scranton, Martha
(Jonathon) Lewis, James,
Elizabeth Hunter, Sarah
(Andrew Haigney) Scranton
and Anne; and grandchildren
Matthew, Timothy, Sarah,
William, Guy, Adam, Laura,
Emma, Christopher^-ahd
Elizabeth.- '• •>•• ''-in h a s

He was predeceased by his
brothers Donald and Walter.

A funeral Mass was celebrat-
ed Jan. 29 at St. Paul on the
Lake Catholic Church, Grosse
Pointe Farms. Interment was at
Mt. Olivet Cemetery, Detroit.

Memorial contributions may
be made to Sacred Heart Major
Seminary, 2701 Chicago
Boulevard, Detroit, MI- 48206;
Pregnancy Aid, 17325 Mack
Avenue, Detroit, MI 48224 or
the charity of one's choice.

Lewis W
"Tip" Tipton

Former Grosse Pointe Woods
resident Lewis W "Tip" Tipton,
83, of Louisville, Ky., died
Sunday, Jan. 13, 2008, sur-
rounded by his loving family.

Born in Detroit on July 13,
1924, to Susie and Lewis
Tipton, he was a longtime resi-
dent of Grosse Pointe.

A U.S. Army World War n
veteran, he proudly served with
the Combat Engineers in both
the European and Pacific the-
aters;

He retired in 1987 as an exec-
utive with. Honeywell Corp.,
where he designed systems for
the automotive industry.

Mr. Tipton's family described
him as a brilliant man — a stu-
dent of history and an avid
reader. They said' his vast
knowledge made him a valu-
able resource to his family and
friends.

He is survived by his daugh-
ters, Suzi (Matt) Preston of
Louisville, Ky. and Lyrine
(Charlie) Munro of Chicago,
111.; grandchildren Meighan,
Savannah, Tripp and Henry;

See OBITUARIES, page 19A

313-881-8500
• 16300 Mack Avenue
Grosse Pointe, MI48230

Joseph A. StanSonts, Manager
Family Owned & Operated Since 1908

Brian A Joseph, Owner / Chairman

586-756-5530
28499 Schoenherr
Warren, MI 48088

John P. Murphy, Manager
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TEST DRIVE ByGregZyla

The great looking, economic and quiet Chevrolet Malibu was named
the 2008 North American Car of the Year. Chevrolet claims it's the best
midsized car they've ever produced.

The winner: 2008 Chevy Malibu IT

T
hree cheers for
Chevrolet! That's
how I'll start this
week's report as we
recently test drove

Chevy's all-new 2008 Malibu
LT—base price: $20,305; price
as tested: $21,470.

Considering the new Malibu
gets 30 miles per gallon high-
way, comes loaded with stan-
dard features and costs a tad
over $20,000 in LT dress, we're
happy to report Chevy is a
true Honda Accord/Toyota
Camry competitor sitting in its
dealer showrooms at this very
moment.

Malibu is Chevy's 4-door, 5-
passenger mid-size family
sedan, and we're betting when
you hear "5-passenger mid-
size," you're probably thinking
crowded rear seat. However,
when I rode rearward, I was
impressed with the ease of en-
trance, comfort and room
Malibu offers. Granted, the
third rear middle person will al-
ways be a bit "tight," yet when I
rode with five in this car there
were lots of compliments on
rear seat room.

Available in four distinct
trims, Malibu starts at a base of
just $19,995 for the LS. Our
tester LT costs $310 more,
which upgrades to GM's
StabiliTrak stability system
with traction control, 17-inch
chrome wheels, dual chrome
exhaust tips and drive shift
control. This recommended
move ap is well worth the addi-

tional money, although for
those who want more bang for
the buck, a top of the line LTZ
rounds out the model lineup.
The Malibu Hybrid is sched-
uled to join the fray shortly, so
Chevy lovers stay tuned.

A2.4-liter, inline Ecotec 4-
cylinder powers LS and LT,
pumping out 169 horsepower
and achieves a commendable
22 mpg city and the aforemen-
tioned 30 mpg highway. The
engine mates to a 4-speed auto-
matic transmission with over-
drive, and we feel this combina-
tion will be most in demand as
gas prices continue to rise. The
LTZ comes with a standard 3.6-
liter V6 that generates 252-
horsepower and delivers 17 city
and 26 highway. A 6-speed au-
tomatic transmission with over-
drive is standard with the V6
models and optional on the 4-
cylinder. Both engines run on
regular unleaded fuel.

Built in Kansas City, Kan., the
new Malibu is a real head turn-
er. Replacing the previous gen-
eration's boxy look is a crisp,
smooth, aerodynamic style
with impressive looking front
end and a new roofline. Evident
are sweeping headlights, color
coordinated integrated front
and rear bumpers, fog lamps,
sweeping roof and more of a
rear rake. Nice tail lamps act as
"bookends" to Malibu's spa-
cious and easy open, power op-
erated, 15.1-cubic-feet trunk.

Outward appearance, how-
ever, isn't the only area Chevy
engineer's zoomed in on for
improvements. All Malibus
come with standard head-cur-
tain side airbags and front seat-
mounted thorax protection air
bags in addition to the usual air
bags now standard in all cars.
Underneath; a four-wheel fully

2008 Chevy MalibuLT

independent suspension and
longer wheelbase delivers a
more controlled ride, which is
especially felt in tighter corners
versus the last generation
Malibu.

LT's come standard with all
the powers, CD/AM/FM stereo,
rear defogger, split rear seat,
driver information center with
tire pressure indicator, steering
wheel audio controls, 4-wheel
disc anti-lock brakes, one year
of OnStar service, power out-

side mirrors, air conditioning
and lots more.

Important numbers include a
wheelbase of 112.3 inches,
3,436 pound curb weight, 40.4-
inch turning circle and a 16 gal-
lon fuel tank.

Awarded the 2008 North
American Car of the Year,
Malibu has received raves from
the automotive media nation-
wide. Motor Trend says
"Malibu is the next big thing in
mid-sized cars," while

"IntelliChoice" notes, "This ve-
hicle has it all, style, value, per-
formance, economy and for the
first time in many years, the
promise of pride in your pur-
chase."

Chevy thus has a car that not
only competes with Honda
Accord and Toyota Camry, it
delivers more in certain areas
and even beats Honda on base
price. Thus, if s no surprise we
bestow a well-earned 9.0 on a
scale of 1 to 10 for Chevy's all

new, all-American Malibu LT.
Make sure you visit a Chevy
dealer if shopping in the mid-
sized market. You won't be dis-
appointed.

Likes: Looks, mechanical en-
gineering, interior, exterior,
mpg.

Dislikes: The 4-cylinder
won't break any drag racing
records, but great fuel econo-
my is a more than a fair trade.

GregZyla is a syndicated au-
to columnist

AUTOS ByJennyKing

Enclave a luxury family vehicle

G
eneral Motors
walked a fine line
when its Buick,
Saturn and GMC
brands brought out

their latest family vehicles:
Enclave, Outlook and Acadia.

PIUS

24 MONTH LOSE-2008 GTS

$

24 MONTH LEASE
Escalade

All Wheel Drive, Nloonroof,
Chrome Wheels

The automaker wanted to
give buyers the room they were
accustomed while moving to-
ward more car-like and fuel ef-
ficient vehicles.

This latest generation, re-
ferred to by some as
"crossovers" and others as
"sport utilities", presents us
with solid, seven-passenger ve-
hicles that have made some
gains in fuel economy and
good size strides in interiors
that more closely resemble lux-
ury sedans than light trucks.

Those may be the best adjec-
tives for the 2008 Buick
Enclave, a decidedly wide vehi-
cle with elbow, hip and leg
room to spare. Plus all the com-
forts of home, with tempera-
ture controls, lights, storage
and cupholders for second and
third row passengers. Two pas-
sengers way up front can enjoy
heated seats if you choose the
CXL model.

This vehicle is available in
CX and CXL trim levels. Front-
drive is standard; all-wheel dri-
ve is available. All models fea-
ture a 275 horsepower V-6 and
Buick's first six-speed automat-
ic transmission.

Buick thinks you'll be im-
pressed that Enclaves start at
under $33,000 MSRE The test
vehicle was a front-drive CXL
with a standard price of
$34,225. Upscale features in-
clude those lovely heated seats,
a power liftgate, heated outside
mirrors and leather seating sur-
faces for first and second rows.

Standard features on both
CL and CXL include
StabiliTrak stability control
with what GM calls "rollover
mitigation technology." This
system will deploy side air cur-
tains "when sensors determine
an impending rollover" and will
keep them inflated slightly
longer for occupant protection.

A serious shortcoming is the

lack of visibility around B-pil-
lars. They are several inches
wide and that, plus the back
and headrest of the front pas-
senger seat, blocks out impor-
tant things like people on the
sidewalk or cars passing your
drive on the street.

A power liftgate is a good
idea, especially for a big vehicle
like this with heavy doors. If
you have one, I suggest using
the button on the fob to put it
into motion. Squeezing its han-
dle area above the license plate
will activate the gate, but it
takes a tight squeeze in just the
right place. It would be easier to
press a normal button (as in an
old-fashioned metal button) or
to pull the handle to raise the
rear door. The fob button will
open and close the liftgate at a
leisurely pace.

With EPA fuel economy rat-
ings of 16 city and 24 highway
for FWD models and 16 city
and 22 highway for AWD mod-
els, the Enclave is way behind
vehicles with diesel engines or
gasoline-electric hybrid power.
Buick and GM point out that
this is a great improvement
over its other seven-passenger
light trucks, which seldom get
out of the teens in their miles
per gallon readings.

I agree options such as
Ultrasonic Rear Park Assist
and a rear back-up camera are
great ideas—especially the
camera. The many beeps—
Buick calls "chimes" — that ac-
cident avoidance features pro-
duce are confusing and I sus-
pect are frequently disregarded
by the driver in today's world of

multiple electronic sounds vy-
ing for our immediate atten-
tion.

My greatest complaint about
the Enclave as well as its GMC
and Saturn siblings is lack of
visibility. The combination of
the B-pillar and the back of the
front passenger seat blocked
off as much as 12 inches of
over-the-shoulder vision that's
so essential in backing from the
drive onto the street or leaving
your diagonal parking space
safely. One must rely a lot on
those outside mirrors and, if
you have one, the rear park as-
sist and camera.

For the teenies in the family,
Enclave also is equipped with
adjustable outside mirrors that
can be programmed on the
CXL to automatically angle
downward when the vehicle is
in reverse, providing a view of
the curb or parking lines. Buick
says the mirrors on the CXL
can be programmed so that
one, both or neither of the mir-
rors provide this view.

Enclave's potential two
dozen storage areas include an
optional second row center
console with a deep storage
compartment and 12-volt pow-
er outlet, two cupholders and a
pullout tray. It is also capable of
folding flat into the load floor.

The test vehicle had an enter-
tainment system that included
a DVD player/screen on the
back of each front seat plus
wireless headsets. These could
be loaded separately for indi-
vidual movies or both could
share a movie loaded into the
main system up front. Indeed,
this was a time to be a passen-
ger instead of the one at the
wheel. Neat stuff.

The Buick Enclave was a fi-
nalist for the 2008 North
American Truck of the Year,
which was awarded to the
Mazda CX-9.

Don GdSley
East Nine Mile Road - Just east of 1-94
586 772 8 2 0 0 / 313 343 5300
dongooleycadillac com
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Mildred E.Willison

Lance Cpl. Scott Winter Ulrich

Laace Cpl. Scott
Winter Ulrich

Lance Cpl. Scott Winter
Ulrich, 21, died suddenly
Wednesday, Jan. 23,2008.

He was on active duty with
the U.S. Marine Corps and
based at Camp Lejeune, N.C.
with the 1 l th Marine
Expeditionary . Force
Headquarters Group, 2nd
Radio Battalion. He was born
Nov. 19, 1986 in Detroit and
was a lifelong Grosse pointe.
Woods resident.

Lance Cpl. Ulrich was a June
2005 graduate of Grosse Pointe
North High School. He joined
the Marines in December,
2005 and graduated from the
Marine Corps Recruit Depot at
Parris Island, S.C. as part of the
3rd Battalion on March 3,
2006.

Cpl. Ulrich developed an in-
terest in sports motorcycles the
summer after graduation from
high school and rode his
Kawasaki sports bike to
Grosse Pointe Woods
Lakefront Park where, he
worked as a lifeguard.

He later acquired a 600cc
Yamaha to explore the moun-
tains and back roads in North
Carolina and the Blue Ridge
Mountains, often going on
road trips with the riding club
at the military base.

Cpl. Ulrich's ability to fix or
assemble things was the de-
light of his family, often help-
ing out by assembling the new
baby swing or fixing some-
thing around the house.

During high school, he was
involved in track and field,
cross country, swimming and
diving.

He became interested in
skull racing and trained on the
Detroit River at the Detroit
Boat Club while in middle
school. His lifelong love of
hockey started with street
hockey and continued into the
Grosse Pointe Hockey
Association, where he played
through middle school along
with his brother, Tpdd. His en-
thusiasm for the sport inspired
his sister, Tessa, to take it up.

Cpl. Ulrich's love of the out-
doors began with a trip to
Yellowstone National Park,
where he explored the natural
wonders of the park and won
his ranger badge. He also en-
joyed fly-fishing and fly tying.

His family described him as
personable with an engaging
smile. He offered help to any-
one who needed or asked, of-
ten befriending other people
having difficult times.

He was part of the Our Lady
Star of the Sea Catholic
Church Teen life group at its
beginning.

He is survived by his parents,
Linda Winter and Gregory L.
Ulrich; his older brother, Todd
G. Ulrich; and his younger sis-

ter, Tessa Winter Ulrich; and
his aunts, uncles and cousins.
He is the grandson of Howard
Winter and the late Lillian
Winter.

A funeral Mass was celebrat-
ed at Our Lady Star of the Sea
Catholic Church in Grosse
Pointe Woods followed by full
military honors.

Memorials may be made to
the Lance Cpl. Scott Winter
Ulrich Fund for the University
of Detroit Mercy School of
Law, Veterans Law Clinic, 651
East Jefferson, Room 251,
Detroit, MI 48226 or to the
State Bar of Michigan Access
to Justice Campaign, 306
Townsend Street, Lansing, MI
48933.

MfldredE.WilIison

Mildred E. Willison, 80, of
Bloomfield Hills died
Thursday, Jaa 24, 2008 at her
home.

Mrs. Willison was born in
Detroit. She received a
Bachelor of Fine Arts in 1949
and a Master's in Fine Arts in
1953, both from Wayne State
University. She taught fine arts
from 1949 to 1956 at Asbury
College in Kentucky.

She served as a docent for
the Detroit Institute of Arts for
five years and was a member
of the Sculptor's Guild of
Michigan. Her sculptures have
received awards at the
Birmingham-Bloomfield Art
Association show and the
Nativity Episcopal Festival of
the Arts. Most recently her
work was exhibited at the Ave
Maria Gallery in Ann Arbor.

She is survived by.her hus-
band, David Willison; sons
John (Carol) and Stephen
(Amy); daughters Ann
(Reinhard) Lemke, Roberta
(Scott) Kisker, and Theresa
Pennis) Kerley HI; 21 great-
grandchildren; her sisters,
Frances Ewbank and Nancy
McConnell; and brother
Frederick White.

She was predeceased by her
brother, Robert White.

A funeral service was held
Jan. 28 at First. United
Methodist Church of
Birmingham. Interment is in
White Chapel Memorial
Cemetery in Troy.

Memorial donations may be
made to Heifer International,
PO. Box 1692, Merrifield, VA.

City of Grosse Pointe

Credit fraud
Police are investigating

charges of more than $5,000
made to credit cards opened in
the name of a City resident
without authorization reported
at 10:34 p.m. ^ftednesday, Jan.
23.

Police said the victim report-
ed no other credit problems.

Baby on board
Police arrested a 39-year-old

Detroit woman and 48-year-
old Detroit man for stealing ba-
by formula and a bag of shrimp
from a grocery store in the
16000 block of Kercheval at
1:29 p.m. Tuesday, Jan. 22. •

Police said the woman was
seen leaving the store with the
items and the pair were arrest-
ed following a traffic stop at
Kercheval and Ashland in
Detroit.

—John Lundberg
Those with information on

these or any crimes should call
the City of Grosse Pointe police
department at (313) 886-3200.

Grosse Pointe Farms

Teenage drinking

Police detained a 16-year-old
City of Grosse Pointe male af-
ter he was thwarted in his at-
tempt to steal a bottle of liquor
from a store on Kercheval at
3:25 p.m. Friday, Jan. 25.

The store manager saw the
youth conceal the bottle under
his jacket and confronted him
when he attempted to leave.
The youth admitted trying to
steal the bottle and was held
for police to pick up.

He was released to his par-
ents.

Home invasion
Police are investigating the

theft of a microwave oven and
a family picture taken from a
house on Edgemere reported
at 9:56 p.m. Wednesday, Jan.

Cityof(iir000£ Michigan

NOTICE OF FINAL STATEMENT
Pursuant to Federal Guidelines, a Public hearing has taken
place before the Mayor and City Council on Monday, January
14, 2008 at 7:00 p.m. in the City Municipal Court/Council
Chambers, 15115 E. Jefferson, for Public Comments and
approval of the use of Federal Community Block Grant fund-
ing for the following projects.

Announcing the City's approved objectives and use of Federal
Community Block Grant funds, subject to full funding by
Wayne County, as herewith listed.

Street Improvements $49,130.00
Sidewalk, Curb project $2,700.00
Administration $7,300.00

Services for Older Citizens
• Minor Home Repair $6370.00
• Case Coordination $1500.00
• Information/referral $1000.00
• Meals on Wheels $5000.00

G.P.N.: 01/31/2008
Chris Reimef,

Director of Community Development

^Jmttte <3farms, 'an

NOTICE OF PROPOSED HEARING
AND

PROPOSED STATEMENT
OF

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK
GRANT OBJECTIVES AND REPROGRAMMING

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that a Public Hearing will be
held on. Monday, February 11, 2008 at 11:00 a.m. by the City
Administration at the Municipal Office, 90 Kerby Road, for
review of Community Development Block Grant 2008
Programming.

The following activities are proposed for reprogramming of
funding under the Community Development Block Grant
Program. Final reprogramming amounts are subject to the
approval of Wayne County CDBG Program and the U.S.
Department of Housing and Urban Development (HUD).

2008 PROPOSED PROGRAMMING PROJECTS AMOUNT

ADA $42,600

SOC Minor Home Repair (Public Service) $11,400

SOC Minor Home Repair (Housing Rehabilitation) $30,000

Administration $6,000

Total: $90,000

The City invites all citizens as well as individuals or represen-
tatives of neighborhood groups to submit ideas and comments
concerning this application.

GPN: 1/31/2008
Matthew J. Tepper

Assistant City Manager/City Clerk

23. Entry was gained through a
side door. The home was unoc-
cupied at the time.

Rear window
Police are investigating the

smashing of a vehicle rear win-
dow parked in the driveway of
a house in the 300 block of
Belanger reported at 5:36 p.m.
Monday, Jan. 21.

No items were found in the
area that may have been used
to smash the window.

Larceny
Police are investigating the

theft of a rear wheel from a ve-
hicle parked in the 400 block of
Roland reported at 4:12 a.m.
Monday, Jan. 21. The vehicle
was supported by landscaping
blocks.

—John Lundberg
Those with information on

these or any crimes should call
the Grosse Pointe Farms police
departmental(313) 885-2100.

Grosse Pointe Park

Vehicle vandalized
Overnight Saturday, Jan. 26,

an unlocked Dodge Neon was
entered and rummaged
through. The ignition was
damaged and the car would
not start: Police are investigat-
ing.

Anniversary
Congratulations to Public

Safety Office Joseph Poirier,
who celebrates 19 years with
the public safety department
on Jan. 30.

—BethQuinn
Those with information on

these or any crimes should call
the Grosse Pointe Park police
department at (313) 822-7400.

Grosse Pointe Shores

Lights out
Police arrested a 59-year-old

Grosse Pointe Woods woman
for drunken driving following
a traffic stop on Lakeshofe at
7:57 p.m. Friday, Jan. 25.

Police stopped the vehicle af-
ter observing it traveling with
its headlights off. The driver
could not produce the vehicle's
paperwork and police suspect-
ed she had been drinking be-
cause of her slurred speech.

After failing field sobriety
tests, the woman registered a
. 11 on a breath test. Her vehicle
was impounded.

Attempted invasion
Police are investigating the

failed home invasion at a
house on Roslyn reported at
6:43 p.m. Wednesday, Jan.. 23.

Police said the homeowner
returned to the house and
found an unfamiliar vehicle
parked in the driveway. When
the homeowner approached
the vehicle, the occupant
honked the horn twice and
sped off. The homeowner also
reported seeing another per-
son running through the back-
yard.

Tthe suspect gained entry by
smashing a rear glass block
window. A computer in the

house was moved, but nothing
was reported missing.

—John Lundberg
Those with information on

these or any crimes should call
the Grosse Pointe Shores police
departmental (313) 881-5500.

Grosse Pointe woods

Burglary
A Holiday Road resident

called police after returning
home at 1:20 p.m. Tuesday,
Jan. 22, and finding the side
door of the house forced opea

Police searched the home
and found several drawers
dumped out and a mattress
pulled off a bed. A 42-inch flat
screen television was missing.

A connection?
Police are investigating

whether several reports of ma-
licious destruction of property
the night of Sunday, Jan. 27.
are related.

Homeowners on Anita, Lee
Court, Green Court and
Hawthorne reported items
such as Christmas lights, out-
door garden lights and flower
pots had been destroyed.

—KathyRyan
Those with information on

these or any crimes should call
the Grosse Pointe Woods police
department at (313) 343-2400.

DRUG TESTING
Privacy Protected
Personal/Employee

Student • Housekeeper • Nanny • New Employment
Call for more Information

313.432.0194
»'• j. ' " 17211 Mack Avenue ' '"

trsday, we provide the Pointes wifh complete coverage of the
people, organizations, businesses, sales and events In our community.

We make it easy for Pointers to
stay informed about their schools i ,
and local sports, health, family
events, real estate, business,
restaurants, gardening, antiques,
home maintenance and more.
Our readers benefit from our

advertising and the eastside's best
classifieds, and the local award
winning real estate section
YourHome,
Our subscribers save each week and

have the paper delivered in their mail.

Grosse fointe News

Grosse Pointe News
96 Kercheval • Grosse Pointe Farms, Michigan 48236

N-' — Mail to; Subscriptions ? r " '*A-V

*'! 56 Kefcheval Ave j W) mil
I? Grosse Pointe, MI 48236 JVia

313-343-5577 '^ v .„
; - : : - ; i . - r . \ f v _ : r * i * 5 3 7 - 5 9 f o r 5 2 i s s u e s

—-J
10/18/07
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University Liggett School's middle school is the
ideal environment for a student to spend the
important middle school years. It is the perfect
combination of challenging and nurturing, a place
where learning mixes with fan, and where teachers
enjoy a fantastic rapport with their students.

I have experienced these qualities from the
perspective of both a student and a teacher and I
believe there is no better place to teach and to learn.

As a student, I loved how fanny my teachers were,
how passionate they were about the subjects they
taught, how willing they were to spend time with us,
and how much they enjoyed us, respected us, and
cared for us. I remember taking a lot of pride in the
depth and challenge of the material that we learned.

As a teacher, I love how I have the freedom in
how I teach. I love the high standards and
expectations that we have here. I love coaching.
And, most of all, I love how each day, teachers
joke with students, encourage them, and help
them strive to be the best students and people
they can be.

I love how the students, in turn, amuse,
enlighten, and amaze us as we embark each
year on a journey of learning.

UNIVERSITY

PK-3 -Grade 5 & Grades 9- 12
1045 Cook Road

Grosse Pointe'Woods, MI 48236-2509

Liggett's middle school is a place where students can be
kids, while also striving to become the best people they
can be. The academic standards are high, but teachers
are there to support students every step of the way.
Parents are involved and welcome. Small class sizes
allow teachers to not only know their students' names
and grades, but to know them well as people: their
middle names, their pets' names, their dreams
and passions.

Liggett middle school students and faculty have a
genuine love and respect for one another. These
feelings infuse the atmosphere of the middle
school, and make it the perfect place for students
to learn, laugh, and grow into smart, confident,
and compassionate young adults.

- Rebecca Simpson Gast

Join us for the following
informational events:

All-School Information Sessions
Tuesday, February 5 &

Tuesday March 11
9:00 -11:00 a.m.

Grades 6-8
850 Briarcliff Drive

Grosse Pointe Woods, MI 48236-1124

Substantial financial aid available.
Enrollment Office - 313-884-4444, ext. 217 • www.uls.org

University Liggett School does not unlawfully discriminate against any person on the basis oj religion, race, creed, color, national origin, sex, age, disability, or any other protected class as applicable by law.
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EATURES Sippy cup saga
Stay the course during trainingperiod
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CHURCHES SENIORS HEALTH ENTERTAINMENT

Grosse Pointe North senior Katie Latimer returns to the ice after
enduring a broken collarbone early in the first game of the season. She
returns just in time for a playoff run.

Best ever
.By Bob St. John
StaffWriter

It took just one moment for
elation to turn into disappoint-
ment for Grosse Pointe North's
Katie Latimer.

The 17-year-old senior from
Harper Woods had worked
hard in the offseason, prepar-
ing for what she hoped would
be her best-ever year of ice
hockey.

Then, early in the Lady
Norsemen's season-opening
game at Bloomfield Hills
Cranbrook Kingswood,
Latimer went into the boards
to retrieve the puck, got tan-
gled with a Crane defenseman
and went down hard on her left
shoulder.

The pain came quickly, but
Latimer was able to skate off
on her own power to the
bench.

A few moments later, she
fainted. That is when the deci-
sion was made to take her to
the hospital for X-rays.

"I knew something was
wrong because the pain was so
intense, but I thought it would
go away and I would be able to
get back out on the ice to join

my teammates," Latimer said.
The diagnosis was given to

Latimer and her mother,
Sharon, who took her to the
hospital.

Her left collarbone (clavicle)
had a partial break, sending
Latimer onto the disabled list
for what could have been the
entire season.

"Katie was devasted by the
news and I felt bad for her,"
Sharon Latimer said. "She was
looking forward to her senior
year of hockey and helping her
team win games.

"Now, she would have to
wait until the injury healed,
which we hoped wouldn't be
that long."

North head coach Scott
Dockeft called Latimer's fa-
ther, Charlie, with the bad
news. Charlie Latimer couldn't
make the game because of a
prior commitment.

"I talked to Katie that night
and she was very disappoint-
ed," Charlie Latimer said. "I felt
horrible because Katie really
wanted to be a part of the
hockey team. Her mom and I
told her to keep up hope."

Three nights later, Latimer
was at Grosse Pointe

Community Rink with her arm
in a sling, supporting her team-
mates through a tough 4-4 tie
against arch rival Grosse
Pointe South.

The Lady Blue Devils tied
the score with less than one
second left on the clock.

"I thought the injury would
be season-ending, but my doc-
tor said to come back in four
weeks and reevaluate the
shoulder," Katie Latimer said.
"It was tough to watch my
teammates play and practice
because I wanted to be out
there, helping them.

"It stunk, but there was noth-
ing I could do except let the
collarbone heal."

For the next couple of weeks,
Latimer leaned on family and
Mends to help her get through
each day.

At school, her friends carried
her books and bookbag to each
class. Latimer endured a lot of
physical and mental pain that
first week,

"I can't thank my mom and
dad, friends, teammates and
coaches enough for helping
me through this injury," PHOTO BY BOB BRUCE

Grosse Pointe North senior Katie Latimer, left, battles for the puck against Northville junior
See LATIMER, page 2B Andrea Zinkosky during her first week back from her injury.
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ATTHENEWDIA
FrWay Night live!: Experience the global rhythms, jazz sensibilities,

Saturday: Creafeybur own print at the drop-i n wofefiop, :. :

Target Family Sundays: Storyteller Tonya Date brings the works of aeelaimec
•' -: Harlem RenaissanGe novelist Zora Neale Hurston to life.

Now on View: Julie Mehretu; City Sitings and Best of the Best

Programs .are made possib le w j th suppor t f r om t h e ' M k h i g a h Counci l f o r Arts
and Cultural Af fa i rs and.the City of fetiojt. . . . . . ' ., ,. .. . •.
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. _ > • " •» .

' . *

*v t I

Winter
Clearance

i . s

Men's - Suits, Sport Coats*, Sweaters,
Slacks, Sport Shirts and More.

Slacks and MoreSweaters

Childrens
T-Shirts

HICKEY'S
WALTON PIERCE

TERMS OF SALE: ALL SALES FINAL
Alterations charged at tailors cost. *Navy blazers not included.

(313) 8 8 2 - 8 9 7 0 17051 KERCHEVAL • GROSSE POINTE • IN THE VILLAGE
HOURS: MON. THRU FRI. 1 0 - 6 , THURS. TILL 7, SAT. 10 - 5:30, SUNDAY 1 2 - 4 I
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Latimer said. "I couldn't have
done it without them."

Through the pain and newly
found hours of free time,
Latimer studied, did home-
work and eventually found her
way to the work out on the
treadmill.

"I couldn't do much of any-
thing athletic-wise for a few
weeks," Latimer said. "I have
been injured before (she broke
an ankle and a wrist), but this
was different because it was
my senior year."

Latimer followed her doc-
tor's advice, allowing the col-
larbone to heal. After the holi-
day break, she had a full range
of motion.

'After I was able to achieve
a full range of motion, I made
the decision to get back to
practice and get back to play-
ing with my teatrfmates,"
Latimer said.

Dockett guided his L^dy
Norsemen to 4 solid mark
without Latimerjin the lineup,
but it wasn't easy;. -; .,

"We had a huge hol^m.pur :
lineup without Ifatie iri thfere,
but the girls played hard: in
her absence," Dockett • said. .
"It's nice to have her back."

It took a few practices and
games to get, her timing back,
but she made a complete re-
covery by scoring three goals
in wins against Northville
(one) and Livonia Ladywood
(two).

"It feels great to be back on
the ice," Latimer said. "I
missed a good part of the sea-
son, but I still have more than
a month left to help us try and
win our ultimate prize, the
state championship."

"I'm a little nervous now
watching Katie skate, espe-
cially when she gets bumped,"
Sharon Latimer said. "I'm a
typical parent. I don't want to
see my daughter get hurt
again." f

Charlie Latimer concurs.
Sitting in the stands takes on
an entirely new meaning.

"I told Katie to go out there
and play like she was never
injured because I don't want
her favoring the shoulder,"
Charlie Latimer said. "She

. could get injured again if she

. favors it."
Latimer and her teammates

currently sit in first place in

PHOTOS BY BOB BRLO

Katie Latimer, eentei; is all,
smi les after returning to the
ice; Earents, Charlie, left, arid
ShEy-on* a^e at her side.

the Michigan Metro Girls
High School Hockey League
Division I standings, just
ahead of Grosse Poihte South.

Their only loss was 4-3 at
Ann Arbor. In that game, they
blew a 3-1 lead heading into
the final period.

With Latimer healthy, the
Lady Norsemen are a legiti-
mate contender for the state
title. It would be the pro-
gram's first-ever.

Latimer, who holds a 3.5
grade point average, played
rollerhockey for eight years
before starting ice hockey the
summer before her freshman
year of high school.

"I have to give coach Tim
(Van Eckoute) and Dockett
credit for being patient with
me and giving me a chance to
play for my high school," she
said. "I never skated on ice
until that summer before my
freshman year at North. Now,
I can't get enough hockey."

Both her parents competed
in athletics, which has helped
the 5-foot, 8-inch Latimer hold
her own on the ice.

240.—Fracture 01 the middle
of the clavicle*

Katie Latimer is focused on ending the girls ice hockey season
on a strong note after missing nearly the entire first half with a
broken collarbone.

DRAWING FROM GRAY'S ANATOMY

Fracture of the middle of the clavicle

Other coaches at North
have asked Latimer to play

Presented by...
Award Winning Singer and Evangelist

Katrina Rae
and her husband

John Daughenbaugh

467 Fairford Road (at Momingside)

Grosse Pointe Woods

Saturday, February 2nd • Concert at 7:00 pm
Monday, Tuesday & Wednesday

February 4 - 6 at 7:00 pm

Admission is Free
For More Information...

www.olsos.org or 313.884.5554

their particular sport, but she
said her true love is hockey
and she needs the time to get
good grades.

"I want to be an engineer

when I graduate from college
and maybe work with pros-
thetics," Latimer said.

She said her college choices
are narrowed down to
Michigan State University,
Western Michigan University
and Michigan Tech
University.

Each college fields a club
hockey team, and Latimer
said she wants to join.

"I want to continue playing
hockey in college and my
choices have programs," she
said. "Playing hockey is awe-
some, but I know it is impor-
tant I get good grades and
graduate from college with a
degree."

"I'm proud of Katie and her

brother, Kiel, because they
both give it their best," Sharon
Latimer said. "Katie has had
to adapt to a few changes
growing up and she has done
a wonderful job of being a
very strong and compassion-
ate daughter."

"I see Katie as a confident
high school senior who knows
it takes hard work to accom-
plish her goals," Charlie
Latimer said. "This injury set

" her back a little, but now she
is back and ready to go."

Latimer will be ready when
the Lady Norsemen end their
regular season on Valentine's
Day, Thursday, Feb. 14, at
South. A division title might
be on the line.

Lia Simcina, daughter of
Zairo Maio of Grosse Pointe
Shores and David Simcina of
Portland, Ore., has been
named to the Dean's List at
Michigan State University for
the fall semester. She is a grad-

uate of Grosse Pointe South
High School.

• • •
Maria Simcina, a 2007 grad-

uate of Grosse Pointe South
High School, has been named
to the Dean's List at Michigan

LAZARE'S

MASSIVE SEASON END

CLEARANCE

U P T O O U % O F F

EVERYTHING MUST GO
(In Stock Merchandise Only)

ALL FURS, SHEARLINGS, LEATHERS, FINE FABRICS

SPORTSWEAR, HANDBAGS, GLOVES, SCARVES

493 Ouellette Ave. Windsor, Canada, (313) 961-4731, (888) 520-2737
Mon - Sat 9-6, lazares.com

State University for the fall se-
mester.

She is the daughter of Zairo
Maio of Grosse Pointe Shores
and David Simcina of
Portland, Ore.

• • •
Taylor McCarty of Grosse

Pointe Shores has been named
to the Dean's list at Miami
University (Ohio) for the fall
semester. He is a graduate of
Grosse Pointe North High
School.

• • •
Donald Badaczewski grad-

uated from the University of
Michigan Law School and is
employed as an attorney with
the firm of Dechert, LLP in
New York City. The 2000
Grosse Pointe South High
School graduate is also a 2004
graduate of the University of
Virginia.

He is the son of Donald and
Audrey Badaczewski of
Grosse Pointe Park.

• • •
Philip Black, son of Jim and

Maj-Britt Black of the City of
Grosse Pointe, has been
named to the Dean's List at
Michigan State University for
the fall semester.

• • • . :
Lauren J. Abke of Grosse

Pointe Farms has been named
to the Pean's list at Wfestern
Michigan University for the
fall semester.

NATIONAL Why not surprise someone with Michigan's
Finest Coney Island Chili Sauce?

That's right, you can now order
National Coney Island's chili sauce

and hot dogs to enjoy at home.
Place your order today!

Nationwide delivery available.
6700 East Davison • Detroit, MI 48212

Tel. 313-365-5611
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FACES & PLACES

;> The 2008 North American
^International Auto Show's an-
; vnual black-tie CharityPreview
;!!on Friday, Jan. 18, at Cobo
•„:Center welcomed a]sell-out
< crowd of 15,000 guests and
' raised $6 million for children's
',& charities. j . •
.#• The event also featured an
%• acoustic preview performance
!|by the Barenaked Ladies at
;f* the ribbon cutting ceremony
-tand an hour and 15 minute
fi show at Cobo Arena..
<t "It was a fantastic!evening
-1 for children and a grand night
'{[for Detroit," said Carl
1 Galeana, senior co-chairman
~;for the NAIAS 2008. ,

"The Barenaked Ladies per-
formance was the fiijst of its
kind for the NAIAS iand we
are incredibly pleased with
the results. Both ; perfor-
mances by/the Batfenaked
Ladies were amazing) and we

|think they really gav6 our at-
^tendees, a night to refnember
at the Charity Previewj"

c Band members — Ed
f Robertson, Steven Page, Tyler
I Stewart, Jim Creeggan and
I Kevin Hearn, a top concert at-
Itraction — entertained crowds
fwith top hits, "If It Had A
I Million Dollars," "Pin£h Me,"
§"Brian Wilson," "The Old
§ Apartment," the Billboard
iNumber One Hit "One Week"
land other songs. I;
* Since its inception in 1976,

the event has raised $77 mil-
lion for children's charities in
! metro Detroit and more than
$60 million of that in the last
10 years alone. The purchase

/(of a single Charity Preview
.' ticket buys goods, clothing
" and health and support ser-
" vices for many local kids.

The NAIAS Charity Preview
has welcomed many local, na-
tional and worldwide celebri-
ties including Aretha
Franklin; Kelis, R&B singer;
DJ Funk Master Flex; Hall &
Oates; Celine Dion; comedi-
ans Steve Harvey and Tommy
Davidson; Kevin Bacon; Kid
Rock; Jay Leno; Veronica
Webb; Tony Danza; Jeff
Daniels; Omarosa; and Rachel
Ray.

Beneficiaries of the 2008
Charity Preview include:
Barat Child and Family
Services; Boys & Girls Club of
Southeastern Michigan; Boys
Hope-Girls Hope of Detroit;
The Children's Center; the
Children's Homes of Judson
Center; Children's Hospital of
Michigan; Children's Services
of Northeast Guidance Center
Assistance League; the DADA
Charitable Foundation Fund, a
fund of the Community
Foundation for Southeast
Michigan; The Detroit
Institute for Children; Easter
Seals — Michigan; the March
of Dimes; and ThinkDetroit

PAL.
Any charity interested in ap-

plying for a grant from the
Detroit Auto Dealers
Association Charitable
Foundation Fund for next
year's Charity Preview should
contact the Community
Foundation for Southeast
Michigan, 333 West Fort

Street, Suite 2010, Detroit, MI
48226-3134, (313) 961-6675,
or visit the foundation Web
site, cfsem.org.

PHOTOS BYBRUCEHUBBARD

Above left, Jim Press of Chrysler with Grosse Pointer Bonnie
Lyunch at the Firehouse party during the North American
International Auto Show.
Left, John McCandlass of Grosse Pointe Woods, left, with Joe
and Beth Moran of Grosse Pointe Farms.
Above, Paul and Melissa Kieswetter.

' Women's self defense
Self defense for wc-rtien from

^ 7 to 9 p.m., Tuesdsay, Feb. 5, of-
f' fered by live Safe Academy, is
J' a hands-on course that gives
r women life-saving skills that
1 increase one's safety.

The skills taught are time
tested, realistic and easy to re-

**tain and call into action under
stress. '

The class is also «a great
stress reliever. The cost is $20
and taught at the; Grosse

,. Pointe War Memorial.:
The War Memorial is located

' at 32 Lakeshore, Grosse Pointe
Farms. Parking is lighted and

'? free. To register for classes, call
f (313) 881-7511.

grades 6-12.
Ski trips to Pine Knob depart

the War Memorial at 4:30 p.m.
and return at 11:30 p.m.
Fridays through March 7.
Participants must become a
Ski HI Club Member for a fee
of $30. The cost per trip is $48
without ski rental; $64 with
rental; or $67 for snowboard
rental.

A special Mid Winter Break
trip to Mt. Holly is planned
from 9:30 to 5:30 p.m. Feb. 20
and non-member guests are
welcome.

The Grosse Pointe War
Memorial is located at 32
Lakeshore Drive, Grosse
Pointe Farms. To register for
classes, call (313) 881-7511.

No. 243 meets at 11 a.m.
Thursday, Feb. 7, and is hosted
by Lillian Iicata.

Following a business meet-
ing, Carol Birtchford will dis-
cuss the Underground
Railroad.

Lunch will be served.
R.S.VP. to licata by Monday,

Feb. 4.

Congratulations from your children:
Liz and Bob, Al and Nancy, Doug, Rob

and grandchildren
Lindsay, Bob, Al and Ryan

War Memorial
Dances, driving lesions and

'* ski trips top the list of Activities
' for area youth offered by the

Grosse Pointe War Metnorial.
•! Middle schoolers can take

over the Lakeside Ballroom on
. Friday Feb. 8 for a Valentines
'Day dance and again Friday,
"rMarch 14 to celebrate St.

'"Patrick's Day.
[ Students must have a valid

;* War Memorial ID card (the fee
/is $5) and proof they attend

1 school in the community.
/' Tickets for the dances are
^$10 when purchased in ad-
vance and $12 the week of the

tJ event. They will not be sold at
rthedoor.

The Grosse Pointe Driving
, School is offering driver's
v training courses throughout
1 the year at the ^^ar Memorial
' for students at least 14 years, 8
^months old. The class is of-
fered at two levels withthe first
providing 24 hours of class-
room instruction and six hours

.''on the road. The second, com-
0 prised of three clashes, re-
J quires participants to'have a
JI Level 1 license and 30 hours

driving experience with a par-
ent.

if Fees are $279 for the first
£ segment and $40 for the sec-

ond. Level One classes are of-
fered Feb. 18 through March 6
and March 10 through April 3.
Level Two classes are sched-
uled for Feb 4,5 and 7; Feb 18,
19 and 21; March 3, 4 and 6;
andMarchl7,18and20.

Teens can also take,to the
slopes with The Ski Hi Club for
Teens open to Grosse Pointe
school district students in

AAUW

The American Association of
University Women, Grosse
Pointe Branch, holds its annual
international program at 7
p.m., Thursday, Feb. 7, at the
home of co-president Carolyn
Barth of Grosse Pointe Woods.

The topic, "The Modern
Chinese Woman," features
Xuiqing V&ng, a Chinese lan-
guage teacher at Warren
Woods High School.

Desserts and coffee will be
served. The meeting is open to
the community.

Call (313) 881-0409 regard-
ing the location and to make
reservations. Admission is free.

Earm&garden
Grosse Pointe Shores

branch of the Women's
National Farm & Garden
Association meets at 11:30
a.m., Friday, Feb. 1, with host-
ess Lynn Kiley, 1285 Grayton,

Co-hostesses are Colleen
Kelly and Roma Thrasher.

Laura Kennedy will discuss
the GPWM Children's garden.

Herb society
The Herb Society of

America/Grosse Pointe unit
meets from 7 to 9 p.m.
Wednesday, Feb. 13, in the
board room of the Children's
Home of Detroit, 900 Cook,
Grosse Pointe Woods.

Mary Northcutt will present
the lore and history of the mus-
tard plant. A mustard-making
demonstration and tasting is
included.

For more information, call
Barbara Hayes at (313) 881-
1237.

Alzheimer's support
A support group for care-

givers of individuals with
memory loss meets from 1 to 3
p.m. Monday, Feb. 18 at A
Friend's House Adult Day.
Services.

The group is for anyone car-
ing for or concerned about a
family member or friend with
memory loss. On-site respite
services are available for a fee.

Sponsored by Catholic
Services of Macomb, A
Friend's House is located at
15945 Canal, Clinton
Township.

For additional information or
to pre-register, call (586) 412-
8494.

Boat club
A general meeting of the

Grosse Pointe Farms Boat Club
begins at 7 p.m. Friday, Feb. 8,
at the Grosse Pointe Farms
Pier Park boathduse.

Social time, light snacks and
refreshments begin at 6:30
p.m. All residents of the Farms
can attend. New members are
welcome and should call
Nadin&Pendolinoat (313) 882-
8595 for more information.

Questers
Questers Pera'pointe Chapter

Fox Creek Questers
Fox Creek Questers No. 216

meet at 12:30 p.m. Thursday,
Feb. 7, at the home of Marry
Miller.

Marie Lane is the co-hostess.
Ann Thomas will discuss

"Life after 50" by Ulla
Hettinger.

Grosse Pointe War Memorial's Channels
5

and
915

24hr
Television

For the
Whole

Community

February 4 to February 10
8:30 am Vitality Plus (Aerobics)
9:00 am Musical Storytime
9:30 am Fointes of Horticulture
10:00 am Who's in toe Kitchen?
10:30 am Things to Do at the War Memorial
11:00 am Out of the Ordinary
n:30amTech Poiotes

12:00 pm Economic Club of Detroit
1:00 pm The SOC Show
1:30 pm Great Lakes Log
2:00 pm The John Prost Show
2:30 pm The legal Insider
3:00 pm Things to Do at the War Memorial
3:30 pm Watercolor Workshop
4:00 pm Vitality Plus (Tone)
4:30 pm Musical Storytime
5:00 pm Positively Positive
5:30 cm The SOC Show
6:00 pm The Legal Insider
6:30 om Who's in the Kitchen
7:00 pm Vitality Plus (Step/Kick Boxing)
7:30 pm Things to Do at the War Memorial
8:00 pm Positively Positive
8:30 pm Tech Pointes
9:00 pm Watercolor Workshop
9:30 pm Pointes of Horticulture
10:00 pm The John Prost Show
10:30 pm Great Lakes Log
11:00 pm Out of the Ordinary
11:30 pm Tech Pointes

Midnight Economic Club of Detroit
1:00 am The SOC Show
1:30 am Great Lakes Log
2:00 am The John Prost Show
2:30 am Tech Pointes
3:00 am Watercolor Workshop
3:30 am Pointes of Horticulture
4:00 am The John Prost Show
4:30 am Great Lakes Log
5:00 am Out of the Ordinary
5:30 am The Legal Insider
6:00 am Things to Do at the War Memorial
6:30 am Watercolor Workshop
7:00 am Vitality Plus { Tone)
7:30 am Musical Storytime
8:00 am Positively Positive

Featured Guests
Who's in the Kitchen?
Doug Cordier - Rotolone d'uovo

Things to Do at the War Memorial
Chamber Music, Massage for Couples,
Veterans Club & Babysitting Course

Out of the Ordinary
Zohra Gideon & Jane E. Hart
New Year / New You

TechPoistes
Adam Lincoln - Free applications

Economic Club of Detroit
The Honorable Mike Huckabee,
2008 Presidential Candidate

The SOC Show
BobStuber-SafelyExpert Parti

Great Lakes Los
Gary Morgan - Clinton River Watershed

The John Prost Show
Gary Severn, Michael LeVan

. Board of Realtors Property Tax Seminar
Stan Harr & Jan Stewart
Detroit Concert Choir

The Leeal Insider
Kym Worthy - Wayne County Prosecutor

Watercolor Workshop
Flowers in a Vase Part II

A DVD Copy of any
WMTV

program can be obtained for
$20

Schedule subject to change without notice.
For further information call, 313-881-7511
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CHURCHES

Cellist David Levine and pianist Wesley Hshwick

Open Door series
A special editiori of the Open'

Door Series at First English
Evangelical Lutheran Church,
800 Vernier, Grosse Pointe
>Mx>ds, presents cellist David
Levine and pianist Wesley
Fishwick in recital at 4 p.m.,
Sunday, Feb. 10.

The duo celebrates its 40th
anniversary of performing to-
gether *The Shostakovich
Sonata for Cello and Piano
"Opus 40", as well as works by
Bach, Vivaldi, Beethoven and
Rachmaninoff.

Tickets at the door are $8 for
adults and $5 for students.

Levine is known throughout
the Metro Detroit area as a so-
lo performer, chamber musi-
cian, teacher and coach.

Levine earned a degree in
cello performance from
Wayne State University. He
was a member of the Detroit
Symphony Orchestra and the
Cleveland Orchestra.

He performs, coaches cham-
ber music and teaches.

Fishwick began exploring
the piano at age 3 and took for-
mal lessons at age 5. ^ ^ ^ ,

His primary teacher was

Mischa Kbtjler, former pianist
with the ^Detroit Symphony
Orchestra and studio pianist at
WWJRadio.

Fishwick took first prize in
the Grinnell Piano
Competition and Young
Keyboard Artists International
Piano Competition at the
University of Michigan. He
participated in the 1974
Tchaikovsky International
Competition in Moscow.
Fishwick is a classroom
teacher in the Macomb
Intermediate School District.

church office at (313) 884-
5040.

Ash Wednesday
Grosse Pointe

Congregational Church, 240
Chalfonte, will hold a special 7
p.m. service in honor of Ash
Wednesday, Feb. 6.

FMth Circle
The Vfomen of the Church in

Faith Circle at First English
Evangelical Lutheran Church
hold its annual Valentine salad
luncheon and card party at
noon, Tuesday, Feb. 12, in The
Luther Center, 800 Vernier at
V\fedgewood in Grosse Pointe
Woods.

The cost is $8 with door
prizes and table prizes will be
provided. Bring your own
cards orjume, of your choice.
To make Reservations, call the

Assumption programs
A variety of exercise, fitness

and special interest programs
are available at Assumption
Cultural Center in St. Clair
Shores.

Choose from kalosomatics
exercise classes for children
and adults from beginners to
the more experienced as well
as adult yoga and tae kwon do
karate classes. There are also
parents and tots/play group
classes.

Special interest classes in-
clude bridge club, Ace Driving
and Kumon math and reading
programs.

.,.5CaU (5§6)r, 779-6111, ext. 4
fbr more information.

PASTOR'S CORNER By Kent Coomer

Don't let negativity
overwhelm you
A

ccording to the
Abingdon Bible
Commentary,
Psalmll8 from the
Bible is the last of

the "Hallel" psalms. They are
so-called due to their frequent
use of the term Hallelujah or
"Praise the Loril."

In part, this psalm reads, "all
Israel is urged to praise
Jehovah because of his unfail-
ing goodness." The first and
last verses both state "O give
thanks unto the Lord; for he is
good... his mercy endureth for
ever."

The benefit from contemplat-
ing these praises comes not
from appeasing or tcbrownnos-
ing" a tribal god or king so that
we may receive their favor, but
in realizing the inherent good-
ness and majesty of an urilimit-
ed God, so that the problems in
our rather limited lives don't
overwhelm us. The infinity of
God in prayer or meditation

uplifts us from our concerns
with and provides a whole dif-
ferent outlook, which can re-
fresh and heal us.

There's certainly no lack of
negativity out there with which
to deal! World events, natural
disasters, mass economic chal-
lenges, political intrigue and
stridency, combined with per-
sonal safety concerns, health
problems, individual debt and
much more are continually
bombarding us from all angles.
As important and arresting as
all these problems are, their
eventual solution comes from
an enlightened sense of man's
spiritual relationship to our
heavenly Father-Mother.

Jesus illustrated this concept
when he was asleep on the
boat during a severe storm,
while his disciples fretted for
their very lives (see Matthew
8:23-27). Were they legitimate-
ly in peril? Of course! People
perished in such storms regu-

larly, and the situation looked
very dire. How dare Jesus sleep
and ignore that every passen-
ger's existence was threatened!
When out of desperation the
disciples awoke Jesus. He re-
mained unimpressed with the
circumstances and simply
asked them, "Why are ye fear-
ful, O yeof little faith?" After
Jesus calmed the disciples' fear,
the Bible says that he "rebuked
the winds and the sea and
there was a great calm."

So when we're faced with a
myriad daily life challenges, we
have to choose whether to fo-
cus on the stormy circumr
stances or to instead seek the
spiritual calm that Jesus exem-
plified. If we can turn away
from the storm and "praise the
Lord" instead, fresh perspec-
tives can lead to practical solu-
tions to little and big problems.

Kant Commer is a member of
the local Christian Science con-
gregation.

Isabella Dorothy
and

Portia Catherine
Sanchez

Steve and Angela (Rusen)
Sanchez of Marietta, Ga., are
the parents of twin daughters,
Isabella Dorothy and Portia
Catherine Sanchez, born Aug.
23,2007.

The maternal grandparents
are Hein and Beverly Rusen of
Sarasota, Fla., formerly of
Grosse Pointe Shores.

The paternal grandparents
are Francisco and Patricia

Sanchez
Shores.

of Grosse Pointe

nal grandparents.
Gulli Bodin of Katrineholm,

Sweden, is the maternal great-
grandmother.

Paternal great-grandparents
are Grace and John McLellan
Jr. of Grosse Pointe Farms.

Mats Jonatan Duffy
Michael and Lena Duffy of

the City of Grosse Pointe are
the parents of a son, Mats
Jonatan Duffy, born Oct. 3,
2007.

The maternal grandparents
are Hans and Karin Eriksson
of Katrineholm, Sweden.

Gail McLellan of Euless,
Texas, and Mike Duffy Sr. of
St. Clair Shores are the pater-

Madeleine Sarah
Grabruck

Erick and Jennifer Grabruck
of Grosse Pointe Farms are the
parents of a daughter,
Madeleine Sarah Grabruck.

The grandparents are David
and Sandy Collins of Shelby
Township, William Grabruck
of Grosse Pointe Farms and
Fred and Linda Costa of
Traverse City.

Bethel Baptist
Church

24600 Little Mack Ave,, St. Clair Shores
(586) 772-2520

Ministering to Detroit's eastside since 1864
Sunday Worship 10:45 a.m., 6 p.m.

Sunday School 9:30 a.m.

Wednesday AWANA Clubs 6:30 p.m.
and adult Bible Study 7 p.m.

Dr. J. Robert Cosand, Pastor
Scott Beaman, Youth Pastor

www.bethetbaptlstscs.org

.Saint
nmbjose

Parish

Saturday Vigil Mass
at 4:00 p.m.

Sunday Masses
at 8:30 fie 11:15 a.m.

St. Ambrose Roman Catholic Church
15020 Hampton, Grosse Pointe Park

One block north of Jefferson,
at Maryland

WORSHIP
VICE

mi-wir.

m
St. Paul Ev. Lutheran Church

375 Lothrop at Chalfonte
881-6670

9:00 a.m. Worship
10:10 a.m. Education Hour

11:15 a.m. Worship

Nursery Available

Rev. Frederick Harms, Pastor
Rev. Morsal Collier, Assoc. Pastor

Grosse Pointe Baptist Church
Christ Centered and Caring -

Committed to Youth and Community
Sunday Worship - 11:00 AM

Sunday School - 9:30 AM for Age 2 - Adult
Awana Clubs Wednesday @ 6:15 p.m.

Middle School Youth meet Wednesday at 6:30p.m.
Senior High Youth meet Tuesdays at 7:00p.m.

21336 Mack Avenue Grosse Pointe Woods
Phone: (313) 881-3343

CHRISTIAN SCIENCE CHURCH
First Church of Christ, Scientist

282 Chalfonte Ave.

Sunday Service -11:00 a.m. -12:00 p.m.
Wednesday Testimony Meeting

7:30 p.m. -8:30 p.m.

All are warmly welcome at both services
Free Childcare provided

Questions? 884-2426

GRACE UNITED
CHURCH OF CHRIST
1175 Lakepointe at Kercheval

Grosse Pointe Park 822-3823

Sunday - Worship 10:30 a.m.

Tuesday-Thrift Shop 10:30-3:30

Wednesday - Amazing Grace Seniors
every second Wednesday at

The Tompkins Center at
Windmill Pointe Park 11:00 - 3:00

COME JOIN US

Pastor: Marguerite (Margo) Allen

Jefferson Jlvenue
iPresByterian Church
Serving Christ in Detroit for over 153 years

r

Christ the King
Lutheran Church

Mack at Lochmoor
884-5090

8:15 & 10:45 a.m, - Worship Service
9:30 a.m.-Sunday School

& Bible Classes
Supervised Nursery Provided

www.christthekinggp.org

Randy S. Boelter, Pastor

fotomifoimrs'
A House of Prayer for All People

Traditional Anglican Worship
Since 1842

SUNDAY
8:30a.m. and 11:00 a.m - Holy Communion
11:00 a.m. -Church Sunday School

and Nursery

THURSDAY
12:10 p.m. -Holy Communion

170 E Jefferson Avenue
On Hart Plaza at the Tunnel

Free Secured Parking in Ford Garage
with entrance in the median strip

of Jefferson at Woodward

Grosse Pointe
Congregational Church

10:00 am. FAMILYWORSHIP
(crib room available)

10:15 am. Church School

240 CHALFONTE AT LOTHROP

www.gpcong.org

gpcong@sbcglobal.net

884-3075

AFFILIATED WITH THE UCC AND ABC

FIRST ENGLISH EVANGELICAL
LUTHERAN CHURCH
800 Vernier Road (ta«otw

} (313)884-5040
8:15am- Traditional Worship
9:30 a r t - Contemporary Worship
9:30am- SundaySchool

11:00 am- Traditional Worship
:•• Nursery Available

Rev. Walter A. Schmidt, Pastor

Grosse Pointe
Unitarian Church

February 3, 2008
10:30 a.m. Service

"Soine Heroes"
Rev. John Corrado

17150 MAUMEE
881-0420

Visit us at www.gpuc.us

WELCOME

m$ mm

St James
Lutheran Church

"ontheHif
170 McMillan Road
Grosse Pointe Fanns

Sunday
9:00 a.m. Education for all
10:15 a.m. Holy Eucharist

Sunday, February 3, 2008
9:00?Adult Bible Study

10:30 a.m. Worship Service
Sermon: "The Beloved Community"

Scripture: Jonah 3:1-5 & 10;
Psalm 2 and Matthew 5:14-16

The Rev. Dr. Ronald Peters, Guest Preacher
Associate Professor of Urban Ministry

Pittsburgh Theological Seminary

Church School: Crib - 8th Grade

Parking Lot 8625 E. Jefferson at Burns, Detroit

GROSSE POINTE
MEMORIAL CHURCH

Established 1865
The Presbyterian Church (USA)

A STEPHEN MINISTRY and
LOCOS Congregation

16 Lakeshore Drive
Grosse Pointe Farms '

313-882-5330
www.gpmch urdi.org

(313)-259-2206
marinerschurchofdetroit.org

9 & 11:00 AM Worship Services ]

in the Sanctuary

The Rev. Peter Henry, preaching
Holy Communion

"Children and Worship" Program

for Preschool through
2nd grade at 9 a.m. Service

8:45 -12:15 PM Crib & Toddler Care

7:30 AM Friday Ecumenical Men's Breakfast I

Sunday Worship 10:30 a.m.

Christian Education for ail - 8:15 am.
Wednesday Bible Study - 5:30 p,m.

til

Rev. Elizabeth Arakstoi, Assoc. Pastor

Wednesday
Noon Holy Eucharist

313-884-0511
sqamesgp@ameritech.net

Grosse Pointe
UNITED METHODIST

M CHURCH
W" A Friendly Church for AH Ages
W 211 Moross Rd.

i Grosse Pointe Farms
886-2363

SUNDAYWORSHIP
9:30 a.m. Worship

CHURCH SCHOOL
9:45 am. Church School -4 yrs. - 5th Grade

10:45 am Church School - Middle & Senior High
11:00 am Adult Church School

Nursery & Toddler Care Provided

L O G O S Congregation

Rev. Robert D. Wright-Pastor
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Colson-
Gracey

Mr. and Mrs. Larry Walton
Colson of Vaidosta, Ga., have
announced the engagement of
their daughter, Allison
Courtney Colson, to David
William Gracey, son of Judge
and Mrs. Paul Clement Gracey
of Grosse Pointe Farms. A June
wedding is planned.

Colson's maternal grandpar-
ents are the late Mr. and Mrs.
Lester Webster McKee. Her pa-
ternal grandparents are Mr.
and Mrs. George Wallace
Colson of Vaidosta, Ga. Colson
is a graduate of Vaidosta High
School and earned a Bachelor
of Science degree in communi-
cations from Georgia Southern
University. She is with CNN in
the Washington, D.C. bureau
as a producer for all CNN net-
works.

Gracey's maternal grandpar-
ents are the late Mr. and Mrs.
Andrew Krywy. His paternal
grandparents are the late Mr.
and Mrs. Harold Clement
Gracey.

He graduated from Grosse
Pointe South High School and
earned a Bachelor of Arts de-
gree in political science from
the University of Michigan. He
is with CNN in the
Washington, D.C. bureau on
the show "The Situation Room
with Wolf BUtzer."

Kirchner-
Elley

Ken and Susan Kirchner of
Grosse Pointe Farms have an-
nounced the engagement of
their daughter, Alexis
Hbllerbach Kirchner, to
Stanley Jed Elley, son of Lesley
Klerck and Stan Elley of
Capetown, South Africa. A
July wedding is planned.

Kirchner is a graduate of the
Grosse Pointe Academy and
University Liggett School. She
earned two Bachelor of Arts
degrees from the University of
Colorado, Boulder, in commu-
nications and theater. She is an
account coordinator with
Nordstrom Northern
California Estee Lauder.

Elley earned a Bachelor of
Arts in sports management
from Cape Peninsula
University of Technology
South Africa.

He is the founder of the
Tornadoes Rugby Club in
Capetown, is a sports market-
ing and management consul-
tant and a rugby, soccer and
cricket coach.

Cassin -
Miller '

Dr. and Mrs. Bader J. Cassin
of Grosse Pointe Farms have
announced the'engagement of
their daughter, Laura L Cassin,
to Andrew Leonard Brooks
Miller, son of Mr. and Mrs.
Thomas C. Miller of Grosse
Pointe Park. A June wedding is
planned.

Cassin is a 1998 graduate of
University Liggett School. She
earned a Bachelor of Arts from
Wayne State University and a
Master of Business
Administration from
University Detroit-Mercy. She
is the vice president of retail fi-
nancial services with JP
Morgan Chase.

Miller graduated from
Grosse Pointe South High
School in 1998. He attended
Hillsdale College and is the
sales director for Quicken
Loans.

Hempstead-
Fajardo

David and Cynthia
Hempstead of Grosse Pointe
Park have announced the en-
gagement of their daughter,
Kathryn Hempstead, to Javier
Fajardo, son of Javier and
Thirza Fajardo, of Caracas,
Venezuela. A May wedding is
planned.

Hempstead earned a
Bachelor of Science degree in
dietetics from Miami
University of Oxford, Ohio and
a Master of Science degree in
dietetics and nutrition from
Loyola University. She is a di-
etitian for oncology/hematol-
ogy at the University of Illinois

at Chicago Medical Center. '
Fajardo earned a Bachelor of

Science degree from St.
Ignacio de Loyola, Caracas,
Venezuela, and an M.D. degree
from Universidad Central de
Venezuela. He was an OB/GYN
resident at the University of
Illinois Chicago and is an
OB/GYN at Northwestern
Memorial Hospital in Chicago.

Chapman -
Jones

Thomas and Mary Chapman
of Grosse Pointe Farms have
announced the engagement of
their daughter, Ann Marie
Chapman, to Drew Allen
Jones, son of Robert and Karen
Jones of Wyoming. A May
wedding is planned.

Chapman graduated from
Grosse Pointe North High
School in 2004 and is to receive
a Bachelor of Science degree
in nursing from Grand Valley
State University in April. She is
a nurse technician at Spectrum
Health's Blodgett Hospital in
the adult critical care unit,
Grand Rapids.

Jones graduated from
Rogers High School in
Wyoming in 2003 and is to re-
ceive a Bachelor of Science de-
gree in political science from
Grand Valley State University
in April. He is an intern at the
American Heart Association.

Luzadre -
Loch

Phil and Karen Horn of
Grosse Pointe Farms and John
and Rebecca Luzadre of
Exeter, N.H., have announced
the engagement of their
daughter, Elizabeth Luzadre, to
Ian Loch, son of Robert and
Taryn Loch of Dover, N.H. and
Dave and Cathy Fessenden of
Portsmouth, N.H. A July wed-
ding is planned.

Luzadre graduated from
Grosse Pointe South High
School in 1997, earned a
Bachelor of Arts degree in
English from the University of
Michigan and a Master of
Education in elementary edu-
cation from the University of
New Hampshire. She is a
teacher in Concord, N.H.

Loch is pursuing a degree in
information systems technolo-
gy from New Hampshire
Community Technology
College. He is in restaurant
management in Portsmouth,
N.H.

Boyer -
Kris

Mr. and Mrs. Douglas Boyer
of Atwood, formerly of Grosse
Pointe Farms, have announced
the engagement of their
daughter, Katherine (Kami)
Margaret Boyer, to Gregory
Paul Kris, son of Mrs.
Dominique Rallier of Rennes,
France, and Andrew Kris of
Antwerp, Belgium. An August
wedding is planned.

Boyer is a 2002 graduate of
Lake Forest College and is vice
president of sales and market-
ing for Retail Decisions in
Providence, R.I.

She is the granddaughter of
John Boyle of the City of
Grosse Pointe and Francis
Boyer, a former Grosse Pointe
Farms resident.

Kris graduated from Keele
University and is president of
Fresh Enterprise in London,
England.

Kopf-
Stover

Bruce and Susan Kopf of
Grosse Pointe Shores have an-
nounced the engagement of
their daughter, Jane Victoria
Kopf, to Victor William Stover,
son of David and Jeannette
Stover of Ann Arbor. An
August wedding is planned.

Kopf is a 1999 Grosse Pointe
North High school graduate.
She earned a Bachelor of Arts
degree in biology from
Kalamazoo College and a
Master of Arts degree in edu-
cation from the University of
Michigan.

She is an English as a second
language teacher in Bellevue,
Washington.

Stover graduated from Ann
Arbor Pioneer High School in
2000 and earned a Bachelor of
Arts degree in economics and
business from Kalamazoo
College. He is pursuing a
Master of Urban Planning de-
gree at the University of
Washington.

Foltz-
Bargnes

Dennis and Kathryn Foltz of
Mount Carroll, 111., announce
the engagement of their
daughter, Jessica Marie Foltz,
to Oscar Guy Bargnes HI of
Chicago, 111., son of Oscar and
Patricia Bargnes of the City of
Grosse Pointe. An August wed-
ding is planned.

Foltz earned a Bachelor of
Arts degree in English in 2001,
from the University of Illinois
and graduated with a Juris
Doctor in 2004 from the
Loyola University Chicago
School of Law. She is an attor-
ney in Chicago with Scariano,
Himes and Petrarca, Chtd.

Bargnes earned a Bachelor
of Science degree in econom-
ics from the University of
Michigan. He is a derivatives
trader for Jump Trading in
Chicago.

Merchant -
Ghesquiere

Mark and Diana Merchant
of Burt have announced the
engagement of their daughter,
Tracy Merchant, to Michael
Ghesquiere Jr., son of Mike
and Lynn Ghesquiere of
Columbus. A June wedding is
planned.

Merchant earned a Bachelor
of Science degree from
Michigan State University and
a Master's of Accounting de-
gree from Walsh College. She
is an accountant.

Ghesquiere earned a
Bachelor of Administration de-
gree from Davenport
University and a Bachelor of
Science degree in computer
science from Michigan State
University. He is in the family
business.

Mayberry -
Morawski

Mr. and Mrs. Donald
Mayberry of Dearborn have
announced the engagement of
their daughter, Sara Michele
Mayberry, to Matthew William
Morawski, son of Mr. and Mrs.
Thomas Morawski of Grosse
Pointe Woods. An August wed-
ding is planned.

Mayberry graduated from
Dearborn High School and
earned a Bachelor of Science
degree in biology and a Master
of Public Health degree from
the University of Michigan.
She is the senior medical pro-
ducer at WDIV-TV

Morawski graduated from
Grosse Pointe North High
School and earned a Bachelor
of Arts in Journalism from
Wayne State University.

He is a new producer at
WDIV-TV

Hendley -
Emery

Mr. and Mrs. Noel Alan
Hendley of Greer, S.C. have an-
nounced the engagement of
their daughter, Jessica
Winifred Hendley, to Hardy
Lott Emery, son of William Lott
and Greta Emery of Greenville,
S.C., formerly of Grosse Pointe
Shores. An April wedding is
planned.

Hendley earned a Bachelor
of Arts degree in psychology
from the University of South
Carolina. She plans to pursue a
master's degree in counseling.

Emery earned a Bachelor of
Fine Arts degree in visual com-
munications from Kendall
College of Art and Design. He
is the senior designer for
Adrenaline.

Radatz -
Berschback

Bill and Anne Radatz of St.
Clair Shores have announced
the engagement of their

Allison Courtney Colson and
David William Gracey

Laura L. Cassin and Andrew
Leonard Brooks Miller

Drew Allen Jones and Ann
Marie Chapman

Katherine Margaret Boyer
and Gregory Paul Kris

Javier Fajardo and Kathryn
Hempstead

Elizabeth Luzadre and Ian
Loch

Tracy Merchant and Michael
Ghesquiere Jr.

Nicole Marie Baker and
Benjamin J. Karle

Nathan Wolf and Jill Bramos

Hardy Lott Emery and Jessica
Winifred Hendley

Emily Ann Radatz and
Michael Scott Berschback

daughter, Emily Ann Radatz, to
Michael Scott Berschback, son
of Jim and Karen Berschback,
of Grosse Pointe. A June wed-
ding is planned.

Radatz earned a Bachelor of
Science degree from Madonna
University in family and con-
sumer science and business
administration. She is an asso-
ciate advancement director at
Regina High School in Warren.

Berschback earned a
Bachelor.of Science degree
from Central * Michigan
University in meteorology. He
is a meteorologist for The
Weather Network in Oakville,
Ontario.

Stanley Jed Elley and Alexis
Hollerbach Kirchner

Baker -
Karle

Jean and Gary Baker of
Muskegon have announced
the engagement of their
daughter, Nicole Marie Baker,
to Benjamin J. Karle, son of
Barbara and Bob Karle of the
City of Grosse Pointe. A July
wedding is planned.

Baker earned a Bachelor of
Science degree from Western
Michigan University and is a
biology, chemistry and envi-
ronmental science teacher at
Three Rivers High School,

Karle earned a Bachelor of
Social Work degree and a
Master of Social Work from
Western- Michigan University.
He is a family therapist and so-
cial worker for St. Joseph
County.

Bramos -
Wolf

Michael and Judith Bramos
of Harper Woods have an-
nounced the engagement of
their daughter, Jill Bramos, to
Nathan Wolf, son of Karl and
Cynthia Wolf of Schaumburg,
111. A July wedding is planned.

Bramos earned a degree in
Bachelor of Arts degree in sec-
ondary education from Hope
College. She is a math teacher
at Hamilton High School.

Wolf earned a Bachelor of
Science degree in mechanical
engineering from Michigan
Technological University.

He is pursuing a Master of
Business Administration, de-
gree at Grand Valley State
University.

He is an account manager at
Amstorelnc.

David-
Watkins

. Jim and Jane David of
Logansportj Ind., have an-
nounced the engagement of
their daughter, Molly J. David,

Jessica Marie Foltz and Oscar
Guy Bargnes 111

Victor William Stover and
Jane Victoria Kopf

Matthew William Morawski
and Sara Michele Mayberry

Andrew Watkins and Molly J.
David

to Andrew K Watkins, son of
Warren and Ann Watkins of
Grosse Pointe Farms. A
September wedding is
planned. '

David earned a Bachelor of
Arts degree in business from
Indiana University and is a
consultant with Accenture Ltd.
in Chicago.

Watkins earned a Bachelor
of Arts degree in politics from
Princeton University.

He is a consultant with
Accenture Ltd. in Chicago.

See ENGAGEMENTS, page GB
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Adams-
Jerabek

Lindsay Adams, daughter of
Marve and John Adams of
Grosse Pointe Farms, married
Marc Jerabek, son of Olivia
and Peter Jerabek of
Bloomfield Hills, on Oct. 28,
2006, at Jefferson Avenue
Presbyterian Church in
Detroit.

Peter Smith and Lou Prues
officiated at the 5:30 p.m. cere-
mony which was followed by a
reception at the Grosse Pointe
War Memorial.

The bride wore $n ivory
strapless, silk organza gown
with a fitted bodice and slight
train and a two-tiered finger-
tip-length veil edged in crys-
tals. She carried a bouquet of
white, creamy roses, stephan-
otis, green wheat and green
hypernicum berries.

The bride's brother, Jeff
Adams of Grosse Pointe
Farms, served as his sister's at-
tendant. The groom's sister,
Dana Jerabek, served as her
brother's attendant.

Friends of honor included
the bride's sister-in-law, Katie
Adams of Grosse Pointe
Farms, the bride's cousin Erin
Wheeler of Portland, Ore., the
bride's childhood friend
Deanna Raab of Phoenix,
Ariz., the bride's childhood
friend Gretchen Heinze of
Chicago, 111., the bride's college
friend Valerie Weeks of
Clawson, the bride's college
friend Cathy Dubbs of
Newport Beach, Calif., the
bride's college friend Laura
VanGemert of Royal Oak and
the bride's cousin Leigh
Skrelunas of New Canaan,
Conn. Other friends of honor
included the groom's child-
hood friend Kaled
Khaznehkatbi of Royal Oak,

the groom's childhood friend
Sam Varde of Royal Oak, the
groom's childhood friend Mike
Zellen of Manhattan Beach,
Calif., the groom's childhood
friend Matt Dion of Redondo
Beach, Calif., the groom's law
school friend Cary Berlin of
Berkley and the bride's cousin
Marty Skrelunas of New
Canaan, Conn.

The female attendants wore
black dresses in styles of their
own choosing, each accented
in the manner they chose with
a terra cotta silk sash. They
carried a long-stemmed terra
cotta rose which they placed in
a vase at the front of the
church as they proceeded for-
ward at the beginning of the
ceremony.

The mother of the bride
wore a full-length dusty grey-
blue lace dress and a gardenia
corsage.

The groom's mother wore an
ankle-length taupe lace dress
and jacket and gardenia wrist
corsage.

The bride's grandmother,
Helen Greenhalgh was the pi-
anist . and Victoria Haltpm
played violin. Readers were the
bride's uncle, Edwin
Skrelunas, and the groom's
great uncle, Larry Sanchez.

The bride earned her under-
graduate degree in psychology
from Albion College and her
juris doctor from the
University of Detroit Mercy
School of Law. She is an attor-
ney with Maddin, Hauser,
Wartell, Roth and Heller, PC. in
Southfield.

The groom earned his un-
dergraduate degree in busi-
ness pre law from Michigan
State University and his juris
doctor from Wayne State
University School of Law. He is
an attorney with Fabrizio and
Brook, EC. in Troy.

The couple honeymooned in
Hawaii. They live in the City of
Grosse Pointe.

Martin -
Firestone

Elizabeth Martin, daughter
of Daniel and Bernadette
Martin of Grosse Pointe
Woods, married Michael
Firestone, son of David and
Jennifer Firestone of Royalton,
Vt., on Sept. 29, 2007, at
Lowndes Grove Plantation in
Charleston, S.C.

Richard Bennett officiated at
the ceremony which was fol-
lowed by a reception at
Lowndes Grove.

The bride wore an antique
white strapless, embroidered
silk organza gown with a satin
sash. She carried a bouquet of
mini ivory calla lilies, orange
french tulips and pink orchids.

The maid of honor was the
bride's sister, Rachel Martin of
Charleston, S.C.

Bridesmaids were Katie
Eckert of Chicago, 111.,
Adrienne Nutter of Grosse
Pointe Park and Rebecca
Waldmeir, sister of the bride, of
Grosse Pointe Woods.

Attendants wore silk
charmeuse dresses with a
pink, orange and green floral
motif. They carried bouquets
of orange tulips and pink or-
chids mixed with green
berries.

Bora Gulari of Detroit was
the best man.

Groomsmen were John
Kline and Oliver Martin, both
of New York City, N.Y

The mother of the bride
wore a tea-length navy taffeta
dress.

The groom's mother wore a
black dress with a beaded
jacket.

Drs. Gregory Paul
Prokopowicz

Readers were the bride's
brother, Daniel Martin n, and
Adam Hollerbach.

The bride earned a Bachelor
of Science degree in business
from Miami University. She is
a senior financial analyst at
Comcast Corp. in Southfield.

The groom earned a
Bachelor of Science degree in
civil engineering from Wayne
State University and a
Bachelor of Arts degree in eco-
nomics from the University of
Michigan. He is a senior staff
engineer at NTH Consultants
in Detroit.

The couple honeymooned in
Bermuda. They live in Grosse
Pointe Farms.

Steele -
Prokopowicz

Kimberley Eden Steele,
daughter of Rosalind Steele of
Toronto, Ontario, married
Gregory Paul Prokopowicz,
son of Gerald and Aulga
Prokopowicz of Grosse Pointe
Shores, on April 27, 2007, in
Toronto.

Sarah Bunnett-Gibson offici-
ated at the ceremony which
was followed by a reception at
the McLean House,
Sunnybrook Estates.

The maid of honor was
Jennafer Sherman and the best
man was Michael Peterson.

The bride is a graduate of the

Mr. and Mrs. Marc Jerabek

University of Toronto. She is a
doctor and assistant professor
of surgery at Johns Hopkins
Hospital.

The groom is a graduate of
the University of Michigan. He
is a doctor and assistant pro-
fessor of internal medicine at
Johns Hopkins Hospital.

The couple lives in
Baltimore, Md.

Port-
Ginn

Mary Bush Port, daughter of
Mr. and Mrs. George Franklin
Port of the City of Grosse
Pointe married Thomas
Anthony "Tony" Ginn, son of
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Hadley
Ginn of Winnetka, 111., on Oct.
12, 2007, at All Saints'
Episcopal Church, Chicago, 111.

The Rev. Bonnie A Perry of-
ficiated at the 4:30 p.m. cere-
mony. A reception followed at
the Peggy Notebaert Nature
Museum in Chicago.

The bride was attended by
her sister, Diana Port Baker of
San Anselmo, Calif., and the
groom's sister, Sarah Ginn
Harris of Wellesley, Mass.

William Nichols Baker, 2 1/2,
and William Weeks Harris, 3,
accompanied their mothers
down the aisle.

Ms. and Mrs. Michael
Firestone

Georgianna Jackson Lamed
Port, the bride's daughter by a
previous marriage, was the
flower girl.

The groom's brother, Peter
Vilas Ginn of Chicago, served
as the best man. Ushers were
Daniel Joseph Bowers and
Christopher Ford Daley, both
of Chicago; Joshua Ruehl
Dolby of Glenview, 111.;
Gregory Scott Harris of
Wellesley; and Johnn Wayne
McDermott of Evanston, 111.

The bride is a graduate of
the Pingry School,
Martinsville, N.J. and Denisori
University. She earned a mas-
ter's degree in education from
Loyola University and is a fifth
grade teacher at the Walt
Disney Magnet School in
Chicago,

The groom graduated from
New Trier High School and
DePaul University. He has a bi-
cycle messenger service in
Chicago, The couple lives in
Chicago.

Eric Hartill and Rebecca
Macks

From page 5B

Macks -
Hartill

Ralph and Mary Ann Macks
of Grosse Pointe Woods have
announced the engagement of
their daughter, = Rebecca
Macks, to Eric Hartill, son of
Jeff and Sue Hartill of Hobart,

Ind. A November wedding is
planned.

Macks earned a Bachelor of
Science degree from Western
Michigan University and is a
business analyst with State
Farm Insurance.

Hartill earned a Liberal Arts
degree from Wabash College.
He is a claims supervisor with
State Farm Insurance.

,. Serne-
Varty

Mr. and Mrs. John F. Varty of
Grosse Pointe Farms have an-
nounced the engagement of
their son, Michael, to Kate M.
Seme, daughter of Dale and
Sheila Seme of Strongsville,
Ohio. A July wedding is
planned in Cleveland, Ohio.

Seme earned a Bachelor of
Fine Arts degree from Bowling
Green State University.

Varty is pursuing a career in
his major of criminal justice.

Kate M. Serne and Michael
Varty

Share your love story.
Grosse Pointe News seeks

love stories of Grosse Pointers
who have been married more
than 10 years.

Submit a story by
Wednesday, Feb. 6. Mail to
Grosse Pointe News, 96
Kercheval, Grosse Pointe
Farms, MI 48236, attention
Ann or e-mail
editor@grossepointenews.com
Include a day time phone
number.
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HEALTH/SENIOR
X-TRA SPECIAL ADVICE By Theodore G. Coutlish and Mary Beth Langan

Transition to a sippy cup was tough

A
way from the of-
fice for four days
in December, Ted
decided it was time
to transition

Andrew from a baby bottle to a
sippy cup—cold turkey.

Four whoie days to transi-
tion the nearly 7-year-old with
Fragile X Syndrome and se-
vere sensory issues from suck-
ing room-temperature 2-per-
cent milk out of an 8-ounce ba-
by bottle to drinking from
some type of sippy cup.

Going into the battle, we
both agreed continuing with
room-temperature milk—and
only milk—would be critical.
But we knew the transition

would be difficult. We'd al-
ready tried to introduce a min-
imum of 19 types of sippy cups
over the years. It took us
months to transition him from
a tiny 2-ounce bottle intro-
duced during his NICU stay to
a 4-ounce bottle. This boy had
been honing his strong senso-
ry issues (and his will) since
birth.

Nerves would be fried dur-
ing this transition. Patience
would be exhausted.

As it turns out, we grossly
underestimated.

First day: Andrew would not
drink a sip. Valve or no valve,
soft or hard tip, straw or no
straw, with or without handles.
He wanted nothing to do with
his choices. He just pointed to
his precious bottle.

Second day: He drank a few
drops. Most spilled on the floor
or on his shirt.

Third day: Ditto.

Fourth day: Ditto.
Uh-oh. His skin was becom-

ing pale. His voice was defi-
nitely scratchy. This child, the
love of our lives, had drank al-
most nothing. (Thank good-
ness for the liquid in apple-
sauce.)

He was winning. At the end
of the fourth day, Ted said he
had never met anyone this
ridiculously stubborn. What
do we do? Will Social Services
take him away? Should we
continue? What if he still re-
fuses?

Mary Beth's answer was
firm: stay the course. If we give
up now, he'll never make the
transition. In the heart of the
storm, when giving up looked
like the only option, Mary
Beth's words made sense. Stay
the course.

Over the next week, we got
tough. We settled on one sippy
cup. We stopped pleading. We

demanded. But miserable bat-
tle after battle, he refused to
drink. We refused to give up.
Even for a reward of time on
the computer—his most cov-
eted activity in the world—his
lips were sealed.

During the second week,
slowly, he began drinking a
few sips and more with each
passing day and with less and
less coaxing. He tolerated
swallowing milk for three sec-
onds following our count of
one-two-three. And three be-
came five. And five became 10.

During the third week, when
Andrew opened the refrigera-
tor, grabbed a sippy cup with
cold milk and drank all of it
nonstop without prompting,
Ted looked at Mary Beth,
cocked his thumbs up and
mocked the movie character
Borat: "Great success!"

But the victories were just
starting.

Andrew began drinking wa-
ter. His choice. He had always
refused water and juice. Milk
does a body good, but it's also
good to have a variety of drink
choices.

He began trying new foods.
Partly that had to do with a
failed short medication trial of
Abilify, that helped him to go
from barely eating to eating
every moment of the day.
When you are hungry, you're
willing to try a few more selec-
tions.

He went from his favorite
veggie sticks to snacking onto
exotic polenta sticks a la Aunt
Therese, with a side of
Twizzlers sauce. (Seriously.
Twizzlers really do boil down
into a sauce.)

He even finished a whole
serving of regular oT kid fare;
macaroni and cheese.

Although the Abilify is gone
and a stimulant is back, these

eating and drinking changes
seem to be sticking. All this
from the boy with super strong
sensitivities of all types. All
this from a boy we were once
told had the most severe sen-
sory dysfunction an experi-
enced occupational therapist
had ever seen.

Next up? Perhaps chicken
fingers or spaghetti? Maybe a
cheeseburger and fries? What
we previously thought were
impossible menu items for our
little restrictive eater just may
be achievable goals.

Hope is here.
Grosse Pointe residents

Theodore G. CouUlish and
Mary Beth Langan created this
column to share experiences
from their journey as parents
of a child with Fragile X
Syndrome [fragilex.org]. Send
questions or comments to
ted.couHUsh@emich.edu or
mblangan@hotmail.com.

ASK THE EXPERTS ByBethGarvey

Parents need to help children manage anxiety
FamiiyCo)

There seems to be more
' • and more pressure on

kids today. How can parents
help their children manage the
anxiety that comes with the in-
creasing demands on them?

A In my practice I see
• more and more children

with anxiety. Kids are putting
tremendous pressure on them-
selves to excel. ̂ feU-rounded-
ness or moderate success is of-
ten no longer good enough for
them. As a parent, you can
help your child learn how to
identify and manage anxiety.

The first step is recognizing
the body's signals of distress.
Stress can be manifested as fa-
tigue or agitation; somatic
complaints like headaches or
stomachaches; or tuning out or
shutting down. Parents are in
the best position to help chil-
dren recognize their pattern of

emotions.
Once recognized, children

can begin to sort out what
caused the anxiety, which can
be a difficult process. Very of-
ten, they feel like it '̂ just hap-
pened" or that it is not connect-
ed to anything. But it is, and the
more adept they are at identify-
ing triggers, the better.

Different things trigger anxi-
ety in different people. For
some it is beginnings, for oth-
ers its unpredictability. It can
be lack of limits, or it can be
performance.

Help your children explore
what causes their anxiety and
they will be more capable of al-
leviating their discomforJT, lr ^
J'fvfo matter what the^fi^fe^1^
Ifirodeiy is a signal t n a ^ ^ ^ t l ^
have to change the way you're
thinking about the task at
hand.

Anxiety is usually accompa-
nied by an endless circle of self-
talk that says, "this can't be
done" or "this is impossible." A
parent can point out distorted
thinking when they hear it and
help their child identify man-

ageable ways to accomplish
the "impossible."

Parents can also help by as-
sisting their child in anticipat-
ing difficulties, looking at per-
formance historically, and
identifying positive traits that
will help kids accomplish their
tasks. My experience has been
that children who are often
anxious are very high perform-
ing.

However, their expectations
about future performances or
ability to manage multiple de-
mands are negatively distorted.

When they insist that they
are not able to manage some-
thing, I remind them that fu-
ture success is best predicted
by past performance. I review
past successes. Not that this
magically snaps them out of
their way of thinking, but it
does begin to challenge their
distorted thinking, which is
what fuels their anxiety.

Anxiety can also be reframed
as a positive. It can energize,
focus or motivate people. Just
the discomfort of it can help
you facilitate change. Talk with

your kids about what they're
experiencing and how it can
serve them. For example:

• Is their anxiety telling
them that they need to ask for
help?

• Does it mean they need to
prioritize or compartmentalize
their tasks?

• Does it mean they have to
give up some of their perfec-
tionism and just do their best?

• Does it mean they have to
have a voice and stand up for
themselves?

Finally, help your child iden-
tify what helps them to self-
soothe. Is it exercise, medita-
tion, quiet time or asking for
support? Is it talking things
over with friends, creating
alone time, or spirituality? Help
them discover what works for
them and demonstrate that
self-care is an important thing
to value.

Self-care is something we
need to teach our children at a
young age and is perhaps best
done by modeling it in our own
lives. It is hot selfishness or
meeting one's needs at the ex-

Caltt Duncan, chairwoman of the Grosse Pointe Chapter of the Daughters of Penelope, presents
the donation to Bemadine Sherwood, manager, of the Van Elslander Cancer Center. Back row:
co-chair Don Daskas, co-chair Sandy Moisides, and president Dorothea Williams, all from the
Grosse Pointe Chapter of the Daughters of Penelope.

Breast center gets donation
The Grosse Pointe Chapter

of the Daughters of Penelope
donated $5,000 donation to the
Liggett Breast Center.

The donation is from of the
organization's annual fundrais-
er, Festival of Tables, held in
October at the Grosse Pointe
War Memorial. Guests perused
30 tables decorated with
themed displays ranging from
Bemadine Sherwood and the
Detroit Yacht Club's "Belle Isle

Gem," to "Garden of Hope,"
designed by Carolyn
Kaczmarek, LaJuana Fuller,
and Jeannine Mercurio and
"Fall Harvest" designed by
Mary Natschke and Sue
Kosmas in honor of Breast
Cancer Awareness.

"It's about making a differ-
ence in the community and the
lives of women," said chapter
president Dorothea Williams.
'We know that this contribu-

tion will help women with spe-
cial needs go through cancer
diagnoses and treatment," said
chapter president Dorothea
Williams.

The Daughters of Penelope,
the women's affiliate of the or-
ganization headquartered in
Washington, D.C., is a leader in
philanthropic, educational and
cultural activities with local
chapters in the United States,
Canada and Greece.

Mature driver
class offered

"You Can Be An Older, Wiser
Driver," begins at 10:30 a.m.
Tuesday, Feb. 12, at the St.
Peter the Apostle parish house,
Commons Room.

Age doesn't mean giving up
activities, but it can mean
changing driving habits to re-
flect changing abilities.

According to research, peo-
ple's eyes, at age 60, need three
times as much light as they did
when they were 20. Peripheral
vision, the pupils' ability to con-
tract for accurate depth percep-
tion, decreases. An older
adulfs driving skills can be im-
proved in spite of changing
abilities. For instance, for travel
at dusk or after dark, pre-plan
the trip by choosing well-light-
ed areas or carpool with a
younger driver.

Learning the correct way to
adjust and use side-view mir-
rors improve a driver's peripti--
eralvisioa

"Driving issues pertinent to
the maturing driver, such as vi-
sual acuity, physical limitations,
and things that can be done to
offset these limitations are just
some of the factors that will be
addressed in a special one-hour
presentation," said Cheryl
Dupay, Community Outreach
& Safety Coordinator for AAA
Michigan.

"We provide a safe haven for
seniors who are looking to up-
date their driving skills. Many
realize that the last time they
were involved in a driver's
training program was 40 or
more years ago," Dupay said.

The parish house is located at
19851 Anita in Harper Wfoods.

Register by calling (313) 886-
1 7 7 © ; * y > "<• ••• ) •-

Free will donations will be
accepted.

pense of others. Self-care is
about health: getting enough
sleep, eating well and exercis-
ing.

It also involves saying no and
setting limits, having a voice
even when it makes others un-
comfortable and pursuing ac-
tivities one enjoys.

We are more focused, more

connected, more self-aware
and more successful in our
tasks and our relationships if
we practice taking care of our-
selves.

Send questions write to The
Famify Center, 20090
Morningside Dr., Grosse Pointe
Woods, M 48236 or via e-mail
at Infb@famifycenterweb.org.

Now Seeing Patients
in Grosse Pointe

Dr. Andrew Georgeson
specialist in

Varicose & Spider Veins

• Board Certified Surgeon
• Exclusive TRIVEX procedure

most insurances

Call for a FREE SCREENING
131 Kercheval "on the Hill"

(586) 228-0798

Sound like a dream come true? It can be, when

Dr. Ferrara and his staff of highly trained, licensed

professionals introduce you to their range of procedures

to reduce the signs of aging. All are designed to

eliminate incisions and long recovery times.

ACTIVE FXW I BOTOX® I RESTYIANE® I IPL

The Skin and Laser Center of Grosse Pointe also offers

laser hair removal, .microdermabrasion, facials, peels

and ultrasound. Call now for a free consultation and

information on their winter specials, including Active FX™,

the revoiutionary laser resurfacing treatment!

SKIN & LASER CENTER

FERRARA DERMATOIOGY CLINIC
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STATE OF THE ARTS ByAlexSuczek

DSO provides a little French music

I
t would belittle the uni-
versal appeal of music to
characterize last week-
end's Detroit Symphony
Orchestra concerts as

purely French, yet a distinctly
Gallic influence prevailed.

Conductor Charles Dutoit,
solo pianist Jean-Philippe
CoEard and the program were
all French, not to mention our
French Canadian
Concermaster Emmanuele
Boisvert, who acknowledged
her conductor with an unusual-
ly happy smile. Recognition of
their congeniality was in-
escapable and most evident in
the evening's brilliant perfor-
mances.

The "Overture to Beatrice"
and "Benedict" by Hector
Berlioz set the standard for the
evening. Fast paced and in-

tense, it is a severe test of an or-
chestra requiring precision and
unanimity of phrasing. The
challenge is intensified by the
superb acoustics of Orchestra
Hall where every sound is car-
ried and reverberates clearly.

Dutoit's artistry was at an im-
portant advantage in this cir-
cumstance, rewarding the au-
dience with a spectacular hear-
ing of the witty and engaging
music. The quality of the expe-
rience was emphasized after
hearing orchestras in other
halls with good reputations and
recognizing once again the ex-
ceptional sound in Detroit's. It
is one of the most exciting
places to hear great perfor-
mances of great music.
Happily, we had both.

No less exciting but in a dra-
matically different style,
Maurice Ravel's "Concerto for
the Left Hand" was a refresh-
ing contrast to the romance of
Berlioz.

Rather than trying to create
the impression that the pianist
could create the same effect as

with two hands, Ravel created
a concerto that emphasizes the
unique effects adapted to a
one-handed performance at
the keyboard. Collard spanned
the 88 keys with superb virtu-
osity and amazing accuracy.
He achieved stunning effects
with Ravel's use of the glissan-
do, which recurs regularly
enough in the score to justify
giving that as a name to the
work.

Pollard's technique is so so-
phisticated, that even playing
solo with his left hand only, he
created an effect giving the im-
pression of a light orchestral
accompaniment. Together,
soloist and conductor main-
tained a throbbing tempo with
suggestions of jazz, bold per-
cussion and massed wood-
winds and brass, punctuated
by lyrical episodes and Ravel's
characteristic tricky rhythms.
The changes in pace and un-
usual effects were handled
deftly to create a uniquely ex-
citing concerto performance.

And there was more Gallic

creativity to come.
The major work on the pro-

gram was Berlioz's unique
"Symphonie Fantastique" and
it matched the standard al-
ready set in this performance.
Continuing his infatuation with
Shakespeare (which had given
rise to the opera overture that
opened the concert) he com-
posed the symphony to ex-
press his adoration for the
English actress, who had
starred in Shakespeare's play
on which the opera was based.
Incidentally, it also stands as a
salute to the reputation of
Frenchmen as lovers.
Eventually, the actress married
Berlioz and bore him a son.

The symphony is an expres-
sion of his initially unrequited
experiences with the actress
(who spoke no French and he
no English) in a series of five
dream-like episodes. The or-
chestrations are rich and pow-
erful in which Berlioz builds on
forms established by
Beethoven. He utilized an ef-
fect called in French, the "idee

fixe" that later appeared in
Wagner as the "leit motif." For
Berlioz it represents his obses-
sion with his love and it ap-
pears somewhere in each
movement. The moods are
wonderfully varied. The
dreamy first movement repre-
sents the artist's dreams in a
drugged state. The second is a
gorgeous waltz painting the
scene of an elegant and roman-
tic ball.

There is a bucolic atmos-
phere representing a country
scene where the English horn
and oboe play a duet suggest-
ing shepherds playing to their
flocks. The lover's jealousy
moves him to murder his
beloved followed by a grim
march to the guillotine and a
witches sabbath followed by
stark rendering by chimes and
bizarre instrumental effects of
the Dies Irae from the Catholic
liturgy.

Most satisfying was the
amazing facility at communi-
cating the change moods of the
music. Dutoit and the orchestra

conveyed the passion and ex-
citement, the lyrical moments
and the tragic imagery, chang-
ing moods with facility to cre-
ate an exciting and dramatic
arch to the work's program of a
lover's dreams.

The "Symphonie
Fantastique" is famous as a
popular concert showpiece but
perhaps even more important
as a stylistically innovative
work filled with dramatic and
narrative treatments inspired
by opera and the composer's
own passionate feelings that
were imitated and expanded
on by later composers.
Moreover, it is a collection of
musical scenes filled with fun,
wit, love and drama all of
which received lavish expres-
sion in this performance.

This week on Friday and
Saturday evenings, another
French pianist Jean-Yves
Thibaudet will offer more mu-
sic of Ravel with the symphony.

For more information and
tickets call (313) 576-5111 or
visitDetroitsymphony.com. :

'Corpse' at Broadway Onstage
"Corpse," a comedy thriller

by Gerald Moon, will be per-
formed at the Broadway
Onstage Live Theatre through
Saturday, Feb. 9, with perfor-
mances at 8 p.m. Fridays and
Saturdays.

The play is set in London in
1936 and tells the story of
twin brothers, one of whom
plots to murder the other in
the most unusual circum-
stances. Evelyn, an out of
work actor, engages the ge-

RESERVE \OUR 7IUCITS TODAY*
(313) 577-2972

WAY\F STATE
{ S r i

_ K
Be iter n Linus H

ELMO HOPES TO

ELMP
MUSICA

JANUARY 25 - FEBRUARY 10
A — '•rt

i::w

Tickets at OlymplaEritertainment.com,
the Box Offices and all ticketj£&ter outlets

Including Macy's.
CKarge by phone (248) 433-1515.

*•&£: OfympiaEntertainment.com

Detroit Pubiic TV Benefit Performance on
Friday, February 1 at 7:00 p.m.

For more information, call 248.305.3900
or log onto detroitpubiictv.org.

nial Major Powell, who has a
shady past, to do away with
his suave, sophisticated,
monied twin. Their plotting in
Evelyn's cave of a flat is punc-
tuated by visits from the the-
atrical landlady.

As with most fool proof
plans, things do not go as they
should and people are not
what they seem. "Corpse" is
not so much a whodunit as a
whodunit to whom.

Portraying twins Evelyn
and Rupert Farrant is Ken
Karges. Taking on the role of
Major Powell is Broadway

Onstage Producer Dennis
Wickline and Elizabeth Rager
will be seen as nosy landlady
Mrs. McGee. Stan Newman
completes • the cast as
Hawkins, a local constable
who unexpectedly enters into
the plot.

The production is under the
direction of Mike Kowalski.

Tickets are $16 and group
rates are available.
Reservations can be made by
calling (586) 771-6333.

Broadway Onstage is locat-
ed at 21517 Kelly at Toepfer in
Eastpointe.

"Corpse," a comedy thriller can be seen through Saturday, Feb.
9, at Broadway Onstage Live Theatre, 21517 Kelly at Toepfer in
Eastpointe. Tickets cost $16 and group rates are available.
Reservations may be made by calling (586) 771-6333.

THURSDAY FEBRUARY 14
OPENING NIGHT! AM- SEATS $12*

FRIDAY FEBRUARY 15
FIRST 1000 KIDS 12 & U1NJDER RECEIVE A COWBOY HAT!

KIDS AGES 510. WITH STiCKHOfiSE, CAW PARTICIPATE IN THE STlGKHGfiSE STAMPEDE'.

- ' • - • ' j — 'Restr ict ions apply; visit paiacenet.com for details
f\J flCKhlS'Al PAtA€t;rjFr.COj>],THK PAiACK BOX Uf-hHJt,
'MJ* AND A l l ti&etotelSijer OUTLETS. CHAftSE AT MS.e«,6e6e

Denim overalls and flannel shirts, worn by Susana Hunter's
husband, Julius, were recycled into this quilt.

Quilting genuis display
at The Henry Ford ^

Quilting Genius 2: The
Improvisational Quilts of
Susana Hunter, will be on dis-
play from Friday, Feb. 15
through Sunday April 27, at
The Henry Ford Museum.

This exhibit features nearly
30 improvisational quilts made
by Hunter, an African-
American quilter from Wilcox
County, Alabama. The story of
her creativity and resourceful-
ness is told through her quilts
that feature large shapes, bold
colors, asymmetrical patterns
and improvisational flair.

Dating from the 1930s to the
1970s, Hunter's quilts put into
context the lives and experi-
ences of many African
Americans living in the Jim
Crow South.

For most of their lives,
Hunter and her husband,
Julius, made their living grow-
ing cotton and corn. They lived
in a two-room house with no
running water or electricity. To
help keep /her family ^varm
through' Alabama winters,
Hunter made quilts, piecing
them out of whatever was at
hand; fabric scraps from the

clothes she sewed for her fami-
ly, worn clothing, or seed and
fertilizer sacks.

During her lifetime, Hunter
made hundreds of quilts.

'It is The Henry Ford's mis-
sion to preserve the work of or-
dinary people and tell their sto-
ries of extraordinary ingenu-
ity," said Patricia Mooradian,
president of The Henry Ford.
"Susana Hunter had few re-
sources, but she was deter-
mined to provide for her family
and did so through her creativ-
ity." •

The exhibit will also feature
some of Hunter's household
items including her quilting
frame, sewing scissors and
thimbles. The exhibit is free
with museum admission or
membership.

The museum is open from
9:30 a.m. to 5 p.ni. seven days a
week.

Admission is $14 for adults,
$13 for seniors and $10 for
youth. Members and children
four and under are admitted
free. For more information, call
(313)982-6001 or visit
TheHenryFord.org.
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ENTERTAINMENT

Party like it's 1899 at Detroit Institute of Arts
Hairstyles and fashions are

different and there are more
entertainment options today.
But in some ways, Americans
spend their leisure time as
they did 100 years ago.

"Life's Pleasures: The
Ashcan School's Brush with
Leisure, 1895-1925," is a spe-
cial exhibition on view March
2 to May 25 at the Detroit
Institute of Arts explores how
city-dwellers at the turn of the
last century spent their leisure
time through 80 paintings by
American artists known col-
lectively as the Ashcan School.

The Ashcan School refers to
a group of artists centered
around artist/teacher Robert
Henri, who instructed his stu-

dents to "paint what is real."
Many works feature bars and
cafes, where they hung out, or
depict performances they at-
tended. Several artists were
former newspaper illustrators,
who sketched events while
they were happening to cap-
ture a vivid sense of the "real."

Much of the Ashcan artists'
subject matter dealt with the
grittier side of city life.

"What is remarkable about
the works in the exhibition is
that they realistically capture
not only the people and activi-
ties, but also evoke the atmos-
phere surrounding them," said
Graham W J. Beal, DIA direc-
tor.

Other leisure-time themes

include dining out, fine and
performing arts, sports and
recreation and the outdoors.

Tickets, which include mu-
seum admission and an exhi-
bition audio tour, are $12 for
adults and $6 for ages 6 to 17.
DIA members are admitted
tree.

A complementary exhibition
drawn from the DIA's collec-
tion, "Give it a Rest: People at
Play in American Prints and
Drawings, 1895-1945" will be
on view April 2 through Aug.
3. These approximately 100
works on paper form a reflec-
tion of casual times in daily
life.

• The DIA's Detroit Film
Theatre will present "Celluloid

Pleasures: American Pastimes
of the Silent Era" at 4 p.m.
Saturdays from March 15 to
April 19. The free matinees
feature live musical accompa-
niment and include films star-
ring Douglas Fairbanks, W C.
Fields, Buster Keaton and
Harold Lloyd.

• The national symposium,
"Circa 1900: Celebrating
American Turn-of-the-Century
Arts," takes place March 27 -
31 and includes a day and a
half devoted to the Ashcan
School with receptions at the
Manoogian collection and the
Scarab Club. Arts and Crafts
will be the focus of the next
two days, with lectures and
visits to Pewabic Pottery, the

Guardian Building and other
architectural sites planned. A
day-long trip to Granbrook
rounds out the symposium.
Call (313) 833-4025 for infor-
mation or to register.

• Beginning Saturday, April
5, artist Richard Lewis paints a
portrait from a live model in
the same vein as Ashcan
painters and will complete the
portrait over the next four
Saturdays while visitors
watch.

• Frank Deford, National
Public Radio commentator
and senior editor at Sports
Illustrated, will give a talk,
"Sports: The Hype and
Hypocrisy," at 2 p.m. Sunday,
April 6. This is a ticketed

event.
• Friday Night live will fea-

ture different music groups
configured from paintings. For
example, a painting by George
Luks depicts a guitarist, flute
player and vocalist. The same
type of trio will perform live.
During the April 9 Friday
Night live, the Aerial Angels, a
female circus act that includes
tightrope walking, an aerial
hoop and other feats.

Museum hours are 10 a.m.
to 5 p.m. Wednesdays and
Thursdays; 10 a.m. to 10 p.m.
Fridays; and 10 a.m. to 6 p.m.
Saturdays and Sundays.
Admission is $8 for adults, $4
for ages 6 through 17. DIA
members are admitted free.

A LA ANNIE By Annie Rouleau-Scheriff

PHOTO BY VIRGINIA O. MCCOY

Easy recipes to keep the chef out of the kitchen and instead, enjoying the Super Bowl.

S
urprise your chips
this Super Bowl
Sunday with two
easy dips that will
turn your serving

bowls into super bowl's of their
own.

The first is a simple take on
the old onion dip we've sam-

Gardening
symposium

"Patterns in Gardening," a
symposium focusing on dis-
covering and enhancing pat-
terns in the garden is planned
for Saturday, Feb. 9, at the
MSU Management Education
Center in Troy.

The event is hosted by
Horticulture magazine and
Cranbrook Gardens
Auxiliary.
' : Program speakers include
Val Easton, a garden colum-
nist for the Seattle Times'
Pacific Northwest Magazine
and contributor to numerous
other publications; Raymond
J, Evison, owner of The

• .Geurnsey Clematis Nursery
Ltd, a producer of clematis;
Jan Mover, lighting designer;
Gary Koller, a professional
horticulturist and landscape
designer; and Nan Sinton, di-
rector of programs for
Horticulture and an experi-
enced designer and hands-on
gardener.
c "Look around your garden.

|No matter how natural and
•'wild it looks, chances are
you'll notice several patterns
hidden in plain sight," Sinton
said. "This program will show
you how to recognize and use
patterns to enliven your gar-
den and maximize what you
already have."

Registration for the day-
long event is available online
at hortprograms.com or by
calling toll-free 877-GDN-
PROG (877-436-7764):

pled for years, served hot. The
second is a cool blue cheese
dip that takes no more than a
few pulses in the food proces-
sor.

Both will be crowd pleasers.

Hot French
Onion Dip

2 cups cream cheese
1 package onion soup mix
16-oz. package shredded

Swiss cheese (11/2 cups)
1/4 cup mayonnaise

Preheat oven to 375 degrees.
In a small bowl, combine all in-
gredients. Transfer to a small
(1 quart) baking dish and bake
at 375 for 20-25 minutes, until
heated throughout. Serve with
your favorite potato chips.

Cool Blue
Cheese Dip

1 cup cottage cheese
14-oz. container crumbled

blue cheese
1 tablespoon lemon juice
1 tablespoon milk
2 green onions, chopped
1 teaspoon dried basil

Combine all ingredients in a
food processor and pulse until
smooth. Transfer mixture to a
fancy dip bowl and top with
additional chopped green
onion. Serve with your fa-
vorite chips. Either dip recipe
can be easily doubled.

My chip choice? Kettle
brand chips. They're sturdy,
flavorful and worth every
calorie.

Let's go Giants!

OPEN

Mon, Tues & Thur 11am - 9pm

Wed 11 am • 10pm • Fri 11 am • midnite

Sat 11 am - 11pm • Sun 12 noon -8pm

g
Private tee Partis*
ftoW Trips
Group Rate*
Sfcote Rentals
Convenient
Adjacent Parking

800 Woodward Avenue
-. f Blocks North

2nd Saturdays at Children's museum
Preserving family history is

the topic of the Feb. 9, 2nd
Saturdays on Second event at
the Detroit Children's
Museum, the third oldest chil-
dren's museumm in the na-
tion.

Rotating timed sessions are
planned from 1 to 3 p.m. and
led by members of the African
American Genealogical
Society. Topics include
Beginning Geology 4 Kids —
Who are You?; Exploring One
Family's History — How it

Came to Be!; and Meet Family
Historians.

Also, master storyteller
Auntie Gurtie will share family
legends.

Participants will receive a
genealogy beginner's kit.

The fee is $5 for nonmem-
bers and $3 for members.

Other activities include a
planetarium show at 12:30
p.m. for children age 4 and
older.

Reservations are required.
Call (313) 873-8100.

A Winter Break Happening
including a 1 p.m. planetarium
show, make and take craft sta-
tions, games and exhibits is
planned from noon to 4 p.m.
Monday, Feb. 18, through
Friday, Feb. 22.

The museum is open from 9
a.m. to 4 p.m. Monday through
Friday and noon to 4 p.m. on
second Saturdays from
October through May.

The museum explores sci-
ence and history and is located
at 6134 Second Ave., Detroit.

Valentine's dance at Grosse Pointe War Memorial
Music, candlelight and

dance lessons for Valentine's
Day sweethearts are being of-
fered at the Grosse Pointe War
Memorial, 32 Lakeshore,
Grosse Pointe Farms.

The Thursday, Feb. 14,
evening begins at 7 with a
Night-Club Two-Step dance
lesson for those with no prior
dancing experience and con-

tinues at 7:30 p.m. for those
who are beyond the basics.
Music starts at 8 p.m. in the
candle-lit Fries Crystal
Ballroom.

Tickets are $12 and include
coffee, tea, iced tea and water.
Participants can bring their
own beer and wine.

As a follow-up, couples can
sign up for a Massage for

Couples class offered from 7 to
9 p.m. Thursday, March 6.

The basic do's and don'ts of
massage concentrating on the
back, neck and shoulders will
be taught. Participants are
asked to wear a bathing suit
under their clothing.

The fee is $50 per couple.
For more information and to
register, call (313) 881-7511.

BW..JA"

Best Fresh Ground
Round Burger

BREAKFAST SPECIALS j,
UNTIL 1O AM ! Deluxe with french fries & your choice

of salad or cole slawBREAKFAST SERVED
ALL DAY!

Dine in Monday - Friday 11:00 am - 5:00 pm
You do not need a coupon to get the best

price on food & drink!!!

LUNCH SPECIALS
SALAD & SOUP!

Tues - Fri 6-2 pm
Sat 7-1 pm • Sun 8-1 pm

Closed Mondays
19218 Mack Ave

Grosse Pointe Farms
Across from Pointe Plaza

Grill open daily till 1:00 am,
Monday - Saturday 11:00 am - 2:00 am • Sunday 5:00 pm - 2:00 am

18666 Mack Avenue, Grosse Pointe Farms,

(313)881-5675313-882-4475
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ULS: HOOPS SOUTH HOOPS GYMNASTICS CLASSIFIED

North girls basketball team plays well
in loss to Saginaw Arthur Hill PAGE3C

SOUTH BOYS HOCKEY

triumph
I •;£ East Kentwood Invitational

is South's third tourney win
By Chuck Klonke
Sports Editor

Grosse Pointe South's hock-
ey team has one thing in mind
when it climbs on the bus to go
to a tournament.

"They're there to play hock-
ey," Blue Devils coach Bob
Bopp said after South posted 2-
1 victories against Traverse
City Central and South Lyon to
win the East Kentwood tourna-
ment last weekend.

"We won all three tourna-
ments we played in this year,
and I can't remember the last
time we did that. This is a great
road team. They're serious and
they put hockey first."

South has also shown that it
can overcome adversity.

In the championship game
against South Lyon the Blue
Devils got the first five penal-
ties of the game, and they felt
most of them were unde-
served.

"Some teams will look at that
as a reason to lose, but not this
team," Bopp said. "We played
through it, and found a way to
win."

Although South was quicker
Grosse Pointe South goalie Trevor Sattelmeier stops a shot during the Blue Devils' championship game victory against South and more talented than the
Lyon in last weekend's East Kentwood Invitational. The Blue Devils posted 2-1 victories against Traverse City Central and South Lions, the Blue Devils weren't
Lyon. able to score until 6:39 of the

PHOTO BY PETER MARSHALL

second period. %
"We had some great

chances, but I think our play-
ers were trying too hard not to
make another goalie look
good, and as a result we were
missing the net," Bopp said.
"We were trying too hard to
make the perfect shot.".

Alex Marshall finally broke
the scoreless tie, assisted by
Lance Lucas and Sam Mott .

"It was good to see Alex get a
couple of points in this game,"
Bopp said. "He's been working
hard all season, so I was hatroy
to see it pay off."

South Lyon's Chris Eckler
tied the game while the lions
had a 5-on-3 advantage at
10:13 of the second period, but
a minute and 23 seconds later,
Miles Knight broke the tie with,
a shot from the top of the face-
off circle that went in just un-
der the crossbar.

"We played a line of Dan
Gerow, Miles Knight and Alex
Marshall and they really
played well and provided the
team with a spark," Bopp said.
"Miles is a young player who
will be a great, one for South.
He has such a hard shot and he
gets it off quickly. That was a

See SOUTH, page 3C

•A LIBERTY. mmPURSUIl

2008 Cadillac CTS
GM Employees
24 Month Smartlease

$3,238 Due at Signing

24 Mo. One Time $Q X "7 TOO*
tease Payment * -

Stock #136059
rlnkecadillac.Gom/cadHfac_cts^special.aspx

Stock #107534
rinkecactiHac,eom/eadillac_sts,speclal.aspx

JHBNHHHBSSBBRHHHBHBHBHHBHfflP

2008 Cadillac
GM Employees
24 Month Smartlease

$3,042 Due at Signing

24 Mo. One Time $ 1 1 "j SLf\OO
Lease Payment I I

24 Month Smartlease

$3,099 Due at Signing

24 Mo. One Time $
Lease Payment

MUST PRESENT
AD FOR SPECIALS

1-3 FOOT ITALIAN SUB

1-12 PERSON ANTiPASTO SALAD

1-24 SLICE PIZZA PARTY T R A Y - /

-32 SLICE CHEESY GARLIC BREAD

2-2 LITERS OF ANY BRAND POP3 FOOT ITALIAN
PARTY SUB

or 2 for

PARTY
SALADS

8 Person...... _*9.49
12 Person J13.49
24 Person J22.99
36 Person $29,99

24 SLICE
PARTY TRAYS

Pizza
Plus M

WITH CHEESE & 1 ITEM
Additional Items'2.50 ...

PIZZA
MEAL DEAL

24 SLICE PIZZA
CHEESE & 1FTEM

18BREAD$nCKS&FREE2UTER

Stock #102582
rinkecadlllac.com/cadillac_srx_specia].aspx

'Payments based OR £4 month ©MAC Sfflartlease. Onetime payments based on 24 months. Pius tax. title and registration, 10,000 miles per year.
25 cents per mite over, Sttbjeoi to approved credit. Must be eligible for Smarttease owner loyalty on STS and SRX. Programs expire t-31-08.

RINKE CADILLAC
Expect More. We Deliver!

Showroom Hours; Mon &Thurs S:30airi-9:00pm;Tues, Wed & Fri 8:30am-6:00pm

1-696 & VAN DYKE • (866) 385-9847
tf traveling west on I-69&, exit Hoover, follow Service Drive to Rinke Cadillac. It travelling east on 1-696. exit

Van Dyke: take Ihe second bridge past Van Dyke.over expressway to Rinke Cadillac.

Visit our web site: www.rinkecadillac.com for all of our specials

COKE PRODUCTS 2 Liter............. 4/S5.00

STROH'Sfc SANDERS ICE CREAM 56 oz 2/$ 7.00

^MBT SKOALS
COUNTRY FRESH SOUR CREAM OR CHIP DIP 16 oz 2/$3.00
KRAFT SHREDDED OR BRICK CHEESE 8 oz 3/$6.00

KRAKUS HAM .....$3.69 Ib.

SARANAC SPINACH DIP.... ,. .$2.99 Ib.

9GM.3MM
CARLO ROSSI 4 Liter „.... $8.49

YELLOW TAILS All Types 750 ml ..................$5.99

li&fe fL Warm or Cold

MILLER LITE OR MGD 12 oz. 18 Pk Bottles $11.49 PUBW^

BUDWEISER OR BUD LIGHT 2-12 Pack 12 oz. Bottles $16.49

C
18660 Mack • Grosse Pointe Farms • 313.881.7392
20915 Mack • Grosse Pointe Woods • 313.884.3880
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Grosse Pointe North's Jerry Peoples, left, and Darrin Willis trap Chippewa Valley guard Tyler Alwardt

redefines its goals
By Chuck Klonke
Sports Editor

Grosse Pointe North's boys
basketball team is redefining
its goals for the rest of the sea-
spa,.. , . . „,, .

'"'•'•!••;•• Friday w e h a v e e ight
,-••• .u.;> i c h a i n i n g , a n d w e n e e d

IO use those as a tuneup and to
get better as a team," coach Pat
Donnelly said after the
Norsemen's 60-47 loss to
Romeo in the Macomb Area
Conference Red Division.

"We're not in the running for
a conference championship.
We want to be playing at our
highest level when we're play-
ing in the (state) districts. We
have to improve our team
chemistry and our communi-
cation. We haven't been able to
get into a real flow offensively.".

Donnelly was pleased with
some aspects of North's play
against Romeo.

"We started out with a lot of
intensity," he said.

"Romeo got into a double-
digit lead early. We struggled to
score but we played some de-
cent defense in the half court.

They hurt us some in the tran-
sition."

The Bulldogs led by 14
points at halftime and North's
objective for the second half
was to cut the lead to single
digits by the time the fourth
quarter started.

In the second half, Donnelly
went to a smaller, quicker line-
up.

The Norsemen got within 11
points late in the third quarter,
and had a wide-open attempt
for a three-point basket but it
failed to find the mark.

"We played real hard and
gave a good effort," Donnelly
said. "We just struggled to put
the ball in the basket."

Donnelly was happy with the
play of Nick Waller, who led
North with 23 points, including
13 from the free-throw line.

"That was Nick's most com-
plete game of the year,"
Donnelly said.

"He did a good job rebound-
ing and attacking the rim. He
got a lot of his points on put-
backs."

Waller also drew the tough
assignment of guarding
Romeo's Blake Cushingberry,

who has a scholarship to
Oakland University.

"Cushingberry scored 18
points, but he had only four
field goals and a couple of
those came in transition,"
Donnelly said. "Nick did a
good job. of using his length
and athletic ability to shut him
down."

Unfortunately for North, the
Bulldogs had Nick Kosovich
step up to score 18 points.

"When you go against a
good team like Romeo, some-
times you have to pick your
poison," Donnelly said.

North's coach wasn't as hap-
py earlier in the week when the
Norsemen lost 58-49 against
Chippewa Valley.

"I didn't think our intensity
was there," Donnelly said. "We
turned the ball over against
their soft zone with some lazy
passes. But give Chippewa
credit. They took us out of our
transition game and made us
playhalfcourt."

Big Reds coach Kevin Voss
felt relieved that he had es-
caped with another victory
against North. In their first
meeting, Chippewa Valley

pulled out an overtime victory.
"They're scary," Voss said.

"They did a better job this time
of finding Nick in the middle.
He can really hurt you."

Chippewa Valley was able to
counter Waller's 20 points with
24 from Chris Lemm.

North tied the game at 45-all
on a three-point basket by
Jerry Peoples with 4:23 re-
maining. Then Lemm made
two straight baskets, the sec-
ond coming on a steal and a
layup. After a basket by Waller
made it 49-47, Alex Dzierbicki
picked off a North pass and
scored on a layup. Lemm
drilled a three-pointer, and
Rick Doran scored with a
minute and a half to go to put
the Big Reds ahead 56-47.

North led 15-13 after the first
quarter and the teams were
tied at 26 at halftime.
Chippewa Valley started the
second half with a.13-4 run.

Dora'n finished with 16
points and seven rebounds,
while Dzierbicki added 12
points for Chippewa Valley.

Peoples scored 11 points for
North and Paul Bramos had
eight.

GIRLS HOCKEY

has Norsemen's number
By Bob St. John
StaffWnter

For a 'second straight time
this season, Grosse Pointe
North's girls hockey team
dropped a one-goal decision to
Ann Arbor.

The Lady Norsemen's only
two losses this season have
come to the Pioneers.

"It's a disappointing loss,
that's for sure," said North
head coach Scott Dockett said.
"We had a couple of golden op-
portunities to win the game,

but missed the net."
The Pioneers led 1-0 on a

goal by junior Angie Chronis,
but were whistled for a penalty
with only 2:25 left in the third
period, giving the Lady
Norsemen life.

With only 41 ticks left on the

GROSSE POINTE FARMS-CiTY UTTLE LEAGUE 2008 SEASON IS MEREl

ns January 14th, ends February 12th

clock, sophomore Nikki
Capizzo converted a power-
play goal to tie the game 1-1.
Senior Christie Listwan drew
the only assist.

The home team carried the
play in overtime, but it was the
Pioneers that won with a goal
with 2:07 left.

"We played a pretty strong
game after not putting out a
strong effort our prior game
against Liggett," Ann Arbor
head coach Lon Grantham
said.

"This is a big win for us and
gives us the tiebreaker against
North.

"Plus getting the extra point
with the win instead of only
one point for the tie keeps us a
point behind in the division
standings."

The last time North and Ann
Arbor played, the Lady
Norsemen blew a 3-1 lead
when the Pioneers scored
three third-period goals to win
4 - 3 . •

North fell to 10-2-1 in the
Michigan Metro Girls High
School Hockey League and 12-
2-1 overall. The Norsemen
host Cranbrook Kingswood on
Thursday, Jan. 31 in a 530 p.m.
contest.

wins

busv wee
By Chuck Klonke
Sports Editor

University Liggett] School's
basketball team had $ busy but
productive week.

The Knights plajbd. three
games in four nights and came
away with victories fti two of
the contests.

"We won a couplejof close
games, which will Help our
confidence," said UlfS coach
Sidney Johnson.

The Knights begjan the
marathon with a 52-50 Metro
Conference win (against
Clawson.

Patrick Gustine hit k three-
point shot with 20 seconds re-
maining to put the Knights
ahead to stay, although me out-
come was far from decided.

Gustine's basket capped a
comeback for ULS, which
trailed by six points wilh 1:44
remaining in the game. ;

Clawson missed a shot and
had to foul ULS when the
Knights grabbed the rewound.
ULS missed the front end of
the bonus and the Trojaps got
the ball out of bounds. " |

"We put Jeremiah Manning
on the ball because we knew
they were going to try to throw
it the length of the court,"
Johnson said. "He tipped the
ball, which meant the clock
started, and they couldn't get
off a good shot."

Clawson's coaches argued
that the clock shouldn't have
started, but to no avail.

Aaron Heaney and Gustine
led the Knights with 13 points
apiece. Heaney also had a
good game rebounding.

Andrew Malaski finished
with nine points and Manning
and Mark Ghaf ari added seven
apiece.

In the Knights' next game, a
non-leaguer against Warren
Conner Creek West, they had
to fight off a comeback by the
Eagles, but held on for a 49-47
victory.

ULS was ahead 26-10 at half-
time, but Conner Creek kept
chipping away at the lead and
by the fourth quarter the
Eagles had come all the way
back.

"Our zone defense bothered

their main shooter in the^first
half," Johnson said. "They had
a 6-8 player andfhe played on
the perimeter injhe first half."

Conner Creek changed its
;cond half.

played in the
acond half and
' to find him dri-

|ainst our zone,"
abte

strategy in the
"Their big

paint in the
they were
ving angles
Johnson said.

Once it s£
close for coi
to get moi
fense.

"We held/the ball for about a
minute," Johnson said. "That's
the first tune this year we've
done that/ but we wanted to
change fhe tempo. When

reek) made its run,
taking shots too

:ed getting too
tort, ULS started

deliberate on of-

(Conner
we start'
quickly."

Gustini
finishin:

had a strong game,
with 22 points, in-

cluding siix three-point baskets.
Ghafari had nine points.

"Thatjwas our most cohesive
defensive game of the season,"
Johnso^i said. "We executed
well against their shooters."

Metro' Conference leader
Lutheran North put a damper
on the Knights* week with a TO-
SS victory.

"It was a rough-and-tumble
game, knd they were a lot big-
ger thajn we are," Johnson said.
"The ojfficials weren't calling a
very tjght game, so we got
pushed around when we tried
to box out and we try to do a lot
of boxing out."

ULS trailed by only four
points at halftime, but North
went on a 12-2 run in the third
quarter to open up a comfort-
able lead. The Knights got
within five points in the fourth
quarter but couldn't trim the
lead any more than that.

"Ghafari played a strong
game at guard," Johnson said.
"He rebounded well and
scored 10 points. Heaney also
rebounded well and scored 1G
points."

Gustine led ULS with 18
points but many of those came
late in the game.

"They had somebody shad-
ow Patrick the whole game,"
Johnson said. "It was difficult
for him to create shots. He did-
n't have a lot of open looks."

r*0$M MIS tfl$

PHOTO BY RENATO JAMETT

University Liggett School's Aaron Heaney drives around a
Conner Creek West player during the Knights' non-league vio
tory against the Eagles.
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Grosse Pointe North's Kelly DeFauw and Utica's Jamie Skiba get ready to chase after a loose ball.

drops thriller to Arthur Hill
By Chuck Klonke
Sports Editor

Tim Bigham was perplexed
after watching Grosse Pointe
North's girls basketball game
with Saginaw Arthur Hill
Monday night.

Bigham is one of North's
biggest fans. All three of his
children have played sports at
North — his youngest daugh-
ter, Sara, is a sophomore on the
Norsemen's junior varsity bas-
ketball team — so he has
watched a lot of the school's
games.

"Tim came up to me after the
game and said, 'I always
thought the best game I've ever
seen was (North's) overtime
loss to (Detroit) King in the
quarterfinals in 2000, but now I
don't know. This might be it,"'
North coach Gary Bennett
said.

Monday's game wasn't a vic-
tory for the Norsemen, who
lost 62-59, but that didn't both-
er Bennett a whole lot.

"It was an awesome game,"
Bennett said. "It was a great
environment. We had a two-
hour bus ride and they play in
an older gym. It was an old-
time atmosphere. But best of
all, we really competed. We led
about 97 percent of the game.
Unfortunately, we weren't
leading at the end."

The Lumberjacks gave the
Norsemen a competitive game
— something they don't get
very often in the Macomb Area
Conference Red Division —
and North rose to the occasion.

"This was a lot like our
Rochester game," Bennett said.
"We shot better in this one and
we took care of the ball better.
We have to keep getting better
if we want to have a good run

in the (state) tournament."
North led most of the first

half, a lead that was between
six and eight points most of the
time. The Norsemen were
ahead 19-11 after the first quar-
ter and 33-27 at halftime.

Neither team played very
well in the third quarter but
North took a 39-37 lead into
the final eight minutes.

The last three minutes were
back and forth. With 1:12 re-
maining and North holding a
two-point lead, Bennett called
timeout.

"We wanted to go into our
movement offense," Bennett
said. "We didn't want to do any
standing around because
Arthur Hill is really quick, and
if you're standing around they
can guard you."

North took some time off the
clock, but had a turnover. The
Norsemen played some tight

defense, but one of the
Lumberjacks players got loose
for a three-point basket to put
Arthur Hill up by three points.

Kayla Womack answered
with a three-point basket to tie
the game, but Arthur Hill got a
basket of its own to break the
tie.

North came up empty on its
next possession and with 5.6
seconds to go, the Norsemen
had to foul. The Lumberjacks
made one and North called an-
other timeout to set up a play.

"We executed the play per-
fectly and got a good look at a
three, but it didn't fall," Bennett
said.

Ariel Braker had another
outstanding game for North
against a quality opponent.

'Ariel had a monster game,"
Bennett said. "Their coach told
me that she might be the best
player he's ever seen. And

when I told him she's only a
sophomore, he couldn't believe
it."

Braker's statistics only begin
to tell the story of how well she
played. She finished with 16
points, 24 rebounds, six steals
and four assists.

"She fouled their big girl out
of the game," Bennett said.
"She made an outlet pass the
length of the court to Kayla
that was unbelievable. One of
the officials was standing in
front of our bench and he said
to me, 'I don't believe I just saw
that.' You hear coaches talk
about players who disappear in
big games. That's not Ariel.
That's when she's at her best."

Kelly DeFauw played a near-
ly-flawless floor game and
wound up with 14 points and
five assists.

See NORTH, page 4C

SOUTH:
Shield plays
in 100th game
Continued from page IC

great shot that he scored on."
South had to kill off three

more penalties in the third pe-
riod, but managed to do it with
goalie Trevor Sattelmeier com-
ing up with some good saves.

"He's as good as it gets in
goal," Bopp said. "We're not
scoring a lot of goals, but we
know we don't have to score a
lot with Trevor in goal."

The game was also a mile-
stone for Tim Shield, who be-
came the third player in South
history to play in 100 games.

"He's been a regular since
his freshman season when we
put him right on the second
line," Bopp said. "He's always
coming up with the big play.
That's because we've never
had anybody with a bigger
heart. He's a competitor."

Anthony Swancoat holds the
South record for games played
with 102, and Andy Klein
shares second place with
Shield. Tim's older brother,
Trey, played in 99 games.

Tim Shield showed that
competitive spirit in the semifi-
nal win against Traverse City
Central when he scored the
winning goal with 37 seconds
remaining in the third period.

Kelly O'Donnell-Daudlin
passed the puck to Lucas, who
carried it into the Trojans'
zone. Shield was skating full
speed toward the net with a
TCC player draped over him,
and he redirected Lucas's pass
past the goalie.

Traverse City's Chris
Archambo opened the scoring
at 12:43 of the first period, but
32 seconds later, Lucas tied the
game on a highlight-reel goal.
Michael Blazoff made a perfect
pass up the ice to Lucas, who
was cutting through the neu-
tral zone. Lucas skated in
alone, pulled the goalie and de-
posited the puck in the net.
Chris Stephens had the second
assist.

"Lucas has been so reliable,"
Bopp said. "He has a knack for
scoring the big goals, too."

Sattelmeier turned away 19
of the 20 shots in faced to pick
up the win.

Jimmy Morris also played a
strong game for South.

"He didn't score any points,
but he looked fast and made
play-after-play," Bopp said.

The two victories snapped a
three-game losing streak for
South and improved the Blue
Devils' overall record to 12-4-1.

South
bows to
WWT,

PHOTO BY DR. J. RICHARD DUNLAP

Grosse Pointe South's Aisha Rodney works against St. Clair's
6-foot-2 center Sarah Davis.

By Chuck Klonke
Sports Editor

It wasn't the best of weeks
for Grosse Pointe South's girls
basketball team, but coach
Kevin Richards isn't getting
discouraged.

"We're getting better,"
Richards said:, "Our individual
skills are a hundred times bet-
ter than at the beginning of the
season. I liked our effort in
both of the games. After the St.
Clair game (a 57-50 defeat), I
told the girls that all I can ask is
that we're in a position to win
at the end of the game — and
we were."

The loss to St. Clair gave the
Blue Devils a split in the season
series with the Saints.

"The tempo of the game
worked in our favor but we
didn't adjust to the way the
game was called," Richards
said. "We pressured them and
got them to turn the ball over,
but we fouled them too much,
and a lot of them were bad
fouls, like reaching in."

St. Clair made 21 of 34 free
throws, while South made only
nine of 21 attempts.

"Offensively, we did a lot of
good things," Richards said.

See HOOPS, page 4C

GROSSE POINTE PARK
LITTLE LEAGUE BASEBALL

FOR AGES 6-18
Registration

Monday, February 4th
at The Pointe After
19005 Mack Avenue

(near Mack & Moross)
6:30 - 8:00 p.m.

Registration Fees
A, AA, AAA, Major League (Ages 6-12) • $150.00 per player

or $205 per family
Junior, Senior, Big League (Ages 13-18) • $95 per player

*Age as of April 30th, 2008*
* Copy of player's birth certificate required9"

Try-Outs To Be Held
A, AA, AAA, Major League (Ages 6-12)

Sunday, March 16th

Junior, Senior & Big League for (Ages 13-18)
Sunday, April 6th (tentative)

A M

* * * .

Try-Out times & location will
be mailed in March

For questions and
additional information

Call 313-999-3487
or 313-550-9661
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Kevin Gibson, who has collected two assists in each of Grosse Pointe North's last two games,
faces off against Brandon Contralto of Brother Rice.

Inconsistency a concern
By Chuck Klonke
Sports Editor

With the final month of the
regular season coming up,
Grosse Pointe North hockey
coach Scott Lock has some se-
rious concerns.

"My team scares me," Lock
said after the Norsemen split
their two games last week.
"We're so inconsistent, and you
can't have that in the state tour-
nament. That's pretty much
been the case all season."

It certainly has been the last
two weeks.

After North's impressive win
against Catholic Central, it lost
5-1 to Clarkston the next time
out. The Norsemen bounced
back from that defeat with a 3-
1 win against St. Clair Shores,
but then lost 8-2 to Brother
Rice in a key Michigan
Interscholastic Hockey League
game.

"I don't have an answer for
it," Lock said. "(Brother Rice)
physically dominated us the
whole game. We didn't come
into the game with any fire. I
don't understand that, either.
We lost to them in overtime the
first time we played them, and
if we had won this game we-
could have jumped into second
place in the league." *

Brother Rice is a big team,
but Lock didn't think that
should have played as big a
part in the game as it did.

"When you don't fly around,
you're going to get hit," Lock
said. "I'm not saying we're like
the Red Wings, but when the
bigger teams like San Jose and
Anaheim try to intimidate
them, they make them pay for
it. That's what we have to do."

If the score doesn't show the
Warriors' domination of the
game, the shot totals do.
Brother Rice had a 46-19 ad-
vantage in that statistic.

Brother Rice led 2-0 after the
first period on goals by Scott
Christie and Nick Tinetti.

After North's Michael
Neveux scored a power-play
goal at 2:28 of the second peri-
od to cut the lead to 2-1, the
Warriors answered with goals
by Brandon Contratto and
Ryan Stankard to lead 4-2 after
two periods.

Any hopes of a North come-
back were dashed early in the
third period when Brother Rice
took advantage of a couple of
5-on-3s to score goals by Joey
VanAntwerp and Brett Kroll
during the first 2:29 of the peri-
od.

Stankard scored his second
goal of the game and Pat

Haffey capped the Warriors'
scoring with a power-play goal
at 9:17 to make it 8-1.

Neveux scored his second
power-play goal of the game
for North with 4:08 left. Justin
Kovacs and Kevin Gibson as-
sisted on both of Neveux's
goals.

It was an entirely different
game than North played
against St. Clair Shores earlier
in the week.

"The whole team played
pretty solid," Lock said. "We
played hard and we did some
smart things."

North outshot the Lakers 13-
1 in the first period, which fea-
tured some heavy hitting on
both sides.

Kovacs scored the only goal
of the first period. Late in the
period, North took a costly
penalty and St. Clair Shores
scored the tying goal early in
the second period.

"We had outshot them 13-2
and we were tied 1-1," Lock
said.

North broke the deadlock
with a power-play goal by Ben
Scarfone, assisted by Evan
Skorupski, in the third period,
and Jimmy Tocco added an in-
surance goal, assisted by
Kovacs. Gibson collected two
assists for North.

South
blanks
Mercy

Grosse Pointe South's girls
hockey team gave up-and-
coming Farmington Hills
Mercy a quick lesson
Thursday, Jan. 24, winning 8-0.

The host Lady Blue Devils
scored four goals in each of the
first two periods. The game
was called by the mercy rule
after two periods.

"I thought our girls played a
good game and skated pretty
well against an improved
Mercy team," South head
coach Bill Fox said.

South scored two goals
within the first five minutes of
the opening period-

Emma Hull had l|jer best
game of the season, netting a
hat trick and two assists. Alex
Rentz scored two goals, while
Ashley Thibodeau, Shannon
Gianino with two assists, and
Kelsey Burgess (two assists)
had a goal apiece.

Jessica Snella and Tara
Bolton also had a good game.

The home team outshot the
Marlins 28-5.

PHOTO BY BOB BRUCE

Grosse Pointe South's girls hockey team cruised to easy wins
last week, thanks to solid play from captain Maria Hartman.

Gymnastics team
third at Athens

Top competition brought out
the best in the Grosse Pointe
United gymnastics team last
weekend.

The team, which is made up
of gymnasts from Grosse
Pointe North and Grosse
Pointe South, finished third at
the Troy Athens Invitational
with a season-high score of
129.05 points.

"The girls were up against
some of the best gymnasts in
the state and they definitely
came on strong," said coach
Cathy Hubmeier.

Lauren Krieger was second
in Division II with an all-
around score of 34.15. Heather
Koresky was ninth with 32.60
and Brittany Rizzo finished
10th witha32.50 score.

Krieger and Rizzo tied for
fifth place in balance beam in
Division II with an 8.80.
Krieger tied for second in floor
exercise (9.05) and Koresky
was eighth (8.70).

Jenna Simon, Andrea
Koueiter, Lydia Fuller, Becky
Foglesong and Danielle
Coderre also had strong per-
formances with contributed to
the team's success at Athens.

Earlier, Grosse Pointe United
lost to Dearborn Edsel Ford de-
spite a team score of 126.8.

Krieger was second in vault
(8.35) and floor (9.00) and third
on parallel bars (7.95). She and
Rizzo tied for third on beam
with scores of 8.30. Koresky
was third on vault with 8.25.

a i success,
program
Last sea-
te North
hased a

nasties
sctremely

Simon, KoueitenFuller, Katie
LeVan, Anna Liang and
Coderre also madq key contri-
butions.

This is the secdnd season
that the two schools have had a
combined team.

"The combination team con-
tinues to be
Hubmeier said,
has grown stronge:
son the Grosse Po:
Booster Club pu
spring floor for the
team. That was an
generous contributibn to the
program. The girls Ijave really
benefitted from the t.se of this
floor, from learning few tricks
to preserving theii ankles.
Grosse Pointe has one of the
best high school facilities I've
seen." j

Grosse Pointe finished third
at the Fraser Invitational with a
score of 126.35. \

Krieger tied for first place in
floor exercise in Division II
with an 8.85. She wasj second
on beam (8.45) ana vault
(8.65); fifth on bars (7J95) and
fourth in all-around with a
score of 33.9. ]

Koresky was third on floor
(8.75), fourth on beam (8.25),
seventh on vault (8.3) and fifth
in all-around with a 32.35.

Rizzo placed sixth on beam
(8.1) and 10th in all-around
(31.25). Simon was 10th on
floor with 8.0.

Koueiter competed in vault,
bars, and floor and Liang com-

peted in beam. I
Grosse Poinfe defeated

Fraser 126.60-124.00.
Krieger led tfie team with

firsts on beam (B.95) and floor
(9.0) and tied for first on vault
(8.4). She was! third on bars
(7.7). I

Koresky wasfcecond on vault
(8.35) and thirfi on floor (8.45).
Rizzo was tlif d on vault (8.3)
and beam (8.i

Koueiter scbred well on vault
and floor, while Foglesong
competed on beam and "did a
great job,"/ Hubmeier said.
"Danielle Coderre competed in
floor and did another great
routine." /

Grosse Pointe lost its dual
meet witn Trenton, but the
te^m had several personal
bests, j .

Fuller sfcored a personal best
of 7.8 on/vault and Liang had a
personal! best of 7.8 on beam
and needs one more qualifying
score tp compete individually
at the regional.

Kouejiter had her personal
best op floor with a 7.75;
Simon) had personal bests on
vault (8.2) and beam (7.85);
and Cdderre had a strong meet
on floor.

Krieger took second on vault
(8.40) land bars (7.9) and came
back ^fter a scary fall off the
beamjto take first on floor with
an 8.j)0. Rizzo was third on
vaulti (8.35) and beam (8.70)
and t̂ ed for third on floor with
8.35.1

South's depth prevails
Grosse Pointe South's swim-

ming team used its depth to de-
feat Romeo, 114-72, in a
Macomb Area Conference Red
Division meet.

South won only five of 12
events, But it had a lot of sec-
onds, thirds and fourths.

South took the top three
spots in the 200-yard freestyle
with Michael Shook, who had
a winning time of 1:52.32, Zach
Powell and Jack Hessburg;
and the 100 freestyle with Matt
Mandel (52.46), Joe Hessburg,
and Matt Schmidt.

South won the 200 freestyle

relay with Mandel, Cam
Johnson and the Hessburg
brothers in 1:36.50.

Roby Boggs won the 100
breaststroke in 1:06.07.

Jordan Long made another
impressive showing in diving
with a score of 294.65 points.

South's teams of Schmidt,
Fares Ksebati, Mac Day and
Johnson and J.R Lang, Beau
Yavor, Wayne Brackett and
David Cockell finished second
and third, respectively, in the
200 medley relay.

Boggs was second, Brad
Kaminski third and Ryan

Graham fourth in the 200 indi-
vidual medley; Mandel,
Johnson and Joe Hessburg fin-
ished 2-4-5 in the 50 freestyle;
Kevin Macconnachie was third
and Mike Mulier fifth in diving;
Kaminski, Cockell and Sam
Effinger took second through
fourth in the 100 butterfly; and
Powell, Jack Hessburg and
Brackett finished second
through fourth in the 500
freestyle.. Shook, Schmidt and
Lang finished 2-3-4 in the 100
backstroke; Cockell was sec-
ond and Ksebati fourth in the
100 breaststroke.

HOOPS:
South slips to
7-7 record
Continued from page 3C

"We made seven three-point
field goals. Unfortunately, we
missed some layups."

Kate Pangori had one of her
best all-around games. She
scored 14 points and shot 4-
for-9 from three-point range.

"Kate's starting to realize her
potential," Richards said.
"She's more than just a shoot-
er. She's starting to put the ball
on the floor and pulling up."

Clare Conway had a strong
game with 12 points in her new
role of coming off the bench to
provide some instant offense.

"We were looking to change
things up," Richards said.

"Clare is so versatile, she can
play a number of positions."

The third quarter was
South's downfall as St. Clair
outscored the Blue Devils 21-
14.

"St. Clair is playing better
than it did when we played
them before," Richards said.

Earlier, South dropped a 41-
28 decision to Warren Woods-
Tower in a Macomb Area
Conference crossover game.

"We struggled to score,"
Richards said. "We had some
good looks but the shots
weren't falling."

Richards was pleased with
the defensive effort against the
Titans' Grand Valley State
University-bound center
Jessica Trambley.

"We held her to three points
and they were making a con-
certed effort to get her the
ball," Richards said. "Aisha
Rodney did a good job, and she

had help."
However, when you play a

good team you sometimes
have to pick your poison, and
WWT guard Katie Geyman
took up the slack for Trambley.
Geyman scored 20 points in
the second half and hit five
three-point baskets.

"Warren Woods-Tower is as
good as any team in the league
except for (Grosse Pointe)
North," Richards said.

South cut the Titans' lead to
five.points with 5 1/2 minutes
remaining in the game, but
WWT hit back-to-back three-
point field goals to ease the
pressure.

"That took away the momen-
tum," Richards said.

South slipped to 7-7 overall
and 3-4 in the MAC White
Division. The Blue Devils host
EAnse Creuse North on Friday,
then play at Utica Ford n on
Tuesday, Feb. 5.

NORTH:
Wins twice in
MAC Red
Continued from page 3C

Olivia Stander shot well
from outside and finished with
12 points, four steals and three
assists.

Stander recently made a ver-
bal commitment to play soccer
for Michigan State.

Last week, North had little
trouble beating two MAC Red
opponents.

The Norsemen built a 25-0
first-quarter lead and coasted
to a 61-34 win against Utica.

Stander had her best shoot-

ing game of the season as she
hit three triples and finished
with 13 points. She also collect-
ed six assists.

Braker had 11 points and
seven steals and DeFauw
scored 10 points.

North's other league victory
was a 57-38 win against
Eisenhower.

The Norsemen had a 30-10
lead before the Eagles closed
the gap to 34-22 at halftime. It
got even closer in the third
quarter.

"We had our worst third
quarter of the season," Bennett
said.

Eisenhower outscored North
8-5 in the quarter and at one
point got within seven points
(39-32).

Braker wound up with 17

points, 11 steals, eight re-
bounds, five assists and five
blocked shots.

Christine Klein had 12
points and eight rebounds, and
made some impressive moves
inside.

DeFauw had eight points
and six steals.

"Kelly's so s- consistent,"
Bennett said. "She always
plays a solid game. You always
know what to expect from
her."

Jasmine Kennedy con-
tributed seven points and four
rebounds in limited playing
time.

North is 13-2 overall and 7-0
in the MAC Red.

The Norsemen host Port
Huron Northern on Tuesday,
Feb. 5.
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Mail: Clarified Advertising, 96 Kercheval, GrossejPointe Farms, Mi, 48236

Phone: (3fe) 882-6900 Ext. 3 Fax: (313) 343-3569

1
CLASSIFICATIQNjNO.

5

$21.15 FOR 12 WORDS. ADDITIONAL WORDS, .656 EACH. SfiLtEfiE COLOR!

13 S21.S0 t4 S22.45

18 m.05

\ 15 «».W

« Ms.ro

12 $21.15

« *S9.«

20 • S2A3S

3. OF WEEKS: X COST PER WEEK-

YOUR CONTACT AND BELLING INFORMATION

NAME:

STREET ADDRESS:.

CITY; STATE:.

PHONE:.

AMOUNT ENCLOSED:

Q VISA Q MASTERCARD CARD NO.L

SIGNATURE:

2IP:.

, EXP. DATE:.

Prepayment is required, we accept visa. Mastercard, cash and cfieck.
Declined Credit cards. Minium fee $2,oo or 3% of total declined.

DEADLINES

Piease calf for holietay

deadlines are for publication in following

Thursday's newspaper

Names/Land far s a l ^
Photos, artiogos: !

1 2 P M FRIDAY

words ads: 4 P.M M Q N D I Y

Rentals; ,
13PMTBESDAY

General*

pRicir
fentls required.

We acceat visa, Mastercard,
cashartdlcheck. Pieas© note

word ads;
12 words for $21.15;
additions words are ese each. Abbreviations
are not accepts.
[Measured ads:
$34.40 per column inch.
Bordered ads:
$39.40 per column inch

we offer special rates for fteJp wanted
sections.
Frequency discounts:
Given for multi-week scheduled advertis-
ing, with prepayment or credit approval.
Call for rates or for mom information
Phone lines can be busy on Monday and
Tuesday Ptease call early

CLASSIFYING
AND CENSORSHIP
We reserve the right to classify each as un*
der its appropriate heading The publisher
reserves the right to edit or reject 3d copy
submttted for publication

CORRECTIONS
AND ADJUSTMENTS

099
BUSINESS OPPORTUNITIES

ESTABLISHED wom-
an's hair salon lor
lease. Harper/ 8 Mile.
Terms negotiable.
(313)885-8300

GELATO Cafe, LLC- SQ-
rious inquiries only!
Training and equip-
ment included. $130k.
(313)886-1540 :

SALON in Grosse
Pointe,. 8 styling sta^
tions. New everything!
586-294-2646 •

100 ANNOUNCEMENTS

103ATTORNEYS/LEGALS

NEED an Attorney?
Law offices of William
Rabaut Over 20 years
experience (586)778-
2730

108 COMPUTER SERVICE

COMPUTER Techni-
cian, in home residen-
tial troubleshooting,
network setups, tutor-
ing, disaster recovery.
Military certified. Local
resident. Available
24/7. .(313)310-3610
Chris

112 HEALTH & NUTRITION 1 2 0 0 HELP WANTED GENERAL
203 HELP WANTED

DENTAL/MEDICAL

In Home Or business
Training For Your

Convenience
Nutrition & Exercise
BODY BY KAREN

(Certified)
Discounts Available

114 MUSIC EDUCATION

THE Music Trfee, Suzu-
ki violin lessons, certi-
fied teacher. Lisa
Saigh, (586)773-7569

VOICE & pi^no coach.
Be a better singer.
Adults, your home,
Grosse Pointes.
(810)326-0206

HEALING Hands Holis,
tic Health Center!
School of Massage is1

now enrolling for Feb-
ruary start. Please call,
(586)469-3811 or visit,
www.mvomas.com for
more information.

I'LL come to you- take
your portraits. 10 por-
traits/ $20.00. Bob,
313-640-4194

101 PRAYERS

NOVENA to St. Jude
May the Sacred Heart
of Jesus be adored,
glorified, loved and
preserved throughout
the world, now and for-
ever. Oh Sacred Heart
of Jesus, pray for us.
St. Jude, helper of the
hopeless, pray for us.
St. Jude, worker of
miracles, pray for us.
Say this prayer for 9
days, 9 times each day.
By the 9th day, your
prayer will be an-
swered, it has never
been known to fail,
never. Publication
must be promised, in
Thanksgiving to St.
Jude for blessings re-
ceived & special thanks
also to blessed Mother
& St. Anthony. J&J

NOVENA to St. Jude
May the Sacred Heart
of Jesus be adored,
glorified, loved and
preserved throughout
the world, now and for-
ever. Oh Sacred Heart
of Jesus, pray for us.
Worker of miracles,
pray for us. St. Jude,
helper of the hopeless,
pray for us.
Say this prayer 9 times
a day. By the 8th day,
your prayer will be an-
swered, it has never
been known to fail,
never. Publication
must be promised.
Thanks, St. Jude for
prayers answered.
Special thanks to our
Mother Of perpetual
Help. B.C.C.

ANY Transportation
Company. Safe, relia-
ble, anywhere. Pickup
truck available. Richard
{313)320-4336.

f! Owned/ Operated by
jj METRO AIRPORT CAB.
£ Luxury transportation to and
Sfrom airport. All size vehicles.

I Established 30 years.
1 24 hours/ 7 days.
| We accept all
4 major credit cards.

^EJHSBHSSSHI!

120 TUTORING EDUCATION

Grosse Pointe
Learning Center

•Since 1977*
131 Kercheval

313-343-0836

123 DECORATING SERVICES

JULIE'S Custom Drap-
ery & Blinds. Free esti-
mates. Your material
or mine. (586)214-1700

125 FINANCIAL SERVICES

AVOID
FORECLOSURE
Behind on Payments?

Save your Credit

We Can Help!

Call 313-590-1000

200 HELP WANTED GENERAL

DRIVER for catering
company- full time.
Knowledge of Detroit &
Metro area and valid
Michigan Chauffeurs li-
cense needed, clean
professional appear-
ance and attention to
detail a .must, Email re-
sumes to Karen©
edibiesrex.com

WAITRESS, part- time.
Apply in person. Irish
coffee Bar & Grill,
18666 Mack Avenue.
Grosse Pointe Farms.

FRANCESCO'S Salon
in Grosse Pointe Vil-
lage- looking for hair
stylists, nail tech with
some clientele. Full or
part time. 810-444-
3889.

NOW accepting appli-
cations: seeking pas-
sionate & knowledgea-
ble pet people for part-
time morning shift. Ap-
ply at: Lou's Pet Shop
20741 Mack.

PREVA SALON
Employment

Opportunities:
Professional and
Experienced Hair

Stylists & Nail Techs.
Anton, 313-881-7523

THE Blake Company
seeks a Property Main-
tenance Worker with
limited management
responsibilities for east
suburban apartments.
Experience required in
electrical, plumbing,
carpentry. HVAC expe-
rience preferred, indi-
vidual must be hard
working and possess
excellent communica-
tion skills, Full time po-
sition requires 24 hour
availability. Must have
excellent references.
Fax resume to 313-
881-3395 or Email to
cblake@thebiake
companv.net

UNIVERSAL Parking is
now hiring valet at-
tendants, valet supervi-
sors, greeters, and
shuttle bus drivers
(CpL license not re-
quired) to work at our
new location in Grosse
Pointe! We are seeking
highly motivated, cus-
tomer service based in-
dividuals. All applicants
must be 18 years of
age, or oider, and have
valid state drivers li-
cense. Those applying
for a valet position
must be able to drive a
stick shift. Please visit
our website: www.
universalvalet.com to
fill out an application.
Please mention Grosse
Pointe in the referred
by column.

201 HELP WANTED

BABYSITTER

BABYSITTER in our
home; 15-20 hours per
week. Must have relia-
ble transportation and
references. 313-407-
0370

EXPERIENCED and
loving full time nanny
needed for 7 year old,
3 year old and infant in
our Grosse Pointe Park
home. Must have valid
drivers license. Excel-
lent pay, flexible start
date. 313-993-1374/
days; 313-823-0084/
PM/ weekends.

RN/ LPN preferred. Do
you enjoy being in-
volved in patient care?
Eastside Dermatology
is seeking talented in-
dividuals to join our
quality focused team of
nurses. We offer a
stimulating growth en-
vironment with com-
petitive wages and
benefits. Fax your re-
sume now to schedule
an interview and ex-
plore this opportunity.
313-884-9756.

205 HELP WANTED LEGAL

100 ANNOUNCEMENTS 100 ANNOUNCEMENTS

CONCEALED PISTOL LICENSE
TRAINING CLASSES

(Required to obtain Michigan CCW License)
State approved- CCW Board Recognized
SAS GROUP ofieis private or group training

•Basic CCW Classes, Basic Safety Classes
•Marksmanship, Tactical & Specialized Training

REFUSE TO BE A VICTIM
For Appointment Call James D. Binder |

(586)776-4836
or email sasgroup@comcast.net

LEGAL secretary- full
time, friendly genera!
practice law firm, mini-
mum 5 years experi-
ence. Send resume to
Office Manager, P.O.
Box 420, St. Ciair
Shores, Ml 48080

207 HELP WANTED SALES

PTJEASEJOIMUS^
COLDWELL. BANKER

SCHWEITZER
PRESENTS

CAKBER NIGHT

Wed., Feb. €
6:00pm

#• Are you interested
in a case&s in

re&t estate sales?

*• Come explore your
opportunities

to reserve a spot ait ova
upcoming seates&tepg
career information

session!̂

> This is a free session

no obligation!
COtDWELL BANKER

SCHWEITZER
20902 Made Are.

Grosse Pointe Woods

209 HELP WANTED

PROFESSIONAL

FUNERAL planning
counselor- Mature,
100% commission, no
benefits. Flexible
schedule. Life insur-
ance license will be re-
quired, Send resume
to: oakesgroup@gmail
.com

210 HELP WANTED

RESTAURANT

CHEFS/ cooks. Experi-
enced only. Call Steve,
(313)881-8540, after
4pm.

EXPERIENCED wait-
ress/ bartender. Apply
in person at: Sunrise
Sunset Saloon, 15222
Charlevoix, Grosse
Pointe Park. (313)822-
6080

207 HELP WANTED SALES

INSIDE sales- part
time. Recently retired
professional? Looking
for a low stress job
where you can make a
few extra dollars? This
Eastside based compa-
ny seeks a personable,
articulate individual for
telephone sales, busi-
ness- to- business.
Successful candidate
must have some sales
and computer experi-
ence. Monday- Friday,
1:00- 5:00pm. Send re-
sume to: Heaithmark
industries, 22522 East
Nine Mile, St. Clair
Shores, Ml 48080

102 LOST & FOUND 102 LOST & FOUND

lam requestingyour assistance in recoveringa
GOLD FABERGE EGG ENCRUSTED WITHJEWELS,

approximately 8 inches tall, attached to a wooden base,

The afore mentioned egg was taken from a home on
Lake Shore Drive, during an under age house parly.

The subjects that stole the egg along with other jewelry,
stated that the 'egg was thrown from a car window,

while at a stop sign at Southbound Wedgewood
atRoslyn, November 12, 2007.

If you have any Information, Please Call
Village of Grosse Pointe Shores,

Detective Sergeant Dan Pullen, 313-881-5500

200 HELP WANTED GENERAL! 200 HELP WANTED GENERAL

AMBASSADOR BRIDGE
PAID TRAINING/ UNIFORMS

TOLL FREE BRIDGE CROSSING
CHANCE TO EARN ATTENDANCE BONUS

Qualifications:
MUST BE 18 YEARS + VALID DRIVERS LICENSE

AVAILABLE TO WORK
WEEKENDS/HOLIDAYS (12 HOUR SHIFTS)

CASH HANDLING EXPERIENCE PREFERRED
ESSENTIAL STAFFING, INC.
SEND RESUME TODAY!

FAX: 586-792-4548
esyobs@sbc<ilobat.Het

NO ATTACHMENTS

209 HELP WANTED

PROFESSIONAL

209 HELP WANTED

PROFESSIONAL

r PART TIME 911 POLICE/ FIRE *2
COMMUNICATION TECHNICIAN

The City of Grosse Pointe is accepting applications for
Part Time 911 Police/ Fire Communicatio.ri Dispatchers.

Applications may be obtained at the City of Grosse Pointe
Public Safety Department, Monday- Friday; 8:30am-

4:00pm, 17145 Maumee Avenue, Grosse Pointe, MI 48230;
or the City website @ >vww.grossepointedty.org

Qualifications Required:
1. At least IS years of age.
2. Must not have been convicted of a violation of criminal law.
3. Graduation from an accredited high school or GED.
4. Must be able to type at least 30 net words per minute.
5. Must be proficient in the use of a computer.
6. Must be available on an on-call basis.

Condition of Employment:
1. Vision must be free of significant abnormality, correctable
to 20/20 and normal color vision.

2. Pass a physical, drug testing and background investigation.
3. Must possess a valid Michigan Drivers License.

Application with copy of High School Diploma or GED
certificate must be returned no later than Febrjruary 14, 2008.

EOE

300 SITUATIONS WANTED1302 SITUATIONS WANTED
BABYSITTERS I CONVALESCENT CARE

209 HELP WANTED
PROFESSIONAL

ADMINISTRATIVE as-
sistant for catering
company- full or part
time. Outgoing, friend-
ly, business professio-
nal with MSOffice
knowledge, exception-
al phone skills, ability
to problem solve a
must. Hospitality or
sales background help-
ful. Email resumes and
cover letters to
karen@ediblesrex.com

TO PLACE AN AD
CALL313-882-$900ext3

300 SITUATIONS WANTED

BABYSITTERS

ATTENTION:

DAY CARE
FACILITIES

(In-Home & Centers)
Must Show Their
Current License
To Advertising
Representative
When Placing

Your Ads
THANK YOU

Parents - Please
Verify All Child Care

Licenses!

EXPERIENCED medi-
cal student seeking
flexible hours, babysit-
ting in your home.
Many references,
(313)819-9399

LOVING nanny availa-
ble to care for children
in your home. $10/
hour. Willing to do light
housework as well.
Spanish speaker, call
Lorena at 313-399-
6937.

302 SITUATIONS WANTED

CONVALESCENT CARE

CARE AT HOME
Care givers, personal

care, cooking, cleaning
Licensed - Bonded

Since 1984.
Full/part time, live-in.

(586)772-0035

H O M E care provided
foY your elderly loved
ones. Honest & reliable
care givers available.
24 hour care, transpor-
tation to & from ap-
pointments. Referen-
ces provided. For more
info call, (313)590-
1234, askforRona.

L O V I N G , honest a reli-
able care giver availar
ble. References. Please
call, (313)550-5927.

QUALITY care for your
loved one. Very afford-
able. 25 years experi-
ence. Appointments,
shopping, light house-
keeping. 24 hour care.
(313)886-3356

A+ Live-ins Ltd.
Companion Caregivers provide
Personal Care, Cleaning, Cooking
& Laundry. Hourly & Daily Rates

Insured & Bonded
Dee Allen - Grosse Pointe Resident

881-8073

Home Care
Assistance of Michigan

•Full Time •Part Time

S -Live-in
•Personal Care

•Cleaning »Cooking
•Laundry

Insured/Bonded
Henry DeVries, Jr.

313-343-6444

POINTE CARE
SERVICES

SOCAwardWinner
"Senior Friendly Business "

PERSONAL CARE,
COOKING, CLEANING,

LAUNDRY

FULL/PART TIME
INSURED & BONDED

313-885-6944
Mary Ohesquiere, R.ri. j

303 SITUATIONS WANTED
DAY CARE

ATTENTION:
by MICHIGAN LAW

DAY CARE
FACILITIES ^ i

,.. On-Home, & pej)|ej;s,k-
Must Show Their ,,
Current License
To Advertising
Representative
When Placing

Your Ads
THANKYOU

Parents - Please
Verify All Child Care

Licenses!

WE ACCEPT

FOR YOUR
CONVENIENCE

ACROSS
1 Towns
6 "Bam!"
9 Raw rock

12 Dizzying
designs

13 Mimic
14 Gender
15 Ancient

Roman port
16 Workaday

grind
18 Beast
20 Culture

medium
21 Pismire
23 Affirmative

action?
24 Skilled
25 Out of

bounds
27 "Aida"

composer
Period of
decline
Blue shades
Fillies'
mothers
No purebred
Reached
1950s DJ's
stack
Festive

44 Belligerent
deity

45 Kitchen
device

47 Hoarder of a
sort

49 Wipe out
52 Biblical

verb suffix

1

12

15

2

•

3

_

4 9

14

10 11

29

31
35

37
38
41

43

53 Rocks
54 Chipped in
55 — Moines
56 Garden plot

57 ... and what
may grow
there

DOWN
1 Greet the

villain
2 Boom times
3 Knocking

noise
4 Smile
5 Blotch
6 Procession
7 October

stone 34
8 Drench 36
9 Orange

variety 38
10 Summarize
11 Put forth 39
17 Curie

discovery 40
'19 Man with a

van. 42
21 Keep talking 45
22 Ultramodernist 46
24 Wood-

shaping tool 48
26 Grayish-red
28 Grates 50
30 Roscoe 51
32 Kids (SI.)
33 Greek vowel

Pigs' digs
Walking on (
air
Stared
open-mouthed
Speak from
the soapbox
Georgia and
Cal
Remove wool
Spiked club
Cube-maker
Rubik
Eve,
originally
Witness
Mag. staffers

V • - - • - * *
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304 SITUATIONS WANTED1305 SITUATIONS WANTED1305 SITUATIONS WANTED

GENERAL I HOUSE CLEANING I HOUSE CLEANING
406 ESTATE SALES

FOR hire, full time.
Personal assistant.
caretaker, chauffeur,
cook, security & handy-
man. Former police of-
ficer with references.
Piease call (248)892-
8535, ask for Bill snyd-
er

305 SITUATIONS WANTED

HOUSE CLEANING

20 years experience,
honest & reliable.
Grosse Pointe referen-
ces available. Lisa
(313)623-0435

406 ESTATE SALES

AFFORDABLE house-
cleaning by Polish lady.
Honest, dependable,
detail oriented. Grosse
Pointe references.
(313)729-6939

AMERICAN hardwork-
ing woman available to
clean your home. Hon-
est, dependable, relia-
ble. Free estimates. 12
years - experience.
(313)527-6157

CLEANING lady, expe-
rienced, with referen-
ces. {313)802-2849

406 ESTATE SALES

ANTIQUES/COLLECTIBLES

MARGARET L.L.C.
House cleaning and
laundry services. Polish
ladies with very good LATE 20's. 3 piece full
experience, excellent size bedroom set, good
references. We speak condition, many carved
English! (313)319-7657 and inlaid features,

$1,600. JOhn, (586)776-
6100

PLACE YOUR AD TODAY!
CALL (313)882-6900 X 3

HOUSE/ estate/ ga-
rage sale! 323 Mt Ver~
non, Grosse Pointe
Farms. Friday, 11am-
3pm.

BAKER Serpentine
sideboard, Vintage Her-
schede grandfather
clock, Kindei Winter-
thur collection chairs,
Weiman silver leaf
Bombe chest, 6 George
III mahogany side
chairs... now _1O~ 15%
off. Grosse Pointe Col-
lection,. 20155 Mack,
Grosse Pointe Farms.
313-884-2700.

BOOKS

406 ESTATE SALES 406 ESTATE SALES

John King
313-961-0622

•Clip & Save This Ad<

411 CLOTHES/JEWELRY

CHEAP- 1 diamond
wedding ring, 2 Emer-
ald rings with dia-
monds, For Details
(586)727-4451

412 MISCELLANEOUS

ARTICLES

CRAFTSMAN electric
start 5 horse snow
thrower, like new,
$300/ best offer.
(586)296-3346

STILL in box, Deil
E4400, desk top com-
puter with 19" diagonal
LCD screen, $900.
Queen size sleep num-
ber bed. $900.
(313)585-8074

WATCHES, cameras,
coin collections, ail col-
lectibles, plus! Call for
complete list (248)545-
8146

416 SPORTS EQUIPMENT

iMpEX Powerhouse
betph press in addition
45 Ib Olympic bar and
6- 1p Ib plates, 4- 5 Ib
pSatfS, $290. 313-882-
9992 ask for Eric.

2003 Taurus| Perfect
condition. 83JC miles
with warrarfy. SES,
CD, maintained per-
fectly. $7,5fV best.
Jerry, (586)42f 7574

601 AUTOMOTIVE

CHRYSLER

Complete Service
Glen ana Sharon Bucket!

313-885-0826

M A R C I A WILK
S T A T E S A L E S

wanted vintage Clothes And Accessories
paying Top Dollar For The Following:

Clothes From The 1900's Through 1970s.
•costume •Fine Jewelry/Watches

•cufflinks -Furs *Hats -Handbags 'Shoes
Lingerie 'Linens •Textiles
•Vanity 'Boudoir items

References, Complete Confidentiality
"Best of Hour Detroit"

"Paris*4 24S-866-43S9

407 FIREWOOD

1107 BUCKINGHAM
GROSSE POINTE PARK

FRIDAY, SATURDAY
FEBRUARY 1 AND 2
9:00AM- 4:00PM

This is a great sale! You will be surprised ot the amount of
really great items ready to take home & love! There is a
really nice new plaid Drexei sofa, with a complimentary
floral chair and ottoman, maroon leather sofa, maroon
leather wing chair, blue leather sofa, blue leather wing

chair, blue leather Lazy Boy, steel and glass coffee table
and sofa table. Baker loyeseat, nice petite Henredon
English oak sideboard, dining room table with 6 choirs,

three steel tables with tile tops, sweet pair Chippendale
style love seats, king- size bed. Pottery Barn coffee fable,
three piece Bistro set, marbled topped Eastlake table,

queen pine four poster bed with armoire and cedar chest,
two baker's racks. Queen Anne lowboy, nice kitchen table
and 4'chairs, brand new vanity with marble top and mirror,

clocks including Grandmother's clock and pressed oak
mantle clock, big screen Toshiba HD Theater view TV, Bose

wave radio, very large bookshelf, artwork Including oil
pointings, lamps, books, Claire Murray hooked rugs,

treadmill, hammock, skis, grill, patio furniture, There Is an
unbelievable selection of Women's clothing; size 10- 22W,
including over 30 St, John Knits, Michael Kors, Lilly Pulitzer,

Lacosre, Escada, Neiman Marcus, Tommy Bahama,
Adrlenne Vlttadlni, Talbots, Chicos, Ralph Lauren, Laura
Ashley, Ann Taylor, Susan Bristol, Giesswein Oilily. Singrid
Olsen, INC, White House Black Market, Whot are clothes•

without shoes? Jack Rogers. Ferragamo, Kate Spade,Stuart
__Weltzman, Bruno Magli. You are going to love this sale,
P""W " plan to spend some time! ysgl

Street numbers honored at 8:30am Friday
t accept Visa, Master card and Discover on all

purchases. Check out my Website www.marciawilk.com
to see some featured items.

^Known for Honesty & Integrity"
www.iluvantiques.co lyi

(586)344-2048

2 SALES - BOTH STERLING HEIGHTS
#1- February 1 & 2 * Seville Terrace Complex

11840 Ina Drive, Building P
Friday and Saturday • 10am - 4pm

#2 - Saturday Only, Fairway Green Condos
34767 Maple Lane Drive

Saturday • 9am - 4pm
Both Off 15 Mile Road and Maple Lane (Hoover)

Creative solutions to home liquidation!
Call us before you dean or throw anything away!

Auctions

Appraisals

Senior Moving
Specialists

Lori Sfefek

i Stefeifs Auction House is located at:
1 18450 Mack Avenue
1 Crosse Pointe Forms, Ml 48236

FREE stacking, deliv-
ery, kindting. Split,
seasoned.' $100/ face
cord. New phone,
(586)725-3860.

HARDWOOD. Seas-
oned. $80/ face cord,
delivered. (248)840-
5566

408 FURNITURE

A new Queen pillow
top • mattress set, in
plastic. Must sell! $259.
(586)296-2233

ESTATE furniture, pair
Baker dark fruitwood
dining room chests/
lateral files. Octagonal
pedestal side table,
fruitwood, Italian Pro-
vincial. Unique rustic
tables, lamps, 2 maple
captain's chairs, for
family room or cottage.
Excellent condition,
reasonable. (313)884-
0449

409 GARAGE/YARD/
RUMMAGE SALE

MOVING sale! Satur-
day, February' 2nd,
9am. Lovely oak dining
set, wall unit, coffee
tables, kitchen goods,
quality clothing, tools,
misc. All must go! 2 is-
land Lane, (Fisher &
Jefferson).

WINDSOR high chair,
stroller, matching carri-
er. Travel play pen. Like
new, (313)417-9270

413 MUSICAL

INSTRUMENTS

GROSSE POINTE
STRINGS

Repair & set- up of
violin, viola, cello and
bass. Rehairing bows.

Selling reasonably
priced student
instruments.

Call (313)882-7874
for an appointment.

W A N T E D - GuitarsT
Banjos, Mandolins and
Ukes. Local collector
paying top' cash! 313-
886-4522.

STEEL buildings- 20x
20 taMOOx 100. Qualify
for big advertising dfs-
countfup to 50% off.
Can ) erect. 734-955-
5573.

2004 Dodgef Neon SXT-
Loaded 4 -poor, blue.
59,000 mi]k. Factory
warranty. $,950/ best.
313-882-1403, after
6pm. |

602 AUTOMOTIVE
fORD

2001 Fold FOCUS LX-
whlte, | door auto.
Clean, f 1,000 miles.
$4,200. (£86)344-8896

500 ANIMAL

ADOPT A PET

605 AUTOMOTIVE

FOREIGN

GROSSE Pointe Ani-
mal Adoption Society-
Pet adoption. Saturday,
February 2; 12- 3pm.
Children's Home of De-
troit, 900 Cook, Grosse
Pointe Woods. 313-
884-1591, GPAAS.Org

2005 /Honda Accord
EX- 2/door coupe, 4
cylinder. 19,000 miles.
Very /good condition.
Asking $15,500.
(313)882-3999

GROSSE Pointe Ani-
mal Clinic: older tan
male cocker. Female
Lhasa n îx. Black DMH
cat. 2 i black kittens.
(313)82215707

414 OFFICE/BUSINESS I 505 LOST AND FOUND

EQUIPMENT

2 small office desks,
credenza and 2 lateral
files, best offers,
(313)885-8535

415 WANTED TO BUY

FINE china dinner-
ware, sterling silver
flatware and antiques.
Call Jan/ Herb.
(586)731-8139

SHOTGUNS, rifles, old
handguns; Parker,
Browning, Winchester,
Colt, Luger, others.
Collector. (248)324-
0680

FOUND: black iab mix
& yeilowi retriever mix,
collars, 1 Maryland/
Mack, (310)823-8477

509 PET BOARDING/SITTING

WILL prbvide tender,
loving carp in my home
for your small dog. Ref-
erences. (313)886-1792

Honda CRV-LX-
automatic, 4WD.
78,opo miles. One
owner. New tires, re-
mote start. $9,600.
{31^)881-2213

20^5 Toyota Scion XB,
5 ipeed, 41,000 miles,
g reW black cloth,
$1,0,900. weekdays till
5:00pm, (586)776-
3f55. After 6 & week-
ends, (586)530-5373

606 AUTOMOTIVE

SPORT UTILITY

2001 Jeep Grand Cher-
dkee Laredo, 4 wheel
thrive. Tan, 117,000
miles. Good condition,
yveil cared for. Runs
(ike a top! $3,400.
313)882-4939

K fointe New CONNECTION (313)882-6900 eXt. 3

700 APTS/FLATS/DUPLEX• 700 APTS/FLATS/DUPLEX• 700 APTS/FLATS/DUPLEX|700 APTS/FLATS/0UPLEX1700 APTS/FLATS/DUPLEX• 700 APTS/FLATS/DUPLEX• 700 APTS/FLATS/DUPLEX|702 APTS/FLATS/DUPtEX
POINTES/HARPER WOODSlPOINTES/HARPER WOODSiPOINTES/HARPER WOODSBPOINTES/HARPER WOODSIPOINTES/HARPER WOODSlPOlNTES/HARPER WOODslpQINTES/HARPER WOODS! S.C.S/MACOMB COUNTY !

1 bedroom. Vernier,
upper, appliances, ga-
rage, air, no pets, ref-
erences, - $600.
(313)881-3149

1ST month free! 870
Nottingham, 4 unit
building, lower availa-
ble. 2 bedrooms, hard-
wood floors, applian-
ces, $625. Also a tem-
porary apartment avail-
able on 817 Beacons-
field. {586)212-0759

1073 Lakepointe up-
per, $645/ month, 2
bedrooms, den, living
room, full dining room,
window air, sun porch,
updated kitchen, base-
ment storage with
washer, dryer. Off
street parking. Call
(313)822-4750

2 & 3 bedroom apart-
ments, section 8 ok, no
pets, non- smoking.
(313)492-5333

1272 wayburn, 2 bed-
room, appliances,
washer, _ dryer, air,
$750 includes water.
(313)971-5458

2 bedroom apartment,
storage room, garage,
air, good condition,
$700 plus security.
(313)881-2806

1313 Somerset, beau-
tiful 3 bedroom, 1,300
square feet, includes
appliances. $850/
month. Mike (313)690-
9050

Classified Advertising
313-882-6900 ext 3

* CONNECTION

su|do|ku
© Puzzles by Pappocom

Tips and computer program at:

www.sudoku.com

E-2

DIRECTIONS:
Fill in the grid so
that every tpw,

every column and
every 3 x 3 grid

contains the digits
1 through 9 with

no repeats.

Thursday 01-31-08

E-1 SOLUTION 01-24-08

2 bedroom upper,
wayburn. Newly re-
decorated. Ready Feb-
ruary. $650/ water. Ap-
pliances. 313-689-0171

2037 vernier, Grosse
Pointe Woods. Quiet 2
bedroom, 1st floor, 900
sq. f t appliances. Cen-
tral air. Covered porch.
Basement. Garage. No
pets, non- smoking.
$750.(313)418-1738

3 bedroom flat, Bea-
consfield, hardwood
floors, working fire-
place, all appliances,
washer, dryer, off
street parking. $750/
month. (313)884-7684

414 Neff- 4 bedroom, 2
1/2 baths, air, 2 car ga-
rage. $1,400. Crane Re-
alty (313)884-6451

827 Neff, 2 bedroom
duplex. Appliances/ ga-
rage. Walk to Village,
$875.(313)882-0245

A must see, 1 bed-
room upper, 1974 Ver-
nier, Grosse Pointe
woods. Approximately
1,000 square feet.
$650/ month, heat &
water included.
(586)838-9536, days
(313)461-6419, eve-
nings.

AFFORDABLE town-
house apartment in
Grosse Pointe Woods.
2 or 3 bedroom. Updat-
ed kitchen, central air.
Clean and well main-
tained. No dogs. Start-
ing at $775/ month.
(248)848-1150

BASEMENT apart-
ment. Laundry. Re-
decorated. Must see,
$475/ month, security.
Utilities included. 586-
212-1660

BEACONSFIELD/ Jef-
ferson, 2 bedroom, first
floor, appliances, wa-
ter. $575. Available
now. 313-885-0031

CHARMING Lake-
pointe 1 bedroom stu-
dio apartment. Base-
ment storage, laundry.
Off- street parking.
$455.(313)881-4893

DUPLEX, 2 bedroom,
air, appliances, base-
ment. $800. (586)286-
5693, before 3pm.

FURNISHED: elegant,
spacious upper unit
with beautiful fire-
place, hardwood floors
and large skylit bonus
room. Month to month,
$1,000, includes utilit-
ies. (313)410-7947

GROSSE Pointe
Farms, 3 bedroom up-
per, new kitchen, new
furnace, appliances,
basement, garage.
$1,200.(313)647-1675.

GROSSE Pointe villas,
Mack at Lakeland. 1
bedroom. Totally reno-
vated. $795/ month,
heat/ air included.
{313)882-0154

GROSSE Pointe, 2
bedroom upper, water,
appliances included.
1475 Wayburn, $650
plus security, (313)205-
0155

HAMPTON iri The
Park. 2 bedroom, cen-
tral air, $400. No appli-
ances. (313)885-8808

HARCOURT luxury
apartment. Beautiful
with numerous ameni-
ties. $1,100. Professio-
nal/ senior discounts.
(313)821-1753

HARCOURT, 2
room lower, air, clean,
$900. Separate utilities.
NO pets, (313)530-9566

HARPER Woods/ East-
pointe, 2 bedroom
homes, section 8 ok.
Starting- $725.
(586)634-0217

NOTTINGHAM, South
of Jefferson, 2 bed-
room lower, new appli-
ances, hardwood
floors, parking, $550.
{810)229-0079

PARK- South/ Jeffer-
son. 895 Beaconsfield.
2 bedroom upper, su-
per clean, completely
redone including kitch-
en, $700 includes heat
& water. (248)370-
8865

RENTERS: it's time to
buy! Gorgeous 2 family
home, with 2 story up-
per for you. 912 Not-
tingham. Virtual tour at
mikelevan.com

SHARP one bedroom
in Park. Hardwood, ap-
pliances, laundry, heat,
parking. $625.
{313)886-8058

SOMERSET, 3 becP
room upper, recently
painted, appliances,
separate basement,
garage. No pets, $775.
plus security. (313)881-
3039

ST. Clair Avenue, 2
bedroom, 1 bath, fire-
place, insulated porch,
central air, $1,050.
(313)806-7149

TROMBLEY upper- 3
bedroom, den, 2 1/2
baths, dining room, liv-
ing room, updated
kitchen, 2 car garage,
$1,150.(313)824-3228

TROMBLEY, 79T
1,400 sq. ft. 2 or 3 bed-
room, 2 bath upper.
Air, all appliances. Fire-
place, separate base-
ment, garage. $1,050,
plus security. (313)331-
6882

UPPER, lower fiat
Grosse Pointe Farms,
$850/ month. Tenant
pays all utilities. 313-
881-6687

V E R Y nice duplex! 2
bedroom, 1 bath, ga-
rage. Fresh paint & ap-
pliances. $780 rent.
Call 313-623-6633.

WINDMILL Pointe, 3
bedroom upper and 2
bedroom lower, hard-
wood, newer kitchens,
appliances, privacy &
yard. $1,800/ $2,000.
(313)821-5282

State and federal housing
laws prohibit discrimination
that is based on race, color,

religion, national origin,
sex, disability, age
(Michigan Law),

marital (Michigan Law)
or familial status.

For further information,
call the-Michigan

Department of Civil Rights
at 800-482-3604; the U.S.

Department of Housing and
- the Urban Development

800-669-9777
or your local

Fair Housing Agency.

701 APTS/FLATS/DUPtEX
DETROIT/WAYNE COUNTY

2 bedroom lower in
East English village.
$800, includes heat,
gas, water, 12th month
free. 313-445-0503.
Credit check.

22174 Moross- 2 bed-
room, bath, basement.
Across from St. John
Hospital. $625, deposit.
586-909-5517.

3482 Haverhill, off
Mack, upper flat, 3
bedroom, basement,
garage. (313)418-2593

5035 Chalmers at East
Warren, upper studio
$450/ month, base-
ment studio $380/
month. All utilities in-
cluded. {313)655-9728

CADIEUX Mack, 1
bedroom, heat, water,
iaundry. $525; 8 Mile/
Kelly. $575. (313)882-
4132

E A S T English village.
Upper flat, 2 bedroom.
$500 plus security,
5041 Bishop. (313)510-
4470

NEWLY restored two
bedroom upper flat in
East English village. All
new carpeting, plumb-
ing, electrical, heating.
Kitchen, porch, two car
garage, $700/ month.
(313)881-9686

702 APTS/FUTS/DUPLEX
S.C.S/MACONIB COUNTY

ONE and two bedroom
apartments- St. Clair
Shores/ Eastpointe.
well maintained, air
conditioning, coin iaun-
dry and storage. $595-
$695. The Blake Com-
pany, 313-881-6882.
No pets/ no smoking.

ST. clair Shores, 10
Mile/ Jefferson oh Nau-
ticale Mile. 1 bedroom,
$550 includes heat &
water, laundry. 586-
778-4422

ST. Clair Shores, : du-
plex 2 bedrooms, large
living room, kitchen,
full basement, fenced
yard. $795. Immediate
occupancy. (586)263-

.5875,(313)886-4281.

705 HOUSES FOR RENT

POINTES/HARPER WOODS

$1,200, Madison: spa-
cious 3 bedroom, 2
baths, near schools,
shopping, . fireplace.
(313)881-9687

$900. Woods. Cozy 2
bedroom bungalow,
fenced yard, new fur-
nace, air. 313-881-9687

1447 Maryland, spa-
cious, 2 bedroom up-
per, freshly . painted,
newly remodeled kitch-
en and bath, new car-
peting throughout,
shared basement
$650. Shown by ap-
pointment, Jim Saros
Agency, 313-927-0418

207 Lakeview, Grosse
Pointe Farms, new
construction, 4 bed-
room, 3 1̂ 2 bath. First
floor master. First floor
laundry, gourmet kitch-
en. Month to month.
$2,700. Option to own.
Call (313)884-8882

2169 ' Ridgemont,
Grosse Pointe Woods,
includes washer, dryer,
kitchen appliances. 2
bedrooms, 1 bath.
$900. (313)885-4657

2179 Allard, Grosse
^ _, Pointe Woods. Spa-

ROSEVILLE- one bed- c i o u s r a n c h i $ 1 j 2no/
room apartment, first m o n t n > possible rent to
floor. All. appliances. o w n , C a l | A g e n t P a t

No pets. 248-543-3940 M a s t r o , 313-618-9014
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705 HOUSES FOR RENT I 705 HOUSES FOR RENT | 705 HOUSES FOR RENT | 706 HOUSES FOR RENT
POINTES/HARPER WOODSiPOINTES/HARPER WOODSIPOINTES/HARPER WOODSi DETROIT/WAYNE COUNTY

28922 Kenipsha, 3 bed-
room, clean,. clean!
$1,100/ month with
option to ijbuy. Com-
plete. (586)4J15-5001

3 bedroom/ 2 bath
Grosse Poirfte Woods.
Fireplace, '\ hardwood
floors, basement, ga-
rage. $1,104 (313)820-
8260 V

414 Neff- 4 bedroom, 2
1/2 baths, air>}2 car ga-
rage. $1,400.'fcrane Re-
alty (313)884-^51

730 Trombleyj Deluxe
2- 3 bedroom.-^lose to
Windmill Poin'l£ and
Patterson Parti New
kitchen, carpet^ hard-
wood in formal-\dining
room. New cental air
and furnace. ,\Same
floor laundry. \ Fire-
place. (313)882-48^,5

CHARMING farm
house, 856 St. dlair,
Grosse Pointe Cityl 2
bedrooms, 1 bath, on-
street parking. $950/
month (313)407 7112

COZY 1% bedroom cot-
tage on Maryland,
newly decorated.,
$750/ month. (586)954-:
9334 f

FURNISHED 2 bedj
room, 1 block from Vi
lage. Air, utilities & c
ble included. Month fo
month. $1,8Q0.
(313)478-4430 I

GROSSE Pointe Farfns
3 bedrooms, 1 ,1/2
bath, $1,175 plus fee-
curity. Credit checkJNo
pets. Southeastern
Management, ?
(313)640-1788 \

j
5

GROSSE Pointe Ffark,
Tudor. 5 bedrooni 5
bath. Remodeled,
$3,500/ month, option
to buy. 313-550-6238

GROSSE Fpinte
Woods, 3 bedroom, 1,
1/2 bath colonial, p car
garage, hardwood
floors, new paint, all
appliances, all uppates,
air, finished basement
$1,600/ • rfionth.
(313)468-6197 I

WlAPLETON, Grosse
v Pointe Farms. 3 bed-
brooms, 2 car garage,
newly painted, applian-
ces, air, water. Sharp!
$1,350.(313)885-5679

SUNNINGDALE in the
Woods- 3,800 sq. ft.
English Tudor. Fully fur-
nished. Short or long
term lease. (313)882-
0154. visit www.677
sunningdale.com

706 HOUSES FOR RENT
DETROIT/WAYNI COUNTY

3 or 1 bedroom. 1 1/2
baths. Hardwood,
brick, garage, applian-
ces. $480- $780.
(313)882-4132

NEAR Cadieux Cafe. 2
bedroom house, 1 1/2
baths. Basement, all
appliances, $700/
month plus utilities.
(313)410-2100

SECTION 8 homes.
Rent: $800- $950. 3/ 4
bedroom. Available im-
mediately. (248)988-
8977

ST. John area, cozy 2
bedroom bungalow,
$650/ month. (734)678-
6283

707 HOUSES FOR RENT/
S.CS/MACONIB COUNTY

HARRISON Twp. 3
bedroom, 3 bath wa-
terfront house, newly
remodeled, 1st floor
laundry, central air, ac-
cess to Metro Park.
$1,475.(586)917-9170

ST Clair Shores- Harp-
er/ 13. 1,500 sq. ft.
Beautiful ranch, 2 car
attached. 1 1/2 baths.
Finished basement.
Air, fireplace. New ap-
pliances.- No pets.
$1,250,586-294-2646

709 TOWNHOUSES/
CONDOS FOR RENT

1 bedroom condo,
Grosse Pointe; clean,
convenient location;
$600/ month. 2 bed-
room condo, Harper
Woods; all new carpet;
$700. month. Call Myr-
na Smith, Bolton John-
ston, 313-884-6400.

709 TOWNHOUSES/ 1716 OFFICE/COMMERC1AL|716 OFFICE/COMMERCIAL
CONDOS FOR RENT I FOR RENT I FOR RENT

START the new year
by moving into a Bab-
cock co-op. Priced to
seii '& some with
terms. Located in Royal
Oak, Eastpointe, East.
Detroit. Call Babcock
Management,
(586)498-9188

ST. Clair Shores execu-
tive colonial duplex. 2
bedrooms. Basement,
garage. $895. No pets.
(586)725-5923

ST. Clair Shores, 3 bed-
room ranch, basement,
garage, $895/ month.
References. (313)885-
0197

2 bedroom condo,
Grosse Pointe City.
Utilities included.
Freshly painted, clean.
$850/ month. (313)595-
6073

GROSSE Pointe Villa
condo for rent. Quiet 1
bedroom upper unit.
Great location for hos-
pital resident, senior,
snow birds, etc... Non-
smoker please. Rent is
$675 per month, plus
security . deposit. Call
(313)885-3997, after
5pm. for appointment. -

LAKESHORE Village, 2
bedroom townhouse,
$750/ month plus se-
curity & utilities. Credit
report. Sale, $89,000.
(313)881-9140

711 GARAGES/MINI
STORAGE FOR RENT

SAFE storage, Grosse
Pointe Park. $100/
month. (586)722-3277

714 LIVING QUARTERS
TO SHARE

9 Mile/ Mack, 2 bed-
room . condo to share.
Maie, $450/ month in-
cludes iutilities, plus
deposit. (810)334-2735

SPACIOUS waterfront
home at 16 & Jefferson
includes all utilities, ca-
ble. Nonsmoker. $495/
month. (586)917-9170

716 OFFICE/COMMERCIAL
FOR RENT

20390 Harper, small
upper office (8'x 9')
$135/ month, lease.
313-884-7575

21500 Harper (be-
tween 8 & 9 Mile) St.
Clair Shores. Several
individual windowed
offices. Ideal for ac-
countants, manufac-
tures reps, attorneys,
or semi-retired per-
sons. Use of confer-
ence room, air condi-
tioning, large parking
lot. Call 586-773-7400,
or inquire at building.

Grosse Pointe
Woods

Office space for lease
individual offices.

Starting at $400/ mo.,
includes all utilities

313-268-2000

GROSSE Pointe
Woods, beautiful 6,000
sq. ft. retail building for
lease. Premier location
on Mack Avenue, also
excellent for office/
medical. Lahood Real-
ty, (313)885-5950

HARPER WOODS
REDUCED

Suites (1,600 sq.ft.)
One furnished

individual offices
Rent/Lease to Own

Roger, 313-886-1763

INDUSTRIAL- I-94 @ 9
Mile. 5,000 sq. ft. (in-
cludes I K office). Well
maintained. Email
AdvanAce@aol.com

SMALL executive offi-
ces in Harper Woods
available for immediate
occupancy. (313)371-
6600

721 VACATION RENTALS
FLORIDA

MARCO Island Florida,
beachfront condos
from $1,200/ week.
Homes with pools from
$1,700/ week. Harbor-
view Rentals, (800)377-
9299, karen@rent
marco.com

WEST Palm Beach, FL
studio/ 1 bedroom
beachfront villa with
kitchenette. Pools, res-
taurant and grocery on
site. Marriott Ocean
Pointe resortx March
27- April 3. $.1,200/
best. (313)882-5022 \

723 VACATION RENTALS

MICHIGAN

HARBOR Springs, cozy
ski condo. Near slopes.
Sleeps 8. Many extras.
(313)823-1251

ERVIGES Some classifications are not required by-
law to be licensed. Please check with
the proper state agency to verify license.

907 BASEMENT
WATERPROOFING

A Solution to Your
Water Problem

James Kleiner
Basement

Waterproofing.
inside or Outside

Walls Straightened
and Braced.

Licensed & insured.
Serving the East Side

for 30 Years.
* 313-885-2097
586-466-1000
"A Business Built

on Trust"

STREMERSCH
BASEMENT

WATERPROOFING
WALLS REPAIRED
STRAIGHTENED

REPLACED

ALL WORK
GUARANTEED

LICENSED
313-884-7139

SERVING COMMUNITY
39 YEARS

912 BUILDING/REMODELING! 929 DRYWALL/PLASTERING

BASTIAN Works, Re-
modeling, finish car-
pentry, crown 1 mould-
ings, kitchens base-
ments, repairs.. Li-
censed/ insuijed. 15
years experience. Gary,
{313)268-7024 :;

DAVID Carlinj Remod-
eling. 35 years experi-
ence. Remodeling and
jdesign, all phases. Li-
bensed. {313)938-4949,
(586)463-2639.

FINE home building &
renovation. Economical
alternatives provided.
Highly experienced. Li-
censed. Insured. 313-
824-4663

YORKSHIRE Building
& Renovation. Kitch-
ens, baths, additions.
All types carpentry/ re-
modeling. (313)881-
3386

914 CARPENTRY

SUPERIOR Plastering
& Painting. Plaster &
drywall repairs. Paint-
ing, texture applica-
tions, insurance re-
pairs, insured, 25 years
experience. Call Tom
Mccabe, (313)885-
6991

THE Original Wall Doc-
tor is celebrating 30
years of pleasing pa-
tients. Painting, cus-
tom closets, remodel-
ing, plastering. Ready
now to do surgery on
your home project!
Perfection is my goal.
For a free exam call
(313)530-3192

930 ELECTRICAL SERVICES

THOMAS
KLEINER

Construction Co.
BASEMENT

WATERPROOFING
•Walls Straightened &
Braced or Replaced
•1 ' beams installed

•Underpinning
•All Concrete &

• Masonry
•25 Years Experience
•10 Year Guarantee
•Drainage Systems
Licensed & Insured
"Most trusted &
referred in the

Pointes"
(313)886-3150

Member BBB
WALLS moving? We
install I Beams, to pre-
vent wall movement.
James Kleiner water-
proofing, 313-885-
2097,586-466-1000

HACKSTOCK CONST.
Licensed & Insured
finish carpenter.

7 man crew, 27 years
experience in
Grosse Pointe.

References available.
Trim bookcases
& remodeling.

Tom, (810)305-1733

(586)415-0153. Uni-
versal Electric. Older
home specialists. Cir-
cuit breaker boxes,
outdoor plugs, re-
cessed lights, addi-
tions, all types of elec-
trical work. Licensed,
insured, www.nomore
fuses.com

ELECTRICAL WOrk-
rough, finish. Custom-
ized to suit your needs.

•References. Paul, 810-
765-5678, 810-580-
9267

Old House Specialist
Expert Carpentry at

Reasonable Rates

Kitchens •
Windows

Baths,
Doors

Grosse Pointe Since 1989

CfiPIZZO
CONSTWaiON

'BASEMENT
WATERPROOFING

•WALLS STRAIGHTENED
AND REPLACED

•10 YEAR GUARANTEE

Family Business ̂
LICENSED^'
INSURED

TONY & TODI

885-0612

911 BRICK/BLOCK WORK

MADISON Mainte-
nance. Grosse Pointe
resident. Tucjcpoihting,
all masonry., Jason,
{313)885-8525;
(313)402-7166^ cell.

BACK
"Grosse Pointe's 5

ijiestoration Specialists" 3
The Art of Making »

tepair Work Pisappeatfl
Specializing In: j

•Joint Restoration | j
fChimneys •PorchesJf

•Lime'Stone ™
iWater Sand Blasting^
licensed * Estimates^

Richfird L. Price B. D.

Free Estimates
Licensed • Insured

916 CARPET INSTALLATION

GARY'S Carpet Serv-
ice, installation, re-
stretching. Repairs.
Carpet & pad available.
586-228-8934

920 CHIMNEY REPAIR

JAMES Kleiner. Chim-
neys repaired, rebuilt.
{313)885-2097,
{586)466-1000

929 DRYWALL/PLASTERING

(313)999-1003
LAKESHORE

PLASTER, INC.
• Decorative Plaster

Repair
• Plaster Mould

Duplication
• All Plaster Repairs
• Interior Painting
• Faux Finishes

• Texture Duplication
• Drywali

AAA plaster/ dry wall.
Water damage. 25
years experience. Li-
censed, insured. Joe of
Hallmark Remodeling.
(313)510-0950

CHIP Gibson Plaster,
Stucco, Drywall, Cor-
nice Repair, Custom
Painting Interior - Exte-
rior (313)884-5764

S & J ELECTRIC
Residential
Specialist

No job TOO small
313-885-2930

936 FLOOR SANDING/
REFINISHING

FLOOR sanding and
finishing. Free esti-
mates. Terry Yerke,
586-823-7753

G & G FLOOR CO.

Wood floors only
313-885-0257

Floors of distinction
since 1964.

Bob Grabowski
Founder / President
Licensed, Insured
Free Estimates
we supply, install,

sand, stain and finish
wood

floors, new & old.
Specializing in
Glitsa finish.

(586)778-2050
Visa, Discover &

Master Card accepted

MANCUSO hardwood
floor sanding- refinish-
ing. Grosse Pointe resi-
dent. Shop location,
19335 Van Dyke. Joe,
1-800-606-1515

N A T U R A L Hardwood
Floors- complete fioor-
ing service. Dust free!
15 years. Tony,
(313)330-5907

PRIMA Floors, LLC
Hardwood specialists.
New installation. Refin-
ishing. Guaranteed!
Ray Parrfnello
(586)344-7272 WWW.
primahardwoodfloors
.com

943 LANDSCAPERS/
TREE SERVICE/GARDENER

DAVE'S Tree & Shrub.
Tree removal/ trim-
ming. Topping. 18
years experience. 586-
216-0904

945 HANDYMAN

A low price- Mike han-
dyman, electrical,
plumbing, carpentry,
flooring, painting. Ce-
ramic tile. Anything big
or small. Also, remod-
eling. (313)438-3197,
native Grosse Pointer,
586-773-1734, . 810-
908-4888 cell.

ABLE, dependable,
honest. • Carpentry,
painting, plumbing,

•electrical, if you have a
problem, need repairs,
any installing, call Ron,
(586)573-6204

ALL repairs & installa-
tions. Electrical, paint-
ing, drywall, carpentry.
Tiie. Kitchens, baths,
basements. Professio-
nal, affordable. Li-
censed & insured. Call
Kris (586)925-1949

FREE estimates. Con-
tractor quality at han-
dyman rates. Licensed,
experienced & insured.
313-824-4663

OLDER home special-
ist. Carpentry, plumb-
ing, electrical, plaster,
painting, gutters, sid-
ing, kitchens, baths,
windows. (313)331-
0323

RELIABLE Services.
Any type of repair,
maintenance, improve-
ment. Home or busi-
ness. 37 years in
Grosse Pointe. Local
references. (313)885-
4130

946 HAULING & MOVING

APPLIANCE
REMOVAL

Garage, yard,
basement, clean outs.
Construction debris.
Tree/shrub removal

Free estimates.
MR.B'S 586-7590457

VISA/MC

MOVING &
STORAGE

Local &
Long Distance

Agent for
Global Van Lines

822-4400
• Large and Small Jobs

• Pianos {our specialty)

• Appliances

• Saturday, Sunday

Service

• Senior Discounts

Owned & Operated
ByJohnSteininger
11850 E. Jefferson

MPSC-L19675
Licensed - Insured

FREE ESTIMATES

948 INSULATION

I

FIREFIGHTERS/ paint-
ers, interior/ exterior.
Residential. Power
washing, wali washing,
wallpaper removal.
Free estimates.
(586)381-3105

PAINTER- exterior/ in-
terior. Very low rates.
Grosse Pointe resident.
{313)882-3286

QUALITY job, reasona-
ble price. Horizon
Painting. Painting/ dec-
orating. Wall repair.
Wood stain, wall paper
removal. Over 30 years
experience. Residen-
tial, commercial. Call
Dennis, 586-506-2233.
586-294-3828

WALLPAPER installa-
tion & removal, 35
years experience.
(586)574-1365

946 HAULING & MOVING 1 9 5 4 PAINTING/DECORATING 1 9 5 4 PAINTING/DECORATING

ERIC'S PAINTING
Interior / Exterior

Piaster/Drywall Repairs
window Glazing

Power Wash
Licensed - insured

G.P. References
(313)884-9443

Senior Discount
Free Estimates

960 ROOFING SERVICE

flick Karoutsos
pflinnne
C O M P A N Y
. 'InteriorsExterior

• Restoration
• Custom Painting

3$$%%. CUSTOM
^ ' ^ CARPENTRY

SUPERIOR PREPARATION
& CRAFTSMANSHIP

FREE ESTIMATES
LICENSED & INSURED

n\\imin\,\Kn
ROOFING

1 K(siilt?nti.i[sm.i1)listR[-ROUTS* ILVROTIS

^Insured
TKI.LI.SIIMA1LS
(5K6)»775*44i4

Home insulation
Specialists

Sparks & Sommers
walls. Attics

51 Years Experience
(586)779-9525

GrossE 'Pointe
Grosse ftnnte News CONNECTION

(313)882-6900 ext. 3

A-i painting, custom
Painting & decorating.
Enhance your rooms
with a beautiful faux
finish! Wallpaper re-
moval, plaster repair.
Hand- painted furniture
& walls (as featured in
Homestyle Magazine).
(313)882-4714 .

BRIAN'S PAINTING
Professional painting,

interior/ exterior.
Specializing all types

painting, cauiking,
window glazing,
plaster repair.
Expert gold/
silver leaf.

All work guaranteed.
Fully Insured!

Free Estimates and
Reasonable Rates, call:

586-778-2749
or 586-822-2078

PAIGE PAINTING
LLC

interior/ Exterior
Wallpapering and
removal. Insured.

No Job Too Small
586-350-5236

CHIP GIBSON
PAINTING

PLASTER REPAIR
RESTORATION &

INTERIOR PAINTING
SUPERIOR PREPARATION

AND CRAFTSMANSHIP
FREE ESTIMATES

LICENSED & INSURED
Grosse Pointe Since 1981

Don't Forget-
Cal! your ads in Early!
Classified Advertising

313-882-6900 ext 3

957 PLUMBING &

INSTALLATION

DIRECT
PLUMBING

&
DRAIN

886-8557
*Free Estimates

,*Full Product Warranty

*Senior Discount

*References

*AI ! work Guaranteed

MICHAEL HAGGERTY
Lie. Master Plumber

L.S. walker company.
Plumbing, repairs,
drains, sewer cleaning.
Reasonable! 19 years.
(586)784-7100,
(586)713-5316/cell.

PLUMBING work-
rough, finish. Custom-
ized to suit your needs.
References. Paul, 810-
765-5678, 810-580-
9267

960 ROOFING SERVICE

Flat Roof
Specialist

Over 30 Years Exp.
Free Estimates

Licensed - Guarantees

(313)372-7784
YORKSHIRE Building.
Cedar tear off. Flat
roofs. Licensed, insur-
ed. (313)881-3386

ROOFING
SIDING* CUTTERS

29522 LITTLE MACK,
ROSEVILLE

CERTIFIED ^
PROFESSIONAL

ROOFERS

1-800-459-6455
www.JJROOFING.COM

Licensed & Insured
FREE ,—.

ESTIMATES

973 TILE WORK

AAA complete baths,
kitchens, tile design. 25
years experience. Li-
censed, insured. Joe of
Hallmark Remodeling.
(313)510-0950

A L L work guaranteed,
kitchen, bath, fireplace,
floors. Tile, marble,
granite. References.
Free estimates. Jim,
(586)598-1470

981 WINDOW WASHING

FAMOUS Mainte-
nance. Licensed & in-
sured since 1943. Gut-
ter cleaning/ power
washing. 313-884-
4300.

UNIVERSAL Mainte-
nahce- window & gut-
ter cleaning. Fully in-
sured. Free estimates.
(313)839-3500

954 PAINTING/DECORATING! 954 PAINTING/DECORATING

P A I N T I N G : Exterior: wood Brick siding
interior: Custom painting & Faux Finish

PLASTER REPAIRS: wans, ceiling, cornice
Moldings, Repaired or Reproduced

CARPENTRY: Rough a Finished. Architectural Molding'
custom Mlllwork, Reproductions

.REFERENCES C A L L 5 o 6 - 7 4 6 - 1 1 0 1 INSURED
FOR FREE ESTIMATE & DESIGN

AWARD WINNING QUALITY WORK
41 YEARS EXPERIENCE • ESTABLISHED 1966

2008

RULES: Reshuffle six letters to form a new word. If a word is given, find
an anagram of that word. Place letters in boxes next to shuffled letters.
After all six words are solved, find new 6-letter words shuffled in the six
columns or two diagonals.
HINT: There might be more than one answer hidden in the six columns
or two diagonals. Can you find SEVEN words? Happy Hunting!

BAUHSM

LEGOAR

ERRSSI

TGEURT

STUYRT

REIARI
Last Weeks

Puzzle Solved
Col. 1: COBALT

Col. 2: ARRIVE /VARIER
Col. 4: INTENT
Col. 6: SHEETS

Top Left Diag.: RETAIL
Top Right Diag.: ENCORE

D

N

I

1
J j



8 C GROSSE POINTE NEWS, JANUARY 31, 2008

NBS WILL BEAT ANY COMPETITORS PRICE ON

r?
r~j

Pioneer • Pioneer Elite • Sony • Panasonic
Toshiba • Yamaha • Mirage • Energy • NHT

Niles < Bello • Salamander
*Based on stocking model, New in box from an Authorized Dealer in Michigan *See Store For Details.

NBS TV
HOME THEATER

SALE HOURS:
Mon & Thurs 10am - 8pm

Tues, Wed, Fri, Sat 10am - 6pm
2 1 8 1 5 G R E A T E R M A C K A V E N U E

SAINT CLAIR SHORES, Ml 4BDBD

(5B6) 772-9333


