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JoAnn 
Matouk 
Romain 
Mystery
Nearly 11 years ago, 
Grosse Pointe Woods 
homemaker JoAnn 
Matouk Romain went 
missing. The car she 
drove was found at St. 
Paul Catholic Church, 
where she had attended 
Mass. Based on what her 
family believes is scant 
evidence, Grosse Pointe 
Farms police immediately 
came to the conclusion 
the short, 55-year-old 
walked across Lakeshore 
Road in freezing tempera-
tures and committed sui-
cide by drowning in the 
frigid water of Lake St. 
Clair. Her family has nev-
er accepted the suicide 
theory. On Oct. 19, 
Netfl ix’s “Unsolved 
Mysteries” will look at the 
JoAnn Matouk Romain 
case. See the fi rst of our 
three-part series on page 
8A.

THE GROSSE POINTES 
— In spite of a strong rec-
ommendation from an
attorney to vote down a 
resolution to censure his 
client, the Grosse Pointe 
Public School System 
Board of Education voted 
6-1 in favor of censuring 
Trustee Cindy Pangborn. 
Pangborn cast the dissent-
ing vote.

The meeting was held 
in-person at Brownell 
Middle School’s multipur-
pose room Oct. 12 — the 
first in-person meeting 
since March. While atten-
dance was restricted to 
160 total participants to 
allow social distancing, 
the meeting was sparsely 
attended.

The resolution, pre-
sented for review and dis-
cussion at the Sept. 28 
meeting, was revised to 
refl ect Pangborn did not 
place, but “cooperated 
with a 501(c)4 in placing 
an ad maligning our high 
school administrators, our 
schools and intentionally 
included misleading infor-
mation.”

Farmington Hills attor-
ney Michael Schwartz 
addressed the board on 
his client’s behalf during 
public comments before 
the vote. Schwartz repre-
sented Monica Palmer, the 
petitioner during the Sept. 
16 hearing to approve lan-
guage for a petition to 
recall board President 
Margaret Weertz and 
Trustee Chris Lee. Palmer, 
a Grosse Pointe Woods 
resident, also is listed as 

Board 
votes to 
censure 
Pangborn
By Mary Anne Brush
Staff Writer

GROSSE POINTE 
FARMS — A new way of 
going about meetings 
brings a new risk of is-
sues, which the Grosse 
Pointe Farms City 
Council experienced at 
the beginning of its 
monthly  meet ing 
Monday, Oct. 12.

This was the city’s 
seventh council meeting 
via Zoom since April, 
held virtually due to the 
COVID-19 pandemic, 
but the fi rst time a meet-
ing has been “Zoom 
bombed,” a term that 
refers to an unwelcome, 
disruptive intrusion by 
internet trolls.

Just minutes after the 

Council 
meeting 
Zoom 
bombed
By Laurel Kraus
Staff Writer

CITY OF GROSSE 
POINTE — For the last 
two weeks, the City’s 
public works department 
has been moving vehicles 
and materials from its 
temporary locations to its 
new 25,000-square-foot 
facility, which is now op-
erational and complete, 
aside from some land-
scaping work and install-

ing new fencing.  
The prior home base 

for the City’s DPW was a 
5,000-square-foot build-
ing built in 1964. With 
only 11,000 square feet 
of usable space including 
the yard, it was far too 
small to store the depart-
ment’s materials and 
vehicles, City Manager 
Pete Dame said, leading 
to outdoor storage with 
d a m a g i n g  e f f e c t s . 
Leaving road salt in the 

elements led to it becom-
ing crusty and hard, 
while the back half of 
vehicles not covered by 
carport canopies rusted 
quicker.

Due to lack of room, 
many materials and vehi-
cles had to be stored in 
locations such as the 
parking lot behind CVS, 
the pump station, under 
the cell tower and even 

New DPW building operational
By Laurel Kraus
Staff Writer

GROSSE POINTE PARK 
— One of Michigan’s fi rst 
social districts and the 
lone district in the Pointes 
has shown early signs of 
success.

Since launching in the 
Park in September, the 
city is enjoying positive 
feedback from restau-
rants and bars that took 
advantage of a Michigan 
bill designed to boost 
patronage at alcohol 
establishments economi-

cally impacted by health 
and safety restrictions.

“Everybody that I have 
talked to about it at the 
restaurants is excited 
that we’re the fi rst in the 
Grosse Pointes,” City 
Manager Nick Sizeland 
said.

The Park also is just 
the second social district 
opened in Wayne County, 
following Belleville, he 
said. The Bricks Pizzeria, 
O’Flaherty’s and Red 
Crown are the fi rst three 
establishments that took 
advantage of the bill 

passed by Gov. Gretchen 
Whitmer, letting them 
sell alcohol that can be 
consumed outside their 
premises. Businesses eli-
gible to join the Park’s 
social district must oper-
ate at Kercheval from the 
city of Detroit’s bound-
ary between Alter and 
Wayburn to Nottingham, 
on the north and south 
sides of Kercheval, con-
tinuing to Charlevoix; 
from the city of Detroit 
between Alter and 

Social district sees successful start
By Eddie B. Allen Jr.
Staff Writer

GROSSE POINTE 
SHORES — Mark 
Heppner watched with 
optimistic anticipation for 
the bidding to begin.

The president and CEO 
of the Edsel & Eleanor 
Ford House, like others 
tuned in to the Oct. 6 
Chr is t ie ’s  auct ion, 

watched from home as 
the event streamed live 
from Rockefeller Center 
in New York. Up for sale 
to the highest bidder — 
and what was meant to 
be the darling of the 
night, Heppner said — 
was an original Cezanne 
watercolor painting, 
“Nature morte avec pot 

Sold!
By Jody McVeigh
Editor

COURTESY PHOTO

“Nature morte avec pot au lait, melon et sucrier” 
sold for $28,650,000.

Painting proceeds to support 
Ford House endowment fund

See DPW, page 2A

See SOLD, page 3A

See BOMBED, page 5A

See SOCIAL, page 2A

See CENSURE, page 4A
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in Neff Park, while vehi-
cles able to be stored in 
the DPW yard had to go 
through multiple maneu-
vers one at a time to 
leave the site. It took at 
least 15 minutes just to 
get employees onto the 
roads, Dame said.

“The whole idea 
behind the public works 
facility was to have a 
building that could func-
tion properly to hold 
everything related to 
public works,” he added.

The new facility not 
only is equipped to hold 
the vehicles in an 
enclosed space, enabling 
them to last longer by 
not being exposed to the 
elements, but also will 
allow the City to pur-
chase and store materi-
als such as water pipes 
and dirt in bulk, saving 
time and money.

“The other main differ-

ence with being inside is 
if we’re called for a water 
main break in the middle 
of the night or we call out 
the crews to salt the 
streets, you won’t hear 
the beeping of the trucks 
in reverse as they’re 
being backed out of the 
facility or as the front-
end motor is loading the 
salt from where it’s 
stored into the trucks,” 
Dame explained. “The 
noise will be contained in 
the middle of the night so 
that the neighbors will 
have less impact from 
living near a public 
works facility.”

The facility also will 
bring a better work envi-
ronment  for  DPW 
employees.

The old building 
housed only a small 
maintenance bay, a cou-
ple offices and small 
lunch room.

“They did not have a 
locker room or showers,” 
Dame said, “so if they 
were working in the 

sewer pits, fi xing up bro-
ken sewer lines all day, 
they had no way to wash 
up after a day’s work.”

The new facility holds 
offices for the supervi-
sors, separate locker 
rooms and bathrooms, 
and a break room that 
doubles as a training 
room. 

“It essentially allows 
the department to func-
tion like a public works 
department should,” 
Dame explained.

As part of a similarly 
large-scale project, the 
City’s public safety 
department moved into 
its new facility on Mack 

Avenue in late August.
“These projects all 

started six years ago, 
spanning the course of 
three mayors,” Dame 
said. “You can imagine 
the feeling is one of great 
relief that the day is 
fi nally here to be in these 
two major new facilities 
and using them and 
operating in a way that 
these two departments 
deserve to be operating.

“There’s a great deal of 
pride that the employees 
in public safety and pub-
lic works have for their 
jobs and they do do an 
excellent job,” he contin-
ued, “but now they have 

the tools and facilities to 
be able to do them more 
effi ciently.”

The public works 
department may hold an 

open house next year 
during National Public 
Works Week, so resi-
dents may see the facil-
ity.

DPW:
Continued from page 1A

Plows are lined up in their new spaces.

All of the city’s DPW vehicles fi t into the new en-
closed space.

PHOTOS BY RENEE LANDUYT

A view of the building from the mezzanine over the offi ces. There is a space for every city truck to park.

Shelving will be installed on this mezzanine, situat-
ed over the new offi ces.

An outside view of the new DPW building.

Wayburn on the north 
side of Charlevoix to the 
west side of Nottingham 
is the remaining area.

Three more establish-
ments are working to 
secure permits through 
the state in order to par-
ticipate, so the Park 
could have six busi-
nesses in the social dis-
trict by the end of 2020, 
S i z e l a n d  s a i d . 
O’Flaherty’s purchased 
heat lamps to further 
expand its service as the 
weather chills, he added.

“We’re hoping to 
extend it as long as we 
possibly can, but obvi-
ously it’s a spring and 
summer opportunity 
more than other times of 
the year,” Sizeland said.

Park public safety has 
reported no criminal 
incidents related to 
activity in the social dis-
trict, he added. City 
council noted in July 
that the initiative could 
be immediately canceled 
if business operators 
and patrons didn’t 
behave responsibly 
when they unanimously 
voted to begin the effort.

Further celebrating 
the district’s early suc-
cess, a winner of the 
logo design competition 
will be announced by 
the end of October, 
Sizeland added. Three 

fi nalists have been cho-
sen in the contest to cre-
ate imagery that will be 
displayed in signage 
identifying the area and 
reproduced on cups and 
possibly souvenir items. 

“We had very talented 
contestants and it was 
exciting to see their 
work,” Sizeland said.

An announcement of 
the winner had origi-
nally been scheduled by 
the end of September, 

but the finalists were 
asked to complete addi-
tional tasks.

Sizeland said the win-
ning design will be key to 
further engaging the city 
and encouraging resi-
dents to visit the district.

“I wanted it to convey 
something that would 
make them proud and 
make them want to share 
with their family and the 
rest of the community,” 
he said.

SOCIAL:
Continued from page 1A

PHOTO BY RENEE LANDUYT

This social district notice is placed next to Red 
Crown, one of three businesses currently participat-
ing in the district.

GROSSE POINTE 
WOODS — It was a 
symbol of autumn be-
fore it became a popular 
Halloween costume, but 
the scarecrow’s history 
dates to centuries ago.

The Egyptians were 
said to have used the 
earliest form of scare-
crow to protect wheat 
fields and the Japanese 
used similar manne-
quins  to  preserve
rice crops. The Woods 
Parks and Recreation 
Department has some-
thing else in mind for 
the legend of the scare-
crow since recently 
announcing a commu-
nity design competi-
tion: lots of fun.

T h r o u g h  e a r l y 
November, Woods resi-
dents and businesses 
are asked to design 
their most eye-catching 
creations and display 
them outside their 
homes and buildings.

“It is our first city-
wide scarecrow contest 
and our hope is that we 
can make it an annual 

thing where families 
and businesses keep 
part icipating,”  said 
Nicole Gerhart, recre-
ation supervisor.

Born in response to a 
lack of recent commu-
nity events, including 
several popular outings 
the city administration 
canceled amid public 
health concerns, the 
competi t ion invites 
wide participation. 

“With COVID, many 
families are looking for 
something to  do,” 
Gerhart said.

Par t i c ipants  may 
enter their scarecrows 
in the categories of 
scariest, happiest or 
most creative and are 
asked to photograph 
their entries and email 
the images to lfpassistant
@gpwmi.us by Sunday, 
Nov. 8. Entries should 
include the family or 
business name respon-
sible for the submis-
sion, the address where 
it’s displayed and the 
name of the scarecrow, 
if applicable. Local 
businesses are being 
solicited to donate 
prizes for the winning 

entries, Gerhart said.
Although “scariest” is 

one of the categories, 
entries should be fam-
ily-friendly. 

While  i t ’s  not  a 
Halloween activity, the 
s c a r e c r o w  c o n t e s t 
incorporates the holi-
day ’s  costume and 
visual aspects, and is 
geared toward getting 
Woods residents out 
into neighborhoods to 
view the displays. The 
ease of access to old 
clothing and other 
items often used for 
scarecrows should help 
encourage participa-
tion, Gerhart said.

“We were trying to 
find something that 
would  be  fami ly-
f r iendly  and that 
wouldn’t involve much 
c o s t , ”  s h e  s a i d . 
“Scarecrows consist of 
hay and old clothes, 
things people usually 
h a v e  a r o u n d  t h e 
house.”

Additional informa-
tion is available by
contacting the Woods 
Parks and Recreation 
Department at (313) 
822-2812.

Woods hosts first 
scarecrow contest
By Eddie B. Allen Jr.
Staff Writer
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SATURDAY, OCT. 17

 ◆ Grosse Pointe Park Round Robin Pickleball Bash at 
Patterson Park. Registration begins 9:30 a.m., tourna-
ment play follows 10 a.m. to 2 p.m. Cost is $20. Call 
(313) 822-2812, Ext. 200.

 ◆ Grosse Pointe Woods residents-only hazardous 
waste drop-off, 9 a.m. to 1 p.m. at the public works 
yard, 1200 Parkway Drive, at Marter.

MONDAY, OCT. 19

 ◆ Grosse Pointe Woods City Council meeting, 7 p.m. 
via Zoom.

 ◆ City of Grosse Pointe City Council meeting, 7 p.m. 
via Zoom.

TUESDAY, OCT. 20

 ◆ Grosse Pointe Shores City Council meeting, 7 p.m. 
via Zoom.

WEDNESDAY, OCT. 21

 ◆ Mini Halloween Boofest at Osius Park, 6 to 7 p.m.

SATURDAY, OCT. 24

 ◆ Halloween in the Park, 1 to 4 p.m. Sign up for a time 
slot at the Lavins Activity Center. Cost is $10. Call 
(313) 822-2812, Ext. 200 or 201.

 ◆ Hill Mortgage hosts a shred party in the municipal 
parking lot behind Kercheval on The Hill, 10 a.m. to 1 
p.m. Limit of 50 pounds per customer. Call (313) 636-
3700 or email jkaleta@hillhomeloans.com.

The Week Ahead

au lait, melon et sucrier,” 
offered from the Ford 
House collection.

Around 280,000 people 
from around the world 
tuned into the auction. 
With the bang of the 
gavel, the Cezanne sold 
for $28,650,000 — setting 
a world auction record 
for a watercolor, the auc-
tion house said.

While pleased with this 
result, Heppner said 
making the decision to 
part with the painting 
was diffi cult.

“It’s never really an 
easy decision for any 
organization, no matter 
who they are, to part with 
any asset, no matter what 
it is,” Heppner said. “Our 
board made that decision 
long ago … for the long-
term sustainability of our 
organization. … They 
gave serious consider-
ation entertaining the 
sale of this painting. It’s 
not something any orga-
nization should take 
l ightly.  They were 
thoughtful, they did their 
due diligence. I’m proud 
of the board for making a 
sound decision and mov-
ing forward and follow-
ing through. 

“And Christie’s was 
great to work with,” he 
added. “They couldn’t 
have been more wonder-
ful.”

Initially, the sale was 
meant to be part of 
Christie’s traditional 
spring auction event, 
Heppner said. The onset 
of COVID-19 canceled 
said auction and the auc-
tion house began strate-
gizing how to move 
forward.

“Christie’s was really 
innovative and creative,” 
Heppner said. This sum-
mer, “they mounted the 
fi rst international — with 
four locations, Hong 
Kong, London, New York 
and Paris — online sale. I 
sat in on it to watch and 
observe. … It was inter-
esting to see what they 
did. They said it exceeded 

their expectations and 
it’s what we needed to 
feel confident to move 
forward with this sale.”

Prior to the auction, 
the painting was sent to 
Hong Kong and London 
before returning to New 
York to draw up excite-
ment for the piece.

“I wanted to be very 
optimistic,” Heppner 
said, explaining that Ford 
House interviewed three 
auction houses before 
deciding on Christie’s 
and all three estimated 
the painting’s value 
between $20 million and 
$27 million.

“It hit right where they 
said,” he noted. “The 
board was very happy, 
felt fortunate, grateful. 
Being the optimist 
always, I was hoping for 
$30 (million) to $35 mil-
lion, but I certainly wasn’t 
disappointed.”

While Heppner hasn’t 
been given information 
on the buyer, he said 
Christie’s plans to inquire 
whether the painting’s 
new owner is comfort-
able being named. If not, 
it’s possible Christie’s 
will release a statement 
regarding the country in 
which it will reside, as 
well as whether it will be 
part of a private collec-
tion or for public display. 

For more than 80 years, 
“Nature morte avec pot 
au lait, melon et sucrier” 
was a fixture at Ford 
House. It was painted 
between 1900 and the 
artist’s death six years 
later. The still life belongs 
to a group of watercolors 
that represent the culmi-
nation of Cezanne’s life-
long study of painting, 
the auction house noted.

It was one of more than 
200 works of art collected 
by the Fords when they 
lived at the Grosse Pointe 
estate.

“Edsel and Eleanor did 
collect,” Heppner said. 
“They evolved into very 
dedicated art collectors, 
but they were more 
patrons of art. They sup-
ported local art, individ-
ual artists, art institutions 
like the DIA. … It was 

part of the life of who 
they were. They were 
very much not just about 
collecting, but about 
being philanthropic with 
art.”

When the Fords lived 
in Grosse Pointe Shores, 
they had no idea their 
home would become a 
N a t i o n a l  H i s t o r i c 
Landmark or that their 
art and art objects would 
be so treasured, Heppner 
explained. 

“That’s not what they 
were trying to do,” he 
said. “They collected 
what they liked here and 
now. A lot of it was given 
away to family.”

Many of the pieces 
throughout Ford House 
are reproductions of art-
work the Fords donated 
to the Detroit Institute of 
Arts, sold or gave to fam-
ily members, Heppner 
said.

And while there’s 
plenty of beautiful art 
still displayed at Ford 
House — including a 
Matisse hanging on the 
second fl oor, “which we 
have no plans to sell,” he 
said — auctioning the 
Cezanne was for the bet-
terment of the Ford 
House legacy.

“All proceeds go to the 
existing endowment … 
for the future of Ford 
House,” Heppner said. 

When Eleanor Ford 
passed away in 1976, she 
set aside $50 million for 
an endowment to sup-
port the estate in the 
future.

“Eleanor had the fore-
sight to do that,” Heppner 
said. “She also expressed 
her desire to leave the 
estate for the betterment 
of the community.

“She did not want it to 
be a burden on the family 
or the community,” he 
added. “The last thing 
Ford House wants to be is 
another institution with 
its hand out to the com-
munity, not that there’s 
anything wrong with 
that. We want to solve 
our own issues if we have 
issues. This is a private 
operating foundation. … 
The vast majority of our 

revenue comes from one 
source and that is the 
endowment she set up.”

With the auction 
behind him and the 
endowment enriched, 
Heppner said Ford House 
is looking forward to the 
opening of its new visitor 
center and administra-
tion building — projects 
that have been delayed 
several times since 
ground broke in 2017.

“When these buildings 
are done, there will be 
nothing like them in the 
community, in southeast 
Michigan, in the state,” 
he said. “They’ll be a 
crowned jewel for their 
quality, craftsmanship, 
detail and artistry.”

A wet spring and early 
summer in 2019, coupled 
with delays in the deliv-
ery of materials, post-
poned construction even 
before the pandemic 
struck this spring, caus-
ing more interruptions.

“We planned that we 
would have been in the 
bui ldings already,” 
Heppner said. “2020 was 
to be this launching pad 
for reintroducing, rei-
magining the new Ford 
House. … We want to be 
community partner and 
asset to the community, 
not just behind stone 
walls. The buildings were 
going to launch us into 
all this attention. Now 
the attention has been 
moved to spring 2021. 
Schedules are tightening 
up. If all goes well, we’ll 
be in the buildings as 
early as mid-April or into 
May.”

The structures are 75 
to 80 percent complete, 
Heppner said. Most of 
what’s left is interior 
work — fl ooring, carpet-
ing, paneling, moving in 
furniture, installing exhi-
bitions — and landscap-
ing, which won’t happen 
until spring.

“We need to get this 
community excited and 
proud for what we’ve 
done,” he said. “It’s going 
to be unbelievable. … 
We’re so excited for Ford 
House and for every-
body.”

SOLD:
Continued from page 1A

A temporary section 
o f  s i d e w a l k  n e a r 
Maryland in the Park 
has been secured after 
a woman’s leg sank sev-
eral inches into the 
ground beneath it.

Brandie Paling was 
rescued by several pub-
lic safety officers after 
her leg was submerged 
to the knee around 6:30 
p.m. Wednesday, Sept. 
30, during a walk with 
her two children.

Paling’s social media 
post described a casual 
s t r o l l  b e f o r e  s h e 
stepped into the tempo-
rarily filled area where 
u n d e r g r o u n d  D T E 
Energy line replace-
ment was being com-
pleted.

“Thanking God it 
swallowed me and not 
my kids,” Paling’s post 
read.

Medics with buckets 
and shovels responded 
immediately, rescuing 
Paling who suffered 
minor injury.

She thanked the 
“awesome police and 

paramedics” in her 
post.

A DTE spokesperson 
said weather contrib-
uted to the incident.

“We were deeply con-
c e r n e d  w h e n  w e 
learned that a resident 
was injured on a tempo-
rary sidewalk recently 
installed by a third-
party contractor work-
ing for DTE,” said 
Colleen Creagh Rosso. 
“DTE worked closely 
with the Grosse Pointe 
Park Department of 
Public Works to secure 
the site and investigate. 
We found that recent 
heavy rains damaged 
the temporary sidewalk 
and we worked quickly 
t o  m a k e  r e p a i r s . 
Because the safety of 
our customers and 
employees is our top 
p r i o r i t y ,  w e ’ v e 
inspected all temporary 
sidewalks in the area 
and determined that 
they were not similarly 
impacted by the storm.”

— Eddie B. Allen Jr.

DTE repairs sidewalk 
where woman injured

GROSSE POINTE 
FARMS — A 44-year-old 
Chesterfield Township 
woman’s vehicle ended 
up in Lake St. Clair near 
Provencal and Lakeshore 
at approximately 10:15 
p.m. Thursday, Oct. 8.

The lone occupant of 
the vehicle, the woman 
had gotten out into the 
four-foot deep water and 
was walking out farther 
into the lake when offi -

cers from Grosse Pointe 
Farms and Grosse Pointe 
Shores arrived on the 
scene. 

Two Shores officers, 
James Tassie and Jason 
Rengert, entered the 
water wearing personal 
flotation devices and 
were able to help the 
woman to shore from 
around 100 feet out. 

“This is yet another 
example of the dedica-
tion and service our offi -
cers in GPS provide 
every day,” Shores 

Director of Public Safety 
John Schulte said via 
email.

The driver was then 
transported to a local 
hospital in good condi-
t ion,  according to 
Schulte.

“The car wasn’t that 
far out, but it was out far 
enough that they called 
for the dive team to 
make sure there was 
nobody else involved,” 
Farms Director of Public 
Safety Dan Jensen 
explained.

After breaking out the 
front passenger-side 
window, the dive team 
located a child’s seat, but 
after finding the wom-
an’s cell phone, which 
was still operational, 
were able to confirm 
with her husband the 
kids were with him.

It is unknown whether 
intoxication or drug use 
were involved at this 
time.

“Nothing was found to 
indicate that,” Jensen 
reported.

By Laurel Kraus
Staff Writer

Car enters lake at Provencal

PHOTOS COURTESY OF THE GROSSE POINTE FARMS PUBLIC SAFETY DEPARTMENT

Public safety offi cers work to remove a car from Lake St. Clair last Thursday night.
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Long-time Grosse 
Pointer Mark Orr has 
spent a lifetime giving 
back to the community.

The high school base-
ball standout grew up on 
the east side, graduating 
from Finney before 
accepting an athletic 
scholarship to Western 
Michigan University to 
play outfi eld on the base-
ball team.

He was presented a 
choice to either play pro-
fessional baseball for the 
Detroit Tigers organiza-
tion or go to college. 
Tigers scout Bill Lajoie 
discovered the high 
school baseball phenom, 
drafting him in the fi fth 
round at No. 112 in the 
mid-1970s.

“I had a choice to 
make,” Orr, of Grosse 
Pointe Park, said. “I could 

keep a signing bonus and 
who knows what hap-
pens if I don’t make the 
big leagues, or accept my 
college scholarship, go to 
Western, play baseball 
and earn a degree.

“It was a tough deci-
sion, but thanks for my 
family and coaches for 
talking it through with 
me, I decided to play col-
lege baseball.”

He played for the 
Broncos, had a good col-
lege career and earned 
multiple degrees at the 
end of that chapter of his 
life. He once hit four 
home runs in the first 
game of a double-header, 
which was a moment in 
time that he will never 
forget.

Orr earned three 
degrees at Western, mass 
media communications, 
business management 
and physical education/
sports management. He 

also earned secondary 
education certifi cation in 
all majors and finished 
with a 3.46 grade point 
average as a student-ath-
lete.

He graduated from col-
lege and threw his hat 
into the real estate busi-
ness. He has worked at 
Sine and Monaghan Real 
Living in Grosse Pointe 
Farms the past number of 
years.

He hit a home run in 
that category as his real 
estate talents have done 
him well. He met his wife 
of more than 30 years, 
Jan, who has been part of 
a one-two combination 
with Orr during the suc-
cessful game of life.

Orr never strayed far 
from baseball .  He 
coached as an assistant 
at Grosse Pointe South 
under head coach Dan 
Griesbaum, where they 
won a state champion-

ship, then moved to 
Grosse Pointe North to 
coach at the freshman 
and junior varsity level.

During his time coach-
ing at North and South 
with his manager, Jan, at 
his side, his teams have 
won more than 250 
games.

“Jan has been a tre-
mendous help, organiz-
ing the teams, and I 
coach them,” Orr said.

They are the keystone 
combination that is the 
catalyst for success. The 
support they give each 
other is what drives their 
successful balance of life, 
he said.

Jan had a successful 
run with her involvement 
in Grosse Pointe hockey, 
using her management 
skills to the fullest.

Orr also coaches on the 
side, giving individuals 
lessons on baseball fun-
damentals. He loves the 

game and this is his way 
to stay connected. He is 
also the owner of Double 
Play Sports/Pro Am 
Baseball.

“I’ve been fortunate to 
balance my career in real 
estate and coaching base-
ball,” Orr said.

He doesn’t have any 
children, but he says the 
players he coached 
through the years have 
been a nice substitute.

“I’ve coached some 
great kids through the 

years and met a lot of 
wonderful families,” Orr 
said.

He stepped away from 
coaching at North and is 
kind of in free-agent 
mode. He has listened to 
some coaching offers, 
but nothing has wowed 
him.

Orr is a motivational 
speaker, mentor and suc-
cessful team builder. His 
winning percentage of 
more than .750 is evi-
dence of that.

By Bob St. John
Sports Editor

Orr exudes positivity in life

PHOTO COURTESY OF MARK ORR

Mark Orr and his wife, Jan, at a recent visit to the 
Dirty Dog Jazz Café.

the record-keeper for the 
Taxpayers for Grosse 
Pointe Schools, a 501(c)4 
formed Sept. 2 that paid 
for the advertisements in 
question.

“I am here today because 
I have come across a reso-
lution that apparently was 
authored by a person who 
is a member of this board 
and that resolution seeks 
to censure my client, 

Cindy Pangborn, for 
actions that she did not 
engage in,” Schwartz said. 
“In fact, looking at the res-
olution as it was there does 
not even appear to be any 
evidence whatsoever that 
my client engaged in any 
action involving a 
Taxpayers for GP Schools 
publication of advertise-
ments that appeared in the 
Grosse Pointe News and 
other media. Under these 
circumstances, it seems to 
me that there is a signifi -
cant problem here to have 
brought such a resolution 
seeking to essentially den-
igrate my client where 

there is no basis for doing 
so.

“It seems to me you have 
a number of choices, one 
of which would be to deny 
it and vote it down, which 
I think is the appropriate 
situation given the fact 
there is no proper founda-
tion for this motion in the 
fi rst place,” he continued. 
“The other one is to 
approve it. If you were to 
do that, you would bring 
dishonor not only upon 
yourselves but upon this 
school district. And so, 
therefore, I am suggesting 
to you in the strongest of 
means to take this motion 

— this resolution — deny 
it and allow this board to 
get on with the business at 
hand and not engage in 
this type of activity.”

Prior to the discussion 
on the motion, Pangborn 
asked what action would 
be taken if the resolution 
passed.

“The action is that your 
censure is on the record, 
that you’ve been disci-
plined by the rest of the 
board members,” Weertz 
said. “That’s the action. 
There’s no further action.”

“So it’s a form of embar-
rassment,” Pangborn said.

“It’s a form of disci-
pline,” Weertz clarifi ed.

Pangborn read a signed 
and notarized affidavit 
Schwartz passed out to 
her fellow board mem-
bers.

“The problem with this 
resolution is that the accu-
sation never happened,” 
Pangborn read. “I never 
placed the ad in the Grosse 
Pointe News. I didn’t pay 
for it, I don’t belong to nor 
have I cooperated or had 
any involvement with the 
nonprofit 501(c)4. I had 
nothing to do with any 
involvement in the place-
ment or creation of the 
advertising in question. I 
support our teachers, the 
staff and the administra-
tors at all our buildings 
who have worked tire-
lessly to support our stu-
dents and who have been 
put in an impossible posi-
tion by the district admin-
istrators. Based on this 
information — and there is 
no proof of the accusation 

— I would like to call the 
question.”

Board members shared 
their thoughts during a roll 
call vote.

“I understand that it’s 
uncomfortable to have a 
discussion like this,” 
board Treasurer Judy 
Gafa said, “but I’ll take an 
hour if I have to to defend 
our administrators and 
our schools because they 
work hard. I’ll also take 
an hour if we need to to 
defend the teachers who 
work so hard. To have an 
ad like that placed in the 
paper is so awful, is so dis-
gusting. … It’s worth a 
half-hour of someone’s 
time to stand up and do 
the right thing. Sometimes 
standing up and doing the 
right thing is not easy, but 
at the end of the day, I’m 
going to do it.”

“This is a sad day in 
Grosse Pointe public 
schools,” Weertz said. “I 
don’t take any pleasure in 
having to do this. We have 
employees that we must 
not involve in name-call-
ing in the newspaper. That 
was demeaning and we 
won’t stand for it. I won’t 
stand for it. Each of you 
can decide on your own 
what you stand for. But I 
stand for our principals 
and our staff. We have 
never had this type of cam-
paign before.”

“I was initially going to 
vote ‘no’,” Trustee Joseph 
Herd said, “the reason 
being I think everyone 
should have second 
chances, but I asked a 
question a couple of weeks 

ago. And the question was, 
‘Mrs. Pangborn, were you 
aware that your picture 
and name were going to be 
in the ad?’ And you said 
yes. … I believe that you 
know that as Americans 
we all have a right to 
express our opinion, but 
not in every position. And 
when we take on particu-
lar positions, then we are 
not able to do what others 
who are not in that posi-
tion do. Because of that, I 
thought about it and I 
came to the conclusion 
that you said you were not 
aware of what was in the 
ad, but that ad disparaged 
our teachers and our 
administration to the point 
of where I think that in our 
positions, we have to be 
extremely responsible 
about what we lend our 
names to.”

“Freedom of speech is 
one thing, but libelous 
statements are another 
thing,” Lee said. “If I saw 
an ad like that with my 
picture and my name, I 
would raise holy hell to 
stop it.”

“I’m not happy about 
my ‘yes’ vote,” Secretary 
Christopher Profeta said. 
“I attended the last meet-
ing with an open mind and 
what I heard was you say 
that you coordinated on 
artwork. I heard other 
people on the ad say they 
saw the message. That to 
me is my reasoning for my 
‘yes’ vote.”

Secretary Kathleen 
Abke did not comment, 
but voted in favor of the 
resolution.

Continued from page 1A
CENSURE:

Left, Dr. Cynthia 
Browne, a radiation 
oncologist, talks about 
the importance of vi-
tamin D for respirato-
ry and immune 
health.
Below, the Anthony L. 
Soave Family Mobile 
3D Mammography 
truck was parked on 
Kercheval during the 
event so women could 
get mammograms.

PHOTOS BY 
RENEE LANDUYT

Sponsored by Ascension 
St. John Hospital, Get 
Your Pink On took place 
Oct. 1, and highlighted 
the importance of wom-
en’s health. Physicians 
gave presentations on 
breast cancer screening, 
the importance of vita-
min D and the genetics-
breast cancer link. 
Goodie bags, drawings 
and retail specials also 
were part of the event. 
Top, Julia Hoffmann, 
Maureen Hennessy and 
Christine Trempus gath-
ered in The Village with 
the goodie bags they re-
ceived after attending a 
physician presentation. 
Bottom, Sharon 
Campbell, an 18-year 
cancer survivor, exits 
Next Door Art & Gift 
Gallery through pink 
streamers.

Get Your 
Pink On

www.gpbr.com

Only one website 
gives you access to 
1,000+ local REALTORS® 
and a list of homes 
open for tour.

ORS®

101520

WEEKEND

10
15

20

USPS 230-400

PUBLISHED EVERY
THURSDAY BY

POINTE NEWS INCORPORATED

16980 KERCHEVAL AVE.
GROSSE POINTE, MI 48230

PHONE: (313) 882-6900

PERIODICAL POSTAGE PAID at Detroit, 
Michigan and additional mailing offi ces.

SUBSCRIPTION RATES: $44.50 per year 
via mail in the Metro area, $65 outside.

POSTMASTER: Send address changes to 
Grosse Pointe News, 16980 Kercheval, 
Grosse Pointe, MI 48230.

The deadline for news copy is 3 p.m. 
Monday.

Advertising proof deadline is 5:00 p.m. 
Friday.

CORRECTIONS AND ADJUSTMENTS:
Responsibility for display and classifi ed 
advertising errors is limited to either 
cancellation of the charge for or a 
rerun of the portion in error. Notifi cation 
must be given in time for correction 
in the following issue. We assume no 
responsibility of the same after the fi rst 
insertion.

THE GROSSE POINTE NEWS reserves 
the right not to accept an advertiser’s 
order. Grosse Pointe News advertising 
representatives have no authority to 
bind this newspaper. Only publication of 
an advertisement shall constitute fi nal 
acceptance of the advertiser’s order.



GROSSE POINTE NEWS, OCTOBER 15, 2020

PUBLIC SAFETY  |  5A 

SAFETY5A

City of Grosse Pointe

Harassing 
communications

A member of the 
Grosse Pointe Public 
School System Board of 
Education received polit-
ical literature with hand-
written profanities on it 
in her mailbox Thursday, 
Oct. 8.

Reckless driving 
without license 

After driving through a 
red light at Jefferson 
Avenue and Lakeland 
Street, a 15-year-old 
Detroit girl was arrested 
for driving without a 
license at 9:37 p.m. 
Friday, Oct. 9.

Stolen 
credit card

A 46-year-old Detroit 
woman reported her 
boyfriend, a 49-year-old 
Detroit man and known 
drug dealer, for stealing 
her credit card while she 
was in the hospital 
Friday, Oct. 9, and charg-
ing $634.95 from a con-
venience store. 

— Laurel Kraus
Report information 

about these and other 
crimes to the City of 
Grosse Pointe Public 
Safety, (313) 886-3200.

Grosse Pointe Farms

More stolen 
political signs

A 2020 presidential 
election sign was stolen 
from a Lothrop Road 
yard Tuesday, Oct. 6.

Another political sign 
was stolen from a 
Vendome Road yard 
b e t w e e n  1 0  p . m . 
Wednesday, Oct. 7, and 
8 a.m. Thursday, Oct. 8.

Identity theft
A 64-year-old Farms 

man discovered he was 
the victim of identity 
theft Thursday, Oct. 8, 
when Wayfair contacted 
him regarding an out-
standing balance of 
$821.20, which he did not 
authorize.

Not a 
picky renter

When an appointment 
was made to rent any 
car for any amount of 
money Thursday, Oct. 8, 
employees at an area car 
rental service had raised 
suspicions.

T h e  1 8 - y e a r - o l d 
Detroit man then tried to 
use a fake Michigan 
driver’s license to rent 
the vehicle and was 
arrested for fraud.

Suspicious 
fi lmer

A 24-year-old Macomb 
Township man was 
reported to public safety 
by the owner of a busi-
ness in the 100 block of 
Ke r c h e v a l  Av e n u e 
Friday, Oct. 9, when he 
was seen with a camera 
on his lap fi lming people 
eat, including a group of 
girls around the ages of 
12 to 14. 

The man was advised 
he will be charged with 
trespassing if he returns 
to the business.

Gas vendetta
A petroleum transport 

employee was fi lling fuel 
holding tanks at an area 
gas station at 7:55 p.m. 

Sunday, Oct. 11, when a 
man, suspected to be a 
29-year-old from Detroit, 
drove onto the grass and 
backed over the fuel 
supply hose to get to the 
air pump.

When asked what he 
was doing, the driver 
said he didn’t see the 
hose, but then pro-
ceeded to drive forward, 
running it over again.

Wrong way
After being seen trav-

eling the wrong direc-
tion on eastbound Mack 
Avenue at 1:29 a.m. 
Monday, Oct. 12, a 
34-year-old Detroit man 
was pulled over and 
arrested for operating 
while intoxicated.

A preliminary breath 
test showed his blood 
alcohol content was .22 
percent.

— Laurel Kraus
Report information 

about these and other 
crimes to Grosse Pointe 
Farms Public Safety, 
(313) 885-2100.

Grosse Pointe Shores

Operating while 
intoxicated

After being stopped 
on Lakeshore Road for 
improper lane use and 
striking the curb at 
12:53 a.m. Wednesday, 
Oct. 7, a 20-year-old 
Chesterfield man was 
arrested for operating 
while intoxicated, sec-
ond offense; driving 
whi le  l icense sus-
pended; not having 

insurance and minor in 
possession of drug par-
aphernalia. 

While a preliminary 
breath test showed his 
blood alcohol content to 
be .073 percent, he 
admitted to smoking 
marijuana and taking 
pills before driving.

New vehicle, 
old plate

A 37-year-old Grosse 
Pointe man who was 
pulled over for an 
improper  p late  a t 
Lakeshore and Oxford 
roads at 4:52 p.m. 
Thursday, Oct. 8, stated 
he had just purchased 
the vehicle at the end of 
September and was tak-
ing it home after getting 
work done on it.

The plate belonged to 
another one of his vehi-
cles, for which he was 
arrested in addition to 
not having insurance.

No insurance 
A 39-year-old Ferndale 

man was arrested for not 
having insurance at 10:14 
p.m. Friday, Oct. 9, after 
he was pulled over on 
Lakeshore Road and 
Fontana Lane for having 
no license plate.

Drawing 
attention 

When pulled over on 
Lakeshore Road at 2:28 
a.m. Saturday, Oct. 10, 
for speeding 48 mph 
with hazard lights fl ash-
ing, LEIN showed the 
39-year- old Detroit 
man’s vehicle had no 
insurance.

The man then pro-
vided a false name and 
date of birth before 
being arrested for not 
having a license or 
insurance. 

Speeding 
without 
insurance

A 19-year-old Hazel 
Park man traveling 58 
mph at Lakeshore and 
Clairview roads at 9:12 
p.m. Sunday, Oct. 11, 
told offi cers he just pur-
chased the vehicle and 
had not had a chance to 
insure or register it, for 
which he was arrested.

— Laurel Kraus
Report information 

about these and other 
crimes to Grosse Pointe 
Shores Public Safety, 
(313) 881-5500.

Grosse Pointe Woods

Driving while 
suspended

A 27-year-old Detroit 
man’s  vehicle was 
impounded after he was 
stopped for disobeying a 
traffi c signal while trav-
eling north on Harper 
near Allard around 2:20 
a.m. Sunday, Oct. 11. 

He was cited after his 
driving record showed 
21 suspensions.

Retail raid
A suspect is sought 

after taking several 
cases of beer, dishwash-
ing detergent and paper 
towels from a super-
market in the 20400 
block of Mack around 

4:30 p.m. Friday, Oct. 9, 
without paying. 

T h e  m a n  w a s 
described as white, 
heavy-set, around 50 
years old and wearing a 
blue shirt and khaki 
shorts. He was last seen 
fl eeing in a black Honda 
with no license plate, 
travel ing north on 
Mack.

— Eddie B. Allen Jr.
Report information 

about these and other 
crimes to Grosse Pointe 
Woods Public Safety, 
(313) 343-2400.

Grosse Pointe Park

Stolen 
equipment

A $1,500 concrete saw 
was stolen from an 
unlocked work trailer in 
the 1200 block of 
Wayburn between 1 p.m. 
Thursday, Oct. 8, and 
8:30 a.m. Friday, Oct. 9. 
The tool is described as 
orange and white in 
color. 

Stolen bikes
Two bikes valued at a 

total of $850 were stolen 
from an unlocked garage 
in the 1000 block of 
Nottingham between
1 a.m. and 3 p.m. Friday, 
Aug. 9. Also stolen from 
a rear porch were two 
duffel bags containing 
miscellaneous tools.

— Eddie B. Allen Jr.
Report information 

about these and other 
crimes to Grosse Pointe 
Park Public Safety, (313) 
822-7400.
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meeting began, and dur-
ing a presentation by a 
representative of the 
Grosse Pointe Public 
Library, unknown voices 
slinging profanity and 
vulgar sentences over-
took the proceedings. 
The meeting was shut 
down by city adminis-
tration moments later.

“They came in all at 
once and you know 
we’ve had a pretty suc-
cessful run of meetings, 
so I think that we’re so 
used to our residents 
behaving,” Assistant 
City Manager and City 
Clerk Derrick Kozicki 
said. “ … The names 
were normal and then 
they weren’t normal and 
then I was trying to end 
the meeting as quickly 
as possible.”

The council meeting 
w a s  t h e n  s l o w l y 
restarted as city admin-
istration let participants 
in one at a time to verify 
each person.

“We apologize, every-
body, for that interrup-
tion,” Mayor Louis 
Theros said, as the 
m e e t i n g  r e s u m e d 
around a half hour later.

An additional precau-
tion included muting 
each participant who 
was not a co-host — co-
hosts are typically mem-
bers of council, city 
staff and those present-
ing — without the abil-
i t y  t o  u n m u t e 
themselves.  During 
public comment por-
tions, residents were 
unmuted one at a time 
after being verifi ed.

“It appears when I 
was trying to turn the 
doorbell on, I acciden-

tally clicked the ‘allow 
participants to unmute 
themselves’ (button), so 
I think that was our 
cause,” Kozicki said, 
referring to a Zoom fea-
ture that alerts hosts 
when participants show 
up to meetings late, so 
city administration will 
notice they’re there and 
let them in.

Due to the Open 
Meetings Act, the city 
posts the passwords to 
Zoom meetings on its 
website, which allow 
anyone access.

“I’m surprised it took 
that long for that to hap-
pen,” Councilman Neil 
Sroka said.

Zoom bombing is ille-
gal and punishable by 
fi nes and imprisonment, 
a c c o r d i n g  t o  t h e 
Department of Justice’s 
U.S. Attorney’s Office 
Eastern District  of 
Michigan. Such charges 
could include disrupting 
a public meeting, com-

puter intrusion, using a 
computer to commit a 
crime, hate crimes, 
fraud and transmitting 
threatening communi-
cations.

“ You think Zoom 
bombing is funny?” 
a s k e d  M a t t h e w 
S c h n e i d e r,  U . S . 
Attorney for Eastern 

Michigan, in a press 
release in April. “Let’s 
see how funny it is after 
you get arrested. If you 
interfere with a telecon-
ference or public meet-
ing in Michigan, you 
could have federal, state 
or local law enforce-
ment knocking at your 
door.”

BOMBED:
Continued from page 1A
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Crossroads 
dinner canceled, 
donations needed
To the Editor:

We are sorry to have to 
announce that the spe-
cial pre-Thanksgiving 
dinner at the Crossroads 
Soup Kitchen has been 
canceled this year due to 
concerns of spreading 
COVID-19.  

Each year, since 1997, 
we have served a com-
plete turkey dinner to 
approximately 1,000 
needy men, women and 
children thanks to the 
generosity of hundreds 
of our neighbors, friends 
and family.  

You have donated the 
turkeys, provided funds 
needed to purchase the 
rest of the meal, trans-
ported supplies, worked 
in the Soup Kitchen, 
offered encouragement 
and prayers, and have 
been the ultimate sup-

port group for this big-
ger than life annual 
project.  

We really could not 
have done it without 
you.  But, please keep 
your energy and enthusi-
asm in your back pock-
ets as we are expecting 
to return next year, bet-
ter than ever. In the 
meantime, please do not 
forget the neediest of 
our neighbors.  

 A c c o r d i n g  t o 
Forgotten Harvest, right 
now, “In the city of 
Detroit, over 57 percent 
of children under the age 
of 18 live in poverty.”  
That means that one in 
two children in our own 
backyard are food inse-
cure. And, that doesn’t 
even address the inci-
dence of hunger among 
adults.  However, we can 
do something about 
these tragic statistics.

Please consider donat-
ing the cost of a turkey 

— the turkey you would 
have purchased if our 
Soup Kitchen dinner 
was going to take place 
this year. Whatever you 
would have spent on that 
donation can be turned 
into food for a family.  

Every day of every 
week, Crossroads of 
Michigan sees clients 
who are in need of many 
things, but food is the 
No. 1 request.  Last year, 
Crossroads’ daily out-
reach program distrib-
uted 226,224 pounds of 
food, one bag at a time.  

This year the situation 
has worsened due to the 
increase in unemploy-
ment and restrictions 
resulting from the pan-
demic. 

Donations can be 
made by check, or elec-
tronically. Visit the 
Crossroads website at 
crossroadsofmichigan.
org to donate online 
through PayPal. Or, mail 
a check to Crossroads of 
Michigan, 2424 W. Grand 
Blvd., Detroit 48208, and 
p l e a s e  m e m o : 
Thanksgiving. If you 
prefer, a check made out 
to  Crossroads  o f 
Michigan may also be 
dropped off at our home 
at 266 Lewiston Road, 
Grosse Pointe Farms, 
48236.  

Thank you for your 
generosity now and over 
so many years. We look 
forward to making a dif-

ference with you, again, 
in the Soup Kitchen next 
year. Until then, please 
pray for Crossroads, all 
those who are in need, 
and stay well.  

YOLANDA AND 
CHARLIE TURNER
Grosse Pointe Farms

Roundabout 
a good idea
To the Editor:

I quite like the idea of 
turning the horrible 
Moross/Mack intersec-
tion into a roundabout or 
rotary or whatever we 
decide to call them. 

I have driven on them 
here and in other coun-
tries and fi nd them the 
most efficient way of 
moving traffi c, once you 
get used to them. They 
avoid unnecessary start-
ing and stopping as well 
as being more aesthetic, 
in that the center pro-
vides an opportunity for 
sculpture or plantings.

And while I’m on the 
subject, I think that the 
placing of stop signs at 
the t iny Wayburn/
Kercheval traffic circle 
defeats the whole pur-
pose of its design. They 
are totally superfluous 
and merely add to the 
general sign clutter of 
which we have way too 
much already in my 
opinion.

KURT SHUCK
Grosse Pointe
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LETTERS
The Grosse Pointe News welcomes your letters to
the editor. All letters should be typed, double-spaced 
and signed. Letters longer than 250 words may be
edited for length. All letters may be edited for
content. We reserve the right to refuse any letter. 
Include daytime phone number for verifi cation
or questions. The deadline for letters is 3 p.m. 
Monday. Letters to the editor may by emailed to
editor@grossepointenews.com.
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T
he comprehensive education survey done 
for the Grosse Pointe News shows, along 
other highlights, that an unfortunate diver-
gence is building between the two ends of 
the school district.

The deepest opposition to recent changes — clos-
ing two elementary schools and moving fi fth graders 
to the middle schools — comes from the end of the 
district encompassed by ZIP code 48230. The 
changes, in response to declining enrollment, took 
effect this fall.

The Grosse Pointe Public School System is made 
up primarily of ZIP codes 48230, which covers the 
cities of Grosse Pointe and Grosse Pointe Park, and 
48236, which covers the remaining Pointes. (The dis-
trict also includes part of ZIP code 48225 in Harper 
Woods; unfortunately, numbers there are too small 
to yield signifi cant survey fi ndings.)

The differences between the two ends of the dis-
trict mostly show up among those expressing dissat-
isfaction with the way things are, well beyond issues 
involved in school reconfi guration.

For example, twice as many people (29 percent) in 
48230 think educational quality has gotten worse 
over the past two years than people in 48236 (14 per-
cent). Almost half (47 percent) of those in 48230 
think the district has done only a fair to poor job of 
handling its fi nances, compared to a bit more than a 
quarter (28 percent) in 48236.

Although only a small percentage of respondents 
gave the district an overall grade of D-F, the numbers 
were markedly higher (17 percent vs. 4 percent) in 
48230 than in 48236. Fewer respondents in 48230 
believed they had supported past bond issues, as 
well. 

Similar disparities occurred when respondents 
were asked to rate administrators and the Board of 
Education, but not teachers, who got high grades 
from everyone. 

And of course the issue of closing Trombly 
Elementary School in Grosse Pointe Park was deci-
sively less popular in 48230, where that school is 
located. Respondents in 48230 also favored a board 
recall 48 percent to 31 percent, with 21 percent unde-
cided. Those in 48236 opposed it, with 33 percent for, 
46 percent against, and 21 percent undecided.

Notably, the two ZIP codes did not demonstrate 
major differences when respondents were asked 
about potential scenarios for reopening schools dur-
ing the COVID-19 pandemic. But even then, more 
respondents (41 percent) in 48230 thought the dis-
trict’s actual response was fair to poor, than those (27 
percent) in 48236.

Keep in mind that these breakdowns involve high 
margins of error; still, the differences are big enough 
to be considered signifi cant. 

And seen as a trend, rather than individual gripes, 
they suggest that district dissatisfaction is more con-
centrated in the ZIP code that includes Trombly. 
(Those respondents even seem to register the highest 
opposition to closing Poupard Elementary School, at 
the opposite end of the district.)

All of which sets the stage for an election in which 
fi ve of the seven seats on the Board of Education are 
up for grabs. The survey makes it pretty clear that the 
community making up the district is split almost in 
half over the issue of closing schools — and prefers, 
in all areas, to keep fi fth graders in elementary school 
— with opposition heaviest in the Park and the City. 

That makes it harder to envisage where consensus 
might emerge or which candidates’ platforms and 
skills might help the district come back together. The 
survey, conducted by EPIC-MRA, a survey research 
firm out of Lansing, seems to demonstrate that 
respondents unhappy about one set of decisions have 
become increasingly skeptical of almost all other 
aspects of school district management.

And the geographic disparity, as shown in the dif-
ference of opinions in the two ZIP codes covering the 
Grosse Pointes, adds another layer of complication. 
It suggests the next Board of Education, if it is to suc-
ceed at all, will need to represent and embrace this 
broad range.

Survey detects 
‘Trombly effect’

PHOTO BY RENEE LANDUYT

Pure Grosse Pointe
Staff photographer Renee Landuyt believes this perfectly coifed tree on Ballantyne in Grosse Pointe Woods, 

when its foliage is full, looks like the hairstyle of the famous painter and TV host of “The Joy of Painting,” Bob 

Ross. One of his famous quotes is, “The secret to doing anything is believing you can do it.” Those are good 

words to live by.

O U R  V I E W

Y
ou don’t need to head way up north to see 
great fall color. According to the County 
Road Association of Michigan, you need 
only go as far north as Lakeshore Road 
near the Edsel & Eleanor Ford House to 

have a lovely drive once the leaves change. 
No doubt that stretch of road is nice, although for 

some reason the road association describes it as lying 
between Eight Mile and Marter roads — not realizing, 
as most Pointers know, that Eight Mile never reaches 
Lakeshore. Perhaps they meant Vernier Road.

In any event, talking only about county roads sort 
of misses the point around here. Admittedly, the rest 
of the county stretch of Lakeshore through Grosse 
Pointe Shores and into Grosse Pointe Farms remains 
a beautiful — if less tree-lined — drive. But the real 
showstoppers around here each fall are city streets.

The Pointes practically glow when the light is right. 
Street after street offers a canopy or a curtain or a 
tunnel of color. Don’t tell anyone, but the best of the 
best is Berkshire Road in Grosse Pointe Park, both 
above and below Jefferson, according to a somewhat 

prejudiced expert: Brian Colter, forester for both the 
Park and the City of Grosse Pointe.

The Pointes’ big advantage is diversity of species, 
Mr. Colter says, which results in a variety of colors 
each fall. Yellow is the most common around here, 
followed closely by red; maples are the most common 
tree — 38 percent of the inventory in both cities where 
he works. 

Throughout the Pointes, trees number about 60,000, 
and that diversity has become  a necessity as various 
tree diseases and insect infestations move through 
the region. Even those precious maples may be under 
threat if the Asian longhorn beetle makes its way 
here, Mr. Colter said. 

The area is entering peak color right about now, he 
said.

Although not necessarily related to the timing of the 
best color, the Pointes have their own, slightly warmer 
microclimate to thank for an additional boost in what 
can grow here. And hopefully that microclimate will 
give Pointers, this year, a chance to drive — or stroll 
— through day after luminescent day.

G.P. entering peak fall colors



I 
was looking 
through old photos 
the other day and 
came upon one of 
my parents. They’re 

at that age I hold them 
perpetually in my mind 
now that they’re gone.

They’re sitting on the 
back terrace together, 
unraked leaves littering 
the bricks. My father is 
still robust, slim but not 
yet frail, wearing a plaid 
flannel shirt and work 
pants. My mother is in a 
blouse, pair of slacks and 
heels — her uniform 

whether she’s teaching 
school or driving to the 
grocery store. She’s read-
ing the New York Times, 
legs crossed. My dad is 
leaned over, elbows rest-
ing on his knees, his 
hands together at some 
task, two buckets at his 
feet.

Whoever took the pic-
ture has caught their 
attention, as my mother 
has lowered the paper 
and my dad has turned 
his head to face the cam-
era. They’re both smiling.

I shared the photo with 
my siblings, for nostal-
gia’s sake. My sister 
thinks our dad was peel-
ing apples to make apple-
sauce. It would be the 
right time of year, evi-
denced by the gathering 
of rust-colored leaves at 

their feet and the hint of 
gold behind the pines. 
One bucket would be for 
the peelings, the other for 
the bared apples.

We had an apple tree 
out back and every other 
year or so it would yield a 
crop. They were not 
apples you were tempted 
to eat. They were small 
and misshapen, shrunken 
and knotty and puckered 
with holes, but to my 
father, they were a trea-
sure trove.

He never touched the 
apples on the tree, but 
would gather them from 
the ground to make 
batches of lumpy apple-
sauce that was never, no 
matter how much sugar 
he added, sweet enough. 
He enjoyed the process, 
though — peeling the 

apples, boiling them for 
hours and then mashing 
the pulp. The smell would 
fi ll our house.

I wish I knew what was 
in the pages of the news-
paper my mother was 
reading that day. Did she 
share the news with my 
father? Did he listen, or 
was he distracted by 
reflections unrelated to 
whatever troubling head-
lines disturbed the world 
that day?

The light on my moth-
er’s face indicates the sun 
was setting in the pasture 
behind our house, casting 
a long shadow across the 
bricks, but igniting the 
trees. There’s a rectangle 
of light along her ankle 
and my father’s forehead. 
I can feel the heat of that 
sun. I see the veins on my 

dad’s hands, recall their 
coolness and strength 
and the warmth of my 
mother’s hands.

It’s a moment of still-
ness that won’t last. My 
mother will soon refold 
the paper, restoring the 
sections to their proper 
order, and my father, his 
work complete, will 
gather his buckets. She 
will head to the kitchen to 
tie on an apron and pre-
pare dinner, the NPR 
theme music on the radio 
heralding the arrival of 
more news for her quiet 
intellect to absorb.

He will retire to his 
study to grade the student 
papers stacked on his 
desk or roll a plain sheet 
of paper into his IBM 
Selectric typewriter. The 
erratic clack of the keys 

will be followed by the 
silence of his pencil or 
pen — a careful notation 
here, a quiet crossed-out 
word there.

Somewhere in the 
house, there are children. 
Reading upstairs in their 
bedrooms, doing home-
work at the kitchen table, 
watching TV, or playing 
outside with friends. 
Summoned indoors by 
the dinner bell, they bring 
with them the scent of dry 
leaves and the evening’s 
chill.

The table is set and the 
candles are lit. There’s a 
dog curled in the corner 
of the dining room and a 
cat perched on the buffet. 
My father takes his seat at 
the head of the table. At 
his back, behind the glass 
of the French doors, the 
light is fading, a pale glow 
behind black trees.

The day is over and 
another one yet to begin, 
somewhere still in time.

1945
75 years ago this week

MORE ON STREET 
FIRES: It all depends on 
where you sit … or 
rather where you live 
when you start that fi re 
to burn autumn leaves. 
The Park recent ly 
announced that anyone 
who burned leaves on 
the street would be 
prosecuted. It was said 
the fi res spoiled a lot of 
new pavement last year. 
Now the subject has 
come up in the Farms 
and the story is entirely 
different. “The more 

they burn, on the streets 
or elsewhere, the more 
we like it,” said Murray 
Smith, Farms engineer. 
“We don’t have to clean 
them up and haul them 
away or pull them out of 
the sewers.”

Obituaries: Margaret 
V. Belfrey, Mrs. Charles 
L. Frederick

1970 
50 years ago this week

C I T I Z E N S 
C I R C U L A T E 
PETITIONS AGAINST 
RINK: A citizen cam-
paign fi ghting the erec-

tion of an indoor hockey 
rink by the Grosse 
P o i n t e  H o c k e y 
Association at Elworthy 
Field is gaining momen-
tum. Leaders of the 
campaign told the News 
that some dozen peti-
tions opposing the pro-
posal are currently 
being circulated in the 
City.

Obituaries: Carter 
Sales Jr., Claire Ballard, 
Russell A. Alger Jr., 
Joseph B. Hester, Clifton 
M. Bayliss, Gilbert J. 
Hatie, Frank I. Bowles, 
Alexander G. Ashley, 
Edna M. Meissner, 
Catherine Donovan, 
Phyllis M. Hoag, Byron 
Birks Phillips

1995
25 years ago this week

SANDERS CLOSES 
VILL AGE STORE: 
Despite efforts over the 
past couple years to keep 
Sanders in the Village 
afl oat, the restaurant/con-
fectionary closed its doors 
last weekend. Sanders, 
which has been at the 
same location since 1935, 
almost closed in 1987 and 
again in 1994. The store 
hasn’t been profi table for 
several years, Sanders 
Systems President James 
Braiser said.

DEBATE RENEWED 
O V E R  C L O S I N G 
CAMPUSES DURING 
LUNCH: Will the actions 
of a few unruly students 

affect all who attend pub-
lic high school in Grosse 
Pointe? Ever since the 
mid-1970s, when the 
Grosse Pointe school dis-
trict opened the high 
school campuses for the 
lunch period, the issue 
periodically surfaces as to 
whether the campuses 
should be closed. This 
year is another one of 
those times.

Obituaries: John G. 
Sauer, Margaret Boehr 
Canty, Irene M. Leithauser, 
Mary Hays Gilmore, 
Wesley Jeffrey, William R. 
Olmsted, Jean Caulkins 
McDaniel

2010
10 years ago this week

BIKE PATH GETS 
COUNTY FUNDING: 
Wayne County Parks and 
Recreation is providing 
$70,000 of the $100,000 
cost of a bike route project 
encompassing the five 
Grosse Pointes. Exercising 
by bicycling to work, 
school and shopping dis-
tricts is Move More, the 
second component of a 
three-part Live Well in 
Grosse Pointe initiative 
cultivated by the Grosse 
Pointe Chamber of 
Commerce. Wayne County 
Commissioner Tim Killeen 
provided the impetus to 
supply a majority of the 
project’s funding.

Obituaries: Ralph Louis 
Wi lgarde ,  Michae l 
Hessheimer, Gladys 
Elizabeth Kopp, Joanne H. 
Jocque, Aileen Lorraine 
Meininger
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The JoAnn Matouk Romain Mystery
The crazy, but true story of a Grosse Pointe family’s search 

for answers in a suicide that most likely wasn’t 

By Scott M. Burnstein
Special to the Grosse Pointe News

Part one of a three part series

T
he sky-borne 
messages be-
gan appearing 
seven years 
ago and 

haven’t stopped since. 
As soon as metro 

Detroit shakes off win-
ter and descends into 
spring, planes start 
appearing in and around 
Grosse Pointe towing 
banners with questions 
posed to a local busi-
nessman and his police 
offi cer cousin regarding 
a suspicious death in 
their family circle. 

Many believe it was a 
cold-blooded murder, 
but offi cially, it’s consid-
ered a suicide. Those 
crying foul play have 
made certain their feel-
ings are widely known 
and have let the lurid 
accusations fl y, both by 
way of the infl ammatory 
air-fl own messages and 
through the federal 
court system.  

“Did you think you 
could get away with it?” 
one message read.

“Bill and Tim, why 
won’t you take a poly-
graph test?” read 
another.

“Your time is up 
#handcuffs,” read the 
most recent message 
that fl ew over Labor Day 
weekend.

The story of JoAnn 
Matouk Romain’s Jan. 
12, 2010, death reads 
like it was ripped from a 
“Law & Order” script. 

In fact, Netfl ix’s suc-
cessful reboot of the 
1980s and ’90s NBC 
true-crime property, 
“Unsolved Mysteries,” is 
diving into the Matouk 
Romain case for its sec-
ond batch of episodes, 
set to air Oct. 19. The 
show fi elded more than 
25,000 tips in the days 
after the fi rst slate of a 
half-dozen episodes 
landed in July. 

“Your head spins look-
ing at all the facts here; 
it’s hard to tell who the 
good guys are and who 
the bad guys are,” said 
retired FBI agent Bill 
Randall, a private inves-
tigator who was retained 
by the Matouk Romain 
family. “Things are as 
muddy as I’ve ever seen. 
It can drive you insane.” 

The following — based 
on thousands of pages 
of court records, deposi-
tion testimony, private 
investigation reports, 
dozens of interviews and 
a collection of exclusive 
sources in government, 
law enforcement and the 
underworld — is an in-
depth look at the 
Matouk Romain case, 
which though declared a 
suicidal drowning 
remains open to this 
day. 

A troubled 
timeline

On a late, freezing-
cold January night in 
2010, Michelle Romain 
was at her mother’s 
home in Grosse Pointe 
Woods when, she 
recalls, there was a 
knock at the door from 
the police. An offi cer 
from the Grosse Pointe 

Farms Public Safety 
Department was there to 
inform her that her 
mother, JoAnn, had 
gone missing from their 
family’s church parking 
lot off Lakeshore Road. 

It was 9:25 p.m., she 
says. 

The police offi cer told 
the daughter that the 
2008-model Lexus SUV 
her mother, Joann 
Matouk Romain, was 
driving was found aban-
doned in the St. Paul’s 
Church parking lot. He 
ran her license plate and 
ended up at her door-
step.

To Michelle Romain, 
something immediately 
felt amiss in the expla-
nation. The Lexus was 
registered in Michelle 
Romain’s name, not her 
mother’s; so why 
weren’t they asking 
about her safety and 
whereabouts? 

The offi cial police 
report asserts an offi cer 
didn’t come across the 
car until 9:50 p.m., more 
than a half-hour after an 
offi cer, according to 
Michelle Romain, came 

looking for the wrong 
person. The license plate 
wasn’t put through the 
Michigan Department of 
Motor Vehicles database 
until 9:58 p.m., so the 
police wouldn’t have had 
an address to check out 
until a half-hour after 
the offi cer had arrived at 
Michelle Romain’s door, 
if the daughter’s time-
line is correct. 

Yet, according to time-
stamped records 
Michelle Matouk 
obtained via the 
Freedom of Information 
Act, the Coast Guard 
received a call at 9:30 
p.m. requesting a water 
search for Matouk 
Romain. Coast Guard 
helicopters, divers and 
boats arrived on the 
scene before 10 p.m. 
and engaged in an all-
hands-on-deck type 
search. 

JoAnn Matouk 
Romain wasn’t found for 
another two months and 
eight days. Her body 
was fi nally discovered 
fl oating in another coun-
try in late March 2010. 

The confl icting time-

line was the fi rst in a 
long line of factors in 
the circumstances sur-
rounding the suspicious 
death of the 55-year-old 
devout Catholic and 
homemaker and mother 
that don’t make sense 
and have resulted in 
allegations of a wide-
reaching conspiracy to 
cover up a crime that 
remains, dubiously yet 
offi cially, ruled a suicide.

“Things don’t add up 
and that hits anybody 
looking into this with an 
objective mind right off 
the bat, you don’t have 
to scratch deep here to 
see the injustice,” says 
Matouk Romain estate 
attorney Keith Altman. 
“It’s like the old Occam’s 
Razor theory, when 
faced with a situation, 
the simplest explanation 
is usually the correct 
one. Knowing every-
thing we know about 
JoAnn and the situation 
that night, there’s no 
reason to believe she 
went into the water, that 
she ever would want to 
kill herself, but that’s 
the immediate conclu-

sion that is made by 
police. That doesn’t pass 
the smell test; that’s not 
the logical conclusion to 
come to, and they came 
to it in the bat of an eye-
lid, the snap of a fi nger.” 

U.S. District Judge 
Linda Parker called the 
disputed facts in the 
Matouk Romain case 
“very disturbing” and 
certain aspects of the 
investigation “somewhat 
suspicious” in her 2018 
opinion dismissing the 
family’s wrongful death 
lawsuit brought against 
a number of individuals, 
including offi cials at the 
highest levels of two 
Grosse Pointe public 
safety departments and 
a decorated detective for 
the Wayne County 
Prosecutor’s Offi ce 
under Kym Worthy. 

Despite Parker’s res-
ervations, she tossed the 
case. The higher court 
would go on to back her 
up. Still, Matouk 
Romain’s immediate 
family continues to fi ght 
for and demand 
answers.

Grosse Pointe Farms 

police declared Matouk 
Romain dead of a sui-
cide the very same night 
she vanished by the 
water 10 years and 10 
months ago. Actually, 
according to the depart-
ment itself, the case was 
determined a suicide 
within minutes of arriv-
ing on the scene, with 
nothing to go on but a 
car that was left parked 
at St. Paul’s. 

Detectives theorized 
that Matouk Romain 
entered the icy water 
and drowned herself. 
They claim there were 
women’s shoe footprints 
leading from the park-
ing lot to the water 
embankment; however 
the crime scene photos 
showed no such inden-
tations in the snow. Her 
daughters and the pri-
vate investigators 
retained to work the 
case for the family 
doubt 4-foot-10, 165-
pound mother of three 
would have been able to 
navigate herself into the 
water on the jagged, 
rocky terrain, let alone 
wade or swim the 
approximately 400 yards 
of frigid Lake St. Clair 
to where the water 
would be over her head 
in order to drown.

There was no body for 
going on three months, 
but the police in Grosse 
Pointe Farms insisted 
she killed herself by 
going into the water due 
to a mental illness she 
had no history of. 
Family members 
hounded the police to 
look for their mother 
throughout January, 
February and most of 
March 2010, but they 
were continually 
rebuffed. The case 
became a game of hot 
potato and moved from 
the Farms, where she 
went missing from, to 
Grosse Pointe Woods 
where she lived, to the 
Michigan State Police. 
The FBI took a cursory 
look at the case by inter-
viewing JoAnn Matouk 
Romain’s daughters and 
an eyewitness.  

On March 20, 2010, 
Matouk Romain’s frozen 
body was found by 
Canadian fi shermen. It 
was fl oating in the 
Boblo Island side of the 
Detroit River. A 
Canadian autopsy found 
no evidence of foul play.

The story stood: It was 
a suicide. But was it?

A private autopsy con-
ducted by a pathologist 
at the University of 
Michigan said otherwise 
and showed her death to 
be a “dry drowning,” a 
condition that occurs in 
1 to 2 percent of drown-
ings, according to 
WebMD, where vocal 
cords spasm,  close up 
and shut off the airways. 
There was no water in 
her lungs, which could 
also mean she was dead 
before she even hit the 
water. 

Crime-scene expert 
Sal Rastrelli, hired by 
Matouk Romain’s family 
to analyze the case, dis-
putes the notion that the 
currents in Lake St. 

COURTESY PHOTO

JoAnn Matouk Romain



GROSSE POINTE NEWS, OCTOBER 15, 2020

SPECIAL REPORT  |  9A 

A9

Clair that winter at the 
location police claim she 
entered the water would 
have been strong 
enough to push her to 
Canada (where she was 
eventually found almost 
11 weeks later). He also 
questions how her body 
was in such good condi-
tion.

“The water in that 
area was much shal-
lower than usual that 
year, and there was no 
current at the time she’s 
alleged to have entered 
the water,” he said. 
“JoAnn could not have 
been on the bottom of 
the lake for three miles, 
traversed the Detroit 
River for another 23 
miles, without damage 
to her clothes or body. 
There would have cer-
tainly been damage; her 
body would have been 
tumbling and bouncing 
off submerged objects. 

“The fact that her 
body was frozen would 
have meant she stayed 
on the water’s bottom 
until the weather got 
much warmer. The lack 
of damage to the body 
indicates she didn’t 
travel very far, certainly 
not 30 miles. And it’s 
very unlikely that her 
body would have ended 
up near Boblo Island, 
considering the currents 
and the fact that she 
would have most likely 
gotten trapped on one of 
the aforementioned 
objects. I believe her 
body got into the water 
at a completely different 
site.” 

Haunting 
questions

Who would want to do 
harm to the docile and 
devout JoAnn Matouk 
Romain, a homemaker 
known for mothering 
the whole neighborhood 
and frequently attending 
church services? 

According to some, it 
was members of her 
own family. Members 
about whom she had 
voiced concerns to sev-
eral people in the weeks 
leading up to her going 
missing. One family 
member who, if you 
believe an eyewitness 
account from the night 
Matouk Romain van-
ished, was spotted at the 
scene of her disappear-
ance. 

And what did her 
estranged husband, 
David Romain, who is 
currently married to his 
ex-wife’s best friend, 
know?

Why did the cops close 
the investigation, for all 
intents and purposes, 
before even opening it, 
declaring it a suicide 
immediately with no 
sign of a body or reason 
to think she was sui-
cidal? Why didn’t the 
feds get involved, con-
sidering the circum-
stances or when the 
body wound up in a dif-
ferent country?   

These are the haunting 
and disturbing questions 
that still remain unan-
swered a decade later. 
And, from a law enforce-

ment perspective, it 
doesn’t appear that there 
is any sense of urgency in 
fi nally getting to the bot-
tom of things.

No search warrants 
were sought. No grand 
juries were convened. 
The frustration is palpa-
ble.

“The fact that we’re 
more than 10 years 
removed from JoAnn’s 
death and that it’s still 
offi cially ruled a suicide 
and there hasn’t been a 
full-blown local and fed-
eral investigations into 
what should have been 
viewed as a kidnapping 
and murder all along, is 
inconceivable to me,” 
Solomon Radner, another 
Matouk Romain estate 
attorney says. “I literally 
can’t believe it. It’s outra-
geous.”

Family feud
Woods Wholesale Fine 

Wine & Spirits in Grosse 
Pointe Woods has been a 
staple for residents in the 
Pointes for more than a 
half-century. Located on 
Mack Avenue just north 
of Vernier, the quaint-
looking liquor store was 
opened by William and 
Louise Matouk, in 1954 
and became known as a 
friendly stop for any 
Pointers planning a party 
or hosting a family din-
ner.

The Matouks were 
Syrian and settled in 
Grosse Pointe Woods to 
raise a family. The couple 
produced fi ve children: 
Bill, Rosemary, JoAnn, 
John and Kathy. The 
eldest siblings, Bill and 
Rosemary, followed their 
parents into the family 
business and went to 
work at the wine shop. 
The Matouks built a for-
tune in rare wine —sell-
ing and trading vintage 
bottles of cabernets, mus-
cat and pinot noir to and 
with the Pointes’ elite — 
and purchasing real 
estate.

JoAnn Matouk married 
Dave Romain in 1980 
after meeting him 
through her sister 
Rosemary Matouk-Hage’s 
husband. Romain co-
owns Empire Foods, a 
wholesale food distribu-
tor company. His family 
was from Lebanon. The 
newlywed couple nested 
near JoAnn Matouk 
Romain’s parents in the 
Woods and had three chil-
dren, two girls and a boy: 
Michelle, Kellie and 
Michael. 

By all accounts, Matouk 
Romain looked after a 
calm, happy home. 
Trouble began brewing 
immediately following the 
Matouk siblings’ parents 
being out of the picture. 

William Matouk died in 
1988. Louise Matouk 
passed away in 1994, 
leaving the store and an 
estimated $20 million 
estate to be divided 
amongst her fi ve chil-
dren, according to court 
documents.

Problems arose almost 
instantly.

A battle over the estate 
erupted. The early seeds 
of a nuclear meltdown in 
peace and civility were 
fi rmly planted within 
days, possibly even 
hours, after Louise 
Matouk’s death 26 years 
ago, per court records 
and interviews with the 
family. Distributing the 
assets from the will 
devolved into an all-out 
war, rife with animosity, 
allegations of theft, 
deceit, signs of sabotage 
and piles of contentious 
litigation.

Bill Matouk and 
Rosemary Matouk-Hage 
were given Woods 
Wholesale Fine Wine & 
Spirits, and the eldest 
son, Bill, was made exec-
utor of the estate. 
According to civil court 
fi lings, JoAnn and John 
Matouk never received 
their fair share of the 
estate and accused Bill 
Matouk and Rosemary 
Matouk-Hage of stealing 
millions. 

JoAnn and John 
Matouk fi led a 1998 law-
suit, and by the beginning 
of the 2000s had settled 
for $600,000 apiece in 
back payment. 

Court records in the 
civil suit allege Bill 
Matouk and Rosemary 
Matouk-Hage forged 
JoAnn Matouk Romain’s 
signature on documents 
allowing her inheritance 
to be put into the stock 
market. Bill Matouk was 
removed as executor of 
the estate and replaced 
with attorney George 
Haddad, a family friend 
of William and Louise 
Matouk. JoAnn Matouk 
Romain declined to pur-
sue criminal charges 
against her siblings.

Bill Matouk declined to 
go on the record for the 
story. Rosemary Matouk-
Hage did not return 
phone messages.

The bitterness of the 
dispute lingered through 
the next decade, with icy 
tension marking relations 
between the siblings, 
some of which had been 
bubbling under the sur-
face since childhood, 
according to people famil-
iar with the Matouk fam-
ily dynamics. John and 
Bill Matouk had been 
bickering rivals since 
their days as kids.

Some point to jealousy.  
“They never had a good 

relationship,” says one 

family friend. “The 
resentment that exists 
there was there long 
before their parents 
passed away and their 
sister ended up dead. It 
was jealousy and resent-
ment from Day One.”

John Matouk’s attor-
ney, Robert Davis, puts it 
more bluntly:

“John was a football 
star and Bill was shaped 
like a football, that’s 
about the only thing those 
two have ever had in 
common.”

What is known for cer-
tain is that while Bill 
Matouk took over the 
store from his parents, 
John Matouk set off to 
make his own mark as an 
entrepreneur. And he 
encountered a tremen-
dous amount success. 

At least, early on.   
In the 1990s, John 

Matouk founded 
Remtech, an environ-
mental clean-up com-
pany, and made a small 
fortune of his own from 
the contracts he secured 
as the nation’s economic 
welfare boomed. He was 
named to Crain’s Detroit 
Business magazine’s 
prestigious “40 under 40” 
list in 1995. But John 
Matouk had demons of 
his own that arose in the 
years after his initial suc-
cesses. 

A series of bad, ill-
timed fi nancial invest-
ments, several fallouts 
with business partners 
and friends and a severe 
downturn in the U.S. 
economy of the late 
2000s, put him on the 
ropes. Rumors of unpaid 
gambling debts surfaced. 
He was indicted and con-
victed of a $25,000 check-
kiting scam out of Wayne 
County Circuit Court. 

“The tide turned 
quickly against John,” 
claims one mutual 
acquaintance of the 
brothers. “He was riding 
high for a bit, then a lot of 
dirty laundry got aired 
and bridges were 
burned.”

John Matouk blames 
his brother, Bill, and his 
cousin, Tim Matouk, a 
longtime police offi cer in 
the area who has worked 
for multiple departments 
through the years, for his 
misfortune.

“All of my business 
problems have come by 
way of Bill and Tim 
Matouk,” he says today. 
“They poisoned the well, 
told lies, pulled strings 
and turned people against 
me.” 

The spite continued to 
grow and manifest well 
after the dispute over the 
will had been settled.

JoAnn Matouk Romain 
and John Matouk claimed 
in their lawsuit related to 

the will and estate that 
Bill Matouk and 
Rosemary Matouk-Hage 
went to the family house 
and took bundles of cash 
their mother had kept 
hidden and put it in their 
pockets, neglecting to 
share the loose currency 
with the other three sib-
lings. The fi ngers never 
stopped pointing after 
that. 

Besides a trip to 
Florida, where the 
Romain and Matouk fam-
ilies vacationed sepa-
rately, but met for a few 
meals in the winter of 
2006, communications 
were, for all intents and 
purposes, broken off. 
Between 2007 and the 
end of 2009, Matouk 
Romain didn’t speak a 
single word to Bill 
Matouk or Rosemary 
Matouk-Hage. 

That all changed 
approaching the end of 
2009 when Matouk 
Romain called Bill 
Matouk and told him she 
wanted to speak to him 
about their cousin, Tim 
Matouk. They met at the 
store on Dec. 30. Matouk 
Romain drove herself.

Bill and Tim Matouk, 
the latter at the time a 
Harper Woods police offi -
cer assigned to the 
COMET drug task force, 
were close. Tim Matouk 
and Matouk Romain were 
not.

And it was pretty clear, 
at least by the conclusion 
of 2009, why. Maybe not 
the exact reason, but the 
distaste Matouk Romain 
held for Tim Matouk was 
intense and becoming 
more and more public. 
She was terrifi ed of him 
and let people know. A 
line in the sand had been 
drawn and the cousins 
were on opposite sides.

A metro Detroit native, 
Scott M. Burnstein is an 
author, investigative 
reporter and historian 
who has published six 
books on the subject of 
organized crime. He has 
his law degree from 
University of Illinois-
Chicago and does fre-
quent talks and national 
media appearances 
related to mob activity in 
North America. His work 
can be read at gangster
report.com and in The 
Oakland Press-Macomb 
Daily.

Tips on the Matouk 
Romain case may be sent 
to burnsteinscott@gmail.
com

This investigative story 
was made possible by a 
Journalism Emergency 
Relief Fund grant from 
Google News Initiative.

Part two of the three 
part series will appear 
next week.

DRONE PHOTO BY JACK RYAN/SKYVIEW AERIAL PRODUCTIONS

This view from St. Paul Catholic Church, where JoAnn Matouk Romain attended Mass the night she disappeared, shows where she had parked the 2008 Lexus 
she was driving and the route she allegedly took to get to the seawall, according to police.

PHOTO BY RENEE LANDUYT

Woods Wholesale Wine was opened by William and 
Louise Matouk in 1954 and operated by siblings Bill 
Matouk and Rosemary Matouk-Hage.
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The regular meeting 
of the Grosse Pointe 
Public School System 
Board of Education Oct. 
12, held in Brownell 
Middle School’s audito-
rium, was the fi rst in-
person meeting since 
March 9, after which the 
governor ’s executive 
order required public 
meetings to be held vir-
tually due to the new 
coronavirus. All board 
meetings have been 
conducted virtual ly 
since April 13.

Effective Oct. 9, up to 
500 people are permit-
ted to attend indoor 
social gatherings in 
R e g i o n  1 ,  w h i c h 
includes Grosse Pointe.

GPPSS limited atten-
dance to 160 people, 
including board mem-
bers, administration 
and support staff, to 
allow social distancing. 
A l l  p r e s e n t  w e r e 
required to wear face 
masks and maintain six 
feet from anyone not 
l iving in the same 

household, according to 
instructions on the dis-
trict website.

The meeting opened 
with a report on the fi rst 
day of students’ return 
to elementary school 
bu i ld ings .  Monday 
marked the fi rst day of a 
hybrid roll-out, with 
Young 5, fi rst- and sec-

ond-grade students 
beginning in-person 
instruction on alternat-
ing days in two cohorts.

On Monday, Oct. 19, 
third and fourth graders 
will join the younger 
students in the elemen-
tary school buildings 
and fifth graders will 
have the opportunity to 

learn the ins and outs of 
the middle school build-
ings before they are 
joined by sixth-, sev-
enth- and eighth-grade 
students.

“Today, I had the 
opportunity to visit all 
seven schools,” said Jon 
Dean, deputy superin-
tendent for educational 

services. “I wandered 
into over 40 teachers’ 
classrooms and I want 
to tell you what I saw. 
First, I think I saw a lot 
of smiles. I put ‘I think’ 
there because we were 
all wearing masks … I 
saw lots of staff mem-
bers having really posi-
tive interactions with 

each another, excited to 
see their kids. It was 
kind of a unique time 
because it was the fi rst 
day of school, but these 
cohorts and these kids 
and these teachers have 
been together (online) 
for about five weeks 
now.”

Mason Elementary 
School Principal Roy 
Bishop shared his per-
spective on the stu-
dents’ excitement to be 
back in the building and 
the support he received 
from the community.

“It was very refresh-
ing today to be able to 
have kids within a build-
ing, to see the interac-
t i o n  b e t w e e n  a 
community, between 
our staff, between our 
students,” Bishop said. 
“... To have half the 
amount of students we 
normally have, we had a 
chance to be able to 
build more relation-
ships, to be able to go 
deeper on some of the 
content. … I had one 
student say to me, 
‘Thank you for letting 
me come today.’”

By Mary Anne Brush
Staff Writer

Monday night live at the board meeting

PHOTO BY RENEE LANDUYT

Mason Elementary School Principal Roy Bishop updated board members on the fi rst cohort of students’ 
return to the school building for face-to-face learning.

An employment dis-
crimination case against 
the Grosse Pointe Public 
School System filed 
nearly four years ago 
will be tried in front of a 
jury after both parties 
were unable to reach a 
settlement.

In Redlin v. GPPSS, 
Debra Redlin, an assis-
tant principal at Parcells 
Middle School, filed a 
complaint Nov. 15, 2016, 
in the U.S. District Court 
Eastern District  of 
Michigan Southern 
Division, alleging she 
was  d i sc r imina ted 
against due to her gen-
d e r  a n d  s e x u a l l y 
harassed in violation of 
Title VII and Michigan’s 
El l iott -Larsen Civi l 
Rights Act during the 
2014-15 school year 
while an assistant prin-
cipal at Grosse Pointe 
South and was trans-
ferred to Parcells for the 
2015-16 school year as 
retaliation for filing a 
complaint. She also 
alleged discrimination 
for taking leave under 
the Family Medical 
Leave Act.

After discovery, the 
district filed a motion 
for summary judgment 

on all claims and Redlin 
dismissed her sexual 
harassment claims in 
her response to this 
motion.

On May 10, 2018, 
Senior U.S. District 
Judge  Bernard  A . 
Friedman ruled in the 
district’s favor, dismiss-

ing all claims and con-
cluding “no reasonable 
jury could fi nd that (the) 
defendant discriminated 
or retaliated against 
(the) plaintiff based on 
her gender or because 
she took leave.”

Redlin fi led an appeal 
with the U.S. Court of 
Appeals for the Sixth 
Circuit. In a ruling April 
16, 2019, the court 
reversed the district 
court  judgment on 
Redlin’s claims that 
GPPSS discriminated 
against her based on her 
gender and retaliated 
against her, and affi rmed 
its ruling on Redlin’s 
Family Medical Leave 

Act retaliation claim, 
stating Redlin “has not 
shown a genuine issue 
of material fact as to 
Defendant taking any 
adverse employment 
against her after her 
FMLA leave.”

The ultimate question, 
according to the opin-

ion, “is whether the evi-
dence  presen ts  a 
sufficient factual dis-
agreement to require 
submission of the case 
to the jury, or whether 
the evidence is so one-
sided that the moving 
parties should prevail as 
a matter of law.”

To show discrimina-
tion, Redlin needed to 
demonstrate she was a 
member of a protected 
class, was qualifi ed for 
her job, suffered an 
adverse employment 
decis ion and “was 
replaced by a person 
outside the protected 
class or treated differ-
ently than similarly situ-

ated non-protected 
employees.”

Once this was demon-
strated, the burden 
shifted to the defendant 
to articulate some legiti-
mate, nondiscrimina-
tory reason for the 
adverse employment 
action.

“Should the defendant 
do so,” according to the 
opinion, “the plaintiff 
then must prove by a 
preponderance of the 
evidence that the stated 
reasons were a pretext 
for discrimination.”

In providing the back-
ground for the case, the 
opinion reviewed how 
Redlin received a “mini-
mally effective” rating 
for  t ipp ing  of f  a 
coworker about a nega-
tive evaluation. Despite 
similar conduct, Terry 
Flint, also an assistant 
principal at South at the 
time, received an “effec-
tive” review. Redlin was 
asked to resign as a 
result  of  this and 
another indiscretion and 
was transferred. 

“Despite his similar 
indiscretions, Flint was 

never asked to resign or 
transferred,” the court 
wrote. “The explana-
tions given for the dif-
ference in treatment 
suggest pretext, inas-
much as the explana-
tions do not rationally 
explain the difference, 
and a jury could reason-
ably reject the stated 
reasons and find that 
the difference in treat-
ment was motivated by 
gender discrimination.”

Similarly, the court 
concluded the district’s 
stated reasons for its 
adverse employment 
actions against Redlin 
did not justify the disci-
plinary actions and that 
Redlin provided “suffi -
cient evidence from 
which a jury could rea-
sonably reject” the 
defendant’s explana-
tion, creating a “genuine 
issue of material fact as 
to whether Defendant’s 
reasons were pretex-
tual.”

After affi rming in part 
and reversing in part the 
district court’s grant of 
the defendant’s motion 
for summary judgment, 
the  appeals  court 
remanded the case for 
trial by jury. 

The parties did not 
reach a resolution dur-
ing a May 13 telephonic 
settlement conference 
with a magistrate judge. 
A trial date has not been 
set.

Parties may request 

the magistrate judge’s 
additional involvement 
in settlement discus-
sions in the future, 
according to court docu-
ments.

Given the priority of 
criminal cases over civil 
in the federal court sys-
tem, Redlin’s attorney, 
Robert Palmer, doesn’t 
expect the trial to take 
place before late 2021.

“We are perfectly pre-
pared and ready to go to 
trial whenever the court 
system fi gures out when 
to do it in the middle of 
this COVID age,” he 
said, “but we’ve also 
contacted the school 
system on numerous 
occasions to try to talk 
about resolutions and 
have been unable to get 
any kind of concrete 
offer or position.

“In the meantime, 
Debra is doing a fi ne job 
over at Parcells,” he 
added.

“The settlement con-
ference was in May,” 
Mark McInerney, attor-
ney for the school dis-
trict, confi rmed. “It did 
not settle the case. It left 
open the possibility of 
se t t l ing  the  case . 
Nothing is scheduled at 
the moment. There is no 
trial date. That is the 
last step in the process 
that there will be a jury 
trial, but nobody quite 
knows when that is 
going to happen.

“I haven’t given up the 
notion that it might set-
tle,” he added, “but 
we’re also ready when 
the time comes to go to 
trial.”

Redlin case proceeds to jury trial
By Mary Anne Brush
Staff Writer

The ultimate question, according to the opinion, ‘is whether 
the evidence presents a suffi cient factual disagreement to 
require submission of the case to the jury, or whether the 
evidence is so one-sided that the moving parties should 
prevail as a matter of law.’
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There’s a smattering of 
purple ribbons decorating 
trees and front doors 
throughout the Grosse 
Pointes.

It’s the hope of one 
Grosse Pointe family that 
curious passersby stop 
and ask what those rib-
bons represent.

“Paint the Town Purple” 
is the fi rst fundraiser for 
the newly formed 501(c)3, 
The Audrey Eckert 
Foundation. Named for 
the infant daughter of 
Grosse Pointe Farms resi-
dents Robert and Raleigh 
Eckert, the foundation not 
only bears her name, but 
also raises funds in her 
memory.

“Audrey was born in 
May with hypoplastic left 
heart syndrome, which
is a condition where
only the right side of the 

heart is working,” Raleigh 
Eckert said. “She was 
born at  CS Mott 
(Hospital), who has the 
best team in the world to 
treat hypoplastic left heart 
syndrome. She was also 
diagnosed with Jacobsen’s 
Syndrome, which caused 
a lot of complications.”

While at Mott, Audrey 
underwent three open-
heart surgeries before she 
was three weeks old. She 
passed away June 6.

In an effort to raise 
awareness of both HLH 
and Jacobsen’s Syndrome, 
as well as to honor “the 
amazing team” who 

treated Audrey at Mott, 
the Eckerts formed
The Audrey Eckert 
Foundation. During their 
stay at Mott, Eckert 
explained, the pandemic 
made it impossible for 
family to visit.

“These doctors and 
nurses and staff became 
our families,” she said. 
“We wanted to do some-
thing to honor them. And 
once Audrey passed, we 
knew we wanted to do 
something for other fami-
lies like ours.”

The foundation will 
fund research for 
Jacobsen’s Syndrome, a 
rare chromosomal disor-
der. So rare, in fact, there 
were only 200 docu-
mented cases, Eckert 
said. Audrey was case 
201. A second goal of the 
foundation is to partner 
with CS Mott to create a 

By Jody McVeigh
Editor

Foundation hopes to ‘Paint the Town Purple’

PHOTOS COURTESY OF MADISON DETTLINGER

Purple ribbons are being sold by the Audrey Eckert 
Foundation to raise awareness of hypoplastic left 
heart syndrome and Jacobsen’s Syndrome.

Last week, more than 
2,000 volunteers part-
nered with the Detroit 
nonprofi t Life Remodeled 
to participate in its 
annual Six Day Project. 
Among them, a group of 
nearly 30 Grosse Pointe 
residents put their effort 
and energy into revitaliz-
ing the block of Quincy, 
between Collingwood 
and Boston.

“The neighborhood is 
possibly halfway vacant 
lots where houses have 
been torn down, proba-
bly a few more that 
should be torn down and 
some other occupied 
houses,” said Sue Acton, 
coordinator of outreach 
ministries at Grosse 
Pointe Memorial Church. 
“The neighborhoods Life 
Remodeled chose this 
year are blocks that had 

been cleaned up in previ-
ous drives, but had over-
grown trees and shrubs 
and grass that needed 
cutting. It’s overwhelm-
ing for the few people 
left on the block to han-
dle everything.”

This year’s team was 
onsite the afternoon of 
Oct. 8. This is the fourth 
year a group from 
Memorial Church has 
participated, though the 
local effort extends 
beyond the church and 

includes members of 
Grosse Pointe Rotary 
Club and Christ Church 
Grosse Pointe, among 
others.

This was the fi rst year 
Grosse Pointe Farms res-
ident Jane Fox partici-
pated. She co-chaired 
the event with Julie 
Huellmantel of Grosse 
Pointe Park.

“It was very rewarding 
and in my opinion, the 
event went very well,” 
Fox said. “We had volun-
teers in age from a teen-
ager to a couple in their 
80s. Everyone found 
their niche where they 
were comfortable work-
ing on the block.”

Huellmantel, who has 
been a team leader four 
years, said she was 
pleased with the way the 
event turned out.

“Despite the reduced 
number of participants, 
it was still a great day,” 
she said.

Acton said some of her 
regular  vo lunteers 
passed on this year’s 
event due to concerns 
over COVID-19.

Precaut ions were 
taken, she assured, add-
ing she was encouraged 
by the nearly 30 who did 
volunteer.

“Life Remodeled is an 
amazing organization,” 
she said. “The way they 
could pivot to do a 
COVID-safe event is 
amazing. They did 50 
blocks over this week.”

Some changes made to 
ensure health and safety 
included skipping the 
group sign-in and having 
online registration only; 
skipping a lunch and 
offering only afternoon 
work hours; sanitizing 
tools at the end of each 
day; wearing masks and 
gloves; and staying 10 
feet apart.

“The tools were set out 
on the corner of the 
block you’re working 
on,” Acton said. “They’d 
all been cleaned from the 
day before. … We were 
asked to pick one tool to 
use for the day, too.

“Our  group was 
assigned one block,” she 
added. “The job was to 
spread out and get things 

done in a safe way.”
“Since there were 26 of 

us working in a big block 
area, staying 10 feet 
apart was not a big prob-
lem,” Fox said. “We each 
had sanitized tools we 
used to tackle a specifi c 
job, whether it was mow-
ing or weeding or pick-
ing up trash or trimming 
or clearing out debris 
from around a house.”

Fo x  s a i d  L i f e 
Remodeled representa-
tives checked on volun-
teers throughout the day, 
offering water and mak-
ing sure everyone had 
the equipment they 
needed.

“They were very will-
ing to accommodate our 
needs,” she said.

Though the team spent 
the day mowing lawns 
and clearing brush, 
Acton noted they didn’t 
need to clear away loads 
of garbage like in years 
past, when neighbor-
hoods were used as 
dumping grounds for old 
tires and other unwanted 
items.

“That feels good,” she 
said.

Huellmantel noted 
while last year’s scope 
included clearing out 
alleyways in the blocks 
surrounding the Durfee 
Innovation Society, 
where Life Remodeled is 
headquartered, this year, 
the plan involved front 
yards.

“On the block, we had 
10 to 12 houses,” 
Huellmantel said. “Six of 
them had people living in 
them. We wanted to 
make sure the people liv-
ing there felt safe. We 
cleared brush from the 
street all the way to the 

By Jody McVeigh
Editor

Group revisits, resuscitates overgrown block

PHOTO COURTESY OF JULIE HUELLMANTEL

Grosse Pointe volunteers socially distance for a group photo with Life Remodeled CEO Chris Lambert, 
center.

PHOTOS COURTESY OF SUE ACTON

Left, volunteer John Mozena mows a lawn. Right, volunteer Holly Cory takes a 
break with fellow workers, Mike Huellmantel and Julie Huellmantel.

See PURPLE, page 4B

See REVISIT, page 3B

Audrey Eckert wears her “signature” purple bow.

101520

Integrity. Heritage. Lifestyle.

2019 Top Producer at Higbie Maxon Agney.

Darlene D’Amico
darlene@higbiemaxon.com
313-886-3400
586-909-7767
higbiemaxon.com

101520

96 Kercheval Avenue • On-the-Hill
Grosse Pointe Farms, MI 48236sir.com 313.888.8800



GROSSE POINTE NEWS, OCTOBER 15, 2020

2B  |  FEATURES

B2OBITS

Joseph J. 
McDonnell

Joseph Jerome “Jerry” 
McDonnell, 66, passed 
away Friday, Oct. 9, 
2020. 

The eldest of seven 
children, he was born 
Apr i l  2 ,  1954 ,  to
Joseph J. and Nancy 
McDonnell.

Jerry is survived by 
h i s  ador ing  wi fe , 
Rebecca (nee Forbes); 
loving children, Jane 
(Ted Watts) and Joseph 
J.  “Jerry”;  beloved 
grandson, Irving; and 
loving mother, Nancy. 
He will be dearly missed 
by his siblings and their 
spouses ,  Lee  Ann 
H a r k a w a y  ( Pa u l ) , 
Patricia Convertino (the 
late John), Cathleen 
Diehl (John), Timothy 
(Andrea), Sheila Roarty 
(John) and Michael 
(Jill); mother-in-law, 
Jane Forbes; and sister-
in-law, Nancy Leonard 
(Robert). Jerry also was 
uncle to 21 nieces and 
nephews to whom he 
always showed genuine 
interest in what they 
were studying or doing 
at work.

A lifetime resident of 
Detroit’s east side, Jerry 
attended St. Clare of 
M o n t e f a l c o  g r a d e 
school. He graduated 
from University of 
Detroit Jesuit High 
School, the University 
of Michigan and Wayne 
State University Law 
School. 

In his 40-year legal 
career, Jerry repre-
sented railroads in all 
aspects of personal 
injury litigation at law 
f i r m s  D u r k i n , 
McDonnell, Clifton & 
O’Donnel l  PC and 
Gallagher Sharp LLP.

Jerry’s greatest love 
was spending time with 
his family and doting on 
his grandson. 

His numerous inter-
ests included hunting 
and fi shing, music, fi lm, 
cooking and bread bak-
ing. 

A private graveside 
service will be held at 
Resurrection Cemetery 
in Clinton Township.

Memorial contribu-
tions may be made to 
Loyola High School at 
loyoladetroit.org; or U 
of D Jesuit High School 
at uofdjesuit.org.

Susan Ruth 
Stewart Brenner
Grosse Pointe Woods 

resident Susan Ruth 
Stewart Brenner, 73, 
passed away Friday, 
Oct. 9, 2020, at home 
surrounded by dear 
friends, after a coura-
geous battle with can-
cer. 

She was born Jan. 14, 
1947, in Detroit, to 
James and Ruth Stewart 
(nee Scheldenbran), 
both now deceased.

Raised in Harper 
Woods, Susan gradu-
ated from Harper Woods 
High School. She pur-
sued her passion for 
teaching and earned a 
bachelor’s degree from 
M i c h i g a n  S t a t e 
University. 

Susan returned to 
Harper Woods and 
became a fourth-grade 
teacher. She was dedi-
cated to her students’ 
success and always 
strived to help each stu-
dent reach their full 
potential. She remained 

a teacher to many peo-
ple even after she 
retired.

Susan loved adven-
ture and traveled to 
many places in the U.S. 
and Europe. She also 
loved collecting memo-
rabilia from her travels, 
as well as angels and 
antiques. A great ani-
mal and nature lover, 
Susan enjoyed spring-
time visits by backyard 
ducks, monarch butter-
flies and her precious 
dogs that predeceased 
her, Buffy and Maxi.  

Susan’s friends said 
she will be remembered 
for always lending a 
helping hand where 
needed and her contri-
butions to society will 
be greatly missed. 

Susan was the loving 
wife of the late James 
Brenner.

A funeral liturgy was 
held Oct. 14, at St. Clare 
of Montefalco Catholic 
Church, Grosse Pointe 
Park.

In lieu of flowers, 
memorial contributions 
in Susan’s name may be 
made to Detroit Dog 
R e s c u e ,  P. O.  B o x 
806119, St. Clair Shores, 
MI 48080; or Almost 
Home No Kill Shelter, 
P.O. Box 250602, West 
Bloomfield, MI 48325; 
or I Heart Dogs Rescue 
and Animal Haven, 
22415 Groesbeck Hwy., 
Warren, MI  48089. 

Evelyn E. 
Livingston

Evelyn E. Livingston 
(nee Dowd) passed 
a w a y  p e a c e f u l l y 
Monday, Oct. 5, 2020, at 
home. The youngest of 
11 children born to 
James Patrick and 
Sarah  Dowd (nee 
McHugh), she was 93.

She was predeceased 
by her parents and sib-
lings, Gerald, James, 
John, Thomas, Eleanor 
Hawthorne, Kathleen, 
Margaret, Geraldine, 
Sister Winifred, IHM, 
and Helen Flanagan. 
Evelyn is survived by 
her loving children, 
K a t h l e e n  C u c c h i 
(Rober t ) ,  Maureen 
Moseley (Douglas) , 
James P. Livingston, 
John M. Livingston, 
William E. Livingston 
(Jill) and Timothy J. 
Livingston; and grand-
children, Robert Cucchi 
Jr. (Vanessa), Devon 
Moseley (Joey Fandel), 
Kevin  Moseley, Patrick 
M. Livingston, Timothy 
J. Livingston, Colleen 
Livingston and Casey D. 
Livingston.   

Evelyn faced her fair 
share of  adversi ty 
throughout life, her 
family said. She relied 
on her Catholic faith 
and placed her trust in 
God to see her through. 
She also faced life’s 
challenges head-on with 
no excuses. Her great-
est achievement was 
raising her six dearly 
loved children.

Evelyn was a volun-
teer for many charitable 
events. Active with the 
Bon Secours Ladies 
Auxiliary after she 
retired, Evelyn worked 
alongside classmates 
from her days at St. 
Clare of Montefalco 
grade school.

A lifelong resident of 
Detroit’s east side and a 
true “east sider,” Evelyn 
never met anyone who 
did not know someone 

she also knew. She was 
a great conversational-
ist and loved to social-
ize. She also possessed 
a quick wit with an Irish 
charm and dazzled 
everyone. Her family 
said she will be sorely 
missed by all who knew 
and loved her. 

A funeral Mass was 
celebrated Friday, Oct. 
9, at St. Joan of Arc 
Catholic Church in St. 
Clair Shores.

In lieu of flowers, 
donations may be made 
to St. Jude Children’s 
Research Hospi ta l , 
s t jude .org ;  or  the 
Capuchin Soup Kitchen, 
cskdetroit.org.

Patricia Dow 
Ashurkoff

Former Grosse Pointe 
Farms resident Patricia 
Dow Ashurkoff died 
Sunday, Oct. 4, 2020, in 
Ashburn, Va., due to 
complications from a 
fall. Born in 1936, she 
was the daughter of 
Douglas and Mary 
Louise Dow and grew 
up in Detroit’s Indian 
Village neighborhood.  

Trish was affl icted in 
childhood by Perthes 
disease — a bone disor-
der affecting the hip 
joints — and spent four 
years using crutches 
and wearing a brace. 
Because of her disci-
pline with this regimen, 
Trish not only recov-
ered, but became a 
gifted athlete.  She 
played varsity lacrosse 
and captained the girls 
swim team at George 
S c h o o l ,  i n  B u c k s 
County, Pa. In summers, 
she swam at the Detroit 
Boat Club, where she 
was an interclub cham-
pion and joined the 
coaching staff .   A 
University of Michigan 
graduate and Kappa 
Alpha Theta sorority 
member, Trish joined 
the faculty and coach-
ing staff at Grosse 
Po i n t e  U n i v e r s i t y 
School and introduced 
and coached g ir ls 
lacrosse.

She met her husband, 
Peter Ashurkoff, when 
Peter came to Detroit 
for his  work with 
General Motors Co. 
Introduced by Peter’s 
Princeton roommate 
and later Grosse Pointe 
Farms mayor,  Joe 
Fromm, the couple was 
married at Mariners 
Church in 1958. They 
lived in Grosse Pointe 
Farms with their chil-
dren,  Stephen and 
Cathy, until Peter ’s 
transfer to Mexico when 
GM opened its Toluca 
plant. 

Tr i sh  and  Pe ter 
returned to Michigan 
when Peter joined the 
engineering staff at 
GM’s Buick division. 
Together they raised 
their family in Grand 
Blanc and Trish served 
throughout the commu-
nity. A board member of 
the Grand Blanc Library 
and community leader 
w i t h  t h e  F l i n t 
Environmental Action 
Team, Trish also contin-
ued as an educator 
through her service as a 
substitute teacher at 
Grand Blanc High 
School. She and Peter 
relocated to Ashburn to 
be closer to their chil-
dren and grandchildren 
after they retired.

Trish is survived by 

her husband of 62 years, 
Peter; children, Stephen 
(Ellen) of Ashburn, and 
Cathy Parnell (Terry) of 
Cocoa Beach, Fla.; three 
grandchi ldren;  and 
brothers, Bryden, Peter 
and Stuart Dow. She 
was predeceased by her 
sister, Caroline Dow 
Dykhouse.  

A memorial service 
will be held at a later 
date. 

Memorial contribu-
tions may be made to 
the Muriel E. Brock 
Campaign, University 
Liggett School, 1045 
Cook Rd., Grosse Pointe 
Woods,  MI  48236;
o r  u l s . o r g / g i v i n g /
s u r e - f o u n d a t i o n s /
muriel-e-brock-campaign. 

Christina P. 
Frederick

Grosse Pointe Woods 
resident Christina P. 
Frederick, 71, passed 
away peacefully Monday, 
Oct. 5, 2020. Born Nov. 5, 
1948, in Detroit, she was 
a loving daughter of 
Philip and Penelope 
Williams.

Christina graduated 
from Grosse Pointe High 
School in 1966. She 
earned a Bachelor of 
Arts degree in education 
and history from Eastern 
Michigan University and 
taught many years in the 
St. Clair Shores public 
school system.

Christ ina proudly 
served as a member of 
the Bon Secours Nursing 
Care Auxiliary and vol-
unteered at Ascension 
St. John Hospital. She 
enjoyed music, sewing 
and cooking.

A devout member of 
Assumpt ion  Greek 
Orthodox Church in St. 
C la i r  Shores  and 
Annunciation Greek 
Orthodox Cathedral in 
Detroit, Christina sang in 
the choir in her youth 
and attended church 
each Sunday for the 
Divine Liturgy through-
out her life. She also was 
an active member of the 
Assumption Ladies 
Philoptochos Society.

Christina was the ador-
ing wife of Robert 
Frederick. She and 
Robert were married in 
1992; all of her family, 
nieces and nephews 
served as wedding atten-
dants. During the cou-
ple’s many loving years 
together, they traveled 
throughout Europe, 
North Africa and Mexico 
and enjoyed visiting fam-
ily throughout the U.S. 
Christina especially 
enjoyed visits with her 
stepdaughters, Michelle 
Frederick and Karla 
Edelman, and visited her 
family in Texas and 
California as often as 
possible. 

Christina was an 
extraordinary aunt and 
loved being with her 13 
nieces and nephews. She 
always had treats for 
them at home and 
enjoyed taking them out 
for lunch and ice cream. 
She also was loving god-
mother to Alexia Vader 
and Alexia’s daughter, 
Penelope.

Christina is survived 
by her loving husband, 
Robert; stepdaughters, 
Michelle Frederick and 
K a r l a  E d e l m a n 
(Michael); step-grand-
children, Matt, Anna and 
L a u r e n ;  s i b l i n g s , 
Katherine Kotsis (the late 
Harry), Georgia Carson 
(the late George), 
Dorothea Williams and 
John Williams; 13 nieces 
and nephews; and 24 
great-nieces and great-
nephews. She was prede-
ceased by her parents, 
Philip and Penelope 
Williams, and brother 
and sister-in-law, George 
and Anne Williams.

A private funeral ser-
vice was held Oct. 7, at 
Assumpt ion  Greek 
Orthodox Church. Burial 
took place at Grand 
Lawn Cemetery in 
Detroit.

Richard James 
Martin

Richard James Martin, 
85, passed away peace-
fully Thursday, Oct. 8, 
2020, at his home in 
Grosse Pointe Farms. 

Born and raised in 
Detroit, Richard gradu-
ated from De La Salle 
Collegiate High School 
in 1953.

Richard had a strong 
work ethic even as a 
young man. He loved to 
tell stories about caddy-
ing for Henry Ford II at 
the Country Club of 
Detroi t ,  where he 
worked to help support 
his family during his 
high school years.

Richard began a four-
year apprenticeship at 
t h e  I n t e r n a t i o n a l 
Brotherhood of Electrical 
Workers Local 58 after 
he graduated high 
school. This launched his 
lifelong career in com-
mercial electrical con-
tracting and 67-year 
membership in the IBEW. 
He served the electrical 
contracting industry in 
numerous ways for 
decades. Hired as an 
electrical estimator by 
Motor City Electric Co. in 
1984, Richard rose 
through the ranks to 
become chief estimator 
and then vice president 
of estimating. Using his 
talent for building rela-
tionships and negotiat-
ing deals, Richard played 
an integral role in
m a k i n g  M C E  t h e
No. 1 electrical contrac-

tor in Michigan. The 
MCE team assisted in 
the construction of many 
iconic Detroit land-
m a r k s ,  i n c l u d i n g 
Comerica Park, Ford 
Field, Little Caesars 
Arena and other promi-
nent city sites.

In 1994, Richard was 
elected chairman of
the National Elect-
r i c a l  C o n t r a c t i n g 
Associat ion’s  Joint 
Apprenticeship and 
Training Committee, 
which oversaw construc-
tion of a new training 
center; here he men-
tored young electricians 
to join the industry he 
loved. He also served on 
the board of the NECA 
and remained an active 
member for  many 
decades. Considered a 
legend in his field, 
Richard enjoyed the 
friendship of many 
industry colleagues who 
describe him as loyal, 
honest and a true gentle-
man.

He and his loving wife 
of 60 years, Shirley, 
raised five children. 
Together, they traveled 
the world; their favorite 
trips were to Japan, 
Egypt and Greece.

Richard was an avid 
hunter and fisherman, 
and in recent years 
enjoyed relaxing with his 
family at their cottage on 
the south channel of 
Harsens Island. 

Richard was prede-
ceased by his wife, 
Shirley, and brother, Roy 
Martin. He is survived by 
his children, Renee 
Seago (John) of Grosse 
Pointe Shores, Debora 
Murray (Patrick) of 
Grosse Pointe Shores, 
Kelly Marshall (Brett) of 
Grosse Pointe Shores, 
Dr. Rich Martin, D.O. 
(Melissa) of Hood River, 
Ore., and Susan Martin 
of Holland; 12 grandchil-
dren, Kristina (Ryan), 
Meghan (Danny), Kelly, 
Michael, Ryan, Catherine 
( N a t h a n ) ,  R o b e r t 
(Susie), Sarah (Matt), 
Kristin, Jennifer (Alex), 
Matthew and Christopher; 
three step-grandchil-
d r e n ,  Pa t r i c k  J r. 
(Christy), Kristine (Matt) 
and Meredith; 14 great-
grandchildren; four step-
great-grandchildren; 
and several nieces and 
nephews.

A funeral Mass was 
celebrated Oct. 12, at St. 
Paul on the Lake Catholic 
Church, Grosse Pointe 
Farms. 

Donations in Richard’s 
memory may be made to 
PIME Missionaries, 
17330 Quincy St.,

Detroit, MI 48221; or 
De La Salle Collegiate, 
delasallehs.com/alumni/
support-de-la-salle.

OBITUARIES
Obituary notices are purchased and often prewritten by family or friends. While 
we try to run obituaries as submitted, we nevertheless reserve the right to edit for 
accuracy, style and length.
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See OBITS, page 3B
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houses. Now, the police 
can look down the street 
and see all that’s going 
on.”

Huellmantel noted the 
few residents on the 
block clearly are caring 
for their properties.

“Their homes are 
beautiful,” she said. 
“They have gardens that 
are beautifully kept,” but 
it ’s the abandoned 
homes and vacant lots 
that are eyesores.

She said many of the 
residents came out to 
thank volunteers for 
their efforts.

“One of my favorite 

parts is when the com-
munity members are 
also out there working,” 
Huellmantel said. “Of all 
my mission work, I enjoy 
the most working hand 
in hand with the people 
we might be helping.”

Fox agreed.
“It was heartwarming 

to work together to 
make such a difference 
on this block,” she said. 
“At one point I spoke to 
a woman who was trim-
ming in her own yard 
and took such pride in 
her property. She had 
mowed the vacant lot 
adjacent to her well-kept 
home. She was appre-
ciative of what we were 
doing on the block as it 
would help the value of 
her own property fi nan-
cially and visually as 
well.”

Since 2011,  Life 
Remodeled has worked 
to intentionally bring 
together a diverse group 
of volunteers to complete 
large-scale revitalization 
projects and encourage 
collaboration, partner-
ship and unity. 

“This year more than 
ever, we’ve seen the lack 
of unity as a country 
affect our everyday 
l ives ,”  sa id  Chr is 
Lambert, Life Remodeled 
founder and CEO. “Life 
Remodeled has been 

working to bridge people 
across divides to help 
transform each other’s 
lives since our founding 
10 years ago and in this 
current climate, we need 
activities like the Six Day 
Project where we can 
work together in a safe 
way while still making a 
signifi cant impact.”

Acton said she’s been 
pleased with a lot of the 
volunteer efforts at 
Memorial since the 
onset of the pandemic. 
The church saw nearly 
20 volunteers help 
unload food donations 
for Forgotten Harvest 
last month and is look-
ing for more help.

“ We  have  o ther 
‘Unpack the Truck’ 
events coming up at St. 
John Presbyterian,” she 
said, “on the third Friday 
for the next three 
months.”

Sign-up is available on 
the church’s website, 
gpmchurch.org.

Additionally, volun-
teers are needed to help 
donate meals for Cass 
Communi ty  Soc ia l 
Services’ homeless pop-
ulat ion.  While the 
annual Shelter Week 
event has been canceled, 
Cass is still doing its 
best to fi nd shelter for 
those who need it. In 
turn, local churches are 

asked to feed them.
“Our church members 

still will donate meals, 
which we would have 
done anyway,” Acton 
said, “and we’re having 
a cereal drive. We’re 
hoping to donate 300 
meals. It’s Oct. 30 and 
31. Cass would appreci-

ate the help.”
Lastly, Memorial also 

participates in food and 
sandwich drives for the 
newly formed nonprofi t, 
313 Calling, for which 
volunteers are needed.

“We’re doing the best 
we can to keep people 
volunteering,” she said.

PHOTOS COURTESY OF SUE ACTON

Diane Strickler, foreground, and her socially dis-
tanced co-volunteer, Dick Allison.

Co-chair Jane Fox takes a break from trimming 
bushes.

REVISIT:
Continued from page 1B

Vilma Y. Marone
Grosse Pointe Woods 

resident Vilma Y. Marone 
(nee Osborne), formerly 
of Grosse Pointe Park, 
passed away peacefully 
Saturday, Oct. 10, 2020, 
surrounded by her family. 
She was 91.

Vilma was the beloved 
wife of the late Richard; 
loving mother of Justin 
Marone (Judy), Susan 
Jones (the late Bob), Rick 
Marone (Sheila), Louise 
Gates (Chris), John 
Marone, Michael Marone 
(Nicole) and the late Ann 
Marone; dearest grand-
mother of 11; and great-
grandmother of two.  

Her loved ones noted 
that she will be remem-
bered for her love of fam-
ily.  

Vilma enjoyed listening 
to classical music, attend-
ing plays and gardening. 

Vilma will lie in state 
Friday, Oct. 16, from 
10:30 a.m. until time of 
the funeral Mass at 11 
a.m. at St. Ambrose 

Catholic Church, 15020 
Hampton, Grosse Pointe 
Park, followed by inter-
ment at Sacred Heart 
Cemetery, 18430 Utica 
Road, Roseville. Due to 
COVID-19 precautions, 
face masks must be worn, 
social distancing will be 
observed and attendees’ 
temperatures will be 
taken upon entry.  

In lieu of flowers, 
memorial contributions 
may be made to the 
Capuchin Franciscan 
Province of St. Joseph, 
thecapuchins.org; or the 
National Shrine of St. 
Jude, shrineofstjude.org.  

Share a memory at ver
heyden.org.

Noel Stephen 
Mermer

Former Grosse Pointe 
resident Noel Stephen 
Mermer died Saturday, 
Oct. 3, 2020, at his home 
in Charleston, S.C., after 
a long battle with amyo-
trophic lateral sclerosis. 
Born March 16, 1967, in 
Grosse Pointe, he was 
53.

Noel was publisher and 
co -founder of  the 
Charleston City Paper. 
While his business 
accomplishments were 
notable, he will be 
remembered most for 
being a loyal and sup-
portive father, husband, 

brother, son and friend, 
his family said.

A graduate of Michigan 
State University, Noel 
moved to Atlanta, where 
he found his calling as a 
newspaperman at the 
al ternat ive weekly, 
Creative Loafing. He 
soon was promoted to 
publisher of a new 
Creative Loafing in 
Savannah. At 26, he was 
the company’s youngest 
publisher and relished 
the role. Despite his 
young age,  Noel ’s 
uncanny ability to man-
age multiple deadlines, 
work within a strict bud-
get, inspire co-workers to 
deliver more and con-
stantly close deals was 
obvious.

N o e l  m o v e d  t o 
Charleston in 1997, 
where he realized his 
dream of starting and 
owning his own newspa-
per, the Charleston City 
Paper. He touched many 
lives in his role as pub-
lisher more than 20 
years. His family recalled 
Noel telling his City 
Paper family, “Back to 
work!” His many co-
workers considered him 

a personal mentor as well 
as a boss. They also 
recalled he enjoyed tell-
ing friends and acquain-
tances, “Not too late 
tonight,” when he left a 
social gathering. Noel 
also was well known for 
saying “Let’s take the 
high road” in diffi cult sit-
uations. He touched 
countless people’s lives, 
from family and friends 
to co-workers. People 
always knew where they 
stood with Noel, because 
his bravery and honesty 
allowed him to say 
exactly what he was 
thinking. He also had a 
big personality that lit up 
every room.

Noel married Christine 
in 2003; they were soon 
blessed with two sons, 
Noel and Bennett. He 
loved taking his sons 
deep-sea fishing and 
watching them play their 
favorite sports. An 
incredible dad, he cher-
ished every moment with 
his boys and ensured 
they share his determi-
nation, compassion, gen-
erosity and humor.

Noel is survived by his 
wife, Christine; sons, 

Noel and Bennett; sister, 
Sheila Mutz (Bryce) of 
Atlanta; nephews, Bryce 
and Blake; and in-laws, 
Suzanne Boren of Mt. 
Pleasant and Cecil Boren 
(Cindy) of Greensboro, 
N.C. He was predeceased 
by his father, Noel, in 
1992; and his mother, 
Carolyn, in 2017.

A funeral service was 
held Oct. 10, at St. 
Michael’s Church in 
Charleston. A recording 
of the service may be 
viewed at youtu.be/
J2tV5gm25kc. 

A Celebration of Life 
service will be held in 
Grosse Pointe at a later 
date.

Noel’s family intends 
to establish a nonprofi t 
organization to assist 
future ALS families with 
the costs of caregiving 
and travel. 

In lieu of fl owers, dona-
tions may be arranged by 
emailing NoelMermer
ALS@gmail.com.

Arrangements were 
handled by J. Henry 
Stuhr Inc., Charleston.

Share a memorial mes-
sage with the family at 
jhenrystuhr.com.

Vilma Y. Marone

OBITS:
Continued from page 2B

Noel Stephen Mermer

Worship
  Service

800 Vernier Road (Corner of Wedgewood)

(313) 884-5040

Rev. Sean Motley, Senior Pastor
~ “Go Make Disciples” ~

www.feelc.org

FIRST ENGLISH EVANGELICAL
   LUTHERAN CHURCH

  9:30 am - Drive-In service on Sunday
11:00 am - Inside service on Sunday
Service on youtube at FEELC-GPW and on our
facebook page First English Lutheran Church. 

Sunday 10AM services are on
Zoom Meeting online and phone
https://us02web.zoom.us/j/4105997963

415-762-9988, then enter 4105997963
AND with a Drive-in service in 

the parking lot

www.gpcong.org

Grosse Pointe
Congregational

Church
(United Church of Christ )

Grosse Pointe
UNITED METHODIST 

CHURCH

Rev. Dr. Ray McGee

      

www.facebook.com/ 
GrossePointeUMC

www.gpumc.org 
313-886-2363

Join us online for 
Sunday morning  

worship
https://gpumc.info/ 

SundayWorship

Learn more about us by 
visiting our Facebook page:

SUNDAY
8:15 & 10:45 a.m. - Worship Service

9:30 a.m. - Bible Study
10:45 a.m. - Sunday School

MONDAY
7 p.m. - Worship Service

2nd & 4th Monday of the Month
WEDNESDAY
10 a.m. - Bible Study

Randy S. Boelter, Pastor
Making New Disciples-
Building Stronger Ones

Christ the King
Lutheran Church

and Preschool
Mack at Lochmoor • 884-5090

www.christthekinggp.org

Sharing Godʼs grace through Christ, 
we love, pray, rejoice and serve.

All are welcome!

Worship Online
With Us!

Visit stpaulgp.org and
scroll to Quick Links

Select Our Youtube Channel
or Our Facebook Page

375 Lothrop at Chalfonte
Grosse Pointe Farms

313.881.6670
The Rev. Justin Dittrich

15020 Hampton
Grosse Pointe Park, 
Michigan 48230-1302

Ambrose
Saint

Catholic Church

Masses
Saturday Vigil — 4:00 p.m.
Sunday — 8:30 and 11:15 a.m.Sunday — 10:00 a.m.

101520
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lasting program for fami-
lies who experience 
extended stays at the hos-
pital.

“The foundation is also 
meant to secure Audrey’s 
legacy, because she was 
only with us for a short 
time,” said Madison 
Dettlinger, Eckert’s sister 
and a City of Grosse 
Pointe resident. “We’re 
honoring her and making 
sure her short life makes 

a big difference.”
A s  O c t o b e r  i s 

International Pregnancy 
and Infant Loss Awareness 
Month, the foundation 
started its fi rst fundraiser 
Sunday, Oct. 4. The orga-
nization is asking people 
to purchase purple rib-
bons to tie around a tree 
or hang on their front 
door, Eckert said, “to raise 
awareness of the founda-
tion and of pregnancy and 
infant loss. We hope fami-
lies who have lost chil-
dren or have had 
miscarriages will drive 

around Grosse Pointe and 
feel less alone.”

In the fi rst fi ve days of 
“Paint the Town Purple,” 
the foundation raised 
more than $5,000, for 
which the sisters are 
grateful.

“People all over Grosse 
Pointe are supporting us,” 
Eckert said. “It feels like 
Audrey is with us when 
we do that, when the 
communi ty  comes 
together to support their 
own.”

The color of the ribbons 
holds signifi cance as well. 
While Audrey was alive, 
she was hooked up to sev-
eral machines and could 
not wear clothes, but, 
“she was born with a full 
head of hair,” Eckert said. 
“To claim her as our own, 
we put hair bows on her. 
… My husband and I 
decided a long time ago 
her favorite color is pur-
ple.”

“Paint the Town Purple” 
is expected to last 
throughout October. 
Those interested in mak-
ing a suggested donation 
of $5 will receive a ribbon 
to display. Donations may 
be made online at give
butter.com/paintthetown
purpleAEF or via the 
foundation’s Facebook or 
Instagram pages. A web-
site is under construction 
and should be available 
soon as well.

“We’re so appreciative 
of everyone’s support,” 
D e t t l i n g e r  s a i d . 
“Especially now, every-
one’s so isolated with 
COVID, but we are all in 
this together. This shows 
we can come together to 
show support.”

Added Eckert, “We’re 
very thankful for every-
one who’s donated and 
we’re excited to see how 
much good it will do.”

PURPLE:
Continued from page 1B

The League of Women 
Voters of Grosse Pointe 
h a s  i n v i t e d  D r. 
Alexander Riegel to lead 
its virtual program, 
“Weaving the Fabric of 
Diversity,” at 7 p.m. 
Thursday, Oct. 22. 

The LWV is soliciting 
partners in the commu-
nity to promote its 
national and local posi-
tion for social justice. 
Dr. Riegel will address 
articulating a positive 
vision of diversity as the 
foundation of a new 
understanding of our 

common humanity. He 
also will discuss the his-
torical narratives that 
determine the present 
state of our society and 
which can determine 
the future state if no 
action is taken.

Dr. Riegel has served 
as minister of the Grosse 
Pointe Unitarian Church 
since 2015. He also is 
certifi ed in confl ict reso-
lut ion and media-
tion. He served on the 
executive committee of 
the Grosse Pointes-
Harper Woods NAACP 
Branch and is working 
with Grosse Pointe 
churches to bring social 

justice issues and out-
reach ministries to the 
forefront. Under his 
l e a d e r s h i p ,  t h e 
Unitarian Church began 
a one-year educational 
program in 2019, to 
motivate its congrega-
tion to work harder 
toward anti-racism and 
social justice.

Advanced registration 
for the live event is 
required through the 
League of Women Voters 
GP website, lwvgrosse
pointe.org/events/oct-
22-speaker/.

Freundl is a member 
of the League of Women 
Voters of Grosse Pointe.

Diversity is the topic 
for LWV Oct. 22 meeting
By Margaret Freundl
Guest Writer

The League of Women Voters of 
Grosse Pointe shares the following dates 
and information for the Nov. 3 election:  

Monday, Oct. 19, 2020 — Deadline to 
register or update voter registration 
online. Michigan’s new Voting Rights 
law allows eligible Michiganders to reg-
ister and vote up to and on Election Day. 
Note: After this deadline has passed, reg-
istration must be in person at the city 
clerk’s office, with documentation of 
identity required and proof of no fewer 
than 30 days of residency in the city or 
township where wishing to register and 
vote.

Tuesday, Oct. 20, 2020 — 
Recommended date for mailing absen-
tee ballots to ensure the ballot arrives in 
time to be counted Nov. 3. U.S. postage 
is required to submit an absentee ballot 
by mail. Note: A recent judicial ruling in 
September allows for absentee ballots 
postmarked by Nov. 2 to be counted if 
they arrive within 14 days after Election 
Day.

Friday, Oct. 30, 2020, 5 p.m. —
Deadline to request an absentee ballot 
by mail. Voters are advised to submit 
their application much earlier than this 
date to avoid the potential for mail 
delays. Voters can request an absentee 
ballot be sent to them by mail by com-
pleting an application online or down-
loading an application from the city 
clerk’s website to complete and return to 
their local clerk’s offi ce by email, mail or 
in person.

Monday, Nov. 2, 4 p.m. — Deadline for 
voters to submit, in person at the clerk’s 
offi ce, a written request to spoil their 
absentee voter ballot and receive a new 

ballot.
Tuesday, Nov. 3, 7 a.m. to 8 p.m. — 

Polls open to vote in person. Voters have 
the right to vote if in line by 8 p.m. The 
voter will be asked to show a photo ID 
when he/she checks in to vote. If the 
voter doesn’t have a photo ID, he/she can 
still vote. The poll worker will ask the 
voter to sign an affidavit before that 
explains why there’s no voter ID. All vot-
ers, including voters with disabilities, 
have access to a Voter Assist Terminal in 
all polling places. This helps the voter 
mark a ballot; once the ballot is marked, 
it is counted in the same fashion as all 
other ballots. Voters are encouraged, but 
not required, to wear a face covering 
while at a polling place.

Tuesday, Nov. 3, 8 p.m. — Deadline to 
return completed absentee ballots to a 
local approved absentee ballot drop box 
or the clerk’s offi ce. Clerk locations and 
hours may be found at the local clerk’s 
website or michigan.gov/vote. 

The League also wants all residents to 
know where the approved ballot drop 
boxes are located. All fi ve Grosse Pointes 
have drop boxes outside the respective 
municipal buildings, available 24/7 and 
up to 8 p.m. on Election Day. Harper 
Woods has an indoor ballot drop box 
available during business hours.

Additional information may be 
accessed at michigan.gov/vote website. 
The Oct. 6 recorded LWV program, 
“Making Your Mail-in-Ballot Count,” 
also may be accessed at the lwvgp.org 
website or Facebook page. In addition, 
vote411.org is an excellent resource for 
voters to view what’s on their ballot. Visit 
youtube.com/watch?v=-T7hSEKVcnk.

Know where, when, how to vote
PHOTOS COURTESY OF MICHAEL FLORIAN

ANGOTT’S

Since 1936

586-359-2123 
www.angotts.biz 101520

Cleaning  •  Sales  •  Repairs

Draperies • Blinds
Shutters • Shades

Love Local.

“Leaf” 
yourself 

time for other 
things... 

Time to prepare the yard for winter and 
prep for next year. No time? No problem! 

To place your ad now, go online or call 313-882-6900 x1

Find 
a great 
Grosse 
Pointe
gardener 
for your fall 
cleanup!

Dining
ENTERTAINMENT& 

Best
BURGERS IN TOWN!

18666 Mack Avenue
Grosse Pointe Farms
313-881-5675

Fresh Yellow Belly
LAKE PERCH DINNER

With Salad or 
Cole Slaw, Fries 

and Warm Roll
$19.95

Dine In or Carry Out
PATIO OPEN

Thank You
Frontline 
Heroes!

SEE 
MENU

y

EST. 
1980

Kennedy’s

101520

T-BONE PAXTON

Visit
dirtydogjazz.com
for more information

OCTOBER 14, 2020
AND 
OCTOBER 15, 2020

Vocalist & Trombonist

Visit
dirtydogjazz.com
for more information

OCTOBER 16, 2020
AND 
OCTOBER 17, 2020

ALEXANDER ZONJIC
Jazz Flutist

Visit
dirtydogjazz.com
for more information

GENE DUNLAP
NOVEMBER 4, 2020
THROUGH
NOVEMBER 7, 2020

Jazz Drummer

SKEETO VALDEZ

Visit
dirtydogjazz.com
for more information

OCTOBER 28, 2020
THROUGH 
OCTOBER 31, 2020

Jazz Drummer
SKEETO VALDEZ
Jazz Drummer
OCTOBER 28, 2020
THROUGH
OCTOBER 31, 2020

LIVE PERFORMANCES
have returned to the 
Dirty Dog Jazz Cafe!
Reservations Highly Recommended

In our attempt to keep our customers safe by following the state’s Covid guidelines, our capacity will be limited to 50%. 
We recommend that you call ahead so we can guarantee your reservation. For more information please visit our Facebook page.

(313) 882-5299 
97 KERCHEVAL, GROSSE POINTE FARMS, MI 48236

DIRTYDOGJAZZ.COM06
25

20

CURBSIDE DELIVERY and CARRY OUT AVAILABLE

09
17

20
10

15
20

Visit
dirtydogjazz.com
for more information

KIMMIE HORNE
NOVEMBER 20, 2020
AND
NOVEMBER 21, 2020

Visit
dirtydogjazz.com
for more information

OCTOBER 21, 2020
THROUGH 
OCTOBER 24, 2020

DETROIT JAZZ FESTIVAL
Jazz Group

Visit
dirtydogjazz.com
for more information

RALPHE ARMSTRONG
NOVEMBER 11, 2020
THROUGH
NOVEMBER 14, 2020

Jazz Bassist

Jazz Vocalist

Visit
dirtydogjazz.com
for more information

DAVE BENNETT
NOVEMBER 18, 2020
AND
NOVEMBER 19, 2020

Jazz Clarinet
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Golf

SOUTH & NORTH

Grosse Pointe South 
and Grosse Pointe North 
took to the golf course 
last week to compete in 
their respective regional 
tournaments.

For the Blue Devils, 
they won their Division 1 
regional with a 346. 
Farmington was a distant 
second at 375 and 
Livonia Stevenson was 
third at 391.

The regional was 
played at Whispering 
Willows Golf Course in 
Livonia.

The Blue Devils were 
led by Audrey Becker, 
who was the medalist, 
posting a 76.

Gia Cavaliere was next 
with 89, followed by Elli 
Richter with 90, Jennifer 
Crowley with 91 and 

Alston Smith with 92.
Each of the Blue Devils 

fi nished in the top eight 
in the fi nal standings.

North played a Division 
2 regional tournament at 
Farmington Hills Golf 
Course in Farmington.

South Lyon, Port 
Huron Northern and 
Farmington Hills Mercy 
advanced to the state 
fi nals.

The Norsemen fin-
ished seventh with a 416.

Evelyn Stahl fi nished 
as one of the top three 
individual scorers from a 
non-advancing team. 
Stahl fired 90 to make 
the state fi nals as an indi-
vidual.

Other scorers for the 
Norsemen were Ana 
Todesco with 106, Rita 
Shemmai with 109 and 
Samantha Lucido with 
111.

Great day
for both
By Bob St. John
Sports Editor

Swimming

RIVALS

Grosse Pointe South’s 
girls swimming and div-
ing team defeated city 
foe Grosse Pointe North 
last week, 140-43.

The Blue Devils’ depth 
was too much for the 
Norsemen as they won 
10 of the 12 events.

The Norsemen’s victo-
ries came from Shayla 
Andrews, who won the 
50- and 100-yard free-
style with times of 26.09 
and 57.18.

As for the Blue Devils, 
they won the opening 
event, the 200-yard med-
ley relay, as Brooke 
L e z o t t e ,  P h o e b e 
Handwork,  Sophie 
Schuetze and Olivia Yoo 
posted a time of 1:54.02.

N o r t h ’ s  M a g g i e 
McSkimming ,  Ava 
Macgillis, Sophia Vitale 
and Andrews placed 
third with a time of 
2:02.96.

In the 200-yard frees-
tle, South’s trio of Yoo, 
Isabella Gelle and 
Hayden Barry placed 
first, second and third 
with times of 1:58.06, 
1:59.79 and 2:00.73.

For North, Diana 
Muccioli was fifth at 
2:06.53.

South’s Schuetze won 
the 200-yard individual 
medley with a time of 
2:14.94.

In diving, South swept 
the event with Caroline 
Rogers, Ava Rogowski 
and Alayna Okonowski 
earning 175.05, 154.9 
and 122.25 points.

Yoo also won the 100-

yard butterfl y with a time 
of 58.82. She was fol-
lowed by South’s 
Schuetze and North’s 
Muccioli, who had times 
of 59.70 and 1:06.06.

Following Andrews in 
the 100-yard freestyle 
were South’s Bedsworth, 
Jilliana Pilutti and Ella 
Pazuchowski, who had 
times of 58.14, 58.95 and 
1:00.94.

South also swept the 
500-yard freestyle as 
Gelle, Barry and Sophia 
Kapla posted times of 
5:18.88, 5:22.57 and 
5:22.93. North’s Ava 
DeCoste was fourth with 
a time of 5:41.86.

The Blue Devils won 
the 200-yard freestyle 
relay with Bedsworth, 
Pilutti, Pazuchowski and 
Gelle won with a time of 
1:46.36, while North’s 
Muccioli, Sophia Vitale, 
Andrews and Victoria 
Treder took second at 
1:48.06.

Lezotte, Klepp and 
Clark swept the 100-yard 
backstroke, turning in 
times of 1:01.88, 1:02.87 
and 1:03.27. North’s 
McSkimming was fifth 
with a time of 1:08.66.

I t  w a s  S o u t h ’ s 
Handwork winning the 
100-yard breaststroke 
with a time of 1:11.94, 
and North’s Macgillis 
took second at 1:13.62.

In the fi nal event, the 
400-yard freestyle relay, 
South’s Yoo, Schuetze, 
Pilutti and Barry won 
with a time of 3:50.02, 
while North’s Muccioli, 
Treder, DeCoste and 
Macgillis fi nished third 
at 4:06.49.

South’s
depth key
By Bob St. John
Sports Editor

Tennis

UNIVERSITY L IGGETT  SCHOOL

The No. 1 seed and 
host University Liggett 
School boys tennis team 
earned a regional cham-
pionship last week.

In a different format 
due to concerns for hav-
ing too many people at 
one venue, the Michigan 
High School Athletic 
Association broke up the 
usual eight-team region-
als and broke them in 
half.

In addition, each team 
played dual matches 
instead of competing 
against the fi eld.

The Knights earned a 
first-round bye, and 

played Armada in the 
title match and won 7-1 
to advance to the state 
fi nals.

At No. 1 singles, Neil 
Murphy, subbing for 
William Cooksey, lost 
6-1, 6-0, but Sebastien 
Courtright,  George 
Anusbigian and Gerry 
Sherer were victories, 

6-1, 6-1 at No. 2 singles, 
6-1, 6-1 at No. 3 singles, 
and 6-0, 6-0 at No. 4 sin-
gles.

The duo of Vince 
Maribao and Tarun Jarial 
won 6-1, 6-0 at No. 1 dou-
bles, while the No. 2 dou-
bles team of Tommy 
Ugvan and Alec  Leonard 
won 6-2, 6-0.

The No. 3 doubles 
squad of Bennett French 
and Campbell Marchal 
won 6-0, 6-0, and the No. 
4 doubles team of Rocco 
Scarfone and Brendan 
Connors won 6-0, 6-2 to 
complete the district title 
victory.

ULS improved to 
11-4-2 overall.

By Bob St. John
Sports Editor

Time
to amp
it up

PHOTO BY RENEE LANDUYT

ULS captains, from left, William Cooksey, Vince Maribao, Tarun Jarial and 
Alec Leonard, pose with the regional trophy.

GROSSE POINTE SOUTH

The Grosse Pointe 
South boys tennis team 
claimed its fi rst Division 
1 regional title in a few 
years last week, beating 
Dearborn Edsel Ford 8-0 
and Chippewa Valley 8-0.

In the regional final 
against the Big Reds, the 
host Blue Devils lost a 
total of one game in all 
eight of the fl ights.

The four singles play-
ers, Connor Stafford, 
Corbin Ifkovits, Luke 
Holowinski and Owen 
Sanford, each won 6-0, 
6-0.

In doubles, the squads 
of Jacob Harris and 
Jackson Marchal, Alex 
Prather and Blake 
Discher, and Will White 
and Will Sine, also won 
6-0, 6-0.

The No. 4 doubles 

team of Adam Chugh 
and Joe Brennan won 
6-1, 6-0.

Against Edsel Ford, the 
Blue Devils won each 
match in straight sets 
and lost a total of five 
games.

Stafford, Ifkovits, 
Holowinski and Sanford 
won in singles, while 
Harris and Marchal, 
Prather and Discher, 
White and Sine, and 
Chugh and Brennan 
won.

By Bob St. John
Sports Editor

Title
is in

PHOTO COURTESY OF BLAKE DISCHER

Coach John Willard, far left, poses with his Grosse Pointe South boys tennis 
team after winning a regional title.

GROSSE POINTE NORTH

Grosse Pointe North’s 
boys tennis team put 
together its best effort of 
the season last week, 
cruising to a Division 2 
regional title on its home 
courts.

The solid play in the 
regional is what head 
coach John Van Alst gets 
from his student-athletes 
each and every season.

They play a tough reg-
ular season, improve and 
let it rip in the regionals.

The Norsemen beat 
Port Huron 8-0 in the 
semifinals and dis-
patched of L’Anse Creuse 
7-1 in the title match.

In the win over Port 
Huron, Simon Stallings 
won 6-1, 6-1 at No. 1, and 
it was Alex Muawad win-
ning 6-0, 6-1 at No. 2.

Sahith Nannapaneni 
won 6-3, 6-0 at No. 3, and 

James Moussiaux won 
6-1, 6-1 at No. 4.

Mitchell Mills and Ben 
Zoia won 6-1, 6-0 at No. 
1 doubles, and the duo of 
Kaiden DePascale and 
Connor Tubbs took a 6-1, 
6-2 win at No. 2 doubles.

At No. 3 doubles, 
Simeon Nelson and John 
Mueller won 6-4, 6-1, 
and Ethan Molitor and 
Ethan Michalski earned 
a 6-0, 6-4 win at No. 4 
doubles.

In the title match, 
Stallings, Muawad and 
Moussiaux won their sin-
gles matches in convinc-
ing fashion.

The doubles team of 
Mills and Zoia won a 
tough three-setter, win-
ning 5-7, 6-2, 6-2, and 
DePascale and Tubbs 
earned a 6-4, 6-1 win at 
No. 2 doubles.

Nelson and Mueller 
won 7-5, 5-7, 6-2 at No. 3 
doubles, and the final 

win came from the No. 4 
doubles squad of Molitor 
and Michalski, 6-2, 6-2.

T h e  N o r s e m e n 
improved to 4-6 with the 
regional sweep.

Next for the Norsemen 
is the Division 2 state 
fi nals Thursday, Oct. 15, 
through Saturday, Oct. 
17, in Midland.

The format is the same 
in the fi nals as it was in 
the regionals.

Teams play dual 
matches and seeded.

This is an attempt to 
have less people at the 
events, and social dis-
tancing with mandatory 
wearing masks is in 
place.

The Division I finals 
are held in Novi, with 
Division 3 held in 
Holland and Division 4 
held in Kalamazoo.

MHSAA info
Note that if an outdoor 

event is not in a fixed 
outdoor seating venue, a 
site must maintain no 
more than 30 spectators 
per 1,000 square feet of 
the facility, up to a maxi-
mum of 1,000 spectators.

Based on the MDHHS 
Emergency Order of 
October 5, there will be 
no change to the face 
covering requirements 
as outlined in MHSAA 
guidance to schools from 
both Sept. 10 and 30. 

The face covering 
requirement for every-
one else present includ-
ing coaches, trainers, 
managers, media mem-
bers, game administra-
tion and spectators also 
remains unchanged. 
Remember that social 
distancing must be fol-
lowed at all times for 
everyone except athletes 
and offi cials involved in 
active participation dur-
ing the contest.

By Bob St. John
Sports Editor

Norsemen win title

10
15

20

18412 Mack Ave. 18412 Mack Ave. 
Grosse Pointe Farms, Grosse Pointe Farms, 

MI 48236MI 48236

REALTOR® 
Exceptional personal service,
exceptional results

(313) 575-6937
andrewkesteloot@att.net

Andrew Kesteloot
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Field hockey

RIVALS

Rivals Grosse Pointe 
South and host University 
Liggett School girls fi eld 
hockey teams finally 
played their game last 
week that was originally 
scheduled for Aug. 31.

A division title and No. 
1 playoff seed was on the 
line as the two teams 
entered the game as the 
top two in the Michigan 
High School Field 
Hockey Association 
Division 2 East stand-
ings.

It was also the third 
game in three days for 
the Blue Devils.

After the Blue Devils 
and Knights each had the 

better scoring opportuni-
ties in the fi rst two quar-
ters, they played an equal 
third period with no 
score.

The Blue Devils caught 
a break early in the 
fourth quarter. A scram-
ble in front of the Knights’ 
goal was whistled as a 
penalty stroke for the vis-
itors.

With 13:36 left, senior 
Kathryn Skupien scored, 
lifting the Blue Devils to 
a division-clinching 1-0 
victory.

South head coach 
Jessie Rouleau couldn’t 
be any prouder of her 
squad, which stayed 
unbeaten with the close 
victory.

After the goal, each 

team fi red shots that just 
missed their mark. Each 
team had good chances 
to either tie in the case of 
the Knights or add to 
their lead in the case of 
the Blue Devils.

Of note, the Knights 
played the game without 
their top forwards, who 
missed the game due to 
COVID-19 concerns.

In other games last 
week,  South beat 
Hartland 2-0 and Ann 
Arbor Greenhills 3-1, 
while ULS lost 1-0 to 
Dearborn.

Grosse Pointe South 
improved to 6-0-1 in the 
division and 9-0-1 over-
all; ULS dropped to 4-2 in 
the division and 5-2 over-
all.

By Bob St. John
Sports Editor

Blue Devils edge ULS, claim title

PHOTO BY RENEE LANDUYT

South girls celebrate after taking a 1-0 lead over University Liggett School.

GROSSE POINTE NORTH

The Grosse Pointe 
North girls fi eld hockey 
team stretched its win-
ning streak to four last 
week, beating visiting 
Clarkston 6-0.

The Norsemen scored 
four quick goals in the 
first quarter, and put 
their game on cruise 

control for the remaining 
three. They dominated 
the game from the open-
ing whistle.

Ashlyn Senter led the 
way with two goals, 
while Erin Murphy, 
Anneliese Lechner, 
Rachel Mellon and Ella 
Maltby had a goal apiece.

With the play predomi-
nantly in Clarkston’s 
zone, life was easy for 

g o a l k e e p e r  L u c y 
Driscoll.

The following evening, 
the Norsemen traveled 
to Brighton and lost 1-0.

Grosse Pointe North is 
2-3-1 in the Michigan 
High School Field 
Hockey Association 
Division 2 East standings 
and 5-4-1 overall with 
one week left in the regu-
lar season.

Norsemen put best
foot forward in win
By Bob St. John
Sports Editor

Football

GROSSE POINTE SOUTH

Grosse Pointe South’s 
football team put itself in 
position to win an 
improbable Macomb 
Area Conference Red 
Division title after its 
stunning 21-17 road win 
over Chippewa Valley 
last weekend.

With one game left in 
the division, the Blue 
Devils are 3-1, tied with 
Macomb Dakota and 
S t e r l i n g  H e i g h t s 
Stevenson.

This weekend, the Blue 
D e v i l s  t r a v e l  t o 
Stevenson, while Dakota 
is on the road at Romeo. 
With a win over the 
Titans, the Blue Devils 
would at least clinch a 
share of the title, or win 
it outright with a win and 
if the Cougars lose to the 
Bulldogs.

After winning four 
straight MAC White 
crowns, head coach Tim 
Brandon has his team 
believing they can make 
it five in a row after 
jumping up to the one of 
the toughest divisions in 
the state, the MAC Red.

It didn’t look good in 
the fi rst half against the 
Big Reds as the home 
team grabbed a 14-0 
lead. The Blue Devils 
offense was stuck in neu-
tral.

In the second half, the 
gear was put in drive as 
junior Will Johnson 
scored on a 14-yard run 
to make it 14-7.

Senior Bennett Smihal 
kicked the extra point.

Egan Sullivan ran 9 
yards for a touchdown to 
tie it at 14 after Smihal’s 
PAT, but the home team 
kicked a field goal to 
take a 17-14 lead midway 

late in the third quarter.
The Blue Devils drove 

the length of the field 
and scored the go-ahead 
TD on another Sullivan 
run. This one was from 
5-yards out with 2:25 left 
in the game.

Defensive coordinator 
Chad Hepner’s squad 
went to work after that, 
thwarting another drive 
to seal the victory.

The defense held the 
explosive Big Reds to 
only 17 points, three in 
the second half.

They forced the Big 
Reds into four turnovers. 
Seniors Luke Srebernak 
and Max Gavagan each 
had an interception.

Sullivan had 80 yards 
rushing on 18 carries to 
lead the offensive charge. 
Johnson had 37 yards 
rushing on four carries.

Grosse Pointe South is 
3-1 overall.

Blue Devils upset CV
By Bob St. John
Sports Editor

GROSSE POINTE NORTH

The Grosse Pointe 
North football team is 
back at the .500 mark 
after crushing host 
Warren Cousino 30-10 
last weekend.

The Norsemen started 
out with a bang as 
Kennard Williams ran 
the opening kickoff back 
95 yards for a touch-
down. Mike Zontini 
kicked the extra point 
and just like that is was 
7-0.

“It was an explosive 
run, that’s the fi rst KOR 
for a TD in the past 3 
years,” head coach Joe 
Drouin said. “We saw 
some things on fi lm and 
thought we could catch 
them with an onside kick 
following our fi rst score. 
Cousino recovered and 
had a nice 47-yard drive 
to score tying the game at 
7.”

T h e  N o r s e m e n 
responded with a 41-yard 
field goal by Zontini. 
That gave the visitors a 
10-7 lead.

“From that point on the 
story of the game was 
our defense,” Drouin 
said. “The defense stood 

strong, only allowing 108 
yards the remainder of 
the game and a late 
fourth quarter fi eld goal. 
(allowing 155 total 
yards).

“We added Taiwan 
Jones to our coaching 
staff and the players have 
really responded to his 
coaching style. Some 
defensive players had to 
step up and fi ll in at posi-
tions this week.”

Drew Hill led the 
defense with 14 tackles, 
two timely tackles for a 
loss, and a forced fumble.

Johnny Bonnell seven 
tackles, including one for 
a loss. Ben Bania, Tim 
Cleland and Colin Duffy 
all added to the defensive 
stops. Hunter Abddelloui 
stood strong on the 
defensive line.

“Hunter is your typical 
noseguard, a cloud of 
dust follows him around 
and he loves it,” Drouin 
said. “He has a motor and 
is always around the ball 
carrier.”

O f f e n s i v e l y,  t h e 
Norsemen had 204 total 
yards with Joe Plieth 
throwing for 116.

Plieth and Zontini,(four 
catches for 57 yards and 
a TD, hooked up for a 

30-yard TD. “Plieth had a 
nice l i t t le  Patr ick 
Mahomes moment with 
an improvised shovel 
pass to Williams for the 
two-point conversion,” 
Drouin said. “Kevin 
Shubnell worked with 
Joe’s footwork this past 
week and it made a dif-
ference in our passing 
game. We added offen-
s ive  weapon Kyle 
Armbruster to the mix 
this week as well. Kyle 
might be the fastest kid 
in the school and at 6’1” 
he makes for a nice pass-
ing target.”

Armbruster had four 
catches for 46 yards, 
while Williams had 151 
total yards with a 14-yard 
TD and a two-point con-
version reception, plus 
the kick return for a 
score.

Ethan LaCroix added 
to the scoring with a 
6-yard run. Colin Duffy 
helped the offense with a 
30-yard run.

Grosse Pointe North is 
2-2 in the Macomb Area 
C o n f e r e n c e  G o l d 
Division and overall.

Next is a 7 p.m. home 
game Friday, Oct. 16, 
against Warren Woods-
Tower.

Norsemen at .500
By Bob St. John
Sports Editor
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Buff Tabby.Buff Tabby.
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20542 Harper
(Lennon and Harper)

(313) 884-1551
www.gpaas.org

GROSSE POINTE ANIMAL ADOPTION SOCIETY

OPEN FOR ADOPTIONS
BY APPOINTMENT

313-884-1551

CUTE CUDDLY KITTENS
WITH AGE APPROPRIATE SHOTS,

READY TO GO HOME!

WINDOWS & DOORS

Storm Doors • Windows • Screen Repair
Home Safes, Keys & More

Village Lock & Home Repair

The only locksmith on Mack Avenue

18554 Mack Avenue • Grosse Pointe, Michigan 48236
villagelockgp@gmail.com • 313-881-8603

K9 Specialties

• Custom Fit Leather & Biothane Collars
• Training Tips by Appointment

16
colors

1
20

Located inside Village Lock & Home Repair

Made in Michigan
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Volleyball

UNIVERSITY L IGGETT  SCHOOL

PHOTO COURTESY OF DAN SULLIVAN

Senior night
University Liggett School volleyball team captains, 
Allie Mulder and Rosie Bracken, helped the Knights 
beat Detroit Cristo Rey 25-11, 25-10, 25-13 last week. 
The Knights evened its conference record at 2-2. 
Head coach Dan Sullivan noted that Kennedy 
Campbell led the team in kills and Elle Quinlan was 
solid as the new libero.

SOUTH & NORTH

For the second time in 
five days, the Grosse 
Pointe South volleyball 
team squared off against 
division foe Utica.

The Chieftains earned 
a five-set win the first 
meeting, and this time 
around the Blue Devils 
were on the losing end of 
a 25-23, 24-26, 25-19, 
25-20 setback.

Head coach Janeil 

DiVita and her Blue 
Devils knew this would 
be a tough match against 
an evenly matched foe.

It was as neither team 
could get much separa-
tion on the score board 
in the first two games 
with each team winning 
49 points.

The Blue Devils fell a 
step behind in the third 
game and never could 
catch up, leaving them 
trailing two games to 
one.

They fell into a big 
hold in game four, trail-
ing 14-5, but battled back 
cut it to 20-15 and had 
momentum.

The Blue Devils just 
couldn’t sustain the 
charge and the Chieftains 
scored fi ve of the next 10 
points to win the 
M a c o m b  A r e a 
Conference  Whi te 
Division contest in four 
games.

South rebounded to 
edge host Marysville in 

fi ve games to improve to 
2-3 in the MAC White 
Division.

North results
As for Grosse Pointe 

North, it lost 25-15, 
25-18, 25-22 to division-
leading Fraser.

Brynn Spicher, Mary 
Schaden and Lauren 
Lefebvre each had five 
kills, while Lindsey 
Brewer and Shailee 
Simon had four service 
aces apiece.

By Bob St. John
Sports Editor

South splits; North falls

Cross country

RIVALS

Grosse Pointe North 
and Grosse Pointe South 
are making changes to 
what was once a loaded 
schedule.

Changes have been 
made thanks to the can-
cellation of dozens of 
weekend invitationals.

Last week, the rivals 
ran against each other 
and the Blue Devils eged 
the Norsemen 26-30.

It was the largest meet 
to date in the state with 
more than 100 runners 
competing.

South was led by the 
2-3-4 fi nish of freshman 
Kloie Roy, sophomore 
Grace Wininger and 
senior May Eger. The 
three fi nished within 22 
seconds of each other 

with times of 22:00, 
22:02 and 22:22, respec-
tively.

Sophomores Anna 
Czech (6th) and Marrin 
Harris (11th) sealed the 
win for South. Other 
Blue Devils in the top 20 
i n c l u d e d  D i a n n e 
Dollison (12th), Morgan 
Braddock (18th), Ava 
Carr (19th) and Miranda 
Barba (20th).

“This was a tremen-
dous competition for the 
GP community,” South 
head coach Steve 
Zaranek said. “More 
than 100 girls from our 
two high schools raced, 
competed well, and dis-
played wonderful sports-
manship. The event was 
very inspiring.

“South and North have 
very similar teams. We 
need to rely on team 
depth. The girls from 
both teams understand 
the value of pushing 
each other and support-
ing one another.”

North boys
The Grosse Pointe 

North boys cross-coun-
try team traveled to 
H o w e l l  f o r  t h e 
Highlander Invitational 
last weekend, fi nishing 
seventh.

S e n i o r  P r e s t o n 
Navarre won the race 
with a season-best time 
of 15:47. Sophomore 
Alex Agius fi nished 18th 
in the race in a new per-
sonal-best time of 17:16.

Rounding out our 
scoring was junior Max 
Kluge with a time of 
18:29; freshman David 
Rochon at 18:31 and 
junior Paul Ciaravino at 
18:34.

Also competing for us 
were sophomore Charlie 
Bomgaars and junior 
Ryan Spiteri, who had 
times of 18:35 and 19:25.

“We are looking for-
ward to racing at Lake 
St. Clair Metro Park for 
the Pre-Regional meet 
on Oct. 21,” head coach 
Diane Montgomery said. 
“Our team goal, of 
course, is to fi nish in the 
top four and qualify for 
the Region Meet on Oct. 
30, at Chandler Park 
Golf Course.”

South edges North in girls
Soccer

NORTH, SOUTH & ULS

Grosse Pointe North 
and Grosse Pointe South 
boys soccer teams are 
gearing up to make a run 
at a district title.

Las t  week ,  the 
Norsemen beat visiting 
Orchard Lake St. Mary’s 
3-0 on senior night.

Chris Valice scored the 
fi rst goal with only 2:28 
left before the half to 
give the home team a 
true 1-0 lead.

They made it 2-0 in the 
fi rst couple of minutes of 
the second half when 
John Latiff scored on a 
penalty kick, and with 
11:53 left, Tom Sheffi eld 

gave the Norsemen an 
insurmountable three-
goal lead when he tal-
lied.

South came back from 
a 2-1 halftime defi cit to 
beat L’Anse Creuse North 
4-2 last week on senior 
night.

Senior Max Simonson 
scored two goals to lead 
the Blue Devils.

In the second half, 
junior Emmett O’Keefe 
tallied the tying goal at 
the 38:53 mark of the 
second half, while junior 
Nick Litsas had the even-
tual game winner in the 
second half.

Playoff push

406 ESTATE SALES

(At the corner of Lochmoor and Morningside.)

313 779 0193
www.marciawilkestatesales.com

587 LOCHMOOR
GROSSE POINTE WOODS

FRIDAY AND SATURDAY
OCTOBER 16TH AND 17TH

9:00 A.M. - 4:00 P.M.

What a great sale in this beautiful 5,000 

square foot home! We have great new items 

in perfect condition. We have like new 

sofas, pair perfect Kravet chairs, French 

bench, chair and needlepoint French chair, 

lighted curio cabinet, lots of bookshelves, 

daybed/trundle, new bedroom set, Human 

Touch Robotic Massage chair, small church 

pew, oil paintings, Shinola watch, men and 

women’s clothing and shoes including 

St. John Knits, Lilly, Christian Louboutin, 

books, Yamaha acoustic guitar, conga drum, 

outdoor furniture, extra large dog crate, 

chest freezer, brand new items include 

18” Bosch dishwasher, two Restoration 

Hardware sinks and light fixtures, and a 

Toro 1800 Power Curve Snowblower in the 

box,  we have skis, snowshoes, snowboard, 

tandem bike, toys, we are still unpacking 

boxes from storage, lots and lots more! 

101520

Street Numbers honored at 8:30 a.m. Friday
Check out marciawilkestatesales.com to see 

some featured items! We accept cash, checks, 
VISA, MasterCard, and AMEX.

406 ESTATE SALES

313-881-1800

BEAUTIFUL MOVING SALE
FRIDAY OCTOBER 16 AND
SATURDAY OCTOBER 17

9:00 A.M. - 3:00 P.M.

This fabulous home features wonderful 
high end furniture and decorative items. 
Check website for photos and details. 

Street numbers honored and exchanged Friday at 8:30 a.m.
Our numbers handed out at 8:30 a.m. Friday only

stefeksauctions.com

101520

6 WINDWARD PLACE
Grosse Pointe Farms

CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING
200 HELP WANTED

GENERAL

CDL-A Drivers
Wanted

3 months minimum
experience,

excellent pay,
benefits, sign on

bonus, 401K,
dedicated routes

Romeo and Wayne
dispatch.
Call Kirt

(586)752-4529
Ext 1032

210 HELP WANTED
RESTAURANT

302 CAREGIVER

305 HOUSE CLEANING

400 ANTIQUES /
COLLECTIBLES

406 ESTATE SALES

406 ESTATE SALES

409 GARAGE / YARD /
RUMMAGE SALE

409 GARAGE / YARD /
RUMMAGE SALE

412 MISCELLANEOUS
ARTICLES

DIRECTV
Switch and save!
$49.99/ month.

Select all- included
package. 155

channels. 1000s of
shows/ movies on
demand. FREE
Genie HD DVR

upgrade. Premium
movie channels,
FREE for 3 mos!

Call 1(844)975-3287

412 MISCELLANEOUS
ARTICLES

WESLEY
Financial Group,
LLC. Timeshare

cancellation
 experts. Over
$50,000,000 in

timeshare debt and
fees cancelled in
2019. Get free in-
formational pack-

age and learn how
to get rid of your

timeshare!
Free consultations.

Over 450
positive reviews.

Call (866)353-4896

415 WANTED TO BUY

603 GENERAL MOTORS

(313)882-6900 ext. 1 (313)882-6900 ext. 1

(313)882-6900 ext. 1
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708 APT/FLAT/DUPLEX
FOR RENT

716 OFFICE / COMMERCIAL 
FOR RENT

TIRED
of working out
of your house?

Professional
executive office

available.
280 sq. ft.

Commercial office
space on

Kercheval in the
Park. Furnished
with high speed

internet, skylights,
utilities, public and
private entrances.

Perfect for
relocating from

expensive
parking

downtown.
$850/month
everything
included.

Mark
(586)489-0818

721 VACATION RENTAL-FLA
Solution for
last weeks 

puzzle 10/8/20

10/15/20 022218

313 343.5578
HAVE THE GROSSE POINTE NEWS DELIVERED

TO YOUR HOME EVERY WEEK.
CALL
today!

is your 
LEADING SOURCELEADING SOURCE

The Grosse Pointe
NEWS

forfor Local Local 
InformationInformation

DIRECTORY OF SERVICES
Some classifications are not required by law to be licensed. Please check with the proper state agency to verify license.

Solution for
last week’s

puzzle 10/8/20

Solution Time: 21 minutes© 2020 King Features Synd., Inc.
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RENTAL REAL ESTATE

911 BRICK / BLOCK WORK 911 BRICK / BLOCK WORK 911 BRICK / BLOCK WORK 914 CARPENTRY

920 CHIMNEY REPAIR

927 DEBRIS / CLUTTER 
REMOVAL

929 DRYWALL / PLASTERING

934 FENCES

943 LANDSCAPERS /
TREE SERVICE/GARDENER

943 LANDSCAPERS /
TREE SERVICE/GARDENER

945 HANDYMAN

A

(313)237-7607
(586)215-4388
(810)908-4888

945 HANDYMAN

946 HAULING / MOVING

Local &
Long Distance Moving
& Full-Service Storage

Owned & Operated
By Taylor Lydon

11850 E. Jefferson Ave

(313) 882-4400

948 INSULATION

954 PAINTING / DECORATING

954 PAINTING / DECORATING

957 PLUMBING
& INSTALLATION

960 ROOFING SERVICES

981 WINDOW WASHING

Classifi ed Advertising
an IDEA that sells!

(313)882-6900 ext. 1 (313)882-6900 ext. 1

Let the 
Classifieds

Do The Walking

(313)882-6900 ext. 1

CLASSIFIEDS


